VAGUE ENTRIES

First Fee Application

none

Second Fee Application

none

Third Fee Application

Prepare for Attorney Attendance at Hearing

04/08/13	GLJ	Assist with preparation for attorney attendance at hearings set for 4/9/2013	1.20
05/08/13	GLJ	Preparation for attorney attendance at hearings set for May 14	2.20
05/30/13	GLJ	Preparation for attorney attendance at hearings set for June 4	2.20
06/24/13	GLJ	Preparation for attorney attendance at plan strategy meeting	1.60

Fourth Fee Application

Attention to...

		abblest	"15"
			EXHIBIT
08/08/13	GLJ	Telephone conferences with A. Dukes regarding order for expedited	0.50
08/06/13	DRE	Telephone conference with R. Rosenthal regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.2); attention to plan issues (.3)	0.50
08/02/13	GLJ	Draft certificate of service for motion to compel production, motion to shorten notice to respond to same and notice of hearing (.4); prepare same for filing (.2); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	0.90
		same (1.2); review local rules regarding shortening notice period on motion to compel and setting it for hearing on August 13 (.6); prepare motion to compel and motion to shorten notice for filing (.8); draft notice of hearing and prepare same for filing (.4); attention to filing motions and notice of hearing electronically (.9); coordinate service of all documents (1.3)	
08/01/13	GLJ	Review draft of motion to compel production and prepare exhibits to	5.20
08/01/13	DRE	Draft motion to shorten notice on motion to compel (.7); review and revise motion to compel (2.4); review and revise notice of hearing (.4); attention to service of foregoing (.6)	4.10

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 1 of 11

dda

		consideration of motion to compel (.3); attention to uploading replacement order (.2)	
08/09/13	DRE	Correspondence regarding motion to terminate exclusivity $(.3)$; revise motion to terminate exclusivity (I. 7); research in connection with same (1.1); attention to plan and discovery issues in connection with preparation for hearing (1.2)	4.30
08/12/13	DRE	Review documents produced by debtors (4.9); correspondence regarding same (.2); correspondence regarding discovery issues (.8); attention to same (.9); telephone conference regarding same (.6)	7.40
08/13/13	DRE	Correspondence regarding objection to Debtor's exclusivity motion (.2); attention to service of same (.1); finalize objection for filing (.2); draft certificate of service for same (.2); telephone conference with regarding objection (.2); file objection and certificate of service (.6); review Atalaya's objection to exclusivity (.4)	1.90
08/15/13	GLJ	Telephone conference with clerk to obtain hearing date and clarify time for hearing on third fee application (.3); draft notice of hearing	5.70
		(.4); finalize exhibits to third fee application and prepare same for filing (1.2); attention to filing third fee application and notice of hearing on same electronically (.8); draft certificate of service and prepare same for filing (.5); attention to filing same electronically (.4); review draft of Protiviti's second fee application and correspond with J. Crockett regarding July time (1.3); coordinate service of third fee application (.8)	
08/16/13	GLJ	Correspond with J. Crockett regarding Protiviti's second fee application (.3); review and revise exhibits to same and prepare for filing (1.0); attention to filing same electronically (.7); draft notice of hearing and certificate of service (.5); prepare same for filing (.4); attention to electronic filing of notice of hearing and certificate of service on Protiviti's second fee application (.7); coordinate service to special service list (.8)	4.40
09/03/13	DRE	Attention to claims issues (.3); review claims register and schedules in connection with same (.4)	0.70
09/06/13	DRE	Attention to plan and disclosure statement issues	1.10
09/10/13	DRE	Telephone conference with M. Mintz regarding plan issues (.3); attention to same (.8)	1.10
09/11/13	AMC	Attention to collateral description language for commercial tort claims	0.20
09/13/13	AMC	Draft Security Agreement for Class 5 Unsecured Creditors for BP commercial tort claims (.8); review LA UCC provisions on commercial tort claims and general perfection provisions for conformance to Uniform Commercial Code (.5); attention to	1.70

collateral description of BP Tort Claim in Exhibit A (.4)

09/16/13	AMC	Transmit drafts of note and security agreement for Class 5 general unsecured creditors and attention to open questions	0.10
09/18/13	DRE	Attention to discovery and plan issues	0.40
09/18/13	GLJ	Attention to downloading documents produced by Yucaipa; review same	7.50
09/20/13	DRE	Attention to retention issues	0.30
09/23/13	DRE	Attention to plan and disclosure statement issues	0.30
09/26/13	DRE	Review and comment on revised joint plan (.5); review and comment on revised disclosure statement (1.9); telephone conference with Mr. Crockett regarding same (.4); revise disclosure statement (1.6); attention to plan issues {.4}	4.80
09/26/13	GLJ	Review supplemental affidavit on Greenberg Traurig's retention as counsel to Committee and prepare same for filing (.3); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	0.60
09/30/13	DRE	Finalize and prepare for filing ex parte motion, notice and proposed order (.8); revise notice for service (.3); telephone conference with V. Bakhshain regarding service of notice and other plan and disclosure statement related service issues (.3); extensive revisions to disclosure statement motion, confirmation procedures order, forms of notices and ballots (2.2); correspondence with B. McIlwain regarding same (.2); prepare certificate of service for notice and order (.2); correspondence with V. Bakhshain regarding same (.5); attention to filing and service issues (.9)	5.40
09/30/13	GLJ	Assist with finalization of motion, ballots and other documents to be filed as exhibits to procedures motion (2.6); review ex parte motion to limit notice on disclosure statement (.4); prepare same for filing (.4); attention to filing ex parte motion to limit notice on disclosure statement electronically (.3); several telephone conferences with clerk's office regarding entry of orders regarding ex parte motion (.3); conference regarding comments to procedures motion (.4); prepare procedures motion and exhibits for filing (.8); attention to filing same electronically (.5); review plan terms to assist with creditor calls leading up to confirmation (1.5)	7.20
10/02/13	GLJ	Review and prepare affidavit of service for filing (.4); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	0.70
10/15/13	DRE	Attention to September fee statement	0.50
10/17/13	DRE	Telephone conference with Mr. Mintz regarding July fee statement (.2); attention to same (.3); draft Protiviti's fee application order (.4);	1.20

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 3 of 11

attention to DIP budget (.3)

10/18/13	DRE	Attention to September fee statement (.4); correspondence with service parties to GT fee statement (.1)	0.50
10/21/13	GLJ	Review affidavit of service on disclosure statement and prepare same for filing (.3); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	0.60
10/22/13	GLJ	Review affidavit of service for notice of expedited hearing on disclosure statement and related documents served by BMC and prepare same for filing (.3); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	0.60
10/24/13	DRE	Review claims/solicitation spreadsheet prepared by BMC (1.2); detailed correspondence to V. Bakhshian regarding same (1.0); correspondence regarding claims reconciliation (.I); review classification of claims (.2); review draft of first amended disclosure statement (.7); attention to claims issues (1.1); telephone conference with J. Crockett and M. Atkinson regarding same (.3)	4.60
10/25/13	DRE	Attention to plan claim issues (2.1); review and comment on proposed language to first amended disclosure statement (.9); attention to disclosure statement amendment issues (2.3)	5.30
10/28/13	DRE	Attention to disclosure statement issues (.2); review correspondence regarding plan/claim issues (.2); correspondence with V. Bakhshian regarding plan solicitation issues (.2)	0.60
10/30/13	DRE	Attention to plan solicitation and disclosure statement issues (.5); telephone conference with Mr. McIlwain regarding solicitation (.4); revise disclosure statement order (.4); review solicitation procedures (.6); detailed correspondence with Mr. Bakhshian regarding same (.7); review disclosure statement order entered by court (.1); correspondence with Mr. McIlwain regarding same (.2)	2.90
11/12/13	DRE	Revise first amended disclosure statement (.4); attention to plan issues (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Smith regarding same (.3); review disclosure statement order uploaded to court (.2)	1.70
11/14/13	DRE	Attention to plan solicitation issues (1.7); review and respond in detail to correspondence from V. Bakhshian regarding same (.9); extensive review of and comment on first amended disclosure statement (1.3); extensive review of and comment on first amended plan (.8); follow up correspondence with V. Bakhshian regarding plan and disclosure statement and solicitation issues (.8); review finalized notices and ballots (.8); correspondence with B. Smith regarding same (.5)	6.80
11/15/13	DRE	Correspondence with V. Bakhshian regarding solicitation issues and today's call (.4); correspondence with B. Smith regarding same (.4); attention to plan solicitation issues (.4); telephone conference with V. Bakhshian and B. Smith regarding same (.8); prepare for same (.4)	2.40

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 4 of 11

11/15/13	DRE	Attention to fee statement for October 2013 (.7); correspondence with counsel to notice parties regarding same (.2)	0.90
11/18/13	DRE	Revise order to compel compliance with subpoenas (1.1); attention to discovery issues (.6); review correspondence from opposing counsel regarding same (.4)	2.10
11/18/13	DRE	Review correspondence from B. Smith and V. Bakhshian regarding plan solicitation issues (.4); attention to same (.5)	0.90
11/19/13	DRE	Attention to fee statement issues	0.40
11/19/13	DRE	Attention to plan discovery issues (.4); telephone conference regarding discovery (.9); revise discovery order (1.4); conference regarding discovery issues (.4); review correspondence from D. Harris regarding discovery order (.7)	3.80
11/20/13	DRE	Review CD label for plan solicitation (.2); review plan class report (.9); attention to solicitation issues (.4)	1.50
11/22/13	DRE	Review of ballots and notices (1.2); correspondence with B. Smith and V. Bakhshian regarding same (.3); attention to claim and solicitation issues (.9)	2.40
11/25/13	DRE	Attention to DIP/budget issues	1.20
Assist with.	• • •		
09/12/13	DRE	Update case calendar (.2); assist with preparation for status conference (.2)	0.40
09/17/13	GLJ	Review claims summaries and schedules (2.2); assist with preparation for drafting ballots (1.4)	3.60
09/30/13	GLJ	Assist with finalization of motion, ballots and other documents to be filed as exhibits to procedures motion (2.6); review ex parte motion to limit notice on disclosure statement (.4); prepare same for filing (.4); attention to filing ex parte motion to limit notice on disclosure statement electronically (.3); several telephone conferences with clerk's office regarding entry of orders regarding ex parte motion (.3); conference regarding comments to procedures motion (.4); prepare procedures motion and exhibits for filing (.8); attention to filing same electronically (.5); review plan terms to assist with creditor calls leading up to confirmation (1.5)	7.20
10/15/13	GLJ	Assist with planning for solicitation and preparation for confirmation	5.60
10/18/13			

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 5 of 11

10/28/13	DRE	Assist with preparations for tomorrow's hearing	0.20
11/14/13	SLH	Review of updated plan and disclosure statement (.5); assist with solicitation questions (.4)	0.90
Preparation fo	or attor	ney attendance at hearing or other matter	
08/08/13	GLJ	Preparation for attorney attendance at hearings set for August 13, 2013	1.20
08/12/13	GLJ	Complete preparation for attorney attendance at August 13, 2013 Hearings	1.20
08/14/13	GLJ	Preparation for drafting third fee application (2.6)	
09/13/13	GLJ	Review matters set for hearing (.6); review docket updates (.7); preparation for attorney attendance at hearings (3.5)	4.80
09/16/13	GLJ	Review Judge Summerhays' calendar for hearings set for 9/17/13 (.2); correspond with case manager to clarity hearing time for fee applications and objections to claims (.3); follow-up with Debtors' counsel regarding same (.2); preparation for attorney attendance at hearings (1.2)	1.90
09/17/13	GLJ	Review claims summaries and schedules (2.2); assist with preparation for drafting ballots (1.4)	3.60
09/23/13	GLJ	Preparation for drafting fourth fee application (1.4); review proposed U.S. Trustee guidelines in connection with same (.8)	2.20
10/01/13	GLJ	Review recent pleadings filed in preparation for upcoming hearings	1.20
10/15/13	GLJ	Assist with planning for solicitation and preparation for confirmation	5.60
10/28/13	GLJ	Complete preparation for attorney attendance at hearing on disclosure statement	1.50
11/22/13	GLJ	Discuss preparation for document production	0.30

Fifth Fee Application

Attention to....

12/03/13	SLH	Attention to discovery questions and production	0.70
12/05/13	SLH	Attention to document production	0.50
12/06/13	DRE	Attention to discovery issues	1.00

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 6 of 11

12/06/ 13	SLH	Attention to document production	0.70
12/09/ 13	DRE	Attention to discovery issues and document production (2.8); review and comment on stipulation regarding confidential infol1nation (1.1); telephone conferences and correspondence with Mr. Harris regarding same (.9); correspondence with Mr. McIlwain regarding same (.1); draft proposed language to stipulation (.5)	5.40
12/09/13	DRE	Attention to next interim fee application	0.10
12/09/13	SLH	Conference with P. Brown regarding protective order and discovery due from Yucaipa (.2); attention to document production (.8); review emails from D. Harris regarding document production (.2)	1.20
12/10/13	DRE	Attention to discovery issues and stipulation regarding confidential information (3.2); correspondence with Mr. Ranis regarding same (.2); further revise stipulation (1.0); telephone conference with Mr. Harris regarding stipulation (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Brown and Mr. Ranis regarding same (.5); review final stipulation (.2); correspondence with Mr. Harris regarding same and document production (.2)	5.50
12/10/13	DRE	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.4); telephone call to Mr. Derbes regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Bakhshian regarding solicitation affidavit of service (.2); telephone conference and correspondence with Mr. Brunol regarding confirmation issues (.5); review and comment on plan discovery order (.3); review solicitation affidavit of service (.6); correspondence with Mr. Meyers regarding same (.3); correspondence with Mr. Smith regarding same (. 1)	2.50
12/10/13	SLH	Attention to document production	1.20
12/11/13	DRE	Attention to discovery issues and document production (2.7); correspondence with Mr. Bales regarding Yucaipa's document production (.2)	2.90
12/12/13	DRE	Review stipulation regarding Yucaipa's document production (.2); correspondence regarding same (.6); attention to discovery production (.5); telephone conference regarding production to Yucaipa (.2); telephone conference with Mr. McIlwain regarding discovery scheduling order (.5); review documents produced by Yucaipa (3.3)	5.30
12/12/13	SLH	Telephone conference with Mr. McIlwain regarding discovery schedule (.3); attention to same and document	1.10

		production (.6); emails to D. Han i s regarding scheduling order (.2)	
12/13/13	DRE	Review and comment on discovery scheduling order (.2); draft Committee's expert designation (.7); attend to service of same (.6); attention to discovery issues (1.4); correspondence with Mr. McIlwain and Mr. Harris regarding expert report (.2)	3.10
12/13/13	SLH	Telephone conference with Mr. McIlwain regarding discovery (.1); attention to production (.6)	0.70
12/16/13	DRE	Attention to Greenberg Tranrig's and Protiviti's fee statements for November 2013 (.4); correspondence with counsel for parties regarding same (.3); review Protiviti's interim fee application (.5); attention to service of foregoing (.6)	1.80
12/16/13	GLJ	Revise narrative for fee application (1.0); draft notice of hearing on GT's and Protiviti's fee applications (.5); prepare fourth fee application for filing (1.3); attention to filing same electronically (.8); prepare Protiviti's third fee application and and exhibits for filing (1.0); attention to filing same electronically (.7); coordinate service of fee applications and fee statements (2.5)	7.80
12/17/13	GLJ	Review designation of fact witnesses and prepare same for filing (.3); attention to filing same electronically (.4)	0.70
12/17/13	GLJ	Draft certificate of service on fee applications (.5); prepare same for filing (.2); attention to filing same electronically (.3)	1.00
12/20/13	DRE	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.4); telephone conference regarding plan discovery (.2); follow up correspondence regarding same (.1); correspondence with Mr. Bakhshian regarding ballot issue (.4); attention to same (.4)	1.50
12/31/13	DRE	Attention to Yucaipa document production	1.30
01/02/14	DRE	Telephone conference with Mr. Gruher regarding claim/plan issues (.3); telephone conference with creditor regarding claim issues (.2); attention to plan/claim issues (1.8); correspondence regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Bakhshian regarding same and balloting update (.3); follow up correspondence with Mr. Bakhshian (. 1)	3.00
01/03/14	DRE	Telephone conferences and correspondence with Mr. Gruher regarding plan and claim issues (1.2); attention to same (1.6); telephone conferences and correspondence regarding same (.4);	4.00

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 8 of 11

		review and respond to correspondence from Mr. Bakhshian regarding plan tabulation (. 5); correspondence regarding same (.1); review revised ballot tabulation (.2)	
0 1/06/14	DRE	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.9); correspondence with B. Smith regarding same (.2); review in detail tabulation report (.4); attention to tabulation issues (.9); telephone conference with B. Smith regarding tabulation (.4)	2.80
01/07/14	DRE	Attention to plan confirmation issues (2. 1): correspondence with BMC and B. Smith regarding tabulation (.2); telephone conference regarding plan/claim issues (.3); follow up correspondence regarding same (.2); review and comment all tabulation affidavit (.7)	3.50
01/08/14	DRE	Attention to plan/claim issues (.9); telephone conference and correspondence regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Gruher regarding plan/claim issues (.3); telephone conference with	4.00
01/09/14	DRE	Correspondence with Mr. Smith regarding revised tabulation declaration (.1); review same (.3); review and respond to correspondence from Mr. Gruher regarding plan/claim issues (.2); telephone conference and correspondence regarding same (.4); revise stipulation regarding Lakes Medical's claim (.7); correspondence with Mr. McIlwain regarding stipulation (. 1); attention to plan issues (.6)	2.40
1/10/14	DRE	Correspondence regarding stipulation (.4); revise stipulation (. 1); attention to plan confirmation issues (3.2); review correspondence from F. Brunol regarding same (. 1); telephone conferences with S. Rosenblatt regarding plan objection (.4); draft stipulation resolving same (1.3); revise same (.5); correspondence with Mr. Smith regarding same (.2); review and comment on brief in supp011 of Confirmation (.9); telephone conference with Mr. Smith regarding brief and stipulation (.4); revise designation of administrator (.2); draft certificate of service for same (.2); revise Lakes Medical stipulation (.5)	8.40
01/11/14	DRE	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.4); correspondence regarding same (.2); revise Lakes Medical stipulation (.3); correspondence with Mr. McIlwain regarding same (. 1); review and comment on confirmation order (.9); correspondence regarding same (.2)	2.10
01/31/14	DRE	Attention to December 2013 fee statements for Committee professionals (.3); correspondence with counsel distributing same (.1)	0.40
02/28/14	SLH	Attention to status of claim objections	0.90
02/28/14	SLH	Attention to appeal issues	0.80

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 9 of 11

03/05/14	SLH	Emails regarding committee meeting (.2); attention to same and appeal (.5)	0.70
03/10/14	DRE	Attention to filing of objection to motion for stay (.4); draft certificate of service regarding same (.4); attend to filing same (.3)	1.10
03/12/14	SLH	Attention to closing and open items (1.8); conferences regarding closing (.4)	2.20
03/17/14	GLJ	Attention to ordering transcript from hearing held on 3/10/2014	1.20
3/18/14	SLH	Attention to closing issues	1.80
03/25/14	SLH	Attention to closing (1.8); telephone conference with L. Futrell regarding closing (.3); telephone conference with J. Crockett regarding closing (.6)	2.70
3/26/14	DRE	Attention to objection to motion for stay (.4); attention to designation of additional items to be included in appeal (.3); draft same (1.1); review transcript of hearing on motion to stay (.4); draft certificate of service for designation of record (.2)	2.40
03/26/14	SLH	Attention to closing issues and information needed for closing 2.90	
03/27/14	SLH	Attention to closing issues	2.70
04/02/14	DRE	Attention to re-filing of objection to motion for stay (.4); correspondence with Mr. Hancock regarding same (.2); draft certificate of service regarding same (.1); attend to filing same (.2); attend to cover letter and courtesy copy to chambers (.6)	1.50
04/07/14	SLH	Review Atalaya's objection to Yucaipa's motion to stay; attention to motion to stay	0.80
04/07/14	SLH	Attention to appellate brief and issues on appeal	0.60
04/12/14	SLH	Attention to closing next week	1.20
04/15/14	SLH	Attention to closing	1.30
04/16/14	SLH	Attention to closing	0.30
04/16/14	SLH	Attention to closing	0.50
Assist with			

01/10/14	GLJ	Assist with preparation for attorney attendance at hearings on	2.50
		Confirmation	

12-51127 - #1567-15 File 06/17/14 Enter 06/17/14 17:07:37 Exhibit 15 Pg 10 of 11

Preparation for attorney appearance

01/10/14 GLJ Assist with preparation for attorney attendance at hearings on 2.50

4815-1336-3483, v. 1