

EXHIBIT A

Creditors Committee Meetings and Communications

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Fee</u>
3/13/14	C. Reardon	Emails with David Swan, Mark Duedall and William Alleman regarding fee matters and CNO	0.20	\$ 150.00
3/18/14	C. Reardon	Email exchange with Greg Werkheiser regarding prior settlement discussions and local rules regarding payment of fees	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/19/14	C. Reardon	Review transcript regarding settlement in preparation of call with UCC counsel	0.20	\$ 150.00
3/19/14	C. Reardon	Conference call with David Swan, Mark Duedall and Morris Nichols regarding UCC counsel	0.50	\$ 375.00
Creditors Committee Meetings and Communications			1.00	\$ 750.00

Disclosure Statement and Plan

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Fee</u>
3/7/14	C. Reardon	Review update email (with attachments) on Plan and Disclosure Statement filed by Debtors along with related issues regarding the causes of action to be assigned to the trust, status of winddown budget, and several matters related to trust formation and proposed counsel	0.70	\$ 525.00
3/11/14	C. Reardon	Email exchanges with David Swan regarding various open matters	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/12/14	C. Reardon	Email exchange with David Swan regarding update on communications with Craig Boucher	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/20/14	C. Reardon	Voicemail and email exchange with Craig Boucher	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/21/14	C. Reardon	Telephone call with David Swan regarding status of plan related issues	0.20	\$ 150.00
3/24/14	C. Reardon	Review emails forwarded by David Swan	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/27/14	C. Reardon	Review email exchanges among counsel regarding various open priority and administrative claims	0.10	\$ 75.00
Disclosure Statement and Plan			1.40	\$ 1,050.00

Petitions, Schedules and Financial Reports

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Fee</u>
3/10/14	C. Reardon	Email exchanges with Craig Boucher regarding winddown budget and status of fee payments	0.20	\$ 150.00

Petitions, Schedules and Financial Reports			0.20	\$ 150.00
---	--	--	-------------	------------------

Professional Retention and Fee Matters

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Fee</u>
3/19/14	C. Reardon	Review draft of 1st interim fee request	0.30	\$ 225.00
3/19/14	C. Reardon	Review comments on 1st interim fee request received from Morris Nichols	0.10	\$ 75.00
3/19/14	C. Reardon	Review revised 1st interim fee request to reflect comments from counsel	0.20	\$ 150.00

Professional Retention and Fee Matters			0.60	\$ 450.00
---	--	--	-------------	------------------

Totals for Matter			3.20	\$ 2,400.00
--------------------------	--	--	-------------	--------------------