

EXHIBIT A**COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY****Velti, Inc.****(Case No. 13-12878 (PJW))****March 1, 2014 through April 30, 2014**

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Creditor Communications and Meetings	.4	\$223.00
Fee Applications (MNAT – Filing)	7.0	2,339.50
Fee Applications (Others – Filing)	13.5	5,491.50
Fee Applications (MNAT – Objections)	1.5	492.00
Fee Applications (Others – Objections)	2.6	800.00
Court Hearings	4.7	1,929.50
Claims Objections and Administration	1.4	749.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.7	1,037.00
Litigation/Adversary Proceedings	.1	61.00
Professional Retention (Others-Objections)	7.2	4,367.50
TOTAL	40.1	\$17,490.00

TIME ENTRIES

INDEX	ID	LAST NAME	DATE	STAT	TASK	BILLED HOURS	BILLED AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION
Creditor Communications and Meetings								
3252604	338	Werkheiser	04/10/14	B	B150	0.30	183.00	Conference with D Swan, L Richendorfer and others re Mobclix chapter 7 trustee issues.
3256395	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/16/14	B	B150	0.10	40.00	Call from creditor re: claim
Total Task: B150						0.40	223.00	
Fee Applications (MNAT - Filing)								
3255949	338	Werkheiser	03/07/14	B	B160	0.20	122.00	Emails with C Chung re MNAT fee issue
3229447	338	Werkheiser	03/14/14	B	B160	0.10	61.00	Review and respond to W Alleman email re quarterly fee app.
3256004	338	Werkheiser	03/17/14	B	B160	0.30	183.00	Review and comment on MNAT first quarterly fee app and emails with W Alleman re same.
3235804	594	Conway	03/20/14	B	B160	0.50	125.00	Discuss MNAT Feb 2014 fee app w/W. Alleman (.1); revise, prep for efile and efile w/the court (.3); discuss svc w/T. Naimoli (.1)
3254877	594	Conway	04/15/14	B	B160	0.10	25.00	Extract cno re MNAT Feb 2014 fee app in preparation for quarterly fee hearing
3231693	605	Naimoli	03/17/14	B	B160	0.30	43.50	Review email from W. Alleman (.1); Prepare, efile & serve First Interim Fee Application Request of Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP for the Period November 12, 2013 Through January 31, 2014 (.2)
3228233	684	Maddox	03/13/14	B	B160	0.60	150.00	Draft 1st quarterly MNAT fee app (.5); emails with B. Alleman re asme (.1)
3228879	684	Maddox	03/14/14	B	B160	0.10	25.00	Meeting with B. Alleman re interim fee app
3228941	684	Maddox	03/14/14	B	B160	0.40	100.00	Revise 1st quarterly fee application
3229223	684	Maddox	03/14/14	B	B160	0.20	50.00	Further revise quarterly fee app of MNAT (.1); emails with B. Alleman re same (.1)
3231255	684	Maddox	03/17/14	B	B160	0.10	25.00	Draft COS re MNAT quarterly fee app
3231853	684	Maddox	03/18/14	B	B160	0.30	75.00	Emails with G. Werkhesier re Feb fee app (.1); review pro forma re: Feb time (.2)
3231887	684	Maddox	03/18/14	B	B160	0.20	50.00	Revise MNAT Feb pro forma
3231894	684	Maddox	03/18/14	B	B160	0.20	50.00	Draft notice and COS re MNAT Feb fee app
3231904	684	Maddox	03/18/14	B	B160	0.30	75.00	Draft MNAT Feb fee app (.2); emails with B. Alleman re same (.1)
3234595	684	Maddox	03/19/14	B	B160	0.10	25.00	Revise MNAT fee app, notice and COS
3235491	684	Maddox	03/20/14	B	B160	0.30	75.00	Revise COS and notice re MNAT fee app (.1); revise MNAT fee app (.2)

3228825	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B160	0.50	200.00	Review/revise draft MNAT quarterly fee application
3228239	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B160	0.10	40.00	Review interim comp order and e-mail M. Maddox re: same
3228880	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/14/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	Conf. with M. Maddox re: revisions to MNAT quarterly fee app
3229216	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/14/14	B	B160	0.30	120.00	Review and revise revised MNAT quarterly fee app
3229227	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/14/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	E-mail G. Werkheiser re: MNAT 1st quarterly fee app
3231665	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/17/14	B	B160	0.30	120.00	Coordinate filing and service of MNAT quarterly fee app
3231883	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/18/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	Review/revise MNAT fee app proforma
3231884	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/18/14	B	B160	0.10	40.00	Call with M. Maddox re: MNAT Feb. fee app
3234429	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/18/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	Review and comment on draft MNAT fee app
3235255	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B160	0.10	40.00	Revise MNAT Feb. application per G. Werkheiser comments
3234695	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	Review/revise updated MNAT Feb. application; call with M. Maddox re: same
3235041	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B160	0.10	40.00	Conf. with G. Werkheiser re: MNAT monthly fee app and Asgaard quarterly app
3235744	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/20/14	B	B160	0.20	80.00	Coordinate filing of MNAT Feb application and conf. with M. Maddox re: same

Total Task: B160 7.00 2,339.50

Fee Applications (Others - Filing)

3255844	338	Werkheiser	03/02/14	B	B165	0.10	61.00	Review and respond to C Jang email re call with Debtors to discuss professional fees.
3229589	338	Werkheiser	03/03/14	B	B165	0.90	549.00	Prepare for and attend TC with D Swan, D Foley, R Chesley, C Jang re professional fees and funding case exit.
3255942	338	Werkheiser	03/07/14	B	B165	0.20	122.00	Investigate Debtors' nonpayment of approved fees.
3256029	338	Werkheiser	03/18/14	B	B165	0.30	183.00	Review and respond to C Reardon email re Debtors' short pay of Asgaard and related issues.
3255385	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B165	1.20	732.00	Prepare for and attend TC with D Swan, C Reardon, Asgaard counsel and others re Debtors' nonpayment of Asgaard fees, Deloitte situation and related issues.
3256041	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B165	0.50	305.00	Review and comment on Asgaard quarterly application and email C Reardon and M Duedall re same.
3256044	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B165	0.20	122.00	Coordinate filing and service of Asgaard quarterly fee request and email W Alleman re same.
3257167	594	Conway	04/17/14	B	B165	0.40	100.00	Review and respond to email of W. Alleman re notice and cos of McGuireWoods (.1); draft notice and cos and forward to W. Alleman for review (.2); prep application for efilng w/the Court (.1)

3257404	594	Conway	04/17/14	B	B165	0.50	125.00	Review further email from W. Alleman w/attachments of McGuireWoods March 2014 fee app (.1); review and prep documents for efilng and efile Application w/the Court (.3); discuss svc w/wp (.1)
3258198	594	Conway	04/21/14	B	B165	0.10	25.00	Extract, review and calendar March 2014 fee app of McGuireWoods
3258211	594	Conway	04/21/14	B	B165	0.10	25.00	Extract, review and calendar March 2014 fee app of Asgaard Capital
3231692	605	Naimoli	03/17/14	B	B165	0.30	43.50	Review email from W. Alleman (.1); Prepare, efile & serve First Interim Fee Application of McGuireWoods LLP for the Period November 12, 2013 Through January 31, 2014 (.2)
3235269	605	Naimoli	03/19/14	B	B165	0.30	43.50	Review email from W. Alleman (.1); Prepare, efile & serve First Interim Fee Application of Asgaard Capital LLC for the Period November 13, 2013 through January 31, 2014 (.2)
3235398	605	Naimoli	03/19/14	B	B165	0.40	58.00	Review email from W. Alleman (.1); Prepare, efile & serve the Fourth Monthly Application of Asgaard Capital LLC for the Period February 1, 2014 through February 28, 2014 (.3)
3256848	605	Naimoli	04/16/14	B	B165	0.50	72.50	Review email from W. Alleman (.1); Prepare, efile & serve Fifth Monthly Application of Asgaard Capital LLC for the Period March 1, 2014 through March 31, 2014 (.4)
3231464	684	Maddox	03/17/14	B	B165	0.10	25.00	Draft COS re McGuire quarterly fee app
3236488	684	Maddox	03/21/14	B	B165	0.40	100.00	File and serve McGuire fee app (.3); emails with B. Alleman re same (.1)
3225553	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/10/14	B	B165	1.50	600.00	Review and comment on Capstone fee application
3228214	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mail from D. Swan and respond re: interim fee applications
3229244	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/14/14	B	B165	0.20	80.00	Call from S. Cornell re: interim fee application question
3230032	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/17/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mails with S. Cornell, D. Swan, M. Duedall re: interim fee applications
3231365	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/17/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mail S. Cornell in response to question about interim fee apps
3231638	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/17/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mails with M. Duedall re: Asgaard interim fee application
3231666	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/17/14	B	B165	0.50	200.00	Review and coordinate filing McGuire Woods fee application
3234383	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/18/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	Call from G. Werkheiser re: Asgaard fee app issues and review multiple e-mails re: same
3234693	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B165	0.80	320.00	Attend call with Committee professionals re: fee applications
3235340	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B165	0.50	200.00	Review and comment on Asgaard fee app and e-mail M. Duedall re: comments (.3); coordinate filing and service of revised app (.2)
3235044	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B165	0.70	280.00	Review and comment on Asgaard quarterly fee app
3235141	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B165	0.20	80.00	Review and coordinate filing and service of Asgaard quarterly fee application
3236360	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/21/14	B	B165	0.40	160.00	Review and comment on MW monthly fee application
3236481	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/21/14	B	B165	0.30	120.00	Coordinate filing and service of MW Feb. fee app
3249743	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/07/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mail S. Brown re: omnibus fee order

3251760	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/09/14	B	B165	0.10	40.00	E-mail C. Jang re: omnibus fee order
3252227	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/09/14	B	B165	0.20	80.00	Review and comment on omnibus fee order
3256595	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/16/14	B	B165	0.70	280.00	Review and coordinate filing and service of Asgaard fee app
3257447	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/17/14	B	B165	0.30	120.00	Review and coordinate filing and service of MW fee app
Total Task: B165						13.50	5,491.50	
Fee Applications (MNAT - Objections)								
3255970	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B170	0.10	61.00	Respond to M Maddox email re CNO for MNAT fee app.
3273544	338	Werkheiser	04/14/14	B	B170	0.10	61.00	Review and respond to A Conway email re CNO for MNAT fee app.
3253923	594	Conway	04/14/14	B	B170	0.20	50.00	Review docket re objs to MNAT Feb fee app (.1); email to G. Werkheiser and W. Alleman re drafting CNO re same (.1)
3254154	594	Conway	04/14/14	B	B170	0.30	75.00	Review MNAT Feb fee app and draft cno (.2); email to W. Alleman for review (.1)
3254191	594	Conway	04/14/14	B	B170	0.20	50.00	Efile cno re MNAT Feb fee app
3227382	684	Maddox	03/12/14	B	B170	0.10	25.00	Draft CNO re: MNAT Jan fee app
3227468	684	Maddox	03/12/14	B	B170	0.10	25.00	Emails with B. Alleman re MNAT Jan fee CNO
3227702	684	Maddox	03/12/14	B	B170	0.10	25.00	File CNO re Monthly Application for Compensation (Second) of Morris, Nichols, Arshnt & Tunnell LLP, as Delaware Co-Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, for Allowance of Interim Compensation and for Interim Reimbursement of All Actual and Necessary Expenses Incurred for the period January 1, 2014 to January 31, 2014
3227467	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/12/14	B	B170	0.10	40.00	Review MNAT fee app CNO
3253945	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/14/14	B	B170	0.10	40.00	E-mails with A. Conway re: MNAT CNO
3254186	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/14/14	B	B170	0.10	40.00	Review and coordinate filing of MNAT fee app CNO
Total Task: B170						1.50	492.00	
Fee Applications (Other - Objections)								
3252857	594	Conway	04/10/14	B	B175	0.20	50.00	Review docket re objs to Fourth fee app of Asgaard for Feb. (.1); email to W. Alleman re drafting CNO (.1)
3252946	594	Conway	04/10/14	B	B175	0.20	50.00	Draft CNO re Asgaard Feb fee app and email to W. Alleman for review
3252962	594	Conway	04/10/14	B	B175	0.20	50.00	Prep CNO re Asgaard Feb fee app for filing and efile w/the Court
3255130	594	Conway	04/15/14	B	B175	0.40	100.00	Review and respond to email from W. Alleman re drafting cno re 4th monthly fee app of McGuireWoods (.1); review docket, extract application (.1); review app, draft cno and email to W. Alleman for review (.2)
3255183	594	Conway	04/15/14	B	B175	0.30	75.00	Prep for efilng and efile cno re McGuireWoods Feb monthly fee app (.2); email as filed to W. Alleman for submittal to counsel (.1)
3228127	684	Maddox	03/13/14	B	B175	0.10	25.00	Draft CNO re Asgaard Jan fee app

3228420	684	Maddox	03/13/14	B	B175	0.20	50.00	File McGuire Jan fee CNO (.1); file Asgaard Jan fee CNO (.1)
3228198	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	E-mail S. Cornell re: MW CNO
3228240	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	E-mail from M. Duedall and coordinate filing of Asgaard CNO
3228412	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	Review and coordinate filing of MW fee app CNO
3228449	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	E-mail M. Duedall re: as-filed Asgaard CNO
3228196	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B175	0.20	80.00	Review/revise Asgaard CNO and e-mail M. Duedall re: same
3252949	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/10/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	Review and coordinate filing of Asgaard CNO
3252937	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/10/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	E-mail M. Duedall re: Asgaard CNO
3253183	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/11/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	Review and comment on MGW fee app CNO and e-mails with S. Cornell re: same
3255146	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/15/14	B	B175	0.10	40.00	Coordinate filing of MW CNO

Total Task: B175 2.60 800.00

Court Hearings

3273543	338	Werkheiser	04/08/14	B	B300	0.30	183.00	Review agenda and emails with A Conway re prep for 4/10 hearing.
3252599	338	Werkheiser	04/10/14	B	B300	1.20	732.00	Prepare for hearing.
3252600	338	Werkheiser	04/10/14	B	B300	0.20	122.00	Confer with D Swan re hearing.
3252602	338	Werkheiser	04/10/14	B	B300	0.60	366.00	Attend hearing.
3255246	560	Tate	04/09/14	B	B300	0.70	101.50	Discuss extract of pleadings w/A. Conway re: April 10th hearing (.10) re: review docket and extract pleadings (.60)
3250424	594	Conway	04/08/14	B	B300	0.20	50.00	Review docket re notice of agenda, extract, review and email to W. Alleman and G. Werkheiser re binder of matters
3251046	594	Conway	04/08/14	B	B300	0.20	50.00	Review email from G. Werkheiser re extraction of certain matters re April 10th hearing (.1); extract agenda (.1)
3251047	594	Conway	04/08/14	B	B300	0.20	50.00	Review and respond to further email of G. Werkheiser re additional matters re April 10th hearing and extract
3251767	594	Conway	04/09/14	B	B300	0.70	175.00	Review docket and extract pleadings re April 10th hearing (.6); discuss assistance w/same w/S. Tate (.1)
3251769	594	Conway	04/09/14	B	B300	0.30	75.00	Prepare hearing binder for G. Werkheiser re April 10th hearing
3225366	684	Maddox	03/10/14	B	B300	0.10	25.00	Emails with B. Alleman re agenda and Jefferies fee app

Total Task: B300 4.70 1,929.50

Claims Objections and Administration

3229554	338	Werkheiser	03/11/14	B	B310	0.10	61.00	Confer with W Alleman re bar date issue.
3255821	338	Werkheiser	03/31/14	B	B310	0.50	305.00	Review C Jang email re Yellowpages request to file late claim, review proposed POC and email D Swan re same.

3276524	338	Werkheiser	04/07/14	B	B310	0.30	183.00	TC with C Jang re motion to extend bar date and emails with D Swan and C Jang re same.
3226992	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/11/14	B	B310	0.20	80.00	Review proofs of claims received and e-mail S. Cornell re: same
3227090	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/11/14	B	B310	0.10	40.00	Conf. with G. Werkheiser and e-mail S. Cornell re: bar date issues
3228121	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/13/14	B	B310	0.10	40.00	E-mails with S. Cornell re: bar dates
3249671	964	Alleman, Jr.	04/07/14	B	B310	0.10	40.00	Review motion to extend bar date, motion to shorten same, and notice of hearing
Total Task: B310						1.40	749.00	
Plan and Disclosure Statement								
3255846	338	Werkheiser	03/02/14	B	B320	0.10	61.00	Review D Swan email re comments on plan structure.
3255828	338	Werkheiser	03/31/14	B	B320	0.10	61.00	Review and respond to D Swan email re call to review DS hearing issues.
3273563	338	Werkheiser	04/01/14	B	B320	0.40	244.00	Review UST email of comments on plan and DS and emails from D Swan and R Chesley re same.
3273564	338	Werkheiser	04/02/14	B	B320	1.10	671.00	Prepare for and attend TC with D Swan and Debtor professionals re plan/DS issues and Deloitte retention issues.
Total Task: B320						1.70	1,037.00	
Litigation/Adversary Proceedings								
3259981	338	Werkheiser	04/14/14	B	B330	0.10	61.00	TC with E Schnitzer re potential preference actions issue
Total Task: B330						0.10	61.00	
Professional Retention (Others - Objections)								
3237339	221	Schwartz	03/19/14	B	B370	0.60	381.00	Tele. w\ G. Werkheiser (and in part w\ R. Young) re: Deloitte retention issues
3239058	221	Schwartz	03/20/14	B	B370	0.10	63.50	Review G. Werkheiser email re: Deloitte retention issues
3226306	338	Werkheiser	03/11/14	B	B370	0.60	366.00	Review court filings re Deloitte retention (.2); review emails re same (.1); and TC with D Swan re same (.3).
3228714	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	TC with D Abbott re Deloitte dispute and possible resolutions.
3228722	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	0.30	183.00	TC with Chun Jang re Deloitte dispute.
3228725	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	0.30	183.00	TC with D Swan re Deloitte dispute.
3228726	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	TC with D Buchbinder re Deloitte dispute.
3255976	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	0.40	244.00	Emails with D Swan re discussions with Debtors about Deloitte retention dispute and possible settlement options.
3229622	338	Werkheiser	03/12/14	B	B370	1.50	915.00	Research re Deloitte retention dispute.
3255986	338	Werkheiser	03/13/14	B	B370	0.40	244.00	Email C Jang re Werner materials for use in Deloitte dispute.
3255993	338	Werkheiser	03/13/14	B	B370	0.30	183.00	Emails with D Foley and D Swan re Deloitte dispute and next steps.

3255634	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B370	0.60	366.00	TC with E Schwartz and R Young (partial) re Deloitte retention dispute.
3256036	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B370	0.40	244.00	Research re Deloitte issues.
3256037	338	Werkheiser	03/19/14	B	B370	0.10	61.00	Email D Swan re Deloitte contact.
3256046	338	Werkheiser	03/20/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	TC with R Chesley re Deloitte status.
3256047	338	Werkheiser	03/20/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	Email D Swan re summary of discussions with Debtors on Deloitte status.
3256054	338	Werkheiser	03/20/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	TC with B Hackman re Deloitte situation.
3256055	338	Werkheiser	03/21/14	B	B370	0.10	61.00	Email D Swan re Deloitte.
3255679	338	Werkheiser	03/24/14	B	B370	0.10	61.00	Review and respond to D Swan email re Deloitte situation.
3276490	338	Werkheiser	04/02/14	B	B370	0.20	122.00	Emails with D Swan re Deloitte situation.
3234714	964	Alleman, Jr.	03/19/14	B	B370	0.20	80.00	Research re: Deloitte issues and e-mail G. Werkheiser re: same

Total Task: B370 7.20 4,367.50

FEE SUBTOTAL 40.10 17,490.00