

EXHIBIT D

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation, et al.**Berkeley Research Group, LLC****Exhibit D: Time Detail**

For the Period 6/1/2016 through 8/31/2016

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|--|---------------------|--------------|--|
| 05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation | | | |
| 6/7/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Edited third interim fee application. |
| 6/8/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.2 | Continued editing third interim fee application. |
| 6/8/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.1 | Continued editing third interim fee application. |
| 6/8/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.7 | Continued editing third interim fee application. |
| 6/9/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.3 | Prepared third interim fee application. |
| 6/9/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Reviewed comment on third interim fee application. |
| 6/15/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Continued editing third interim fee application. |
| 6/15/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Made edits to the 3rd Interim Fee application. |
| 6/15/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.2 | Reviewed March - May fee application. |
| 6/16/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.7 | Prepared March-May fee application. |
| 6/16/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Reviewed third interim fee application. |
| 6/27/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Prepared draft order for third interim period. |
| 6/30/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.4 | Developed response to US Trustee regarding the Third Interim Fee Application. |
| 7/8/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Reviewed June fee application. |
| 7/13/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Prepared draft order for third interim application for fees. |
| 7/14/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Read proposed form of order regarding disposition of the USTO's fee objection. |
| Task Code | Total Hours | 6.6 | |

07. Interaction/Meetings with Debtors/Counsel

| | | | |
|-----------|-------------|-----|---|
| 6/28/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.1 | Participated in call with Debtors' Counsel (B. Snow) to discuss claims resolution issues. |
|-----------|-------------|-----|---|

Berkeley Research Group, LLC

Invoice for the 6/1/2016 - 8/31/2016 Period

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|--|--------------|------------|--|
| 07. Interaction/Meetings with Debtors/Counsel | | | |
| 7/7/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.6 | Participated in call with Debtors (J. Nash, Deloitte; S. Rosenblatt, Butler Snow) and claims agent (B. Daniel, BMC) to discuss claims. |
| 7/13/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Read communications on claims classifications from Debtor Counsel. |
| 7/20/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed Meadowlark LLC draft engagement letter. |
| 8/11/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Reviewed correspondence from Debtor Counsel re: open items for confirmation. |
| 8/25/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Read Counsel's update report. |
| 8/30/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Read correspondence from Counsel re: confirmation issues. |
| Task Code Total Hours | | 2.9 | |
| 08. Interaction/Meetings with Creditors | | | |
| 6/1/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Spoke with Counsel (D. Meek, Burr Forman) regarding status of case. |
| 6/1/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Prepared agenda for call with Counsel (Burr Forman). |
| 6/29/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Communicated amongst case professionals re: fee objection. |
| 7/12/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Corresponded re: POR issues with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) |
| 7/13/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Communicated with Counsel regarding fee objections. |
| 7/22/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.5 | Communicated amongst case professionals re: revisions to trust agreement. |
| 7/29/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.4 | Prepared various communications re: terms of trust agreement. |
| 8/10/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.6 | Prepared for conference call with Committee and Counsel by reviewing recent correspondence and notes. |
| 8/10/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Participated in UCC call with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) to discuss case update with Committee. |
| 8/10/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Participated in call with Burr Forman (D. Meek) to discuss professional liability coverage. |
| 8/10/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Participated in conference call with Committee to provide an update on case status. |
| 8/10/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Participated in conference call with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) to discuss case issues and confirmation. |
| 8/26/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Reviewed email from Counsel on case status. |

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|--|---------------------|--------------|---|
| 08. Interaction/Meetings with Creditors | | | |
| Task Code Total Hours | | 4.2 | |
| 11. Claim Analysis/Accounting | | | |
| 6/30/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed Kerley employee claims and objection. |
| 7/15/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Reviewed drafts of employee claims rejections. |
| 7/18/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.8 | Reviewed filed form of employee claims objections. |
| 8/1/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed claims objections listing. |
| 8/2/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed response to claims objection. |
| Task Code Total Hours | | 2.3 | |
| 22. Preference/Avoidance Actions | | | |
| 6/1/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Reviewed proposed avoidance action counsel. |
| 6/30/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed preference payment data provided by Debtor Counsel. |
| 6/30/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Reviewed avoidance action spreadsheet. |
| 8/30/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Read proposed settlement of refund recovery. |
| 8/31/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Read communications re: the potential recovery of avoidance action. |
| Task Code Total Hours | | 1.2 | |
| 27. Plan of Reorganization/Disclosure Statement | | | |
| 6/1/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed scope responsibilities of plan trustee. |
| 6/6/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.8 | Reviewed objections to plan of reorganization. |
| 6/6/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.4 | Reviewed brief in support of adversary proceeding. |
| 6/8/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Reviewed AIG objection to plan of reorganization. |
| 6/14/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Reviewed objection from ACE to the POR. |
| 6/22/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.8 | Analyzed claims data to determine cutoff for GUC allowance. |
| 6/23/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Reviewed monthly operating reports for March and April 2016 to determine cash consumption trends ahead of confirmation. |
| 6/30/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed amended plan and disclosure statement. |

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|--|--------------|-------|---|
| 27. Plan of Reorganization/Disclosure Statement | | | |
| 7/1/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.7 | Reviewed plan of reorganization draft. |
| 7/5/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.9 | Noted items pertaining to the plan and disclosure statement to discuss with Counsel and staff. |
| 7/8/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Read draft objections relating to employee compensation. |
| 7/8/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Read correspondence relating to voting and balloting. |
| 7/8/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Read disclosure statement approval notice. |
| 7/8/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.1 | Reviewed confirmation order draft prepared by Debtor Counsel. |
| 7/11/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Reviewed sample ballot and correspondence from claims processor. |
| 7/13/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed creditor solicitation report from claims processor. |
| 7/13/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Reviewed claims to understand voting class participation. |
| 7/15/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Reviewed correspondence among claims agent (BMC) and Debtor Counsel (S. Rosenblatt) discussing final claims counts. |
| 7/20/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.7 | Reviewed Liquidation Trust Agreement. |
| 7/20/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.6 | Reviewed plan documents, including trust arrangements. |
| 7/20/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Prepared email to internal Counsel regarding key terms of the liquidation trust agreement. |
| 7/21/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 2.3 | Reviewed MPC Trust agreement. |
| 7/21/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.8 | Made edits to liquidation trust agreement. |
| 7/21/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Composed email to E. Ordway, M. Tenenbaum, and Counsel regarding plan trustee agreement. |
| 7/22/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Spoke with insurance brokers at Marsh to discuss D&O for Plan. |
| 7/22/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.4 | Commented on latest draft of the Trust Agreement. |
| 7/22/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Read revised drafts of trustee agreement. |
| 7/22/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.3 | Reviewed new draft of liquidation trust agreement. |
| 7/28/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Read stipulation of Debtors for ACE insurance. |
| 7/28/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Conducted first review of Liquidation Trust Agreement comments from Committee members. |

| Date | Professional | Hours | Description |
|--|---------------------|--------------|---|
| 27. Plan of Reorganization/Disclosure Statement | | | |
| 7/29/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.5 | Reviewed trust agreement and noted items to discuss re: Trust agreement. |
| 8/2/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.1 | Reviewed claims data in anticipation of trustee work. |
| 8/3/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Read Debtor Counsels' edits to trust agreement. |
| 8/4/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed workers compensation motion. |
| 8/4/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Spoke with Marsh brokers to discuss placing D&O for Plan. |
| 8/5/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.2 | Reviewed trust agreement to determine risks for insurance coverage. |
| 8/5/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.2 | Researched internal policies and experience on D&O. |
| 8/16/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.7 | Reviewed responses to objections. |
| 8/17/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.4 | Read stipulation and order regarding ACE insurance objection. |
| 8/19/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Read various court filings relating to confirmation. |
| 8/23/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 1.1 | Reviewed various orders on objections of the Debtors. |
| 8/25/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.3 | Responded to questions from other professionals regarding insurance for Trustee. |
| 8/29/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.8 | Reviewed pleadings and related emails relating to Chemours objection. |
| 8/29/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.2 | Reviewed various communications regarding confirmation issues. |
| 8/30/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed Debtors' draft liquidation analysis. |
| 8/30/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.4 | Reviewed Trustee objections to POR and commented on same. |
| 8/31/2016 | S. Tajuddin | 0.5 | Reviewed billing details for case to date period to determine forecasted balances for liquidation analysis. |
| 8/31/2016 | M. Haverkamp | 0.4 | Prepared outstanding fees estimate for liquidation analysis. |
| 8/31/2016 | E. Ordway | 0.3 | Reviewed communications amongst professionals re: liquidation analysis |
| Task Code | Total Hours | 26.8 | |
| Total Hours | | 44.0 | |