

BUTLER | SNOW

		(1/2 time)				
06/16/16	TMH	Review MORs for March and April 2016	0.40	B110	A104	76.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re January, February and March MORs	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/16/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with R. Kerley re executing the March 2016 MORs	0.20	B110	A106	33.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Revise April 2016 MORs for all 3 entities	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/16/16	VGJ	Receipt, review and assemble the March 2016 MORs for all 3 entities and electronically file same with Court	1.70	B110	A111	280.50
06/17/16	CHM	Review/analyze SOFAs in connection with amendment to Schedule 5.1.3 of Plan	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/17/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re finalizing monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/17/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title regarding title commitment.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/17/16	SWR	Work on narrative for May monthly operating reports	0.40	B110	A103	196.00
06/17/16	SWR	Work on changes to Schedule 5.13 per the Committee's request	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding information regarding transfers to	0.30	B180	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		insiders				
06/17/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt re payments to insiders	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Retrieve information on payments to insiders for S. Rosenblatt	0.30	B110	A110	49.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Finalize, assemble and electronically file the March 2016 MORs for all 3 entities with the court.	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Finalize and assemble April 2016 Monthly Operating Reports for all 3 entities and email to R. Kerley for approval	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/20/16	CHM	Review proposed order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/20/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to plan	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
06/20/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC re solicitation procedures	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
06/20/16	JLG	Update title to plant site	2.00	B250	A104	670.00
06/20/16	JMC	Work on review of certain documents in connection with McCain Engineering subpoena to David Phelps.	0.30	B190	A104	58.50
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize generic order approving disclosure statement	0.50	B110	A103	245.00
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize changes to First Amended Disclosure Statement	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize changes to First Amended Joint Plan	1.80	B320	A103	882.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with VJ Barham regarding update	0.30	B320	A105	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		index for First Amended Joint Plan				
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding developments in case	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed generic order approving disclosure statement	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree (counsel for AIG) regarding First Amended Joint Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding status report on disclosure statement hearing	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/21/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel re plan confirmation issues	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/21/16	SWR	Work on Schedule 5.13 to First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Work on order approving First Amended Disclosure Statement	0.70	B320	A103	343.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding solicitation materials and procedures	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Kate Heitzenrater regarding order resolving objection of ACE Insurance Companies	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding First Amended Plan and Disclosure	0.20	B320	A107	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Statement				
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding solicitation materials for First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding solicitation issues	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Lammert regarding status report on disclosure statement hearing	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
06/21/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
06/22/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/22/16	SWR	Work on exhibit to First Amended Plan	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Jon Nash regarding amended January monthly operating report and United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee regarding first quarterly United States Trustee fees and amended monthly operating report for January 2016	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding approval of Order approving disclosure statement and related matters	0.20	B110	A107	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding revised plan and disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for objecting parties and interested parties regarding order approving disclosure statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with BMC Group regarding claims analysis, solicitation procedures, and coordination with counsel for Committee	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/22/16	VGJ	Finalize and electronically file the April 2016 Monthly Operating Reports with the Court for all 3 entities	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/23/16	CHM	Review/analyze proofs of claim filed by ACE and Westchester	0.40	B310	A104	154.00
06/23/16	VGJ	Prepare revisions to January 2016 MOR to reflect proper cash disbursements	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/23/16	VGJ	Revise Exhibit "A" to Section 5.13 of Plan	0.60	B110	A111	99.00
06/24/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to plan and disclosure statement	0.70	B320	A104	269.50
06/24/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to order approving disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A104	77.00
06/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree, Kate Heitzenrater, and Marc Solomon regarding approval of order	0.50	B320	A107	245.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		approving disclosure statement				
06/25/16	SWR	Work on Schedule 5.13 to First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
06/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with interested parties regarding generic order approving disclosure statement and First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/27/16	CHM	Review proofs of claim of employees for severance claims	0.50	B310	A104	192.50
06/27/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/27/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to plan and disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/27/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the liquidation survey re final survey and deeds	0.20	B130	A107	77.00
06/27/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel re disclosure statement and solicitation procedures	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
06/27/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title about deeds to trusts and exceptions list.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/27/16	SWR	Review correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater and proof of claim of ACE Insurance Companies	0.30	B310	A104	147.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ray Carter regarding status of 320-acre parcel	0.30	B130	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for MPC Liquidation Trustee and counsel for AIG regarding pending issues regarding transfer of policies	0.40	B130	A107	196.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proof of claim of ACE Insurance Companies	0.20	B310	A107	98.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Connie Benedictos of AIG regarding updated contacts for MPC	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/27/16	SWR	Review correspondence with Linda Zwicker regarding AIG claims data	0.30	B120	A108	147.00
06/27/16	TMH	Correspondence with Trustmark regarding escrow account	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
06/28/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with BMC and committee counsel re balloting, noticing and claim objections	0.80	B320	A107	308.00
06/28/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC and committee counsel re solicitation matters	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/28/16	SWR	Prepare language for amended January 2016 monthly operating report	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
06/28/16	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objections to severance claims	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
06/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee	0.20	B110	A107	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		regarding conference call with BMC to discuss solicitation issues				
06/28/16	SWR	Extended conference call with professionals for Committee, BMC, and Debtors regarding plan solicitation issues	1.10	B110	A107	539.00
06/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ray Carter of Mississippi Secretary of State regarding status of 320-acre parcel	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
06/28/16	TMH	Correspondence with counsel for CSX regarding filing of claim for rejection damages	0.10	B320	A107	19.00
06/28/16	TMH	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Committee and BMC for matters involving the plan and disclosure statement	1.70	B320	A107	323.00
06/28/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re amended January Operating Report	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/28/16	VGJ	Conference call with S. Rosenblatt, C. Maddux, T. Hewitt, J. Nash, B. Daniel re Plan, Ballots and claims	1.10	B110	A108	181.50
06/28/16	VGJ	Prepare Amended January 2016 Monthly Operating Report and forward to R. Kerley for approval and execution	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
06/28/16	VGJ	Revisions to Exhibit to Schedule 5.3	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/29/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust re closing matters and finalizing deeds	0.40	B130	A107	154.00

BUTLER | SNOW

06/29/16	JLG	Research past title reports and provide abstractor with needed information and tax records.	1.20	B250	A102	402.00
06/29/16	JLG	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding recording of deeds and trust agreements.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/29/16	SWR	Review notice of delinquent property taxes filed by Jackson County Chancery Clerk in bankruptcy cases	0.50	B240	A104	245.00
06/29/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objections to severance claims	0.30	B310	A105	147.00
06/29/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding inapplicability of omnibus objection for severance claims	0.30	B310	A105	147.00
06/29/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding updates to Schedule 5.13	0.30	B320	A105	147.00
06/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with local counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding deeds for conveyance of property	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
06/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding revised Schedule 5.13	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/29/16	TMH	Research use of omnibus objections within Federal and local rules of bankruptcy	0.20	B310	A102	38.00

BUTLER | SNOW

06/29/16	TMH	Review employee proof of claims for filing objections	1.00	B310	A102	190.00
06/29/16	TMH	Draft omnibus objection to no liability claims	1.80	B310	A103	342.00
06/29/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re closing documents	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
06/29/16	VGJ	Interoffice communication with S. Rosenblatt re revisions to Schedule 5.13 - Exhibit A to Plan	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/29/16	VGJ	Review of various objections to claims and forms	1.00	B110	A111	165.00
06/29/16	VGJ	Continue revisions to Schedule 5.13 - Exhibit A to Plan and prepare Word format copy	2.50	B110	A111	412.50
06/30/16	CHM	Review/analyze notice filed by Jackson County with respect to tax sale	0.30	B310	A104	115.50
06/30/16	CHM	Review/analyze claims, business records and prior correspondence regarding termination of severance plan	0.50	B310	A104	192.50
06/30/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC regarding status of claims review and analysis of same	0.20	B310	A108	77.00
06/30/16	JLG	Update title and provide new information to title company.	2.00	B250	A103	670.00
06/30/16	JLG	Conference with abstractor regarding title work	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/30/16	SWR	Work on objection to severance claims	0.60	B310	A103	294.00
06/30/16	SWR	Work on and finalize	0.60	B320	A103	294.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		joint plan and disclosure statement				
06/30/16	SWR	Review notices of maturities of tax sales and deadline for redemption of property	0.40	B240	A104	196.00
06/30/16	SWR	Review Kerley proofs of claim	0.30	B310	A104	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Conference with Velvet Johnson regarding details on tax sales and 2015 redemptions	0.30	B240	A105	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding finalize and file First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A105	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding upload of generic order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A105	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding requested documentation	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with local counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding deeds and exhibits	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and counsel for Environmental Trustee regarding notices of maturity of tax sales for 2013 taxes.	0.30	B240	A107	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding Kerley claims for severance and	0.30	B310	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		indemnification				
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding claims analysis and solicitation and Kerley claim	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/30/16	SWR	Review notices from Jackson County chancery clerk regarding 2013 ad valorem taxes received in the mail	0.30	B240	A108	147.00
06/30/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claims form to be used for all objections	1.70	B310	A103	323.00
06/30/16	TMH	Review all claims filed by employees for future objections	0.60	B310	A104	114.00
06/30/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re Delinquent Tax Notices	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
06/30/16	VGJ	Retrieve information and spreadsheets on 2012, 2013 and 2014 ad valorem taxes for S. Rosenblatt	0.50	B110	A110	82.50
06/30/16	VGJ	Assemble proposed Order Approving Disclosure Statement and electronically file with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
07/01/16	CHM	Review/analyze/finalize First Amended Joint Plan and First Amended disclosure statement	1.80	B320	A104	693.00
07/01/16	GCV	Review file for information re severance plan termination for Steve	0.40	B220	A104	144.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Rosenblatt and email correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt re same.				
07/01/16	PSM	Receipt and review of Amended Disclosure Statement with focus on Environmental Settlement Agreement and Committee Settlement Agreement as a basis for funding Plan.	2.00	L250	A104	590.00
07/01/16	SWR	Review and revise application to employ Meadowlark Advisors as successor CRO	0.70	B160	A103	343.00
07/01/16	SWR	Review and revise initial draft to proofs of claim for severance pay	0.50	B310	A103	245.00
07/01/16	SWR	Final revisions to plan and disclosure statement	1.60	B320	A103	784.00
07/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gilbert Van Loon regarding minutes and notice of MPC of termination of severance pay plan	0.20	B210	A105	98.00
07/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding engagement letter and application to employ Meadowlark Advisors as CRO	0.30	B160	A106	147.00
07/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Jon Nash regarding MPC minute book	0.20	B210	A106	98.00
07/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee and with CRO regarding objection to proofs of claim for severance	0.30	B310	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding compared versions of plan and disclosure statement and Schedule 5.13	0.40	B320	A108	196.00
07/01/16	TMH	Work on application to retain Meadowlark Advisors as CRO	0.80	B160	A103	152.00
07/01/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/01/16	TMH	Correspondence with G. Van Loon regarding severance plan	0.10	B110	A105	19.00
07/01/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re First Amended Plan and First Amended Disclosure Statement	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
07/01/16	VGJ	Assemble Amended Plan and Amended Disclosure Statement and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
07/05/16	SWR	Work on Order approving disclosure statement, fixing time for acceptances or rejections, and setting confirmation hearing date and time	0.80	B110	A103	392.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding order approving disclosure statement and setting conference hearing date	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding engagement letter for Meadowlark Advisors	0.30	B160	A105	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Mitch Carrington regarding response to McCain subpoena to David Phelps	0.20	B430	A105	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and professionals for Committee regarding confirmation hearing date and time	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ed Lawler regarding status report on plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Craig Geno and John Lammert regarding Jackson County notice of delinquent property taxes	0.30	B240	A107	147.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gordon Gouveia regarding McCain Engineering subpoena to David Phelps	0.20	B430	A107	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding solicitation procedures	0.40	B110	A108	196.00
07/05/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Christy Cannette regarding possible confirmation hearing dates	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
07/05/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Collette Derouen regarding court's standard order approving disclosure statement and setting confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A108	98.00
07/05/16	TMH	Work on engagement	0.90	B160	A103	171.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		letter for Meadowlark				
07/05/16	VGJ	Draft Order Approving Disclosure State and Setting Plan for Hearing	0.60	B110	A103	99.00
07/05/16	VGJ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt re proposed Orders to Withdraw	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
07/05/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A111	33.00
07/06/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A106	77.00
07/06/16	JMC	Correspondence with Shaw Fishman firm regarding subpoena of former officer of the debtors.	0.20	B190	A107	39.00
07/06/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding amended monthly operating report for February and March 2015	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and professionals for Committee regarding conference call to discuss solicitation procedures and issues	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
07/06/16	SWR	Telephone conference with John Lammert regarding 2013 ad valorem taxes to Jackson County	0.40	B240	A108	196.00
07/06/16	TMH	Research FCC from 603	0.20	B110	A102	38.00
07/06/16	TMH	Correspondence with Bob Ogle regarding letter from FCC for consummation of assignment/transfer of control application	0.30	B110	A104	57.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/06/16	TMH	Review letter from FCC for consummation of assignment/transfer of control application	0.30	B110	A104	57.00
07/06/16	VGJ	Finalize Amended MPC January 2016 MOR and electronically file same with Court	0.40	B110	A111	66.00
07/06/16	VGJ	Amend February and March 2016 MOR for MPC and electronically file same with Court	0.80	B110	A111	132.00
07/07/16	CHM	Review/analyze numerous proofs of claim and potential objections	1.80	B310	A104	693.00
07/07/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in extended conference call with management, BMC, committee professionals and internal team regarding solicitation procedures and claim objections	1.30	B320	A106	500.50
07/07/16	JMC	Work on gathering requested information in connection with subpoena of former officer of the Debtors.	0.80	B190	A107	156.00
07/07/16	JMC	Call with Gordon Gouveia regarding subpoena of former officer of the Debtors and other related matters.	0.30	B190	A107	58.50
07/07/16	SWR	Finalize order approving First Amended Disclosure Statement, fixing time for filing and objections, and notice of confirmation hearing	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
07/07/16	SWR	Work on omnibus objection to severance	1.80	B310	A103	882.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		claims				
07/07/16	SWR	Work on motion to permit omnibus objection under Rule 3007(c)	1.40	B310	A103	686.00
07/07/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Butler Snow team regarding work on items on list of open items by BMC Group	0.80	B110	A105	392.00
07/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding Aero Data invoice	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
07/07/16	SWR	Extended conference call with Jon Nash, professionals for Committee, Brad Daniel of BMC Group and Butler Snow team regarding review open items for solicitation procedures and issues and address same	1.10	B110	A107	539.00
07/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding deeds and invoice from Aero-Data	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
07/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group and professionals for Committee regarding late-filed claims	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
07/07/16	TMH	Conference call with BMC and Committee counsel to review claims and voting issues	1.10	B110	A101	209.00
07/07/16	TMH	Prepare for and attend meeting regarding claims in case	1.60	B310	A101	304.00
07/07/16	TMH	Work on employee claims spreadsheet to	0.50	B310	A103	95.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		reflect revisions made by BMC for severance or other employee claims				
07/07/16	VGJ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re claims	0.50	B110	A105	82.50
07/07/16	VGJ	Conference call with B. Daniel with BMC, S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re claims	1.10	B110	A108	181.50
07/07/16	VGJ	Organize claims notebook for objections review	1.50	B110	A110	247.50
07/08/16	CHM	Review/analyze draft objections to certain types of claims; related review/analysis of proofs of claim	0.90	B310	A104	346.50
07/08/16	CHM	Review proposed order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
07/08/16	DBC	Telephone conference with Tim Cantrell regarding trust fund earnings and payment of taxes thereon.	0.30	B410	A104	153.00
07/08/16	JLG	Review and discuss title update findings with abstractor.	0.50	B250	A104	167.50
07/08/16	JLG	Forward to Stewart Title and discuss with underwriter.	0.50	B250	A108	167.50
07/08/16	SWR	Research for claims objections requirements	0.50	B310	A102	245.00
07/08/16	SWR	Finalize order approving First Amended Disclosure Statement, fixing time for acceptances and rejections, and notice of confirmation hearing	0.30	B110	A103	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/08/16	SWR	Work on claim objection for no liability on claim	0.70	B310	A103	343.00
07/08/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding procedure for omnibus claims objection	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Conference with Velvet Johnson regarding procedures of omnibus claims objection	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Michael Caples regarding taxes on earnings on financial assurance trust fund	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding payment of taxes financial assurance trust fund	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Roy Furrh regarding payment of taxes on financial assurance trust fund	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and professionals for Committee regarding omnibus claims objection	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO, Brad Daniel of BMC Group, and professionals for Committee regarding order on disclosure statement and balloting	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding confirmation hearing date	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC	0.20	B110	A108	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Group regarding letter from bankruptcy clerk regarding procedures for chapter 11 plan solicitation				
07/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding record date for voting and approval of proposed order	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
07/08/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Christy Cannette regarding motion and hearings for omnibus claims objection to severance claims	0.50	B110	A108	245.00
07/08/16	TMH	Work on motion for omnibus objection procedures and first omnibus objection of the debtors to severance claims	1.90	B310	A103	361.00
07/08/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus claim objection procedure and first omnibus objection	1.60	B310	A103	304.00
07/08/16	TMH	Work on spreadsheet for omnibus objection for severance claims	0.80	B310	A103	152.00
07/08/16	TMH	Review individual claims for filing individual objections to each for severance, wages, etc.	2.40	B310	A104	456.00
07/08/16	TMH	Correspondence with Beth Carter regarding FCC licenses and transfer of same	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
07/08/16	TMH	Correspondence with BMC regarding the Brock Services Agreed Order	0.20	B310	A108	38.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/08/16	TMH	Correspondence with D. Meek regarding R. Kerley claims filed in the MPC case	0.20	B310	A108	38.00
07/08/16	VGJ	Revise proposed Order Allowing Omnibus Claims Objection	0.20	B110	A103	33.00
07/08/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with T. Hewitt and S. Rosenblatt re procedure for omnibus objections	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
07/08/16	VGJ	Interoffice meetings with T. Hewitt and emails with S. Rosenblatt re Omnibus Objections	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
07/08/16	VGJ	Telephone conference with C. Cannette (Court) re procedure for Omnibus Objections	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
07/08/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	49.50
07/08/16	VGJ	Assemble proposed Order Approving Disclosure Statement, et al. and electronically submit same to Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
07/09/16	SWR	Additional research on burden of proof and presumptions on claim objections	0.70	B310	A102	343.00
07/09/16	SWR	Work on objections to various categories of claim - severance, duplicate, amended and superseded, late filed, non-complying, no liability, and secured creditor	3.60	B310	A103	1,764.00
07/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding claims	0.40	B310	A105	196.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		objections prototypes and course of action				
07/10/16	TMH	Work on objection claim for non-complying claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/10/16	TMH	Work on objection claim for late filed claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/10/16	TMH	Work on objection claim for duplicate claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/10/16	TMH	Work on form objection claim for workers compensation	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/10/16	TMH	Work on form objection claim for no liability claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
07/10/16	TMH	Review and analyze all employee claims to determine objection(s) to file	2.20	B310	A104	418.00
07/11/16	CHM	Review/analysis of proofs of claim and drafts of objections	1.90	B310	A104	731.50
07/11/16	CHM	Review/analyze sample ballot and related correspondence with balloting agent	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
07/11/16	CHM	Review/analyze amended order approving disclosure statement and setting related deadlines	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
07/11/16	CHM	Correspondence with solicitation agent regarding preparation of solicitation packages	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
07/11/16	JMC	Review and analyze subpoena duces tecum in connection with the McCain Engineering matter.	0.50	B190	A104	97.50
07/11/16	JMC	Correspondence with Tristan Armer regarding subpoena duces tecum in	0.10	B190	A107	19.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		connection with the McCain Engineering matter pending in state court.				
07/11/16	SWR	Review and revise order approving disclosure statement and setting date for acceptances and rejections of ballots and confirmation hearing and prepare redline of same	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
07/11/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding objections to claims filed only with BMC and not with Court	0.30	B310	A105	147.00
07/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding amended order on service of solicitation materials and voting	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
07/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding documents in solicitation materials	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
07/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group and Butler Snow team regarding date of completion of service of solicitation materials	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
07/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group and Butler Snow team regarding sample ballot for class 6 claims	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
07/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding letter from clerk regarding service of	0.20	B320	A108	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		solicitation materials				
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of Bruce Reece	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of Gary Scudder	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Dennis Lavender	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/11/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Russell D. Hayes	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/11/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Keith Broussard	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/11/16	TMH	Work on objection for duplicate filed claims	2.60	B310	A103	494.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of H. Gaines	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of James R. Prisock	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of Mack McDonald	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of William O. James	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of James W. Stallings	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of Robert Tanner	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to severance claim of James L. White	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/11/16	TMH	Draft objection to	0.20	B310	A103	38.00