

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding affidavit of Jon Nash	0.10	B160	A107	49.00
08/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding stipulation and order on objection to claims of ACE Insurance	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Samantha VonSchriltz regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
08/09/16	TMH	Work on affidavit of J. Nash to change to a declaration	0.20	B160	A103	38.00
08/09/16	TMH	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding affidavit	0.20	B160	A108	38.00
08/10/16	CHM	Review/analyze certain plan provisions and related legal research	0.80	B320	A104	308.00
08/10/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding liquidation trust agreement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
08/10/16	SEK	Interoffice conference with attorney Galloway regarding instructions as to the liquidation portion of prior surveys.	0.30	B120	A105	42.00
08/10/16	SEK	Conduct review and summary of liquidation portion of prior surveys noting all item numbers for exceptions and any easements or other documents not listed.	1.40	B120	A110	196.00
08/10/16	SWR	Update Liquidation Trust Agreement to add oversight members and contact information	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
08/10/16	SWR	Finalize notice of filing	0.30	B320	A103	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		of plan supplement				
08/10/16	SWR	Review plan provisions regarding exculpation	0.30	B320	A104	147.00
08/10/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding arrangements for conference call with Gallagher and counsel for Committee	0.30	B120	A107	147.00
08/10/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan supplement and Liquidation Trust Agreement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/10/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding questions of United States Trustee regarding First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
08/10/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding questions of United States Trustee regarding First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/10/16	TMH	Work on notice of supplement to the Plan	0.70	B320	A103	133.00
08/10/16	VGJ	Assemble and electronically file the Declaration of Jonathan J. Nash with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/11/16	CHM	Review/analyze response to claim objection	0.20	B310	A104	77.00
08/11/16	JLG	Review survey for legal access to liquidation trust parcels.	0.50	B250	A104	167.50
08/11/16	JLG	Telephone call to Surveyor about access to spoil area	0.30	B250	A108	100.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/11/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor about word versions of legal description	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
08/11/16	JLG	Correspondence and telephone conference with Rod Clement about access issue and cure methods	0.70	B250	A108	234.50
08/11/16	SWR	Research on balloting and confirmation issues	0.60	B320	A102	294.00
08/11/16	SWR	Brief research for confirmation hearing for voting purposes for claims filed in an unknown or undetermined amount	0.70	B320	A102	343.00
08/11/16	SWR	Work on response to Chris Steiskal regarding questions concerning Mississippi Phosphates First Amended Plan	0.60	B320	A103	294.00
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding proposed agreed order for Jon Nash retention	0.10	B160	A105	49.00
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding preparation of agreed order on objection to John Deere claim for crawler tractor	0.10	B310	A105	49.00
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding access issue	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les Alvis regarding payment by Environmental Trustee for John Deere crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les	0.30	B310	A107	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		Alvis regarding payment of MPC missing installment and agreed order on claim objection				
08/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding response to proposed ACE stipulation	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/11/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding response to stipulation and order regarding ACE Insurance	0.20	B310	A107	98.00
08/11/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding pending issues for hearing on claims objections and confirmation hearing	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
08/11/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Roberto Puga and Kyle McCulloch regarding payment of balance owed to John Deere for the crawler tractor	0.40	B210	A108	196.00
08/11/16	SWR	Work on logistics for hearing on objections to claims and confirmation hearing of First Amended Plan	0.30	B110	A111	147.00
08/11/16	TMH	Work on declaration of J. Nash to re-file per request of UST	0.20	B160	A103	38.00
08/11/16	TMH	Work on order for Meadowlark application	0.50	B160	A103	95.00
08/11/16	TMH	Review response to objection filed by Carl Budinich	0.10	B310	A104	19.00
08/11/16	VGJ	Telephone conference	0.20	B110	A108	33.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		with W. Watson (Court) re proposed Order and Declaration as to Meadowlark Advisors				
08/11/16	VGJ	Revise Declaration of Jonathan Nash, finalize and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/11/16	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order re employing Meadowlark Advisors and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/12/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC regarding preparation for confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
08/12/16	JLG	Correspondence regarding access to spoil area.	0.50	B250	A108	167.50
08/12/16	SWR	Revisions to order sustaining objection to proof of claim of John Deere for the crawler tractor	0.30	B310	A103	147.00
08/12/16	SWR	Review local rule on ballot summary and certification requirements	0.20	B320	A104	98.00
08/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and John Galloway regarding access to spoil parcel of Liquidation Trust	0.30	B130	A107	147.00
08/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les Alvis regarding agreed order sustaining objection to proof of claim of John Deere for the crawler tractor	0.20	B310	A107	98.00
08/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC	0.30	B320	A108	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		regarding ballot summary and certification requirements				
08/12/16	TMH	Work on agreed order for John Deere objection on grounds that it has been paid	0.80	B310	A103	152.00
08/12/16	TMH	Review correspondence from creditor C. Budinich	0.10	B310	A104	19.00
08/12/16	VGJ	Review of court docket re responses to objections to claims	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
08/15/16	CHM	Review/analyze amended proofs of claim filed by worker's compensation claimants and related responses to claim objections	0.50	B310	A104	192.50
08/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC regarding balloting matters	0.30	B320	A108	115.50
08/15/16	SWR	Work on draft of ballot summary and certification form	0.50	B320	A103	245.00
08/15/16	SWR	Work on budget and staffing plans for August and September 2016.	0.80	B110	A104	392.00
08/15/16	SWR	Review amended proof of claim of Victor Lemon	0.10	B310	A104	49.00
08/15/16	SWR	Review responses to objections by Jonathan Sholtis on behalf of Victor Lemon and Jerry Scudder	0.30	B310	A104	147.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding submission of agreed order on objection to John Deere claim for crawler tractor	0.10	B310	A105	49.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon	0.20	B110	A106	98.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		Nash regarding staffing plans and budget for remainder of case (assuming confirmation of plan)				
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding order approving retention of Meadowlark as CRO	0.20	B160	A106	98.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG regarding approval of workers compensation insurance motion	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
08/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding proposed motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger and Leland Murphree regarding amended proof of claim forms and motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for ACE Insurance and counsel for Committee regarding proposed stipulation and order	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les Alvis regarding settlement of claim of John Deere for the crawler tractor and	0.30	B310	A107	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		proposed agreed order				
08/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding ballot summary and certification	0.40	B320	A108	196.00
08/15/16	TMH	Work on ballot summary and certification	1.30	B320	A103	247.00
08/15/16	TMH	Work on confirmation order	1.10	B320	A103	209.00
08/15/16	TMH	Correspondence with J. Nash for additional information needed for Meadowlark Advisors application	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
08/15/16	TMH	Correspondence with clerk of court for additional information needed for Meadowlark Advisors application	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
08/16/16	CHM	Review/analyze motions for relief from stay filed by Lemon and Scudder	0.30	B140	A104	115.50
08/16/16	SWR	Work on narrative for July monthly operating reports	0.60	B110	A103	294.00
08/16/16	SWR	Review motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A104	98.00
08/16/16	SWR	Internal communication regarding workers compensation insurance motion	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
08/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ron McAlpin regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
08/16/16	SWR	Telephone call to counsel for workers compensation insurance claimant	0.20	B140	A107	98.00



# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		regarding motion for relief from automatic stay				
08/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and AIG regarding workers compensation insurance motion	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/16/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding approval of motion regarding workers compensation insurance	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Liquidation Trustee and John Deere regarding order resolving claim of John Deere regarding the crawler tractor	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater (counsel for ACE) regarding stipulation and order on claim objection	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding ballot summary and certification	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
08/16/16	TMH	Work on order approving disclosure statement	1.10	B320	A103	209.00
08/16/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
08/16/16	VGJ	Retrieve attachments for Confirmation Order for T. Hewitt	0.50	B110	A110	82.50
08/16/16	VGJ	Prepare Exhibit to Application to Employ Meadowlark Advisors and electronically file same with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/16/16	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Resolving Objection to Claim of John Deere and electronically file same with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/16/16	VGJ	Finalize Stipulation Consolidating ACE Proof of Claims and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/17/16	CHM	Multiple correspondence among counsel to AIG and the Liquidation Trust regarding workers' compensation motion	0.40	B310	A107	154.00
08/17/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel regarding preparation for confirmation hearing and related matters	0.50	B320	A107	192.50
08/17/16	SWR	Finalize notice of Plan Supplement and Liquidation Trust Agreement	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
08/17/16	SWR	Review and revise chart of claims objections and responses	0.40	B310	A104	196.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding stipulation and order on ACE Insurance claim	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding status report on case administration issues, including claims objections and confirmation issues	0.50	B110	A107	245.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with James McCullough regarding current address for Hydrovac	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
08/17/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Jonathan Sholtis regarding coordinated responses to motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and counsel for AIG regarding proposed order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding AIG workers compensation insurance policies	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding entry of stipulation and order regarding ACE Insurance claims objection	0.20	B310	A107	98.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding draft of Ballot Summary and Certification form	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding members and contact information for oversight committee of Liquidation Trust Agreement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding class 4 secured claims	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
08/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding draft Ballot Summary and Certification form and a draft Ballot Tabulation Detail Report	0.40	B320	A108	196.00
08/17/16	TMH	Work on Notice for Filing of Plan Supplement	0.20	B320	A103	38.00
08/17/16	TMH	Review responses to claim objections received	0.30	B310	A104	57.00
08/17/16	TMH	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel in preparation of ballot certification and confirmation hearing	0.40	B320	A107	76.00
08/17/16	VGJ	Search Schedule G for all utilities with whom MPC had deposits and prepare list for S. Rosenblatt	0.70	B110	A104	115.50
08/17/16	VGJ	Prepare and revise Objection to Claims Chart and Responses filed	1.80	B110	A110	297.00
08/17/16	VGJ	Revise Stipulation and Agreed Order Between Ace per Court and electronically file same	0.20	B110	A111	33.00
08/18/16	CHM	Review/analyze plan and disclosure statement and related documents in preparation for confirmation hearing	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
08/18/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust regarding ad valorem taxes	0.20	B240	A107	77.00
08/18/16	JLG	Work on revisions to title commitment and	5.50	B250	A103	1,842.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		conformity of exceptions with reading of survey.				
08/18/16	JLG	Telephone call to surveyor with applicability questions.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/18/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement about commitment.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/18/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title about changes suggested for commitment and final legal descriptions.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/18/16	JMC	Correspondence with Kourtney Lyda regarding proposed workers' compensation order.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/18/16	SWR	Finalize chart of claims objections and responses filed.	0.50	B310	A103	245.00
08/18/16	SWR	Conference with Velvet Johnson regarding claims objections chart	0.30	B310	A105	147.00
08/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding notice of filing of plan supplement	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
08/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and counsel for AIG regarding order on motion to lift automatic stay for workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding deadline for redemption of property from 2014 tax sales	0.30	B240	A107	147.00
08/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B240	A108	98.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

John Lammert of Assessment Technologies regarding Jackson County ad valorem taxes						
08/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with Christy Cannette regarding procedure for orders sustaining claims objections	0.30	B310	A108	147.00
08/18/16	TMH	Work on Order for omnibus objection for amended and superseded claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
08/18/16	TMH	Work on Order for omnibus objection for non-compliant claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
08/18/16	TMH	Work on Order for omnibus objection for duplicate claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
08/18/16	TMH	Work on Order for omnibus objection for late filed claims	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
08/18/16	TMH	Work on Order Granting Debtor's Objections to Claims as Severance Pay	0.40	B310	A103	76.00
08/18/16	TMH	Review claims and objections for order for all claims	0.20	B310	A104	38.00
08/18/16	VGJ	Draft the Proposed Order Granting Debtor's Objections to Proof of Claims re Severance Pay	0.80	B110	A103	132.00
08/18/16	VGJ	Assemble and electronically file the Notice of Supplement to Plan with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/19/16	JLG	Review prior title policies, deeds of trust and global easements and make new changes to draft commitment.	2.50	B250	A104	837.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/19/16	JLG	Communicate new information to Stewart Title.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/19/16	JMC	Work on issues in connection with workers' compensation motion and proposed order.	0.50	B140	A104	97.50
08/19/16	SWR	Finalize and file motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.40	B140	A103	196.00
08/19/16	SWR	Review and revise proposed orders objecting to other claims	0.90	B310	A103	441.00
08/19/16	SWR	Work on order granting objection of Mississippi Phosphates to severance claims	0.60	B310	A103	294.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding list of workers compensation insurance claimants on whom to serve notice of motion	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding orders on omnibus objections to claims	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding repayment of United States Trustee fees and filing of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding monthly operating reports and payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding conference call	0.20	B120	A107	98.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		with insurance broker to discuss D&O policies				
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding motion to lift automatic stay and coordination with motion on Lemon claim	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding requested conference call with counsel for Committee regarding D&O insurance policies	0.20	B120	A108	98.00
08/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Liquidation Trustee and John Lammert regarding real and personal property Jackson County ad valorem taxes	0.30	B240	A108	147.00
08/19/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objections to late-filed claims	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
08/19/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objections to non-complying claims	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
08/19/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objections to amended and superseded claims	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
08/19/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objections to duplicate claims	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
08/19/16	VGJ	Correspondence with Christi Cannette (Court) re procedure for proposed	0.20	B110	A108	33.00



# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		Order pertaining to all of the Objections re severance pay				
08/19/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
08/19/16	VGJ	Gather the mailing list of the interested parties to the Motion to Modify Stay as to Workers' Compensation Claims	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
08/19/16	VGJ	Assemble Motion to Modify the Automatic Stay as to Workers' Compensation Claim and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/19/16	VGJ	Finalize Proposed Order Granting Objections to Claims as to Severance Pay and all the Omnibus Objections and electronically file same with Court	0.80	B110	A111	132.00
08/22/16	CHM	Review correspondence and ballot submitted by Glenn Machine Works	0.20	B320	A104	77.00
08/22/16	CHM	Review/analyze confirmation objection filed by office of the United States Trustee	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
08/22/16	CHM	Review/analyze objection to confirmation filed by Chemours	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
08/22/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Chemours confirmation objection and other matters related to confirmation hearing	0.30	B320	A106	115.50
08/22/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel	0.30	B320	A107	115.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

		regarding confirmation hearing				
08/22/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC regarding returned ballots and analysis of same	0.30	B320	A108	115.50
08/22/16	JLG	Review survey and telephone call to surveyor regarding out parcels on plant site and legal access issues.	0.50	B250	A104	167.50
08/22/16	JLG	Run legal descriptions on questionable deeds of trust against survey.	1.00	B250	A104	335.00
08/22/16	JLG	Receive and study final draft of title commitment from Stewart.	1.20	B250	A104	402.00
08/22/16	JLG	Telephone call to Rod Clement with questions about outstanding deeds of trust.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/22/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of rules of evidence and other authorities in preparation for upcoming confirmation hearing.	0.60	B320	A101	117.00
08/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson concerning updated workers' compensation claimant information and pending motions.	0.30	B140	A105	58.50
08/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding workers' compensation motion and proposed orders.	0.30	B140	A107	58.50
08/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding agreed order granting motion to	0.10	B140	A107	19.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		modify automatic stay in connection with certain workers' compensation claims.				
08/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding confirmation of certain information concerning workers' compensation claimants.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/22/16	SWR	Work on narrative for July monthly operating reports	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Work on proposed agreed orders for motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A103	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Work on ballot summary and certification form	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Review objection of Chemours to First Amended Plan	0.40	B320	A104	196.00
08/22/16	SWR	Review objection of United States Trustee to First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A104	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding Mississippi Phosphates financials	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding drafting of order confirming chapter 11 Plan	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding July monthly operating report narrative	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding	0.30	B110	A106	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		financials for May, June, and July monthly operating reports				
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding United States Trustee objection to First Amended Plan and course of action in response to same	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding draft of ballot summary and certification form	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding objection of Chemours to First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding possible objection of United States Trustee to plan provision	0.30	B320	A106	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding motion to lift automatic stay as to workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger and Leland Murphree regarding agreed order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding proposed agreed order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation	0.40	B140	A107	196.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		insurance				
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding notice parties to workers compensation insurance motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Chemours regarding objection to First Amended Plan	0.10	B320	A107	49.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding issues affecting confirmation of chapter 11 Plan	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding possible objection of United States Trustee to plan provision	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding objection of United States Trustee to First Amended Plan and request for conference call with United States Trustee to discuss objection	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding extension of time to object to First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Chemours objection and confirmation hearing	0.40	B320	A107	196.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Lammert regarding conference call to discuss Jackson County taxes	0.20	B240	A108	98.00
08/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniels regarding revised Ballot Summary and Certification form	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
08/22/16	TMH	Work on Order Confirming Plan to incorporate UST issues	1.50	B320	A103	285.00
08/23/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel and office of the United States Trustee regarding confirmation matters	0.40	B320	A107	154.00
08/23/16	CHM	Multiple correspondence with committee counsel and BMC regarding voting on plan	0.40	B320	A107	154.00
08/23/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to various creditors regarding confirmation issues	0.40	B320	A107	154.00
08/23/16	JMC	Work on possible evidentiary issues for confirmation hearing.	0.70	B320	A101	136.50
08/23/16	SWR	Review financials on July and previous monthly operating reports	0.40	B110	A104	196.00
08/23/16	SWR	Review claims register for administrative and secured claims	0.40	B110	A104	196.00
08/23/16	SWR	Review orders entered sustaining objections to claims for severance pay	0.40	B310	A104	196.00
08/23/16	SWR	Review disclosure statement provisions and disclosure statement order regarding treatment	0.50	B320	A104	245.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		of late-filed claims				
08/23/16	SWR	Review Judge Lynn's decision in Pilgrim's Pride for scope of protections for trustee and trustee's counsel	0.30	B320	A104	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding current monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
08/23/16	SWR	Telephone conference with John Galloway regarding title policy and orders granting sale free and clear of liens	0.30	B130	A105	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Marty Sosland regarding exculpation provision	0.30	B320	A105	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding draft of order confirming First Amended Plan and incorporation of United States Trustee's requests	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
08/23/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding financials on monthly operating reports	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding orders on objections to claims	0.20	B310	A106	98.00
08/23/16	SWR	Plan for and participate in extended conference call with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and representatives of Assessment Technologies regarding Jackson County taxes on real and personal property and treatment	1.30	B240	A107	637.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		under First Amended Plan				
08/23/16	SWR	Conference call with Chris Steiskal and Ron McAlpin and counsel for Committee regarding exculpation provision and objection of United States Trustee to First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Billy Wessler regarding Bastech 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree and Tom Butler regarding claim of Alabama Motor Electric Services	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Ken Long with DOJ/EPA regarding EPA claim	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
08/23/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Roy Furrh regarding MDEQ claim	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding claims of EPA and MDEQ	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding response to objection of United States Trustee to exculpation provision	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/23/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan and disclosure statement provisions for treatment	0.50	B320	A107	245.00



# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		of late-filed claims				
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with AT&T regarding secured claim	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
08/23/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conferences with Brad Daniel regarding late ballots and ballot summary	0.60	B320	A108	294.00
08/23/16	VGJ	Multiple items of correspondence to R. Kerley re monthly operating reports for all 3 entities	0.20	B110	A106	33.00
08/23/16	VGJ	Telephone conference with W. Watson (Court) re proposed Order on Objection to Claims on Severance Pay	0.30	B110	A108	49.50
08/23/16	VGJ	Revise exhibit to proposed Order Sustaining Objections to Severance Pay and electronically file same with Court	0.80	B110	A111	132.00
08/23/16	VGJ	Receipt of information for May, June and July MORs for all 3 entities, revise and finalize same	0.90	B110	A111	148.50
08/23/16	VGJ	Revise exhibit to proposed Order Sustaining Objections to Certain Non-Complying Claims and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/23/16	VGJ	Prepare Certificate of Service and retrieve addresses for interested parties for Notice of Hearing on Motion to Modify the Automatic Stay as to Workers	1.30	B110	A111	214.50