

# BUTLER | SNOW

		Compensation Claims, prepare for mailing to all interested parties and electronically file same with Court				
08/24/16	CHM	Review/analyze remaining responses to claims objections	0.60	B310	A104	231.00
08/24/16	CHM	Review/analyze updated tabulation report	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
08/24/16	CHM	Multiple correspondence with counsel to the committee regarding tabulation report and ballots submitted	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
08/24/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with BMC and management regarding voting on plan, confirmation hearing and related matters	0.60	B320	A108	231.00
08/24/16	JLG	Study survey and suggest description changes to surveyor.	1.00	B250	A104	335.00
08/24/16	JLG	Prepare and forward to Stewart Title new requirements and exceptions for commitment.	0.80	B250	A104	268.00
08/24/16	JLG	Telephone calls to Rod Clement, surveyor and Steve Rosenblatt about plant description and lien exceptions.	0.90	B250	A108	301.50
08/24/16	SWR	Conference with VJ Barham regarding logistical issues for confirmation hearing	0.20	B210	A101	98.00
08/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with John Galloway regarding	0.40	B130	A105	196.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		title issues and bankruptcy court orders on sale of property				
08/24/16	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington regarding drafting of responses to motion to lift automatic stay and proposed orders on motions to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding preparation of hearing notebooks for confirmation hearing	0.30	B320	A105	147.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding status of balloting on First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A106	147.00
08/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding present cash status of Debtors	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding real estate transfer issues	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
08/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding workers compensation insurance claims and motions to modify automatic stay	0.50	B140	A107	245.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with attorneys for various parties regarding workers compensation insurance motions	0.60	B140	A107	294.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.60	B320	A107	294.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		counsel for various creditors regarding late-filed claims				
08/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding position of Chemours regarding proposal for resolution of objection	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding balloting on First Amended Plan by unsecured creditors	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding response to proposed language on covered parties	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Marc Solomon regarding response of United States Trustee on covered parties	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
08/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with BMC Group regarding balloting matters	0.40	B320	A108	196.00
08/24/16	SWR	Conference call with BMC and CRO regarding status report and discussion of ballot summary and certification	0.50	B320	A108	245.00
08/24/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re Class 6 Votes	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
08/24/16	VGJ	Prepare chart of all Unsecured Creditors that have not voted in Class 6 for the Plan	1.20	B110	A110	198.00
08/24/16	VGJ	Prepare 4 hearing notebooks for Objection	2.20	B110	A110	363.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		to Claims and Responses set for hearing for S. Rosenblatt				
08/24/16	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Undeliverable Mail to Debtor from Court; search for more current address and prepare Notice of Change of Address and electronically file same with Court	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
08/25/16	CHM	Work in connection with preparation for confirmation hearing, including review/analysis of potential hearing testimony and exhibits	1.30	B320	A101	500.50
08/25/16	CHM	Review final ballot summary and certification	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
08/25/16	CHM	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding workers' compensation claims	0.20	B310	A107	77.00
08/25/16	JMC	Work on proposed agreed order granting motion to lift automatic stay as to workers' compensation claims.	0.90	B140	A103	175.50
08/25/16	JMC	Prepare response to motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon.	0.90	B140	A103	175.50
08/25/16	JMC	Review motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon.	0.30	B140	A104	58.50
08/25/16	JMC	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding response to motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon.	0.20	B140	A105	39.00
08/25/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt	0.20	B140	A105	39.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		regarding proposed agreed order granting motion to lift automatic stay as to workers' compensation claims.				
08/25/16	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt on structure of proposed agreed order granting motion to lift stay as to workers' compensation claims.	0.20	B140	A105	39.00
08/25/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding response to motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon.	0.20	B140	A105	39.00
08/25/16	JMC	Correspondence with counsel for Victor Lemon and AIG regarding proposed order granting motion to lift stay as to workers' compensation claims.	0.30	B140	A107	58.50
08/25/16	SWR	Revise and update motions to dismiss bankruptcy cases and to convert bankruptcy cases	0.80	B110	A103	392.00
08/25/16	SWR	Review and revise proposed orders granting motion to lift automatic stay regarding workers compensation insurance and response to Lemon motion to lift automatic stay	0.50	B140	A103	245.00
08/25/16	SWR	Revise and update ballot summary and certification	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
08/25/16	SWR	Conference and correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding proposed	0.30	B140	A105	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		orders on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims				
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and counsel for liquidation trust regarding response to Lemon motion	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding course of action regarding motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance and response to Lemon motion	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding proposed order granting motion to lift automatic stay regarding workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding scope of order granting Debtors' motion to modify automatic stay for workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/25/16	SWR	Extended conference call with BMC Group, counsel for Committee, and CRO regarding balloting and Ballot Summary and Certification	0.70	B320	A107	343.00
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel at BMC regarding update on	0.30	B320	A108	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		ballot summary and details on ballots				
08/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC, counsel for Committee, CRO and Chris Maddux regarding claims, ballots and voting	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
08/25/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt re MORs and email correspondence with R. Kerley re same	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
08/25/16	VGJ	Finalize and assemble the Response to Motion for Relief from Stay (Victor Lemon) and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/26/16	CHM	Preparation for confirmation hearing, including review of plan, correspondence with various constituencies, previous pleadings in the case and development of witness testimony	1.90	B320	A101	731.50
08/26/16	CHM	Review/analyze ballot summary and certification and numerous individual ballots	0.80	B320	A104	308.00
08/26/16	CHM	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding preparation for confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A106	77.00
08/26/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to PHI regarding update on BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	77.00
08/26/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to MDEQ regarding	0.40	B320	A107	154.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		confirmation hearing				
08/26/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to PHI regarding confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
08/26/16	SWR	Work on logistics for next week's hearings in Gulfport	0.30	B110	A101	147.00
08/26/16	SWR	Final revisions to Ballot Summary and Certification	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
08/26/16	SWR	Review draft of outline of proposed testimony of Jon Nash for confirmation hearing	0.50	B320	A104	245.00
08/26/16	SWR	Internal conference regarding planning for claims objection hearing and confirmation hearing	0.50	B110	A105	245.00
08/26/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Marty Sosland regarding Texas cases approving exculpation provisions	0.50	B320	A105	245.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding ballot tabulation and summary	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding requested documents and information	0.40	B110	A107	196.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding conference call with Gallagher	0.30	B120	A107	147.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding removal of judgment liens from real property purchased by Liquidation Trust	0.30	B130	A107	147.00



# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Lisa Usry and John Galloway regarding survey and title issues	0.30	B130	A107	147.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with David Houston and Roy Furrh regarding stipulation and agreed order for MDEQ administrative claim	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding response of United States Trustee to exculpation provision	0.10	B320	A107	49.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Byrd regarding confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
08/26/16	SWR	Conference call with Roy Furrh and David Houston regarding claims of MDEQ and confirmation process	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
08/26/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding status of negotiations with Chemours regarding plan objection	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding conference call with counsel for Committee	0.30	B120	A108	147.00
08/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding ballot summary and certification.	0.50	B320	A108	245.00
08/26/16	SWR	Review exhibits to ballot summary and certification and prepare for exhibits for filing	0.50	B320	A110	245.00
08/26/16	TMH	Research whether admin	0.50	B320	A102	95.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		claims can be classified and paid upon availability of funds.				
08/26/16	TMH	Work on testimony outline for J. Nash for confirmation hearing.	1.90	B320	A103	361.00
08/26/16	TMH	Review and identify documents needed for court hearings	0.80	B320	A104	152.00
08/26/16	TMH	Meet with C. Maddux and S. Rosenblatt for court preparation	0.90	B320	A105	171.00
08/26/16	TMH	Correspondence with J. Nash regarding confirmation hearing	0.10	B320	A108	19.00
08/28/16	SWR	Preliminary research on exculpation provisions in chapter 11 plans in Fifth Circuit post-Pacific Lumber	0.90	B320	A102	441.00
08/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding report on status of BP claim	0.20	B120	A106	98.00
08/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Joe Rice regarding status report on BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	98.00
08/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kourtney Lyda regarding proposed order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance matters	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/29/16	CHM	Extended work in connection with	3.20	B320	A101	1,232.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		preparation for confirmation hearing, including review/analysis of confirmation objections, review/revision of witness outline, review of potential hearing exhibits and conference with S. Rosenblatt				
08/29/16	CHM	Review/analyze response to Chemours confirmation objection and related legal research	0.50	B320	A103	192.50
08/29/16	CHM	Review/analyze monthly operating reports for all debtors for May, June and July	0.90	B110	A104	346.50
08/29/16	CHM	Review/analyze motion for relief from stay filed by William Burge	0.30	B140	A104	115.50
08/29/16	CHM	Review/analyze correspondence from counsel to Chemours to counsel to the committee regarding objection to confirmation and related matters	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
08/29/16	CHM	Multiple correspondence with management regarding confirmation hearing preparation	0.40	B320	A106	154.00
08/29/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to William Burge regarding pending LHWCA claim	0.30	B140	A107	115.50
08/29/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding call with insurance broker and agenda for same	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
08/29/16	CHM	Correspondence with	0.20	B320	A107	77.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		counsel to the liquidation trust regarding confirmation hearing				
08/29/16	JLG	Search and assemble exception documents to Rod Clement.	0.90	B250	A104	301.50
08/29/16	JLG	Review against survey additional exception documents from Jackson County land records produced by abstractor.	1.60	B250	A104	536.00
08/29/16	JLG	Conference with abstractor about requirements.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/29/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement about title commitment.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
08/29/16	JMC	Work on drafting and revising proposed agreed order granting motion of Victor Lemon to lift stay.	1.20	B140	A103	234.00
08/29/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon in connection with drafting and revising proposed agreed order granting same.	0.30	B140	A104	58.50
08/29/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of response to motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon in connection with drafting and revising proposed agreed order granting same.	0.20	B140	A104	39.00
08/29/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of proposed agreed order granting motion of the Debtors to modify the automatic stay in connection with	0.30	B140	A104	58.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		drafting and revising proposed agreed order granting motion of Victor Lemon to lift the automatic stay.				
08/29/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of responses of Victor Lemon and Jerry Scudder to claim objection in connection with drafting and revising proposed agreed order resolving same.	0.50	B310	A104	97.50
08/29/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of claim objection to proofs of claim filed by Jerry Scudder and Victor Lemon in connection with drafting and revising proposed order resolving same.	0.40	B310	A104	78.00
08/29/16	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt regarding proposed order granting relief from stay in connection with certain workers' compensation claims.	0.30	B310	A105	58.50
08/29/16	JMC	Correspondence with counsel for AIG regarding certain claims under the Debtors' insurance policies.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/29/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding LHWCA claim of William Burge.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/29/16	SWR	Research on Fifth Circuit bankruptcy decisions approving plan with exculpation provision	3.30	B320	A102	1,617.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/29/16	SWR	Research on plans permitting payment of administrative claims as soon as practicable after the effective date	2.30	B320	A102	1,127.00
08/29/16	SWR	Work on orders to modify automatic stay for workers compensation insurance claims	0.50	B140	A103	245.00
08/29/16	SWR	Work on response to objection of Chemours to First Amended Plan	1.50	B320	A103	735.00
08/29/16	SWR	Work on response to United States Trustee objection to confirmation of First Amended Plan	1.40	B320	A103	686.00
08/29/16	SWR	Review motion for relief from automatic stay by Burge for longshoreman's compensation claim	0.20	B140	A104	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Conference and correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding July monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux and Thomas Hewitt regarding plan provision on payment of administrative claims and effective date	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding July monthly operating reports	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding	0.20	B320	A106	98.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		exculpation provision in First Amended Plan				
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee regarding payment of fees for second quarter of 2016	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee and Gallagher regarding conference call to discuss D&O insurance	0.30	B120	A107	147.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding proposed orders on motion to lift automatic stay on Lemon and Scudder claims and on Debtor's motion	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG regarding inclusion of longshoreman's compensation claims within scope of order on workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Byrd regarding order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with AIG regarding proposed orders granting motion for relief from automatic stay	0.50	B140	A107	245.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Steinberger regarding status of	0.30	B140	A107	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		workers compensation insurance motions and orders				
08/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding closing transactions	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Chemours objection to confirmation	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
08/29/16	TMH	Plan and prepare for confirmation hearing and hearing on objections	2.10	B320	A101	399.00
08/29/16	TMH	Interoffice conference regarding review of documents for confirmation hearing	1.10	B320	A101	209.00
08/29/16	TMH	Research case law to determine if any cases confirmed with Admin Expenses classified and paid upon available funds	0.60	B320	A102	114.00
08/29/16	TMH	Work on testimony outline for J. Nash	0.90	B320	A103	171.00
08/29/16	TMH	Correspondence with Mrs. Ezell regarding order for duplicate claim	0.20	B310	A108	38.00
08/29/16	VGJ	Office conference and review of MORs with S. Rosenblatt	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
08/29/16	VGJ	Interoffice meeting and several emails with T. Hewitt re documents needed for confirmation hearing	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
08/29/16	VGJ	Retrieve documents and pleadings for confirmation hearing, exhibits and prepare index of documents and	2.70	B110	A110	445.50



# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		begin preparing notebooks of same				
08/29/16	VGJ	Revise all MORs for all 3 entities for May, June and July and organize with attachments	1.70	B110	A111	280.50
08/29/16	VGJ	Draft letter to U. S. Trustee, Payment Center re 2nd Quarter fees	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/30/16	CHM	Plan and prepare for confirmation hearing	2.80	B320	A101	1,078.00
08/30/16	CHM	Review/analyze/revise response to objection to confirmation filed by the office of the United States Trustee	0.40	B320	A103	154.00
08/30/16	CHM	Review order regarding workers compensation motion and revisions proposed by counsel to interested parties	0.40	B110	A104	154.00
08/30/16	CHM	Review/analyze documents and correspondence from Gallagher regarding insurance matters	0.40	B110	A104	154.00
08/30/16	CHM	Review order extending automatic stay with respect to William Burge	0.20	B140	A104	77.00
08/30/16	CHM	Review legal research and related memorandum in connection with preparation for hearing on claims objections	0.30	B310	A104	115.50
08/30/16	CHM	Review addendum to plan supplement	0.20	B320	A104	77.00
08/30/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding responses to objections to confirmation	0.20	B320	A106	77.00
08/30/16	CHM	Correspondence with	0.30	B110	A107	115.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

		counsel to AIG regarding order on workers compensation motion				
08/30/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel and Gallagher regarding insurance matters	0.50	B320	A107	192.50
08/30/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding confirmation hearing	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
08/30/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding responses to confirmation objections	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
08/30/16	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding preparation for hearing on claims objections.	0.30	B310	A101	58.50
08/30/16	JMC	Work on memo concerning FRE 803(6) FRE902 in preparation for hearing on claims objections.	1.90	B310	A103	370.50
08/30/16	JMC	Work on drafting and revising response to objection by UST to plan confirmation.	1.90	B320	A103	370.50
08/30/16	JMC	Review FRE 803(6) and authorities interpreting same in preparation for hearing on claims objections.	1.10	B310	A104	214.50
08/30/16	JMC	Review fifth circuit bankruptcy issues on exculpation.	1.90	B320	A104	370.50
08/30/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding	0.20	B320	A105	39.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

		updated draft of response to objection to plan confirmation.				
08/30/16	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt on response to objection to plan confirmation.	0.40	B320	A105	78.00
08/30/16	JMC	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding proposed changes to proposed agreed order granting motion to lift stay filed by Victor Lemon.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/30/16	JMC	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Steve Rosenblatt regarding proposed changes to order granting motion of Victor Lemon to lift stay.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/30/16	JMC	Correspondence with Leland Murphree and Jonathan Sholtis regarding proposed changes to proposed order granting motion of Victor Lemon to lift stay.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
08/30/16	JMC	Correspondence with Tristan Armer regarding McCain Engineering litigation.	0.10	B190	A107	19.50
08/30/16	SWR	Final preparations for claims objection hearing and hearing on motions to lift automatic stay	2.80	B110	A101	1,372.00
08/30/16	SWR	Telephone conference and conference with Jon Nash regarding hearing preparation	1.30	B110	A101	637.00
08/30/16	SWR	Work on revisions to orders to modify the	0.40	B140	A103	196.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		automatic stay to reflect comments of other counsel				
08/30/16	SWR	Additional work on response to objection of United States Trustee to confirmation	0.90	B320	A103	441.00
08/30/16	SWR	Additional work on response to objection of Chemours to confirmation of First Amended Plan	1.30	B320	A103	637.00
08/30/16	SWR	Prepare supplement to Plan Supplement	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
08/30/16	SWR	Review notice of hearing on motion to lift automatic stay by Burge	0.10	B140	A104	49.00
08/30/16	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington and review memo on business records exception to hearsay rule	0.50	B110	A105	245.00
08/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kourtney Lyda regarding closing checklist for transfers to Liquidation Trustee	0.30	B130	A107	147.00
08/30/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for AIG and claimant regarding proposed orders	0.70	B140	A107	343.00
08/30/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Steinberger regarding proposed orders and course of action	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
08/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for United States Trustee regarding exculpation provision on First Amended Plan	0.50	B320	A107	245.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

08/30/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding responses to objections to First Amended Plan filed by United States Trustee and Chemours	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
08/30/16	SWR	Conference call with counsel for Committee, special counsel for Committee, and Gallagher regarding D&O insurance	0.30	B120	A108	147.00
08/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Steve Fitzsimonds regarding Mississippi Phosphates D&O Policy and organization of the Environmental Trust and Liquidation Trust	0.20	B210	A108	98.00
08/30/16	SWR	Travel to Coast for hearing on claims objections, motions to lift automatic stay on Wednesday and confirmation hearing on Thursday (1/2 half time)	1.50	B195	A112	735.00
08/30/16	TMH	Work on exhibit list and notebook for hearing	1.20	B320	A103	228.00
08/30/16	TMH	Work on Debtors' response to objection of Chemours	0.30	B320	A103	57.00
08/30/16	TMH	Travel to Gulfport for hearing on claim objections.	1.50	B320	A112	285.00
08/30/16	VGJ	Internal conference with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re hearing notebooks	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
08/30/16	VGJ	Assemble hearing notebooks for	4.50	B110	A110	742.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		confirmation hearing, Objections to Claims hearing and exhibits for hearing				
08/30/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
08/30/16	VGJ	Receipt of executed MORs (May, June and July) for all 3 entities, assemble and electronically file with Court	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
08/30/16	VGJ	Prepare Notice of Change of Address for Jonathan J. Nash and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
08/30/16	VGJ	Assemble and electronically file the Notice of Filing of Supplement to Plan (Second) with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
08/31/16	CHM	Extended work in connection with preparation for confirmation hearing, including review/analysis of committee and government settlements, work on liquidation analysis and cumulative effect of settlement agreements, conference with Jon Nash regarding preparation and review of other documents and pleadings	6.40	B320	A101	2,464.00
08/31/16	CHM	Travel to Gulfport for confirmation hearing (1/2 time)	1.50	B320	A112	577.50
08/31/16	JLG	Review title update from abstractor and missing	1.10	B250	A104	368.50

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		exception documents.				
08/31/16	JLG	Assemble information for Rod Clement and forward to Rod Clement	0.20	B250	A104	67.00
08/31/16	SWR	Final preparations with Jon Nash for claims objection hearing for remaining severance claims	1.10	B310	A101	539.00
08/31/16	SWR	Prepare for tomorrow's confirmation hearing, including conference with Jon Nash, including analysis and review of plan provisions, committee and government settlements, outline testimony of Jon Nash, work on exhibits and liquidation analysis	5.80	B320	A101	2,842.00
08/31/16	SWR	Correspondence with Beth Carter regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
08/31/16	SWR	Conference with counsel for Committee regarding response to objections of Chemours and United States Trustee and issues at confirmation hearing	0.90	B110	A107	441.00
08/31/16	SWR	Conference with counsel for AIG and claimant regarding finalizing two orders on motion for relief from automatic stay and correspondence with other counsel for AIG	1.40	B140	A107	686.00
08/31/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding settlement discussions regarding Chemours	0.30	B320	A107	147.00

# BUTLER | SNOW

---

		objection to confirmation				
08/31/16	SWR	Correspondence with Samantha VonSchriltz regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
08/31/16	SWR	Attend and participate in hearing on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance and also claims objection hearing on severance claims	0.90	B310	A109	441.00
08/31/16	TMH	Meet with J. Nash and S. Rosenblatt for hearing preparation	1.00	B320	A106	190.00
08/31/16	TMH	Plan and prepare with J. Nash for confirmation hearing	4.30	B320	A106	817.00
08/31/16	TMH	Meet with Committee Counsel regarding Chemours objections and preparation for confirmation hearing	1.20	B320	A107	228.00
08/31/16	TMH	Prepare for and attend hearing on claim objections and relief from automatic stay	1.20	B320	A109	228.00
08/31/16	TMH	Return travel to Jackson from hearing on claims objections.	1.50	B320	A112	285.00
08/31/16	VGJ	Interoffice conference and email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt re administrative tax claims	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
08/31/16	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Carter re US Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
08/31/16	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Daniel with BMC re Dept of Revenue proof of claims	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
08/31/16	VGJ	Prepare chart of all	0.70	B110	A110	115.50



# BUTLER | SNOW

		Administrative (Tax) claims				
08/31/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
08/31/16	VGJ	Finalize Responses to US Trustee's Objection to Plan and Chemours' Objection to Plan and electronically file both with the Court	0.40	B110	A111	66.00
09/01/16	CHM	Plan and prepare for confirmation hearing, including review of hearing exhibits and extended meeting with CRO to prepare for testimony and finalize liquidation analysis	2.80	B320	A101	1,078.00
09/01/16	CHM	Appear for and attend confirmation hearing	1.90	B320	A109	731.50
09/01/16	CHM	Return travel from Gulfport to Jackson after confirmation hearing (1/2 time)	1.50	B320	A112	577.50
09/01/16	SWR	Final preparations for confirmation hearing	1.90	B320	A101	931.00
09/01/16	SWR	Post hearing conference with Debtors' professionals regarding next steps	0.90	B110	A105	441.00
09/01/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Marty Sosland regarding exculpation provision	0.40	B320	A105	196.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding proposed language for confirmation order	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Maddux and Thomas Hewitt regarding	0.20	B320	A105	98.00