

BUTLER | SNOW

		amended response to objection of United States Trustee to confirmation of First Amended Plan				
09/01/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Chris Maddux regarding filing amended response to objection of United States Trustee	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Jeff Bowman regarding need to retain Horne and requested documents by Horne for 2015 tax return	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ron McAlpin regarding United States Trustee response to exculpation provision	0.10	B320	A107	49.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding proposed language to resolve the objection of the United States Trustee to confirmation of the First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Samantha VonSchriltz regarding posting of checks for second quarter United States Trustee fees	0.10	B110	A108	49.00
09/01/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding report on confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A108	98.00
09/01/16	SWR	Participate in confirmation hearing on First Amended Joint Plan	1.80	B320	A109	882.00
09/01/16	SWR	Return travel to Jackson from confirmation hearing (1/2 half time)	1.50	B195	A112	735.00

BUTLER | SNOW

09/01/16	TMH	Work on confirmation order	1.80	B320	A103	342.00
09/01/16	TMH	Review Burge motion for relief from stay	0.10	B140	A104	19.00
09/01/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
09/02/16	SWR	Work on affidavit of Wendy Eversole in support of Debtors' application to retain Horne LLP	0.80	B160	A103	392.00
09/02/16	SWR	Work on application to retain Horne LLP to prepare and file state and federal tax returns	0.90	B240	A103	441.00
09/02/16	SWR	Work on amended response to objection of United States Trustee to confirmation of chapter 11 plan	0.90	B320	A103	441.00
09/02/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Wendy Eversole regarding draft of Application to retain Horne and supporting affidavit	0.30	B160	A106	147.00
09/02/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Horne regarding conference call to discuss status of matter and course of action regarding preparation and filing of 2015 tax returns	0.40	B240	A106	196.00
09/02/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Aaron Samuels regarding status report on tax return preparation and need for financial records and information	0.40	B240	A108	196.00
09/02/16	TMH	Work on 21 day notice for Horne retention	0.20	B160	A103	38.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		application				
09/02/16	TMH	Work on order for Horne retention application	0.40	B160	A103	76.00
09/02/16	TMH	Work on Horne Statement as Exhibit A to Retention Application for 2015 Taxes	0.80	B160	A103	152.00
09/02/16	TMH	Work on application to employ Horne for 2015 taxes	1.30	B160	A103	247.00
09/02/16	TMH	Work on Confirmation Order for Chapter 11 Plan	2.50	B320	A103	475.00
09/03/16	SWR	Additional research regarding bankruptcy cases in Fifth Circuit allowing exculpation provisions	0.80	B320	A102	392.00
09/03/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and counsel for Environmental Trustee regarding Mississippi Power easement issue	0.40	B210	A107	196.00
09/06/16	CHM	Review/analyze survey and purchase agreement regarding location of power lines and resolution of easement issue with Mississippi Power	0.40	B250	A104	154.00
09/06/16	CHM	Review/analyze/revise amended response to objection to confirmation filed by office of the United States Trustee	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
09/06/16	JLG	Telephone call to surveyor regarding possible changes to survey and descriptions.	0.50	B250	A108	167.50
09/06/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Scott Nelson regarding	0.10	B140	A107	19.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		order resolving motion to lift stay concerning William Burge.				
09/06/16	SWR	Revise and update application to retain Horne and statement in support of application	0.30	B160	A103	147.00
09/06/16	SWR	Finalize and file amended response to objection of United States Trustee to First Amended Plan	1.60	B320	A103	784.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding finalize and upload orders on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding Excess BP Proceeds definition	0.20	B120	A106	98.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding order on motion to lift automatic stay on Burge claim	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
09/06/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding approval of orders on motion to lift automatic stay for workers compensation insurance claims	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Roberto Puga regarding Mississippi Power Company easement issue and contact information for Mississippi Power Company's attorneys	0.30	B130	A108	147.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B160	A108	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Aaron Samuels and Wendy Eversole at Horne regarding revised application and statement in support of Application				
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Aaron Samuels regarding valuation of 320-acre tract	0.30	B210	A108	147.00
09/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Horne and Jon Nash regarding background information for preparation of 2015 state and federal tax returns	0.40	B210	A108	196.00
09/06/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
09/06/16	VGJ	Assemble and finalize proposed Agreed Orders on Relief from Stay re Workers' compensation and Lemon-Scudder Stay Relief Motions and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
09/06/16	VGJ	Assemble and finalize Amended Response to US Trustee's Objection to First Amended Joint Ch 11 Plan, et al. and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
09/07/16	CHM	Review memorandum from counsel to MS Power to counsel to the liquidation trust regarding easement issues	0.20	B250	A104	77.00
09/07/16	CHM	Review/revise orders related to certain claim objections	0.40	B310	A104	154.00
09/07/16	JMC	Correspondence with	0.10	B140	A107	19.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		Steve Rosenblatt and Jonathan Sholtis regarding order on workers' compensation policies.				
09/07/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Scott Nelson regarding order lifting stay concerning workers' compensation claims.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/07/16	SWR	Update and submit order on Lemon motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance	0.20	B140	A103	98.00
09/07/16	SWR	Prepare order granting motion to lift automatic stay on Burge longshoreman's compensation claim	0.40	B140	A103	196.00
09/07/16	SWR	Prepare response to Burge motion to lift automatic stay	0.40	B140	A103	196.00
09/07/16	SWR	Prepare order on Burge motion to lift automatic stay on longshoreman's compensation claim	0.40	B140	A103	196.00
09/07/16	SWR	Review and revise proposed orders sustaining objections to severance claims	0.30	B310	A104	147.00
09/07/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding filing of response and submission of orders	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
09/07/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding payment and scope of work for Horne	0.20	B160	A106	98.00
09/07/16	SWR	Telephone conferences	0.30	B160	A106	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		with Jon Nash and Aaron Samuels regarding retention of Horne for 2015 tax returns				
09/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre and Roberto Puga regarding Mississippi Power Company easement issue	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
09/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding order granting motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
09/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding order on motion to lift automatic stay on workers compensation insurance claims and submission of order on Burge motion	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
09/07/16	SWR	Correspondence with Wendy Eversole and Aaron Samuels regarding affidavit and application for Horne to prepare and file tax returns	0.20	B160	A108	98.00
09/07/16	TMH	Work on order sustaining Burns objection	0.50	B310	A103	95.00
09/07/16	TMH	Work on order sustaining Budinich objection	0.50	B310	A103	95.00
09/07/16	TMH	Work on order sustaining Ezell objection	0.60	B310	A103	114.00
09/07/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt re pleadings for retention of Horne	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
09/07/16	VGJ	Assemble and finalize the proposed Orders Sustaining Objection to	0.50	B110	A111	82.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		Proof of Claims (3) and electronically file same with court				
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Steve Rosenblatt regarding orders entered modifying the automatic stay.	0.10	B140	A106	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding proposed language in draft order resolving motion to lift stay of William Burge.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Leland Murphree and Steve Rosenblatt regarding proposed changes to proposed order modifying automatic stay in connection with motion filed by William Burge.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson and Steve Rosenblatt regarding LHWCA coverage and status of severance pay claims.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding preparation of specific order resolving motion to lift stay.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Scott Nelson regarding preparation of specific order resolving motion to lift stay.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson, Steve	0.10	B140	A107	19.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		Rosenblatt and Staci Zorn regarding proposed order resolving motion to lift stay filed by William Burge.				
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis and Steve Rosenblatt regarding order modifying the automatic stay.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/08/16	JMC	Correspondence with Staci Zorn regarding status of coverage for LHWCA claim of William Burge.	0.10	B140	A108	19.50
09/08/16	SWR	Work on order to modify automatic stay as to Burge longshoreman's litigation	0.70	B140	A103	343.00
09/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding Horne retention application	0.20	B160	A105	98.00
09/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding order on Lemon motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
09/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding motion for relief from automatic stay for Burge action	0.40	B140	A107	196.00
09/08/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with W. Watson (Court) re proposed Order Dkt. 1618	0.10	B110	A108	16.50
09/08/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
09/08/16	VGJ	Assemble and	0.30	B110	A111	49.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		electronically file the proposed Agreed Order Granting Motion for Relief from Stay (Burge) with the Court				
09/08/16	VGJ	Revise Agreed Order Granting Motion for Relief from Stay and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
09/08/16	VGJ	Assemble and electronically file the Response of the Debtors to Motion for Relief from Stay with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
09/09/16	CHM	Review/analyze/revise confirmation order	1.20	B320	A104	462.00
09/09/16	JLG	Review each document addressed in comments and consider applicability based on survey.	2.50	B250	A104	837.50
09/09/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement on comments to title commitment.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher and Jon Nash regarding liability policy on 320-acre tract	0.30	B210	A108	147.00
09/09/16	VGJ	Assemble Agreed Order Granting Motion for Relief from Stay (Burge) and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
09/12/16	CHM	Review documents related to title work	0.20	B250	A104	77.00
09/12/16	CHM	Review reply of the Office of the United States Trustee in support of objection to confirmation	0.20	B320	A104	77.00
09/12/16	JLG	Study of survey and questions posed by Rod	0.80	B250	A104	268.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Clement.				
09/12/16	JLG	Correspondence with Lisa Usry about title exceptions.	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
09/12/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor about legitimacy of lease parcels from county.	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
09/12/16	JLG	Telephone call from Michael Caples about time line for title work and prospective purchaser.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/12/16	SWR	Review reply of United States Trustee to response of Debtors to objection of United States Trustee to confirmation of First Amended Joint Plan	0.20	B320	A104	98.00
09/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Galloway regarding question concerning leases with Jackson County	0.20	B130	A105	98.00
09/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with Aaron Samuels and Jon Nash regarding retention of Horne to prepare 2015 tax returns of Debtors	0.30	B160	A106	147.00
09/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding reply of United States Trustee to response of Mississippi Phosphates to objection of United States Trustee to confirmation of First Amended Plan	0.10	B320	A106	49.00
09/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding overview of pending workers compensation	0.40	B120	A107	196.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		insurance claims				
09/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding request for current status report on workers compensation insurance claims	0.20	B120	A107	98.00
09/13/16	CHM	Review correspondence from counsel to Steel regarding relief from stay	0.20	B140	A104	77.00
09/13/16	JLG	Work with Rod Clement and Lisa Usry on title commitment exceptions.	3.00	B250	A103	1,005.00
09/13/16	JMC	Correspondence regarding workers' compensation claims of K. Steel.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
09/13/16	SWR	Revise Horne Statement to Application to retain Horne to prepare tax returns to modify scope of work and allocation of fees	0.50	B160	A103	245.00
09/13/16	SWR	Work on order confirming chapter 11 plan	0.60	B320	A103	294.00
09/13/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding reduced scope of work and allocation of fees for 2015 tax returns	0.30	B160	A106	147.00
09/13/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding variety of open items	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
09/13/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Horne retention, scope of work, and allocation of fees	0.30	B160	A107	147.00
09/13/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger	0.20	B210	A107	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		regarding chart of workers compensation insurance claims				
09/13/16	SWR	Correspondence with Wendy Eversole regarding Horne retention application and statement in support	0.20	B160	A108	98.00
09/14/16	CHM	Review/analyze draft of confirmation order	0.90	B320	A104	346.50
09/14/16	JLG	Continue review of exception documents commented on by Rod Clement.	1.50	B250	A104	502.50
09/14/16	JLG	Telephone call to Lisa Usry with suggestions for revised title commitment.	0.40	B250	A108	134.00
09/14/16	MCA	Emails from/to P. Murphy and S. Rosenblatt re: Steel lawsuit and follow up re: same	0.50	L120	A101	125.00
09/14/16	PSM	Review of prior MTL Stay on General Liability claim and status of SIR	0.30	L120	A104	88.50
09/14/16	PSM	Review of prior MTL Stay on General Liability claim and status of SIR	0.30	L120	A104	88.50
09/14/16	PSM	Receipt and review of email from counsel for creditor K. Steel; forward advisory email to counsel.	0.30	L120	A107	88.50
09/14/16	SWR	Further work on findings, conclusions, and order confirming chapter 11 plan	0.70	B320	A103	343.00
09/14/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding Steel litigation	0.40	B430	A105	196.00

BUTLER | SNOW

09/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding proposed confirmation order	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
09/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Horne regarding allocation of fees for preparation of 2015 income tax returns	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
09/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed findings, conclusions, and confirmation order	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
09/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree and counsel for Committee regarding Steel claim against Mississippi Phosphates	0.40	B430	A107	196.00
09/15/16	SWR	Work on narrative for August 2016 monthly operating reports	0.80	B110	A103	392.00
09/15/16	SWR	Revise application to retain Horne and supporting affidavit for changed scope of work and shared fees	0.50	B160	A103	245.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding August monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding effective date of First Amended Plan	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding interplead funds into registry of court	0.10	B120	A107	49.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding sale orders and	0.40	B130	A107	196.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		documents and workers compensation insurance issues				
09/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Roy Furrh regarding allowed administrative claim of MDEQ	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding status report on confirmation order	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding effective date for chapter 11 plan	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
09/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Wendy Eversole and Aaron Samuels of Horne regarding revised affidavit and application	0.20	B160	A108	98.00
09/16/16	JLG	Prepare first revised title commitment following discussions with counsel for liquidation trust	2.10	L140	A103	703.50
09/16/16	SWR	Finalize and file application to retain Horne to prepare and file 2015 tax returns	0.30	B160	A103	147.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Michael McCabe regarding AIG contact person for Steel litigation	0.10	B430	A105	49.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding Trammo lease extension request	0.20	B120	A106	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Horne regarding filing of retention application and notice	0.20	B160	A106	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ryan Papir of Trammo regarding proposed letter agreement for extension of termination date	0.20	B120	A107	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for counsel for Committee regarding Horne retention application	0.20	B160	A107	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding AIG contact person for Steel litigation	0.20	B430	A107	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jeff Minnis regarding requested extension by Trammo of effective date of lease termination	0.20	B120	A108	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Liquidation Trustee and counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding order granting motion to assume Trammo lease as amended	0.20	B120	A108	98.00
09/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Wendy Eversole of Horne LLP regarding affidavit for retention application	0.30	B160	A108	147.00
09/16/16	TMH	Work on notice of Horne application	0.90	B160	A103	171.00
09/16/16	TMH	Correspondence with BMC re Horne Application and Notice	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
09/19/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement's office about specific exceptions and homestead sites as part of liquidation trust	0.40	L140	A108	134.00
09/19/16	SEK	Drafted check requisition form in preparation of	0.20	B120	A103	28.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		forwarding payment to Joseph Poirrier for title update for numerous parcels in Jackson County.				
09/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Puga (MPC Environmental Trustee) regarding Mississippi Power easement issue	0.20	B210	A108	98.00
09/19/16	TMH	Correspondence with Clerk regarding Horne application	0.30	B160	A108	57.00
09/20/16	CHM	Correspondence regarding Mississippi Power easements	0.20	B250	A108	77.00
09/20/16	JLG	Correspondence with Lisa Usry about homestead sites.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/20/16	JMC	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding claim of William Burge.	0.20	B310	A107	39.00
09/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding submission of order on Burge longshoreman's compensation claim	0.10	B140	A105	49.00
09/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding submission of Order on motion to lift automatic stay on Burge longshoreman's compensation claim	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
09/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed draft of confirmation order	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
09/20/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
09/20/16	VGJ	Assemble and	0.30	B110	A111	49.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		electronically file the proposed Agreed Order on Burge Stay Relief Motion with the Court				
09/20/16	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Returned Mail to Debtor, research for current address	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
09/20/16	VGJ	Electronically file BMC Group's Affidavit of Service with the Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
09/21/16	CHM	Review/analyze assignment documents from counsel to the Liquidation Trust	0.20	B130	A104	77.00
09/21/16	JLG	Assemble and forward needed information to abstractor.	0.40	B250	A104	134.00
09/21/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor regarding legal access to homestead sites.	0.10	B250	A108	33.50
09/21/16	JLG	Travel to courthouse and discuss new requirements with abstractor.	0.80	B250	A108	268.00
09/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding execution of amended assumption and assignment of Trammo lease	0.30	B130	A106	147.00
09/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding execution of amended assumption and assignment of Trammo lease	0.30	B130	A107	147.00
09/21/16	SWR	Telephone conference with John Lammert regarding status of bankruptcy case and course of action regarding tax disputes	0.30	B240	A108	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

09/22/16	JLG	Finalize and issue revised title commitment.	1.10	B250	A103	368.50
09/22/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement about access issues.	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
09/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Scott Nelson regarding claim of William Burge.	0.10	B310	A107	19.50
09/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding order granting motion to lift automatic stay on Burge claim	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
09/22/16	VGJ	Review of court docket re status of orders	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
09/23/16	SWR	Work on section of confirmation order regarding reservation and preservation of rights	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
09/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed insert to confirmation order and request for status report on prior draft	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
09/26/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to confirmation order provided by committee counsel and related correspondence	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
09/26/16	JLG	Complete over limits request form and forward to Stewart Title.	0.90	B250	A103	301.50
09/26/16	JLG	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding policy costs.	0.10	B250	A108	33.50
09/26/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title regarding title policy	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B130	A105	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		John Galloway regarding budgeted amount for title insurance				
09/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding title insurance allocation	0.20	B130	A106	98.00
09/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding additional provisions for confirmation order	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
09/27/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed inserts to confirmation order proposed by counsel to the committee	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
09/27/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust regarding release of documents evidencing encumbrances	0.20	B250	A107	77.00
09/27/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Scott Nelson regarding agreed order.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
09/27/16	SWR	Work on additional inserts for confirmation order	0.70	B320	A103	343.00
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding submission of Horne retention order	0.20	B160	A105	98.00
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding confirmation order	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding order approving of Horne retention	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding Trammo deeds of trust	0.40	B130	A107	196.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		and indebtedness				
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding status of entry of order granting motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
09/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding additional inserts for confirmation order	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
09/27/16	TMH	Work on order to employ Horne to incorporate UST comments	0.40	B160	A103	76.00
09/27/16	VGJ	Correspondence with W. Watson (Court) re status of workers compensation proposed Order	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
09/28/16	JLG	Correspondence with Rod Clement about title commitment.	0.10	B250	A108	33.50
09/28/16	JLG	Telephone call from Lisa Usry about legal descriptions.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/28/16	JLG	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and others about title premium.	0.40	B250	A108	134.00
09/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding payment of title insurance premiums	0.30	B130	A106	147.00
09/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding title insurance premiums	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
09/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding drafts of deeds to convey real property to the Liquidation Trust and the	0.30	B130	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

09/28/16	SWR	Environmental Trust Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding refining of proposed confirmation order	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
09/29/16	JLG	Respond to comments and questions raised by counsel for the Environmental Trust.	0.30	B250	A103	100.50
09/29/16	JLG	Review survey of Environmental Trust property on questions raised about exceptions.	1.00	B250	A104	335.00
09/29/16	JLG	Review proposed deeds and comments from counsel for the trusts.	0.60	B250	A104	201.00
09/29/16	JLG	Correspondence regarding form of conveyances to Liquidation Trust and Environmental Trust.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
09/29/16	PSM	Emails to/from counsel for claimant K. Steel re: Motion for Rule 2004 exam and General Liability policy; advise bankruptcy team on same.	0.40	L120	A107	118.00
09/29/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Gordon Gouveia regarding David Phelps' compensation statement	0.30	B160	A107	147.00
09/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Lammert regarding request for status report on ad valorem tax litigation	0.20	B240	A108	98.00
09/30/16	PSM	Follow up emails to/from L. Murphree re: General Liability policy and stay	0.30	L120	A107	88.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		relief for claimant K. Steel.				
09/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding communications with counsel for Kristopher Steel regarding motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
09/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding assumption and assignment of Trammo lease	0.20	B185	A106	98.00
09/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding documentation for sale to Liquidation Trust and Environmental Trust	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
09/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding response of AIG to motion to lift automatic stay by Kristopher Steel	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
09/30/16	TMH	Research permits transferred to liquidation trust and environmental trust	0.20	B110	A102	38.00
10/03/16	JLG	Review copies of requested exception documents.	0.50	B250	A102	167.50
10/03/16	JLG	Correspondence with Lisa Usry regarding title issues	0.10	B250	A108	33.50
10/03/16	SWR	Correspondence with Scott Nelson regarding relief from stay for Burge claim to proceed	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
10/04/16	CHM	Review final draft of confirmation order and related correspondence	0.50	B320	A104	192.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		with counsel				
10/04/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to Liquidation Trust regarding assumption and assignment of Trammo lease	0.30	B130	A107	115.50
10/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding assumption and assignment agreement	0.20	B130	A106	98.00
10/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding premium for title policy	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
10/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with Steve Buxbaum regarding assumption and assignment of Trammo lease	0.30	B130	A107	147.00
10/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for interested parties regarding draft of approved confirmation orders	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
10/05/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust regarding recording of documents	0.20	B250	A107	77.00
10/05/16	JLG	Follow up with Stewart Title on approval of commitment and policy.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
10/05/16	SWR	Review and revise compensation statement of Stillwater Advisory Group	0.50	B160	A104	245.00
10/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding compensation statement of Stillwater Advisory Group and filing of same	0.20	B160	A106	98.00
10/05/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B160	A107	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		Gordon Gouveia regarding compensation statement of Stillwater Advisory Group				
10/05/16	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order Granting Application to Retain Horne and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
10/06/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding analysis of avoidance actions	0.20	B120	A106	77.00
10/06/16	SWR	Work on narrative for September monthly operating reports	0.60	B110	A103	294.00
10/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding narrative for September monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
10/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding title insurance premium	0.20	B130	A106	98.00
10/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding avoidance action analysis and conference call with counsel for Committee	0.30	B180	A106	147.00
10/06/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for environmental trust regarding confirmation order	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
10/06/16	SWR	Voicemail from Steve Buxbaum regarding title insurance premium	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
10/06/16	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding timing of effective date, entry of confirmation order,	0.60	B110	A107	294.00