



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:2

05/03/16	TMH	Correspondence with Deloitte regarding MOR needs and information	0.20	B110	A106	38.00
05/03/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
05/03/16	VGJ	Assemble Order and Notice of Plan and Disclosure Statement with exhibits for mailing to all parties on the court matrix and forward to BMC for service	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
05/03/16	VGJ	Receipt of February 2016 MOR information for MPC, ATS and SATS; revise same; and electronically file same with Court	1.20	B110	A111	198.00
05/03/16	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Returned Mail to Debtor, search for new addresses	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
05/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt and Velvet Johnson regarding narratives and financial information for March and April monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
05/04/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding filing of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
05/04/16	TMH	Work on narrative for March MOR	0.50	B110	A103	95.00
05/04/16	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Returned Mail to Debtor, search for new address; prepare Notice of Change of Address	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
05/05/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for	0.20	B110	A110	33.00

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:3

BUTLER | SNOW

		attorneys				
05/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding application for fees and expenses	0.20	B160	A105	98.00
05/06/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with J. Myers with BMC re Affidavit of Service and mailout	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
05/06/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with Bob Fishman re Disclosure Statement and Plan	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
05/06/16	VGJ	Finalize Affidavit of Service for BMC and electronically file same with Court regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan mailout	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
05/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding payment of United States Trustee fees	0.10	B110	A107	49.00
05/10/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding payment of quarterly United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
05/10/16	TMH	Correspondence with Deloitte re BMA contract	0.30	B110	A106	57.00
05/12/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding quarterly United States Trustee fees and quarterly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
05/13/16	TMH	Work on fifth fee application and research all statements from December 2015 through April 2016	1.40	B160	A103	266.00
05/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Fishman regarding plan provisions	0.30	B320	A107	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:4

05/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding solicitation procedures	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
05/16/16	TMH	Finalize fifth fee application for Butler Snow	0.40	B160	A103	76.00
05/16/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
05/16/16	VGJ	Prepare, finalize, assemble and electronically file the 21 Day Notice of the Fifth Fee Application of Butler Snow with the Court and forward to BMC for mailing to all parties on Shortened Service List	1.50	B110	A111	247.50
05/16/16	VGJ	Finalize, assemble and electronically file the Fifth Fee Application of Butler Snow with the Court	1.30	B110	A111	214.50
05/17/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC re notice requirements for disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A108	115.50
05/17/16	SWR	Internal communication obtaining information requested by United States Trustee in connection with Butler Snow fee application	0.30	B160	A105	147.00
05/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding request for additional documents and information regarding fee application	0.20	B160	A107	98.00
05/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel regarding	0.30	B110	A108	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		solicitation procedures for chapter 11 plan and disclosure statement				
05/17/16	TMH	Work on order for Fifth Fee Application	0.90	B160	A103	171.00
05/17/16	TMH	Correspondence with UST re Fifth Fee Application	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
05/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding approach of unsecured creditors committee on preference actions	0.20	B180	A106	98.00
05/18/16	VGJ	Several emails with B. Daniel with BMC re solicitation procedures	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
05/19/16	CHM	Review/analyze revised preference analysis	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
05/19/16	JLG	Secure copies of requested instruments and correspondence with surveyor re same.	0.70	B250	A102	234.50
05/19/16	JLG	Review prior title commitment and respond to additional surveyor questions.	1.00	B250	A104	335.00
05/19/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor re requested information.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
05/19/16	JMC	Work on motion to modify automatic stay as to the workers' compensation insurance policies.	1.10	B140	A103	214.50
05/19/16	JMC	Review and analysis of settlement agreements in connection with motion to modify automatic stay as to the workers' compensation insurance policies.	0.10	B140	A104	19.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:6

05/19/16	JMC	Review and analysis of case law and other authorities in connection with drafting and revising motion to modify automatic stay as to the workers' compensation insurance policies.	0.80	B140	A104	156.00
05/19/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt in connection with motion to modify automatic stay as to the workers' compensation insurance policies.	0.20	B140	A105	39.00
05/19/16	SWR	Internal communication regarding items requested by United States Trustee regarding fee application	0.20	B160	A105	98.00
05/19/16	SWR	Conference with Velvet Johnson regarding revised preference analysis using gross numbers	0.30	B180	A105	147.00
05/19/16	SWR	Internal communication re 940 employment tax return for fourth quarter 2015	0.20	B210	A105	98.00
05/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson and Thomas Hewitt regarding status of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
05/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding providing requested information regarding Fifth Fee Application of Butler Snow	0.20	B160	A107	98.00
05/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Marc Solomon and Derek Meek regarding transfers	0.30	B180	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		within 90 days of petition date				
05/19/16	TMH	Work on and finalize March MOR Narrative	0.30	B110	A103	57.00
05/19/16	TMH	Correspondence with Deloitte re financial data for March 2016 MOR	0.20	B110	A106	38.00
05/19/16	TMH	Correspondence with Deloitte regarding missing tax return and correspondence from the IRS	0.20	B110	A106	38.00
05/19/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re March MORs	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
05/19/16	VGJ	Email and interoffice meeting with S. Rosenblatt re disbursement analysis from Deloitte	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
05/19/16	VGJ	Revise MPC Disbursement and Avoidance Analysis from Deloitte; begin working on Word document of same for inserting into pleading	2.50	B110	A110	412.50
05/19/16	VGJ	Finalize and assemble Affidavit of Service from BMC re noticing of Fifth Fee Application of Butler Snow and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
05/20/16	CHM	Review final draft of survey	0.40	B130	A104	154.00
05/20/16	CHM	Correspondence with surveyor re final draft of survey	0.20	B130	A108	77.00
05/20/16	JLG	Review draft survey circulated by surveyor.	0.50	B250	A104	167.50
05/20/16	JLG	Correspondence with	0.30	B250	A108	100.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		surveyor about exception documents.				
05/20/16	JMC	Revise and finalize motion to modify automatic stay regarding workers' compensation policies.	1.50	B140	A103	292.50
05/20/16	SWR	Review and revise motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A104	98.00
05/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding motion to modify automatic stay for workers compensation insurance	0.20	B140	A105	98.00
05/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mark Otto (surveyor) regarding survey results	0.20	B130	A108	98.00
05/20/16	VGJ	Search for new addresses for creditors, prepare a Notice of Change of Address and electronically file same with Court	1.50	B110	A111	247.50
05/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding financials for April monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
05/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding 940 tax return	0.20	B210	A106	98.00
05/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding February invoice in connection with Fifth Fee Application	0.20	B160	A107	98.00
05/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree (counsel for AIG) regarding question about plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:9

05/23/16	CHM	Review/analyze options with respect to solicitation procedures and related correspondence	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
05/23/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC regarding solicitation procedures	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
05/23/16	JLG	Review back title history and forward relevant information to title company.	1.10	B250	A104	368.50
05/23/16	JLG	Telephone call to surveyor about new draft survey.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
05/23/16	JLG	Telephone call to Stewart Title about requirements for preparation of commitment.	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding plan noticing issues	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Fishman regarding D&O insurance policies	0.40	B120	A107	196.00
05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for AIG regarding status of workers compensation insurance policies and general liability insurance policies and plan treatment	0.50	B120	A107	245.00
05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan amendment issues	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding solicitation issues	0.20	B110	A108	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:10

05/23/16	SWR	Correspondence with Linda Zwicker regarding applicable D&O insurance policies	0.20	B120	A108	98.00
05/23/16	TMH	Review D&O policies of MPC	0.30	B110	A102	57.00
05/23/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt and team re noticing procedures	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
05/23/16	VGJ	Retrieve the various insurance policies requested by S. Rosenblatt for B. Fishman and email same to T. Hewitt for review	0.50	B110	A110	82.50
05/24/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to liquidation trust and surveyor regarding release of final survey	0.40	B130	A107	154.00
05/24/16	CHM	Telephone conference and other correspondence with counsel to liquidation trust regarding plan provisions	0.50	B320	A107	192.50
05/24/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding plan provisions	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
05/24/16	JLG	Secure copies of paper surveys and conduct in depth review of same.	1.20	B250	A104	402.00
05/24/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title about title issues.	0.20	B250	A108	67.00
05/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding amendments to plan	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
05/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Fishman regarding D&O insurance policies	0.20	B120	A107	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:11

05/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Lisa Usry and Mark Otto regarding survey	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
05/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan amendment issues	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
05/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Bob Fishman regarding covered parties issue	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
05/24/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding amendments to Plan and allowed claim of Liquidation Trust	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
05/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Linda Zwicker and Steve Fitzsimonds regarding status of D&O insurance policies	0.20	B120	A108	98.00
05/24/16	TMH	Work on April 2016 Narrative for MOR	1.10	B110	A103	209.00
05/24/16	VGJ	Telephone conference with B. McDaniel with BMC re returned mail and change of addresses	0.30	B110	A108	49.50
05/25/16	JMC	Prepare order on motion to modify automatic stay as to workers' compensation policies	0.80	B140	A103	156.00
05/25/16	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding motion to modify automatic stay as to workers' compensation policies and proposed order granting same.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
05/26/16	JLG	Search and provide copies of all prior title reports and policies to	2.00	B250	A102	670.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:12

		Stewart Title.				
05/26/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title about title and survey.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
05/26/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding status of motion to modify automatic stay as to workers' compensation and proposed order granting same.	0.20	B140	A105	39.00
05/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding workers compensation insurance issues	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
05/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Lisa Usry regarding survey	0.20	B130	A107	98.00
05/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Linda Zwicker regarding update on workers compensation insurance issues, including payments of claims and retention amounts for workers compensation insurance and general liability insurance	0.30	B120	A108	147.00
05/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding status of workers compensation insurance motion	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
05/31/16	JLG	Review of survey prior to conference call with Stewart Title	0.50	L140	A104	167.50
05/31/16	JLG	Conference call with Stewart Title about issuance of policy and title issues	0.50	L140	A108	167.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:13

05/31/16	JLG	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt about title requirements and orders	0.30	L140	A110	100.50
05/31/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Galloway regarding documents and information on Liquidation Trust and Environmental Trust	0.30	B130	A105	147.00
05/31/16	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding payment of United States Trustee fees and filing of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
05/31/16	SWR	Correspondence with Samantha VonSchriltz regarding United States Trustee fees and monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
05/31/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt re outstanding US Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
05/31/16	VGJ	Retrieve documents for title company out of the bankruptcy court pleadings for John Galloway	0.70	B110	A110	115.50
06/01/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to AIG re plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/01/16	SWR	Work on budget and staffing plans for May, June, and July 2016.	0.80	B110	A104	392.00
06/01/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Leland Murphree and Ryan Thompson regarding AIG Insurance issues with plan and disclosure statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/02/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.10	B320	A105	49.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:14

		Paul Murphy regarding call from Kate Heitzenrater regarding ACE Insurance				
06/02/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding position of ACE Insurance regarding plan and disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/02/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mark Otto and Jon Nash regarding survey	0.20	B130	A108	98.00
06/02/16	TMH	Correspondence with ACE insurance regarding possible language for plan	0.20	B320	A107	38.00
06/03/16	CHM	Teleconference with counsel to State of Mississippi re plan and disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A107	154.00
06/03/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Arsalan Muhammad regarding requested extension to file response to disclosure statement	0.40	B110	A107	196.00
06/03/16	TMH	Draft Order granting Fifth Fee Application for Butler Snow	1.40	B160	A103	266.00
06/03/16	TMH	Review language provided by ACE insurance suggested to be included in the plan	0.20	B320	A104	38.00
06/06/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed plan language requested by counsel to Chubb	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/06/16	CHM	Review/analyze objection to disclosure statement filed by AIG	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/06/16	CHM	Review pleadings and briefs filed in adversary	0.90	B430	A104	346.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:15

		proceeding with respect to Mississippi Power refund				
06/06/16	CHM	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/06/16	CHM	Correspondence from surveyor regarding revisions to survey	0.20	B130	A108	77.00
06/06/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor about form and content of certification on survey.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/06/16	JLG	Telephone call from Stewart Title with commitment questions.	0.40	B250	A108	134.00
06/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Lenders and ACE regarding extension of deadline to object to disclosure statement	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed language to address the ACE Insurance issue	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
06/06/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Leland Murphree regarding objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/06/16	SWR	Correspondence with Arsalan Muhammad regarding extension to objection deadline for disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
06/06/16	TMH	Correspondence with counsel for ACE Insurance regarding additional language	0.30	B320	A107	57.00
06/07/16	JLG	Email and telephonic	0.80	B250	A108	268.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:16

		conference with title company about form and content of title commitment.				
06/07/16	SWR	Review limited objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A104	196.00
06/07/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding application to employ Meadowlark Advisors	0.20	B160	A105	98.00
06/07/16	TMH	Work on application to employ Meadowlark Advisors	1.20	B160	A103	228.00
06/08/16	JLG	Work on draft of new commitment incorporating new survey and exception inclusions.	2.00	B250	A103	670.00
06/08/16	JLG	Telephone call to title company re title commitment	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/08/16	JLG	Respond to title company questions about bankruptcy papers previously provided.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/08/16	SWR	Review and revise proposed order granting Fifth Fee Application	0.30	B160	A103	147.00
06/08/16	SWR	Work on proposed language to resolve objection of ACE Insurance to disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/08/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed language to resolve ACE Insurance objections to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
06/08/16	TMH	Correspondence with UST regarding proposed	0.20	B160	A107	38.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:17

		changes made to Fifth Fee Application				
06/08/16	VGJ	Interoffice communication with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re proposed Order for Fifth Fee App	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
06/08/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
06/09/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to ACE regarding objection to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
06/09/16	JLG	Proof information on survey against exception items listed in title commitment.	0.80	B250	A104	268.00
06/09/16	JLG	Check legal descriptions on survey against commitment descriptions.	0.50	B250	A104	167.50
06/09/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding ACE Insurance language for disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/09/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Leland Murphree regarding proposed language to resolve objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/09/16	TMH	Correspondence with UST regarding Fifth Fee Application	0.10	B160	A107	19.00
06/09/16	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order Granting Fee App for Butler Snow and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
06/10/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B210	A107	98.00



		Paul Delcambre regarding National Electric Safety Code issue				
06/10/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding objection to disclosure statement by ACE Insurance Companies	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/11/16	SWR	Review objections of ACE Insurance and AIG to Disclosure Statement	0.50	B320	A104	245.00
06/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Mississippi Power easement issue	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
06/11/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding issues to discuss in conference call on Monday	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/13/16	CHM	Review correspondence from counsel to MS Power re transmission lines	0.20	B210	A104	77.00
06/13/16	CHM	Review proposed language from AIG to potentially resolve disclosure statement objection	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/13/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding case administrative matters	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/13/16	CHM	Correspondence with surveyor re finalizing survey	0.20	B130	A108	77.00
06/13/16	SWR	Work on proposed language for plan to address objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A103	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:19

06/13/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Lammert regarding update on bankruptcy case	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
06/13/16	TMH	Review BMA Engineers document	0.10	B130	A104	19.00
06/14/16	CHM	Review/analyze language proposed by ACE Insurance to potentially resolve disclosure statement objection	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/14/16	CHM	Review/analyze disclosure statement objection filed by ACE Insurance	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/14/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re MORs and payment of UST fees	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/14/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to ACE Insurance re disclosure statement objection	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/14/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC re solicitation procedures	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
06/14/16	JLG	Check final surveys circulated for changes requested.	0.30	B250	A104	100.50
06/14/16	JLG	Correspondence with surveyor regarding final surveys	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Mitch Carrington regarding subpoena on David Phelps	0.30	B110	A105	147.00
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding payment of United States Trustee fees and filing of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:20

06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding conference call to discuss issues for disclosure statement hearing	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status report on monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Gordon Gouveia and Bob Fishman regarding amendments to plan and service of subpoena by McCain Engineering	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding Plan language to resolve objections of ACE Insurance	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
06/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding disclosure statement hearing	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
06/14/16	TMH	Correspondence with counsel for ACE insurance regarding plan language	0.20	B320	A107	38.00
06/14/16	VGJ	Prepare two hearing notebooks on Disclosure Statement and Plan	0.80	B110	A110	132.00
06/15/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to resolve AIG objection to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/15/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to resolve ACE objection to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/15/16	CHM	Review revised schedule	0.30	B320	A104	115.50



		to disclosure statement reflecting transfers				
06/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re preparation for disclosure statement hearing	0.20	B320	A106	77.00
06/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel and counsel to ACE re proposed revisions to resolve ACE objection to disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
06/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to AIG re proposed revisions to resolve AIG objection to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel re language to resolve AIG objection to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/15/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel re objections to disclosure statement and plan amendments	0.80	B320	A107	308.00
06/15/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to ACE Insurance and committee counsel re disclosure statement objection	0.50	B320	A107	192.50
06/15/16	JMC	Review and analysis of parties in non-debtor litigation to obtain documents and other information of the Debtors.	0.50	B190	A104	97.50
06/15/16	SWR	Revise and update list of items to discuss in	0.30	B110	A103	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:22

		conference call				
06/15/16	SWR	Work on proposed language to resolve objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/15/16	SWR	Work on amended and revised Schedule 5.13 to plan	0.70	B320	A103	343.00
06/15/16	SWR	Review financial information for March 2016 for monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A104	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt and Velvet Johnson regarding preparation of March monthly operating reports for filing	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding signing monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding filing of monthly operating reports and payment of United States Trustee fees	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding report on resolution of ACE objection to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding availability for confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A106	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal and Ron McAlpin regarding cash disbursements for purpose of payment of	0.30	B110	A107	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:23

		United States Trustee fees				
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status report on filing of monthly operating reports and payments of United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding revised and updated list of issues	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Prepare for and participate in extended conference call with counsel for Committee regarding case administration issues to address regarding disclosure statement and plan	1.30	B110	A107	637.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with Kate Heitzenrater (counsel for ACE) regarding resolution of objection of ACE to disclosure statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding revised Schedule 5.13 and points to cover at tomorrow's disclosure statement hearing	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed language to resolve objection of AIG to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
06/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mark Otto regarding hard	0.20	B130	A108	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:24

		copy of survey				
06/16/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to AIG re plan amendment	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/16/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to ACE re resolution of objection to disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding February monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
06/16/16	SWR	Telephone conference and conference with counsel for AIG regarding resolution of objection to disclosure statement and workers compensation insurance issues and other matters	0.90	B110	A107	441.00
06/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee and AIG regarding workers compensation insurance issues	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding agreed language for plan modification	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
06/16/16	SWR	Conference with counsel for Committee regarding follow-up items from disclosure statement hearing	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
06/16/16	SWR	Appear and participate in hearing on disclosure statement for Joint Plan	0.70	B320	A109	343.00
06/16/16	SWR	Travel to and from Coast for hearing on approval of disclosure statement	3.10	B195	A112	1,519.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:25

		(1/2 time)				
06/16/16	TMH	Review MORs for March and April 2016	0.40	B110	A104	76.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re January, February and March MORs	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/16/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with R. Kerley re executing the March 2016 MORs	0.20	B110	A106	33.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
06/16/16	VGJ	Revise April 2016 MORs for all 3 entities	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/16/16	VGJ	Receipt, review and assemble the March 2016 MORs for all 3 entities and electronically file same with Court	1.70	B110	A111	280.50
06/17/16	CHM	Review/analyze SOFAs in connection with amendment to Schedule 5.1.3 of Plan	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/17/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re finalizing monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/17/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title regarding title commitment.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/17/16	SWR	Work on narrative for May monthly operating reports	0.40	B110	A103	196.00
06/17/16	SWR	Work on changes to Schedule 5.13 per the Committee's request	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/17/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding information regarding transfers to	0.30	B180	A107	147.00



		insiders				
06/17/16	VGJ	Interoffice emails with S. Rosenblatt re payments to insiders	0.30	B110	A105	49.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Retrieve information on payments to insiders for S. Rosenblatt	0.30	B110	A110	49.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Finalize, assemble and electronically file the March 2016 MORs for all 3 entities with the court.	0.70	B110	A111	115.50
06/17/16	VGJ	Finalize and assemble April 2016 Monthly Operating Reports for all 3 entities and email to R. Kerley for approval	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/20/16	CHM	Review proposed order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/20/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to plan	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
06/20/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC re solicitation procedures	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
06/20/16	JLG	Update title to plant site	2.00	B250	A104	670.00
06/20/16	JMC	Work on review of certain documents in connection with McCain Engineering subpoena to David Phelps.	0.30	B190	A104	58.50
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize generic order approving disclosure statement	0.50	B110	A103	245.00
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize changes to First Amended Disclosure Statement	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/20/16	SWR	Work on and finalize changes to First Amended Joint Plan	1.80	B320	A103	882.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with VJ Barham regarding update	0.30	B320	A105	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:27

		index for First Amended Joint Plan				
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding developments in case	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed generic order approving disclosure statement	0.20	B110	A107	98.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree (counsel for AIG) regarding First Amended Joint Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding status report on disclosure statement hearing	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/21/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel re plan confirmation issues	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/21/16	SWR	Work on Schedule 5.13 to First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Work on order approving First Amended Disclosure Statement	0.70	B320	A103	343.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding solicitation materials and procedures	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Kate Heitzenrater regarding order resolving objection of ACE Insurance Companies	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree regarding First Amended Plan and Disclosure	0.20	B320	A107	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:28

		Statement				
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding solicitation materials for First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC regarding solicitation issues	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with John Lammert regarding status report on disclosure statement hearing	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
06/21/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
06/22/16	CHM	Correspondence with management re monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	77.00
06/22/16	SWR	Work on exhibit to First Amended Plan	0.40	B320	A103	196.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Jon Nash regarding amended January monthly operating report and United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee regarding first quarterly United States Trustee fees and amended monthly operating report for January 2016	0.30	B110	A107	147.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding approval of Order approving disclosure statement and related matters	0.20	B110	A107	98.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:29

06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding revised plan and disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A107	196.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for objecting parties and interested parties regarding order approving disclosure statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with BMC Group regarding claims analysis, solicitation procedures, and coordination with counsel for Committee	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/22/16	VGJ	Finalize and electronically file the April 2016 Monthly Operating Reports with the Court for all 3 entities	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/23/16	CHM	Review/analyze proofs of claim filed by ACE and Westchester	0.40	B310	A104	154.00
06/23/16	VGJ	Prepare revisions to January 2016 MOR to reflect proper cash disbursements	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
06/23/16	VGJ	Revise Exhibit "A" to Section 5.13 of Plan	0.60	B110	A111	99.00
06/24/16	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to plan and disclosure statement	0.70	B320	A104	269.50
06/24/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to order approving disclosure statement	0.20	B320	A104	77.00
06/24/16	SWR	Correspondence with Leland Murphree, Kate Heitzenrater, and Marc Solomon regarding approval of order	0.50	B320	A107	245.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:30

		approving disclosure statement				
06/25/16	SWR	Work on Schedule 5.13 to First Amended Plan	0.30	B320	A103	147.00
06/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with interested parties regarding generic order approving disclosure statement and First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.50	B320	A107	245.00
06/27/16	CHM	Review proofs of claim of employees for severance claims	0.50	B310	A104	192.50
06/27/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to order approving disclosure statement	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
06/27/16	CHM	Review proposed revisions to plan and disclosure statement	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
06/27/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the liquidation survey re final survey and deeds	0.20	B130	A107	77.00
06/27/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel re disclosure statement and solicitation procedures	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
06/27/16	JLG	Correspondence with Stewart Title about deeds to trusts and exceptions list.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
06/27/16	SWR	Review correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater and proof of claim of ACE Insurance Companies	0.30	B310	A104	147.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Ray Carter regarding status of 320-acre parcel	0.30	B130	A107	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:31

06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for MPC Liquidation Trustee and counsel for AIG regarding pending issues regarding transfer of policies	0.40	B130	A107	196.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proof of claim of ACE Insurance Companies	0.20	B310	A107	98.00
06/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Connie Benedictos of AIG regarding updated contacts for MPC	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
06/27/16	SWR	Review correspondence with Linda Zwicker regarding AIG claims data	0.30	B120	A108	147.00
06/27/16	TMH	Correspondence with Trustmark regarding escrow account	0.10	B160	A108	19.00
06/28/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with BMC and committee counsel re balloting, noticing and claim objections	0.80	B320	A107	308.00
06/28/16	CHM	Correspondence with BMC and committee counsel re solicitation matters	0.20	B320	A107	77.00
06/28/16	SWR	Prepare language for amended January 2016 monthly operating report	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
06/28/16	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objections to severance claims	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
06/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee	0.20	B110	A107	98.00