

BUTLER | SNOW

07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Arthur Taylor Claim No. 131	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Carol Taite Claim No. 153	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Derrick D. Reddix Claim No. 241	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Burnis LaForce Claim No. 70	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of R. Holland Claim No. 111	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Robert Guardia Claim No. 69	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Gregory Ezell Claim No. 72	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Gregory Ezell Claim No. 129	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Welborne Collins Claim No. 109	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Carol Cochran Claim No. 686	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Keith Carter Claim No. 188	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of James Trochessett Claim No. 96	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to	0.10	B310	A103	19.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		severance claim of James Woodcock Claim No. 51				
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Milmon Stringfellow	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Willie Reynolds	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Keith Ludgood	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Ronald Griffith	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Shirley Ellett	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Gregory McCloud	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/13/16	TMH	Work on ballot for voting to accept or reject amended joint plan	0.60	B320	A103	114.00
07/13/16	TMH	Review Class 6 - Unsecured Claims to determine what objections are needed	0.60	B310	A104	114.00
07/13/16	TMH	Review omnibus objections to include individual objections to severance claims and prepare for filing	0.60	B310	A104	114.00
07/13/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
07/13/16	VGJ	Assemble Objections to Severance Claims with exhibits, electronically file Objections with Court and mail to the respective Claimants	7.30	B110	A111	1,204.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:64

07/14/16	CHM	Extended work in connection with review/analysis of multiple proofs of claim concerning potential objections to same and related review of drafts and memoranda	5.20	B310	A104	2,002.00
07/14/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding plan supplement and plan solicitation matters	0.30	B320	A107	115.50
07/14/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objection to claim of John Deere for the crawler tractor	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
07/14/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objections to severance claims in addition to other objections	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
07/14/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding balloting and plan supplement issues	0.20	B320	A105	98.00
07/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding application to retain Meadowlark Advisors as CRO	0.30	B110	A106	147.00
07/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan supplement matters	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
07/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Eric Kurdziel regarding termination of Deloitte as CRO	0.20	B110	A108	98.00

BUTLER | SNOW

07/14/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding sample ballot issues	0.20	B300	A108	98.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on objection to John Deere claim	0.80	B310	A103	152.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on form for certificate of service for objections	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Reginald White	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Roger Cochran	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on objection to severance claim of Arthur Taylor	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on Omnibus Objection to Amended and Superseded Claims	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on Omnibus Objection to Non-Complying Claims	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on Omnibus Objection to Duplicate Claims	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/14/16	TMH	Work on Omnibus Objection to Late-Filed Claims	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/14/16	TMH	Review all objections filed to ensure that all drafted objections were filed	1.30	B310	A104	247.00
07/14/16	TMH	Review class 6 unsecured claims for objections	1.80	B310	A104	342.00
07/14/16	VGJ	Prepare draft of Certificate of Service form for all objections to claims	0.30	B110	A103	49.50
07/14/16	VGJ	Continue to assemble	6.50	B110	A111	1,072.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:66

		Objections to Severance Claims with exhibits, electronically file Objections with Court and mail to the respective Claimants				
07/14/16	VGJ	Assemble Omnibus Objections with exhibits	1.20	B110	A111	198.00
07/15/16	CHM	Work in connection with reviewing and finalizing omnibus objections	1.30	B310	A104	500.50
07/15/16	CHM	Review/analyze issues related to plan and confirmation process	0.40	B320	A104	154.00
07/15/16	CHM	Review/analyze classification issues	0.30	B320	A104	115.50
07/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding certain claims	0.20	B310	A106	77.00
07/15/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust regarding tax issues	0.30	B240	A107	115.50
07/15/16	CHM	Multiple correspondence with BMC regarding questions and clarifications related to ballots	0.60	B320	A108	231.00
07/15/16	SWR	Prepare narrative for June monthly operating reports	0.80	B110	A103	392.00
07/15/16	SWR	Prepare narrative for May 2016 monthly operating reports	0.80	B110	A103	392.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding bankruptcy docket and recent filings	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Butler Snow team regarding omnibus objections	0.40	B310	A105	196.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B110	A106	147.00



		Robert Kerley regarding Meadowlark Advisors as replacement CRO				
07/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding information about John Deere crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A106	147.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding 2013 ad valorem taxes	0.20	B240	A106	98.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Virginia LoCoco regarding proposed agreed order on workers compensation insurance claim	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding proposed agreed order on automatic stay on workers compensation insurance	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
07/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Les Alvis regarding status of payments and payoff for John Deere crawler tractor being used by Environmental Trust	0.40	B210	A107	196.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding 2013 ad valorem taxes owed to Jackson County and parcels transferred to Liquidation Trust and Environmental Trust	0.40	B240	A107	196.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding claims objections and	0.30	B310	A107	147.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		hearing on same				
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding plan supplements	0.30	B320	A107	147.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Eric Kurdziel of Deloitte regarding replacement CRO	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
07/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Kyle McCulloch regarding John Deere crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A108	147.00
07/15/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding solicitation classifications and ballots	0.40	B320	A108	196.00
07/15/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding ballot for Mississippi Phosphates chapter 11 Plan	0.30	B320	A108	147.00
07/15/16	TMH	Work on and file claim objection withdrawals for three separate claim objections	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/15/16	TMH	Work on template for withdrawal of objections	0.70	B310	A103	133.00
07/15/16	TMH	Work on revisions to form of ballot	0.30	B320	A103	57.00
07/15/16	TMH	Review all drafted and filed objections to claims for accuracy and completion of all objections	2.20	B310	A104	418.00
07/15/16	TMH	Review ballot markups sent by BMC	0.40	B320	A104	76.00
07/15/16	TMH	Correspondence with	0.20	B320	A108	38.00



		BMC regarding ballot markups				
07/15/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
07/15/16	VGJ	Finalize and Assemble Omnibus Objections with exhibits and electronically file same with Court and assemble for mailing to those certain claimants	3.00	B110	A111	495.00
07/15/16	VGJ	Prepare Certificate of Service for each of the Objections filed, assemble with attachments and electronically file same with Court	3.80	B110	A111	627.00
07/16/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding confirmation of mailing of solicitation materials to creditor matrix yesterday evening	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
07/18/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Karl Steinberger regarding workers' compensation and automatic stay.	0.10	B140	A107	19.50
07/18/16	SWR	Review October 2015 monthly operating report regarding payment to John Deere for the crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A104	147.00
07/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding approval of engagement letter with Meadowlark Advisors as CRO	0.20	B160	A106	98.00
07/18/16	SWR	Correspondence and	0.40	B210	A106	196.00



		telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding information on John Deere crawler tractor and Liquidation Trustee				
07/18/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Les Alvis regarding John Deere crawler tractor past due payments and payoff	0.60	B210	A107	294.00
07/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding resolution of AIG issues	0.20	B320	A107	98.00
07/18/16	SWR	Correspondence with Eric Kurdziel regarding update on replacement CRO	0.30	B110	A108	147.00
07/18/16	SWR	Telephone conference with wife of Reginald White regarding objection to proof of claim for severance pay	0.20	B310	A108	98.00
07/18/16	SWR	Letter to Reginald White regarding objection to proof of claim for severance pay	0.30	B310	A108	147.00
07/18/16	VGJ	Prepare Certificate of Service for each of the Objections filed, assemble with attachments and electronically file same with Court	6.00	B110	A111	990.00
07/19/16	JLG	Telephone abstractor regarding tax redemption certificates	0.30	L140	A108	100.50
07/19/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Arsalan Muhammad	0.10	B130	A107	19.50



		regarding order approving sale to MPC Liquidation Trust.				
07/19/16	SWR	Review statement of account from John Deere regarding crawler tractor	0.20	B110	A104	98.00
07/19/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding correspondence from counsel for John Deere regarding crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A106	147.00
07/19/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding testimony on severance claim objections	0.30	B310	A106	147.00
07/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding retention of Meadowlark Advisors as CRO	0.30	B160	A107	147.00
07/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding conference call to discuss treatment of AIG workers compensation insurance policies	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
07/19/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les Alvis regarding John Deere crawler tractor	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
07/19/16	TMH	Work on notice of withdrawals for claim objections	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/19/16	VGJ	Telephone conference with K. Wilkinson with Dogan and Wilkinson re claims	0.20	B110	A108	33.00
07/19/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with W. Watson (Court)	0.20	B110	A108	33.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:72

		re Certificates of Service				
07/19/16	VGJ	Receipt and review of the May and June 2016 MORs for each entity	0.50	B110	A110	82.50
07/19/16	VGJ	Revise two Certificates of Service and electronically file same with Court	0.60	B110	A111	99.00
07/19/16	VGJ	Prepare Certificate of Service for each of the Omnibus Objections filed, assemble with attachments and electronically file same with Court	2.00	B110	A111	330.00
07/19/16	VGJ	Prepare 4 Notices of Withdrawal of duplicate or corrected objections, assemble with attachment and electronically file same with Court	1.50	B110	A111	247.50
07/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding claims objection chart and preparation of diskette of all claims objections	0.20	B310	A105	98.00
07/20/16	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding preparation for hearing on claims objections	0.30	B310	A106	147.00
07/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding coordination for hearing on claims objections	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
07/20/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group and Jon Nash regarding payment of invoice	0.20	B210	A108	98.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on Meadowlark	1.10	B160	A103	209.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:73

		retention application				
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order for Meadowlark retention application	0.80	B160	A103	152.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on template for order on objected claims	0.80	B310	A103	152.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order sustaining objection to John Deere claim	0.80	B310	A103	152.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objection to amended and superseded claims	0.60	B310	A103	114.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objection to late filed claims	0.50	B310	A103	95.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objection to duplicate claims	0.50	B310	A103	95.00
07/20/16	TMH	Work on order for omnibus objection to non-complying claims	1.20	B310	A103	228.00
07/20/16	TMH	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding objections filed against severance claims	0.30	B160	A108	57.00
07/20/16	VGJ	Search Lexis for updated contact information on S. Russo	0.20	B110	A102	33.00
07/20/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with BMC Group re mailing of Notice of Application to Retain Meadowlark Advisors to parties on Shortened Service List	0.30	B110	A108	49.50
07/20/16	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	33.00
07/20/16	VGJ	Prepare 21 Day Notice for the Application to	0.70	B110	A111	115.50

BUTLER | SNOW

		Retain Meadowlark Advisors, assemble and electronically file same with Court				
07/20/16	VGJ	Prepare 2 CDs of all Objections to Severance Pay to counsel and financial advisor	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
07/20/16	VGJ	Assemble and finalize Application to Retain Meadowlark Advisors and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	49.50
07/21/16	CHM	Review/analyze liquidation trust agreement and related plan provisions	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
07/21/16	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding workers' compensation claim of James Herren and other related issues.	0.20	B140	A107	39.00
07/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding distribution of CDs with claims objections to various professionals	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding agreed order lifting stay	0.20	B140	A107	98.00
07/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel and professionals for Committee regarding claims objections	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
07/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Daniel of BMC Group regarding certificate of service for plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B110	A108	98.00



07/21/16	SWR	Correspondence with Wanda Watson regarding certificate of service for plan and disclosure statement	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Bruce Reece	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of B. LaForce	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Carol Tate	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Carol Cochran	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Daniel Holland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Dennis Lavender	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Gary Scudder	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Guy Vincent	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Herman Gaines	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Johnson	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Woodcock	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Prisock	0.20	B310	A103	38.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:76

07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Stallings	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James White	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Joseph Holland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Keith Broussard	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Mack McDonald	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Russell Hayes	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of William Burge	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of William Otis James	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Alexander Johnston	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Benjamin Vice	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Blake Bagwell	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Christopher Calhoun	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of David Hammond	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of	0.20	B310	A103	38.00

BUTLER | SNOW

		James C. McCarty				
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James C. Trochessett	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Jeffrey Davis	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Joel Raines	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of John M. McClelland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Kyle Fisher	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Mickie Cates	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Dustin McLeod	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Guardia	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Roger Gray	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Stephen Broom	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Walters	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Wilson	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Victor Lemon	0.20	B310	A103	38.00



07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Welborne Collins	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Clyde Glen	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Johnson, Jr.	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/21/16	VGJ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt re chart for objections and preparation of CDs of objections	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
07/21/16	VGJ	Prepare Objection to Claims Chart	1.00	B110	A110	165.00
07/21/16	VGJ	Finalize 2 BMC Certificate of Service and electronically file same with Court re mailing of Plan and Ballots	0.50	B110	A111	82.50
07/22/16	JMC	Work on proposed revisions and actions items in connection with review and analysis of MPC liquidation trust agreement.	1.10	B320	A104	214.50
07/22/16	JMC	Work on review and analysis of draft MPC liquidation trust agreement.	1.20	B320	A104	234.00
07/22/16	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding analysis of draft MPC liquidation trust agreement to be executed in connection with the plan.	0.40	B320	A105	78.00
07/22/16	JMC	Correspondence with Leland Murphree, Arsalan Muhammed and	0.20	B130	A107	39.00



		Steve Rosenblatt regarding order approval sale to MPC liquidation trust.				
07/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding testimony at claims objection hearing	0.20	B310	A106	98.00
07/22/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding conference call to discuss workers compensation insurance and other matters	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
07/22/16	SWR	Telephone conference with Steve Russo regarding testifying at claims objection hearing	0.30	B310	A108	147.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Jerry Duett	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Joe Smith	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Joseph Bell	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Judy Toles	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Lola Langham	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Michael Sheffield	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Obie Eugene Bowman	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining	0.20	B310	A103	38.00



		objection to claim of Stephen Rouse				
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Holland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Willie James Burns	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Daniel Barnes	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Allan Dees	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Antonio Freightman	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Barry Grierson	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Brandon Eckhoff	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Cedric Young	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Charles Warren	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Charles Hudson	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Charlie Turner	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of David Tillman	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of David Robinson	0.10	B310	A103	19.00



07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Derrick Reddix	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Donald McLeod	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Donald Bosarge	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Dusty Rivers	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Edgar Broussard	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Evgeny Scholl	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Herman Gaines second claim	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Tillman	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Jeffory Vice	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of John Brenier	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Carl Budinich	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of John Stovall	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of John Chisholm	0.10	B310	A103	19.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:82

07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of John Paul Hardy	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Karey Price	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Kenneth Moseley	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/22/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Kimble Cochrand	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	CHM	Review/analyze documents and materials regarding insurance matters	0.40	B210	A104	154.00
07/25/16	CHM	Review/analyze liquidation trust agreement and related plan provisions	0.80	B320	A104	308.00
07/25/16	JLG	Correspondence with abstractor and counsel.	0.30	B250	A108	100.50
07/25/16	SWR	Research on requirements for registered agent for non-domestic corporation	0.50	B430	A102	245.00
07/25/16	SWR	Work on motion to modify automatic stay to permit adjustment and settlement of workers compensation insurance claims	1.60	B210	A103	784.00
07/25/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding registered agent for Mississippi Phosphates	0.30	B210	A106	147.00
07/25/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding annual reports and current officers and directors of MPC	0.30	B210	A106	147.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:83

07/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG regarding draft of motion to modify automatic stay	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
07/25/16	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for AIG regarding tomorrow's conference call	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
07/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trust and AIG regarding documents and pleadings relevant to tomorrow's conference call	0.50	B210	A107	245.00
07/25/16	SWR	Correspondence with Clark Hammond regarding service of process on MPC	0.20	B430	A107	98.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Mitchell Copeland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Ollie Smith	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Patrick Bigelow	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Richard Green	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Jones	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Tanner	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Ronnie Holland	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Stan	0.20	B310	A103	38.00

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:84

BUTLER | SNOW

		Ladner				
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Suzette Whitlow	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Trent Lawson Dkt. 1348	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Walter Rogers Dkt. 1349	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Wesley Smith Dkt. 1350	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of William Hickman Dkt. 1351	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Herman Gaines Dkt. 1373	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Johnson, Jr. Dkt. 1374	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Judy Toles Dkt. 1375	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Suzette Whitlow Dkt. 1376	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Wilson Dkt. 1377	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Wilson Dkt. 1378	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining	0.10	B310	A103	19.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:85

		objection to claim of Kevin Carter Dkt. 1387				
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Kevin Carter Dkt. 1388	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Arthur Taylor Dkt 1389	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Arthur Taylor Dkt 1390	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Burnis LaForce Dkt 1391	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Carol Taite Dkt 1392	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Carol Cochran Dkt 1393	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Derrick Reddix Dkt 1394	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Gregory McCloud Dkt 1395	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Gregory Blanchard Dkt 1396	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Gregory Ezell Dkt 1397	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Gregory Ezell Dkt 1398	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Trochessett Dkt. 1399	0.10	B310	A103	19.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:86

07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of James Woodcock Dkt 1400	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Keith Ludgood Dkt 1401	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Milmon Stringfellow Dkt 1402	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Reginald White Dkt 1403	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Churchwell Dkt 1404	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Roberts Dkt 1405	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Robert Guardia Dkt 1406	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Roger Cochran Dkt. 1407	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Ronald Griffith Dkt 1409	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Ronnie Holland Dkt 1410	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Shirley Fay Ellet Dkt 1411	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Steven Ray Linscott Dkt 1412	0.10	B310	A103	19.00



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:87

07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Timothy Holland Dkt. 1413	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Victor Lemon Dkt 1414	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Welborne Collins Dkt 1415	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Willie Reynolds Dkt. 1416	0.10	B310	A103	19.00
07/25/16	TMH	Draft order sustaining objection to claim of Roger Cochran Dkt. 1441	0.20	B310	A103	38.00
07/26/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to AIG regarding insurance matters	0.30	B210	A107	115.50
07/26/16	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to AIG regarding insurance matters	0.50	B210	A107	192.50
07/26/16	JMC	Correspondence with Leland Murphee and Arslana Muhammed regarding proposed order concerning AIG policies.	0.30	B320	A107	58.50
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding narrative for May and June 2016 monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding payment of quarterly United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	98.00
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding status of	0.20	B110	A106	98.00



Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Rate	Code	Amount
		filing of monthly operating reports for May and June 2016				
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding John Deere crawler tractor	0.20	B210	A106	98.00
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for MPC liquidation trustee regarding proposed motion on workers compensation insurance	0.30	B140	A107	147.00
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding contact information for Gallagher	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
07/26/16	SWR	Conference call with counsel for AIC and MPC Liquidation Trustee regarding status of workers compensation insurance and related matters	0.50	B210	A107	245.00
07/26/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for AIG and Liquidation Trustee regarding conference call to discuss workers compensation insurance	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
07/26/16	SWR	Telephone conference with wife of Willie Burns regarding chapter 11 plan and severance claim objection	0.20	B310	A108	98.00
07/27/16	JLG	Review tax assessments update and assemble for delivery to Stewart Title.	0.70	B250	A104	234.50
07/27/16	JLG	Review exception in draft commitment and compare to those identified on survey.	1.00	B250	A104	335.00
07/27/16	JLG	Correspondence with	0.30	B250	A108	100.50



		Stewart Title about commitment.				
07/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Beth Carter and Jon Nash regarding payment of past due amount for John Deere crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A106	147.00
07/27/16	SWR	Correspondence with Les Alvis and Environmental Trustee regarding payment of balance of payoff on John Deere crawler tractor	0.30	B210	A107	147.00
07/27/16	TMH	Correspondence with Deloitte regarding termination of engagement	0.30	B110	A108	57.00
07/28/16	SWR	Review and revise proposed stipulation with ACE Companies regarding duplicate claims	0.50	B310	A103	245.00
07/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with professionals for Committee regarding proposed Stipulation with ACE Insurance companies	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
07/28/16	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Kate Heitzenrater regarding Debtors' objection to duplicate claims of ACE Insurance and proposed stipulation	0.30	B310	A107	147.00
07/28/16	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding request for information	0.20	B110	A108	98.00
07/28/16	VGJ	Receipt of returned mail on Objections to Claims, search for more current address and resend.	0.50	B110	A111	82.50



Mississippi Phosphates Corporation
 November 11, 2016
 10137354
 Page:90

07/28/16	VGJ	Prepare Notice of Change of Address and Certificate of Service for Mack McDonald and Richard Green and resend Objection and Notice to same	0.90	B110	A111	148.50
07/29/16	CHM	Review/analyze documents and pleadings in case regarding disposition of books and records of the debtor	0.60	B320	A104	231.00
07/29/16	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding McCain Engineering litigation pending in state court.	0.10	B190	A105	19.50
07/29/16	JMC	Work with Chris Maddux regarding proposed changes to liquidation trust agreement.	0.20	B320	A105	39.00
07/29/16	JMC	Correspondence with Gordon Gouveia in connection with McCain Engineering litigation pending in state court.	0.10	B190	A107	19.50
07/29/16	SWR	Work on notice of updated addresses regarding claimants with returned mail on objections to claims	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
07/29/16	SWR	Review Government settlement agreement and Liquidation Trust asset purchase agreement regarding books and records of Debtor	0.40	B110	A104	196.00
07/29/16	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding notice of updated service list for returned mail	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/29/16	SWR	Correspondence and	0.20	B130	A105	98.00



		internal conference regarding asset purchase agreement provisions				
07/29/16	TMH	Work on Notice of change of address and amended COS	0.30	B310	A103	57.00
07/29/16	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt and T. Hewitt re returned mail on Objections to Claim	0.20	B110	A105	33.00
07/29/16	VGJ	Receipt of returned mail on service of Objections to Claims, prepare Notice of Change of Address, electronically file same and forward returned mail to new address	0.80	B110	A111	132.00
07/30/16	SWR	Revise and finalize notice of changes of address and certificate of service	0.30	B110	A103	147.00
07/30/16	SWR	Review proposed MPC Liquidation Trust Agreement	0.30	B110	A104	147.00
07/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding discovery issue in McCain litigation	0.20	B110	A105	98.00
07/30/16	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Liquidation Trustee regarding contact with Gallagher regarding workers compensation insurance issues	0.20	B210	A107	98.00
08/01/16	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to the Liquidation Trust and AIG regarding insurance matters	0.30	B210	A107	115.50
08/01/16	CHM	Correspondence with committee professionals regarding confirmation hearing	0.20	B320	A108	77.00
08/01/16	JLG	Review final survey and	1.00	B250	A104	335.00