

EXHIBIT "B"

ITEMIZED STATEMENT



Post Office Box 830719
Birmingham, Alabama 35283-0719
Office : (205) 251-3000
Fax : (205) 458-5100
BURR.COM

TRAMMO, INC
ATTN: RYAN PAPIR
320 PARK AVENUE, 10th FLOOR
NEW YORK, NY 10022-6987

EMPLOYER I.D. #63-0322727

0026750 MISSISSIPPI PHOSPHATES CORP - OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
UNSECURED CREDITORS

0000001 Creditor Committee Representation

Date	Project #	Description	Atty	Hours	Rate	Value
12/1/2015	9	Finalized fee application order	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
12/1/2015	9	Email to/from UST regarding order on fee application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/3/2015	15	Work re: liquidating plan issue	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
12/3/2015	3	Work re: Kemper v Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
12/4/2015	3	Work re: insurance issues including upcoming call	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
12/7/2015	3	Review of insurance status	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
12/7/2015	3	Call to debtor's counsel	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
12/7/2015	3	Receipt and review additional policies	GPG	0.20	\$475.00	\$95.00
12/7/2015	3	Conference call to Marc Solomon	GPG	0.30	\$475.00	\$142.50
12/7/2015	3	Compare to old insurance policies	GPG	0.70	\$475.00	\$332.50
12/7/2015	3	Preparation for and attend call with insurance broker	MPS	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
12/8/2015	4(a)	Evaluation of potential D&O claim	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
12/9/2015	9	Reviewed fee application of Butler Snow	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
12/9/2015	9	Pulled together information to prepare Fourth Interim Fee Application	BPC	0.40	\$300.00	\$120.00
12/10/2015	9	Reviewed file regarding fee application/time entries	BPC	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00
12/14/2015	12	Work re: Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
12/14/2015	9	Drafting/revising Fourth Interim Fee Application	BPC	0.90	\$300.00	\$270.00
12/15/2015	9	Working on fourth interim fee application	MT	3.70	\$125.00	\$462.50
12/16/2015	4(a)	Work re: potential D&O claims	MPS	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
12/16/2015	12	Work re: Kemper / Mississippi Power issues	MPS	1.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
12/16/2015	9	Revised fee application	BPC	0.80	\$300.00	\$240.00
12/16/2015	5	Reviewed status of Dec-Feb Budget	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00

12/16/2015	9	Telephone conference with D. Meek regarding fee application issues/budgets	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/16/2015	5	Email to M. Solomon regarding budget	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/16/2015	9	Drafting and revising fee application	MT	1.90	\$125.00	\$237.50
12/17/2015	4(a)	Call with counsel for the debtor	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
12/17/2015	4(a)	Work re: D&O claim issues	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
12/17/2015	9	Reviewed/revised Fourth Interim Fee App and Project Summaries	BPC	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
12/17/2015	5	Email to M. Solomon regarding budget	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/18/2015	7	Work regarding 503(b)(9) claims	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
12/18/2015	4(a)	Work re: D&O coverage issues	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
12/18/2015	12	Work re: Kemper / Mississippi Power issue	MPS	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
12/22/2015	4(a)	Call to counsel for Chemours	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
12/22/2015	4(a)	Call to counsel for the debtor	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
12/22/2015	12	Work re: Kemper / Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
12/22/2015	15	Work re: liquidating plan or conversion issues	MPS	0.90	\$400.00	\$360.00
12/22/2015	9	Finalized Fourth Interim fee application	BPC	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00
12/22/2015	9	Email to D. Meek/M. Solomon regarding fee application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/23/2015	12	Work re: Kemper / Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
12/23/2015	15	Work re: case resolution/plan issues	MPS	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
12/28/2015	9	Followed up on status of fee application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/29/2015	6	Reviewed Monthly Operating Report/docket for updates	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
12/29/2015	9	Follow up on status of fee application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/29/2015	6	Retrieve court dockets in the bankruptcy case/review relevant pleadings including	MG	0.40	\$200.00	\$80.00
12/30/2015	9	Telephone call to/from M. Solomon regarding changes to Fourth Interim Application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
12/30/2015	9	Emails to/from M. Solomon regarding fee application issues	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
12/30/2015	5	Reviewed standard rates/budget issues	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/4/2016	9	Review of fee application details	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/4/2016	12	Prepared for call with Mississippi Power	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
1/4/2016	12	Call with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/4/2016	12	Call with counsel for lender	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/4/2016	13	Email with Committee members	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/4/2016	13	Prepared for Committee call	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/4/2016	12	Communications with Debtors' counsel re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00
1/4/2016	12	Communications with counsel to liquidating trustee re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00
1/4/2016	12	Communications with committee re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
1/4/2016	12	Analysis of Mississippi Power issues	MPS	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
1/4/2016	9	Revised/finalized fee application	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/4/2016	9	Meeting with M. Tomes regarding redactions to fee application	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/4/2016	12	Reviewed Kemper Refund Memo	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/4/2016	12	Reviewed research regarding [Redacted]	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/4/2016	9	Reviewed notice of filing exhibit to fee application	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/4/2016	9	Confer with B. Creswell and finalized Burr & Forman's Fourth Interim Fee Application and filed same with court	MT	0.80	\$130.00	\$104.00
1/5/2016	12	Review of adversary proceeding complaint	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/5/2016	12	Call with counsel for Mississippi Power	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/5/2016	12	Work re: complaint filed by liquidating trustee	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00

1/5/2016	12	Preparation for and call with counsel for Mississippi Power re: Kemper claim	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
1/5/2016	10	Email from/to C. Steiskal regarding fee application exhibits	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/5/2016	10	Reviewed email regarding staffing reports/email to D. Meek/M. Solomon regarding the same	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/5/2016	12	Reviewed Complaint for Declaratory Relief	BPC	0.40	\$300.00	\$120.00
1/5/2016	12	Reviewed J. Roberts memo regarding [Redacted]	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/5/2016	12	Reviewed email from Debtors' counsel regarding adversary	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/5/2016	6	Examine new court notices of relevant pleadings	MG	0.20	\$210.00	\$42.00
1/6/2016	12	Work regarding adversary proceeding complaint	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/6/2016	4(a)	Call from counsel for Chemours	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
1/6/2016	12	Work re: MP complaint and related analysis	MPS	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
1/6/2016	4(a)	Work re: potential D&O claims and related issues	MPS	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
1/6/2016	5	Reviewed status of staff budget issues to respond to UST	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/6/2016	6	Review new court notice concerning complaint filed by MPC Liquidation Trust	MG	0.10	\$210.00	\$21.00
1/6/2016	9	Receipt of BMC Group affidavit regarding service of Burr & Forman's Fourth Interim Fee Application and filed same with court	MT	0.20	\$130.00	\$26.00
1/7/2016	12	Conference call with Debtor's counsel	DFM	1.20	\$425.00	\$510.00
1/7/2016	13	Call with Committee Members	DFM	0.50	\$425.00	\$212.50
1/7/2016	13	Call with counsel for Trammo	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
1/7/2016	12	Preparation for and call with counsel for Debtor	MPS	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
1/7/2016	12	Preparation for and call with Committee	MPS	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
1/7/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/7/2016	12	Work re: plan issues	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
1/7/2016	5	Reviewed staffing plan issues	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/7/2016	5	Email to D. Meek/M. Solomon regarding staffing plan issues	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/7/2016	5	Telephone call to UST regarding staffing plan	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/7/2016	12	Telephone conference with Committee regarding Kemper fund issues	BPC	0.40	\$300.00	\$120.00
1/7/2016	12	Reviewed Kemper Fund analysis/adversary proceeding and arguments regarding constitutional torts	BPC	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00
1/7/2016	9	Email to parties regarding fee application/committee expenses and fees	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/8/2016	12	Work regarding adversary proceeding complaint intervention	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
1/8/2016	12	Work re: merits of Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/8/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power standing issue	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
1/8/2016	4(a)	Work re: D&O issues	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
1/8/2016	12	Met with M. Solomon and D. Meek to discuss various issues related to Mississippi Phosphates adversary proceeding re: Kemper funds	JPR	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00
1/8/2016	12	Reviewed 5th Circuit case law to determine requirements for [Redacted]	JPR	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
1/9/2016	12	Reviewed 5th Circuit case law to determine requirements for [Redacted]	JPR	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00
1/10/2016	12	Reviewed 5th Circuit case law to determine requirements for [Redacted]	JPR	1.10	\$250.00	\$275.00
1/11/2016	12	Reviewed 5th Circuit case law to determine requirements for [Redacted]	JPR	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00
1/12/2016	12	Work re: communications from Rosenblatt	MPS	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00
1/12/2016	12	Work re: potential settlement structure of Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
1/12/2016	12	Reviewed 5th Circuit case law to determine requirements for [Redacted]	JPR	6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00
1/12/2016	12	Drafted Louisiana World Exposition Letter	JPR	1.60	\$250.00	\$400.00
1/13/2016	12	Work regarding Louisiana exposition demand letter to debtor	DFM	0.80	\$425.00	\$340.00
1/13/2016	6	Review of recent pleadings	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00

1/13/2016	12	Work regarding possible discovery in adversary proceeding	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/13/2016	12	Work re: derivative standing for Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/13/2016	12	Communication with Debtor's counsel re: Mississippi Power issue	MPS	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00
1/13/2016	12	Reviewed email from S. Rosenblatt regarding services and expenses	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/13/2016	12	Drafted Louisiana World Exposition Letter	JPR	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00
1/14/2016	12	Work regarding Louisiana exposition letter	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/14/2016	12	Teleconference with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/14/2016	4(a)	Work re: D&O insurance extension and related issues	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/14/2016	12	Reviewed Mississippi case law for [Redacted]	JPR	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00
1/15/2016	4(a)	Work re: D&O extension and related issues	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
1/15/2016	12	Reviewed Mississippi case law for [Redacted]	JPR	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00
1/18/2016	12	Reviewed Mississippi case law for [Redacted]	JPR	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00
1/19/2016	12	Work regarding MS Power claim	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/19/2016	12	Teleconference with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/19/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power issue potential settlement	MPS	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
1/19/2016	12	Review and analysis of research on [Redacted]	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
1/19/2016	12	Reviewed Mississippi case law for [Redacted]	JPR	8.00	\$250.00	\$2,000.00
1/20/2016	12	Work re: settlement issues with Mississippi Power issue and related	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
1/20/2016	15	Reviewed Fifth Circuit's position on [Redacted]	JPR	2.90	\$250.00	\$725.00
1/21/2016	15	Reviewed 5th Circuit Precedent [Redacted]	JPR	6.60	\$250.00	\$1,650.00
1/21/2016	6	Retrieve court dockets in the three bankruptcy cases then review relevant pleadings	MG	0.40	\$210.00	\$84.00
1/22/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
1/22/2016	9	Reviewed status of fee application order	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/22/2016	15	Drafted Memo regarding [Redacted]	JPR	8.00	\$250.00	\$2,000.00
1/25/2016	12	Work regarding claim retention research	DFM	0.50	\$425.00	\$212.50
1/25/2016	12	Work regarding commercial/constitutional tort research	DFM	0.50	\$425.00	\$212.50
1/25/2016	12	Correspondence regarding Mississippi Power claim	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
1/25/2016	15	Work re: claim retention and plan issues	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/25/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
1/25/2016	10	Email to US Trustee re: objections to fee application	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/25/2016	9	Revised order on fee application for submission to court	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
1/26/2016	12	Call with counsel for Mississippi Power	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/26/2016	7	Work re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
1/26/2016	7	Prepared for and call with counsel for Mississippi Power	MPS	0.30	\$400.00	\$120.00
1/26/2016	15	Work re: plan disclosure issues	MPS	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
1/26/2016	10	Reviewed status of fee application objections	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
1/26/2016	9	Upload order granting fourth interim fee application for review and consideration by the judge	MT	0.20	\$130.00	\$26.00
1/27/2016	12	Call with counsel for trustee	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	12	Call with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	13	Call with DRG	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	13	Prepared for call with Committee	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	15	Work regarding claim description in plan	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
1/27/2016	15	Review of proposed draft plan	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	12	Emails with counsel for trustee	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/27/2016	12	Work re: analysis of Mississippi Power issues and work in preparation for call	MPS	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00

1/28/2016	13	Committee conference call	DFM	1.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
1/28/2016	12	Call with counsel for trustee	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/28/2016	12	Email with trustee's counsel	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
1/28/2016	1	Review of debtor cash report	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
1/28/2016	13	Preparation for and attend committee call re: various issues	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
1/28/2016	12	Preparation for and calls with counsel for liquidating trustee re: Mississippi Power	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
1/28/2016	12	Work re: analysis of claims in Mississippi Power matter	MPS	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
1/28/2016	13	Telephone call with Committee re: MS Power issues	BPC	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00
1/28/2016	12	Reviewed cases re: constitutional tort issues/legal analysis	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
1/29/2016	12	Emails with debtor's counsel regarding status of Mississippi Power litigation	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/29/2016	13	Emails with Committee members regarding status of service and acceptance of same	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
1/29/2016	12	Preparation for and call with counsel from Debtor re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.60	\$400.00	\$240.00
1/29/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power litigation issues	MPS	3.70	\$400.00	\$1,480.00
1/30/2016	12	Emails with counsel for Mississippi Power regarding acceptance of service	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
2/1/2016	15	Work re: plan details	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/1/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power dispute	DFM	1.20	\$425.00	\$510.00
2/1/2016	13	Email from Committee members	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
2/1/2016	15	Work re: potential plan in case	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
2/1/2016	12	Work re: settlement of Mississippi Power dispute and work re: standing issues	MPS	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
2/2/2016	12	Calls and emails with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/2/2016	12	Continued work re: Mississippi Power dispute	DFM	0.80	\$425.00	\$340.00
2/2/2016	12	Work re: potential settlement and related issues re: Mississippi Power dispute	MPS	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
2/3/2016	12	Call with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/3/2016	12	Work regarding agreed order extending response time	DFM	0.20	\$425.00	\$85.00
2/3/2016	12	Analysis of Mississippi Power issues	DFM	1.50	\$425.00	\$637.50
2/3/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power dispute and related issues	MPS	2.00	\$400.00	\$800.00
2/4/2016	12	Work re: standing research and analysis	DFM	0.70	\$425.00	\$297.50
2/4/2016	12	Work re: standing for Mississippi Power dispute	MPS	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
2/4/2016	12	Work re: answer and counterclaim and related issues	MPS	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
2/5/2016	15	Work re: plan details	DFM	1.60	\$425.00	\$680.00
2/5/2016	15	Work re: plan and potential claims retention	MPS	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
2/8/2016	1	Work re: BP claim details	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/8/2016	1	Communications with counsel for Debtor and related work re: BP claim	MPS	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
2/9/2016	12	Prepared for call with debtor's counsel	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/9/2016	12	Call with counsel for the debtor	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/9/2016	12	Prepared for call with Debtor	DFM	0.50	\$425.00	\$212.50
2/9/2016	12	Review of Mississippi Power payment details	DFM	1.60	\$425.00	\$680.00
2/9/2016	12	Preparation for and call with debtors' counsel re: Mississippi Power issues	MPS	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
2/9/2016	13	Communications with committee members re: various issues	MPS	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
2/9/2016	12	Work re: issues related to Mississippi Power payment	MPS	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
2/10/2016	12	Review of standing issues	DFM	1.90	\$425.00	\$807.50
2/10/2016	12	Work re: standing issues related to Mississippi Power	MPS	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
2/11/2016	15	Edits to proposed plan	DFM	2.20	\$425.00	\$935.00
2/11/2016	12	Work regarding pleading regarding standing for the Committee	DFM	1.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
2/11/2016	15	Work re: comments and changes to draft plan	MPS	3.30	\$400.00	\$1,320.00

2/11/2016	6	Work on case management regarding pleadings as well as correspondence	MG	0.30	\$210.00	\$63.00
2/12/2016	15	Continued edits to and review of plan	DFM	1.20	\$425.00	\$510.00
2/12/2016	12	Review of research and issues related to standing	DFM	1.40	\$425.00	\$595.00
2/12/2016	12	Work regarding pleading on standing	DFM	1.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
2/12/2016	15	Work re: issues with draft plan	MPS	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
2/12/2016	12	Work re: standing and related AP issues	MPS	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
2/12/2016	12	Drafted Mississippi Phosphates Motion for leave to pursue claims	JPR	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00
2/15/2016	12	Work regarding draft motion on standing	DFM	1.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
2/15/2016	15	Plan edits and comments	DFM	1.70	\$425.00	\$722.50
2/15/2016	15	Work re: retained claims under plan	MPS	2.90	\$400.00	\$1,160.00
2/16/2016	12	Emails with counsel for the debtor and trustee	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/16/2016	12	Continued work regarding standing motion	DFM	0.60	\$425.00	\$255.00
2/16/2016	12	Work re: standing issues for adversary proceeding	MPS	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
2/16/2016	15	Work re: retained claims under plan	MPS	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
2/17/2016	12	Work regarding motion for standing	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/17/2016	12	Correspondence with counsel re: standing	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/17/2016	12	Work re: retained commercial tort claims and related issues	MPS	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
2/17/2016	12	Drafted Answer and Counterclaim in adversary proceeding	JPR	9.50	\$250.00	\$2,375.00
2/18/2016	12	Review of draft answer in counterclaim pleadings	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/18/2016	12	Correspondence regarding standing motion	DFM	1.90	\$425.00	\$807.50
2/18/2016	12	Work regarding deadline extension	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/18/2016	12	Work re: motion for standing and related issues	MPS	3.40	\$400.00	\$1,360.00
2/18/2016	12	Drafted Answer to Mississippi Power Company Counterclaim	JPR	4.80	\$250.00	\$1,200.00
2/18/2016	12	Drafted Answer to MPC Liquidation Trust Complaint	JPR	3.20	\$250.00	\$800.00
2/18/2016	12	Revised Answer to Mississippi Power Company Counterclaim	JPR	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00
2/18/2016	12	Work on Motion for Leave of Court to Pursue Claims and Objections on Behalf of	MG	0.80	\$210.00	\$168.00
2/18/2016	12	Work on Notice of Filing concerning the motion for leave for filing in the adversary	MG	0.80	\$210.00	\$168.00
2/18/2016	12	Memorandum to M. Solomon regarding motion for leave and notice of filing	MG	0.20	\$210.00	\$42.00
2/19/2016	12	Work regarding filing details for motion on standing/adversary issues	DFM	2.00	\$425.00	\$850.00
2/19/2016	12	Review of answer in counterclaim	DFM	0.40	\$425.00	\$170.00
2/19/2016	12	Emails with debtor's counsel regarding standing	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/19/2016	12	Work re: issues pertaining to Mississippi Power dispute	MPS	3.40	\$400.00	\$1,360.00
2/19/2016	12	Drafted Order for Motion to Leave	BPC	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
2/19/2016	12	Telephone conference with Chambers regarding Order	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
2/19/2016	9	Reviewed BRG Fee Application	BPC	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
2/19/2016	9	Email to BRG regarding application	BPC	0.10	\$300.00	\$30.00
2/19/2016	12	Email to/from M. Solomon regarding Order on standing	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
2/19/2016	12	Drafted Answer and Counterclaim in adversary proceeding	JPR	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00
2/22/2016	12	Edits to answer and counterclaim	DFM	0.80	\$425.00	\$340.00
2/22/2016	12	Work regarding standing motion	DFM	0.30	\$425.00	\$127.50
2/22/2016	15	Work regarding edits to plan and disclosure statement	DFM	1.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
2/22/2016	12	Prepared for call with debtor and debtor professionals	DFM	0.50	\$425.00	\$212.50
2/22/2016	12	Emails with debtor and debtor professionals	DFM	0.10	\$425.00	\$42.50
2/22/2016	12	Work re: Mississippi Power AP and related issues	MPS	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
2/22/2016	9	Reviewed BRG fee application issues	BPC	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
2/22/2016	9	Review Berkeley Research Group's first interim fee application for completeness	MT	0.20	\$130.00	\$26.00

26750 MISSISSIPPI PHOSPHATES CORP - OFFICIAL C
1 Creditor Committee Representation

Date	Disbursements	Value
11/30/2015	Pacer Research	\$3.00
12/14/2015	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(212)223-3200, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 540 seconds	\$0.45
1/5/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(212)922-2173, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 694 seconds	\$0.60
1/7/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(212)223-3200, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 302 seconds	\$0.30
1/8/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(212)479-6167, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 29 seconds	\$0.05
1/8/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(646)415-4378, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 2 seconds	\$0.05
1/8/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(646)415-4378, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 86 seconds	\$0.10
1/12/2016	Pacer Research Overnight Mail – VENDOR: FedEx INVOICE#: 528966591 DATE: 1/18/2016 Tracking #775422907068	\$10.30
1/14/2016	From: Burr & Forman LLP, 420 N 20th Street, BIRMINGHAM, AL 35203 To: Stephen W. Rosenblatt, Butler Snow LLP, 1020 Highland Colony Parkway, RIDGELAND, MS 39157	\$11.52
1/25/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(228)214-0409, Destination: Gulfport, MS, Duration: 28 seconds	\$0.05
2/16/2016	Pacer Research	\$30.10
2/24/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(212)922-2173, Destination: New York, NY, Duration: 2616 seconds	\$2.20
2/25/2016	Long Distance – Number Dialed: 1(228)214-0409, Destination: Gulfport, MS, Duration: 28 seconds	\$0.05
Total Disbursements		\$58.77

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>Name</u>	<u>Rank</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Gerald P. Gillespy	Partner	\$475.00	1.20	\$570.00
Derek F. Meek	Partner	\$425.00	51.10	\$21,717.50
Marc Solomon	Partner	\$400.00	98.90	\$39,560.00
Bess P. Creswell	Partner	\$300.00	15.60	\$4,680.00
James P. Roberts	Associate	\$250.00	71.40	\$17,850.00
Meredith S. Gunnells (2015)	Paralegal	\$200.00	0.40	\$80.00
Meredith S. Gunnells (2016)	Paralegal	\$210.00	3.00	\$630.00
Margaret Tomes (2015)	Paralegal	\$125.00	5.60	\$700.00
Margaret Tomes(2016)	Paralegal	\$130.00	1.40	\$182.00
	TOTALS		248.60	\$85,969.50