

# **EXHIBIT D**

**Mississippi Phosphates Corporation, et al.****Berkeley Research Group, LLC****Exhibit D: Time Detail**

For the Period 9/1/2016 through 10/24/2016

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>05. Professional Retention/ Fee Application Preparation</b>			
9/9/2016	S. Tajuddin	1.2	Prepared fee application for 4th interim period.
9/9/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.8	Prepared fee application for 4th interim period.
9/14/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.8	Prepared fee application for 4th interim period.
9/14/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.1	Prepared fee application for 4th interim period.
9/29/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.3	Prepared 4th interim fee application.
10/11/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.5	Prepared fee application for 4th interim period.
10/11/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.5	Reviewed June-August fee application.
10/12/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.4	Prepared fourth interim fee application.
<b>Task Code</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>4.6</b>	
<b>08. Interaction/Meetings with Creditors</b>			
9/2/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Read Counsel's report on confirmation hearing
10/4/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Read Counsel's status reports on hearing.
10/13/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.5	Participated in call with UCC and Counsel (D. Meek) to discuss case update.
10/24/2016	E. Ordway	0.5	Participated in call with Committee for cash update.
10/24/2016	E. Ordway	0.4	Participated in conference call with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) and Committee to discuss confirmation issues.
10/24/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.3	Participated in call with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) to discuss status of confirmation.
<b>Task Code</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>2.1</b>	
<b>22. Preference/Avoidance Actions</b>			
9/9/2016	E. Ordway	0.5	Reviewed causes of action analysis and directed staff to investigate identified issues.

Berkeley Research Group, LLC

Invoice for the 9/1/2016 - 10/24/2016 Period

Date	Professional	Hours	Description
<b>22. Preference/Avoidance Actions</b>			
9/12/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.5	Participated in call with E. Neiger of ASK, LLP (possible preference claims Counsel) to discuss work product offering.
9/13/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Communicated with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) re: preference payment investigation.
10/3/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Directed staff re: coordinating preference review.
10/13/2016	E. Ordway	0.4	Participated in conference call with Committee to review case status, including causes of action.

**Task Code Total Hours** 1.8

<b>27. Plan of Reorganization/Disclosure Statement</b>			
9/1/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Read communications regarding settlement of admin. claims.
9/7/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.7	Responded to request from corporate Counsel regarding the obtaining of professional liability endorsement for trusteeship of E. Ordway.
9/7/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.5	Reviewed information related to Trust insurance needs.
9/8/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.8	Reviewed D&O claims analysis prepared by Counsel.
9/8/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.5	Researched tax accounting needs for liquidation trustee.
9/8/2016	E. Ordway	0.2	Communicated with counsel (Burr Forman, D Meek) re: insurance coverage.
9/8/2016	E. Ordway	0.1	Communicated with Counsel (Burr Forman, D. Meek) re: conflict check requirements.
9/9/2016	S. Tajuddin	1.0	Prepared schedule of trust assets for presentation to insurance carrier.
9/9/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.7	Researched illustrative trust agreements for obtaining professional liability endorsement coverage.
9/9/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.6	Reviewed information related to Trust insurance needs
9/12/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.2	Reviewed US Trustee objection to exculpation provisions of trust agreement.
9/13/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.7	Reviewed plan of reorg and litigation trust agreement to develop work plan for post effective date.
9/13/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.5	Reviewed terms of Plan as part of determining anticipated trust expenditures.
9/14/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.6	Reviewed Trust Agreement to detail work plan responsibilities for trustee role.

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>27. Plan of Reorganization/Disclosure Statement</b>			
9/19/2016	S. Tajuddin	0.2	Reviewed Debtors' motion to appoint tax preparer.
10/4/2016	E. Ordway	0.1	Read correspondence re: effective date of plan.
10/13/2016	E. Ordway	0.3	Reviewed amended order for the confirmation prepared by Debtor Counsel.
10/21/2016	E. Ordway	0.3	Read Counsel's report on exculpation of Debtors' professionals by the court and related pleadings.
10/24/2016	M. Haverkamp	0.6	Reviewed necessary elements to effectuate the transfer of accounts and authority from the Debtors to the Plan Trustee.
10/24/2016	E. Ordway	0.4	Reviewed plan supplement provided by Debtor Counsel.
10/24/2016	E. Ordway	0.3	Directed staff re: finalizing bank accounts and Fed ID number of Trust.
10/24/2016	E. Ordway	0.3	Reviewed court order finalizing confirmation of the POR.
<b>Task Code</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>9.8</b>	
<b>Total Hours</b>		<b>18.3</b>	