

EXHIBIT D

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation, et al.**CAPSTONE ADVISORY GROUP, LLC****Exhibit D: Time Detail**

For the Period 12/16/2014 through 2/28/2015



Date	Professional	Hours	Description
01. Asset Acquisition/Disposition			
1/5/2015	E. Ordway	1.1	Read and analyzed CIM documents for sale of the company.
1/8/2015	D. Pickett	1.8	Drafted observations on property visit for report to be shared with Unsecured Creditors Committee.
1/22/2015	D. Pickett	0.6	Obtained update from Sandler O'Neill on asset sale process and updated report to reflect the same.
1/27/2015	E. Ordway	0.4	Prepared for call with Debtors' Counsel and M&A advisor by reviewing notes and preparing question list.
Task Code Total Hours		3.9	
02. Case Administration			
12/16/2014	J. Cooper	0.6	Reviewed the confidentiality agreement for data room access.
12/16/2014	E. Ordway	0.3	Reviewed and edited proposed form of confidentiality.
12/16/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Directed staff in developing work plan and items to be addressed.
12/17/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Directed staff re: next steps and work plan additions.
12/17/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Prepared communications to UCC Counsel re: Confidentiality Agreement revisions.
12/17/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Reviewed revised form of Confidentiality Agreement.
12/18/2014	E. Ordway	0.5	Prepared updated detailed work plan for staff to follow based in discussions with committee members.
12/22/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Prepared work plan for work to be performed over next two weeks.
12/24/2014	E. Ordway	0.2	Prepared and updated internal work plan.
12/31/2014	E. Ordway	0.4	Prepared outline of steps to be conducted on site visit.
1/6/2015	E. Ordway	0.5	Participated in communications re: NDA.
1/13/2015	E. Ordway	0.4	Reviewed and commented on revised NDA document.
Task Code Total Hours		3.9	

Capstone Advisory Group, LLC

Invoice for the 12/16/2014 - 2/28/2015 Period