		water treatment				
05/15/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding personal property tax appraisal	0.20	B240	A106	72.00
05/15/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly status conference call with DOJ/EPA and MDEQ	0.80	B110	A107	288.00
05/15/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from Mississippi Power regarding order on amended sales hearing and related dates	0.20	B130	A107	72.00
05/15/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to creditors regarding objection deadlines	0.30	B150	A107	108.00
05/15/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee professionals regarding term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.60	B230	A107	216.00
05/15/15	JEB	Review MS law on personalty tax lien priority.	1.00	B240	A104	360.00
05/15/15	JMC	Work on research and analysis of personal property tax liens under Mississippi law.	1.30	B310	A102	247.00
05/15/15	JMC	Work on research and analysis concerning attachment and priority of certain liens under the bankruptcy code and Mississippi law.	1.40	B310	A102	266.00
05/15/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding certain open items and other issues in connection with the settlement term sheet	0.20	B130	A105	38.00

		among the Governments, the Lenders and the Debtors.				
05/15/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding Jackson County Tax Assessor information.	0.10	B310	A105	19.00
05/15/15	JMC	Call with Steve Rosenblatt, Chris Maddux and Jeb Bailey regarding certain tax issues under Mississippi law.	0.60	B310	A105	114.00
05/15/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in call with Steve Rosenblatt and counsel for the Lenders in connection with certain tax issues concerning the Debtors.	1.30	B310	A107	247.00
05/15/15	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding Mississippi tax statutes.	0.10	B310	A107	19.00
05/15/15	MDC	Call with EPA/DOJ on status of facility weekly call	0.90	P230	A107	324.00
05/15/15	MDC	Call with potential bidder regarding formulation of possible bid	1.10	P230	A108	396.00
05/15/15	MDC	Conference call with Environ on water balance matters	2.50	P230	A108	900.00
05/15/15	MDC	Work on Firmex data room	1.80	P230	A110	648.00
05/15/15	MDD	Research information for FCC registration	0.30	B130	A102	54.00
05/15/15	SWR	Review recent Fifth Circuit case regarding right of BP to appeal adverse rulings on claims awards	0.30	B120	A102	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt and Marcie Davant regarding	0.50	B120	A105	237.50

		gathering required corporate information for filing protective BP claim				
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding FCC Form 603	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt and Marcie Davant regarding radio permits	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in internal conference call regarding review of ad valorem tax statutes and priority and treatment of personal property taxes	0.70	B310	A105	332.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding status report on protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding issues regarding proposed settlement between Governments and Lenders as reflected in the term sheet	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding Trammo lease issues	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding rendition of personal property by Mississippi Phosphates	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Follow-up on issues raised during conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ	0.50	B210	A106	237.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding details regarding property and	0.30	B210	A106	142.50

		casualty insurance sought to be canceled by Debtors				
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee and CRO regarding status of professional fees escrow accounts	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Joe Rice's team regarding status of filing protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Joe Rice's team regarding additional information needed for filing protective BP claim	0.40	B120	A107	190.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DOJ regarding proposed sales timeline summary	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding continuation of sale hearing and proposed order being circulated	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for parties to Order to re-set Sale Hearing and related matters	0.50	B130	A107	237.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding ordinary course professionals application exhibit	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, Lenders, and Committee regarding conference call to discuss term sheet to proposed settlement of Governments and	0.30	B190	A107	142.50

05/15/15	SWR	Lenders Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding notice requirements for Rule 9019 motion for settlement with Governments and Lenders	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding issues for Monday's conference call with Governments and Lenders	0.20	B190	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marc Solomon regarding issues regarding term sheet on Governments- Lenders settlement proposal	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for EPA regarding report on chemical spend and status of sales process	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding response to motion to cancel property and casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/15/15	SWR	Weekly conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, CRO and Butler Snow team regarding operations at facility and status report on bankruptcy case	0.60	B210	A107	285.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA regarding cost and coverage of property and casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B210	A107	142.50

		Chris Steiskal regarding details regarding property and casualty insurance sought to be canceled				
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding cash flow budget for coming months	0.40	B230	A107	190.00
05/15/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont regarding hearing on 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A107	95.00
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conferences with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding ad valorem taxes on real and personal property	0.80	B310	A107	380.00
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Rod Clement regarding interpretation of ad valorem tax statutes	0.40	B310	A107	190.00
05/15/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Sunny Cheung regarding status of sales process	0.30	B130	A108	142.50
05/15/15	ТМН	Draft waiver request for form 601 for FCC	0.60	B110	A103	111.00
05/15/15	ТМН	Work on responses to questions from Motley Rice regarding MPC protective BP claim	1.20	B110	A103	222.00
05/15/15	TMH	Draft waiver request for form 603 for FCC	1.10	B110	A103	203.50
05/15/15	TMH	Review ledgers for Butler Snow and the Committee escrow accounts	0.40	B160	A104	74.00
05/15/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Trustmark regarding ledgers for Butler Snow and the Committee	0.20	B160	A108	37.00
05/15/15	TMH	File Form 603 online with the FCC for KV8240 radio permit and	1.00	B110	A111	185.00

		submit application				
05/15/15	TMH	Work on form 601 for license renewal with FCC	0.60	B110	A111	111.00
05/15/15	ТМН	File Form 603 online with the FCC for KWW697 radio permit and submit application	0.70	B110	A111	129.50
05/15/15	TMH	File Form 603 online with the FCC for KJ6255 radio permit and submit application	0.70	B110	A111	129.50
05/15/15	TMH	File Form 603 online with the FCC for KVF874 radio permit and submit application	0.70	B110	A111	129.50
05/15/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/15/15	VGJ	Work with Firmex with problems with Data Room and office conference with M. Caples and add additional users	2.00	B110	A110	320.00
05/15/15	VGJ	Receipt and work on April 2015 Monthly Operating Report for MPC	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/16/15	SWR	Brief research regarding attachment of lien for ad valorem taxes to real property	0.50	B310	A102	237.50
05/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding transmittal of requested information to Motley Rice	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Joe Rice regarding conference call to discuss protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding list of issues regarding Governments-	0.20	B190	A107	95.00

		Lenders settlement term sheet				
05/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding budget for professional fees	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
05/16/15	ТМН	Prepare correspondence to Motley Rice regarding responses to inquiries in connection with MPC protective BP Claim	1.10	B110	A107	203.50
05/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding tax returns for filing in connection with protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding FCC assignment documents	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding return of corporate records	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding information requested by Motley Rice for protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Review/revise term sheet between lenders and the governments to incorporate Debtors' comments	0.90	B230	A103	324.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Review documents and correspondence with Motley Rice regarding alternative BP claim	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Review request for waiver to FCC regarding wireless radio permits	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Review/analyze prior title insurance reports regarding status of taxes on real property	0.80	B240	A104	288.00

05/18/15	СНМ	Review research	0.30	B240	A104	108.00
		memorandum regarding tax liens				
05/18/15	СНМ	Review proofs of claim filed by the governments in connection with preparation of Debtors' comments to term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence to committee counsel regarding proofs of claim filed by the governments	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding claims filed by Mississippi Department of Revenue	0.20	B240	A105	72.00
05/18/15	CHM	Conference with D. Cannada regarding ad valorem taxes and status of same with respect to real property	0.30	B240	A105	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Internal correspondence regarding environmental matters	0.30	B310	A105	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding payment of UST fees	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding status of pending matters	0.30	B110	A106	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding corporate records	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding retention of Horne to perform audit of 401(k) plan	0.30	B220	A106	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding term sheet between lenders and the	0.30	B230	A106	108.00

05/18/15	СНМ	governments Correspondence with counsel to applicable parties regarding proposed order extending sale hearing date	0.30	B130	A107	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with committee counsel regarding term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding comments to term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/18/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to lenders, committee, DOJ and MDEQ regarding term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.70	B230	A107	252.00
05/18/15	DBC	E-mails Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux re: personal property taxes and title info on rental property; locate title policies and date down endorsements and email Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux re: same.	0.40	B240	A104	198.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on research regarding certain tax issues of the Debtors under Mississippi law, including the process for assessment of personalty by county tax assessor.	1.10	B310	A102	209.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments.	1.20	B130	A103	228.00

05/18/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising mechanics of certain distribution waterfalls in plan term sheet of the Debtors for each proposed transaction structure.	1.00	B320	A103	190.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising plan term sheet of the Debtors.	1.30	B320	A103	247.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of covenants and other related terms of the settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Governments and the Lenders.	0.70	B130	A104	133.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain Mississippi Attorney General opinions in connection with certain tax issues under Mississippi law.	0.80	B310	A104	152.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work on correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding analysis of tax lien process under Mississippi law and related issues.	0.40	B130	A105	76.00
05/18/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding proposed changes to settlement term sheet.	0.20	B130	A105	38.00
05/18/15	JMC	Work with Chris Maddux on analysis and revisions to settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments.	0.50	B130	A105	95.00
05/18/15	MDC	Response on potential resolution of environmental investigation into water	0.50	P230	A107	180.00

		releases in 2013				
05/18/15	MDC	Respond to inquiries from prospective bidder regarding environmental documents and water balance issues	3.60	P230	A108	1,296.00
05/18/15	SWR	Brief research on professionals other than attorneys as ordinary course professionals	0.60	B160	A102	285.00
05/18/15	SWR	Work on and finalize revisions to Order re- setting sale hearing and related deadlines	0.40	B130	A103	190.00
05/18/15	SWR	Review recent Fifth Circuit decision in Lake Eugenie Land Dev., Inc. v. BP Exploration & Production, Inc. regarding appeals from adverse rulings by facility	0.30	B120	A104	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Review research of Mitch Carrington on ad valorem taxes and tax liens	0.40	B310	A104	190.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding other title insurance policies	0.30	B120	A105	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding Fidelity National Title Insurance Company modification and date down endorsements	0.40	B120	A105	190.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding proposed clarifying revisions to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A105	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker, Michael Caples and Chris Maddux regarding requested information for DOJ	0.20	B190	A105	95.00

05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Tommy Murphy and Brad Thompson regarding logistics for return of records	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding contact with Mississippi Court Collections, Inc.	0.20	B240	A105	95.00
05/18/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington and Chris Maddux regarding results of tax lien research	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and office of UST regarding confirmation of payment of quarterly United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding April monthly operating report	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Thomas Hewitt regarding transfer application for FCC licenses	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding flat rate quote by Horne for 401(k) audit and need for additional quotes	0.30	B160	A106	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding course of action regarding ordinary course professionals retention application	0.30	B160	A106	142.50
05/18/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding response to DOJ regarding possible resolutions	0.20	B190	A106	95.00

_							
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding breakdown of insurance premiums	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding allocation of 2014 personal property ad valorem taxes to Trammo	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding coordination on return of corporate records	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding personal property ad valorem tax appraisals and rendition by Mississippi Phosphates	0.40	B240	A106	190.00
	05/18/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for Committee regarding Governments- Lenders term sheet	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney, Motley Rice and Jon Nash regarding conference call to discuss protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Motley Rice, CRO and Slate Dabney regarding conference call to discuss protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for affected parties regarding revised order re-setting sale hearing and related deadlines	0.50	B130	A107	237.50
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal ordinary course professionals motion	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
	05/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B160	A107	142.50

		Chris Steiskal regarding non-attorneys as ordinary course professionals				
05/18/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in extended conference call with Capstone and counsel for Committee, EPA and MDEQ, Lenders regarding Governments- Lenders term sheet	0.90	B190	A107	427.50
05/18/15	ТМН	Research Ordinary Course Professional definition to include accountants	1.20	B170	A102	222.00
05/18/15	ТМН	Work on FCC 603 Waiver application to update information received from FCC and correct old application	1.10	B110	A103	203.50
05/18/15	TMH	Review AL Electric's motion to withdraw duplicate claim	0.10	B310	A103	18.50
05/18/15	TMH	Review AL Electric's motion to withdraw duplicate claim	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
05/18/15	TMH	Review agreed order with AL Electric for cure amount	0.10	B310	A103	18.50
05/18/15	TMH	Review MOR from R. Kerley for April 2015	0.30	B110	A104	55.50
05/18/15	TMH	Correspondence with MDOR regarding claims	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review draft financial statements in connection with preparation of April monthly operating reports	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review narrative for April monthly operating report	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review/analyze back-up information for protective BP claim	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
05/19/15	CHM	Review correspondence	0.40	B130	A104	144.00

		to prospective bidders regarding revised dates for the sales process				
05/19/15	CHM	Review correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding retention of Horne to perform 401(k) audit	0.20	B160	A104	72.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review correspondence regarding reduced insurance coverage options	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review information regarding insurance policy amounts and coverage terms	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Review/revise term sheet between the lenders and the governments and related review of documents and correspondence	0.80	B230	A104	288.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Internal correspondence regarding review of environmental insurance policies	0.20	B210	A105	72.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt and M. Carrington regarding revisions to term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.40	B230	A105	144.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding April monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding revisions to term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.50	B230	A106	180.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding rendition of personal	0.20	B240	A106	72.00

05/19/15	СНМ	property and values Prepare for and participate in conference call with Motley Rice, PHI counsel and management regarding preparation of protective BP claim	0.70	B110	A107	252.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to the lenders regarding revisions to term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/19/15	СНМ	Correspondence with office of the United States Trustee regarding payment of quarterly fees	0.20	B110	A108	72.00
05/19/15	JMC	Work on research and analysis of certain bankruptcy code provisions in connection with classification of claims in interests in the Debtors' plan.	1.70	B320	A102	323.00
05/19/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments.	0.50	B130	A103	95.00
05/19/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising claim distribution and waterfall mechanics in the plan of the Debtors term sheet.	1.20	B320	A103	228.00
05/19/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising certain plan structures and other components of the Debtors' plan term sheet.	2.10	B320	A103	399.00
05/19/15	JMC	Work on claims analysis and classification in connection with preparation of plan of the Debtors.	1.30	B320	A104	247.00

05/19/15	JMC	Work with Chris Maddux on settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments.	0.10	B130	A105	19.00
05/19/15	JMC	Correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding revisions to settlement term sheet among the Governments, the Lenders and the Debtors.	0.10	B130	A105	19.00
05/19/15	SWR	Complete narrative for April monthly operating reports	0.60	B110	A103	285.00
05/19/15	SWR	Review proposed changes to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.40	B190	A104	190.00
05/19/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding FCC application to assign permits to Mississippi Phosphates as debtor in possession	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding response on insurance coverage issues	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding review of insurance policies	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux regarding review Governments-Lenders term sheet and interpretation of certain provisions	0.50	B190	A105	237.50
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding narrative for April monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding protective BP	0.20	B120	A106	95.00

05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
05/10/15	CIVID	preparation for call on BP claim with Motley Rice	0.40	D120	1100	100.00
05/19/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding clarifications to Governments-Lenders term sheet and course of action	0.40	B130	A106	190.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding order re-setting sale hearing and related matters	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding retention of Horne for 401(k) audit under section 327 and 328	0.30	B160	A106	142.50
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding proposed clarifying changes in Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A106	142.50
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding additional information on cost benefit analysis of property and casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding personal property rendition and personal property taxes	0.50	B240	A106	237.50
05/19/15	SWR	Extended conference call with special counsel for Debtor regarding BP claim, counsel for PHI, and CRO regarding protective BP claim	0.60	B120	A107	285.00

-						
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for potential bidders for facilities of Mississippi Phosphates regarding re-set sale hearing deadlines	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding retention of Horne as ordinary course professionals or pursuant to sections 327 and 328	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding proposed changes to Governments- Lenders term sheet	0.50	B190	A107	237.50
05/19/15	SWR	Telephone call to collection agency for personal property taxes	0.20	B240	A108	95.00
05/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding logistics of returning documents to Mississippi Phosphates from Coast office	0.30	B110	A110	142.50
05/19/15	ТМН	Apply for new FCC FRN for MPC as Debtor in Possession	1.30	B110	A103	240.50
05/19/15	ТМН	Draft supplement to S. Rosenblatt's original affidavit	1.30	B160	A103	240.50
05/19/15	TMH	Draft supplement to affidavit of S. Rosenblatt	1.10	B160	A103	203.50
05/19/15	TMH	Conference call to discuss PHI and MPC BP claims	0.70	B110	A107	129.50
05/19/15	TMH	Correspondence with J. Tobias regarding FCC application	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/19/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
05/19/15	VGJ	Work on April 2015 MOR's for all 3 entities,	1.00	B110	A111	160.00

		assemble attachments and electronically file same with Court				
05/19/15	VGJ	Finalize Order Re- Setting Sale Hearing and electronically filing same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Review documents regarding parcels of real property and uses of same in connection with discussions with DOJ/EPA	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with creditor constituencies regarding casualty insurance and next steps with respect to same	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with management regarding responses to creditor inquiries concerning status of collateral	0.30	B150	A104	108.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Review and revision to term sheet between the lenders and the governments to incorporate provisions concerning future transaction	1.40	B230	A104	504.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Internal correspondence regarding discussions with DOJ regarding environmental issues	0.20	B310	A105	72.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding responses to questions raised by creditor constituencies regarding casualty insurance	0.30	B150	A106	108.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding additional	0.50	B230	A106	180.00

		provisions of term sheet between the lenders and the governments				
05/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to prospective bidder regarding order re- setting sale hearing and related dates	0.20	B130	A107	72.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding Horne retention	0.20	B160	A107	72.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Conference calls with counsel to the lenders regarding term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.70	B230	A107	252.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the lenders regarding casualty insurance	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel regarding term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
05/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to former employees regarding request for information in connection with workers compensation claims	0.20	B310	A107	72.00
05/20/15	DBC	Conference with Steve Rosenblatt regarding excess lands for potential settlement donation to United States of America; research files regarding plats and maps of same and e-mail same to Steve Rosenblatt, James Tucker, Michael Caples and Amanda Barbour.	0.50	L160	A104	247.50
05/20/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising plan term sheet	1.70	B320	A103	323.00

05/20/15	JMC	of the Debtors. Work on drafting a Chapter 11 plan of the Debtors.	0.70	B320	A103	133.00
05/20/15	JMC	Work on classification of claims in connection with formulating and drafting plan term sheet of the Debtors.	1.10	B320	A104	209.00
05/20/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of proceeds distribution under each proposed transaction structure for each class of recipients in connection with the Debtors' plan term sheet.	1.20	B320	A104	228.00
05/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding plan term sheet of the Debtors.	0.20	B320	A105	38.00
05/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding plan term sheet of the Debtors.	0.10	B320	A105	19.00
05/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding shipping of mailing system from the Debtors' facility.	0.20	B210	A106	38.00
05/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Jon Nash regarding certain tax claims against the Debtors.	0.10	B310	A106	19.00
05/20/15	JOH	Continue work on reviewing insurance policies for coverage analysis.	1.90	L110	A104	380.00
05/20/15	MDC	Research for documents related to water balance issues, metals and hazardous waste	6.40	P230	A101	2,304.00

		determination for De Jong				
05/20/15	MDC	Call with Steve Rosenblatt regarding EPA request for documents to be given to Corps of Engineers	0.40	P230	A105	144.00
05/20/15	SWR	Work on revisions and clarifications to Governments-Lenders term sheet	2.30	B190	A103	1,092.50
05/20/15	SWR	Review property maps of Mississippi Phosphates property for non-essential property for DOJ discussions	0.40	B120	A104	190.00
05/20/15	SWR	Conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding conservation easements on Mississippi Phosphates property	0.30	B120	A105	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding review of insurance policies	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding proposed changes to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Multiple correspondence with James Tucker and Butler Snow team regarding report on continued discussions with DOJ	0.40	B190	A105	190.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brad Thompson regarding return of Mississippi Phosphates corporate documents to corporate headquarters	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington	0.20	B320	A105	95.00

05/20/15	SWR	regarding plan term sheet	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/20/13	SWK	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding funding of professional fees accounts	0.30	D 110	A100	142.30
05/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding ordinary course professionals application	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding revisions to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A106	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding payment of FCC license transfer fee	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding follow-up with Gallagher on insurance issues	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding Mississippi Phosphates updated cash flow budget	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for Committee regarding status report on various matters, including Governments-Lenders term sheet and funding of professional fees account for Committee's professionals	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Jon Nash regarding protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding request for extension of time to file objection to	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		ordinary course professionals motion				
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Luke Dove regarding Horne retention application	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Will Sugden regarding IOC contract	0.20	B185	A107	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Ken Long of DOJ regarding property and casualty insurance issues	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding property and casualty insurance issue	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee and counsel for Committee, EPA and MDEQ and Lenders regarding feedback from Sandler O'Neill regarding effect of insurance on sales process	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee and counsel for Committee, EPA and MDEQ, and Lenders re feedback from Gallagher regarding reduction of policy limits of the property and casualty insurance policy	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/20/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Sunny Cheung regarding cancellation of property and casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A108	142.50
05/20/15	ТМН	Research professional fees escrow account deposits and payments	0.50	B160	A102	92.50

		year to date				
05/20/15	TMH	Work on document for waiver of FCC fee for transferring licenses	1.00	B110	A103	185.00
05/20/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Trustmark regarding payments to Butler Snow escrow account	0.20	B160	A108	37.00
05/20/15	ТМН	Correspondence with MS DOR regarding filed claims	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review/revise settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.40	B230	A103	144.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review/revise stipulation regarding TMC 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B310	A103	108.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review/analyze response filed by office of the United States Trustee to motion for relief from certain UST chapter 11 operating guidelines	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review/analyze materials supporting protective BP claim	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review e-mail correspondence and draft pleadings regarding extension of deadline for UST to respond to application to employ ordinary course professionals	0.20	B160	A104	72.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review certain provisions of the settlement agreement with the committee in connection with review/revision of the settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.50	B230	A104	180.00
05/21/15	CHM	Review draft personal property tax rendition	0.20	B240	A104	72.00

-							
	05/21/15	СНМ	Review/analyze options with respect to resolution of pending investigation regarding environmental issues	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Review memorandum from J. Tucker regarding discussions with USDOJ attorneys, next steps and course of action	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Review/analyze various exit options and draft term sheet with respect to same	0.80	B320	A104	288.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding background facts related to analysis of certain insurance policies	0.40	B110	A105	144.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Conference with M. Carrington regarding settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A105	108.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding motion for waiver of UST guidelines for casualty insurance	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding proposed revisions to settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding personal property tax rendition and assumptions underlying same	0.30	B240	A106	108.00
	05/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding retention matters	0.20	B160	A107	72.00
	05/21/15	CHM	Correspondence with	0.30	B230	A107	108.00

		counsel to EPA, MDEQ, the lenders and PHI regarding settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments				
05/21/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to the lenders regarding comments to the settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
05/21/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with EPA regarding use and review of engineering documents	0.20	B310	A107	72.00
05/21/15	DBC	E-mails with working group regarding land to contribute to US Government and settlement of claims; review e-mails regarding Master Services Agreement/BP claim filing.	0.40	L160	A105	198.00
05/21/15	JMC	Work on drafting plan term sheet of the Debtors to reflect the proposed changes made to the settlement term sheet and distribution schemes therein.	0.30	B130	A103	57.00
05/21/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising settlement term sheet to incorporate final changes to same.	0.40	B130	A103	76.00
05/21/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain issues in connection with the workers' compensation claims currently pending against the Debtors.	0.20	B110	A104	38.00
05/21/15	JMC	Correspondence with the Governments and Lenders regarding	0.10	B130	A104	19.00

05/21/15	JMC	proposed changes to the settlement term sheet. Work on review and analysis of proposed changes of the Lenders to settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Governments and the	1.20	B130	A104	228.00
05/21/15	JMC	Lenders. Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding settlement agreement term sheet.	0.10	B130	A105	19.00
05/21/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux on certain issues in connection with the settlement term sheet.	0.50	B130	A105	95.00
05/21/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding the settlement term sheet and final changes to same.	0.20	B130	A105	38.00
05/21/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding proposed changes to settlement term sheet among the Lenders, the Governments and the Debtors.	0.10	B130	A105	19.00
05/21/15	JMC	Work with Chris Maddux regarding the proposed changes of the Lenders to the settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments.	0.20	B320	A105	38.00
05/21/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Steve Rosenblatt and Karl Steinberger regarding certain workers'	0.70	B110	A107	133.00