
		Velvet Johnson regarding filing of notice of extension of challenge period				
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Mitch Carrington regarding requirement for compensation reports by DTBA as CRO	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Butler Snow team regarding compensation reports for DTBA	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding status of February monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding confirmation timeline	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding budget for case administration for committee's professionals.	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill team regarding contact from a decommissioning and demolition company	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and CRO regarding Mississippi Power bill	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel to Brock Services and Thomas Hewitt regarding agreed order for continuance	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding proposed orders	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B110	A107	142.50

		counsel for EPA and MDEQ, counsel for DIP Lenders, and counsel for Committee regarding proposed agreed order extending time to respond to Rule 9019 motion				
03/16/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status of case and course of action	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with various counsel regarding consent to amended sales procedures order	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Brock Services regarding resolution of discrepancies in cure amount	0.30	B185	A107	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding course of action regarding handling objections to cure amounts	0.30	B185	A107	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, counsel for Committee, and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of challenge period and time to object to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding narrative regarding sales process	0.40	B110	A108	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with David Phelps regarding contact from a decommissioning and demolition company	0.20	B130	A108	95.00

03/16/15	TMH	Draft motion to establish procedures for assertion of 503(b)(9) claims.	1.70	B110	A103	314.50
03/16/15	TMH	Work on Brock Services agreed order for continuance	0.30	B185	A103	55.50
03/16/15	TMH	Work on generic agreed order for continuance	1.70	B185	A103	314.50
03/16/15	TMH	Review MORs for MPC, ATS and SATS	0.50	B110	A104	92.50
03/16/15	TMH	Review and analyze all cure objections	1.20	B185	A104	222.00
03/16/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding objection by Alabama Electric	0.20	B185	A106	37.00
03/16/15	TMH	Correspondence with counsel regarding objection to cure amount of Alabama Electric	0.40	B185	A107	74.00
03/16/15	TMH	Correspondence with Hogan Lovells regarding SUNCOM's objection to cure amount	0.10	B185	A107	18.50
03/16/15	TMH	Correspondence with Locke Lord regarding Brock Services objection to cure amount	0.10	B185	A108	18.50
03/16/15	TMH	Correspondence with Hogan Lovells regarding cure objection	0.50	B185	A108	92.50
03/16/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with BMC Group re mail out of Notice of 503(b)(9) Motion to parties listed on Shortened Service List	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Work on establishing secure credentials for new users and managing Firm Ex data room files.	0.40	B110	A110	64.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on review of recent ECF Notices.	0.30	B110	A110	48.00

03/16/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice to Extend Investigation Termination Date and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Returned Mail to Debtor from Case Administrator and search for new address for purposes of amending creditors to reflect same.	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Prepare Notice of Change of Address and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Begin preparation of hearing notebook with motion and objections to Cure Amount	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Begin preparation of hearing notebook with motion and objections to Rule 9019	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Extending Deadline of Rule 9019 Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Finalize Amended Bid Procedure Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/16/15	VGJ	Finalize 503(b)(9) Motion, 21 Day Notice, assemble exhibits and electronically file same with Court	0.70	B110	A111	112.00
03/17/15	CHM	Review/revise motion for status conference	0.30	B110	A103	108.00
03/17/15	CHM	Review narrative statement for February MOR	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
03/17/15	CHM	Review correspondence from DOJ/EPA regarding information request	0.20	B150	A104	72.00

03/17/15	CHM	Review correspondence with Gallagher regarding insurance policies	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
03/17/15	CHM	Review/analyze draft of budget through potential effective date	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/17/15	CHM	Review/analyze documents related to relationship with Mississippi Power and correspondence with respect to rate increase	0.80	B210	A104	288.00
03/17/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with CRO regarding cash flow and other matters pending in cases	1.10	B110	A106	396.00
03/17/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding du Pont objection to 9019 motion	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
03/17/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Mississippi Power documents	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
03/17/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding bank accounts	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
03/17/15	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding information request	0.20	B150	A107	72.00
03/17/15	DBC	Review of Trammo lease regarding required amendments.	0.40	B250	A104	198.00
03/17/15	JMC	Work on motion of the Debtors for status conference to be filed in the bankruptcy cases.	0.90	B110	A103	171.00
03/17/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of documents filed by Caterpillar Financial Services and Court's memorandum order regarding same.	0.20	B140	A104	38.00

03/17/15	SWR	Review and revise order on continuing hearing on cure amounts	0.50	B110	A103	237.50
03/17/15	SWR	Finalize narrative for February monthly operating report	0.40	B110	A103	190.00
03/17/15	SWR	Work on motion for a status conference	0.40	B110	A103	190.00
03/17/15	SWR	Work on order granting motion to determine cure amounts	0.80	B185	A103	380.00
03/17/15	SWR	Review notice of hearing on objections to cure amounts	0.20	B110	A104	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Review notice of hearing on objection of DuPont to Rule 9019 motion	0.10	B110	A104	47.50
03/17/15	SWR	Review notice of hearing of 503(b)(9) claim of Basteck, LLC	0.20	B110	A104	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Review draft cash flow budget prepared by CRO	0.40	B230	A104	190.00
03/17/15	SWR	Review DIP budget and actual-to-budget comparison	0.20	B230	A104	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding treatment of administrative claims	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding continuance of hearing on objections to cure amounts and preparation of orders regarding same	0.20	B185	A105	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding search for insurance policies in data room	0.20	L140	A105	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding conference call with DuPont lawyers regarding DIP budget and	0.30	B110	A106	142.50

		status of case				
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding narrative for February monthly operating report	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding bank management order	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding United States Trustee guidelines for bank accounts in chapter 11 cases	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding insurance issues regarding counsel for Committee and DOJ	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding rate increase by Mississippi Power Company	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding contract and tariff with Mississippi Power for MPC operations	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding request for call with United States Trustee and CRO to review requirements regarding bank management order	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Derek Meek regarding conference call with Committee regarding status of case	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding hearing on objection of DuPont to Rule 9019	0.40	B110	A107	190.00

		settlement motion				
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marc Solomon regarding conference call with insurance broker and funding of escrow for professionals for Committee	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for Committee regarding proposed timeline and need for budget from professionals for Committee	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding proposed timeline to confirmation of plan	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long of DOJ regarding insurance policies	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/17/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding order on Motley Rice retention	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding basis for rate increase asserted by Mississippi Power Company	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for BP Energy and CRO regarding gas contracts	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Fingerhood and Ken Long of DOJ regarding notice of extension of Challenge Period and order extending time for governments to object to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50

03/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill team regarding notice of sale hearing	0.20	B110	A108	95.00
03/17/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for ACE American Insurance	1.00	B185	A103	185.00
03/17/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for continuance of cure motion hearing for SULCOM	0.90	B185	A103	166.50
03/17/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for cure motion regarding Alabama Electric	0.80	B185	A103	148.00
03/17/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for cure motion regarding Trammo	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/17/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for cure motion regarding Mississippi Ammonia Leasing	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/17/15	TMH	Work on order for cure motion regarding non-objecting parties.	1.30	B185	A103	240.50
03/17/15	TMH	Correspondence with Duane Morris regarding Agreed Order	0.10	B185	A107	18.50
03/17/15	TMH	Correspondence with Phelps Dunbar regarding Trammo and MAL objections to cure motion	0.40	B185	A108	74.00
03/17/15	TMH	Correspondence with Baker Donelson regarding reservation of rights filed by ACE American Insurance	0.20	B185	A108	37.00
03/17/15	TMH	Correspondence with court for filing of AL Electric Agreed Order	0.30	B185	A108	55.50
03/17/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt re insurance policies	0.10	B110	A105	16.00
03/17/15	VGJ	Office conference with C. Maddux re MS Power	0.30	B110	A105	48.00

		contract and retrieve same for C. Maddux				
03/17/15	VGJ	Add additional documents to Data Room	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
03/17/15	VGJ	Prepare list of insurance policies listed in Data Room	1.30	B110	A110	208.00
03/17/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices of deadlines and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
03/17/15	VGJ	Finalize Proposed Order Granting Cure Amount, assemble and redact exhibits and electronically file with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/17/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Agreement to Extend Deadline for Investigation Termination and Challenge Period under DIP Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/18/15	CHM	Revise proposed order granting, in part, motion to determine cure amounts	0.30	B130	A103	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review correspondence with Gallagher regarding information requests from DOJ/EPA and committee	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review February MORs	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review correspondence with counsel to objecting parties regarding motion to determine cure amounts	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review proposed order granting Motley Rice retention	0.20	B160	A104	72.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review/analyze monthly fee statements and notices of same	0.50	B160	A104	180.00

03/18/15	CHM	Review/analyze file materials regarding prior insurance policies	1.10	B210	A104	396.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review correspondence from counsel to Mississippi Power regarding rate increase and related data regarding adequate protection payments	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/18/15	CHM	Review issues related to execution of tolling agreement	0.40	B430	A104	144.00
03/18/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in internal meeting regarding legal strategy and course of action	0.70	B110	A105	252.00
03/18/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding equipment subject of pending motion to lift stay	0.20	B140	A106	72.00
03/18/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding DIP bank accounts	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Mississippi Power rate increase	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Correspondence regarding order approving Motley Rice retention	0.30	B160	A107	108.00
03/18/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with Chris Steiskal and CRO regarding DIP bank accounts	0.50	B210	A107	180.00
03/18/15	CHM	Correspondence with UST regarding cash management order	0.20	B210	A107	72.00
03/18/15	DBC	Conference Steve Rosenblatt and research	1.30	B310	A104	643.50

		files regarding environmental insurance request for Department of Justice.				
03/18/15	JMC	Work with Paul Murphy and Steve Rosenblatt regarding certain hard copies of insurance policies and other related documents of the Debtors.	0.20	L300	A105	38.00
03/18/15	MDC	Call with Joint Defense Group attorneys to discuss bevill litigation issues	1.20	P230	A107	432.00
03/18/15	PSM	Establish procedure for identifying and segregating Debtor's insurance files for EPA/MDEQ review and inspection.	0.50	B120	A110	142.50
03/18/15	SEK	Conducted review and assimilation of all MPC files marked insurance, insurance renewals and/or insurance policy in preparation for review by attorney.	5.60	B120	A110	756.00
03/18/15	SWR	Work on motion for status conference for bankruptcy case	0.50	B110	A103	237.50
03/18/15	SWR	Review and revise agreed orders to continue hearings on cure amounts	0.40	B110	A103	190.00
03/18/15	SWR	Prepare Order extending cash management order for 30 days	0.50	B110	A103	237.50
03/18/15	SWR	Revise and finalize cash management order with language requested by United States Trustee	0.20	B110	A103	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Revise order approving the retention of Motley Rice as special counsel for the Debtors to handle	0.30	B160	A103	142.50

		the BP claim				
03/18/15	SWR	Work on monthly compensation request forms for November, December, January and February	1.20	B160	A103	570.00
03/18/15	SWR	Finalize order granting motion to determine cure amounts	0.90	B185	A103	427.50
03/18/15	SWR	Work on order on Brock Services objection to cure amount	0.30	B185	A103	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Work on budget and staffing plan for March 2015	0.50	B110	A104	237.50
03/18/15	SWR	Review February monthly operating report received from Robert Kerley	0.20	B110	A104	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Review list of insurance policies in data room	0.30	B110	A104	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Review minute entry regarding continuation of hearing on objections and responses to motion to determine cure amount	0.10	B185	A104	47.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding filing of February monthly operating report	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding response from Ace Insurance and course of action	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Butler Snow team regarding information concerning insurance policies of debtors and PHI	0.50	B110	A105	237.50
03/18/15	SWR	Conferences with Thomas Hewitt regarding status of hearing on pending motions and	0.20	B110	A105	95.00

		course of action				
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Don Cannada regarding environmental insurance file	0.30	B120	A105	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding regarding review of hard copies of documents to be produced to DOJ and index of boxes	0.30	L140	A105	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding bank management order	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding list of insurance policies	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding use of Caterpillar front end loader	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding adequate protection payments vs. billed amounts for Mississippi Power Company	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding projections for cash flow budget	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding order extending cash management order	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding additional language requested by United States Trustee for cash management order	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Steve Bryant regarding	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

		claim of Brock Services				
03/18/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Wendy Simkulak (counsel for ACE Insurance) regarding response of ACE and hearing on response	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Finalize and execute stipulation for United States Trustee and correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding same	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding Motley Rice retention order	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding submission of revised order approving retention of Motley Rice	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with designated Recipients regarding monthly compensation reports per the interim fee procedures order	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding applicable Mississippi Power Company tariffs for MPC account	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
03/18/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding Mississippi Power Company billing and weekly payments analysis	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher, counsel for Committee and CRO regarding conference call to discuss D&O insurance	0.40	B120	A108	190.00

		policies				
03/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Pamela Brownstein of Arthur J. Gallagher and Robert Kerley regarding premium for insurance policy	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
03/18/15	TMH	Research tolling agreements and validity in chapter 11	0.70	B110	A102	129.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on agreed orders for continuance of hearing on cure motion	0.70	B185	A103	129.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order to withdraw Trammo's objection to cure motion	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order to withdraw MAL's objection to cure motion	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order to withdraw AL Electric's objection to cure motion	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order to withdraw Brock's objection to cure motion	0.50	B185	A103	92.50
03/18/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order to withdraw SULCOM's objection to cure motion	0.60	B185	A103	111.00
03/18/15	TMH	Correspondence with the Court regarding Agreed Orders for continuation of cure motion hearing	0.40	B185	A108	74.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with T. Hewitt re proposed Agreed Orders Continuing Hearing on Cure Amounts	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Continue to prepare list of insurance policies listed in Data Room	2.30	B110	A110	368.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Review of court docket re status of proposed orders	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for	0.20	B110	A110	32.00

		attorneys				
03/18/15	VGJ	Finalize 6 proposed Agreed Orders Continuing Hearing on Cure Amount and electronically submit same to Court	0.70	B110	A111	112.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Finalize Affidavit of Service for BMC and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order Granting Motion to Determine Cure Amounts and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/18/15	VGJ	Finalize Amended Order Extending Authority to Maintain Existing Bank Accounts and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/19/15	CHM	Research regarding allowance, payment and priority of administrative expense claims	0.90	B310	A102	324.00
03/19/15	CHM	Review correspondence from committee counsel regarding information requested with respect to existing and prior insurance policies	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
03/19/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding finalizing MORs	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
03/19/15	CHM	Telephone conference with counsel to IOC regarding status of case	0.30	B150	A107	108.00
03/19/15	CHM	Multiple correspondence (x 9 e-mails) among UST and counsel regarding order authorizing retention of Motley Rice	0.60	B160	A107	216.00
03/19/15	CHM	Multiple correspondence with Gallagher regarding	0.50	B210	A108	180.00

		existing and prior insurance policies and information requested with respect to same				
03/19/15	GCV	Email correspondence to Jeb Burchett and Robert Kerley re: completing 401(k) plan distributions.	0.20	B220	A106	70.00
03/19/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding certain issues in connection with administrative expense claims.	0.20	B110	A105	38.00
03/19/15	MDC	Review issues with DOJ tolling agreement on RCRA matters	1.50	P230	A104	540.00
03/19/15	MDC	Discuss with Steve Rosenblatt regarding tolling agreement with DOJ and environmental issues	1.10	P230	A105	396.00
03/19/15	SWR	Brief research regarding update law on standard for interim fee application	0.40	B160	A102	190.00
03/19/15	SWR	Brief research on treatment of administrative expense claims	0.40	B300	A102	190.00
03/19/15	SWR	Revise Motley Rice retention order	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/19/15	SWR	Prepare stipulation with United States Trustee for Craig Geno as special counsel for Debtors	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/19/15	SWR	Finalize and file monthly operating report for February	0.20	B110	A104	95.00
03/19/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux regarding motion for a status conference	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/19/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding status of hearings on objection to	0.20	B110	A105	95.00

		cure amounts				
03/19/15	SWR	Internal conference regarding environmental issues and sales process	0.50	B130	A105	237.50
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding application for compensation for Butler Snow	0.30	B160	A105	142.50
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding motion for a status conference	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with management regarding monthly operating reports for February	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee, CRO and Arthur J. Gallagher regarding D&O insurance issues and request for conference call to discuss same	0.70	B120	A107	332.50
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding order regarding retention of Motley Rice	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding Motley Rice retention order	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/19/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Ron McAlpin and Slate Dabney regarding Motley Rice retention order	0.40	B160	A107	190.00
03/19/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with United States Trustee and counsel for PHI regarding requirements for Motley Rice retention affidavit and proposed order	0.40	B160	A107	190.00
03/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		Craig Geno regarding stipulation for United States Trustee				
03/19/15	TMH	Work on schedule D for MPC, ATS and SATS	1.30	B110	A102	240.50
03/19/15	TMH	Research cure amounts and objection amounts	1.60	B185	A102	296.00
03/19/15	TMH	Work on agreed orders to resolve outstanding objections	1.40	B185	A103	259.00
03/19/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding schedule amendments	0.30	B110	A106	55.50
03/19/15	TMH	Correspondence with B. Daniel of BMC regarding schedule amendments	0.30	B110	A108	55.50
03/19/15	VGJ	Several emails with T. Hewitt re Amended Schedule D	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with R. Kerley re Amended Schedule D	0.10	B110	A106	16.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Several emails with R. Kerley and S. Rosenblatt re February Monthly Operating Reports	0.20	B110	A106	32.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with B. Daniel re updated Shortened Creditor List	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with W. Watson (Court) re proposed Agreed Orders as to Dkt. 512	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Review of court docket for new entry of appearances to update Shortened Creditor Matrix	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
03/19/15	VGJ	Finalize and assemble February 2015 Monthly Operating Reports for MPC, ATS and SATS and file electronically with Court	0.80	B110	A111	128.00

03/20/15	CHM	Review correspondence with committee counsel and Gallagher regarding directors and officers insurance policies	0.40	B150	A104	144.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review/analyze memorandum from Gallagher regarding directors and officers insurance policies and related tail coverage	0.30	B150	A104	108.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review index of documents potentially responsive to DOJ/EPA information request	0.30	B150	A104	108.00
03/20/15	CHM	Correspondence with DOJ/EPA regarding document production	0.30	B150	A104	108.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review tariff information and supporting documents provided by Mississippi Power	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review correspondence with management regarding amounts owed to Mississippi Power	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review correspondence and documents regarding letters of credit and status of same	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review/analyze information related to outstanding property taxes	0.60	B240	A104	216.00
03/20/15	CHM	Review proof of claim filed by Mississippi Department of Revenue	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/20/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in internal conference call regarding production of documents responsive to information requests from creditors	0.50	B150	A105	180.00
03/20/15	CHM	Office conference with G. Van Loon regarding	0.20	B220	A105	72.00

		employee benefits				
03/20/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding scope and timing of meeting with DOJ	0.40	B150	A106	144.00
03/20/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding bank accounts	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
03/20/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to Mississippi Power regarding calculation of rates	0.60	B210	A107	216.00
03/20/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with DOJ/EPA, MDEQ and management	0.70	B210	A107	252.00
03/20/15	DBC	Emails Karl Burrer of Haynes & Boone and telephone conference Tim Cantrell re: final LC payment to Trammo, review of files concerning same.	0.70	B310	A104	346.50
03/20/15	GCV	Review information from Jeb Burchett and review file.	0.40	B220	A104	140.00
03/20/15	GCV	Email correspondence re: overtime and exempt employees; email correspondence re: fiduciary duties in completing 401(k) plan distributions.	0.30	B220	A106	105.00
03/20/15	JBT	Telephone conference with J. Korzenik regarding offers terms of DOJ; report to A. Barbour and M.Caples regarding government proposal.	0.80	L140	A107	380.00
03/20/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain case law and statutes on the	3.10	B310	A104	589.00

		priority of administrative expense claimants.				
03/20/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux on certain issues regarding status of bankruptcy case.	0.40	B110	A105	76.00
03/20/15	JMC	Conference call with Butler Snow team regarding certain insurance documents of the Debtors in connection with certain discovery requests of the DOJ.	0.40	L300	A105	76.00
03/20/15	MDC	Call with EPA, MDEQ and DOJ on weekly status of facility	0.70	P230	A107	252.00
03/20/15	PSM	Teleconference with S. Rosenblatt, C. Maddux and M. Carrington re: procedure for inventorying MPC insurance files and documents.	0.30	B120	A110	85.50
03/20/15	SAI	Work on escrow account for Committee professionals.	0.60	B170	A108	204.00
03/20/15	SEK	Continue review, summary and assimilation of files received from MPC relating to insurance, insurance policies and insurance renewals from 2002 through 2015 in preparation of review by counsel.	6.90	B120	A110	931.50
03/20/15	SWR	Work on first fee application for Butler Snow	0.90	B160	A103	427.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker and Michael Caples regarding telephone conference with Jeremy Korzenik of	0.20	B110	A105	95.00

		the DOJ and course of action				
03/20/15	SWR	Internal conference and correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding status report on identification and production of insurance policies	0.50	B110	A105	237.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding response to DOJ	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding order on bank accounts and status report on developments in matter	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management and Butler Snow team regarding cure amounts	0.30	B185	A106	142.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Mississippi Power Company issue	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
03/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Roy Furrh regarding bankruptcy counsel for MDEQ	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jeff Barber regarding offer of meeting regarding background information	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/20/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with EPA and MDEQ regarding environmental matters and case administration	0.70	B110	A107	332.50
03/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding D&O insurance issues	0.70	B120	A107	332.50

03/20/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel and business representative of Mississippi Power Company regarding rate increase and course of action regarding adequate protection	0.40	B210	A107	190.00
03/20/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Paul Delcambre and documentation for increased utility rates by Mississippi Power Company	0.50	B210	A107	237.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders and Don Cannada regarding letter of credit for phosphate rock purchase	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
03/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Ken Long and Karl Fingerhood regarding inspection of documents in Coast office	0.30	L320	A107	142.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mabelle Anthony regarding interim fee procedures order for estate professionals and escrow agreements	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with counterparties to escrow agreement regarding amendments to same	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Arthur J. Gallagher regarding D&O insurance issues and communications with counsel for Committee	0.60	B120	A108	285.00
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding inventory of insurance	0.20	L140	A110	95.00

		files				
03/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding copy services for EPA in copying documents	0.30	L140	A110	142.50
03/20/15	TMH	Update research on standard for interim attorney fee awards in the Fifth Circuit	2.10	B110	A102	388.50
03/20/15	TMH	Draft application of Johnson Factors in Fee Application	1.90	B110	A103	351.50
03/20/15	TMH	Work on Amended Escrow Agreement for DTBA	0.60	B160	A103	111.00
03/20/15	TMH	Work on Amended Escrow Agreement for Committee Professionals	0.50	B160	A103	92.50
03/20/15	TMH	Review new schedules of claims submitted by BMC Group	0.30	B110	A104	55.50
03/20/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding schedule amendments	0.10	B110	A106	18.50
03/20/15	TMH	Correspondence with parties that filed objections or reservation of rights to cure motion regarding order signed carving out those objections or reservation of rights	0.60	B110	A108	111.00
03/20/15	TMH	Correspondence with B. Daniel of BMC regarding schedule amendments	0.20	B110	A108	37.00
03/21/15	DBC	Research file re: final letter credit payment to Trammo and email Karl Burrer re: same.	1.50	B310	A104	742.50
03/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding conference call to discuss DOJ issue	0.10	B110	A106	47.50

03/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with counterparties to escrow agreement regarding execution of amended agreements	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding conference call to discuss DOJ issue	0.10	B110	A106	47.50
03/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding stipulation with United States Trustee	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding supplemental Rice affidavit	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review amended schedules	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review status of pending matters in case and next steps with respect to same	0.60	B110	A104	216.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding analysis of BP claim	0.20	B120	A104	72.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review prior correspondence and documents regarding sale process and status of interested parties	0.50	B130	A104	180.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review/analyze ammonia tank/terminal lease	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review memo from broker regarding D&O insurance and related tail coverage	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review/analyze draft of cash flow and underlying assumptions with respect to same	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review/analyze spreadsheet regarding property taxes	0.30	B240	A104	108.00
03/23/15	CHM	Review correspondence	0.30	B310	A104	108.00

		regarding production of documents to DOJ/EPA				
03/23/15	CHM	Review draft of proposed tolling agreement and related motion seeking approval to execute same	0.40	B310	A104	144.00
03/23/15	CHM	Telephone conference with management regarding funding needs and budget	0.40	B230	A106	144.00
03/23/15	CHM	Correspondence with management and counsel to the committee regarding tolling agreement	0.30	B310	A106	108.00
03/23/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding outstanding issues with governments	0.50	B310	A106	180.00
03/23/15	CHM	Correspondence from counsel to DIP lenders regarding funding needs and budget	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/23/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding funding needs and budget	0.50	B230	A107	180.00
03/23/15	GCV	Review file re matters in progress and prepare list of issues to discuss with Robert Kerley; teleconferences with Robert Kerley; work on email correspondence to Vanguard re finalizing 401(k) plan distributions; download and save documents from Robert Kerley.	1.60	B220	A104	560.00
03/23/15	JBT	Telephone conference with Steve Rosenblatt, Jon Nash and Michael Caples regarding J.	0.80	L140	A107	380.00

		Korzenik proposals for prosecution and conditions; communications with Korzenik and team regarding government proposals.				
03/23/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising motion of the Debtors for court approval of agreed order authorizing the Debtors to execute supplement tolling agreement.	3.70	B190	A103	703.00
03/23/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of case law and certain provisions of the bankruptcy code in connection with certain issues regarding administrative expense claim treatment under same.	2.70	B310	A104	513.00
03/23/15	MDC	Research on issues under environmental DOJ charges and possible defenses and impact of same.	1.30	P230	A102	468.00
03/23/15	MDC	Review of Tolling Agreement with DOJ	0.50	P230	A104	180.00
03/23/15	MDC	Conference call with Steve Rosenblatt and Jon Nash on DOJ criminal settlement proposal	0.50	P230	A108	180.00
03/23/15	SEK	Completed review, summary and assimilation of files received from MPC relating to insurance, insurance policies and insurance renewals from 2002 through 2015 in preparation of review by counsel.	8.00	B120	A110	1,080.00
03/23/15	SWR	Review research of Mitch Carrington on tolling	0.30	B110	A104	142.50

		agreement				
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding tentative date for meeting with DOJ.	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding proposed agreed order on supplemental tolling agreement	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding need to execute supplemental tolling agreement, motion to approve execution of tolling agreement, and proposed supplemental tolling agreement	0.40	B110	A106	190.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Butler Snow team regarding conference call to discuss DOJ request	0.40	B110	A106	190.00
03/23/15	SWR	Conference call with CRO and Butler Snow team regarding course of action regarding upcoming meeting with DOJ	0.60	B110	A106	285.00
03/23/15	SWR	Conference call with CRO and Butler Snow team regarding discussion of DOJ proposal	0.50	B110	A106	237.50
03/23/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding conference call to discuss DIP budget and course of action	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/23/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for DIP Lenders, CRO and Butler Snow team regarding planning	0.40	B110	A107	190.00