
		for this week's meeting with DOJ				
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding upcoming conference calls with CRO and unsecured creditors committee	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding budget for professionals for Committee	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Deborah Reyher of DOJ regarding tolling agreement	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding supplemental tolling agreement process	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status of Craig Geno retention order	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel and representative for Mississippi Power and Debtor's management regarding electric charges for most current statement and adequate protection payment	0.50	B210	A107	237.50
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Fingerhood and Ken Long of DOJ regarding production and copying of documents taken from Pascagoula facility	0.30	L140	A107	142.50
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding	0.20	B130	A108	95.00

		developments in sales process				
03/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding update on discussion with insurer regarding tail coverage	0.30	B210	A108	142.50
03/23/15	TMH	Research status of court approval of tolling agreements	1.50	B110	A102	277.50
03/23/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding schedules.	0.60	B110	A106	111.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Several emails with B. Daniel with BMC re amended summary and schedules	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Several emails with Court re Notice of Amendment to Creditor Matrix for all 3 entities	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Check status of proposed Order approving application to employ C. Geno with Court	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Finalize spreadsheet on properties in Jackson County with tax information	1.70	B110	A110	272.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Continue to work on and finalize the Amended Summary of Schedules, Amended Schedules D and H for each of the three entities and electronically file same with court	1.50	B110	A111	240.00
03/23/15	VGJ	Prepare Amended Creditor Matrix with Verifications from R. Kerley for each of the three entities and electronically file same with court	1.70	B110	A111	272.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review correspondence	0.20	B120	A104	72.00

		regarding analysis of BP claim by Motley Rice				
03/24/15	CHM	Review memorandum regarding list of insurance policies from 2004 through present	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review revised terms of Trammo lease agreement and related review of lease agreement	0.60	B210	A104	216.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review/analyze previous drafts of cash flow budgets and related correspondence	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review memorandum regarding motion for approval to execute tolling agreement and related review of tolling agreements	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review draft agreed order regarding motion to enter into tolling agreement	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/24/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding revised terms of Trammo lease agreement	0.40	B210	A106	144.00
03/24/15	CHM	Telephone conference with counsel to Caterpillar Financial regarding motion to lift stay	0.30	B140	A107	108.00
03/24/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel and Gallagher regarding D&O insurance	0.50	B150	A107	180.00
03/24/15	CHM	Review/respond to creditor inquiries	0.30	B150	A107	108.00
03/24/15	CHM	Correspondence regarding Rice affidavit	0.20	B160	A107	72.00
03/24/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with DIP Agent, counsel to DIP lenders	0.80	B230	A107	288.00

		and management regarding pending matters in case and DIP advances				
03/24/15	CHM	Correspondence from Sandler O'Neill regarding sale process	0.10	B130	A108	36.00
03/24/15	CHM	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding discussions with carriers	0.20	B210	A108	72.00
03/24/15	DBC	Emails Steve Russo re: Russo resignations (0.3); emails Steve Russo, Robert Kerley and Steve Rosenblatt re: Trammo lease amendment and review Trammo existing lease re: needed amendments to same (1.0).	1.30	B210	A104	643.50
03/24/15	JBT	Telephone conference with Steve Rosenblatt and bankruptcy committee regarding MPC position regarding government proposals.	0.70	L140	A107	332.50
03/24/15	JMC	Research and analysis of administrative expense claims under Fifth Circuit case law and applicable provisions of the bankruptcy code.	2.90	B310	A102	551.00
03/24/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising motion of the Debtors for court approval of agreed order authorizing the Debtors to execute supplemental tolling agreement with the EPA and drafting and revising agreed order granting same.	3.80	B190	A103	722.00
03/24/15	MDC	Continue look at impact of agreement with DOJ on environmental matter re discharge.	2.10	P230	A102	756.00

03/24/15	SWR	Review and finalize motion for court approval of agreed order authorizing execution of supplemental tolling agreement	0.80	B190	A103	380.00
03/24/15	SWR	Review and finalize proposed agreed order authorizing MPC to execute supplemental tolling agreement	0.60	B190	A103	285.00
03/24/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Gallagher regarding insurance policies	0.50	B120	A104	237.50
03/24/15	SWR	Conference with Velvet Johnson regarding amended schedules and matrix	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding insurance policies	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Mitch Carrington regarding motion and order authorizing MPC to execute supplemental tolling agreement	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding documentation of amended lease terms with Mississippi Ammonia Leasing	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and management regarding amended lease terms with Mississippi Ammonia Leasing and need to document same	0.50	B210	A106	237.50
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding conference call	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

		to discuss DOJ issue and other matters				
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding information for BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding Joe Rice supplemental affidavit	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and Committee regarding proposed motion and order regarding supplemental tolling agreement	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
03/24/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel for DIP Lenders, CRO and Butler Snow team regarding DOJ issues, business operations, DIP budget and status of case	0.90	B210	A107	427.50
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Steve Fitzsimonds regarding update on communications with Chubb	0.20	B120	A108	95.00
03/24/15	SWR	Prepare for and conference call with Gallagher, counsel for Committee and CRO regarding status report on D&O insurance and tail coverage	0.40	B120	A108	190.00
03/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding interest of Oxbow in facility	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with B. Daniel (BMC Group) re amended Shortened Service List	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Email correspondence	0.20	B110	A108	32.00

		with Collette Derouen (Court) re noticing entities on Amended Schedule D				
03/24/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with B. Daniel (BMC) re notice of change of address for creditors through BMC, addresses for proof of claims received through them and additional parties to add to matrix	0.40	B110	A108	64.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Add additional users to Data Room	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Receipt of ECF from Court re \$30 Fee for all 3 entities for amending creditor matrix and prepare check for payment of same	0.40	B110	A110	64.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Prepare Notice of Amendment of Creditor Matrix, assemble exhibits, electronically file same with Court and mail to all affected parties	0.90	B110	A111	144.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Prepare and gather information for Amended Notice of Filing of Updated Limited Service List for March 24, 2015	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/24/15	VGJ	Receipt and review of Notice of Returned Mail to Debtors from Case Administrator	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/25/15	CHM	Work on interim fee application	0.80	B160	A103	288.00
03/25/15	CHM	Revise/finalize notice of additional borrowing	0.40	B230	A103	144.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding interest in	0.20	B130	A104	72.00

		participating in auction				
03/25/15	CHM	Review/analyze draft letter agreement regarding amendment to Trammo lease	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review draft cash flow budget	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding information request	0.20	B230	A104	72.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review settlement term sheet of Lenders and EPA.	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review/analyze documents related to extension and renewal of interim DIP order	0.50	B230	A104	180.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review minutes of MPC regarding resignation	0.20	B260	A104	72.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review memorandum regarding pending litigation and claims in connection with same	0.30	B430	A104	108.00
03/25/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding draft cash flow budget	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/25/15	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding information request	0.20	B150	A107	72.00
03/25/15	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding extension of challenge period, deadline to objection to 9019 motion and deadline to respond to complaint in adversary proceeding	0.60	B230	A107	216.00
03/25/15	CHM	Review correspondence with DOJ/EPA regarding tolling agreement and related motion to approve	0.40	B310	A107	144.00
03/25/15	DBC	Telephone conference	0.70	B210	A104	346.50

		and emails Steve Russo re: resignations from Board of Director officers and review minutes re: same (0.4); emails re: Trammo lease revisions (0.3).				
03/25/15	GCV	Review and analyze e-mail correspondence re: 401(k) plan termination.	0.90	B220	A104	315.00
03/25/15	GCV	Conference with S. Rosenblatt re: 401(k) plan termination.	0.10	B220	A105	35.00
03/25/15	GCV	Email correspondence to Robert Kerley re: 401(k) plan distributions and related issues.	0.30	B220	A106	105.00
03/25/15	GCV	Email correspondence to Vanguard re: 401(k) plan distributions.	0.40	B220	A108	140.00
03/25/15	JMC	Work on research regarding recent case law on treatment of various types of administrative expense claims.	3.10	B310	A102	589.00
03/25/15	JMC	Work on finalizing motion of Debtors for court approval of agreed order authorizing the Debtors to execute supplemental tolling agreement and agreed order granting same.	0.20	B190	A103	38.00
03/25/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of proposed terms of renewed lease arrangement with supplier of the Debtors.	0.30	B210	A104	57.00
03/25/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of administrative expense claim priorities and case law interpreting same.	3.10	B310	A104	589.00
03/25/15	JMC	Correspondence with Paul Murphy, Steve	0.20	B310	A105	38.00

		Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding documents sent by Joel Blacklidge, counsel for Kristofer Steel in connection with K. Steel's workers' compensation claim.				
03/25/15	MDC	Review of documents regarding Tolling Agreement	0.50	P230	A104	180.00
03/25/15	MDC	Meeting with Allen Engineering to discuss wastewater treatment; potential options for groundwater remediation; risk assessment and environment permitting issues at the facility	2.60	P230	A108	936.00
03/25/15	MDD	Draft resignations and minutes of PHI and MPC re S. Russo	1.00	B260	A103	180.00
03/25/15	PSM	Calls and email exchanges with J. Blacklidge, attny for creditor K. Steel, re: creditor's claims based on proffered pleadings from workers comp case.	0.40	B140	A107	114.00
03/25/15	SWR	Brief research on administrative expense claims	0.30	B110	A102	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Work on supplemental tolling agreement, motion to authorize execution and proposed order	0.90	B110	A103	427.50
03/25/15	SWR	Work on first fee application for Butler Snow	1.80	B160	A103	855.00
03/25/15	SWR	Draft order extending deadline for Governments to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.40	B230	A103	190.00
03/25/15	SWR	Draft order extending deadline for Debtors to	0.40	B230	A103	190.00

		respond to adversary proceeding filed by Lenders				
03/25/15	SWR	Draft notice of extension of challenge period	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Briefly review latest settlement term sheet between Lenders and Governments	0.30	B230	A104	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Review preliminary DIP cash flow budget prepared by CRO	0.20	B230	A104	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding inquiry from Toronto entity regarding qualification as a bidder for the MPC auction	0.20	B130	A105	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marcie Davant regarding annual corporate reports	0.10	B210	A105	47.50
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada and Marcie Davant regarding Russo resignation	0.20	B260	A105	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding developments in case	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management and Mississippi Power Company representatives regarding conference call to discuss rate changes	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding DIP financing, budget and pleadings	0.40	B230	A106	190.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding conference call with Committee	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long and Deborah	0.50	B110	A107	237.50

		Reyher of DOJ regarding supplemental tolling agreement, motion to authorize same and proposed order				
03/25/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding update on status of communications between Lenders and EPA	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of challenge period	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Brock Services regarding claim resolution	0.20	B310	A107	95.00
03/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding inquiry regarding qualification as a bidder for the MPC auction	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/25/15	TMH	Draft notice for additional borrowing by Debtors.	2.30	B110	A103	425.50
03/25/15	TMH	Review multiple BMC amendments to creditor matrix	0.50	B110	A104	92.50
03/25/15	TMH	Correspondence with MPC regarding Brock Services cure objection	0.30	B310	A106	55.50
03/25/15	TMH	Correspondence with Brock Services regarding cure objection	0.30	B310	A107	55.50
03/25/15	VGJ	Review and compare List of Creditors from BMC with the Court's Matrix as to Proof of Claims, Schedules and additional Notice parties	2.80	B110	A104	448.00

03/25/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Russo re resignation letters	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/25/15	VGJ	Email correspondence and telephone conference with C. Derouen (Court) re Proof of Claims filed via BMC Group and procedure for uploading creditors to Court Matrix	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
03/25/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar response dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/25/15	VGJ	Finalize updated Shortened Service List and Amended Notice of Filing of same and electronically file with Court	0.80	B110	A111	128.00
03/25/15	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Returned Mail from Case Administrator and search for new address	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/26/15	CHM	Review interim fee applications for committee professionals	0.80	B160	A104	288.00
03/26/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding additional DIP advances	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/26/15	CHM	Review/analyze draft cash flow and related assumptions	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/26/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding DOJ investigation	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/26/15	CHM	Conference call with counsel to DIP lenders regarding additional DIP borrowing	0.50	B230	A107	180.00
03/26/15	DBC	Review Trammo lease letter agreement draft and review existing lease re: amendments to be made to lease (1.0); emails MPC working group re:	1.80	B250	A104	891.00

		same (0.3); detailed email to Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux re: issues to be addressed to lease amendment with Trammo (0.5).				
03/26/15	GCV	E-mail correspondence to Robert Kerley re: 401(k) plan termination.	0.10	B220	A106	35.00
03/26/15	JBT	Communications with J. Korzenik and team regarding postponement of conference.	0.50	L140	A107	237.50
03/26/15	SWR	Review and finalize notice of fee application	0.30	B110	A103	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Work on and finalize first fee application for Butler Snow	1.90	B160	A103	902.50
03/26/15	SWR	Work on order extending time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Work on order granting additional time to respond to adversary proceeding filed by Lender	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Finalize and file motion to authorize execution of supplemental tolling agreement	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Prepare notice of extension of challenge period	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Review documentation for United States Trustee regarding fee application	0.30	B160	A104	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Work on proposed letter to Trammo regarding amendment to industrial lease to Mississippi Ammonia Leasing, LLC	0.70	B210	A104	332.50
03/26/15	SWR	Review revised DIP budget	0.30	B230	A104	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding	0.20	B110	A105	95.00

		postponement of meeting with DOJ				
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding Trammo letter	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding Mississippi Ammonia Leasing Industrial lease and proposed changes	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding update on scheduled meeting with DOJ	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with management regarding Trammo letter	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and management regarding proposed letter to Trammo regarding amendments to Industrial Lease	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Mississippi Power Company regarding conference call to discuss rate charges	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding amended DIP budget	0.50	B230	A107	237.50
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA, MDEQ, Committee and DIP lender regarding extension of challenge period	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with	0.30	B230	A107	142.50

		counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of time for Debtors to respond to adversary proceeding filed by Lenders				
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of time for Debtors to respond to adversary proceeding filed by Lenders	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding motion to authorize tolling agreement and extension of time for Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding agreed order to extend time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with MDEQ and Michael Caples regarding update of status at facility	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt re fee app	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with BMC re mailing of fee application and notice	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Add additional users and documents to Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Prepare, finalize 21 Day Notice for First	1.10	B110	A111	176.00

		Application of Butler Snow for Compensation, assemble exhibits and electronically file same with Court				
03/26/15	VGJ	Finalize Butler Snow Fee Application, assemble exhibits and electronically file same with Court	1.20	B110	A111	192.00
03/26/15	VGJ	Finalize Motion for Agreed Order re Supplemental Tolling Agreement, Proposed Agreed Order and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/27/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding amendment to Trammo lease and related review of provisions of lease	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/27/15	CHM	Review/revise Trammo letter agreement	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/27/15	CHM	Review/analyze drafts of DIP loan term sheet	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/27/15	CHM	Review/analyze claims report prepared by BMC.	0.40	B310	A104	144.00
03/27/15	CHM	Review/analyze status of responses to DOJ/EPA subpoena and production of documents	0.60	L300	A104	216.00
03/27/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding Trammo letter agreement	0.50	B210	A106	180.00
03/27/15	CHM	Correspondence among management regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/27/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with DOJ/EPA, MDEQ and management	0.80	B110	A107	288.00
03/27/15	CHM	Telephone conference	0.20	B230	A107	72.00

		with counsel to DIP lenders regarding notice of additional borrowing				
03/27/15	CHM	Telephone conference with Ken Long regarding document production and review	0.40	L300	A107	144.00
03/27/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to the committee and the committee members regarding case status and next steps	0.50	B150	A108	180.00
03/27/15	DBC	Conference call Steve Rosenblatt, Chris Maddux, Robert Kerley, Jon Nash regarding Trammo Lease LOI revisions; further review of LOI.	1.20	B250	A104	594.00
03/27/15	JMC	Prepare document review protocol description for DOJ request to review the Debtors' hard documents from Pascagoula facility.	2.10	L300	A103	399.00
03/27/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux in connection with expenses associated with review and production of hard documents of Debtors.	0.40	L300	A105	76.00
03/27/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Steve Rosenblatt, Chris Maddux, Ken Long and other DOJ officials in connection with the DOJ's request to review the Debtors' hard documents.	0.60	L300	A108	114.00
03/27/15	MDC	Weekly call with DOJ and EPA to discuss status of facility	0.80	P230	A108	288.00

03/27/15	MDC	Update of Firmex data room for MDEQ.	2.60	P230	A110	936.00
03/27/15	SWR	Prepare corrected order granting motion to authorize execution of supplemental tolling agreement	0.20	B110	A103	95.00
03/27/15	SWR	Prepare supplemental affidavit for Jon Nash regarding Joe Rice retention	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Work on revisions to letter to Trammo and Mississippi Ammonia Leasing regarding interim lease terms	0.80	B210	A103	380.00
03/27/15	SWR	Review provisions of Industrial Lease with Trammo regarding proposed changes	0.50	B185	A104	237.50
03/27/15	SWR	Review amended DIP budget and amended DIP term sheet	0.60	B230	A104	285.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding notice of extension of challenge period	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding items to consider and proposed changes to letter agreement regarding amendment of Industrial Lease with Mississippi Ammonia Leasing, LLC	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington and Chris Maddux regarding protocol for production of hard copies of documents pursuant to subpoena taken from Debtors' headquarters	0.30	L320	A105	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding	0.30	B110	A106	142.50

		cost benefit of production of documents in Coast office				
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding notice of extension of challenge period	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding supplemental affidavit for Joe Rice retention application	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with CRO and management and Butler Snow team regarding discussion of terms of amended lease and proposed letter agreement	0.90	B210	A106	427.50
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and CRO regarding entry of order authorizing execution of supplemental tolling agreement	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Roy Furrh regarding retention of outside counsel for MDEQ	0.10	B110	A107	47.50
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Bess Creswell regarding noticing of pleadings and related matters	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Prepare for and conference call with counsel for Committee, financial advisors for Committee, Committee members and Debtors' CRO regarding status of case and course of action	0.70	B110	A107	332.50
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference	0.30	B130	A107	142.50

		and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status report on sales process				
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Ron McAlpin regarding supplemental affidavit for Joe Rice retention	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Slate Dabney regarding supplemental affidavit for Joe Rice and BP claim	0.40	B160	A107	190.00
03/27/15	SWR	Weekly conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ and CRO regarding status report on environmental matters and status of case	0.60	B210	A107	285.00
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for Committee and CRO regarding DIP budget and additional advance request and procedures	0.60	B230	A107	285.00
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding additional advance under DIP budget and course of action	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
03/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Ken Long and Lisa Cherub regarding protocol and scope of production of documents pursuant to subpoena from Debtors' headquarters	0.30	L320	A107	142.50
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Wanda Watson regarding corrected exhibit to order	0.10	B110	A108	47.50

		authorizing execution of tolling agreement				
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Wanda Watson regarding corrected order and exhibits regarding Motley Rice retention	0.10	B160	A108	47.50
03/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Christy Cannette regarding order on Motley Rice retention	0.20	B160	A108	95.00
03/27/15	TMH	Review multiple BMC amendments to creditor matrix	3.60	B110	A104	666.00
03/27/15	VGJ	Conference with S. Rosenblatt, C. Maddux and M. Carrington re documents produced to USDOJ	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/27/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Extension of Challenge Period and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/28/15	GCV	Review e-mail correspondence between Vanguard and Robert Kerley re: 401(k) termination matters; e- mail correspondence re: escheat of payments of accounts.	0.30	B220	A106	105.00
03/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding filing of notice of additional DIP borrowing	0.30	B230	A105	142.50
03/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding current approved DIP budget	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding notice of additional DIP Borrowing and term sheet	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
03/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference	0.30	B230	A106	142.50

		and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding DIP budget				
03/30/15	CHM	Review memorandum from Gallagher regarding discussions with D&O carrier	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/30/15	CHM	Review correspondence with various constituencies regarding additional DIP borrowing	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/30/15	CHM	Review correspondence with DIP lenders regarding notice of additional borrowing	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/30/15	CHM	Review/analyze updated cash flow and related correspondence	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/30/15	CHM	Review correspondence with counsel to du Pont regarding order continuing hearing on 9019 motion	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/30/15	CHM	Review/analyze comprehensive claim report prepared by BMC and related correspondence	0.40	B310	A104	144.00
03/30/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Mississippi Power rates	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
03/30/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding corporate matters	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
03/30/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding expenditures under revised cash flow projection	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/30/15	CHM	Telephone conferences with management regarding cash flow projections and related assumptions	0.70	B230	A106	252.00
03/30/15	CHM	Telephone conferences	0.60	B230	A107	216.00

		with counsel to DIP lenders regarding updated cash flow projections				
03/30/15	CHM	Work on cash flow projections and review related assumptions and disbursements	1.10	B230	A111	396.00
03/30/15	JBT	Review Delaware bankruptcy court order regarding Exide agreement with DOJ.	0.50	L140	A104	237.50
03/30/15	JMC	Work on document review protocol description for review and production of the Debtors' hard documents to DOJ.	0.50	L300	A103	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Revise proposed order to reflect agreement by DuPont	0.10	B110	A103	47.50
03/30/15	SWR	Revise notice of additional borrowing under DIP budget	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Review BMC Claims report - scheduled and filed claims	0.40	B310	A104	190.00
03/30/15	SWR	Review BMC- prepared claims register by creditor and by claim number	0.40	B310	A104	190.00
03/30/15	SWR	Review structure of dealing with environmental claims in chapter 11 plan and disclosure statement	0.90	B320	A104	427.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding possible agreement with DOJ.	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding filing of notice of additional borrowing under interim DIP budget	0.20	B230	A105	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples regarding	0.20	B230	A105	95.00

		DIP budget and trust fund obligations				
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding DuPont claim and request for conference call with CRO	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding adequate protection payment to Mississippi Power Company	0.20	B140	A106	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding supplemental affidavit for Motley Rice	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding billing rate issue with Mississippi Power Company	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding DIP budget	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with CRO and management regarding trust fund payment to MDEQ	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont regarding conference call to discuss status of case	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont regarding agreement to order extending time for Government to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ and Committee regarding insurance	0.30	B120	A107	142.50

		policies for MPC				
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding LEDES files, budgets and staffing plans for the First Fee Application	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding duplicate filing of fee application and timetable for Capstone amended application	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Craig Geno regarding order granting application to employ and need to submit stipulation	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding amended employment application for Motley Rice	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding maintaining status quo while adequate protection payment issue and billing rate issue is resolved.	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
03/30/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding DIP budget	0.60	B230	A107	285.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding trust fund payment to MDEQ	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding confirmation of terms for additional borrowing under DIP budget	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ and Committee	0.30	B230	A107	142.50

		regarding notice of additional borrowing under amended DIP budget				
03/30/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Wanda Watson regarding request to resubmit order on Rule 9019 motion extension for Governments	0.20	B110	A108	95.00
03/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding insurance policies for MPC and claims period under six-year tail policy	0.40	B120	A108	190.00
03/30/15	TMH	Correspondence with B. Daniel regarding claims objections and spreadsheet	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with S. Rosenblatt re Term Sheet and Budget from Lenders	0.10	B110	A105	16.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Several emails with B. Daniel with BMC re quarterly filing of claims report with Court	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar response deadline dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Finalize Affidavit of Service of BMC of Notice of Butler Snow Fee App and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Prepare and finalize a Notice of Change of Address for Creditor (Baker Tanks) and electronically file same with Court	0.40	B110	A111	64.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Receipt of Returned Mail	0.20	B110	A111	32.00

		to Debtor from Case Administrator and search for new address for same				
03/30/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Additional Borrowing Under Interim DIP Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/30/15	VGJ	Review of Lists of parties to add to court matrix via filed claims through BMC	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/31/15	CHM	Review research regarding legal strategy	0.60	B110	A104	216.00
03/31/15	CHM	Review draft of proposed agreed order regarding resolution of cure objection	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/31/15	CHM	Review correspondence from/to DOJ/FCC regarding proposed language for inclusion in sale order	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
03/31/15	CHM	Review correspondence with committee counsel regarding D&O insurance policies	0.20	B150	A104	72.00
03/31/15	CHM	Review/analyze pleadings and documents in connection with analysis of asserted 503(b)(9) claims	0.70	B310	A104	252.00
03/31/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in internal conference regarding legal strategy	0.70	B110	A105	252.00
03/31/15	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to du Pont regarding status of pending matters in case and next steps	0.30	B110	A107	108.00
03/31/15	JBT	Review the Exide agreement with DOJ.	0.70	L140	A104	332.50
03/31/15	JMC	Review and analyze motion to lift automatic	2.90	B140	A103	551.00

		stay and abandonment filed by Caterpillar Financial Corporation and documents attached to same and work on agreed order to resolve same.				
03/31/15	JMC	Review correspondence from FCC to the Debtors in connection with certain band licenses.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
03/31/15	MDD	Telephone call from R. Kerley re Delaware annual franchise report	0.70	B240	A106	126.00
03/31/15	SWR	Work on budget and staffing plans for next quarter	1.50	L150	A101	712.50
03/31/15	SWR	Research Communications Act of 1934 and applicable Code of Federal Regulations regarding FCC wireless permits	0.90	B130	A102	427.50
03/31/15	SWR	Review and finalize agreed order resolving objection of Mississippi Ammonia Leasing, LLC regarding Cure Motion	0.30	B185	A103	142.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding terms of possible agreement with DOJ.	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/31/15	SWR	Conference with Butler Snow team regarding status report on bankruptcy case	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marcie Davant regarding annual reports for Debtors with Mississippi Secretary of State	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding annual reports for Debtors for Mississippi	0.20	B110	A106	95.00

		Secretary of State				
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding conference call next week with counsel for DuPont	0.10	B110	A106	47.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding inquiry from FCC and course of action regarding sales process	0.40	B130	A106	190.00
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Brock Services regarding proposed letter agreement, cure amount, and course of action	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont regarding conference call to discuss status of case	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Chubb D&O tail policy	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Lloyd Randolph of DOJ regarding language in sale order requested by Federal Communications Commission	0.50	B130	A107	237.50
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding correspondence regarding tail insurance policy	0.10	B120	A108	47.50
03/31/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Sunny Cheung regarding update on sales prospects	0.40	B130	A108	190.00
03/31/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding amended DIP budgets	0.30	B230	A108	142.50
03/31/15	TMH	Review NDA from Roy Abraham as a prospective bidder.	0.20	B110	A103	37.00
03/31/15	TMH	Review NDA from One	0.70	B110	A103	129.50