		compensation issues.				
05/21/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in call with Lenders' counsel, Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding settlement term sheet and proposed changes to same.	0.50	B130	A107	95.00
05/21/15	JOH	Continue work on analysis of insurance policies for insurance coverage re: fish kill.	4.20	L110	A104	840.00
05/21/15	MDC	Review of flow schematic prepared by De Jong for water balance questions; continue document search on water questions	3.20	P230	A104	1,152.00
05/21/15	SWR	Finalize revisions to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.50	B190	A103	237.50
05/21/15	SWR	Review response of United States Trustee to Debtors' motion for relief from certain UST chapter 11 operating guidelines	0.20	B210	A104	95.00
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding review of insurance policies	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker and Michael Caples regarding telephone conference with DOJ lawyers regarding investigation	0.30	B190	A105	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux and Mitch Carrington regarding proposed changes to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.50	B190	A105	237.50
05/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Michael Caples and	0.30	B210	A105	142.50

05/21/15	SWR	conference with Don Cannada regarding non- essential parcels Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding response of United States Trustee to Debtors' motion for relief from certain UST	0.30	B190	A106	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	chapter 11 operating guidelines  Correspondence and	0.30	B190	A106	142.50
		telephone conference with CRO regarding proposed Governments- Lenders Settlement Term Sheet with proposed clarifying revisions				
05/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding personal property rendition for ad valorem taxes	0.30	B240	A106	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding Trammo's responsibility for 2015 ad valorem taxes on inventory	0.30	B240	A106	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marshall Binford regarding EPA's sharing Mississippi Phosphates' engineering document with Corps of Engineers	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Motley Rice regarding request for back-up financial data to be submitted with the protective BP Claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Slate Dabney and Jon Nash regarding protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50

05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding additional time for United States Trustee to respond to ordinary course professionals motion	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding engagement letter for workers compensation insurance defense	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding proposed revisions to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, DIP Lenders, Committee, and PHI regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet with our proposed clarifying revisions	0.50	B190	A107	237.50
05/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Will Sugden regarding contact with Jon Nash regarding IOC contract	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Steinberger and Mitch Carrington regarding discussion of various workers compensation insurance matters and course of action	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding management services agreement between PHI and Mississippi Phosphates	0.30	B210	A107	142.50

05/21/1	5 TMH	Work on CRO certification to Trustmark for disbursement requests	1.30	B160	A103	240.50
05/21/1	5 TMH	Work on 503(b)(9) stipulation with Sulcom	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
05/21/1	5 TMH	Correspondence with J.  Nash regarding disbursement requests	0.20	B160	A106	37.00
05/21/1	5 VGJ	Email correspondence with BMC Group re updated Shortened Service List	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
05/21/1	5 VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/22/1	5 CHM	Review/analyze documents regarding ownership and status of title to parcels of real property	0.40	B120	A104	144.00
05/22/1	15 CHM	Review proposed revisions to letter agreement with Trammo regarding lease modification	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
05/22/1	5 CHM	Review status of environmental key performance indicators	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
05/22/1	15 CHM	Review multiple e-mail correspondence regarding analysis of environmental insurance policies and applicability of same to events	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
05/22/1	15 CHM	Review pleadings, documents and prior correspondence in connection with hearing on motion to cancel property and casualty insurance	0.60	B210	A104	216.00
05/22/1	5 CHM	Review memorandum from bank regarding deposit account control agreement	0.20	B210	A104	72.00

05/22/15	СНМ	Review/analyze current draft of settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.70	B230	A104	252.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Review financing documents regarding lenders purchase of Trammo loan	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from agent to Jackson County tax collector regarding collection of unpaid ad valorem taxes	0.20	B240	A104	72.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Analyze draft term sheet describing exit options and related issues raised by same	0.90	B320	A104	324.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding lien priorities with respect to cash on hand	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding status of Trammo lease modification	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding cash flow budget and related expenditures	0.30	B230	A106	108.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding correspondence from agent to Jackson County tax collector regarding collection of unpaid ad valorem taxes	0.20	B240	A106	72.00
05/22/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly status call with DOJ, EPA and MDEQ	0.80	B110	A107	288.00
05/22/15	DBC	Conference Steve Rosenblatt re: land donation to United States	0.20	B120	A105	99.00
05/22/15	DBC	Conference Steve	0.30	B120	A105	148.50

		Rosenblatt and emails Robert Kerley re: deposit account control agreement with Wells Fargo for Transammonia				
05/22/15	DBC	Email Robert Kerley assignment to Wells Fargo of same	0.20	B120	A106	99.00
05/22/15	DBC	Emails re: affidavit re: master services agreement	0.40	B120	A107	198.00
05/22/15	DBC	Telephone conference Tim Cantrell re: same	0.30	B120	A108	148.50
05/22/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising plan term sheet of the Debtors in connection with most recent changes to distribution and trust structures.	0.70	B320	A103	133.00
05/22/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with EPA, MDEQ and Butler Snow team regarding certain environmental issues.	1.30	B110	A107	247.00
05/22/15	JOH	Continue work on insurance coverage analysis.	2.90	L110	A104	580.00
05/22/15	LSH	Conference call with EPA, MDEQ, DOJ regarding water level in remediation ponds at MS Phosphates facility.	0.90	R404	A108	85.50
05/22/15	MDC	Review of land which could be used as settlement for DOJ criminal complaint	0.60	P230	A104	216.00
05/22/15	MDC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with EPA and DOJ on status of facility	1.10	P230	A107	396.00
05/22/15	MDC	Call with De Jong on water balance questions	1.00	P230	A108	360.00

05/22/15	SWR	Review environmental KPIs for current week	0.10	B210	A104	47.50
05/22/15	SWR	Review of map of the Grand Bay NERR Property	0.20	B210	A104	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide and Michael Caples regarding dates of key events	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Follow-up with Butler Snow team on environmental matters	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Don Cannada regarding management services agreement between Mississippi Phosphates and PHI	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Don Cannada regarding security interest in bank accounts of Mississippi Phosphates	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding report on telephone conferences with DOJ	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with CRO regarding review of information for BP claim	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding demand letter from Mississippi Court Collections, Inc. regarding property taxes owed	0.30	B140	A106	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding letter agreement with Trammo regarding	0.30	B210	A106	142.50

		terminalling operations				
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding banking account changes at Mississippi Phosphates	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO hearing on motion to cancel property and casualty insurance and need for witness	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding map of the Grand Bay NERR property and course of action	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding First Amendment to Industrial Lease with Trammo subsidiary	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/22/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ	0.90	B110	A107	427.50
05/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding filing of protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/22/15	ТМН	Research FCC's OMD for process to return of fees paid to FCC for assignment of licenses	0.80	B110	A102	148.00
05/22/15	ТМН	Work on 503(b)(9) stipulation with AL Electric	1.20	B310	A103	222.00
05/22/15	ТМН	Correspondence with FCC regarding return of fees for transfer of licenses	0.10	B110	A108	18.50
05/22/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order Setting Post-Trial Briefing Schedule and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00

05/22/15	VGJ	Prepare updated Shortened Service List with Notice of same and electronically file same with Court	0.60	B110	A111	96.00
05/24/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of updated settlement term sheet among the Debtors, the Lenders and the Governments in connection with the preparation of the plan of liquidation of the Debtors.	0.50	B320	A104	95.00
05/25/15	DBC	Emails Steve Rosenblatt and Slate Dabney re: master services agreement and research re: same.	0.50	B110	A108	247.50
05/25/15	SWR	Work on EPA issues for sales process and operations	0.30	B130	A104	142.50
05/25/15	SWR	Work on dispute of Mississippi Phosphates with DOJ and possible resolutions to same	0.30	B190	A104	142.50
05/25/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Don Cannada regarding additional corporate information needed for protective BP claim	0.40	B120	A105	190.00
05/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding application to employ Horne under sections 327 and 328	0.20	B160	A105	95.00
05/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding power of attorney for filing protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
05/25/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding	0.40	B120	A107	190.00

		l				
		update on protective BP claim				
05/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Motley Rice and Slate Dabney regarding conference call to discuss additional information needed for protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding report on sales process regarding HC2/Cevital	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review CRO certifications for disbursement of funds	0.20	B110	A104	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with Gallagher regarding orders entered with respect to pending workers compensation claims and related review of orders	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review draft of protective BP claim, supporting documentation and related, prior correspondence concerning same	1.20	B110	A104	432.00
05/26/15	CHM	Review/analyze status of pending matters in chapter 11 cases and development of legal strategy with respect to same	0.70	B110	A104	252.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review workers compensation invoices and payments for 2015	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review current draft of settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review status of disbursements to committee professionals	0.30	B230	A104	108.00

05/26/15	CHM	escrow account	0.40	D260	A 104	144.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review current and prior composition of boards of directors and list of officers for the debtor	0.40	B260	A104	144.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Review stipulation with TMC regarding 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Office conference with M. Caples regarding status of discussions with prospective purchasers	0.30	B130	A105	108.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding sales process and status of discussions with prospective bidders	0.20	B130	A106	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding Horne retention application	0.20	B160	A106	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with committee counsel regarding upcoming hearing and status of settlement discussions	0.20	B110	A107	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding status of disbursements to committee professionals escrow account	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the lenders regarding settlement agreement between the lenders and the governments	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the governments, the lenders, PHI and the committee regarding status of 9019 motion	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/26/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding	0.30	B130	A108	108.00

		sales process and discussions with potential parties				
05/26/15	CHM	Correspondence from Gallagher regarding pending workers compensation and general liability claims	0.20	B310	A108	72.00
05/26/15	DBC	Research Butler Snow files re Management Services Agreement background and history	0.70	B120	A102	346.50
05/26/15	DBC	E-mails Slate Dabney et al. re same	0.30	B120	A107	148.50
05/26/15	DBC	Conference call Steve Rosenblatt, Slate Dabney, Joe Rice et al. re Management Services Agreement and affidavit in connection with protected BP filing	0.80	B120	A107	396.00
05/26/15	DBC	E-mails re same and officers and directors during relevant period.	0.40	B120	A107	198.00
05/26/15	DBC	Telephone conferences Tim Cantrell re same and affidavit	0.50	B120	A108	247.50
05/26/15	MDD	Update list of officers and directors	0.60	B260	A102	108.00
05/26/15	SWR	Work on and revise Horne retention application and affidavit	0.90	B160	A103	427.50
05/26/15	SWR	Review Wellness in light of issues before bankruptcy court	0.30	B110	A104	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Reviewed list of officers and directors of Mississippi Phosphates and PHI received from Velvet Johnson and Marcie Davant	0.30	B120	A104	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Review workers compensation insurance claims and payment	0.40	B210	A104	190.00

		information received from Gallagher				
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding representation of former management team members in bankruptcy case	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding Horne retention application and accompanying affidavit	0.30	B160	A105	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington and Chris Maddux regarding workers compensation insurance claim information	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Work on issues to be discussed with CRO in tomorrow's call	0.50	B110	A106	237.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding developments in bankruptcy case	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Robert Kerley regarding retention of Horne as 401(k) auditor	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chief Financial Officer regarding Governments- Lenders settlement term sheet	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet and course of action	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Joe Rice regarding correspondence with claims facility regarding administrative procedures	0.20	B120	A107	95.00

05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Joe Rice regarding additional information for affidavit in support of protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status of filing protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Prepare for and participate in extended conference call with Motley Rice team, Slate Dabney, and Don Cannada regarding background information and material for affidavit in connection with protective BP claim	0.80	B120	A107	380.00
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding back-up documentation for protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee status report on bankruptcy case and Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, Lenders, Committee, and PHI regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet, timetable and course of action	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding NRD issue and Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B130	A108	95.00

		Sandler O'Neill regarding discussions with state or local economic development offices				
05/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung and Michael Caples regarding HC2/Cevital visit to Pascagoula facility	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
05/26/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Gallagher of Gallagher regarding questions regarding handling of motion for relief from automatic stay on workers compensation claims	0.40	B140	A108	190.00
05/26/15	ТМН	Research escrow account of Committee professionals for amounts paid in and disbursed since April 2015	0.20	B160	A102	37.00
05/26/15	TMH	Draft disbursement request for professional fees for April 2015	1.10	B160	A103	203.50
05/26/15	ТМН	Work on Horne employment application under Sections 327 and 328	2.80	B160	A103	518.00
05/26/15	ТМН	Work on Agreed Order for Cure Amounts with AL Electric	0.20	B170	A103	37.00
05/26/15	ТМН	Correspondence regarding Agreed Order for Cure Amounts with AL Electric	0.20	B170	A107	37.00
05/26/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with D. Cannada re PNC Loan documents	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
05/26/15	VGJ	Review documents in Data Room re PNC Loans	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
05/26/15	VGJ	Receipt of Notice of Undeliverable Mail to	0.30	B110	A111	48.00

		Debtor from Court, search for new addresses				
05/27/15	CHM	Review correspondence with management regarding wastewater treatment protocol and safeguards	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Review/analyze memorandum to lenders' counsel regarding discussions with DOJ and related consideration of property ownership map	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Review/analyze list of officers and directors for the debtors from 2005 through present	0.30	B260	A104	108.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding open/pending items in chapter 11 cases	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding open/pending items in chapter 11 cases	0.80	B110	A106	288.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding funding of professional fees for committee professionals	0.20	B110	A107	72.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the debtors regarding submission of protective BP claim	0.20	B110	A107	72.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the governments regarding settlement term sheet	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the lenders regarding ad valorem taxes and related valuations	0.40	B240	A107	144.00
05/27/15	CHM	Correspondence with	0.20	B310	A107	72.00

		ordinary course counsel regarding defense of pending workers compensation claims				
05/27/15	CHM	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding workers compensation and general liability policies	0.30	B210	A108	108.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with Gallagher and Dan summa regarding workers compensation and general liability policies	0.70	B210	A108	252.00
05/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding options with respect to casualty insurance coverage	0.20	B210	A108	72.00
05/27/15	DBC	Review MPC/PNC loan files with respect to management services agreement.	0.40	B120	A104	198.00
05/27/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Dan Summa and Gallagher regarding certain workers' compensation issues.	1.00	B140	A108	190.00
05/27/15	JOH	Continue work on insurance coverage analysis.	0.60	L110	A104	120.00
05/27/15	MDD	Work on director and officer listing	0.20	B260	A105	36.00
05/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding issues to be discussed in conference call with CRO	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding insurance coverage issues	0.20	B120	A105	95.00

05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson and John Dollarhide regarding additional insurance policies to review	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marcie Davant regarding list of officers and directors for MPC and PHI for protective BP claim	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding tax information on NERR property	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Conference with Michael Caples regarding contingency plan for wastewater treatment in event of a catastrophic loss at facility	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Extended telephone conference with CRO regarding status report on various matters and course of action	0.90	B110	A106	427.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding contingency plans and anticipated costs for wastewater treatment in event of a catastrophic loss at facility	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding insurance alternatives	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding 401(k) audit	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet and timing issues	0.30	B110	A107	142.50

05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Joe Rice and Slate Dabney regarding authorization to file protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Thornton of Motley Rice regarding power of attorney for protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding request for release of lien on NERR property	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding insurance alternatives	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding ad valorem tax information on NERR property	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marshall Binford of EPA and Michael Caples regarding water issues	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding retention of lawyers or others to challenge ad valorem tax assessments	0.50	B210	A107	237.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Joe Rice regarding officers and directors of PHI and MPC during applicable time period	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding challenge to ad valorem tax assessments	0.50	B240	A107	237.50
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B310	A107	142.50

		Karl Steinberger regarding workers compensation insurance claims and related matters				
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Horne regarding retention as professional under sections 327 and 328	0.20	B160	A108	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with potential candidates to challenge ad valorem tax assessed values	0.40	B210	A108	190.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding availability and pricing (if available) of insurance alternatives	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
05/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with Gallagher regarding workers compensation insurance issues regarding automatic stays, application of SIR and reserve funds and course of action on various cases	0.70	B210	A108	332.50
05/27/15	TMH	Work on Horne Affidavit for Application	0.90	B160	A103	166.50
05/27/15	TMH	Correspondence with J. Nash regarding escrow account requests	0.30	B160	A106	55.50
05/27/15	ТМН	Prepare PDF documents of disbursement requests for correspondence with J. Nash regarding escrow account requests	0.30	B160	A106	55.50
05/27/15	TMH	Correspondence with Trustmark regarding disbursement requests	0.50	B160	A108	92.50
05/27/15	VGJ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt re ad valorem taxes owed on certain parcels	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
05/27/15	VGJ	Add additional	0.50	B110	A110	80.00

		documents in the Data Room				
05/27/15	VGJ	Retrieve Pollution Liability and Crime Policies for J. Dollarhide and S. Rosenblatt	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
05/27/15	VGJ	Review of aerial map of parcels and retrieve ad valorem taxes owed for same	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
05/27/15	VGJ	Continue working on list of Directors and Officers for MPC and PHI from 2005 - 2009	1.20	B110	A111	192.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Review/revise cover letter related to protective BP claim	0.60	B110	A103	216.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Revise proposed affidavit prepared in connection with protective BP claim	0.40	B110	A103	144.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Drafting work in connection with preparation of second notice of additional borrowing under interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A103	108.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Review directors and officers chart for the debtors for attachment to affidavit prepared in connection with protective BP claim	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with Motley Rice firm regarding information needed to complete protective BP claim	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/28/15	CHM	Review draft of Trammo lease modification	0.50	B210	A104	180.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft of fourth amended DIP financing term sheet	0.50	B230	A104	180.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Review/analyze prior DIP extension orders	0.30	B230	A104	108.00

05/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/28/15	СНМ	operational matters Correspondence with management regarding	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Trammo lease modification Correspondence with	0.40	B230	A106	144.00
		management regarding notice of additional borrowing and forecasted funding needs				
05/28/15	СНМ	Telephone conferences (x2) with management regarding funding needs and cash flow budget	0.70	B230	A106	252.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to former employees	0.20	B150	A107	72.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding executory contracts and Trammo lease modification	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/28/15	СНМ	Telephone conferences (x3) with counsel to DIP lenders regarding funding of scheduled draws and notice of additional borrowing	0.80	B230	A107	288.00
05/28/15	DBC	Review BP protection file and cover letter	0.60	B120	A104	297.00
05/28/15	DBC	E-mail comments regarding same to Joe Rice, Slate Dabney, Steve Rosenblatt and working group	0.30	B120	A104	148.50
05/28/15	DBC	Further e-mails regarding protective cover letter and affidavits	0.30	B120	A104	148.50
05/28/15	DBC	Begin review of revised Trammo lease amendment and final letter of intent	0.40	B120	A104	198.00
05/28/15	JMC	Work on correspondence	1.30	B110	A103	247.00

		with MS Court Collections regarding potential automatic stay collection and other				
05/28/15	JMC	related matters.  Work on review and analysis of MS Court Collections correspondence and final notice.	0.20	B110	A104	38.00
05/28/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of plan provisions in connection with the preparation of the liquidation plan of the Debtors.	1.10	B320	A104	209.00
05/28/15	JOH	Continue review of insurance policies for potential coverage.	1.60	L110	A104	320.00
05/28/15	MDC	Develop information for water balance call with EPA and DOJ for Monday June 1	5.10	P230	A104	1,836.00
05/28/15	SWR	Work on revisions to affidavit in support of protective BP claim	0.80	B120	A103	380.00
05/28/15	SWR	Work on First Amendment to Industrial Lease with Trammo subsidiary	2.90	B185	A103	1,377.50
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with John Dollarhide regarding insurance issues	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding directors and officers chart	0.30	B120	A105	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding affidavit on corporate matters	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding	0.20	B190	A105	95.00

		status report on discussions with DOJ				
05/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding Trammo lease amendment	0.30	B185	A106	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with CRO and management regarding identification of executory contracts and cure costs to run the Trammo terminalling operations, maintain facility and the gyp stacks and water treatment	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding Mississippi Phosphates land	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Multiple correspondence with Joe Rice and Slate Dabney regarding protective BP claim	0.50	B120	A107	237.50
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding release of lien on NERR land	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status update on Trammo lease amendment and executory contracts and cure costs to run the Trammo terminalling operations, maintain facility and the gyp stacks and water treatment	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding notice of additional borrowings	0.30	B230	A107	142.50

05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with prospective tax assessment candidates regarding additional information	0.40	B240	A107	190.00
05/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher and Robert Kerley regarding insurance issues	0.30	B210	A108	142.50
05/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference with John Lammert regarding background information on property tax assessments	0.50	B240	A108	237.50
05/28/15	ТМН	Work on 9019 motion for governments	0.70	B110	A103	129.50
05/28/15	ТМН	Draft motion to extend DIP Order	0.80	B230	A103	148.00
05/28/15	TMH	Work on Notice of Additional Borrowing under Interim DIP Order	1.10	B230	A103	203.50
05/28/15	ТМН	Draft order for motion to extend DIP Order	0.90	B230	A103	166.50
05/28/15	ТМН	Work on motion to expedite DIP extension motion	0.90	B230	A103	166.50
05/28/15	TMH	Work on order for motion to expedite motion for DIP Extension	0.70	B230	A103	129.50
05/28/15	TMH	Work on stipulation with AL Electric	0.30	B310	A103	55.50
05/28/15	ТМН	Correspondence with AL Electric counsel regarding stipulation	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/28/15	TMH	Correspondence with MS DOR regarding claims	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
05/28/15	VGJ	Draft Affidavit of Stephen W. Rosenblatt re authenticity of Directors/Officers Chart of MPC and PHI	0.50	B110	A103	80.00
05/28/15	VGJ	Continue to work on Directors and Officers Chart for MPC and PHI	1.00	B110	A103	160.00

05/28/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/00/15		and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	D110		40.00
05/28/15	VGJ	Add additional users to Data Room	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
05/28/15	VGJ	Finalize Second Notice of Additional Borrowing Under the Interim DIP Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Review/revise affidavits and other documents for submission with protective BP claim	1.70	B110	A104	612.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Correspondence from Sunny Cheung regarding update on sales process	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Review statement of interest from potential bidder in sales process	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Review/analyze motion to determine cure amounts, order granting same and status of objections filed with respect to same	0.50	B185	A104	180.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Review proofs of claim filed by Mississippi Department of Revenue	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding settlement term sheet between the lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A106	108.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with management regarding proof of claim filed by Mississippi Department of Revenue	0.20	B310	A106	72.00
05/29/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly status conference call with DOJ, EPA and MDEQ	0.90	B110	A107	324.00

_							
	05/29/15	СНМ	Correspondence with lenders' counsel regarding discussions with DOJ with respect to environmental issues	0.20	B310	A107	72.00
	05/29/15	DBC	Emails with Steve Rosenblatt, Mitch Carrington, Slate Dabney and Joe Rice regarding Butler Snow/Don Cannada affidavit	0.50	B120	A103	247.50
	05/29/15	DBC	Revisions to Butler Snow affidavit, finalize, execute and deliver same	0.50	B120	A103	247.50
	05/29/15	DBC	Review Tim Cantrell affidavit and telephone conferences with Tim Cantrell regarding same	0.50	B120	A103	247.50
	05/29/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising certain ancillary documents in connection with the submission of the Debtors' protective BP claim.	1.80	B210	A103	342.00
	05/29/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding protective BP claim and other related issues.	0.20	B210	A105	38.00
	05/29/15	SWR	Work on supporting documents for BP claim at request of Motley Rice	1.60	B120	A103	760.00
	05/29/15	SWR	Work on revisions to affidavit of Tim Cantrell for protective BP claim	0.90	B120	A103	427.50
	05/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding affidavit for protective BP claim	0.40	B120	A105	190.00
	05/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding additional information regarding NERR property	0.30	B190	A105	142.50

05/	/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding insurance program	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/	/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding cure amounts for ammonia terminalling operations and wastewater treatment	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
05/	/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding operational expenses for wastewater treatment	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/	/29/15	SWR	Prepare for and conference call counsel for EPA and MDEQ, and CRO and Butler Snow team regarding environmental issues and status report on developments in case	1.10	B110	A107	522.50
05/	/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal and Robert Kerley regarding status report on declaration of accounts closings	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/	/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Marc Solomon regarding status report regarding developments in case	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
05/	/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding report on status of Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet at Thursday's hearing	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/	/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Motley Rice regarding information for protective BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/	/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B185	A107	142.50

		counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding cure order and cure amounts				
05/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding additional information about Grand Bay NERR property	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding information concerning cure amounts for ammonia terminalling operations	0.40	B210	A107	190.00
05/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher and Robert Kerley regarding update on insurance	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
05/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding update on sales process	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
05/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with FCC and Thomas Hewitt regarding resubmission of application for assignment of licenses	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
05/29/15	SWR	Finalize and file Rule 2014 statement for Heidelberg, Steinberger firm	0.20	B160	A110	95.00
05/29/15	TMH	Research OMD materials to return FCC fees	0.40	B110	A102	74.00
05/29/15	ТМН	Work on FCC application to address issues raised by FCC with its Notice of Return	1.90	B110	A103	351.50
05/29/15	ТМН	Correspondence with FCC help line to work on FCC application to address issues raised by FCC with its Notice of Return	0.20	B110	A103	37.00
05/29/15	TMH	Correspondence with J. Tobias of the FCC to	0.10	B110	A103	18.50

		work on FCC application to address issues raised by FCC with its Notice of Return				
05/29/15	ТМН	Work on order for motion to expedite motion for DIP Extension	0.50	B230	A103	92.50
05/29/15	ТМН	Work on motion to expedite DIP extension motion	0.50	B230	A103	92.50
05/29/15	TMH	Work on order for motion to extend DIP Order	0.50	B230	A103	92.50
05/29/15	TMH	Work on motion to extend DIP Order	0.50	B230	A103	92.50
05/29/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding MS DOR findings	0.70	B310	A106	129.50
05/29/15	TMH	Correspondence with T. Hawkins of MDOR regarding claims	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
05/30/15	GCV	Review file and email correspondence to Robert Kerley re: 401(k) matters to be completed before audit can be performed.	0.40	B220	A104	140.00
05/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding motion to assume and assign Industrial Lease (as amended)	0.30	B185	A105	142.50
05/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal and Robert Kerley regarding report on status or closing of pre-petition bank accounts	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding vendor list and cure amounts	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/30/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding FCC issues	0.10	B110	A106	18.50
05/31/15	DBC	Review and revise Tim	0.50	B120	A103	247.50