Exhibit "A-1"

Invoice for March 1-31, 2015



Post Office Box 6010 Ridgeland, MS 39158-6010 Main (601) 948-5711 Fax (601) 985-4500

Robert Kerley Mississippi Phosphates Corporation P.O. Box 848 Pascagoula, MS 39568-0848 May 5, 2015 Statement: 10069637 Matter: 027376.149010

Billing Attorney: Steve Rosenblatt

Due Date: May 20, 2015

STATEMENT SUMMARY

For Services Rendered Through March 31, 2015

Client: Mississippi Phosphates Corporation

Matter: Chapter 11 for Mississippi Phosphates Corporation and Subsidiaries

TOTAL FEES FOR CURRENT BILLING PERIOD	\$192,355.50
TOTAL COSTS FOR CURRENT BILLING PERIOD	\$1,215.37
TOTAL CURRENT BILLING FOR THIS MATTER	\$193,570.87
Total of Unpaid Balances From Prior Statements*	\$223,505.24
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER	\$417,076.11



Post Office Box 6010 Ridgeland, MS 39158-6010 Main (601) 948-5711 Fax (601) 985-4500

Robert Kerley Mississippi Phosphates Corporation P.O. Box 848 Pascagoula, MS 39568-0848 May 5, 2015 Statement: 10069637 Matter: 027376.149010

Billing Attorney: Steve Rosenblatt

Due Date: May 20, 2015

STATEMENT

For Services Rendered Through March 31, 2015

Client: Mississippi Phosphates Corporation

Matter: Chapter 11 for Mississippi Phosphates Corporation and Subsidiaries

PROFESSIONAL FEES

<u>DATE</u> 03/01/15	СНМ	DESCRIPTION Prepare for and participate in internal conference regarding legal strategy, sales process and environmental issues	HOURS 1.80	TASK B130	ACTIVITY A105	<u>AMOUNT</u> 648.00
03/01/15	JBT	Communications with Steve Rosenblatt, Jeremy Korzenik regarding conference call arrangements to discuss DOJ/EPA mattters.	0.50	L120	A107	237.50
03/01/15	MDC	Prepare and participate in meeting with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux to discuss environmental issues in connection with the sales process.	2.60	P230	A105	936.00
03/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker and Amanda Barbour regarding conference to discuss background facts	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/01/15	SWR	Conference with Butler Snow team regarding discussion of addressing environmental issues in connection with the sales	1.80	B130	A105	855.00

		nrococc				
03/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding call of James Tucker with Jeremy Korzenik regarding DOJ/EPA matters and rescheduling of board of directors conference call.	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/02/15	ABB	Review and analyze offer with M. Caples	0.40	B310	A104	136.00
03/02/15	ABB	Review and analyze offer with M. Caples.	0.40	B310	A104	136.00
03/02/15	ABB	Meet with S. Rosenblatt and C. Maddux re: update on MPC position.	0.50	L120	A105	170.00
03/02/15	ABB	Speak to MPC board members regarding offer	0.40	B260	A106	136.00
03/02/15	ABB	Speak to MPC board members regarding offer.	0.40	B260	A106	136.00
03/02/15	ABB	Speak with Government lawyers Korzenick and Cleveland re: possible settlement.	0.30	B310	A107	102.00
03/02/15	ABB	Speak with Government lawyers Korzenick and Cleveland re: possible settlement	0.30	B310	A107	102.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review/analyze recent correspondence regarding sales process, bid procedures and dates for sales process	0.80	B130	A104	288.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review memo and estimates regarding environmental issues	0.50	B210	A104	180.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review research memorandum regarding environmental issues	0.40	B210	A104	144.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft DIP budget	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review draft motion and correspondence with committee counsel	0.40	B310	A104	144.00

		regarding motion to establish procedures for 503(b)(9) claims				
03/02/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in internal meeting regarding sales process and environmental issues	0.80	B130	A105	288.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in telephonic meeting of MPC board of directors	0.60	B260	A106	216.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding DOJ letter	0.20	B310	A106	72.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to DIP lenders regarding DIP budget and financing needs	0.50	B230	A107	180.00
03/02/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with BMC regarding schedule D amendments	0.30	B110	A108	108.00
03/02/15	JBT	Conference with S. Rosenblatt, C. Maddux, M. Caples, and A. Barbour to discuss possible positions to take with Jeremy Korzenik in conference call; conference call with Jeremy Korzenik, Cleveland, A. Barbour and M. Caples regarding DOJ/EPA matters; conference call with S. Rosenblatt, et al and bankruptcy committee regarding DOJ/EPA matters.	1.50	L120	A107	712.50
03/02/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of treatment of certain claims and debts under the bankruptcy code.	2.60	B310	A104	494.00

03/02/15	MDC	Draft of cost estimates for environmental issues; phone call with DOJ regarding environmental issues and call with MPC to discuss call with DOJ.	8.60	P230	A103	3,096.00
03/02/15	SWR	Supplemental research on treatment and priority of environmental fines and penalties in chapter 11 case	0.70	B310	A102	332.50
03/02/15	SWR	Work on amended affidavit for Joe Rice for Motley Rice retention application	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/02/15	SWR	Review research memo on treatment of claims for fines and penalties in bankruptcy case	0.40	B300	A104	190.00
03/02/15	SWR	Conference with James Tucker, Amanda Barbour, Michael Caples and Chris Maddux regarding response to DOJ letter	0.40	B110	A105	190.00
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Michael Caples regarding estimated environmental costs for gypsum stack	0.40	B210	A105	190.00
03/02/15	SWR	Extended conference call with CRO and management and board of directors regarding DOJ letter	0.90	B110	A106	427.50
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding status of sales process and course of action	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
03/02/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Chief Financial Officer regarding loss control addenda for insurance policies	0.30	B210	A106	142.50

03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with management regarding cash forecast for Debtors	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding letter from DOJ	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding execution of escrow agreement for committee's professionals	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding amended affidavit by Joe Rice for Motley Rice retention	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding exceptions to application of United States Trustee larger case guidelines to Motley Rice retention	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding DIP budget and funding of escrow account for committee's professionals	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/02/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding funding under DIP budget and status of continued operations	0.50	B230	A107	237.50
03/02/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding update on sales process	0.30	B130	A108	142.50
03/02/15	ТМН	Correspondence with BMC regarding/in connection with schedules D and H.	0.60	B110	A108	111.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Revise portions of December 2014 and January 2015 monthly	0.60	B160	A103	216.00

03/03/15	СНМ	statements Review amended motion to lift stay filed by Jerry Scudder.	0.30	B140	A104	108.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to Cigna regarding insurance matters	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Review/analyze documents and file materials regarding environmental issues	1.80	B210	A104	648.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with committee counsel regarding 503(b)(9) claims	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding environmental issues	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
03/03/15	СНМ	Conference call with counsel to DIP lenders and PHI regarding sales process	0.40	B130	A107	144.00
03/03/15	DBC	Conference with Chris Maddux and Steve Rosenblatt regarding DOJ/EPA correspondence with respect to environmental matter and research files regarding same.	0.60	B190	A105	297.00
03/03/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of amended motion to lift the automatic stay filed by Jerry Scudder.	0.30	B140	A104	57.00
03/03/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain correspondence from the Department of Justice.	0.30	B190	A104	57.00
03/03/15	JMC	Correspondence regarding certain CIGNA insurance policies.	0.10	B410	A104	19.00
03/03/15	MDC	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding	0.60	B210	A106	216.00

		permitting issues on East Gypsum stack.				
03/03/15	SWR	Review file for factual details and timeline related to DOJ/EPA matters.	0.50	B110	A104	237.50
03/03/15	SWR	Review DIP budget submitted by CRO to counsel for DIP Lenders	0.20	B230	A104	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding background information for DOJ/EPA matters.	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding orders to be submitted	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding filing amended affidavit for Joe Rice.	0.10	B160	A105	47.50
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding response to correspondence from Marylou Rice regarding LAP Agreement	0.10	B185	A105	47.50
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples regarding cost estimate of environmental expenses	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding administrative issues	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding company documents	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding response to Marylou Rice of Cigna regarding LAP Agreement and response to related inquires	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B110	A106	95.00

03/03/15	SWR	CRO regarding environmental issues. Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and investment banker regarding	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
		postponement of sales process				
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding OCP supply contract	0.20	B185	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding August 2013 release into Bayou Casotte	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brandon Smith and Michael Caples regarding gypsum stack.	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding 503(b)(9) motion	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding conference call to get update on sales process and DIP budget negotiations	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding certain environmental issues.	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding postponement of sales process	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
03/03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding amended affidavit for Joe Rice	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

03/	03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding ordinary course professionals motion	0.10	B160	A107	47.50
03/	03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding retention, stipulation and cash management issues	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/	03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding Joe Rice amended affidavit	0.10	B160	A107	47.50
03/	03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ron Hewitt regarding term of OCP contract	0.20	B185	A107	95.00
03/	03/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marylou Rice of Cigna regarding Agreement for Life Assistance Program Services	0.30	B185	A107	142.50
03/	03/15	SWR	Prepare redline of 503(b)(9) motion	0.30	B110	A110	142.50
03/	03/15	ТМН	Research regarding tolling agreements, specific kinds of settlements and Rule 9019.	2.40	B190	A102	444.00
03/	03/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Cigna in response to issues raised by same regarding the cure motion.	0.60	B110	A103	111.00
03/	03/15	ТМН	Correspondence with BMC regarding Schedules D and H	0.20	B110	A108	37.00
03/	03/15	VGJ	Office conference with C. Maddux and D. Cannada re Evidence Preservation Notice	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/	03/15	VGJ	Work with Cindy Pierce with Jackson County Chancery Court re parcels and amounts owed.	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
03/	03/15	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Daniel with BMC re	0.40	B110	A108	64.00

03/03/15	VGJ	amended schedules Coordiante and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on recent ECF Notices.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/03/15	VGJ	Review and revise Amended Schedule D for MPC, SATS, and ATS.	0.80	B110	A110	128.00
03/03/15	VGJ	Finalize Amended Affidavit of Joseph F. Rice and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/03/15	VGJ	Receipt of Clerk's Notice - Action Required, review Court Docket to determine necessary action to be taken.	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/03/15	VGJ	Search for Evidence Preservation Notice from Data Room.	0.20	B110	A111	32.00
03/04/15	ABB	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Steve Rosenblatt, Chris Maddux and others re: response to DOJ.	0.30	L120	A105	102.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review memorandum from A. Hootsell regarding potential resolution of Mazuma claim	0.20	B120	A104	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review correspondence regarding Joe Rice and Deloitte Analytics retention	0.20	B160	A104	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft of proposed amended DIP order	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review/analyze revised DIP budget and revised DIP term sheet	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review/analyze proposed motion to renew and extend interim DIP order and related comments	0.40	B230	A104	144.00

		provided by counsel to DIP lenders				
03/04/15	СНМ	Review/analyze interim DIP order in connection with obtaining additional advances	0.50	B230	A104	180.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review correspondence to committee counsel regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A104	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review/analyze case law regarding treatment of certain potential administrative expense claims	0.40	B310	A104	144.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with counsel to DuPont regarding application for 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in internal legal conference regarding environmental matters	0.50	B210	A105	180.00
03/04/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding case status, strategy and course of action	0.80	B110	A106	288.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding potential resolution of Mazuma claim	0.30	B120	A106	108.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference calls with counsel to DIP lenders and management regarding additional DIP financing and funding of same	0.70	B230	A107	252.00
03/04/15	CHM	Prepare for and	0.30	B230	A107	108.00

		participate in conference call with DOJ lawyers and management regarding additional DIP financing and funding of same				
03/04/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee professionals regarding additional DIP financing and funding of same	0.60	B230	A107	216.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Correspondence among counsel to Dip lenders and management regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/04/15	СНМ	Telephone counsel with DIP lenders' counsel regarding additional DIP financing and funding of same	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
03/04/15	GCV	Teleconference with Robert Kerley re: forfeiture issue.	0.10	B220	A106	35.00
03/04/15	JBT	Telephone conference with Rosenblatt and team regarding status of discussions with government regarding DOJ letter.	0.60	L120	A107	285.00
03/04/15	JMC	Work on motion of the Debtors to renew and extend interim DIP order and emergency motion for expedited hearing on same.	2.40	B230	A103	456.00
03/04/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain precedential authorities regarding accrual and treatment of certain administrative expense claims under the bankruptcy code.	0.80	B190	A104	152.00

03/04/15	JMC	Correspondence with Stacie Zorn and Daniel Summa in connection with the Longshore and Harbor Workers' Compensation Act claim of William D. Burge.	0.50	B140	A108	95.00
03/04/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with UCC regarding status of certain matters including DIP funding.	1.50	B230	A108	285.00
03/04/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in teleconferences with the Lenders and the DOJ regarding status of certain matters including DIP funding.	1.40	B230	A108	266.00
03/04/15	MDC	Conference with Butler Snow team to discuss response to DOJ on certain environmental matters.	1.00	L120	A107	360.00
03/04/15	SWR	Research on priority for expenses for post-petition environmental remediation	0.90	B300	A102	427.50
03/04/15	SWR	Review and revise proposed order to grant the application of the Debtors to employ DTBA for other services	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Work on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.90	B230	A103	427.50
03/04/15	SWR	Review and revise motion and proposed order to shorten notice period and set hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.60	B230	A103	285.00
03/04/15	SWR	Review of draft of second interim DIP Order	0.40	B230	A104	190.00

03/0)4/15	SWR	Review and analyze interim DIP Order for procedures for additional advances.	0.40	B230	A104	190.00
03/0)4/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding submission of order for interim compensation procedures	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/0	04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ault Hootsell and Robert Kerley regarding resolution of Mazuma issues and wiring instructions	0.30	B120	A105	142.50
03/0)4/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding amended affidavit of Joe Rice	0.10	B160	A105	47.50
03/0	04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding response to Marylou Rice of Cigna regarding status of the CBH Agreement for Life Assistance Program Services	0.20	B185	A105	95.00
03/0	04/15	SWR	Conference with Butler Snow team regarding emergency motion for DIP financing	0.30	B230	A105	142.50
03/0	04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and DIP lender-approved budget for same	0.30	B230	A105	142.50
03/0	04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding treatment and priority of certain claims in chapter 11.	0.20	B300	A105	95.00
03/0	04/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with James Tucker, Amanda	0.50	L120	A105	237.50

		Barbour, Michael Caples and Chris Maddux regarding response to Jeremy Korzenik				
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding affidavits for retention applications of Joe Rice and Craig Geno	0.30	B160	A106	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding proposed order approving retention of DTBA for other services	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding DIP actual-to-budget comparison.	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding interpretation of interim DIP Order	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding budget approved by DIP lenders	0.40	B230	A106	190.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash and Robert Kerley regarding DIP budget and no funding in current period for management services agreement	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Craig Geno regarding United States Trustee guidelines and proposed stipulation	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Tim Sterling of Copeland Cook regarding cure amount notice	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with	0.40	B110	A107	190.00

		Jim O'Mara regarding procedures for dealing with Trammo 503(b)(9) motion				
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding stipulations from Craig Geno and Butler Snow	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding payments to have been made under management services agreement	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding filing of amended affidavit and order approving retention of Joe Rice as special counsel	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Roland Young regarding approval of proposed order to retain DTBA for other services	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding approved budget	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Conference call with professionals for Committee regarding status of case and course of action regarding additional advance under DIP facility	0.60	B230	A107	285.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long of DOJ regarding status of DIP financing negotiations	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Fingerhood and Ken Long of DOJ and Jon Nash regarding status of DIP financing	0.50	B230	A107	237.50

03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding DIP financing	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding DIP budget approved by DIP lenders	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding documentation for advance request	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/04/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Leslie Heilman regarding status of 503(b)(9) hearing and suggested resolution	0.40	B110	A108	190.00
03/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Christy Cannette regarding scheduling of emergency hearing for DIP financing	0.20	B230	A108	95.00
03/04/15	ТМН	Work on research regarding 9019 motion and certain environmental matters in bankruptcy context.	1.80	B190	A102	333.00
03/04/15	ТМН	Work on drafting and revising order for DTBA retention for other services.	1.40	B160	A103	259.00
03/04/15	ТМН	Work on drafting and revising proposed agreed order for Trammo's 503(b)(9) claim	1.80	B310	A103	333.00
03/04/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Cigna regarding cure	0.20	B130	A108	37.00

03/04/15	VGJ	motion Work on incorporating revisions to Schedule D.	0.50	B110	A103	80.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Conference with S. Rosenblatt re proposed orders outstanding.	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with T. Hewitt re hearing dates for proposed Order	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Daniels re Amended Schedule H for MPC, SATS, and ATS.	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with Savage Services Corp. re change of address	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Work on establishing secure credentials for users for Data Room access.	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on recent ECF Notices in the bankruptcy cases.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Receipt and review of Amended Schedule H for MPC, SATS and ATS.	0.70	B110	A111	112.00
03/04/15	VGJ	Receipt and review of Notices of Undelivered Mail from Court to determine actions to be taken in connection with same.	0.40	B110	A111	64.00
03/05/15	CHM	Review amended bid procedures order	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Review correspondence regarding discussions with counsel to parties regarding environmental issues	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
03/05/15	CHM	Review internal memorandum regarding	0.50	B210	A104	180.00

		cost estimates for environmental expenses				
03/05/15	СНМ	Review documents and pleadings in connection with hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.80	B230	A104	288.00
03/05/15	CHM	Review/analyze revised term sheet with respect to motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Review revised DIP budget	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft motion to renew and extend interim DIP order, and motion and order seeking expedited hearing with respect to same	0.70	B230	A104	252.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Review agreed orders on Trammo and du Pont 503(b)(9) applications	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with counsel to Trammo and du Pont regarding agreed orders on 503(b)(9) applications	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Correspondence with A. Hootsell regarding implementation of Mazuma resolution	0.20	B120	A105	72.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with A. Hootsell regarding Mazuma demand	0.30	B120	A105	108.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with P. Murphy regarding hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A105	108.00
03/05/15	CHM	Conference with S. Rosenblatt regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A105	72.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding amendments to	0.20	B230	A106	72.00

00/07/47	CVV 4	revised DIP budget	0.00	D 220		50 00
03/05/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding preparation for hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/05/15	CHM	Correspondence (x8 e- mails) among counsel to interested parties regarding amended bid procedures order	0.60	B130	A107	216.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding draft motion to renew and extend interim DIP order, and motion and order seeking expedited hearing with respect to same	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
03/05/15	СНМ	Respond to inquiries from prospective bidders regarding documents contained in data room	0.30	B130	A108	108.00
03/05/15	JBT	Telephone conference with Jeremy Korzenik regarding certain environmental issues and report to Steve Rosenblatt and team regarding same.	1.20	L190	A107	570.00
03/05/15	JMC	Work on emergency motion for expedited hearing and proposed order granting same.	1.00	B230	A103	190.00
03/05/15	JMC	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding certain environmental issues.	0.10	B410	A105	19.00
03/05/15	MDC	Finalize cost estimates for stack closure.	4.80	P230	A103	1,728.00
03/05/15	MDC	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Butler Snow team to discuss certain environmental issues.	0.80	L120	A105	288.00

03/05/15	MDC	Call with Karl Burrer regarding environmental cost	0.40	P230	A107	144.00
03/05/15	MDC	Call with Karl Burrer regarding environmental cost	0.40	P230	A107	144.00
03/05/15	PSM	Review of Motion to Renew and Extend Interim Order in preparation for conference call with clients.	0.30	B190	A104	85.50
03/05/15	SAI	Work with counsel to STUW on professional fees escrow agreement	1.00	B110	A103	340.00
03/05/15	SWR	Review and revise proposed agreed order to extend date to respond to Trammo 503(b)(9) motion and to remove same from hearing calendar	0.70	B110	A103	332.50
03/05/15	SWR	Review and revise draft of order on DuPont 503(b)(9) motion	0.50	B110	A103	237.50
03/05/15	SWR	Work on amended sales and bidding procedures order	0.90	B130	A103	427.50
03/05/15	SWR	Revise affidavits for Jon Nash regarding retention applications of Joe Rice and Craig Geno	0.70	B160	A103	332.50
03/05/15	SWR	Work on order granting motion for emergency hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.50	B230	A103	237.50
03/05/15	SWR	Work on and finalize motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	1.10	B230	A103	522.50
03/05/15	SWR	Finalize emergency motion for expedited hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.50	B230	A103	237.50

03/05/15	SWR	Review proposed term sheet for advance under interim DIP Order	0.30	B230	A104	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding status report on call with Jeremy Korzenik	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding folders for information in Firmex data room	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sai Ireland and Karl Burrer regarding signature page from Administrative Agent for escrow agreement for committee's professionals	0.10	B110	A105	47.50
03/05/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Michael Caples regarding cost estimates for Lenders for environmental expenses	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson and BMC regarding service of motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and order to shorten time	0.20	B230	A105	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Velvet Johnson regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and motion to shorten time	0.30	B230	A105	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington regarding motion to shorten time on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A105	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux regarding conference call with CRO regarding preparation for	0.20	B230	A105	95.00

		hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order				
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding narrative and spreadsheet on Brock Services account	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding professional fees escrow agreement for DTBA	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Ault Hootsell regarding wiring instructions for Mazuma	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding affidavits in support of retention of Craig Geno and Joe Rice	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding footnote to budget for the last week in budget.	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding budget for motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Steven Bryant regarding resolution of claims of Brock Services for post-petition charges	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jim O'Mara regarding removal of Trammo 503(b)(9) motion from hearing calendar	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

		removal of DuPont 503(b)(9) motion from hearing calendar				
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jim O'Mara regarding proposed order on 503(b)(9) motion	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding 503(b)(9) motion	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding proposed order on DuPont's 503(b)(9) motion	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for affected parties regarding amended sales and bid procedures order	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding changes to sales and bidding procedures order	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for affected parties regarding changes to amended sales and bid procedures order	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Fingerhood and Ken Long of DOJ regarding effect of amended sales and bidding procedures order	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for Committee and CRO regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and budget for same	0.50	B230	A107	237.50
03/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP	0.40	B230	A107	190.00

		Lenders and CRO regarding budget for motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order				
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long and Karl Fingerhood of DOJ and counsel for MDEQ regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding revised term sheet for loan under interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Christy Cannette regarding submission of agreed orders on Trammo and DuPont 503(b)(9) motions and request for re-set sale hearing date	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
03/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill team regarding amended sales and bidding procedures order	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/05/15	TMH	Work on drafting and revising agreed order for Trammo 503(b)(9) claim	1.20	B310	A103	222.00
03/05/15	ТМН	Work on drafting and revising agreed order for Dupont 503(b)(9) claim	1.80	B310	A103	333.00
03/05/15	ТМН	Review/finalize revised schedules D and H and coordinate filing same.	0.80	B110	A104	148.00
03/05/15	TMH	Correspondence with BMC regarding schedules D and H	0.50	B110	A108	92.50

03/05/15	VGJ	Work on Amended Schedules D and H, prepare Amended Summary of Schedules for MPC, SATS, and ATS.	0.50	B110	A103	80.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Prepare a 24 Day Notice for Motion to Establish Procedures with exhibits	0.40	B110	A103	64.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Conference with S. Rosenblatt re Motion to Establish Procedures and notice of same	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Work with T. Hewitt re amended schedules	0.10	B110	A105	16.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with W. Watson (Court) re amending certificate of service	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Work with BMC Group re service of Motion to Extend DIP Order	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on review of recent ECF Notices.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Prepare Amended Certificate of Service for Motion to Extend DIP Order and Motion for Emergency Hearing and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order re Extension of Time and for Other Relief of Du Pont Motion and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/05/15	VGJ	Finalize Motion to Renew and Extend, Emergency Motion to Set Hearing and proposed Order and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00

03/06/15	СНМ	Review documents regarding discussions between counsel to DIP lenders and DOJ	0.40	B110	A104	144.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with counsel (x7 e-mails) regarding sale hearing	0.50	B130	A104	180.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Review/analyze proposed language from DOJ for form APA	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with counsel to du Pont regarding 9019 motion	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/06/15	CHM	Review correspondence from Trammo counsel regarding application for 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Review/analyze pleadings, documents and correspondence regarding environmental matters	0.70	B310	A104	252.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt regarding revisions to bid procedures and bid procedures order	0.50	B130	A105	180.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding status of DIP funding and preparation for hearing with respect to same	0.90	B230	A106	324.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding receipt of Mazuma payment	0.30	B230	A106	108.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management and board of directors (x5 e-mails) regarding discussions with DOJ	0.40	B260	A106	144.00
03/06/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly update conference call	0.80	B210	A107	288.00

		with DOJ, EPA and MDEQ				
03/06/15	СНМ	Correspondence to counsel for DIP lenders regarding environmental matters	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/06/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.60	B230	A107	216.00
03/06/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference calls (x2) with counsel to DIP lenders regarding motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	1.20	B230	A107	432.00
03/06/15	JBT	Communications with S. Rosenblatt and the committee regarding J. Korzenik discussion of yesterday.	0.60	L120	A107	285.00
03/06/15	JMC	Work on agreed order resolving motions to lift automatic stay filed by Jerrry Shumock and Jerry Scudder.	1.10	B140	A103	209.00
03/06/15	JMC	Correspondence with Michael McCabe regarding status of Kristofer Steel motion to lift automatic stay.	0.10	B140	A105	19.00
03/06/15	JMC	Teleconference with Jon Nash and Brandon Smith regarding DIP budget and other related matters.	1.20	B230	A106	228.00
03/06/15	MCA	Email from D. Summa of Gallagher re: status of Steel motion to lift automatic stay and follow up re: same	0.30	B100	A108	72.00
03/06/15	MDC	Call with Jon Nash on environmental issues	0.90	P230	A106	324.00
03/06/15	MDC	Call with Jon Nash on	0.90	P230	A106	324.00

03/06/15	MDC	environmental issues. Call with Karl Burrer	1.30	P230	A107	468.00
		with Haynes Boone regarding environmental cost				
03/06/15	MDC	Call with Karl Burrer with Haynes Boone regarding environmental cost.	1.30	P230	A107	468.00
03/06/15	MDC	Conference call with MDEQ, DOJ and EPA regarding environmental issues at facility.	1.10	P230	A107	396.00
03/06/15	MDC	Call with Lenders on EPA counter offer	1.80	P230	A108	648.00
03/06/15	MDC	Call with Lenders on EPA counter offer.	1.80	P230	A108	648.00
03/06/15	PSM	Teleconference with B. Smith, J. Nash, C. Maddux and S. Rosenblatt re: strategy for hearing on Motion to Renew and Extend Interim Order.	0.80	L120	A106	228.00
03/06/15	SAI	Work on escrow account documentation	1.00	B170	A103	340.00
03/06/15	SWR	Revise amended sale order with new dates for each event in sales process	0.30	B130	A103	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Review offer by DOJ and EPA to DIP lenders regarding DIP financing and case administration	0.50	B110	A104	237.50
03/06/15	SWR	Review proposed language for prototype asset purchase agreement and case cited by DOJ (.3); review sale orders for other chapter 11 cases in S.D. of Mississippi (.5)	0.80	B130	A104	380.00
03/06/15	SWR	Review prior sale order and adjust all dates accordingly in light of new date for sale hearing	0.50	B130	A104	237.50