04/16/15	DBC	regarding sale process Work on revisions to Trammo lease amendment letter agreement	0.40	B250	A103	198.00
04/16/15	JBT	Telephone conference with government lawyer J. Korzenik.	0.50	L140	A107	237.50
04/16/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising amended professional fees escrow agreement of DTBA.	0.10	B110	A103	19.00
04/16/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising motion of the Debtors to renew and extend interim DIP order, emergency motion for hearing on same and proposed order granting motion to extend interim DIP order.	0.90	B230	A103	171.00
04/16/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising motion of the Debtors to renew and extend interim DIP order, emergency motion for hearing on motion to renew and extend on an expedited basis and proposed order granting motion to renew and extend.	2.00	B230	A103	380.00
04/16/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sai Ireland regarding escrow account for DTBA.	0.20	B110	A105	38.00
04/16/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding the DTBA escrow account agreement.	0.10	B110	A105	19.00
04/16/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt on motion to renew and extend interim DIP order to be filed by the Debtors.	0.30	B230	A105	57.00

04/16/15	MCD	Telephone call to Unclaimed Property Division of MS.	0.30	B220	A102	66.00
04/16/15	MDC	Respond to EPA questions regarding water issues due to heavy rainfall at plant	0.80	P230	A107	288.00
04/16/15	SWR	Revise and revise motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and order approving same and emergency motion to shorten time	0.50	B230	A103	237.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with other attorneys regarding questions of United States Trustee regarding first fee application	0.30	B160	A105	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker and Michael Caples regarding discussions with DOJ	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding preparation of motion and agreed order extending time to respond to Rule 9019 and continuance of hearing on Rule 9019 motion	0.20	B230	A105	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington regarding preparation of motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and emergency motion to shorten time	0.30	B230	A105	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding additional discussions with DOJ	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding DIP budget for extended	0.40	B230	A106	190.00

		period and course of action				
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with CRO regarding request to extend challenge period and time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management and Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) claims	0.20	B310	A106	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with interested parties regarding continuance of hearing date on Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Review proposed amendment to Motley Rice contract and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding same	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and counsel for Committee regarding protective filing of BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders and Sandler O'Neill team regarding updated marketing summary	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA regarding sale hearing date and hearing date for Rule 9019 motion	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding questions concerning first fee application of Butler Snow	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding objection of DuPont to Rule 9019 motion and date of hearing on same	0.20	B190	A107	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Mississippi Power and CRO and management regarding conference call to discuss utility rates	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding DIP financing and DIP budget for extended period (through May) and need for extension of interim DIP order	0.50	B230	A107	237.50
04/16/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for EPA and MDEQ and DIP lender regarding extension of challenge period and time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding extension of challenge period and extension of deadline for responding to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
04/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Machelle Anthony of Trustmark regarding disbursements to counsel for Committee and counsel for Debtors from escrow accounts	0.20	B110	A108	95.00
04/16/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Horne regarding revisions needed to Rule 2014	0.30	B160	A108	142.50

		statement and revise statement accordingly				
04/16/15	ТМН	Research regarding inclusion of pre-petition interest on proof of claim	1.20	B310	A102	222.00
04/16/15	TMH	Work on agreed order to continue 9019 hearing	0.60	B110	A103	111.00
04/16/15	TMH	Work on motion to continue 9019 hearing	0.80	B110	A103	148.00
04/16/15	TMH	Review/analysis of 503(b)(9) claims	0.60	B310	A104	111.00
04/16/15	ТМН	Correspondence with MPC and Deloitte regarding 503(b)(9) claims	0.20	B310	A106	37.00
04/16/15	ТМН	Correspondence with W. Wessler regarding agreed order for 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B310	A107	55.50
04/17/15	CHM	Review/analyze marketing summary/contact log prepared by Sandler O'Neill	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
04/17/15	CHM	Review/analyze proposed revisions to letter agreement concerning Trammo lease modification	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
04/17/15	СНМ	Review correspondence regarding status of environmental matters at plant	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
04/17/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with DOJ/EPA and MDEQ	0.70	B150	A107	252.00
04/17/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Mississippi Power regarding future rate	0.60	B210	A107	216.00
04/17/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding additional interest in participating in	0.20	B130	A108	72.00

04/17/15	DBC	sale process Revise and finalize Trammo lease letter of intent.	0.50	B250	A103	247.50
04/17/15	GCV	Conference with MRC re: escheat issue and research re: alternatives.	0.30	B220	A106	105.00
04/17/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising DTBA escrow account agreement and related documents.	0.50	B110	A103	95.00
04/17/15	JMC	Work with Sai Ireland on DTBA escrow account agreement.	0.40	B110	A105	76.00
04/17/15	JMC	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding DTBA escrow agreement.	0.10	B110	A106	19.00
04/17/15	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding DTBA escrow agreement.	0.10	B110	A107	19.00
04/17/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding motion of Caterpillar Financial and proposed agreed order resolving same.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
04/17/15	JMC	Correspondence with Bryan Foster regarding DTBA escrow account agreement.	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
04/17/15	MCD	Telephone conference with Mississippi Department of Treasury unclaimed property division; e-mail to Gilbert Van Loon re: transfer of small balances in 401(k) to unclaimed.	0.60	B220	A102	132.00
04/17/15	MDC	Respond to Jon Nash regarding cost estimates for closure and estimates by EPA	1.00	P230	A102	360.00
04/17/15	MDC	Call with Haynes and Boone attorney regarding environmental issues	1.20	P230	A107	432.00

04/17/15	MDC	associated with EPA Conference call with EPA regarding status of facility	1.00	P230	A107	360.00
04/17/15	PSM	Calls and emails to/from Jason Alderson Esq. re: status of Order on 503(b) Motion and forward claim form.	0.20	B190	A107	57.00
04/17/15	SAI	Work on establishment of new escrow account for debtor's financial advisor	1.00	B160	A108	340.00
04/17/15	SWR	Revise order granting 503(b)(9) procedures motion	0.20	B110	A103	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Review proposed changes in Trammo letter agreement to address open issues	0.20	B210	A104	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding question by creditor concerning 503(b)(9) order	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker and Michael Caples regarding discussions with DOJ	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding discussions with DOJ regarding investigation	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding proposed changes to Trammo letter agreement	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brandon Smith and Robert Kerley regarding insurance proceeds	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding insurance payment for casualty loss to dock	0.20	B210	A106	95.00

04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding key performance indicators (KPIs) regarding wastewater treatment and environmental conditions at facility	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/17/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Carole Evans regarding changes to order approving 503(b)(9) procedures	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding conference call with Sandler O'Neill to discuss sales process and contact log	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/17/15	SWR	Weekly conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ and Debtors regarding environmental matters	0.60	B210	A107	285.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding timing on funding of insurance loss payment	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding environmental issues	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel and business people for Mississippi Power Company and CRO and management regarding applicable utility rate for water treatment operations	0.50	B210	A107	237.50
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Mississippi Power regarding	0.20	B210	A107	95.00

		conference call to discuss electricity rates				
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee and CRO regarding status of DIP financing	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with outside counsel for PHI and MPC regarding Jones litigation regarding status of case remanded to state court	0.20	L110	A107	95.00
04/17/15	SWR	Correspondence with Machelle Anthony of Trustmark regarding DTBA escrow account	0.20	B110	A108	95.00
04/17/15	TMH	Work on objection to DuPont's 503(b)(9) claim	2.80	B310	A103	518.00
04/18/15	СНМ	Review correspondence regarding notice to insurance carrier(s) of potential claim	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
04/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding additional interested party in participation in sale process	0.20	B130	A106	72.00
04/18/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding operational matters	0.40	B210	A106	144.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding response to 503(b)(9) claims of Trammo, DuPont and Bastech	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill team regarding meeting of DeJong and EPA and MDEQ	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and investment banker regarding information on Debtors' facilities for marketing	0.30	B130	A106	142.50

		purposes				
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding notice of DOJ investigation	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Mississippi Power Company open issues	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/18/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Robert Kerley and Brandon Smith regarding 503(b)(9) claims of Trammo, Bastech and DuPont	0.20	B310	A106	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Carole Evans regarding changes to 503(b)(9) procedures order	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding presentation materials for sales process	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for PHI regarding notice under insurance policy	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/18/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding report on payment of insurance proceeds	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/19/15	MDC	Communication with Matthew Ahrens with Milbank regarding environmental consultants getting access to data room and potential site visit	0.50	P230	A107	180.00
04/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding objection to DuPont's	0.20	B310	A105	95.00

		motion for administrative expense claim, as well as agreed orders for Trammo and Bastech on their 503(b)(9) claims				
04/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding open issues with Mississippi Power Company	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/19/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding anticipated receipt of payment of insurance proceeds	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/19/15	TMH	Draft Agreed Order for Trammo 503(b)(9) Claim	0.80	B310	A103	148.00
04/19/15	TMH	Draft Agreed Order for Bastech 503(b)(9) Claim	0.80	B310	A103	148.00
04/20/15	CHM	Correspondence with management and Sandler O'Neill regarding additional parties interested in participating in sale process	0.40	B130	A106	144.00
04/20/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding insurance matters	0.60	B210	A106	216.00
04/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding insurance matters	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
04/20/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with DOJ/EPA, MDEQ, Sandler O'Neill and management regarding sale process	0.90	B130	A107	324.00
04/20/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to Mississippi Power regarding electric utility rates	0.20	B210	A107	72.00
04/20/15	DBC	Emails Robert Kerley and Brandon Smith re: Trammo lease letter	1.00	B250	A103	495.00

		agreement and finalize same; prepare redline version for Trammo.				
04/20/15	GCV	Email correspondence with Jeb Burchett and review information from Jeb Burchett re: remaining participants with account in plan.	0.20	B220	A106	70.00
04/20/15	JBT	Report to team regarding telephone conference with J. Korzenik; response from M. Caples.	0.50	L140	A107	237.50
04/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding DTBA escrow account agreement.	0.10	B110	A105	19.00
04/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Marcie Davant regarding DTBA escrow agreement and documents related to same.	0.20	B110	A105	38.00
04/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding DTBA escrow account agreement.	0.10	B110	A107	19.00
04/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Machelle Anthony regarding the DTBA escrow agreement.	0.80	B110	A108	152.00
04/20/15	JMC	Correspondence with Bryan Foster regarding DTBA escrow agreement.	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
04/20/15	MDC	Communication with Matthew Ahrens with Millbanks to discuss environmental consultants and data room; call with Evan Fleck with Millbanks on schedule for environmental review and meeting with EPA	2.60	P230	A107	936.00
04/20/15	MDD	Obtain certificates of good standing from DE	0.60	L110	A111	108.00

		and MS Secretaries of State re Deloitte				
04/20/15	OMH	Review invoices from MS SOS re good standing Deloitte & Capitol Services Invoice for DE good standing on Deloitte and submit same for payment.	0.40	B110	A111	36.00
04/20/15	SAI	Respond to inquiries from Trustmark Bank about the professional fees escrow account for Burr & Forman/Capstone	0.80	B110	A108	272.00
04/20/15	SWR	Revise order approving 503(b)(9) claim of Trammo	0.30	B310	A103	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Work on objection to 503(b)(9) claim of DuPont	0.80	B310	A103	380.00
04/20/15	SWR	Briefly review Mississippi Power tariffs and contract	0.30	B210	A104	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding follow-up with agent for DIP lender regarding signature pages for amended professional fee escrow accounts	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
04/20/15	SWR	Conference and correspondence with Don Cannada regarding revised Trammo letter agreement	0.20	B185	A105	95.00
04/20/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objection to 503(b)(9) claim of DuPont	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding delay in recovery of insurance proceeds from damage to dock	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.30	B185	A106	142.50

		CRO and management regarding status of revisions to Trammo lease agreement and payment of March invoice				
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Gallagher regarding casualty insurance issue	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Mississippi Power tariffs and contracts	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding utility charges by Mississippi Power	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and management regarding DuPont 503(b)(9) claim	0.40	B310	A106	190.00
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with CRO and counsel for PHI regarding notice issue	0.50	B120	A107	237.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for De Jong regarding access to data room for its environmental consulting firm	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Extended conference call with EPA and MDEQ, CRO, Sandler O'Neill, and Butler Snow regarding discussion of sales and marketing process	0.80	B130	A107	380.00
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney and Jon Nash regarding amendment to Motley	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		Rice agreement per Court order approving retention of Motley Rice				
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of deadline for objections to Rule 9019 motion and hearing date on motion	0.40	B190	A107	190.00
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding utility charges by Mississippi Power Company for Mississippi Phosphates	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding proposed change in coverage for casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
04/20/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding casualty insurance changes	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/20/15	TMH	Research FOB statutes and cases in Mississippi	1.40	B310	A102	259.00
04/20/15	TMH	Work on objection to DuPont's 503(b)(9) Claim	1.10	B310	A103	203.50
04/20/15	ТМН	Correspondence with counsel regarding Bastech's Agreed order for 503(b)(9) Claim	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/20/15	ТМН	Correspondence with counsel regarding Trammo's Agreed order for 503(b)(9) Claim	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/20/15	VGJ	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt re DuPont Agreement	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
04/20/15	VGJ	Add additional users to the Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
04/20/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	48.00

04/20/15	VGJ	Retrieve and organize exhibits to DuPont response	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
04/20/15	VGJ	Review of documents in Data Room re DuPont for S. Rosenblatt	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
04/20/15	VGJ	Finalize Objection to DuPont's Motion for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expense Claim and electronically file same with Court	0.40	B110	A111	64.00
04/21/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft revised cash flow projections and related assumptions underlying same	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
04/21/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding insurance matters	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
04/21/15	JMC	Correspondence from Karl Steinberger regarding workers' compensation claim of Victor Lemon.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
04/21/15	JMC	Correspondence from NeoPost regarding certain services being renewed.	0.20	B210	A108	38.00
04/21/15	SEK	Completed review of MPC voluminous files relating to contract with DuPont regarding sulfuric acid.	0.60	B120	A110	81.00
04/21/15	SEK	Conducted review of MPC voluminous files relating to contract with DuPont regarding sulfuric acid.	2.70	B120	A110	364.50
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael McCabe regarding inquiry from AIG	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington	0.20	B185	A105	95.00

		regarding postage meter for Mississippi Phosphates				
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding Trammo 503(b)(9) order	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy and Thomas Hewitt regarding DuPont contracts	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding monthly operating reports for March	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding insurance proceeds from damage to dock	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding casualty insurance on facility	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding draft of pleadings regarding renewal and extension of interim DIP Order and procedures and timetable for same	0.40	B230	A106	190.00
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding need for approved DIP budget for DIP financing motion	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
04/21/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for De Jong and Michael Caples regarding meeting to discuss environmental issues at facility in connection with proposed sale	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence and	0.50	B190	A107	237.50

		conference call with CRO and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding request to continue hearing on Rule 9019 motion				
04/21/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding response of United States Trustee to request on casualty insurance	0.10	B210	A107	47.50
04/21/15	SWR	Extended conference call with Gallagher, CRO and management regarding casualty insurance program	0.50	B210	A108	237.50
04/21/15	TMH	Work on motion to extend DIP Order	0.70	B110	A103	129.50
04/21/15	ТМН	Work on emergency motion to expedite hearing on motion extend DIP Order	0.40	B110	A103	74.00
04/21/15	TMH	Work on order for motion to extend DIP Order	0.40	B110	A103	74.00
04/21/15	TMH	Draft order for emergency motion for DIP Order	0.50	B110	A103	92.50
04/21/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for Bastech	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
04/21/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for Trammo	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
04/21/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
04/21/15	VGJ	Finalize Proposed Agreed Order Allowing Administrative Expense Claim of Bastech and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/22/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding revised cash flow projections	0.50	B230	A106	180.00

04/22/15	MDC	Communicate with EPA region 4 regarding surge capacity; prepare document regarding surge capacity and wastewater treatment for EPA	3.80	P230	A108	1,368.00
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples regarding update on environmental issues and sales process	0.20	B130	A105	95.00
04/22/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding status report on case	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding claim of Wabash for damage to boiler	0.40	B190	A106	190.00
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Mississippi Power Company rates	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding status report on DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
04/22/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding proposed DIP budget and course of action	0.50	B230	A106	237.50
04/22/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status report	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding adjustment in rates with Mississippi Power Company	0.40	B210	A107	190.00
04/22/15	SWR	Telephone calls to counsel for Committee regarding interim DIP Order and DIP financing	0.40	B230	A107	190.00
04/22/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.50	B130	A108	237.50

		CRO and Sandler O'Neill and Michael Caples				
		regarding meeting with De Jong to discuss sale of facilities				
04/22/15	TMH	Research claim of AL Electric	0.20	B310	A102	37.00
04/22/15	ТМН	Correspondence with counsel to AL Electric re cure dispute	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/22/15	VGJ	Correspondence with T. Hewitt re deadline to object to Trammo's Application for Administrative Fees	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
04/22/15	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Daniel with BMC re Updated Shortened Service List	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
04/22/15	VGJ	Telephone conference and email correspondence with W. Watson (Court) re extension for Motion of Trammo [573]	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
04/22/15	VGJ	Prepare and finalize March Monthly Operating Reports for MPC, ATS and SATS and electronically file same with Court	1.60	B110	A111	256.00
04/22/15	VGJ	Prepare Updated Shortened Service List	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Research regarding party indicating interest in participating in sales process	0.50	B130	A102	180.00
04/23/15	CHM	Review correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding indications of interest in participating in sales process	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from prospective participant in sales	0.20	B130	A104	72.00

04/23/15	СНМ	process Review/revise March	0.50	B160	A104	180.00
04/23/13	СПИ	monthly statement	0.30	D 100	A104	180.00
04/23/15	CHM	Review correspondence from DIP lenders regarding revised DIP budget and operational matters	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Conference with M. Caples regarding prospective bidder	0.30	B130	A105	108.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding rejection of Wabash lease	0.20	B185	A106	72.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding operational matters	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding status of operations and funding for same	0.40	B210	A106	144.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management (x7 emails) regarding revised DIP budget	0.50	B230	A106	180.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to creditors regarding information request	0.30	B150	A107	108.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding revised cash flow budget	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with committee counsel regarding DIP budget and pending deadlines in cases	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
04/23/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding prospective bidder's interest in participating in sales process	0.20	B130	A108	72.00

04/23/15	DBC	Telephone conference and e-mail Robert Kerley regarding prior OCP rock contract and prior TransAmmonia ammonia supply contract.	0.40	B210	A106	198.00
04/23/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising wire instructions in connection with the DTBA escrow account.	0.20	B110	A103	38.00
04/23/15	JMC	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding DTBA escrow agreement.	0.40	B110	A106	76.00
04/23/15	SWR	Work on and finalize motion to continue hearing on Rule 9019 motion and order approving same	0.50	B190	A103	237.50
04/23/15	SWR	Work on motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and order granting same	1.70	B230	A103	807.50
04/23/15	SWR	Work on motion to shorten notice period for motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and order granting same	1.10	B230	A103	522.50
04/23/15	SWR	Review and revise proposed order on Trammo 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A103	95.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding March monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
04/23/15	SWR	Conference with Michael Caples regarding update on environmental matters, meeting with De Jong and another prospect	0.40	B130	A105	190.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding status report on compliance with United States Trustee operating guidelines regarding bank	0.20	B110	A106	95.00

04/23/15	SWR	accounts Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding receipt of insurance proceeds for dock damage	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding interest of De Jong Capital in facilities	0.40	B130	A106	190.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding conference call with De Jong Capital for additional financial information	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding sale process deadlines and hearing dates	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding course of action regarding casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Wabash claim for damaged boiler	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding proposal of Mississippi Power Company regarding change in rates	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conferences with CRO regarding DIP financing and status of proposed DIP budget	0.80	B230	A106	380.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management and Thomas Hewitt regarding proposed 503(b)(9) orders for Trammo and Bastech	0.50	B310	A106	237.50

04/23/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Carole Evans regarding status of 503(b)(9) order	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding receipt of insurance proceeds for damage to dock	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding update on sales process	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding adjustment of rates from change in tariffs	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conferences counsel for Committee regarding status of DIP financing and DIP budget	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
04/23/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding status of approval of DIP budget	0.60	B230	A107	285.00
04/23/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding update on De Jong Capital	0.40	B130	A108	190.00
04/23/15	TMH	Revise Bastech Agreed Order to reflect changes to Trammo Agreed Order	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
04/23/15	TMH	Correspondence with J. Nash, CRO, regarding	0.20	B310	A106	37.00

		Trammo's agreed order for its 503(b)(9) claim				
04/23/15	ТМН	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding Trammo's 503(b)(9) claim as it relates to MAL's cure claim	0.20	B310	A106	37.00
04/23/15	ТМН	Correspondence with G. Wessler regarding changes to Bastech Agreed Order	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/23/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Trammo's counsel regarding the agreed order for the 503(b)(9) motion	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review correspondence to the governments regarding De Jong Capital	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from counsel to Mississippi Power regarding electric utility rates	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review/analyze draft third amended DIP term sheet	0.40	B230	A104	144.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review draft motion to renew and extend DIP loan	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.20	B230	A104	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with and among counsel to the committee, the governments and the DIP	0.40	B230	A104	144.00

		lenders regarding extensions of deadlines and hearing				
04/24/15	СНМ	Review/analyze EPA proof of claim	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Review/analyze MDEQ proofs of claim	0.40	B310	A104	144.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding bank accounts	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding third amended DIP term sheet	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding committee comments to DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with De Jong Capital regarding sales process	0.90	B130	A107	324.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Lloyd Randolph regarding proposed FCC language for sale order	0.30	B130	A107	108.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with DOJ/EPA and MDEQ	0.60	B150	A107	216.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding third amended DIP term sheet	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the governments regarding approved DIP budget	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence from counsel to du Pont regarding joint motion of the debtors and the committee for an order establishing section 503(b)(9) claims	0.20	B310	A107	72.00

•						
		procedure				
04/24/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding De Jong Capital	0.20	B130	A108	72.00
04/24/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising agreed order resolving motion of Caterpillar Financial Inc.	0.90	B140	A103	171.00
04/24/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding proposed agreed order resolving motion filed by Caterpillar Financial Inc.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
04/24/15	MDC	Review of proposal from De Jong	1.20	P230	A104	432.00
04/24/15	MDC	Weekly call with EPA regarding environmental issues at plant	1.00	P230	A107	360.00
04/24/15	MDC	Call with De Jong to discuss environmental issues and DOJ and sales process	0.80	P230	A107	288.00
04/24/15	SWR	Finalize motion to continue Rule 9019 motion and order granting same	0.40	B110	A103	190.00
04/24/15	SWR	Revise and finalize motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order and motion to shorten notice and orders on same	1.30	B230	A103	617.50
04/24/15	SWR	Prepare notice of extension of challenge period for Governments	0.30	B230	A103	142.50
04/24/15	SWR	Revisions to Third Amended Term Sheet for additional DIP loan advance	0.90	B230	A103	427.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding possible remediation project	0.10	B210	A105	47.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding	0.20	B110	A106	95.00

		filing of March monthly operating reports				
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding need for signature card and original voided check from DIP bank account	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
04/24/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with regarding conference call with De Jong Capital regarding conference call to discuss interest in MPC facilities	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding new utility rates and applicable date for same	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding revisions to Third Amended Term Sheet for additional DIP loan	0.40	B230	A106	190.00
04/24/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding lender- approved DIP budget and changes in same	0.90	B230	A106	427.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding voided check from DIP bank account	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/24/15	SWR	Voicemail from counsel for EPA regarding Debtors' cash status	0.10	B110	A107	47.50
04/24/15	SWR	Participate in weekly conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, CRO, and Butler Snow attorneys regarding environmental operational issues, sales process, and status of matter in chapter 11 case	0.70	B110	A107	332.50

04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont regarding procedures for dealing with Debtors' Objection to DuPont's asserted section 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DuPont, EPA and MDEQ, PHI, Committee, and Lenders regarding continuance of hearing on Rule 9019 motion	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding proofs of claim	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel and CRO regarding notice of resetting hearing on Rule 9019 motion	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with Lloyd Randolph regarding conference call with FCC counsel next week regarding sale process and FCC regulations	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/24/15	SWR	Conference call with De Jong Capital and its counsel, CRO, Sandler O'Neill, and Butler Snow regarding discussion of status of De Jong due diligence and structure of proposal	0.70	B130	A107	332.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Mississippi Power regarding adjusted electricity rates	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding proposed budget and	0.40	B230	A107	190.00

		motion to extend interim DIP Order				
04/24/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP lenders, EPA and MDEQ regarding length of extension of challenge period and notice of extension of challenge period	0.40	B230	A107	190.00
04/24/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding revisions to Third Amended Term Sheet	0.40	B230	A107	190.00
04/24/15	SWR	Voicemail, correspondence and telephone conferences with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding approved DIP budget and need for changes in same	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
04/24/15	SWR	Voicemail, telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding lender- approved DIP budget and necessity for changes in same	0.80	B230	A107	380.00
04/24/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Carole Evans and conference call regarding status of motion regarding continuance of hearing on Rule 9019 settlement, motion to renew and extend interim DIP Order, and 503(b)(9) procedures order	0.60	B110	A108	285.00
04/24/15	TMH	Work on Trammo Agreed Order	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
04/24/15	TMH	Finalize Bastech Amended Agreed Order	0.20	B310	A104	37.00
04/24/15	TMH	Finalize Trammo Agreed	0.20	B310	A104	37.00