		Order				
04/24/15	ТМН	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding March MORs	0.20	B110	A106	37.00
04/24/15	TMH	Correspondence with W. Wessler regarding Bastech agreed order	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Conference with S. Rosenblatt re monthly operating reports for March	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Conference with T. Hewitt re status of Bastech Agreed Order	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Correspondence with BMC Group re updating Shortened Service List	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with Wanda Watson with Court re 503(b)(9) proposed Order	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Amended Notice of Filing of Updated Limited Service List and electronically file same with the Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Review Court Docket as to status of outstanding orders	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize the revised Order regarding 503(b)(9) Procedures, assemble exhibit and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Allowing Administrative Expense Claim of Trammo and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Amended	0.30	B110	A111	48.00

		Agreed Order Allowing Administrative Expense Claim of Bastech and electronically file same with Court				
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Motion for Continuance of Hearing on Rule 9019 Motion and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Emergency Motion to Shorten and Expedite Hearing on Motion to Renew and Extend DIP Order and proposed Order and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/24/15	VGJ	Finalize Motion to Renew and Extend Interim DIP Order, proposed Order and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/25/15	СНМ	Review/analyze letter from De Jong Capital regarding indication of interest	0.50	B130	A104	180.00
04/25/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding De Jong Capital indication of interest	0.30	B130	A106	108.00
04/25/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to PHI regarding BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	72.00
04/25/15	SWR	Review De Jong letter of intent received from Evan Fleck of Milbank	0.40	B130	A104	190.00
04/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding response to De Jong letter of intent	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/25/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding executed amendment to Motley Rice contract	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
04/26/15	GCV	Email correspondence to	0.10	B220	A106	35.00

		Robert Kerley re: follow- up on lost 401(k) plan participants.				
04/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples regarding meeting with De Jong in Houston	0.30	B130	A105	142.50
04/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with EPA and MDEQ regarding De Jong letter of intent	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
04/26/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding additional due diligence on De Jong and Alexey Mordachov	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Review/analyze indication of interest provided by De Jong Capital	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Review agreed order resolving motion to lift stay filed by Cat Financial	0.30	B140	A104	108.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Review/revise response to office of the UST regarding questions with respect to fee application	0.30	B160	A104	108.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Review memorandum to DIP lenders, committee counsel and UST regarding options with respect to casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with Gallagher regarding prior insurance policies	0.20	B210	A104	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill and management regarding HC2/Cevital interest in sales process	0.20	B130	A106	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management	0.60	B130	A106	216.00

		regarding report on meeting with De Jong Capital and next steps and course of action with respect to sales process				
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding agreed order resolving Cat Financial motion to lift stay	0.20	B140	A106	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding workers compensation insurance	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding casualty insurance	0.50	B210	A106	180.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding order extending interim DIP order	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Oxbow regarding potential bid	0.70	B130	A107	252.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with DOJ/EPA regarding indication of interest from De Jong Capital	0.20	B130	A107	72.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding casualty insurance	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to DIP lenders regarding status of funding and next steps with respect to same	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
04/27/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding response deadline for adversary proceeding	0.20	B430	A107	72.00
04/27/15	CHM	Correspondence with	0.20	B130	A108	72.00

		Sandler O'Neill regarding indication of interest by prospective bidder				
04/27/15	JBT	Communications from government to office attorneys	0.20	L140	A107	95.00
04/27/15	JMC	Review/revise billing statement for March 2015	3.10	B160	A103	589.00
04/27/15	JMC	Work on proposed agreed order extending the response deadline of the Debtors in the adversary proceeding filed by STUW LLC.	0.50	L210	A103	95.00
04/27/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of Sterling Kidd's proposed changes to the proposed order resolving Caterpillar Financial's motion.	0.40	B140	A104	76.00
04/27/15	JMC	Correspondence with Steve Rosenblatt regarding agreed order extending response deadline in the adversary proceeding filed against the Debtors by STUW, LLC.	0.10	L210	A105	19.00
04/27/15	JMC	Correspondence with Brandon Smith and Robert Kerley regarding proposed agreed order resolving motion filed by Caterpillar Financial Inc.	0.20	B140	A106	38.00
04/27/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding proposed agreed order resolving motion filed by Cat Financial.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
04/27/15	MDC	Meeting with De Jong and environmental consultants to discuss environmental issues at facility	6.00	P230	A107	2,160.00
04/27/15	MDC	Travel to and from	5.50	P230	A112	1,980.00

		Houston TX for meeting with De Jong (1/2 time)				
04/27/15	PSM	Review MPC document spreadsheet; locate and pull certain insurance policies and scan and forward to team.	1.40	B120	A110	399.00
04/27/15	SWR	Work on responses to United States Trustee regarding first fee application of Butler Snow	0.50	B160	A103	237.50
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy and Susan Kiser regarding review of files for old insurance policies	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Michael Caples regarding report on meeting with De Jong	0.50	B130	A105	237.50
04/27/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington regarding preparation of stipulation extending time for Debtors to answer Complaint in adversary proceeding	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples and Chris Maddux regarding proofs of claim of EPA and MDEQ	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding report on meeting with De Jong regarding purchase of facility	0.40	B130	A106	190.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding follow-up discussion on meeting	0.60	B130	A106	285.00

		with De Jong, sale timelines and course of action				
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding conference call to discuss sales timeline and status report on sales process	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Gallagher regarding workers compensation insurance	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding storm damage to facility	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding status of extension of deadline regarding casualty insurance options and alternatives regarding casualty insurance	0.40	B210	A106	190.00
04/27/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with CRO regarding property and casualty insurance	0.50	B210	A106	237.50
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding order granting motion of the Debtors to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
04/27/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding proofs of claim by EPA and MDEQ and letter of intent by De Jong	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding interest	0.40	B130	A107	190.00

		of De Jong in purchase of facility				
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders, Committee and United States Trustee regarding change in insurance coverage	0.40	B210	A107	190.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding order granting motion of the Debtors to renew and extend interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of time to respond to Complaint in adversary proceeding	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Linda Zwicker of Gallagher regarding insurance policies	0.20	B120	A108	95.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Sunny Cheung regarding conference call with Oxbow regarding sulfuric acid facilities	0.40	B130	A108	190.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with Michael Verachtert and Adam Weinstein of Oxbow and Sunny Cheung of Sandler O'Neill regarding sale process	0.80	B130	A108	380.00
04/27/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding follow-up conference call with HC2/Cevital	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
04/27/15	ТМН	Correspondence with Bastech counsel regarding agreed order	0.20	B310	A107	37.00

04/27/15	VGJ	submission Telephone conference with T. Hubey re additional users and documents to Data Room	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
04/27/15	VGJ	Add additional users to the Data Room	0.70	B110	A110	112.00
04/27/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
04/27/15	VGJ	Receipt of Returned Mail to Debtor from Court, research new address, prepare Notice of Change of Address and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/27/15	VGJ	Finalize Affidavit of Service of BMC Group and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Review/analyze file materials regarding wireless radio permits	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence regarding status of discussions with prospective bidders	0.30	B130	A106	108.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence (x12 e-mails) with management and Sandler O'Neill regarding revised timeline for sales process	0.80	B130	A106	288.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to the governments regarding sales process	0.30	B130	A107	108.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to DIP lenders and management regarding sales process	0.60	B130	A107	216.00
04/28/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with DOJ/FCC	0.50	B130	A107	180.00

		regarding potential transfer of wireless radio permits				
04/28/15	СНМ	Correspondence to Lloyd Randolph regarding wireless radio permits	0.20	B130	A107	72.00
04/28/15	JMC	Work on certain outstanding issues in connection with the DTBA escrow account.	0.80	B110	A103	152.00
04/28/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising motion for relief from certain UST guidelines concerning insurance requirements of the Debtors.	2.90	B110	A103	551.00
04/28/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt on motion for relief from certain UST guidelines regarding insurance requirements of the Debtors.	0.10	B110	A105	19.00
04/28/15	JMC	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding proposed agreed order resolving Caterpillar Financial Inc.'s motion and filing of same.	0.10	B140	A105	19.00
04/28/15	JMC	Correspondence with Jon Nash, Brandon Smith and Bryan Foster regarding DTBA escrow account and status of same.	0.10	B110	A106	19.00
04/28/15	JMC	Call with Beth Carter and David Anderson regarding Caterpillar equipment on the Debtors' property.	0.30	B140	A106	57.00
04/28/15	JMC	Conference with Sterling Kidd regarding Caterpillar Financial Inc.'s proposed changes to the proposed agreed order resolving the motion and follow up	0.40	B140	A107	76.00

		correspondence regarding same.				
04/28/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding proposed agreed order resolving Caterpillar Financial Inc.'s motion.	0.20	B140	A107	38.00
04/28/15	JMC	Correspondence with Machelle Anthony regarding DTBA escrow account and related documents.	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
04/28/15	MDC	Site visit with De Jong environmental consultant conference call with Severtal regarding EPA meeting; conference call with Creditors to discuss De Jong meeting	7.50	P230	A108	2,700.00
04/28/15	MDC	Travel to and from plant for meeting with De Jong environmental consultant (1/2 time)	3.50	P230	A112	1,260.00
04/28/15	SWR	Work on notice of extended bid deadline, qualified bid determination, lead bid and auction date	0.60	B130	A103	285.00
04/28/15	SWR	Work on response to Chris Steiskal regarding questions concerning first fee application of Butler Snow	0.40	B170	A103	190.00
04/28/15	SWR	Review DIP actual to budget comparison for WE April 26	0.20	B230	A104	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding copies of old insurance policies	0.40	B120	A105	190.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding transferring copies of old insurance policies to a	0.20	B120	A105	95.00

04/28/15	SWR	thumb drive  Conference with Mitch  Carrington regarding  motion for waiver of  requirement for casualty  insurance	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding requirements of United States Trustee regarding DIP accounts and declaration of account closings	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding conference call with counsel for FCC	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding proposed revised dates for sales process	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO, Robert Kerley, and Sandler O'Neill regarding extension of bid deadline and auction	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding Trammo letter agreement	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding actual-to-budget comparison for WE 4-26- 2015	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding extension of challenge period	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding DIP account signature cards and declaration of	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

04/28/15	SWR	account closings Conference call with Lloyd Randolph (counsel for FCC), CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding sale of FCC wireless licenses	0.60	B130	A107	285.00
04/28/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for DIP Lenders, CRO, and Sandler O'Neill regarding status report on sales process	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
04/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding sales process, insurance and other matters	0.50	B130	A107	237.50
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and Sandler O'Neill and CRO regarding sales process and conference call to discuss in more detail	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and Sandler O'Neill regarding contact information for potential buyers	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding requested extension of bid deadline and auction	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding extension of bid deadline and auction	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
04/28/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding order extending response date for Complaint in adversary	0.30	B190	A107	142.50

04/28/15	SWR	proceeding  Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding status report on property and casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding final batch of insurance policies	0.20	B120	A108	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Extended conference call HC2/Cevital regarding status report on sale process and discussion of environmental issues	0.60	B130	A108	285.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with prospective purchaser for Mississippi Phosphates facility in Pascagoula	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill and CRO regarding prospective buyer for facility	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
04/28/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher regarding extension for quote of actual cash value casualty insurance coverage	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
04/28/15	ТМН	Research objections to cure amounts to determine status after 503(b)(9) agreed orders	0.50	B310	A102	92.50
04/28/15	TMH	Draft notice for extension of bid deadline and changing of auction date	1.40	B110	A103	259.00
04/28/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for Trammo's objection to cure amount	0.80	B310	A103	148.00
04/28/15	ТМН	Multiple correspondence with R. Kerley regarding cure amounts	0.70	B310	A106	129.50
04/28/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00

04/28/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Resolving Catepillar Motion and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/28/15	VGJ	Gather documents for J. Ktsanes and mail via Federal Express	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/28/15	VGJ	Receipt of Returned Mail to Debtor from Court, research new address, prepare Notice of Change of Address and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/29/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with and among various constituencies and management regarding casualty insurance	0.40	B210	A107	144.00
04/29/15	JBT	Telephone conference with government lawyer J. Korzenik regarding possible resolution of environmental issues; report to team regarding same.	1.00	L140	A107	475.00
04/29/15	JMC	Work with Velvet Johnson on issues in connection with the proposed agreed order resolving Cat Financial's motion.	0.10	B140	A105	19.00
04/29/15	JMC	Work with Chris Maddux regarding proposed agreed order resolving Cat Financial's motion and hearing on same.	0.10	B140	A105	19.00
04/29/15	JMC	Call with Paul Murphy regarding Cat Financial's motion and proposed agreed order resolving same and correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding same.	0.30	B140	A105	57.00
04/29/15	JMC	Correspondence with	0.10	B110	A106	19.00

		Robert Kerley regarding casualty insurance policy of the Debtors.				
04/29/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding proposed order resolving motion of Cat Financial.	0.20	B140	A107	38.00
04/29/15	JMC	Correspondence with Machelle Anthony with Trustmark National Bank regarding DTBA escrow account.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
04/29/15	PSM	Short review of docket, Caterpillar Motion for Stay Relief and Agreed Order submitted on same; call to Bankruptcy Court to request vacating and confirm removing from hearing docket.	0.30	B140	A107	85.50
04/29/15	SWR	Research on waiver of United States Trustee operating guidelines for casualty insurance	0.50	B210	A102	237.50
04/29/15	SWR	Finalize notice of extended bid deadline and auction and related deadlines	0.30	B130	A103	142.50
04/29/15	SWR	Work on Agreed Order for first application for fees and expenses	0.50	B160	A103	237.50
04/29/15	SWR	Work on motion for a waiver of the UST operating guidelines for casualty insurance	0.90	B210	A103	427.50
04/29/15	SWR	Conference with Michael Caples regarding possible structure of sales transaction	0.60	B130	A105	285.00
04/29/15	SWR	Conference with Mitch Carrington regarding Cat Financial agreed order on motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	B140	A105	95.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence and	0.20	B160	A105	95.00

		conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding order granting first fee application of Butler Snow				
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) and cure amount issues	0.30	B185	A105	142.50
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding extension of bid deadline and auction date	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding proposed motion for waiver of United States Trustee operating guidelines for casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding United States Trustee initial debtor interview guidelines and response to fee application	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long regarding final batch of insurance policies for MPC	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
04/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding status of filing of back-up BP claim and related matters	0.40	B120	A107	190.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for De Jong regarding meeting with EPA and MDEQ and sales process	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
04/29/15	SWR	Extended conference call with counsel for	0.60	B130	A107	285.00

		Committee, unsecured creditors committee, Sandler O'Neill and CRO regarding status report on sales process and insurance				
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, CRO, and Sandler O'Neill regarding conference call on sales process	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
04/29/15	SWR	Extended conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, Sandler O'Neill, and CRO regarding status report on sales process	1.20	B130	A107	570.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Bess Creswell regarding responding to United States Trustee large case guidelines	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
04/29/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Burrer regarding hearing on Rule 9019 motion	0.40	B190	A107	190.00
04/29/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding position of Committee regarding property and casualty insurance issue	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
04/29/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for Butler Snow's First Fee Application	0.50	B160	A103	92.50
04/29/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for cure objection by SULCOM, Inc.	0.40	B310	A103	74.00
04/29/15	ТМН	Draft agreed order for cure objection by Trammo, Inc.	0.40	B310	A103	74.00
04/29/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for cure objection by	0.40	B310	A103	74.00

		Alabama Electric Motor				
04/29/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for cure objection by Brock Services, LLC	0.40	B310	A103	74.00
04/29/15	TMH	Analyze BP and AL Electric Motor Proofs of Claim to determine status of 503(b)(9) claims in light of 503(b)(9) Procedures Order	1.10	B310	A104	203.50
04/29/15	ТМН	Correspondence with BMC regarding 503(b)(9) claims asserted in Proof of Claim filings	0.20	B310	A108	37.00
04/29/15	VGJ	Work with IT re all pleadings and policies to download on thumbdrives for S. Rosenblatt	1.70	B110	A110	272.00
04/29/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
04/29/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Extension of Bid Deadline, et al and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
04/29/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Extending Response to Deadline in Adversary Proceeding and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
04/29/15	VGJ	Review court docket re status of Agreed Order as to Caterpillar Financial	0.20	B110	A111	32.00
04/30/15	GCV	E-mail correspondence with Jeb Burchette re: remaining 401 (k) plan balances to be distributed.	0.20	B400	A106	70.00
04/30/15	MDC	Conference call with Millbank firm to discuss environmental issues and proposal to EPA/DOJ	1.30	P230	A107	468.00
04/30/15	SWR	Work on motion to dismiss bankruptcy cases	0.90	B110	A103	427.50

04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding report on telephone conference with J. Korzenik	0.30	B190	A105	142.50
04/30/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding BP claim, report on call with EPA and MDEQ, and sales process	0.50	B120	A106	237.50
04/30/15	SWR	Conference call with Jon Nash and Slate Dabney regarding update on BP claim	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding course of action regarding response to J. Korzenik	0.30	B190	A106	142.50
04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding proposed motion on casualty insurance	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding insurance issue	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
04/30/15	SWR	Extended telephone conferences with Slate Dabney regarding BP claim	0.70	B120	A107	332.50
04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding casualty insurance	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
04/30/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Slate Dabney and counsel for DIP Lenders regarding BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
04/30/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding proposed order on first fee application of Butler Snow	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
04/30/15	TMH	Work on fee application	0.70	B160	A103	129.50

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation May 8, 2015 10071282 Page:80

04/30/15	TMH	Correspondence with	0.20 B110	A108	37.00
		~ 44 ~ ~ ~ 44			

Sandler O'Neill regarding access to data room for prospective purchasers

<b>Sub-total of Fees:</b>	125,757.00

Rate Summary								
Amanda Barbour	11.70	hours at	\$340.00/hr	3,978.00				
Ault Hootsell	0.30	hours at	\$370.00/hr	111.00				
Chris Maddux	51.80	hours at	\$360.00/hr	18,648.00				
Don B. Cannada	4.20	hours at	\$495.00/hr	2,079.00				
Gilbert Van Loon	3.30	hours at	\$350.00/hr	1,155.00				
James Tucker	10.40	hours at	\$475.00/hr	4,940.00				
Marcie Davant	0.60	hours at	\$180.00/hr	108.00				
Marianne Clendenen	2.40	hours at	\$220.00/hr	528.00				
Michael Caples	53.20	hours at	\$360.00/hr	19,152.00				
Mitch Carrington	26.60	hours at	\$190.00/hr	5,054.00				
Onida M. Huhn	0.40	hours at	\$90.00/hr	36.00				
Paul S. Murphy	1.90	hours at	\$285.00/hr	541.50				
Sai Ireland	1.80	hours at	\$340.00/hr	612.00				
Steve Rosenblatt	122.10	hours at	\$475.00/hr	57,997.50				
Susan Kiser	3.30	hours at	\$135.00/hr	445.50				
Thomas Hewitt	34.70	hours at	\$185.00/hr	6,419.50				
Velvet Johnson	24.70	hours at	\$160.00/hr	3,952.00				
Subtotal:	353.40			125,757.00				

## **EXPENSES**

<b>DATE</b>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
03/18/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	2.27
03/19/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	7.05
03/20/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	4.19
03/20/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	4.92
03/23/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	11.54
03/24/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	24.37
03/24/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	8.44
03/27/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	27.09
04/01/15	Image Reproduction 138 Page(s)	13.80
04/08/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	8.80
04/09/15	Image Reproduction 172 Page(s)	17.20
04/09/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	11.59
04/10/15	Conference Call – Soundpath/Level 3	6.09
04/13/15	FedEx Shipping – 773357082150	18.81

Mississippi Phosphates Corporation May 8, 2015 10071282 Page:81

04/13/15	FedEx Shipping – 773357293623	15.70
04/13/15	FedEx Shipping – 773357222436	13.97
04/13/15	FedEx Shipping – 773357441530	17.96
04/13/15	Flash Drive – FLASH DRIVE 512MBx4 Requested by VJ Money	92.00
04/13/15	Flash Drive – FLASH DRIVE 512MBx8 Requested by VJ Money	184.00
04/14/15	FedEx Shipping – 773367926590	18.81
04/14/15	FedEx Shipping – 773368313810	15.70
04/14/15	FedEx Shipping – 773368016925	13.97
04/14/15	FedEx Shipping – 773368405193	17.96
04/16/15	Image Reproduction 54 Page(s)	5.40
04/20/15	Cash Disbursement – Marcie Davant: MS SOS Invoice re good standing	26.57
	Deloitte	
04/20/15	Cash Disbursement – Capitol Services: Invoice for DE good standing on	85.00
	Deloitte	
04/20/15	Image Reproduction 12 Page(s)	1.20
04/23/15	Image Reproduction 6 Page(s)	0.60
04/24/15	Image Reproduction 57 Page(s)	5.70
04/27/15	Image Reproduction 114 Page(s)	11.40
04/28/15	FedEx Shipping – 773476675222	69.86
04/29/15	FedEx Shipping – 773484780851	13.81
04/29/15	FedEx Shipping – 773484848510	13.97
04/29/15	FedEx Shipping – 773484914514	17.96
04/29/15	FedEx Shipping – 773484882548	15.70
04/29/15	FedEx Shipping – 773485204360	18.84
04/29/15	Flash Drive – Flash Drive 2 gbx1 Requested by Velvet Johnson	27.00
04/30/15	Pacer Expense – Pacer Expense	164.30
04/30/15	Flash Drive – Flash Drive 512 mbx10 Requested by Velvet Johnson	230.00
	Sub-total of Expenses:	1,263.54

Т	'O	П	r	١	r	C	ΓTI	D.	D	F	N	Т	ן י	R	T	T	T	T	N	1	7	F	C	١T.	•	Т	Н	T	C	1	<b>/</b>	٨	7	ריי	n	E)	D

\$127,020.54