03/06/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux regarding course of action regarding hearing on motion to amend DIP Order	0.50	B230	A105	237.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding course of action regarding communications with DOJ	0.20	L120	A105	95.00
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding report on call with Jeremy Korzenik of DOJ	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management regarding report on telephone conference with the Ezells and termination of severance pay plan	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and management and Ault Hootsell regarding Mazuma payment	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO and investment banker regarding date of sale hearing and other dates	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conferences with CRO regarding DIP budget and motion to amend DIP Order	0.90	B230	A106	427.50
03/06/15	SWR	Review correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding John Simpson claim	0.10	B310	A106	47.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jim O'Mara regarding Trammo 503(b)(9) motion and order	0.40	B110	A107	190.00

03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Fingerhood regarding proposed language for prototype	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/06/15	SWR	asset purchase agreement Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding proposed budget through confirmation of plan	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
03/06/15	SWR	Weekly conference call with DOJ and counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding environmental issues and sales process	0.50	B110	A107	237.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman (counsel for DuPont) regarding BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel who were signatories to sale order regarding amended sale order	0.40	B130	A107	190.00
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status of retention issues for Debtors' special counsel	0.10	B160	A107	47.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Roy Furrh regarding rain forecast for the weekend in connection with certain environmental issues.	0.10	B210	A107	47.50
03/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding offer by DOJ and EPA	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conferences with counsel for DIP Lenders and CRO regarding proposed increases to DIP budget and motion to amend DIP	0.80	B230	A107	380.00

		Order				
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for Committee regarding Debtors' motion to amend DIP Order	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference with the Ezells regarding 9019 motion	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
03/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Christy Cannette regarding date of sale hearing and status of entry of amended Order	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/06/15	TMH	Revise NDA to incorporate proposed revisions by TPG.	1.80	B130	A103	333.00
03/07/15	SWR	Draft motion to convert cases and order granting motion to convert	0.80	B110	A103	380.00
03/07/15	SWR	Draft motion to dismiss cases and order granting motion to dismiss	0.60	B110	A103	285.00
03/07/15	SWR	Work on Joe Rice retention order	0.40	B160	A103	190.00
03/07/15	SWR	Work on Craig Geno retention order	0.40	B160	A103	190.00
03/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding motion to extend cash management order	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding affidavits for Craig Geno and Motley Rice	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding cash management and bank account requirements by United States Trustee	0.30	B110	A107	142.50
03/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Craig Geno regarding	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		review of proposed retention order				
03/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status of Jon Nash affidavits for Craig Geno and Motley Rice retentions	0.10	B160	A107	47.50
03/09/15	СНМ	Draft notice of filing of amended DIP budget in connection with motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.40	B230	A103	144.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Draft proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.40	B230	A103	144.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with management regarding amended schedules	0.20	B110	A104	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from counsel to the governments regarding approval of amended bid procedures order	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review/analyze research memorandum and related cases regarding motion to approve interim compensation procedures	0.50	B160	A104	180.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review/analyze pleadings and documents in preparation for hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	1.30	B160	A104	468.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review BNC certificate of mailing with respect to motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.20	B230	A104	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with committee counsel regarding resolution of motion to renew and	0.40	B230	A104	144.00

		extend interim DIP order and hearing with respect to same				
03/09/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding preparation of amended approved budget	0.20	B230	A106	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding potential resolution of motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.40	B230	A106	144.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management regarding DIP budget and hearing on motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.50	B230	A106	180.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Correspondence from management regarding franchise taxes	0.20	B240	A106	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Correspondence to counsel for DIP lenders, committee, EPA and MDEQ regarding proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with committee counsel regarding potential resolution of motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
03/09/15	СНМ	Telephone conferences (x4) with counsel to DIP lenders regarding resolution of motion to renew and extend interim DIP order and hearing with respect to same	1.20	B230	A107	432.00

03/09/15	JMC	Work on agreed order resolving motion to lift automatic stay filed by Jerry Shumock.	0.80	B140	A103	152.00
03/09/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain authorities and other related issues in preparation for hearing on DIP budget tomorrow.	3.70	B230	A104	703.00
03/09/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd, creditor's counsel, regarding the Debtors' plan.	0.20	B110	A107	38.00
03/09/15	JMC	Correspondence with Shane Whitfield regarding agreed order resolving motion to lift automatic stay filed by Jerry Shumock.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
03/09/15	JMC	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding agreed order resolving motion to lift automatic stay filed by Jerry Scudder.	0.70	B140	A107	133.00
03/09/15	MCA	Correspondence with J. Campbell of AIG re: status of Steel motion to lift automatic stay	0.20	L250	A108	48.00
03/09/15	PSM	Review of Debtors' Motion for Renewal and Extension of Interim DIP Order and Motion for Interim Compensation Procedures with notes to file in preparation for upcoming hearing.	2.00	B190	A104	570.00
03/09/15	SWR	Work on professional fees escrow agreement for counsel and financial advisor for Committee	0.60	B110	A103	285.00
03/09/15	SWR	Work on escrow agreement for DTBA	0.50	B110	A103	237.50
03/09/15	SWR	Work on ordinary course	0.90	B160	A103	427.50

		professionals motion, order and notice				
03/09/15	SWR	Work on affidavit for CRO for retention of Craig Geno as special counsel	0.70	B160	A103	332.50
03/09/15	SWR	Finalize order approving retention of DTBA for other services	0.30	B160	A103	142.50
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding status of order granting application to employ Craig Geno	0.20	B160	A105	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding affidavits for Joe Rice and Craig Geno retentions	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding notice of filing amended DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding status of DIP budget negotiations	0.50	B230	A106	237.50
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding revised DIP budget	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding explanation of Sandler O'Neill budgeted item	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding franchise taxes	0.30	B240	A106	142.50
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding 503(b)(9) motion	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with special counsel and counsel for Committee	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

		regarding execution of stipulation				
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding execution of stipulation by counsel for Committee and by special counsel	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding Jon Nash affidavit for Craig Geno retention	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding explanation of budgeted payment to Sandler O'Neill	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
03/09/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding approved DIP budget	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
03/09/15	SWR	Telephone conferences and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding approved DIP budget and motion to extend interim DIP Order	0.70	B230	A107	332.50
03/09/15	ТМН	Draft motion to extend banking arrangement and related review of correspondence and prior pleadings.	2.10	B110	A103	388.50
03/09/15	TMH	Review schedules D and H and correspond with R. Kerley	0.80	B110	A104	148.00
03/09/15	TMH	Review/analyze proposed changes to NDA provided by TPG	0.70	B110	A104	129.50
03/09/15	VGJ	Revisions to Motion to Waive Requirementsof Section 345	0.20	B110	A103	32.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Receipt and review of Redemption Statements from Jackson County on each parcel of property	0.50	B110	A104	80.00

03/09/15	VGJ	Receipt and review of Notice of Deficiency from Court re Application to Employ Craig Geno, search court docket for same and email Court re same	0.50	B110	A104	80.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Correspondence with R. Kerley re amended schedules	0.10	B110	A106	16.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Correspondence with R. Kerley re Amended Summary of Schedules, Amended Schedule D and G	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Work on establishing secure credentials for additional users to Data Room	0.40	B110	A110	64.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on review of recent ECF Notices.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Finalize Proposed Agreed Order for Extension of Time re Trammo's Claim and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Work on preparing materials for C. Maddux for hearings on DIP financing and interim compensation procedures.	0.20	B110	A111	32.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Prepare and finalize Notice of Filing of Amended Exhibit B to DIP Motion and electronically file same with Court	0.50	B110	A111	80.00
03/09/15	VGJ	Work on Amended Summary of Schedules, Amended Schedule D and G, and Amended Creditor Matrix for MPC, SATS, and ATS.	1.50	B110	A111	240.00

03/09/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Agreed Orders re Motions to Lift Stay of Scudder and Shumock and electronically submit same to Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Prepare for hearing on motion to approve interim compensation procedures	1.20	B160	A101	432.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Revise/finalize proposed order granting motion to approve interim compensation procedures	0.30	B160	A103	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Revise/finalize proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A103	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Review amended bid procedures and related revised sale timeline	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conferences with P. Murphy regarding orders on motions set for hearing on March 11, 2015	0.30	B110	A105	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with M. Caples regarding discussions with prospective bidders	0.30	B130	A105	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Internal conference regarding legal strategy and sale process	0.60	B130	A105	216.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with P. Murphy regarding preparation for hearing on motion to renew and extend DIP financing	0.20	B230	A105	72.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with management and Sandler O'Neill regarding sale process and requests from potential bidders	0.50	B130	A106	180.00
03/10/15	CHM	Telephone conference	0.40	B230	A106	144.00

		with Brandon Smith regarding preparation for hearing on motion to renew and extend DIP financing				
03/10/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding entry of order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.30	B230	A106	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding budget and tax matters	0.20	B240	A106	72.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Horne and Robert Kerley regarding franchise tax return	0.30	B240	A106	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with new prospective bidder and counsel regarding sale procedures, status of bankruptcy case and information in data room	1.00	B130	A107	360.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence (x18 e-mails) with counsel to DIP lenders, committee and UST	1.10	B160	A107	396.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding proposed order granting motion to approve interim compensation procedures	0.40	B160	A107	144.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding DIP funding and preparation of extended budget	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence (x10 e-mails) to counsel to DIP lenders, committee, EPA and	0.70	B230	A107	252.00

		MDEQ regarding approval of proposed order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order				
03/10/15	СНМ	Correspondence to counsel to EPA and MDEQ regarding entry of order granting motion to renew and extend interim DIP order	0.10	B230	A107	36.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding discussions with interested parties in the cases	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to committee regarding motion to establish procedures for presentation of 503(b)(9) claims	0.20	B310	A107	72.00
03/10/15	СНМ	Correspondence to DTBA regarding entry of order granting application to retain DTBA for provision of document management services	0.10	B160	A108	36.00
03/10/15	GCV	Review email correspondence re: payment of 401(k) trustee and administrator fees.	0.10	B220	A104	35.00
03/10/15	JMC	Correspondence with Jonathan Sholtis regarding proposed agreed order resolving motion to lift automatic stay.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
03/10/15	JMC	Correspondence with Shane Whitfield regarding agreed order resolving motion to lift automatic stay filed by Jerry Shumock.	0.30	B140	A107	57.00

03/10/15	MDC	Call with potential buyer	1.20	P230	A108	432.00
		regarding environmental issues				
03/10/15	PSM	Work on reviews and analysis of certain cases on allowing interim compensation procedures for certain professionals and make notes for possible testimony at upcoming hearing on Debtors' Motion.	1.20	B160	A101	342.00
03/10/15	PSM	Email exchanges with Chris Maddux, Steve Rosenblastt, Jon Nash and Brandon Smith re: strategy for hearings on Debtors' Motion for Renewal and Extension of Interim DIP Order and Debtors' Motion for Interim Compensation Procedures.	0.30	B160	A106	85.50
03/10/15	PSM	Call with Chris Maddux and Brandon Smith re: possible testimony at 3/11/15 hearing.	0.20	B190	A106	57.00
03/10/15	PSM	Work with Bankruptcy Court Deputy Clerk re: uploaded Agreed Orders and status of hearings on pending Motions and correspondence regarding same to all interest parties and counsel.	0.50	B190	A107	142.50
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Murphy regarding scheduled hearings on motion to renew and extend Interim DIP Order and interim compensation procedures motion	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding finalizing Order granting application to employ	0.20	B160	A105	95.00

03/10/15	SWR	DTBA for other services Correspondence with Michael Caples regarding	0.10	B210	A105	47.50
		today's numbers regarding daily rainfall reports and the freeboard status reports this week				
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding need for daily rainfall reports and the freeboard status reports this week	0.20	B210	A105	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with Robert Kerley regarding payment of franchise taxes	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with CRO and investment banker regarding response to potential buyer and request for additional due diligence	0.50	B130	A106	237.50
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding order granting motion to renew and extend Interim DIP Order	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Derek Meek regarding 503(b)(9) motion	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence and telephone conference with counsel for prospective buyer regarding additional due diligence on facility	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding Jon Nash affidavit and Motley Rice retention	0.20	B160	A107	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		counsel for affected parties regarding proposed Order granting motion for administrative order on interim compensation for professional fees				
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long of DOJ regarding daily rainfall reports and the freeboard status reports	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Telephone conference with counsel for DIP Lenders and Chris Maddux regarding liquidation plan	0.20	B320	A107	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Bryan Foster regarding escrow agreement for DTBA for interim professional fees	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with investment banker regarding scheduling of a call with an interested party	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/10/15	SWR	Correspondence with Aaron Samuels of Horne regarding franchise taxes	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
03/10/15	TMH	Revise/finalize NDA with TPG.	0.30	B110	A103	55.50
03/10/15	VGJ	Correspondence with S. Rosenblatt re Affidavits re Craig Geno and Motley Rice Applications	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Conference with C. Maddux re pleadings for hearing notebook on Wednesday	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Work on establishing secure credentials for additional users to Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize Affidavits of Jon	0.40	B110	A111	64.00

		Nash for Geno Application and Motley Application and electronically file same with Court				
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Order Granting Renew and Extension of DIP Order and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Work on assembling preparation materials for C. Maddux for 3/11/15 - Motion to Renew and Extend DIP Order and Motion to Establish Procedure for Compensation	0.80	B110	A111	128.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Orders approving the Geno Application and Deloitte Application and electronically file same with Court	0.40	B110	A111	64.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize 21 Day Notice to Application for Authority to Retain and Employ Certain Professionals	0.20	B110	A111	32.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Agreed Order Resolving Motion to Lift Stay and electronically file same	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/10/15	VGJ	Finalize Affidavit of BMC re service of Notice of Filing Amended Exhibit "B" to DIP Motion and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Revise proposed order granting motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.50	B110	A103	180.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Review/analyze order in Delaware case in connection with revision	0.40	B110	A104	144.00

		of order granting motion to establish interim compensation procedures				
03/11/15	СНМ	Review memorandum regarding hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.20	B110	A104	72.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with S. Rosenblatt regarding hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.50	B110	A105	180.00
03/11/15	CHM	Telephone conference with Jon Nash regarding hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.40	B110	A106	144.00
03/11/15	CHM	Telephone conference with Brandon smith regarding status of preparation of January and February 2015 MORs	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Meeting with Brandon Smith and P. Murphy regarding preparation for hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.40	B110	A106	144.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone call with Jon Nash regarding sale process	0.30	B130	A106	108.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Correspondence among management and Sandler O'Neill regarding sale process matters	0.20	B130	A106	72.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding status of operations	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding status of DIP funding and use of same	0.30	B230	A106	108.00

03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding proposed order granting motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.30	B110	A107	108.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Correspondence to UST and counsel to committee and DIP lenders regarding proposed order granting motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.20	B110	A107	72.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with counsel to DIP lenders regarding status of DIP funding	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to DIP lenders and management regarding extension of deadlines and status of DIP funding	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures	1.30	B110	A109	468.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Return travel to Jackson from Gulfport from hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures (1/2 time)	1.50	B110	A112	540.00
03/11/15	СНМ	Travel to Gulfport for hearing on motion to establish interim compensation procedures (1/2 time)	1.50	B110	A112	540.00
03/11/15	GCV	Conference with Chris Maddux and email correspondence to Robert Kerley re: payment of plan administrative	0.10	B220	A106	35.00

03/11/15	MCA	expenses. Correspondence with J. Campbell of AIG re: Kristofer Steel case	0.20	B190	A108	48.00
03/11/15	PSM	Meet with client, Brandon Smith and Chris Maddux to discuss and prepare for hearing on Debtors' Motion for Interim Compensation Procedures.	0.50	B110	A101	142.50
03/11/15	PSM	Work on drafting Order on Debtors' Motion for Interim Compensation Procedures.	2.50	B110	A103	712.50
03/11/15	PSM	Draft and circulate status report re: hearing and ruling on Debtors' Motion for Interim Compensation Procedures.	1.00	B110	A103	285.00
03/11/15	PSM	Attend hearing on Debtors' Motion for interim compensation procedures and make notes for preparing agreed order.	1.00	B110	A109	285.00
03/11/15	SWR	Review memo of Court's ruling and inquiries on motion for administrative order	0.20	B110	A104	95.00
03/11/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Chris Maddux regarding hearing on motion for administrative order establishing procedures for interim compensation	0.40	B110	A105	190.00
03/11/15	SWR	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding monthly operating reports	0.10	B110	A106	47.50
03/11/15	SWR	Review correspondence with management and DIP lender regarding funding for DIP loan	0.20	B230	A106	95.00
03/11/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B160	A107	95.00

		Slate Dabney regarding status report on Motley Rice retention order				
03/11/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding extension of challenge period deadline and complaint response deadline	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/11/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, Committee and DIP lender regarding extension of challenge period and time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.30	B230	A107	142.50
03/11/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on recent ECF Notices.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/11/15	VGJ	Manage documents in Firm Ex data room and establish secure credentials for additional users.	0.40	B110	A110	64.00
03/11/15	VGJ	Correspondence with BNC re returned mail to Debtors, research new address, prepare a Notice of Change of Address for same and electronically file with the Court	1.80	B110	A111	288.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Review narrative statement for January MORs and information supplied for January MORs	0.60	B110	A104	216.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from Sandler O'Neill regarding sales process	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Review/analyze order authorizing retention of Deloitte for CRO services	0.20	B160	A104	72.00

03/12/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with M. Carrington regarding responses to creditor inquiries	0.20	B150	A105	72.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding preparation of MORs	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with management regarding DIP budget and funding with respect to same	0.30	B230	A106	108.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Correspondence among counsel to committee and DIP lenders and UST regarding proposed order granting motion to establish interim compensation procedures	0.30	B110	A107	108.00
03/12/15	СНМ	Correspondence with counsel to DIP lenders regarding extension of deadlines	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
03/12/15	GCV	Review plan document and email correspondence re: payment of fees.	0.30	B220	A104	105.00
03/12/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of amended order authorizing the Debtors' retention of DTBA and Jon Nash as CRO and interim fee procedures order to determine DTBA's obligations under same.	0.60	B110	A104	114.00
03/12/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of Debtors' retention agreement concerning CTEH.	1.10	B110	A104	209.00
03/12/15	JMC	Work on correspondence to JPMS Cox, PLLC, auditors of CTEH, regarding amounts the Debtors owe to CTEH.	0.50	B110	A108	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Work on narrative for	1.40	B110	A103	665.00

		February monthly operating report				
03/12/15	SWR	Begin work on application of Butler Snow for compensation and reimbursement of expenses	0.80	B160	A103	380.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Sai Ireland regarding escrow agreement for unsecured creditors committee's professionals	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Butler Snow team regarding response to creditor inquiry regarding amount of debt owed	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding January monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding requirements for application for compensation for CRO	0.20	B160	A106	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Derek Meek regarding preparation of 503(b)(9) proof of claim form	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long of DOJ regarding extension of challenge period	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding parties subject to revised proposed Order on motion for administrative order on interim compensation for professionals	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with	0.30	B110	A107	142.50

		counsel for Committee regarding 503(b)(9) motion				
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding status of cash management order	0.10	B110	A107	47.50
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding request for extension for Debtors to file a response to the declaratory judgment complaint filed by DIP lenders	0.20	L210	A107	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung and Jon Nash regarding update on negotiations with potential buyer	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/12/15	SWR	Correspondence with Arthur J. Gallagher regarding extension of insurance policies	0.20	B210	A108	95.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with C. Maddux re monthly operating reports	0.10	B110	A105	16.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with S. Rosenblatt re 9019 Motion notice and hearing	0.20	B110	A105	32.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Coordinate and calendar dates for Butler Snow team based on review of recent ECF Notices.	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Finalize proposed Agreed Order Granting Motion to Approve Interim Compensation Procedures and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Work on list of properties owned with redemption amounts for 2012 and 2013 for each	2.30	B110	A111	368.00
03/12/15	VGJ	Finalize January 2015	0.80	B110	A111	128.00

		Monthly Operating Reports for MPC and				
		ATS and electronically file same with Court				
03/13/15	СНМ	Review January MOR for SATS	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Review application for 503(b)(9) claim filed by Bastech	0.60	B110	A104	216.00
03/13/15	CHM	Review correspondence with counsel to parties regarding finalizing amended bid procedures order	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Review objection to motion to determine cure notice filed by Alabama Electric Motor Services	0.30	B185	A104	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Review proposed revisions of committee counsel to motion to establish 503(b)(9) procedures	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from counsel to SULCOM and related proof of claim	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Review application for 503(b)(9) claim filed by Bastech	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Telephone conference with M. Carrington regarding orders previously entered in case and effect of same	0.30	B110	A105	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Prepare for and participate in telephone conversation with S. Rosenblatt regarding operational matters	0.30	B210	A105	108.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding preparation of monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
03/13/15	CHM	Prepare for and	0.80	B110	A107	288.00

		participate in status call with DOJ, EPA and MDEQ				
03/13/15	CHM	Correspondence from counsel to creditor regarding letter agreement for provision of post-petition services	0.20	B150	A107	72.00
03/13/15	СНМ	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding motion to establish 503(b)(9) procedures	0.20	B310	A107	72.00
03/13/15	GCV	Review email correspondence and conference with Chris Maddux re: payment of fees from plan.	0.30	B220	A105	105.00
03/13/15	JMC	Correspondence with Brandon Smith regarding amended order authorizing the Debtors' retention of DTBA and Jon Nash as CRO and interim fee procedures order to determine DTBA's obligations under same.	0.40	B110	A106	76.00
03/13/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux regarding procedure application for compensation for CRO	0.20	B160	A105	95.00
03/13/15	SWR	Telephone conference with CRO regarding cash management order and impact on cash management operations	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/13/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Velvet Johnson regarding filing of January monthly operating reports	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
03/13/15	SWR	Correspondence with Steven Bryant regarding Brock Services matter	0.20	B110	A107	95.00

03/13/15	SWR	Weekly conference call with EPA and MDEQ, CRO and Debtors' counsel regarding environmental matters and developments in case	0.70	B110	A107	332.50
03/13/15	SWR	Conference with Ken Long regarding status of case and course of action regarding environmental issues, sales process, extension of challenge period and inspection of documents	0.80	B110	A107	380.00
03/13/15	SWR	Correspondence with certain counsel as signatories to amended bidding and sales procedures order regarding approval of same	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
03/13/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding dates in sales process	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
03/13/15	SWR	Correspondence with Kyle McCulloch regarding environmental update	0.10	B210	A108	47.50
03/13/15	VGJ	Finalize January 2015 Monthly Operating Reports for SATS and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
03/14/15	SWR	Review revised 503(b)(9) motion, proof of claim and proposed Order received from Derek Meek	0.30	B110	A104	142.50
03/15/15	GCV	Correspondence re: strategy for payment of fees relating to 401(k) plan and calculation of same.	0.30	B220	A106	105.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review draft of narrative for inclusion with	0.30	B110	A104	108.00

03/16/15	СНМ	February MOR Review Trammo objection to motion to	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
02/16/15	CHM	determine cure amounts	0.20	D120	A 104	72.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review Mississippi Ammonia Leasing objection to motion to determine cure amounts	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review correspondence with committee counsel regarding motion to determine cure amounts	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review response to motion to determine cure amounts filed by ACE American Insurance	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review objection to motion to determine cure amounts filed by Brock Services	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review correspondence from counsel to BP Energy regarding motion to determine cure amounts	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review/analyze objection of SULCOM to motion to determine cure amounts and supporting documents	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review motion to lift stay filed by Caterpillar Financial	0.30	B140	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review/analyze provisions of lease between the debtors and Mississippi Ammonia Leasing	0.50	B210	A104	180.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review proposed agreed orders extending deadlines	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review/analyze objection to rule 9019 motion filed by du Pont and related review of other	0.50	B310	A104	180.00

03/16/15	СНМ	referenced pleadings Review revisions to motion to establish procedures for the assertion of 503(b)(9) claims and related correspondence	0.30	B310	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Review/analyze potential confirmation schedule and projected timelines	0.30	B320	A104	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding motion to lift stay filed by Caterpillar Financial	0.20	B140	A106	72.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Correspondence with management regarding Mississippi Power rate increase and impact on budget	0.40	B210	A106	144.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence with management regarding preparation of budget and assumptions included in same	0.50	B210	A106	180.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence with counsel to Brock Services regarding objection to motion to determine cure amounts and hearing with respect to same	0.60	B130	A107	216.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence among counsel regarding finalizing amended bid procedures	0.30	B130	A107	108.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Multiple correspondence among counsel regarding extension of challenge period and other deadlines	0.40	B230	A107	144.00
03/16/15	СНМ	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding parties interested in participating in sales process	0.20	B130	A108	72.00

03/16/15	DBC	Conference with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux regarding amendments to Trammo	0.40	B250	A105	198.00
03/16/15	JMC	Ammonia Tank Lease. Work on motion of the Debtors for status conference pursuant to section 105(d) of the Bankruptcy Code.	1.00	B110	A103	190.00
03/16/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of motion to lift automatic stay filed by Caterpillar Financial Services.	0.90	B140	A104	171.00
03/16/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of correspondence and documents attached to same regarding settlement of Kristofer Steel.	0.60	B190	A104	114.00
03/16/15	SWR	Finalize motion for 503(b)(9) procedures	0.80	B110	A103	380.00
03/16/15	SWR	Work on confirmation timetable (assuming consensual plan and disclosure statement)	0.70	B110	A103	332.50
03/16/15	SWR	Revise order granting 503(b)(9) motion to accommodate changes requested by unsecured creditors committee	0.40	B110	A103	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Review and finalize notice of 503(b)(9) motion	0.30	B110	A103	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Work on narrative for February monthly operating report	0.80	B110	A103	380.00
03/16/15	SWR	Finalize amended bid procedures order	0.50	B130	A103	237.50
03/16/15	SWR	Prepare order granting additional time to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.40	B190	A103	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Prepare notice of Debtors'	0.40	B230	A103	190.00

		agreement to extend the deadline for Challenge Period				
03/16/15	SWR	Prepare agreed order granting additional time for Debtors to respond to Complaint in adversary proceeding filed by agent for DIP lenders	0.40	L210	A103	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Revise order granting additional time for Debtors to respond to Complaint	0.30	L210	A103	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Work on projected budget for administration and exit costs for CRO	0.40	B110	A104	190.00
03/16/15	SWR	Review motion to lift automatic stay filed by Caterpillar Finance	0.20	B140	A104	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Review limited objections of SULCOM and Brock Services to cure amount motion	0.30	B185	A104	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Review reservation of rights of Ace Insurance Company to cure motion	0.20	B185	A104	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Review objections of Trammo and Mississippi Ammonia Leasing to cure amount motion	0.30	B185	A104	142.50
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding notice of extension of Challenge Period and uploading agreed orders for extensions	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding objections by counterparties to cure amount motion and requests for continuance of hearing	0.20	B185	A105	95.00
03/16/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B230	A105	95.00