

**Exhibit "A-3"**

*Invoice for May 1 – 31, 2015*



Post Office Box 6010  
Ridgeland, MS 39158-6010  
Main (601) 948-5711  
Fax (601) 985-4500

---

Robert Kerley  
Mississippi Phosphates Corporation  
P.O. Box 848  
Pascagoula, MS 39568-0848

June 12, 2015  
Statement: 10075851  
Matter: 027376.149010  
Billing Attorney: Steve Rosenblatt

Due Date: June 27, 2015

**STATEMENT SUMMARY**

For Services Rendered Through May 31, 2015

**Client:** Mississippi Phosphates Corporation

**Matter:** Chapter 11 for Mississippi Phosphates Corporation and Subsidiaries

<b>TOTAL FEES FOR CURRENT BILLING PERIOD</b>	<b>\$192,754.50</b>
<b>TOTAL COSTS FOR CURRENT BILLING PERIOD</b>	<b>\$3,215.06</b>
<b>TOTAL CURRENT BILLING FOR THIS MATTER</b>	<b>\$195,969.56</b>
Total of Unpaid Balances From Prior Statements*	\$72,398.87
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS MATTER</b>	<b>\$268,368.43</b>



Post Office Box 6010  
Ridgeland, MS 39158-6010  
Main (601) 948-5711  
Fax (601) 985-4500

Robert Kerley  
Mississippi Phosphates Corporation  
P.O. Box 848  
Pascagoula, MS 39568-0848

June 12, 2015  
Statement: 10075851  
Matter: 027376.149010  
Billing Attorney: Steve Rosenblatt

Due Date: June 27, 2015

**STATEMENT**

For Services Rendered Through May 31, 2015

**Client:** Mississippi Phosphates Corporation

**Matter:** Chapter 11 for Mississippi Phosphates Corporation and Subsidiaries

**PROFESSIONAL FEES**

<u>DATE</u>		<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>TASK</u>	<u>ACTIVITY</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/01/15	AML	Draft pleadings with respect to case administrative matters	2.20	B110	A103	418.00
05/01/15	CHM	Review motion of debtors for relief from certain UST guidelines	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/01/15	CHM	Review order granting Capstone fee application	0.20	B160	A104	72.00
05/01/15	MDC	Call with Environ to discuss capex budget for environmental projects	1.50	P230	A108	540.00
05/01/15	MDC	Meeting with Rick Sumrall at MDEQ to discuss solid waste issues	0.50	P230	A108	180.00
05/01/15	MDD	Confer with S. Rosenblatt re amended and restated certificate of incorporation	0.20	P200	A105	36.00
05/01/15	SWR	Finalize motion for Debtors to retain ordinary course professionals	0.90	B160	A103	427.50
05/01/15	SWR	Review and finalize notice of motion for retention of ordinary course professionals	0.20	B160	A103	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Revise agreed order on fee application	0.20	B160	A103	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Finalize motion for relief	0.90	B210	A103	427.50

---

		from United States Trustee operating guidelines				
05/01/15	SWR	Finalize notice of motion on relief from United States Trustee operational guidelines	0.20	B210	A103	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Adam Langley regarding work on motions to dismiss and convert	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Marcie Davant regarding articles of incorporation of Mississippi Phosphates	0.20	B120	A105	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Michael Caples and Kyle McCullouch regarding weekly report on key indicators at facility	0.30	B210	A105	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding summary of protective BP claims prepared by Motley Rice	0.30	B120	A106	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Telephone conferences with Jon Nash regarding various pending matters, including BP claim, casualty insurance and ordinary course professionals motion	0.70	B120	A106	332.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding status of casualty insurance matter	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding timing of filing protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding articles of incorporation for Mississippi Phosphates	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Conference call with Slate Dabney and counsel	0.50	B120	A107	237.50

---

		for DIP Lenders regarding BP claim				
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding proposed agreed order on Butler Snow fee application	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Karl Burrer regarding hearing on Rule 9019 and update on operational issues	0.50	B190	A107	237.50
05/01/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Derek Meek regarding casualty insurance motion	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Chris Steiskal regarding casualty insurance	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding weekly call	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding motion for relief from casualty insurance requirement of United States Trustee operating guidelines	0.20	B210	A107	95.00
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Horne and Karl Steinberger regarding ordinary course professionals motion and Rule 2014 statement	0.30	B160	A108	142.50
05/01/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding language in motion for relief from United States Trustee guidelines regarding valuation	0.30	B210	A108	142.50
05/01/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for objection to cure	0.20	B310	A103	37.00

---

		amount by Brock Services				
05/01/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for objection to cure amount by Trammo	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
05/01/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for objection to cure amount by SULCOM	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
05/01/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for objection to cure amount by Alabama Electric	0.20	B310	A103	37.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Emails with S. Rosenblatt re thumb drive of all bankruptcy pleadings	0.10	B110	A105	16.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with BMC Group re mail out of Notice and Motion for Relief	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Emails with W. Watson (Court) re Application to Employ and 21 Day Notice	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Add additional users to the Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Finalize Motion for Relief from US Trustee Guidelines and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order Granting First Application of Butler Snow, et al. and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Prepare 21 Day Notice for Motion for Relief and electronically file same with Court	0.70	B110	A111	112.00
05/01/15	VGJ	Finalize the Application	0.60	B110	A111	96.00

---

		to Retain and Employ Certain Professionals and 21 Day Notice and electronically file same with court				
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding response to request from creditor to be removed from shortened notice list	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding entry of agreed order extending deadline of Debtors to respond to Complaint filed by Agent for DIP lenders	0.20	B190	A105	95.00
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt review 503(b)(9) claim of BP Energy	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding response to proof of claim of EPA and MDEQ	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding postage meter	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/02/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding status of Wabash claim and course of action	0.30	B310	A106	142.50
05/02/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Innophos regarding extension of bid deadline and auction	0.20	B130	A107	95.00
05/03/15	MDC	Emails with De Jong concerning secondary liners and meeting with EPA in Atlanta	0.80	P230	A107	288.00
05/04/15	CHM	Legal and factual research regarding issues raised in proofs of claim	1.10	B310	A102	396.00

---

		filed by the governments				
05/04/15	CHM	Review draft narrative for April 2015 MOR	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review March 2015 MOR and correspondence regarding same	0.30	B110	A104	108.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review memorandum from Sandler O'Neill regarding discussions with prospective bidders and status of same	0.30	B130	A104	108.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review correspondence regarding status of objections to motion to determine cure amounts	0.20	B130	A104	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review motion to extend time filed by office of the UST with respect to Burr & Forman fee application	0.10	B160	A104	36.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review portions of transcript from hearing on motion to assume Merchants lease	1.10	B190	A104	396.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review FSNA application for administrative expense claim and analyze components of response to same	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review/analyze proofs of claim filed by the governments	0.90	B310	A104	324.00
05/04/15	CHM	Review draft stipulation concerning BP 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Internal conferences regarding legal strategy with respect to pending matters in the chapter 11 cases	0.70	B110	A105	252.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence regarding creditor inquiries	0.20	B150	A105	72.00



---

05/04/15	CHM	Office conference with S. Rosenblatt regarding next steps and course of action with respect to motion to assume Merchants lease	0.40	B190	A105	144.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding request for return of collateral	0.20	B110	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding DTBA escrow account	0.20	B160	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Wabash Power agreed order and next steps with respect to same	0.20	B185	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Mississippi Power payment	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding amendments to Trammo lease	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence regarding BP 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A106	72.00
05/04/15	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to claimants regarding information request	0.30	B150	A107	108.00
05/04/15	CHM	Multiple correspondence with counsel regarding post-hearing briefing schedule in connection with motion to assume Merchants lease	0.40	B190	A107	144.00
05/04/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising objections of the Debtors to the proofs of claim filed by the EPA and MDEQ.	3.10	B310	A103	589.00
05/04/15	JMC	Work on finalizing and compiling documents and	0.40	B110	A104	76.00

---

		other items in connection with the DTBA escrow account.				
05/04/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain authorities and relevant documents in connection with the proofs of claim filed by the EPA and MDEQ.	1.20	B310	A104	228.00
05/04/15	JMC	Work with Velvet Johnson on Cat Financial agreed order and status of same.	0.10	B140	A105	19.00
05/04/15	JMC	Correspondence with Brandon Smith, Jon Nash and Butler Snow team regarding DTBA escrow account.	0.70	B110	A106	133.00
05/04/15	JMC	Correspondence with Sterling Kidd regarding proposed agreed order resolving motion of Cat Financial.	0.10	B140	A107	19.00
05/04/15	JMC	Correspondence with Mabelle Anthony regarding tax ID numbers in connection with the DTBA escrow account.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
05/04/15	JMC	Call with Mabelle Anthony regarding DTBA escrow account.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
05/04/15	JMC	Call and follow up correspondence with Mabelle Anthony regarding the DTBA escrow account.	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
05/04/15	MDC	Communication with de Jong on environmental issues, meeting with EPA, documents on water balance	3.80	P230	A107	1,368.00
05/04/15	SWR	Work on narrative for April monthly operating report	0.70	B110	A103	332.50

---

05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) claim of BP Energy	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
05/04/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with Jon Nash regarding status report on developments in case and discussion of course of action	0.40	B110	A106	190.00
05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding Mississippi Power Company billings	0.20	B140	A106	95.00
05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Jon Nash regarding update on negotiations with Trammo regarding terminalling operations	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Paul Delcambre regarding monthly billing for Mississippi Power Company charges	0.20	B140	A107	95.00
05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding update on sales process for monthly operating report	0.30	B130	A108	142.50
05/04/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung and Michael Caples regarding De Jong environmental questions and requests	0.20	B130	A108	95.00
05/04/15	TMH	Draft stipulation for BP 503(b)(9) claim	2.40	B310	A103	444.00
05/04/15	TMH	Analyze BP claim in light of 503(b)(9) stipulation	0.20	B310	A104	37.00
05/04/15	TMH	Analyze Trammo's objection to the cure amount with consideration given to the 503(b)(9) stipulation with calculation of claim total	0.30	B310	A104	55.50
05/04/15	TMH	Review BP 503(b)(9)	0.60	B310	A104	111.00

---

		claim				
05/04/15	TMH	Correspondence with CRO, CFO regarding 503(b)(9) claim of BP	0.10	B310	A106	18.50
05/04/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley regarding BP claim objection	0.20	B310	A106	37.00
05/04/15	TMH	Correspondence with counsel to Trammo regarding its objection to the cure amount with consideration given to the 503(b)(9) stipulation with calculation of claim total	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/04/15	VGJ	Telephone conference and several emails with Wanda Watson re status of Dkt. 512	0.40	B110	A108	64.00
05/04/15	VGJ	Correspondence with Wanda Watson (Court) re status of Agreed Order to Dkt 601	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
05/04/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/05/15	CHM	Legal and factual research regarding environmental issues in other chapter 11 cases	0.50	B110	A102	180.00
05/05/15	CHM	Review correspondence with office of UST regarding payment of quarterly fees	0.20	B110	A104	72.00
05/05/15	CHM	Review draft of agreed order setting hearing on du Pont 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A104	72.00
05/05/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding transition of bank accounts	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/05/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding retention of Horne to perform audit of 401(k) plan	0.20	B220	A106	72.00

---

05/05/15	CHM	Correspondence with counsel regarding extension of response deadline to the 9019 motion	0.20	B110	A107	72.00
05/05/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising objections of the Debtors to the proofs of claim filed by certain creditors	3.10	B310	A103	589.00
05/05/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain statutes and secondary materials in connection with the objections of the Debtor to the proofs of claim filed by the EPA and MDEQ.	2.10	B310	A104	399.00
05/05/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt and Chris Maddux on issues in connection with the Debtors' objections to the proofs of claim filed by certain creditors	0.40	B310	A105	76.00
05/05/15	MDC	Research on deep well injection for process wastewater; research on water balance documents and gypsum stack acreage for EPA	3.60	P230	A102	1,296.00
05/05/15	MDC	Call with Sunny Cheung regarding EPA discussion and De Jong offer	0.80	P230	A106	288.00
05/05/15	SWR	Research and review a recent environmental pleading in another bankruptcy case	0.40	B310	A102	190.00
05/05/15	SWR	Review DIP cash flow budget for May	0.30	B210	A104	142.50
05/05/15	SWR	Conference with Chris Maddux and Mitch Carrington regarding outline objections to proofs of claim of EPA	0.30	B310	A105	142.50

---

		and MDEQ				
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding review of proposed stipulation regarding timetable for DuPont 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and CRO regarding payment of first quarter's United States Trustee fees	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding report on status of closing bank accounts	0.20	B110	A106	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Robert Kerley regarding retention of Horne to perform 401(k) audit work	0.30	B160	A106	142.50
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding motion for relief from the UST Operating Guidelines with respect to maintaining casualty insurance on the Debtors' property	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Jon Nash regarding comparable compensation discussion	0.20	B210	A106	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) claim of BP Energy	0.20	B310	A106	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding report on timeline for closing bank accounts with Wells Fargo	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference	0.20	B190	A107	95.00

---

		with Karl Burrel regarding request for extension of time to respond to Rule 9019 motion				
05/05/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding extension for Governments to respond to Rule 9019 motion	0.40	B190	A107	190.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA, DIP lender and unsecured creditors committee regarding confirmation of extension of deadline	0.20	B190	A107	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding stipulation for DuPont 503(b)(9) claim process	0.20	B310	A107	95.00
05/05/15	SWR	Correspondence with United States Trustee regarding payment of quarterly United States Trustee fees for first quarter of 2015	0.30	B110	A108	142.50
05/05/15	TDF	Review relevant Miss. Power documents.	0.80	R501	A104	388.00
05/05/15	TDF	Internal communications with M. Caples.	0.10	R802	A105	48.50
05/05/15	TDF	Meeting with Jimmy Sparks on Miss Power injection documents.	0.90	R802	A108	436.50
05/05/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order sent by Dupont to extend deadline to respond to MPC objection to 503(b)(9) claim	1.00	B310	A103	185.00
05/05/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for Trammo's remaining Objection to Cure Amount after filing the Agreed Order for Trammo's 503(b)(9)	2.30	B310	A103	425.50

---

		claim				
05/05/15	TMH	Correspondence with R. Kerley and Deloitte regarding status of 503(b)(9) claims and cure amounts	0.20	B310	A106	37.00
05/05/15	TMH	Correspondence with BP counsel regarding approval of joint stipulation regarding BP's 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/05/15	TMH	Correspondence with Alabama Electric Power's counsel regarding 503(b)(9)claim	0.30	B310	A107	55.50
05/05/15	TMH	Correspondence with J. O'Mara regarding Trammo's cure objection and 503(b)(9) claim	0.40	B310	A107	74.00
05/05/15	VGJ	Add additional users to Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00
05/05/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/05/15	VGJ	Receipt of Affidavits of Service from BMC Group, finalize and electronically file same with Court	0.40	B110	A111	64.00
05/06/15	CHM	Review/revise April monthly statement	1.40	B160	A103	504.00
05/06/15	CHM	Review/analyze draft term sheet prepared by DOJ/EPA and the lenders and related documents and correspondence	1.10	B110	A104	396.00
05/06/15	CHM	Review/analyze summary of proposed revised sales timeline and revised sales procedures and related documents and correspondence	0.80	B130	A104	288.00
05/06/15	CHM	Review DIP actual to budget variance	0.20	B230	A104	72.00



---

05/06/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding cash management issues	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
05/06/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with management regarding status of discussions between the lenders and the DOJ/EPA	0.50	B230	A106	180.00
05/06/15	CHM	E-mails with counsel to certain former employees regarding information requests	0.20	B150	A107	72.00
05/06/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to DIP lenders regarding status of discussions between the lenders and the DOJ/EPA	0.70	B230	A107	252.00
05/06/15	JMC	Work on research regarding certain environmental issues in bankruptcy in connection with the proofs of claim of the EPA and MDEQ.	1.20	B310	A102	228.00
05/06/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising the objections of the Debtors to the proofs of claim of the EPA and MDEQ.	2.50	B310	A103	475.00
05/06/15	JMC	Work on review and analysis of certain environmental statutes and regulations in connection with the objections of the Debtors to the proofs of claim of certain creditors.	2.10	B310	A104	399.00
05/06/15	MDC	Document production to Jeff Civins on white papers by joint defense group on bevill amendment issues	0.40	P230	A103	144.00

---

05/06/15	MDC	Call with Environ (de Jong environmental) to discuss water balance issues; HF issues and other environmental related matters for meeting with EPA	2.40	P230	A108	864.00
05/06/15	SWR	Prepare updated sales process and timeline	1.30	B130	A103	617.50
05/06/15	SWR	Prepare summary of sales timeline	0.70	B130	A103	332.50
05/06/15	SWR	Prepare notice of extension of challenge period by one day to May 8	0.20	B230	A103	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Finalize proposed Agreed Order on procedures for DuPont's 503(b)(9) claim	0.40	B310	A103	190.00
05/06/15	SWR	Review budget-to-actual comparison for DIP budget	0.30	B230	A104	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding filing of notice of extension of challenge period	0.20	B110	A105	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding BP Energy 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley and CRO regarding closing of pre-petition bank accounts	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding payments to professional fees escrow account for Committee's professionals	0.30	B110	A106	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Sandler O'Neill regarding proposed timeline for sales process	0.30	B130	A106	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Conference call with Jon Nash regarding report on	0.40	B130	A106	190.00

---

		call with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding settlement conferences with Governments and impact on sales process				
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with notice parties regarding March statement for services and expenses	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding report on settlement conferences with Governments and need for revised sales timeline	0.40	B110	A107	190.00
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Chris Steiskal regarding closing of pre-petition bank accounts	0.10	B110	A107	47.50
05/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Craig Geno regarding status of BP claim	0.30	B120	A107	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Steinberger regarding retention as ordinary course professionals and questions about Rule 2014 statement	0.30	B160	A107	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding status of upcoming hearing dates	0.20	B190	A107	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for PHI regarding noticing issue	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Ken Long regarding request to extend challenge period by one day	0.20	B230	A107	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Burrer regarding conference call to discuss	0.30	B230	A107	142.50

---

		status of settlement discussions with Governments				
05/06/15	SWR	Correspondence with Leslie Heilman regarding 503(b)(9) procedures for DuPont claim	0.20	B310	A107	95.00
05/06/15	SWR	Telephone conference with Sunny Cheung regarding impact of proposed timeline on sales process and related matters	0.40	B130	A108	190.00
05/06/15	TDF	Follow up discussion with Jimmy Sparks at his request on drilling logs for Miss. Power well.	0.60	R802	A108	291.00
05/06/15	TMH	Research interim consent decree for Sandler O'Neill	0.50	B310	A102	92.50
05/06/15	TMH	Work on joint stipulation for Alabama Electric for 503(b)(9) claim	1.30	B310	A103	240.50
05/06/15	TMH	Work on joint stipulation with BP to incorporate edits from BP counsel	0.90	B310	A103	166.50
05/06/15	TMH	Work on agreed order resolving objection of Trammo to cure amount	0.90	B310	A103	166.50
05/06/15	TMH	Correspondence with BP Counsel regarding stipulation	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/06/15	TMH	Correspondence with Trammo Counsel regarding stipulation	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/06/15	TMH	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding interim consent decree	0.30	B110	A108	55.50
05/06/15	VGJ	Correspondence with B. Daniel with BMC re adding additional people to shortened service list	0.20	B110	A108	32.00
05/06/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for	0.20	B110	A110	32.00

---

		attorneys				
05/06/15	VGJ	Work with T. Hubey and T. Hewitt regarding Interim Consent Decrees and location in Data Room	1.50	B110	A110	240.00
05/07/15	CHM	Review/analyze summary of proposed revised sales timeline and revised sales procedures and related comments from counsel to parties	0.40	B130	A104	144.00
05/07/15	CHM	Review Trammo comments to draft letter agreement with respect to lease modification	0.30	B210	A104	108.00
05/07/15	CHM	Review/analyze multiple drafts of settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments and related correspondence, documents and pleadings	1.60	B230	A104	576.00
05/07/15	CHM	Review/analyze file materials and proofs of claim regarding real and personal property taxes	0.50	B240	A104	180.00
05/07/15	CHM	Correspondence with management and Gallagher (x4 e-mails) regarding workers compensation, general liability and automobile policies	0.30	B210	A106	108.00
05/07/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding Trammo comments to draft letter agreement with respect to lease modification	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/07/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.40	B230	A106	144.00
05/07/15	CHM	Prepare for and	1.20	B230	A106	432.00

---

		participate in conference calls (x4) with CRO regarding settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments				
05/07/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding discussions with DOJ regarding environmental issues	0.20	B310	A106	72.00
05/07/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference calls (x2) with counsel to lenders regarding settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.90	B230	A107	324.00
05/07/15	CHM	Telephone conference with counsel to creditors regarding information request	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/07/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to the lenders and EPA regarding settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/07/15	CHM	Prepare for and participate in conference call with counsel to the committee regarding settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.50	B230	A107	180.00
05/07/15	DBC	Review revised Trammo ammonia tank lease letter agreement and email Steve Rosenblatt re: same.	0.40	B250	A104	198.00
05/07/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising the objections of the Debtors to the proofs of claim of certain creditors	3.00	B310	A103	570.00

---

05/07/15	JMC	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding DTBA escrow account and wire instructions.	0.20	B110	A106	38.00
05/07/15	JMC	Correspondence with Machel Anthony regarding the DTBA escrow account.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
05/07/15	JMC	Correspondence with Chris Brokmeier regarding DTBA escrow account.	0.20	B110	A108	38.00
05/07/15	MDC	Review of draft settlement term sheet between lenders and the governments	0.70	P230	A104	252.00
05/07/15	MDC	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with De Jong group to discuss water balance issues at the facility	2.50	P230	A107	900.00
05/07/15	MDC	Call with Lenders on draft settlement term sheet with the governments	1.00	P230	A108	360.00
05/07/15	SWR	Prepare and file notice of extension of challenge period	0.30	B110	A103	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Review and analyze draft potential settlement documents received from DOJ	0.40	B190	A104	190.00
05/07/15	SWR	Review and analyze latest draft of Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet	1.10	B190	A104	522.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Don Cannada regarding review of proposed changes to Trammo lease	0.20	B185	A105	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with James Tucker regarding draft agreements received from DOJ	0.20	B190	A105	95.00

---

05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Michael Caples regarding status of negotiations of Governments and Lenders	0.30	B190	A105	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding chart for ad valorem taxes on various parcels	0.30	B240	A105	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) claim of BP Energy	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding proposed changes to summary of sales process	0.20	B130	A106	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Multiple correspondence with CRO and management regarding response to last draft of letter agreement with Trammo	0.50	B185	A106	237.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding documents received from DOJ regarding possible resolutions	0.20	B190	A106	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference call with CRO and management regarding draft of Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.80	B190	A106	380.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO and Gallagher regarding workers compensation insurance premiums and extension	0.30	B210	A106	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding certification to Trustmark	0.20	B110	A107	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with	0.20	B110	A107	95.00



---

		Leslie Heilman regarding proposed order				
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Slate Dabney regarding review of protective BP claim prior to filing	0.20	B120	A107	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Karl Fingerhood of DOJ regarding revisions of summary of sales timeline	0.30	B130	A107	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding proposed Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet	0.50	B190	A107	237.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding request for comments on Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.20	B190	A107	95.00
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for PHI regarding insurance notice requirements	0.30	B210	A107	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding Governments-Lenders term sheet and impact on sales process	0.30	B130	A108	142.50
05/07/15	SWR	Correspondence with Gallagher and CRO regarding insurance financing orders	0.30	B210	A108	142.50
05/07/15	TMH	Work on BP joint stipulation to incorporate latest edits from BP	0.50	B310	A103	92.50
05/07/15	TMH	Correspondence with counsel for Brock Services regarding Agreed Order for cure amount	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/07/15	VGJ	Add additional users to the Data Room	0.50	B110	A110	80.00

---

05/07/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.20	B110	A110	32.00
05/07/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Agreement of Debtors to Extend Deadlines for Challenge Period and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/08/15	CHM	Review/analyze revisions to settlement agreement between lenders and the governments	0.80	B230	A104	288.00
05/08/15	CHM	Review comments to settlement term sheet	0.30	B230	A104	108.00
05/08/15	CHM	Review memorandum regarding status of ad valorem taxes	0.30	B240	A104	108.00
05/08/15	CHM	Review spreadsheet regarding ad valorem taxes	0.30	B240	A104	108.00
05/08/15	CHM	Review/analyze proofs of claim related to 503(b)(9) claims and related pleadings	0.50	B310	A104	180.00
05/08/15	CHM	Conference with M. Caples regarding discussions with prospective bidder	0.40	B130	A105	144.00
05/08/15	CHM	Correspondence with management regarding insurance policies and effective dates of same	0.20	B210	A106	72.00
05/08/15	CHM	Correspondence with counsel to lenders regarding preparation of settlement agreement	0.30	B230	A107	108.00
05/08/15	CHM	Correspondence with committee counsel regarding settlement term sheet	0.20	B230	A107	72.00
05/08/15	CHM	Correspondence with Sandler O'Neill regarding status of bids	0.20	B130	A108	72.00

---

05/08/15	JMC	Work on drafting and revising notice of status report regarding certain issues in the bankruptcy case.	3.70	B110	A103	703.00
05/08/15	JMC	Work on proposed order resetting sale hearing and objection deadline for same.	0.60	B230	A103	114.00
05/08/15	JMC	Work with Steve Rosenblatt on motion for status conference regarding certain outstanding issues in the bankruptcy case.	0.20	B110	A105	38.00
05/08/15	JMC	Prepare for and participate in call with the EPA and MDEQ regarding status of operations and other related matters.	0.70	B110	A107	133.00
05/08/15	JMC	Call with Machel Anthony regarding DTBA escrow account.	0.10	B110	A108	19.00
05/08/15	MDC	Call with EPA on operation issues and call with lenders regarding term sheet	1.50	P230	A108	540.00
05/08/15	MDC	Call with De Jong on follow up for EPA meeting	1.00	P230	A108	360.00
05/08/15	SAI	Work with Trustmark to resolve questions about deposit to escrow account for DTBA	0.80	B210	A108	272.00
05/08/15	SWR	Work on chart reflecting status of ad valorem taxes on various parcels of property for each tax year	0.40	B240	A103	190.00
05/08/15	SWR	Work on budget of estimated fees for May through September 2015	0.40	B110	A104	190.00
05/08/15	SWR	Review current KPIs (key performance indicators)	0.20	B210	A104	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Review agreed order with	0.20	B310	A104	95.00

---

		DuPont regarding hearing on 503(b)(9)claim objection				
05/08/15	SWR	Review materials regarding discharges into Bayou Casotte in August 2013 and February 2014	0.20	B310	A104	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding motion for status conference	0.30	B110	A105	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Velvet Johnson regarding request for insurance policy	0.10	B110	A105	47.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Mitch Carrington regarding drafting of order re-setting the sale hearing date to August 6	0.20	B130	A105	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence and conference with Thomas Hewitt regarding proposed order on Trammo 503(b)(9) claim	0.30	B310	A105	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding proposed agreed order on Brock Services cure amount	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding BMC comprehensive claims report	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Thomas Hewitt regarding 503(b)(9) claim of BP Energy	0.20	B310	A105	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding protective BP claim	0.20	B120	A106	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Robert Kerley regarding Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.20	B190	A106	95.00

---

05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with CRO regarding DIP budget though September	0.30	B230	A106	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Telephone conference and correspondence with CRO regarding treatment of pre-petition and post-petition ad valorem taxes	0.40	B240	A106	190.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, PHI, and DIP Lenders regarding PHI-proposed changes to Governments-Lenders term sheet	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for Committee regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet	0.30	B190	A107	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Conference call with counsel for EPA and MDEQ, DIP Lenders and Debtors regarding Governments-Lenders settlement term sheet and course of action	0.50	B190	A107	237.50
05/08/15	SWR	Weekly conference call counsel for EPA and MDEQ regarding environmental matters and developments in case	0.50	B210	A107	237.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding issues regarding treatment of real and personal ad valorem taxes on lenders' collateral	0.30	B240	A107	142.50
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with counsel for DIP Lenders regarding proof of claim filed by Jackson County	0.20	B310	A107	95.00
05/08/15	SWR	Correspondence with Sunny Cheung regarding	0.20	B130	A108	95.00

---

		update on sales process				
05/08/15	TMH	Research unpaid personal property taxes and dealing with collection agencies and payment payouts	1.80	B240	A102	333.00
05/08/15	TMH	Work on order to re-set Sale Hearing and Objection Deadline	0.10	B110	A103	18.50
05/08/15	TMH	Work on Agreed Order for Trammo's Cure Amount objection to incorporate Trammo's edits	1.30	B310	A103	240.50
05/08/15	TMH	Draft agreed order for Alabama Electric cure amount objection	0.70	B310	A103	129.50
05/08/15	TMH	Draft stipulation for Alabama Electric 503(b)(9) claim	1.10	B310	A103	203.50
05/08/15	TMH	Work on Dupont Agreed Order to encompass final revisions	0.50	B310	A103	92.50
05/08/15	TMH	Analyze 503(b)(9) claim filed by Alabama Electric	0.20	B310	A104	37.00
05/08/15	TMH	Correspondence with AL Electric counsel regarding withdrawal of extra claim	0.30	B310	A107	55.50
05/08/15	TMH	Correspondence with AL Electric's Counsel regarding stipulation of 503(b)(9) claim	0.20	B310	A107	37.00
05/08/15	TMH	Correspondence regarding wire for DTBA	0.20	B160	A108	37.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Office conference and several emails with S. Rosenblatt re Jackson County Ad Valorem Taxes	0.30	B110	A105	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Office conference and several emails with S. Rosenblatt re Insurance Policies	0.30	B110	A105	48.00

---

05/08/15	VGJ	Email correspondence with Cindy Pierce with Jackson County Chancery Court re copies of tax sale deeds and telephone conference with Debbie Gray re same	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Telephone conference with Jackson County Tax Collector's Office re personal and real property tax sales	0.30	B110	A108	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Retrieve copies of insurance policies for S. Rosenblatt	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Add additional insurance policies to the Data Room and update Insurance Chart with same	1.00	B110	A110	160.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Review of ECF Notices and calendar dates for attorneys	0.30	B110	A110	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Update and compare Tax Information with Proof of Claim filed by Jackson County Tax Collector	1.50	B110	A111	240.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Finalize Notice of Agreement to Extend Deadline for Investigation Termination Date and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/08/15	VGJ	Finalize Agreed Order With Respect to Motion of DuPont for Allowance of Administrative Expenses and electronically file same with Court	0.30	B110	A111	48.00
05/09/15	MDC	Review of MPC long mid and short term projects from EPA to De Jong	0.50	P230	A104	180.00
05/09/15	MDC	Prepare for and participate in conference call with De Jong to	1.40	P230	A108	504.00