

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey

Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

UNBILLED SERVICES

Date	Atty	Name	Hours	Rate	Value	Index	Description
B002 ASSET DISPOSITION							
11/19/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.10	290	29.00	11341425	Brief review of motion for filing (sell jet fuel)
11/19/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.40	290	116.00	11341428	Return telephone call to C. Jacobson regarding objection filed to sale motion and respond to parties related to telephonic hearing in New Albany
11/26/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.30	290	87.00	11360605	Review and respond to requests from potential asset purchasers
Total for B002			.80	232.00			
B003 BUSINESS OPERATIONS							
11/14/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.70	290	203.00	11333540	Attend to numerous emails related to discussion on San Antonio's aerospace motion for preliminary injunction and forward to H&B and communicate with M. Hile
Total for B003			.70	203.00			
B004 CASE ADMINISTRATION							
11/03/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11310839	Attend to ATA agenda review
11/03/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.10	290	29.00	11310857	Attend to filing of 5th Supplemental OCP
11/05/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.50	290	145.00	11310093	Telephone call with R. Moore regarding Hoover Hull fee application question and telephone call with A. Morabel at Hoover Hull per trustee's request for information
11/05/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.50	290	145.00	11310095	Attend omnibus hearing
11/06/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.30	290	87.00	11314354	Telephone call from Bloomberg media representative and forward his information to K. Kattner
11/06/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11314379	Attend to orders for 11/5/2008 hearing
11/07/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	1.30	180	234.00	11327539	Review recent pleadings and e-mail messages and update master status spreadsheet (.6); electronically file proofs of service (.5); revise 12/2 agenda (.1); e-mail messages with P. Trimble regarding additional dial-in number (.1)
11/10/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	1.30	180	234.00	11327928	Revise order on continued matters (.1); electronically file proof of service (.1); attention to service issues (.1); draft/finalize letter and package transmitting claims to BMC (.2); review/edit proforma (.2); draft 11/21 agenda (.2); draft notice of draw (.1); review recent pleadings and update

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey

Page 3 (3)

Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

Date	Atty	Name	Hours	Rate	Value	Index	Description
							master status spreadsheet (.1); electronically file OCP affidavit following e-mail message from J. Johnson (.2)
11/11/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.60	180	108.00	11327460	Draft hearing notice (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file bid procedure motion following e-mail message from D. Edwards (.4); e-mail messages with A. Whitfield and J. Myers regarding service issues (.1)
11/12/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.70	180	126.00	11331041	Update master status spreadsheet and agenda (.2); e-mail messages and telephone call with K. Goss regarding motion (.1); revise notice and forward to K. Goss (.1); revise, finalize and upload order on continued matters (.2); internet search for contact information concerning affected party following e-mail message from A. Whitfield (.1)
11/13/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.40	180	72.00	11331068	Voice mail message from and telephone call to claimant E. Manbeck (.1); revise notice of draw and proforma exhibit (.2); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
11/14/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11333541	Attend to request for immediate filing and new hearing date
11/14/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.70	180	126.00	11360660	Attention to service issues (.1); review recent pleadings and update master status spreadsheet (.3); telephone calls with D. Edwards, K. Goss and R. Andis regarding motion to be filed (.3)
11/16/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.40	290	116.00	11361888	Telephone call from creditor related to lien on computers and servers and refer matter to company
11/17/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.70	180	126.00	11360702	Review recent pleadings and update master status spreadsheet (.2); electronically file proofs of service (.3); e-mail messages with D. Edwards, R. Andis and K. Goss regarding additional hearing (.1); revise agenda (.1)
11/18/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.70	180	126.00	11341880	E-mail messages with J. Weddle regarding payment issues (.1); upload order following e-mail message from D. Edwards (.1); finalize/electronically file motion to approve bid (.4); e-mail messages with D. Edwards and BMC regarding service issues (.1)

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey
 Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Page 4 (4)

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)
 Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Date	Atty	Name	Hours	Rate	Value	Index	Description
11/19/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	1.80	180	324.00	11341100	Update 12/2 agenda (.2); forward appearance to BMC (.1); e-mail and voice mail messages with J. Binford regarding filing issues (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file fuel sale motion (.5); draft notices and forward to L. Konermann (.2); attention to service issues (.1); revise and distribute draft agenda (.3); update master status spreadsheet (.3)
11/20/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11343247	Attend to agenda and attendance requirements at hearing tomorrow in New Albany
11/20/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	.50	180	90.00	11360785	Revise agenda following e-mail message from D. Edwards (.2); revise, finalize and electronically file agenda (.2); e-mail K. Goss and R. Andis regarding additional hearing needed in January following e-mail message from B. Bates (.1)
11/21/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.60	290	174.00	11348769	Brief review of motions to modify stay and sell domain names of ATA prior to filing and verify with Court regarding redactions; attend to filing of supplemental affidavit
11/21/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	2.10	180	378.00	11360835	Revise, finalize and electronically file agreed motion to modify stay (.4); review minute entry and recent pleadings and update master status spreadsheet (.2); draft notice and forward to L. Konermann (.1); update 12/2 agenda (.2); e-mail messages with B. Bates and K. Goss regarding additional January hearing date (.1); update dial-in/hearing date chart (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file motion to sell domain names (.5); draft notice and forward to L. Konermann (.1); attention to service of notices (.1); upload order following e-mail message from D. Edwards (.1); finalize and electronically file OCP affidavit following e-mail message from K. Lyda (.2)
11/24/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	2.70	180	486.00	11360882	Electronically file proof of service (.1); update and distribute dial-in/hearing date chart (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file eleven claim objections (2.1);

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey

Page 5 (5)

Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

Date	Atty	Name	Hours	Rate	Value	Index	Description
11/25/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	1.80	180	324.00	11363987	update master status spreadsheet (.2); draft 1/12 agenda (.2) Continue drafting notice of hearing and forward to L. Konermann (.3); revise and distribute notice of draw to S. Turoff and B. Hunt (.1); attention to service issues (.1); electronically file proofs of service (.5); electronically file Mesirow notice of draw following e-mail message from J. Johnson (.2); review recent pleadings and update master status spreadsheet (.2); review pro hac vice motions and update San Antonio adversary proceeding caption and service list (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file notice of draw (.3)
11/26/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11360597	Review and revise agenda for December 2 hearing
11/26/08	10414	S.B. Laughlin	1.50	180	270.00	11360955	Review recent adversary pleadings, update caption/service list, and update master status spreadsheet (.3); revise and distribute 12/2 agenda (.6); revise agenda following e-mail messages from B. Bates and H. Flores (.2); voice mail message from and telephone call to Borgany (American Trakhener Association) concerning receipt of motion and notice (.2); internet search and e-mail messages with BMC regarding affected party (.2)
11/28/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.30	290	87.00	11360640	Review and file October MOR per S. Turoff's request to file on Friday
Total for B004			20.50		4,097.00		
B005 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS							
11/03/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.30	290	87.00	11310838	Respond to ATA employee question regarding claim and class action WARN (S. Harris)
11/11/08	10563	T.E. Hall	1.40	290	406.00	11333489	Check local rules and respond to questions related to claims objections procedures and review and comment on form claim objection
11/19/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11341423	Respond to creditor question about bar date and late-filed claims
11/25/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.90	290	261.00	11358242	Revise motion to show cause against Signature and file same in prior case pursuant to court's instruction and verify facts and assertions

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey

Page 6 (6)

Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)
 Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Date	Atty	Name	Hours	Rate	Value	Index	Description
Total for B005			2.80		812.00		
B007 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS							
11/09/08	10563	T.E. Hall	1.80	290	522.00	11314470	Review and revise billing proforma
11/13/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.90	290	261.00	11333526	Revise (second) proforma after later review and correction
Total for B007			2.70		783.00		
B010 LITIGATION							
11/10/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.20	290	58.00	11317254	Review motion for preliminary injunction filed by Mike Hile
Total for B010			.20		58.00		
B012 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT							
11/05/08	10563	T.E. Hall	.10	290	29.00	11310098	Discuss with U.S. Trustee regarding status of plan
11/25/08	10563	T.E. Hall	1.30	290	377.00	11358243	Begin review of draft plan and disclosure statement
11/28/08	10563	T.E. Hall	3.40	290	986.00	11360646	Continue review of new plan and disclosure statement
Total for B012			4.80		1,392.00		
Total Services			32.50		7,577.00		

UNBILLED DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Quantity	Value	Check No	Voucher ID	Index	Description
604	Copying Costs					
11/10/08	14	2.10			3322720	Copying Costs
Subtotal for Copying Costs		2.10				
613	Postage/Air/Express Delivery					
11/14/08	1	19.98			3327319	Postage/Air/Express Delivery UPS
Subtotal for Postage/Air/Express Del		19.98				

Total Disbursements 22.08

Total Services and Disbursements 7,599.08

TIME SUMMARY

Attorney	Classification	Hours	Matter Rate	Matter Value	Standard Value	Last Date
10563 Hall, T.E.	Associate	15.70	290.00	4,553.00	4,553.00	11/28/08

Client Manager: S.A. Claffey

Page 7 (7)

Matter Manager: 10563 T.E. Hall

Proforma No.: 968184 as of 11/30/08

Client: 0981021 ATA Airlines, Inc. (post Chapter 11)

Requested By: kamitche on 12/24/08

Matter: 0981021.0000001 Chapter 11 Liquidation

Attorney	Classification	Hours	Matter Rate	Matter Value	Standard Value	Last Date
10414 Laughlin, S.B.	Legal Assistant	16.80	180.00	3,024.00	3,024.00	11/26/08
Total Services		32.50		7,577.00	7,577.00	

TASK SUMMARY

Task Description	Hours	Value
B002 ASSET DISPOSITION	.80	232.00
B003 BUSINESS OPERATIONS	.70	203.00
B004 CASE ADMINISTRATION	20.50	4,097.00
B005 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS	2.80	812.00
B007 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS	2.70	783.00
B010 LITIGATION	.20	58.00
B012 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	4.80	1,392.00
	32.50	7,577.00