

Fill in this information to identify the case:

Debtor 1 \_\_\_\_\_  
Debtor 2 (Spouse, if filing) \_\_\_\_\_  
United States Bankruptcy Court for the: \_\_\_\_\_ District of \_\_\_\_\_  
Case number \_\_\_\_\_

RECEIVED  
JUL 14 2016  
BMC GROUP

Official Form 410  
Proof of Claim

12/15

Read the instructions before filling out this form. This form is for making a claim for payment in a bankruptcy case. Do not use this form to make a request for payment of an administrative expense. Make such a request according to 11 U.S.C. § 503.

Filers must leave out or redact information that is entitled to privacy on this form or on any attached documents. Attach redacted copies of any documents that support the claim, such as promissory notes, purchase orders, invoices, itemized statements of running accounts, contracts, judgments, mortgages, and security agreements. Do not send original documents; they may be destroyed after scanning. If the documents are not available, explain in an attachment.

A person who files a fraudulent claim could be fined up to \$500,000, imprisoned for up to 5 years, or both. 18 U.S.C. §§ 152, 157, and 3571.

Fill in all the information about the claim as of the date the case was filed. That date is on the notice of bankruptcy (Form 309) that you received.

Part 1: Identify the Claim

1. Who is the current creditor? Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC  
Name of the current creditor (the person or entity to be paid for this claim)  
Other names the creditor used with the debtor \_\_\_\_\_

2. Has this claim been acquired from someone else?  No  
 Yes. From whom? \_\_\_\_\_

3. Where should notices and payments to the creditor be sent? Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure (FRBP) 2002(g)  
Where should notices to the creditor be sent? Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC  
Name: Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC  
725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor  
Number: 725 Street: South Figueroa  
City: Los Angeles State: CA ZIP Code: 90017  
Contact phone: 213-629-9040  
Contact email: granados@caldwell-leslie.com  
Where should payments to the creditor be sent? (if different)  
Name: \_\_\_\_\_  
Number: \_\_\_\_\_ Street: \_\_\_\_\_  
City: \_\_\_\_\_ State: \_\_\_\_\_ ZIP Code: \_\_\_\_\_  
Contact phone: \_\_\_\_\_  
Contact email: \_\_\_\_\_  
Uniform claim identifier for electronic payments in chapter 13 (if you use one):  
-----

4. Does this claim amend one already filed?  No  
 Yes. Claim number on court claims registry (if known) \_\_\_\_\_ Filed on MM / DD / YYYY

5. Do you know if anyone else has filed a proof of claim for this claim?  No  
 Yes. Who made the earlier filing? \_\_\_\_\_



**Part 2: Give Information About the Claim as of the Date the Case Was Filed**

6. Do you have any number you use to identify the debtor?  No  
 Yes. Last 4 digits of the debtor's account or any number you use to identify the debtor: 

1	5	5	9
---	---	---	---

7. How much is the claim? \$ 46,194.64. Does this amount include interest or other charges?  
 No  
 Yes. Attach statement itemizing interest, fees, expenses, or other charges required by Bankruptcy Rule 3001(c)(2)(A).

8. What is the basis of the claim? Examples: Goods sold, money loaned, lease, services performed, personal injury or wrongful death, or credit card.  
Attach redacted copies of any documents supporting the claim required by Bankruptcy Rule 3001(c).  
Limit disclosing information that is entitled to privacy, such as health care information.  
Professional Services

9. Is all or part of the claim secured?  No  
 Yes. The claim is secured by a lien on property.  
**Nature of property:**  
 Real estate. If the claim is secured by the debtor's principal residence, file a *Mortgage Proof of Claim Attachment* (Official Form 410-A) with this *Proof of Claim*.  
 Motor vehicle  
 Other. Describe: \_\_\_\_\_  
**Basis for perfection:** \_\_\_\_\_  
Attach redacted copies of documents, if any, that show evidence of perfection of a security interest (for example, a mortgage, lien, certificate of title, financing statement, or other document that shows the lien has been filed or recorded.)  
**Value of property:** \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
**Amount of the claim that is secured:** \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
**Amount of the claim that is unsecured:** \$ \_\_\_\_\_ (The sum of the secured and unsecured amounts should match the amount in line 7.)  
**Amount necessary to cure any default as of the date of the petition:** \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
**Annual Interest Rate** (when case was filed) \_\_\_\_\_ %  
 Fixed  
 Variable

10. Is this claim based on a lease?  No  
 Yes. Amount necessary to cure any default as of the date of the petition. \$ \_\_\_\_\_

11. Is this claim subject to a right of setoff?  No  
 Yes. Identify the property: \_\_\_\_\_

12. Is all or part of the claim entitled to priority under 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)?

No

Yes. Check all that apply:

Amount entitled to priority

A claim may be partly priority and partly nonpriority. For example, in some categories, the law limits the amount entitled to priority.

- Domestic support obligations (including alimony and child support) under 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(1)(A) or (a)(1)(B). \$ \_\_\_\_\_
- Up to \$2,775\* of deposits toward purchase, lease, or rental of property or services for personal, family, or household use. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(7). \$ \_\_\_\_\_
- Wages, salaries, or commissions (up to \$12,475\*) earned within 180 days before the bankruptcy petition is filed or the debtor's business ends, whichever is earlier. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(4). \$ \_\_\_\_\_
- Taxes or penalties owed to governmental units. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(8). \$ \_\_\_\_\_
- Contributions to an employee benefit plan. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(5). \$ \_\_\_\_\_
- Other. Specify subsection of 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)( ) that applies. \$ \_\_\_\_\_

\* Amounts are subject to adjustment on 4/01/16 and every 3 years after that for cases begun on or after the date of adjustment.

**Part 3: Sign Below**

The person completing this proof of claim must sign and date it. FRBP 9011(b).

If you file this claim electronically, FRBP 5005(a)(2) authorizes courts to establish local rules specifying what a signature is.

A person who files a fraudulent claim could be fined up to \$500,000, imprisoned for up to 5 years, or both. 18 U.S.C. §§ 152, 157, and 3571.

Check the appropriate box:

- I am the creditor.
- I am the creditor's attorney or authorized agent.
- I am the trustee, or the debtor, or their authorized agent. Bankruptcy Rule 3004.
- I am a guarantor, surety, endorser, or other codebtor. Bankruptcy Rule 3005.

I understand that an authorized signature on this Proof of Claim serves as an acknowledgment that when calculating the amount of the claim, the creditor gave the debtor credit for any payments received toward the debt.

I have examined the information in this Proof of Claim and have a reasonable belief that the information is true and correct.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on date 07/12/2016  
MM / DD / YYYY

  
Signature

Print the name of the person who is completing and signing this claim:

Name Monica Granados  
First name Middle name Last name

Title Accounting Manager

Company Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC  
Identify the corporate servicer as the company if the authorized agent is a servicer.

Address 725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor  
Number Street

Los Angeles CA 90017  
City State ZIP Code

Contact phone 213-629-9040 Email granados@caldwell-leslie.com

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

9/14/2015

Statement No. 38749

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Billing Summary

Total Due Last Statement: 37,706.82

Current Invoice: 16,968.96

Trust Application: 41,632.00

Balance Forward: 13,043.78

Trust Balance: 0.00

**Total Now Due: 28,043.78**

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

9/14/2015

Statement No. 38749

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Legal Services Through 8/31/2015

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/2/2015	MVS	CALL WITH SEVKET; CONFERENCE WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL; REVIER AND REVISE PRESENATION LETTER	2.20	990.00
8/3/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH SEVKET AND JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL RE PRESENTATION; REVIEW AND REVISE PRESENTATION; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER RE SAME; REVIEW ATTACHMENTS AND DOCUMENTS FROM CLIENT	4.50	2,025.00
8/3/2015	KMS	REVISE LETTER TO PROSECUTION; CONFERENCE WITH SCHAFLER RE SAME	3.90	1,170.00
8/3/2015	CCS	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH SINGER RE LETTER BRIEF TO US ATTORNEY'S OFFICE; REVIEW, ORGANIZE EXHIBITS TO LETTER	0.40	78.00
8/4/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES RE PRESENTATION; REVIEW AND REVISE PRESENTATION; CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT	3.30	1,485.00
8/4/2015	KMS	REVISE LETTER TO PROSECUTION; COMPILE EXHIBITS RE SAME; CONFERENCES WITH SCHAFLER AND STROTHER RE SAME	3.10	930.00
8/4/2015	CCS	CONFERENCES WITH SINGER RE LETTER BRIEF AND EXHIBITS; PREPARE AND ORGANIZE EXHIBITS FOR LETTER BRIEF	5.20	1,014.00
8/4/2015	DJT	REVIEW FILES ON CLIENT FTP; COMPARE AGAINST FILES RECEIVED PER SINGER	1.00	195.00
8/4/2015	DKW	EDIT REFERRAL LETTER TO USAO; EMAILS RE SAME	0.80	440.00
8/5/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES RE PRESENTATION; REVIEW AND REVISE PRESENTATION; CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT AND JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL; CONFERENCES WITH WILLINGHAM AND KMS	2.20	990.00
8/5/2015	KMS	REVISE LETTER TO PROSECUTION; CONFERENCE	4.90	1,470.00

WITH STROTHER RE SAME; COMPILE EXHIBITS				
8/5/2015	CCS	REVIEW, REVISE AND CITE CHECK LETTER BRIEF; PREPARE AND ORGANIZE EXHIBITS FOR LETTER BRIEF; CONFERENCES WITH BUSSARAKUM RE SAME	6.90	1,345.50
8/5/2015	DJT	PREPARE CD EXHIBIT TO DECLARATION PER SINGER	0.50	97.50
8/5/2015	DKW	CONFER WITH CO-COUNSEL RE EDITS; EDIT LETTER FOR REFERRAL	2.40	1,320.00
8/6/2015	MVS	REVIEW AND REVISE PRESENTATION AND CONFERENCES RE SAME; OVERSEE SUBMISSION	1.30	585.00
8/6/2015	CCS	REVIEW, REVISE INDEX TO EXHIBITS; ORGANIZE EXHIBITS IN SUPPORT OF LETTER BRIEF; PREPARE AND ORGANIZE BINDERS WITH LETTER AND EXHIBITS; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER, WILLINGHAM, POPESCU RE SAME	2.30	448.50
8/6/2015	DKW	FINALIZE REFERRAL CORRESPONDENCE TO GOVERNMENT	1.80	990.00
8/7/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH WILLIAMS RE PRESENTATION	0.20	90.00
8/24/2015	DJT	PREPARE LETTER AND EXHIBITS FOR AUSA OFFICE PER BUSSARAKUM; UPLOAD TO SFTP SITE; CIRCULATE DOWNLOAD LINK	1.00	195.00
Sub-total Fees:				<u>15,858.50</u>

#### Timekeeper Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
Michael V Schafler	13.70	450.00	6,165.00
Kim M. Singer	11.90	300.00	3,570.00
Charlotte Strother	14.80	195.00	2,886.00
Daniel J. Tholen	2.50	195.00	487.50
David K. Willingham	5.00	550.00	2,750.00
Total hours:	<u>47.90</u>		

#### Expenses

PHOTOCOPIES - OUTSIDE SERVICE	217.25
PHOTOCOPYING	890.25
TELEPHONE - LONG DISTANCE	2.96
Sub-total Expenses:	<u>1,110.46</u>

**Payments**

8/18/2015	Payment	Trust Application	21,632.00
8/31/2015	Payment	Trust Application	16,074.82
9/14/2015	Payment	Trust Application	3,925.18
Sub-total Payments:			<u>41,632.00</u>

**Trust Account**

		Beginning Balance:	0.00
8/20/2015	Payment Received from Client		20,000.00
8/31/2015	Trust Application		-16,074.82
9/14/2015	Trust Application		-3,925.18
Ending Balance:			<u>0.00</u>

Total Due Last Statement: 37,706.82

Current Invoice: 16,968.96  
Trust Application: 41,632.00  
Balance Forward: 13,043.78

Trust Balance: 0.00  
**Total Now Due: 28,043.78**

**Aging**

<u>Over30</u>	<u>Over60</u>	<u>Over90</u>
0.00	0.00	0.00

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

10/9/2015

Statement No. 39243

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Billing Summary

Total Due Last Statement: 16,968.96

Current Invoice: 19,216.95

Trust Application: 3,925.18

Balance Forward: 32,260.73

Trust Balance: 0.00

**Total Now Due: 47,260.73**



# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

10/9/2015

Statement No. 39243

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Legal Services Through 9/30/2015

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/2/2015	MVS	CONFERENCE WITH SEVKET AND PREPARE FOR SAME	0.40	180.00
9/3/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME; CONFERENCES WITH WILLINGHAM RE SAME	1.60	720.00
9/3/2015	DKW	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COHEN RE CLIENT	0.20	110.00
9/4/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES RE STATUS AND STRATEGY; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GOVERNMENT	0.40	180.00
9/4/2015	DKW	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FBI AGENT	0.20	110.00
9/8/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES RE STATUS AND STRATEGY	0.30	135.00
9/8/2015	DKW	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAUL STERN; CONFER WITH SCHAFLER; EMAILS RE SAME	0.60	330.00
9/10/2015	MVS	CALL WITH SEVKET RE STATUS; CONFERENCE WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL	0.70	315.00
9/10/2015	DKW	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT; CONFER WITH SCHAFLER	0.50	275.00
9/11/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH SEVKET; REVIEW AND ANALYZE MATERIALS PROVIDED BY SEVKET; INCORPORATE INTO PROFFER PRESENTATION	1.80	810.00
9/15/2015	MVS	REVIEW SEVKET PRESENTATION AND CONFERENCE RE SAME; REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER RE NEXT STEPS; CONFERENCE WITH FBI	0.80	360.00
9/15/2015	DKW	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STERN RE GOVERNMENT INTERVIEW REQUEST	0.50	275.00
9/22/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES RE PROFFER; PREPARE FOR PROFFER; REVIEW REFERRAL PRESENTATION	3.10	1,395.00

---

9/22/2015	KMS	EMAIL TO SCHAFLER RE DOJ MEETING	0.10	30.00
9/22/2015	DKW	EMAILS WITH GOVERNMENT; CONFER WITH SCHAFLER AND SINGER RE INTERVIEW DEMAND	0.80	440.00
9/23/2015	MVS	PREPARE FOR SEVKET PROFFER; REVIEW REFERRAL PRESENTATION; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER RE SAME; CONFERENCE WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL	3.10	1,395.00
9/23/2015	KMS	EMAIL TO STROTHER RE EXHIBITS	0.10	30.00
9/23/2015	CCS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SINGER EMAILS RE GOVERNMENT SUBMISSION AND EXHIBITS BINDERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COPY SERVICE RE SAME	0.20	39.00
9/24/2015	MVS	MEETING WITH SEVKET WILLINGHAM AND SINGER TO PREPARE FOR PROFFER AND PREPARE FOR SAME	5.00	2,250.00
9/24/2015	KMS	ANALYZE DOCUMENTS; DRAFT OUTLINE RE DOJ MEETING PREPARATION; CONFERENCE WITH SEYALIOGLU, WILLINGHAM AND SCHAFLER RE SAME	5.30	1,590.00
9/24/2015	DJT	PREPARE VENDOR INSTRUCTION RE FORENSIC IMAGING OF LAPTOP	0.50	97.50
9/24/2015	DKW	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH; MEETING WITH CLIENT TO PREPARE FOR PROFFER SESSION	2.80	1,540.00
9/25/2015	MVS	ATTEND SEVEKT PROFFER; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER AND SEVKET AND WILLINGHAM; CONFERENCES RE NEXT STEPS; CONFERENCE WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUSNEL; REVIEW REVISED PROFFER AND CONFERENCES RE SAME	4.10	1,845.00
9/25/2015	KMS	ATTEND DOJ MEETING; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE SAME	4.30	1,290.00
9/25/2015	DKW	MEETING WITH CLIENT; MEETING WITH CLIENT AND GOVERNMENT COUNSEL	3.10	1,705.00
9/28/2015	MVS	CNFERENCES WITH SEVKET RE STATUS AND NEXT STEPS	0.20	90.00
9/30/2015	MVS	CONFERENCE RE STATUS AND STRATEGY	0.50	225.00
9/30/2015	KMS	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE DOJ MEETING	3.70	1,110.00
9/30/2015	DJT	CONFER WITH SCHAFLER RE LAPTOP IFORENSIC IMAGES	0.50	97.50

---

Sub-total Fees: 18,969.00

**Timekeeper Summary**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Michael V Schafler	22.00	450.00	9,900.00
Kim M. Singer	13.50	300.00	4,050.00
Charlotte Strother	0.20	195.00	39.00
Daniel J. Tholen	1.00	195.00	195.00
David K. Willingham	8.70	550.00	4,785.00
Total hours:			45.40

**Expenses**

	APEX ATTORNEY SERVICES	48.50
	PARKING - ALL DAY	120.00
	WESTLAW CHARGES	70.45
9/25/2015	PARKING - EARLY BIRD	9.00
Sub-total Expenses:		247.95

**Payments**

9/21/2015	Payment	Trust Application	3,925.18
Sub-total Payments:			3,925.18

Total Due Last Statement: 16,968.96

Current Invoice: 19,216.95  
 Trust Application: 3,925.18  
 Balance Forward: 32,260.73

Trust Balance: 0.00  
**Total Now Due: 47,260.73**

**Aging**

<u>Over30</u>	<u>Over60</u>	<u>Over90</u>
0.00	0.00	0.00

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

11/5/2015

Statement No. 39674

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Billing Summary

Total Due Last Statement: 32,260.73

Current Invoice: 2,884.91

Trust Application: 0.00

Balance Forward: 35,145.64

Trust Balance: 0.00

**Total Now Due: 50,145.64**



	PHOTOCOPYING	0.25
10/9/2015	COST ADVANCE TO: CITY NATIONAL BANK - BUSINESS MEAL 9/24/15	36.63

Sub-total Expenses: 139.91

Total Due Last Statement: 32,260.73

Current Invoice: 2,884.91

Trust Application: 0.00

Balance Forward: 35,145.64

Trust Balance: 0.00

**Total Now Due: 50,145.64**

**Aging**

<u>Over30</u>	<u>Over60</u>	<u>Over90</u>
13,043.78	0.00	0.00

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

12/8/2015

Statement No. 40144

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Billing Summary

Total Due Last Statement: 35,145.64

Current Invoice: 11,169.00

Trust Application: 0.00

Balance Forward: 46,314.64

w/o KMS Time 120.00

Total Owed: 46,194.64

# Caldwell Leslie

Caldwell Leslie & Proctor, PC

725 South Figueroa Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90017-5524 Tel 213.629.9040 Fax 213.629.9022 www.caldwell-leslie.com

12/8/2015

Statement No. 40144

In re Airfast Tickets, Inc.  
Seyalioglu Sevket  
102 Red Hill Circle  
Tiburon, CA 94920

---

1559-01

In re AirFast Tickets, Inc.,

---

## Legal Services Through 11/30/2015

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/4/2015	MVS	PREPARE FOR SEVKET PROFFER WITH DOJ; CONFERENCES WITH DOJ RE PROFFER; REVIEW PRIOR PROFFER; CONFERENCES WITH SINGER AND WILLINGHAM RE SAME	2.50	1,125.00
11/5/2015	MVS	ATTEND PROFFER WITH SINGER AND SEVKET AND DOJ AND PREPARE FOR SAME	9.60	4,320.00
11/5/2015	KMS	CONFERENCE WITH DOJ, SEYALIOGLU AND SCHAFLER RE PROFFER	6.90	2,070.00
11/6/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH DOJ RE FOLLOW UP	0.30	135.00
11/9/2015	MVS	CONFERENCE WITH FBI RE FOLLOW-UP	0.20	90.00
11/9/2015	MVS	CONFERENCE WITH JOINT DEFENSE COUNSEL	0.30	135.00
11/12/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH SEVKET RE STATUS	0.10	45.00
11/16/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH SEVKET RE EMAIL HACKING; CONFERENCES WITH FBI RE SAME	0.30	135.00
11/16/2015	KMS	EMAIL TO SEYALIOGLU RE DOJ MEETING; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE SAME	5.60	1,680.00
11/17/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH FBI RE STATUS	0.30	135.00
11/18/2015	MVS	REVIEW SUMMARY OF PROFFER SESSION	1.00	450.00
11/18/2015	KMS	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE DOJ MEETING; EMAIL TO SCHAFLER AND WILLINGHAM RE SAME	0.90	270.00
11/19/2015	MVS	CONFERENCES WITH FBI RE CONSENT SEARCH	0.20	90.00
11/23/2015	MVS	REVIEW SEVKET PRESENTATION RE TICKETING	0.80	360.00
<del>11/30/2015</del>	<del>KMS</del>	<del>ANALYZE POWERPOINT PRESENTATION RE AIRLINE TICKETS; EMAIL TO SCHAFLER RE SAME</del>	<del>0.40</del>	<del>120.00</del>

Sub-total Fees: 11,160.00



**Timekeeper Summary**

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
Michael V Schaffer	15.60	450.00	7,020.00
Kim M. Singer	13.80	300.00	4,140.00
Total hours:	29.40		

**Expenses**

11/5/2015	PARKING - EARLY BIRD	9.00
Sub-total Expenses:		9.00

Total Due Last Statement: 35,145.64

Current Invoice: 11,169.00  
 Trust Application: 0.00  
 Balance Forward: 46,314.64

w/o KMS Time 120.00

**Aging**

Over 30	Over 60	Over 90
22,101.86	13,043.78	0.00

Total Owed: 46,194.64

**PROOF OF CLAIM FILING INFORMATION FOR**

**AIRFASTTICKETS, INC.  
CASE NO. 15-11951-SHL**

**Debtor Name**

**Case No.**

**Airfasttickets, Inc.**

**15-11951-shl**

**General Bar Date: April 6, 2016, at 7:00 PM, Eastern Time**

**Governmental Bar Date: April 25, 2016, at 7:00 PM, Eastern Time**

If you would like to file a proof of claim:

Mail original proof of claim form(s) and copies of supporting documentation to:

**If by regular mail**

BMC Group, Inc.  
Attn: Airfasttickets Claims Processing  
PO Box 90100  
Los Angeles, CA 90009

**If by messenger or overnight delivery**

BMC Group, Inc.  
Attn: Airfasttickets Claims Processing  
3732 West 120th Street  
Hawthorne, CA 90250

*Once filed, a "Filed" stamped copy of the proof of claim will be returned to the claimant within (3) business days of docketing IF the claimant encloses a stamped, self addressed envelope with a copy of the proof of claim.*