

EXHIBIT A

EXHIBIT A

For professional services rendered from May 14, 2003 through September 30, 2003.

re: GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
S SIEGEL	05/14/03	1.80	EXCHANGE VOICEMAILS WITH R. ROSENBERG REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME AND REGARDING FIRST DAYS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); FURTHER TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH JOSEPHSON, ROSENBERG, LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.2); EMAILS WITH G. JOSEPHSON, RO. ROSENBERG REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW FIRST DAY MOTIONS (.8)
GD JOSEPHSON	05/14/03	3.50	FINALIZE RETENTION PAPERS FOR ALLEGIANCE MATTER AND DISCUSS SAME WITH K&E (3.5)
S SIEGEL	05/15/03	.60	REVIEW PRESS REGARDING FILING (.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING FIRST DAY HEARING (.3)
GD JOSEPHSON	05/15/03	3.10	ATTEND ALLEGIANCE TELECOM FIRST DAY HEARINGS (3.1)
R J ROSENBERG	05/16/03	2.00	BOARD CONFERENCE CALL (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL - INDEPENDENT DIRECTORS (1.0)
S SIEGEL	05/16/03	.10	EMAILS REGARDING CRD (.1)
S SIEGEL	05/19/03	.50	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. ROSENBERG REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.1); EMAIL P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.1); EMAIL R. ROSENBERG, G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING 327(A) VS. 327(E) (.1); REVIEW DOCKET (.1)
S SIEGEL	05/20/03	.60	VOICEMAIL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING 327(A) V. 327(E) (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING REVISED DECLARATION (.3); REVIEW DOCKET (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	05/20/03	1.30	DISCUSS ALLEGIANCE RETENTION ISSUES WITH R. ROSENBERG (.30); UPDATE DECLARATION TO REFLECT 327(A) STATUS (1.0)
GD JOSEPHSON	05/21/03	.80	REVISE APPLICATION AND DISCUSS SAME WITH S. SIEGEL

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
S SIEGEL	05/22/03	1.20	REVIEW NEW DRAFT 327 APPLICATION AND DECLARATION (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); VOICEMAIL TO P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.1)
L A SALCEDO	05/22/03	.20	AS PER R. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
S SIEGEL	05/23/03	.10	CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING DECLARATION (.1)
L A SALCEDO	05/23/03	.20	AS PER B. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	05/28/03	.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. SMITH REGARDING C. MABE
S SIEGEL	05/28/03	.10	VOICEMAIL WITH P. LUSTRIN REGARDING 327(A) APPLICATION (.1)
L A SALCEDO	05/28/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	05/29/03	.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN RE: BANK POSITION
S SIEGEL	05/29/03	.10	REVIEW DOCKET (.1)
L A SALCEDO	05/29/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	05/30/03	.50	REVIEW REVISED RETENTION PAPERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME
S SIEGEL	05/30/03	.20	EMAILS WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING 327 APPLICATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	05/30/03	2.90	FINALIZE APPLICATION MATERIALS AND DISCUSS SAME WITH K&E (2.70) ; REVIEW WITH R. ROSENBERG (.20)
L A SALCEDO	05/30/03	.20	AS PER B. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/02/03	.80	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. HOLLAND
S SIEGEL	06/02/03	.10	REVIEW DOCKET (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/02/03	.30	REVIEW PLEADINGS AS FILED AND DISCUSS HEARING ISSUES WITH R. ROSENBERG
L A SALCEDO	06/02/03	.20	AS PER B ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET
R J ROSENBERG	06/03/03	3.00	REVIEW DISTRIBUTIONS TO BOARD (2.0); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM BANK (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR (.30); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI, M. KRAMER (.50)
S SIEGEL	06/03/03	.10	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE (.1)

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
GD JOSEPHSON	06/03/03	1.00	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.30); DRAFT AND DISTRIBUTE SECURITIES SURVEY (.70)
L A SALCEDO	06/03/03	.50	AS PER B. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.20); AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, PREPARED NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.30).
R J ROSENBERG	06/04/03	3.00	REVIEW ADDITIONAL BOARD MATERIALS (1.); BOARD CONFERENCE CALL (2.)
S SIEGEL	06/04/03	.10	VOICEMAILS WITH ROSENBERG, LUSTRIN REGARDING 327 APPLICATION (.1)
L A SALCEDO	06/04/03	.20	AS PER B. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
S SIEGEL	06/05/03	.80	TELEPHONE CALL WITH C. SCHWARTZ AND P. LUSTRIN REGARDING 327 APPLICATION (.1); EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); FURTHER EMAILS WITH ROSENBERG, JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.2)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/05/03	.80	REVISE ORDER PER UST DIRECTION (.50); DISCUSS SAME WITH R. ROSENBERG AND S. SIEGEL (.30)
L A SALCEDO	06/05/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/06/03	1.00	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. LUSTRIN (.30); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING CREDITORS COMMITTEE (.40); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. DIZENGOFF (.30)
S SIEGEL	06/06/03	.40	TELEPHONE CALLS AND VOICEMAILS WITH R. ROSENBERG, G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING RETENTION ORDER (.2); REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF SAME (.1); EMAIL TO P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/06/03	1.00	REVISE ORDER AND DISCUSS WITH S. SIEGEL
L A SALCEDO	06/06/03	.20	AS PER R. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/09/03	.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING SELECTION OF CRO
L A SALCEDO	06/09/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/10/03	1.70	BOARD COMMITTEE CALL REGARDING SELECTION OF CRO (1.0); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM AKIN (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			WITH M. CANTOR, J. HENES REGARDING MEETING WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE (.2); REVIEW DRAFT OF NEW BYLAWS FOR SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.3);
S SIEGEL	06/10/03	1.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. LUSTRIN, C. SCHWARTZ REGARDING 327 APPLICATION (.4); EXCHANGE VOICEMAILS WITH R. ROSENBERG REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); FURTHER TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. ROSENBERG REGARDING SAME (.1); REVISE DRAFT ORDER (.1); EMAIL WITH P. LUSTRIN REGARDING SAME (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/10/03	.70	DISCUSS ORDER REVISIONS PER UST
L A SALCEDO	06/10/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/11/03	1.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT PROPOSAL AND LETTER (.30); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING MEETING TOMORROW (.70)
S SIEGEL	06/11/03	.20	EMAILS WITH ROSENBERG, JOSEPHSON REGARDING 327 ORDER AND HEARING (.1); EMAILS WITH JOSEPHSON REGARDING ORDER (.1)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/11/03	1.50	REVISE ORDER (.40); DISCUSS HEARING ISSUES WITH K&E (.50); FINALIZE MATERIALS FOR HEARING (.60)
L A SALCEDO	06/11/03	2.00	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/12/03	3.50	CREDITORS COMMITTEE MEETING (3.0); REVIEW OBJECTION OF COMMITTEE FOR K&E RETENTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE NECESSITY (.2)
L A SALCEDO	06/12/03	.10	AS PER R. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/13/03	1.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING MEETING YESTERDAY (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MANAGEMENT, COMMITTEE REGARDING CREDITORS COMMITTEE MEETING (.8)
S SIEGEL	06/13/03	.30	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING RETENTION HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH G. JOSEPHSON REGARDING NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.2)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/13/03	2.90	ATTEND RETENTION HEARING (2.3); REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE AND FILE SAME (.60)

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
L A SALCEDO	06/13/03	2.20	AS PER R. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.20); AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, PREPARED SERVICE LIST AND LABELS FOR SERVICE OF NOTICE (1.60); FILED AND AND SERVED NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.40).
R J ROSENBERG	06/14/03	.50	REVIEW RELEVANT SECTIONS OF WORLDCOM REPORT OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE REGARDING ALLEGIANCE EMPLOYEES
L A SALCEDO	06/16/03	.70	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.20); PREPARED INVOICE (.50).
L A SALCEDO	06/17/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/18/03	.90	REVIEW REVISED DRAFT RESOLUTIONS FOR SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING BOARD STRUCTURE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING BOARD RESTRUCTURING (.2)
GD JOSEPHSON	06/18/03	.80	REVIEW FEE STATEMENT AND DISCUSS SAME WITH R. ROSENBERG
L A SALCEDO	06/18/03	.80	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.20); PREPARED MONTHLY INVOICE FOR MAY (.60).
L A SALCEDO	06/19/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
L A SALCEDO	06/20/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/23/03	.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING NEW DELAWARE SUPREME COURT DECISION AND IMPLICATION FOR INDEPENDENCE (.2)
L A SALCEDO	06/23/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET AND DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW.
R J ROSENBERG	06/24/03	.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. TOGUT REGARDING DIVISION OF LABOR OF DEBTOR CO-COUNSEL
L A SALCEDO	06/24/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
L A SALCEDO	06/25/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/26/03	.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI, R. HOLLAND REGARDING STRATEGIC ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING INDEPENDENCE OF COMMITTEE (.2); REVIEW E-

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			MAILS REGARDING SAME (.2)
L A SALCEDO	06/26/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
R J ROSENBERG	06/27/03	2.00	CONFERENCE CALLL WITH CLIENT, POTENTIAL ACQUIROR
L A SALCEDO	06/27/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
JOSEPHSON	06/27/03	.80	REVIEW CONFLICT INFORMATION PER R. ROSENBERG
SALCEDO	07/01/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	07/02/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SIEGEL	07/07/03	.10	INCOMING PLEADINGS (.1)
SALCEDO	07/08/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	07/09/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/10/03	.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM BANK GROUP (.2)
SALCEDO	07/10/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	07/11/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/14/03	1.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE REGARDING RELATIONSHIPS WITH CREDITOR GROUPS, BUSINESS STATUS (.4); REVIEW GE OBJECTION TO GREENHILL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING PRESENT STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS, PENDING OBJECTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG (2X) REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. LIPMAN, J. GOLDBERG REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING SAME (.3)
SALCEDO	07/14/03	.80	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); PREPARED MONTHLY STATEMENT (.70).
SALCEDO	07/15/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/16/03	.70	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING OBJECTION TO GREENHILL RETENTION, PROPOSED SOLUTIONS (.5); REVIEW PROPOSED IMPALA SUCCESS FEE STRUCTURE (.2)
SALCEDO	07/16/03	.40	AS PER R. ROSENBERG, REVISED JUNE INVOICE AND SENT OUT.
ROSENBERG	07/17/03	2.70	E-MAIL TRAFFIC REGARDING GREENHILL RETENTION AND OBJECTIONS (.3); E-MAIL TRAFFIC REGARDING NEW DELAWARE CASES REGARDING

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			INDEPENDENCE STANDARDS AND IMPLICATIONS FOR BOARD (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING INDEPENDENCE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG, M. GERSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR REGARDING CURRENT STATUS NEGOTIATIONS, ETC. (.3); REVIEW M. TRESNOWSKI E-MAIL REGARDING IMPALA ROLE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING GREENHILL, IMPALA (.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PROPOSED BOARD RESOLUTIONS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING GREENHILL OBJECTION TO RETENTION (.2)
SALCEDO	07/17/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	07/18/03	.70	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); ORGANIZED PLEADINGS (.60).
ROSENBERG	07/20/03	1.00	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE, USE OF PROFESSIONALS (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN (.3)
ROSENBERG	07/21/03	1.80	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING ISSUES FOR BOARD MEETING (.3); REVIEW MATERIALS FOR COMMITTEE MEETING AND BOARD MEETING TOMORROW (1.0); REVIEW KEY DECISION ANALYSIS FOR BOARD MEETING (.5)
SIEGEL	07/21/03	.40	REVIEW BANK STATEMENT MOTION (.3); INCOMING PLEADINGS (.1)
SALCEDO	07/21/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/22/03	7.30	COMMITTEE MEETING FOLLOWED BY BOARD MEETING (7.3)
SALCEDO	07/22/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/23/03	.70	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING GREENHILL DISPUTE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING SAME (.3); E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.2)
SALCEDO	07/23/03	.50	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); ORGANIZED PLEADINGS (.40).
ROSENBERG	07/24/03	.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING GREENHILL OBJECTION
SALCEDO	07/24/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
ROSENBERG	07/25/03	.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING GREEN HILL OBJECTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.1)
SALCEDO	07/25/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/26/03	.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING GREENHILL OBJECTIONS; E-MAIL REGARDING SAME
ROSENBERG	07/28/03	1.40	CONTINUED E-MAILS REGARDING GREENHILL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR, M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. KRAMER REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR REGARDING SAME (.2)
SALCEDO	07/28/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/29/03	.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING GREENHILL OBJECTION
SALCEDO	07/29/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/30/03	1.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING INDENTURE ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE R. HUNDT REGARDING VARIOUS REORGANIZATION ISSUES (1.0)
SALCEDO	07/30/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	07/31/03	1.00	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION FOR KERP AND BACK-UP (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING GREENHILL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING BOARD PROCESSEES (.3)
SALCEDO	07/31/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/01/03	4.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. KRAMER REGARDING GREENHILL OBJECTIONS, PROPOSED PLAN STRUCTURE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. AUSTIN REGARDING PLAN, RETENTION, KERP ISSUES (.3); SUBCOMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (1.8); REVIEW

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			MEMORANDUM REGARDING INDENTURE PROVISIONS AND LIENS (.5)
SALCEDO	08/01/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	08/04/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	08/05/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/06/03	.80	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING IMPALA SUCCESS SERVICES FEE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING KERP (2X) (.5)
SALCEDO	08/06/03	.20	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET AND DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW.
ROSENBERG	08/07/03	.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CANTOR REGARDING KERP, IMPALA (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING KERP, IMPALA (.4); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIETY OF E-MAILS REGARDING RETENTION ISSUES (.3)
SALCEDO	08/07/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/08/03	.50	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS RE RETENTIONS
SALCEDO	08/08/03	.70	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); PREPARED JULY BILL (.60).
SALCEDO	08/11/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/12/03	2.30	SPECIALL COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (2.3)
SIEGEL	08/12/03	.50	INCOMING PLEADINGS (.3); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATE (.1); EMAIL REGARDING KERP MOTION (.1)
SALCEDO	08/12/03	2.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, REVISED JULY INVOICE AND SENT TO PARTIES (.40); PREPARED EXHIBITS FOR INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (1.60).
SALCEDO	08/13/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	08/14/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET FOR REVIEW.
ROSENBERG	08/15/03	3.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. HUNDT REGARDING M&A PROPOSAL, BUSINESS PLAN (1.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW M&A PROPOSAL (1.0); REVIEW BOARD MATERIALS

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			REGARDING IMPALA PROGRESS AND FEE (.4)
ROSENBERG	08/18/03	3.10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. HUNDT REGARDING M&A PROCESS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH PROFESSIONALS REGARDING BOARD MEETING(1.0); BOARD MEETING (1.4)
SALCEDO	08/18/03	.40	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); ORGANIZED PLEADINGS (.30).
ROSENBERG	08/19/03	1.00	SPECIAL COMMITTEE CALL (1.)
SALCEDO	08/19/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/20/03	.40	E-MAILS REGARDING KERP, PLAN PROPOSALS (.2); REVIEW PRESS RELEASE REGARDING 2ND QUARTER RESULTS (.2)
SALCEDO	08/20/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	08/21/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	08/22/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	08/25/03	.50	REVIEW KERP DUE DILIGENCE (.5)
ROSENBERG	08/27/03	.60	REVIEW MERRILL LYNCH ANALYSIS
ROSENBERG	08/28/03	1.70	STEERING COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (1.7)
ROSENBERG	08/29/03	1.50	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT INVESTIGATIVE RELPORT
SALCEDO	09/02/03	.30	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); TELEPHONECALL WITH S. WANG REGARDING INVOICES (.20).
SALCEDO	09/03/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET FOR REVIEW.
ROSENBERG	09/04/03	.30	REVIEW MEMORANDUM REGARDING UNFINISHED BOARD BUSINESS
SALCEDO	09/04/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/05/03	.50	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); PREPARED AUGUST INVOICE (.40).
SALCEDO	09/08/03	.50	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); REVISED AUGUST INVOICE AND SENT OUT (.40).
ROSENBERG	09/10/03	.80	REVIEW BOARD RESOLUTIONS REGARDING SPECIAL COMMITTEE,

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			SPECIAL INVESTIGATION, BOARD COMPENSATION (.5) REVIEW MOTIONS STATUS REPORT (.3)
SALCEDO	09/10/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/11/03	1.00	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); AS PER R. ROSENBERG, OBTAINED SAMPLES OF FEE APPLICATION (.60); AS PER R. ROSENBERG, ORGANIZATION OF FILE (.30).
SALCEDO	09/12/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	09/13/03	1.00	REVIEW ADDITIONAL BOARD MATERIALS
ROSENBERG	09/14/03	2.00	BOARD CALL
SALCEDO	09/15/03	.70	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET (.10); ORGANIZATION OF B. ROSENBERG FILES (.60).
SALCEDO	09/16/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/17/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/18/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/19/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	09/22/03	.70	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. HUNDT REGARDING PROCESS ISSUES
SALCEDO	09/22/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	09/23/03	1.60	REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING M&A TRANSACTION (.7); COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (.9)
SALCEDO	09/23/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/24/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/25/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
SALCEDO	09/26/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.
ROSENBERG	09/29/03	.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING PLAN ALTERNATIVES
SALCEDO	09/29/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
ROSENBERG	09/30/03	.60	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM POTENTIAL BIDDERS, E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE
SALCEDO	09/30/03	.10	AS PER G. JOSEPHSON, OBTAINED UPDATED DOCKET.

For professional services rendered from May 14, 2003 through September 30, 2003.

re: INVESTIGATION,

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
J A CHERNEY	06/17/03	1.50	REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIAL (.5); CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN, T. HARDWICKE AND B. FARIS REGARDING FORMATION OF COMMITTEE, GOALS, DOCUMENT NEEDS, ETC. (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING BACKGROUND (.3)
T B HARDWICKE	06/17/03	1.00	CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN AND B. FARIS RE BACKGROUND TO INVESTIGATION (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN, B. FARIS, J. CHERNEY RE CLIENT INTERVIEW SET FOR 6/18 (0.4); REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS (0.3)
BC FARIS	06/17/03	.60	MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN, T. HARDWICKE AND J. CHERNEY REGARDING INVESTIGATION OF EMPLOYEE PREPARATION OF FINANCIAL PROJECTIONS (0.6)
J A CHERNEY	06/18/03	2.00	MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN AND T. HARDWICKE REGARDING PROCEDURAL ISSUES (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GERSTEIN, T. HARDWICKE AND A. TERRY REGARDING STARTING COMMITTEE WORK (.7); REVIEW WORLDCOM REPORT (1.0)
T B HARDWICKE	06/18/03	2.00	REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS INCLUDING REPORT RE EMPLOYEE'S ACTIONS AT WORLDCOM AND DRAFT BOARD RESOLUTIONS RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE AND RECENT DELAWARE DECISION RE SPECIAL COMMITTEES (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. TERRY RE INVESTIGATION (1.0)
T B HARDWICKE	06/19/03	.70	LETTER TO A. TERRY RE DOCUMENTS NEEDED (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH A. KIRK RE LEGAL RESEARCH (0.2)
J A CHERNEY	06/20/03	1.60	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. FARIS, M. GERSTEIN AND T.

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			HARDWICKE (.6); ATTENTION TO WORLDCOM REPORT (1.0)
J A CHERNEY	06/23/03	2.70	REVIEW ORACLE DECISION (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING STATUS (.2); REVIEW COMPANY SEC FILING (1.5)
BC FARIS	06/23/03	1.00	REVIEW DELAWARE SUPREME COURT CASE KRASNER V. MOFFETT REGARDING STANDARD OF REVIEW FOR SPECIAL COMMITTEE ACTIONS (.4); MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.3); E-MAIL T. HARDWICKE REGARDING INTERVIEWS OF PROPOSED MEMBERS OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.3)
J A CHERNEY	06/24/03	2.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING PLANS FOR INVESTIGATION (.3); REVIEW DELAWARE LAW ON SPECIAL COMMITTEE INDEPENDENCE (2.0)
T B HARDWICKE	06/24/03	1.00	ATTENTION TO LEGAL RESEARCH ISSUES RE DIRECTOR ON SPECIAL COMMITTEE
AR KIRK	06/24/03	2.30	RESEARCH TEXAS LAW REGARDING EMPLOYMENT RELATIONSHIP (0.8); REVIEW REPORT OF SPECIAL INVESTIGATION OF WORLDCOM FOR ISSUES RELATED TO DEBTOR INTERNAL INVESTIGATION (1.5)
J A CHERNEY	06/25/03	3.00	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.5); ATTENTION TO INDEPENDENCE ISSUES AND REVIEW CASE LAW (2.5)
T B HARDWICKE	06/25/03	1.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS SENT BY CLIENT RE EMPLOYEE WORK
AR KIRK	06/25/03	1.00	RESEARCH CASELAW REGARDING INDEPENDENCE OF OUTSIDE DIRECTORS (0.8); CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING SAME (0.2)
J A CHERNEY	06/26/03	2.20	REVIEW E-MAILS (.2); MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN, B. FARIS AND T. HARDWICKE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ROSENBERG (.5); CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE; ATTENTION TO INDEPENDENCE ISSUES, CASELAW, ETC. (1.5)
T B HARDWICKE	06/26/03	1.40	CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. ROSENBERG RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE ISSUES (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH A. TERRY RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE ISSUES (0.3); E-MAIL LW TEAM RE SAME (0.3); REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE (0.3)
AR KIRK	06/26/03	3.90	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BARKER REGARDING RESEARCH ON INDEPENDENCE OF OUTSIDE DIRECTORS (0.2); RESEARCH SAME ISSUE (2.5); RESEARCH TEXAS EMPLOYMENT LAW FOR PURPOSES OF

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			INTERNAL INVESTIGATION (1.2)
J A CHERNEY	06/27/03	1.60	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND BACKGROUND MATERIAL (1.0); MISCELLANEOUS EMAILS (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN, T. HARDWICKE (0.3)
T B HARDWICKE	06/27/03	.20	SEND CASELAW TO A. TERRY AND E-MAIL RE SAME
J A CHERNEY	06/30/03	.50	CONFERENCE WITH B. FARIS, M. GERSTEIN REGARDING COMMITTEE COMPOSITION, INDEPENDENCE ETC. (0.5)
T B HARDWICKE	06/30/03	1.00	REVIEW EMPLOYEE DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY CLIENT
CHERNEY	07/01/03	1.00	TELECONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE (0.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (0.9)
HARDWICKE	07/01/03	.90	CONTINUE TO REVIEW S. SEETH DOCUMENTS (0.8); CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN RE DIRECTOR SELECTION FOR SPECIAL COMMITTEE (0.1)
KIRK	07/01/03	.60	RESEARCH TEXAS LAWS REGARDING INTERNAL CORPORATE INVESTIGATIONS (0.6)
KIRK	07/02/03	1.20	RESEARCH TEXAS LAWS REGARDING INTERNAL CORPORATE INVESTIGATIONS (1.2)
KIRK	07/07/03	5.60	RESEARCH TEXAS LAWS REGARDING INTERNAL CORPORATE INVESTIGATIONS (5.6)
KIRK	07/08/03	.80	DRAFT BRIEF MEMORANDUM REGARDING TEXAS LAWS AFFECTING INTERNAL CORPORATE INVESTIGATIONS (0.8)
CHERNEY	07/09/03	.90	CONFERENCES WITH M. GERSTEIN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE AND M. TRESNOWSKI (.4); ATTENTION TO FACT INVESTIGATION (.5)
CHERNEY	07/10/03	.50	E-MAILS TO M. TRESNOWSKI, M. GERSTEIN AND T. HARDWICKE
CHERNEY	07/11/03	1.50	PREPARE FOR AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG (.8); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (.7)
HARDWICKE	07/11/03	2.70	PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW OF J. GOLDBERG, INCLUDING REVIEW OF BACKGROUND MATERIALS, CASE LAW AND PREPARE OUTLINE (1.7); INTERVIEW J. GOLDBERG (1.0)
CHERNEY	07/14/03	.30	E-MAILS TO J. GOLDBERG (.3)
CHERNEY	07/17/03	2.30	CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE (.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			DOCUMENTS (2.0)
HARDWICKE	07/17/03	.50	STRATEGY RE INVESTIGATION (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH A. TERRY RE INTERVIEW WITH EMPLOYEE (0.2)
CHERNEY	07/18/03	1.30	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE; REVIEW E-MAILS (.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS (1.0)
HARDWICKE	07/18/03	.20	E-MAILS A. TERRY RE INTERVIEWS IN DALLAS
CHERNEY	07/21/03	2.60	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING PLANS TO INTERVIEW EMPLOYEE (.3); MISCELLANEOUS E-MAILS (.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIAL (2.0)
HARDWICKE	07/21/03	1.10	CONFERENCE WITH EMPLOYEE RE INTERVIEW SCOPE, LOGISTICS (0.5); E-MAIL A. TERRY RE SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE SAME (0.2); STRATEGY RE NEXT STEP (0.2)
CHERNEY	07/22/03	1.50	PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW FOR EMPLOYEE; MISCELLANEOUS E-MAILS (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.5)
HARDWICKE	07/22/03	2.00	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH EMPLOYEE AND CONDUCT INTERNET SEARCHES RE EMPLOYEE
CHERNEY	07/23/03	2.00	REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS AND FILES
HARDWICKE	07/23/03	13.00	PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW OF EMPLOYEE AND TRAVEL TO AND FROM DALLAS FOR THE SAME (7.0) INTERVIEW EMPLOYEE IN DALLAS, TEXAS (5.0) AND REVIEW MATERIALS EMPLOYEE MADE AVAILABLE (1.0)
CHERNEY	07/24/03	2.00	CONFERENCES AND TELECONFERENCE T. HARDWICKE RE: INTERVIEW RESULTS (0.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (1.3)
HARDWICKE	07/24/03	1.00	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE EMPLOYEE INTERVIEW AND E-MAIL J. GOLDBERG RE SAME (0.6); REVISE NOTES OF EMPLOYEE MEETING (0.6)
CHERNEY	07/25/03	.30	MISCELLANEOUS EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES (0.3)
HARDWICKE	07/25/03	.30	E-MAIL TO J. GOLDBERG RE EMPLOYEE INTERVIEW AND CONFERENCE CALL
CHERNEY	07/29/03	2.20	REVIEW MEMORANDUM ON INTERVIEW (1.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE (.2)
CHERNEY	07/30/03	1.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG (.6); REVIEW DOCUMENT (1.0)

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
HARDWICKE	07/30/03	1.50	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG RE INVESTIGATION (0.5); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG RE INVESTIGATION (0.7); CONFERENCE WITH A. TERRY RE SCHEDULING NEXT STEPS IN INVESTIGATION (0.3)
CHERNEY	07/31/03	.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND MIS E-MAILS AND VOICEMAILS (.7)
CHERNEY	08/01/03	1.70	ARRANGE INTERVIEWS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. TERRY (.1); VOICEMAIL TO T. HARDWICKE (.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (1.0)
CHERNEY	08/04/03	.80	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING INTERVIEW SCHEDULE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.3)
HARDWICKE	08/04/03	.50	CONFERENCE RE ADDITIONAL INTERVIEWS RE INVESTIGATION
CHERNEY	08/05/03	.80	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. ROSENBERG; CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE
ROSENBERG	08/05/03	.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE, J. CHERNEY REGARDING STATUS OF INVESTIGATION
HARDWICKE	08/05/03	1.00	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE NEXT STEPS IN INVESTIGATION (.20); CONFERENCE WITH B. ROSENBERG RE STATUS OF INVESTIGATION (.30); PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW (.50)
CHERNEY	08/06/03	.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE
HARDWICKE	08/06/03	2.30	INTERVIEW EMPLOYEE FOR INVESTIGATION; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME
HARDWICKE	08/07/03	7.00	INTERVIEW M. TRESNOWSKI AND P. SHAH AT ALLEGIANCE HEADQUARTERS IN LOMBARD (4.50); MEMO RE SAME (1.30); REVIEW NEW DOCUMENTS SENT BY CLIENT DURING INTERVIEW (1.20)
HARDWICKE	08/08/03	3.10	DRAFT OUTLINE REPORT (1.0) ; FURTHER INTERVIEW WITH EMPLOYEE (.80); CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE DALLAS INTERVIEWS (.30); REVISE FILE MEMO RE INTERVIEWS FOR J. CHERNEY (1.0)
CHERNEY	08/11/03	1.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES TO ARRANGE DALLAS INTERVIEWS (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (1.0)
CHERNEY	08/12/03	6.50	PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS IN DALLAS AND TRAVEL TO DALLAS, INCLUDING DOCUMENT REVIEW, WITNESS OUTLINES, REVIEWING NOTES (6.5)
CHERNEY	08/13/03	11.00	INTERVIEW EMPLOYEES AND PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS (7.0); TRAVEL TO CHICAGO AND REVIEW AND WRITE UP NOTES (4.0)

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
HARDWICKE	08/13/03	.50	CONFERENCE WITH EMPLOYEE RE INVESTIGATION
CHERNEY	08/17/03	2.00	DRAFT MEMOS FROM INTERVIEWS IN DALLAS (2.0)
HARDWICKE	08/18/03	4.40	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE INTERVIEWS OF EMPLOYEES (.30); E-MAIL TO J. GOLDBERG RE STATUS (.10); DRAFT REPORT (4.0)
CHERNEY	08/21/03	2.30	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING DRAFT REPORT (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG (.5); ATTENTION TO INTERVIEW NOTES, OUTLINE OF REPORT, ETC. (1.0)
HARDWICKE	08/21/03	8.50	CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG RE PRELIMINARY CONCLUSIONS OF INVESTIGATION (.70); CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE SAME AND NEXT STEPS (.70); INTERNET RESEARCH AND DRAFT REPORT (7.10)
CHERNEY	08/22/03	1.30	REVIEW NOTES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG; CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE
HARDWICKE	08/22/03	4.80	INTERNET RESEARCH AND DRAFT PRELIMINARY INVESTIGATIVE REPORT (4.0); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH M. TRESNOWSKI RE OPEN FACTUAL ISSUES (.80)
CHERNEY	08/24/03	3.00	REVIEW WORLDCOM SPECIAL COMMITTEE REPORT
CHERNEY	08/25/03	.80	REVIEW WORLDCOM REPORT
HARDWICKE	08/25/03	7.50	DRAFT PRELIMINARY REPORT OF INVESTIGATION
CHERNEY	08/26/03	.80	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING DRAFT REPORT, OPEN ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TRESNOWSKI, RESOLUTIONS, ETC (.8)
HARDWICKE	08/26/03	7.80	CONTINUE TO DRAFT INVESTIGATIVE REPORT
KIRK	08/26/03	2.10	CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING REPORT TO SPECIAL COMMITTEE (0.3); REVIEW REPORTS AND NEWS ARTICLES RELATING TO INVESTIGATION (1.8)
CHERNEY	08/27/03	1.50	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE; ATTENTION TO DRAFT REPORT
HARDWICKE	08/27/03	5.50	CONTINUE TO DRAFT PRELIMINARY INVESTIGATIVE REPORT AND SEND DRAFT TO J. CHERNEY
KIRK	08/27/03	2.60	REVIEW REPORTS AND OTHER DOCUMENTS RELATED TO INVESTIGATION (2.6)

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
CHERNEY	08/28/03	2.60	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REPORT (1.5); CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GERSTEIN AND T. HARDWICKE (.3); MISCELLANEOUS E-MAILS (.3)
HARDWICKE	08/28/03	4.20	EXTENSIVE INTERVIEW RESEARCH RE MATTERS AFFECTING ALLEGIANCE, WORLD COM COLLAPSE AND FORMER WORLD COM EMPLOYEES (3.0); CALLS TO J. GOLDBERG RE CONFERENCE CALL RE DRAFT REPORT (.20); BEGIN TO REVISE DRAFT REPORT TO J. CHERNEY COMMENTS (1.0)
KIRK	08/28/03	5.20	REVIEW REPORTS AND DOCUMENTS RELATED TO INVESTIGATION (4.9); DRAFT EMAIL TO T. HARDWICKE REGARDING FINDINGS (0.3)
CHERNEY	08/29/03	1.00	CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE REGARDING REVISIONS TO DRAFT REPORT (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING DRAFT REPORT (.5)
HARDWICKE	08/29/03	4.50	CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG RE DRAFT REPORT AND DRAFT CONCLUSIONS (.80); FINALIZE REVISED DRAFT REPORT AND SEND TO B. ROSENBERG, M. GERSTEIN FOR REVIEW (3.70)
KIRK	08/29/03	.70	PREPARE APPENDIX TO REPORT OF INVESTIGATION (0.7)
GERSTEIN	08/31/03	.90	REVIEW OF DRAFT REPORT
CHERNEY	09/02/03	2.00	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REPORT (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING (.3); DRAFT REPORT (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE (.3)
GERSTEIN	09/02/03	.50	MEETING WITH J. CHERNEY RE REPORT DRAFT
HARDWICKE	09/02/03	1.10	REVIEW COMMENTS BY R. ROSENBERG AND M. GERSTEIN TO DRAFT REPORT AND CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE SAME (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH M. TRESNOWSKI RE RESOLUTIONS AUTHORITY SPECIAL COMMITTEE (0.2); REVIEW DRAFT RESOLUTIONS SENT BY M. TRESNOWSKI (0.4)
KIRK	09/02/03	1.00	PREPARE INVESTIGATIVE REPORT AND APPENDIX TO SAME (1.0)
CHERNEY	09/03/03	1.40	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REPORT (1.2); E-MAILS TO AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. HARDWICKE
HARDWICKE	09/03/03	3.50	FURTHER INTERVIEW WITH TARGET (0.8); COMMENTS TO B. FARIS RE DRAFT RESOLUTIONS AND CONFERENCE WITH J. CHERNEY RE SAME (0.7); FINALIZE FIRST DRAFT REPORT AND APPENDIX AND SEND TO J.

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			GOLDBERG (2.0)
HARDWICKE	09/04/03	.10	CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG RE DRAFT REPORT DELIVERED TO HIM ON 9/4
HARDWICKE	09/08/03	.20	CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDBERG AND SCHEDULE CALL FOR 9/11 WITH J. CHERNEY
CHERNEY	09/11/03	1.20	PREPARE FOR AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG REGARDING DRAFT REPORT (1.2)
HARDWICKE	09/11/03	3.50	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. CHERNEY AND J. GOLDBERG RE DRAFT REPORT (1.5); REVISE DRAFT REPORT AND DRAFT COVER LETTER FOR SAME PER J. GOLDBERG COMMENTS (2.0)
CHERNEY	09/12/03	1.00	FINAL CHANGES TO DRAFT REPORT AND CONFERENCE WITH T. HARDWICKE (1.0)
ROSENBERG	09/12/03	.50	REVIEW REVISIONS TO DRAFT INVESTIGATIVE REPORT
HARDWICKE	09/12/03	1.00	FINALIZE REVISIONS TO REPORT PER J. GOLDBERG AND J. CHERNEY COMMENTS AND SEND SAME TO J. GOLDBERG FOR REVIEW
HARDWICKE	09/14/03	.20	E-MAIL J. GOLDBERG RE REVISED REPORT
HARDWICKE	09/15/03	.80	REVISE AND FINALIZE REPORT AND COVER LETTER PER J. GOLDBERG'S COMMENTS ON LATEST DRAFT
HARDWICKE	09/16/03	.30	ATTENTION TO DISTRIBUTION OF REPORT TO BOARD OF DIRECTORS
HARDWICKE	09/24/03	.10	E-MAIL J. GOLDBERG RE STATUS

For professional services rendered from May 14, 2003 through September 30, 2003.

re: CORPORATE ORGANIZATION

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
M D GERSTEIN	06/10/03	.60	SPECIAL COMMITTEE CALL WITH B. FARIS RE REVISED RESOLUTIONS (.2); REVIEW REVISED RESOLUTIONS AND FOLLOW-UP ON RESEARCH (.4)
M D GERSTEIN	06/11/03	.10	E-MAIL TRAFFIC WITH B. FARIS, B. ROSENBERG

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
M D GERSTEIN	06/12/03	.50	MEETING WITH S. BARKER RE INDEPENDENCE RESEARCH; FOLLOW-UP
S BARKER	06/12/03	3.60	MEET WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING NEW PROJECT (.50); GATHER PROXY STATEMENT/YEARLY REPORTS OF ALLIANCE FOR RESEARCH (1.0); MEET WITH B. FARIS ON BACKGROUND/PROX (1.0); READ BACKGROUND INFORMATION ON DIRECTOR INDEPENDENCE (1.1)
S BARKER	06/15/03	2.40	CONDUCT LEXIS RESEARCH ON DE CASES REGARDING DIRECTOR INDEPENDENCE, SPECIAL COMMITTEES, COMPENSATION STRUCTURES
M D GERSTEIN	06/16/03	1.50	(SPECIAL COMMITTEE) CALL WITH M. TRESNOWSKI AND A. TERRY RE EMPLOYEE ISSUE (.50); FOLLOW-UP WITH J. CHERNEY, T. HARDWICKE (.30) MEETING WITH S. BARBER RE DIRECTOR INDEPENDENCE ISSUE (.70)
S BARKER	06/16/03	6.10	CONTINUE INTERNET RESEARCH; PREPARE MEMORANDUM ON FINDINGS; MEET WITH M. GERSTEIN; EMAIL R. ROSENBERG (NY)
M D GERSTEIN	06/17/03	2.90	FOLLOW-UP CALL FROM A. TERRY AND CALL WITH R. ROSENBERG (.2); MEETINGS WITH T. HARDWICKE, J. CHERNEY, B. FARIS RE INDEPENDENT INVESTIGATION (1.2); MEETING WITH B. FARIS RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE ISSUES (.5); REVISE SPECIAL COMMITTEE RESOLUTIONS (1.0)
S BARKER	06/17/03	1.40	FINISH MEMORANDUM ON DIRECTOR INDEPENDENCE
M D GERSTEIN	06/18/03	1.90	REVISE RESOLUTIONS AND DRAFT E-MAIL IN RESPONSE TO GOLDBERG, HUNT E-MAILS (.60); REVIEW STRINE OPINION (1.0); CALL WITH B. ROSENBERG RE DIRECTORS (.10); E-MAIL TO GROUP (.20)
M D GERSTEIN	06/18/03	.90	DISCUSSION WITH A. TERRY, D. HENDRICK, J. CHERNEY RE INVESTIGATION (.40); FOLLOW-UP (.50)
BC FARIS	06/18/03	1.70	REVIEW RESOLUTIONS ESTABLISHING SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.2); REVIEW ORACLE DELAWARE CASE REGARDING DEFINITION OF "INDEPENDENCE" IN SPECIAL LITIGATION COMMITTEES (1.5)
M D GERSTEIN	06/20/03	.10	CALL WITH J. CHERNEY ON DIRECTOR BACKGROUND
M D GERSTEIN	06/23/03	2.80	SPECIAL COMMITTEE REVIEW OF KRASNER REGARDING MOFFET (6122); CALL WITH R. ROSENBERG REGARDING DIRECTOR INTERESTS; FOLLOW-UP WITH B. FARIS AND S. BARBER (1.3); MEETING WITH B. FARIS AND S. BARBER ON INDEPENDENCE ISSUE (.5)
S BARKER	06/23/03	3.40	RESEARCH NEW ISSUE RELATING TO DIRECTOR INDEP. (PREVIOUS

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			PROJECT) (1.60), ATTEND MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN, B. FARIS TO DISCUSS RESEARCH (.30); READ RECENT DEL OPINION(1.50)
M D GERSTEIN	06/24/03	.30	CALL WITH K. ABRAHMS REGARDING INDEPENDENCE
BC FARIS	06/24/03	1.10	REVIEW DELAWARE CASE OF KRASNER V. MOFFETT REGARDING STANDARD OF REVIEW IN DELAWARE FOR ACTION OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.8); RESEARCH ADDITIONAL CASE-LAW REGARDING SAME (.3)
S BARKER	06/24/03	1.90	CONTINUE UPDATE ON ALLEGIANCE RESEARCH (.80); LEXIS RESEARCH ON STANDARDS FOR INDEPENDENCE OF DIRECTOR FIRM (.80)
M D GERSTEIN	06/26/03	.50	MEETING WITH T. HARDWICKE, B. FARIS (.3); CALL TO ROSENBERG (.1); FOLLOW-UP WITH T. HARDWICKE (.1); CALL REGARDING INDEPENDENCE ISSUE
BC FARIS	06/26/03	.60	MEETING WITH J, CHERNEY REGARDING ANALYSIS OF DIRECTOR CONTRACTS (.2); MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN, J. CHERNEY & T. HARDWICKE REGARDING SAME (.4)
S BARKER	06/26/03	.20	PHONE CALL WITH A. KIRK ON RESEARCH UPDATE; PHONE CALL/EMAIL B. FARIS REGARDING RESEARCH FINDINGS
M D GERSTEIN	06/27/03	.50	REVIEW OF INDEPENDENCE ISSUE (.5)
M D GERSTEIN	06/30/03	1.50	MEETING WITH B. FARIS RE INDEPENDENCE ISSUE RE DIRECTOR (.4); CALLS WITH M. TRESNOWSKI AND R. ROSENBERG RE INDEPENDENCE ISSUES (.7); CALL WITH R. ALEXANDER RE ISSUE (.3); CALL WITH S. WILSON (.3); FOLLOW-UP WITH B. FARIS (.1)
BC FARIS	06/30/03	1.00	MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING DIRECTOR'S INDEPENDENCE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN AND M. TRESNOWSKI REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GERSTEIN AND DELAWARE COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.3)
GERSTEIN	07/03/03	.60	CALLS RE LIPMAN MATERIALITY ISSUES
GERSTEIN	07/10/03	.30	CALL WITH J. CHERNEY RE PROCESS ON INVESTIGATION
GERSTEIN	07/14/03	.20	CALL WITH B. ROSENBERG RE SPECIAL COMMITTEE STATUS
GERSTEIN	07/17/03	.90	CALL WITH J. GOLDBERG AND B. ROSENBERG RE COMPOSITION AND MANDATE OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE; FOLLOW-UP
GERSTEIN	07/18/03	.70	CALL WITH RLF (.3); FOLLOW-UP TO R. ROSENBERG, B. FARIS RE MOVE

<u>EMPLOYEE NAME</u>	<u>WORKDATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>
			TO RELY ON ENTIRE BOARD (.4)
FARIS	07/18/03	1.10	MEETING WITH M. GERSTEIN REGARDING COMPOSITION OF RESTRUCTURING COMMITTEE (0.3); REVISE AND DISTRIBUTE RESOLUTIONS REGARDING FORMATION OF SAME (0.8)
GERSTEIN	07/20/03	.90	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM DIRECTORS ON BOARD COMPOSITION (.40); CALL WITH B. ROSENBERG (.40); FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS TO B. FARIS (.10)
GERSTEIN	07/21/03	1.50	CALLS WITH B. FARIS, B. ROSENBERG RE MEMORANDUM TO BOARD (.50); REVIEW, COMMENT ON MEMORANDUM (.50); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OUTLINE FOR MEETING (.50)
FARIS	07/21/03	6.10	REVIEW PROXY RULES AND E-MAIL M. GERSTEIN REGARDING DISCLOSURE OF RELATED PARTY TRANSACTIONS (0.4); DRAFT AND DISTRIBUTE MEMO REGARDING DUTIES OF BOARD OF DIRECTORS WITH RESPECT TO ROLE AND COMPOSITION OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE (5.7)
GERSTEIN	07/22/03	1.70	CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOARD RE STRUCTURE OF SPECIAL COMMITTEE (.90); REVISE RESOLUTIONS PER DISCUSSIONS (.80)
GERSTEIN	08/26/03	.40	MEETING WITH T. HARDWICKE RE REPORT AND RESOLUTIONS
FARIS	09/03/03	.30	REVIEW BOARD RESOLUTIONS
FARIS	09/04/03	1.10	REVISE AND DISTRIBUTE BOARD RESOLUTIONS
GERSTEIN	09/08/03	.40	REVIEW MINUTES; COMMENT TO B. FARIS
FARIS	09/08/03	.70	REVISE AND DISTRIBUTE SPECIAL COMMITTEE BOARD RESOLUTIONS