

Project Codes 1 Through 21

BLANK ROME LLP

THE CHRYSLER BUILDING
405 LEXINGTON AVENUE
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10174
(212) 885-5000 FAX: (212) 885-5001
FEDERAL TAX I.D. NO. 23-1311874

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 22, 2009
CHECKERS MICHIGAN LLC MATTER NO. 131878-01601 05954
1200 NORTH FEDERAL INVOICE NO. 1022606
SUITE 111B
BOCA RATON, FL 33432

REGARDING: ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
CHECKERS MICHIGAN LLC
CHAPTER 11

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2009

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIMEKEEPER	CODE	HOURS	VALUE
01	BLANK ROME FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS				
08/09/09	ATTENTION TO FEE APPLICATION MATERIALS	CAVALIERE	01	2.70	1,309.50
08/10/09	E-MAILS WITH E. CHAN REGARDING FEE APPLICATION ISSUES	CAVALIERE	01	.20	97.00
08/13/09	REVISIONS TO FEE APPLICATION MATERIALS (.5); E-MAILS WITH E. CHAN REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE	01	.70	339.50
08/24/09	REVIEW CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION FOR LEGAL FEES (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. MORALES REGARDING REVISIONS TO SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE	01	.20	97.00
08/24/09	PREPARE CNO FOR BLANK ROME FIRST FEE APPLICATION (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.1)	MORALES	01	.80	216.00
08/25/09	DRAFT AND PREPARE SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION, EXPENSE CHART, SUMMARY OF ATTORNEY TIME CHART AND TASK CODE CHART	MORALES	01	2.80	756.00
08/28/09	REVIEW AND REVISE 2ND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR BLANK ROME	MORALES	01	1.50	405.00

08/31/09	REVIEW AND REVISE SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF BLANK ROME	CAVALIERE 01	1.70	824.50
01	TOTAL FOR BLANK ROME FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICA	10.60	4,044.50	
02	OTHER PROFESSIONALS' FEE/EMPLOYMENT ISSUES			
08/10/09	REVIEW OF NOTICE OF MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FILED BY CREDITORS COMMITTEE	BROWNSTEIN 02	.10	72.50
08/13/09	REVIEW COMMITTEE'S COUNSEL FEE APPLICATION FOR JUNE	CAVALIERE 02	.20	97.00
08/13/09	REVIEW OF FEE APPLICATION OF KLEHR HARRISON	BROWNSTEIN 02	.30	217.50
08/19/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND N. MORALES REGARDING CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION FOR PRAETORIAN'S FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.1); OBTAIN AND REVIEW DOCKET AND PRAETORIAN'S FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.2); PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION FOR PRAETORIAN'S FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.3)	GUILFOYLE 02	.60	153.00
08/20/09	REVIEW KLEHR HARRISON JUNE FEE APPLICATION	CARICKHOFF 02	.20	90.00
02	TOTAL FOR OTHER PROFESSIONALS' FEE/EMPLOYME	1.40	630.00	
03	EXECUTORY CONTRACTS AND UNEXPIRED LEASES			
08/03/09	E-MAILS WITH D. MYERS REGARDING ISSUES PERTAINING TO BALAN REJECTED LEASE	CAVALIERE 03	.30	145.50
08/04/09	E-MAIL FROM D. MYERS REGARDING BALAN RENT PAYMENT	CAVALIERE 03	.10	48.50
08/04/09	E-MAIL TO M. SEILER REGARDING EQUIPMENT LEASE MOTION (.1); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM M. SEILER REGARDING SAME AND REVIEW REVISED MOTION (.4)	CAVALIERE 03	.50	242.50
08/04/09	REVISE MOTION TO REJECT EQUIPMENT LEASES	SEILER 03	.30	82.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009 PAGE 3

08/05/09	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR REJECTION OF EQUIPMENT LEASES (.2); E-MAILS WITH M. SEILER REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 03	.40	194.00
08/05/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM J. BOCSKAI REGARDING VENDOR CAPITAL CHART (.1); REVIEW CHART (.2); E-MAIL TO A. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 03	.40	194.00
08/05/09	REVISE MOTION TO REJECT EQUIPMENT LEASES	SEILER 03	.50	137.50
08/06/09	DRAFT SUPPLEMENTAL NOTICE OF POSSIBLE ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT OF CONTRACTS (1.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (.4); E-MAIL TO D. CARICKHOFF AND N. MORALES REGARDING FILING (.1); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH N. MORALES AND D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING NOTICE (.2); E-MAIL TO/FROM BMC REGARDING SERVICE (.2)	CAVALIERE 03	2.20	1,067.00
08/06/09	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF MOTION TO REJECT EQUIPMENT LEASES AND REVISIONS TO MOTION/ORDER (.3); E-MAILS WITH M. SEILER REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAILS TO D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING FILING (.2); E-MAILS WITH D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING MOTION AND E-MAILS TO N. MORALES REGARDING FILING (.2); E-MAILS WITH A. CARTER REGARDING SERVICE (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING EXCLUSION OF SYNERGY CONTRACT FROM REJECTION MOTION (.1)	CAVALIERE 03	1.20	582.00
08/06/09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SUPPLEMENTED CURE NOTICE (.1); AND REVIEW AND FINALIZE SAME (.2)	CARICKHOFF 03	.30	135.00
08/06/09	REVIEW AND FINALIZE MOTION TO REJECT EQUIPMENT LEASES	CARICKHOFF 03	.50	225.00
08/06/09	REVISE MOTION AS PER R. CAVALIERE'S COMMENTS	SEILER 03	.20	55.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009 PAGE 4

08/07/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM A. THOMPSON REGARDING EQUIPMENT AT STORED LOCATIONS AND OTHER LOCATIONS	CAVALIERE 03	.10	48.50
08/10/09	REVIEW CHART PROVIDED BY VENDOR CAPITAL IN CONNECTION WITH EQUIPMENT	CAVALIERE 03	.20	97.00
08/12/09	E-MAILS WITH J. BOCSKAI REGARDING RENT AT CLOSED LOCATIONS WHICH WERE ADJOURNED TO AUGUST 26, 2009	CAVALIERE 03	.40	194.00
08/13/09	PREPARE CHART RELATING TO CLOSED STORES THAT ARE SUBJECT OF ADJOURNED REJECTION MOTION (.7); E-MAIL TO L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY(.1); E-MAIL TO L. BRACKMAN REGARDING PROPOSED RESOLUTION (.2); E-MAIL TO R. LEMISCH REGARDING PROPOSED RESOLUTION (.3)	CAVALIERE 03	1.30	630.50
08/24/09	E-MAILS TO/FROM D. MYERS REGARDING STATUS OF EQUIPMENT LESSOR MOTION (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING REJECTED STORES LIST (.2)	CAVALIERE 03	.40	194.00
08/24/09	E-MAILS WITH L. BRACKMAN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF REJECTED STORES MOTION (.3); E-MAILS WITH R. LEMISCH REGARDING SAME (.3)	CAVALIERE 03	.60	291.00
08/24/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LEASE REJECTION MOTION TO D. MYERS AND RESOLUTION OF SAME	BROWNSTEIN 03	.10	72.50
08/24/09	CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING LEASE REJECTIONS AND ISSUES REGARDING SAME	BROWNSTEIN 03	.20	145.00
08/25/09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS E-MAILS WITH T. LINDSEY AND D. MUN CONCERNING EQUIPMENT LEASES	CAVALIERE 03	.40	194.00
08/25/09	VOICEMAILS WITH L. BRACKMAN REGARDING ATTEMPTED RESOLUTION OF REJECTED STORE LEASE	CAVALIERE 03	.20	97.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009 PAGE 5

08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING LEASE REJECTION AND ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 03	.10	72.50
03	TOTAL FOR EXECUTORY CONTRACTS AND UNEXPIRED	10.90	5,144.50	
05	COMMITTEE BUSINESS AND MEETINGS			
08/03/09	E-MAIL TO L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SCHEDULING OF TIME TO DISCUSS REQUESTS (.1); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING ISSUES PERTAINING TO DOCUMENT REQUESTS (.3); PHONE CALL WITH R. BECK REGARDING SAME (.4); PHONE CALL WITH M. SPRITZER REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.2); E-MAIL TO M. SPRITZER REGARDING SAME (.2); PHONE CALL WITH M. KOWALCZYK REGARDING FINANCING STATEMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH REQUEST (.1); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING UCC SEWCHES (.1)	CAVALIERE 05	1.40	679.00
08/03/09	DISCUSSION WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SEARCHES CONDUCTED IN CONNECTION WITH LEASED EQUIPMENT IN FURTHERANCE OF COMMITTEE'S REQUESTS	ABRAHAMS 05	.10	65.00
08/04/09	INITIAL PREPARATION OF LETTER IN RESPONSE TO COMMITTEE'S REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION	CAVALIERE 05	1.10	533.50
08/04/09	PHONE CALL WITH M. SPRITZER REGARDING COMMITTEE REQUESTS (.2); E-MAILS WITH BERENFELD FIRM REGARDING RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS (.4); E-MAIL TO A. MASDAL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUESTS (.2); PHONE CALL WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING COMMITTEE REQUESTS (.3)	CAVALIERE 05	1.10	533.50
08/05/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE TO R. BECK CONCERNING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND RELATED ATTACHMENTS	BROWNSTEIN 05	.40	290.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009 PAGE 6

08/05/09	E-MAIL TO L. LEVITSKY REGARDING DRAFT 2008 TAX RETURN (.1); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING COMMITTEE REQUESTS AND OTHER OPEN ISSUES (.3); E-MAILS WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING NDA'S FOR COMMITTEE REQUEST (.2); PHONE CALL WITH R. BECK REGARDING SAME (.4); E-MAIL TO R. BECK REGARDING RESPONSE ON SEVERAL OPEN ITEMS (.3); E-MAIL TO M. BERENFELD AND M. CONTE REGARDING TIMING FOR MISSING INFORMATION (.2)	CAVALIERE 05	1.50	727.50
08/06/09	VARIOUS E-MAILS FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING RESPONSES TO COMMITTEE REQUESTS (.5); FINALIZE LETTER TO R. BECK REGARDING SAME (1.5); E-MAIL TO R. BECK WITH COPIES OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS (.1); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY AND A. MASDAL REGARDING RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS AND ANSWERS (.4)	CAVALIERE 05	2.50	1,212.50
08/06/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE TO COMMITTEE COUNSEL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUESTS	BROWNSTEIN 05	.10	72.50
08/07/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING COMMITTEE CALL (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 05	.20	145.00
08/10/09	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM R. BECK REGARDING DEPOSITION (.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DOCUMENTS TO THE COMMITTEE (.3); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEPOSITION (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 05	.50	362.50
08/10/09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. BECK REGARDING COMMITTEE REQUESTS AND UPCOMING DEPOSITION (JOINED BY M. BROWNSTEIN)	CAVALIERE 05	.50	242.50
08/11/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM M. SPRITZER REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS IN RESPONSE TO COMMITTEE REQUEST	CAVALIERE 05	.10	48.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 7

08/11/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. BECK REGARDING DOCUMENTS AND CLAIMS (1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE TO R. BECK (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 05	.20	145.00
08/12/09	E-MAILS WITH M. BERENFELD REGARDING OPEN ITEMS IN LETTER (.2); REVIEW SAME (.2); E-MAIL TO A. MASDAL AND L. LEVITSKY AND E-MAIL FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING CONFIRMATION OF ACCURACY (.1); E-MAILS TO/FROM G. ABRAHAMS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 05	.70	339.50
08/13/09	REVIEW E-MAILS CONCERNING PENTLAND CAPITAL CONTRIBUTION IN FURTHERANCE OF COMMITTEE'S REQUEST	CAVALIERE 05	.20	97.00
08/13/09	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING PERTLAND OF EQUITY CONTRIBUTION IN FURTHERANCE OF COMMITTEE REQUESTS (.1); EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.4)	ABRAHAMS 05	.50	325.00
08/14/09	DRAFT LETTER TO R. BECK REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING MANAGEMENT AGREEMENT (.1)	CAVALIERE 05	1.60	776.00
08/14/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE FOR COPY OF MANAGEMENT AGREEMENT (.1); AND PULL MANAGEMENT AGREEMENT IN CONNECTION WITH COMMITTEE'S REQUEST (.1)	ABRAHAMS 05	.20	130.00
08/24/09	PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SECTION 341(A) MEETING (.2); E-MAIL TO D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 05	.40	194.00
08/25/09	PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING PREPARATION FOR SECTION 341(A) MEETING	CAVALIERE 05	.80	388.00
08/25/09	REVIEW SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS TO PREPARE FOR SECTION 341 MEETING OF CREDITORS	CARICKHOFF 05	.90	405.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 8

08/26/09	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SECTION 341 MEETING	CARICKHOFF	05	1.20	540.00
08/27/09	E-MAIL REGARDING SECTION 341 (A) MEETING ATTENDANCE SHEET	CAVALIERE	05	.10	48.50
05	TOTAL FOR COMMITTEE BUSINESS AND MEETINGS		16.30	8,300.00	
06	CASE ADMINISTRATION				
08/03/09	REVIEW BMC GROUP INVOICE	CAVALIERE	06	.10	48.50
08/04/09	E-MAIL TO/FROM T. FEIL REGARDING INVOICE FOR SERVICES	CAVALIERE	06	.20	97.00
08/05/09	PREPARE AND EFILE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	MORALES	06	.30	81.00
08/05/09	RETRIEVE DOCKET PER R. CAVALIERE	MORALES	06	.20	54.00
08/06/09	E-MAIL FROM/TO M. PANACIO REGARDING UNITED STATES TRUSTEE DISBURSEMENTS (.2); E-MAIL TO/FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE	06	.40	194.00
08/06/09	E-MAIL TO/FROM A. CARTER REGARDING SERVICE ISSUES	CAVALIERE	06	.20	97.00
08/06/09	PREPARE AND EFILE CURE NOTICE AND REJECTION MOTION	MORALES	06	1.00	270.00
08/09/09	DRAFT TO-DO LIST FOR WEEK OF AUGUST 10, 2009	CAVALIERE	06	.30	145.50
08/10/09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL OF M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING STATUS UPDATE	CAVALIERE	06	.20	97.00
08/11/09	E-MAILS FROM J. LEAMY REGARDING SECTION 341(A) MEETING (.2); E-MAIL TO L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE	06	.30	145.50
08/11/09	PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING NEED TO ADDRESS POST-CLOSING ISSUES AND PLAN OF LIQUIDATION	CAVALIERE	06	.60	291.00
08/14/09	REVIEW OF MEMO FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING VARIOUS ITEMS TO ADDRESS IN CONNECTION WITH CASE	BROWNSTEIN	06	.20	145.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009 PAGE 9

08/14/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING UTILITIES AND RELATED ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 06	.10	72.50
08/17/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING VARIOUS OPEN ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 06	.10	72.50
08/17/09	RETRIEVE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS PER M. BROWNSTEIN	MORALES 06	.30	81.00
08/19/09	REVIEW OF ISSUES CONCERNING ACCOUNTS PAYABLE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 06	.20	145.00
08/24/09	E-MAIL FROM/TO J. WILLS REGARDING D&O INSURANCE POLICY (.2); E-MAIL TO A. MASDAL REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 06	.40	194.00
08/26/09	MEETING WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING VARIOUS POST-CLOSING ISSUES AND CONCERNS TO ADDRESS AND PREPARE NOTES CONCERNING SAME	CAVALIERE 06	1.50	727.50
08/26/09	E-MAILS WITH S. TARR REGARDING CAPITAL ONE AS AUTHORIZED DEPOSITORY IN CONNECTION WITH WIRE TRANSFER	CAVALIERE 06	.20	97.00
08/28/09	PREPARE LIST OF OPEN ISSUES TO ADDRESS AFTER CLOSING ON SALE	CAVALIERE 06	1.00	485.00
08/31/09	REVIEW AND REVISE LIQUIDATING BUDGET (.4); E-MAIL TO/FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING TAXES AS PART OF BUDGET (.2); PREPARE LIST OF OPEN ITEMS (.7); REVIEW AND REVISE BUDGET AND OPEN ITEMS LIST (.5); E-MAILS WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SAME (.2); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING THINGS TO DO LIST AND CURE COSTS (.6)	CAVALIERE 06	2.60	1,261.00
06	TOTAL FOR CASE ADMINISTRATION		10.40	4,801.00
07	DEBTOR'S BUSINESS OPERATIONS (I.E., EVALUATION OF OPERATING			
08/03/09	E-MAILS WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING CITY OF AKRON SECURITY DEPOSIT	CAVALIERE 07	.40	194.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 10

(.2); PHONE CALL WITH G. BOZEKA
REGARDING SAME (.2)

08/03/09	REVIEW FILED SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS (.5); E-MAIL TO A. MASDAL REGARDING STATUS OF OPERATING REPORTS (.1)	CAVALIERE 07	.60	291.00
08/05/09	REVIEW OPERATING REPORT (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING SAME AND OTHER OPEN ISSUES (.4); COORDINATE FILING OF OPERATING REPORT (.2); E-MAILS TO D. CARICKHOFF AND N. MORALES REGARDING FILING OF SAME (.2); DRAFT LETTER TO M. PANACIO REGARDING OPERATING REPORT (.4)	CAVALIERE 07	1.50	727.50
08/05/09	E-MAIL TO/FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING CRITICAL VENDOR UPDATE	CAVALIERE 07	.20	97.00
08/07/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING CRITICAL VENDOR LIST (.1); REVIEW LIST (.2); E-MAIL SAME TO R. BECK (.1)	CAVALIERE 07	.40	194.00
08/07/09	E-MAILS WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING DISBURSEMENTS FOR OPERATING REPORT (.2); REVIEW SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 07	.30	145.50
08/12/09	REVIEW OF SCHEDULES AND STATEMENT OF FINANCIAL AFFAIRS FILED IN CASE	BROWNSTEIN 07	1.00	725.00
08/17/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND CASH BUDGET	BROWNSTEIN 07	.30	217.50
08/17/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. GILMOOR REGARDING OPERATIONAL ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 07	.10	72.50
08/19/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT TO ENTERGY AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE CONCERNING DOUBLE PAYMENT	BROWNSTEIN 07	.20	145.00
08/19/09	CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO CLIENT CONCERNING RESOLUTION OF DEBT ISSUES WITH ENTERGY	BROWNSTEIN 07	.20	145.00

07	TOTAL FOR DEBTOR'S BUSINESS OPERATIONS (I.E	5.20	2,954.00	
08	EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/GENERAL LABOR			
08/13/09	E-MAILS CONCERNING LABOR ISSUES RELATED TO TERMINATED EMPLOYEES (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH G. ABRAHAMS, D. HAMBERG AND L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 08	.50	242.50
08/13/09	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING POTENTIAL WARN ACT LIABILITY (.1); DISCUSSION WITH D. GAMBERG AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.3)	ABRAHAMS 08	.40	260.00
08/31/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM J. BOCSKAI REGARDING EMPLOYEE TERMINATION (.1); REVIEW LETTER FROM C. BOWMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); E-MAIL TO G. ABRAHAMS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 08	.30	145.50
08/31/09	CORRESPONDENCE FROM EMPLOYEE REGARDING ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO SALE	BROWNSTEIN 08	.10	72.50
08	TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/GENERAL LABOR	1.30	720.50	
12	SALE OF ASSETS/ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (INCLUDES DEBTOR'S M			
08/03/09	UPLOAD TRIPLE A LEASE ONTO DATA ROOM (.2); REVIEW DISK PURPORTEDLY INCLUDING LEASES (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING TRIPLE R LEASE (.1)	CAVALIERE 12	.40	194.00
08/03/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM M. ARMESTO REGARDING MEETING (.1); PHONE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING SUMMARY OF MEETING BETWEEN CHECKERS AND MARATHON GROUP (.4)	CAVALIERE 12	.50	242.50
08/04/09	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM/TO D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON ISSUES (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING TEXTRON STIPULATION (.1); PHONE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING SALE PROCESS (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	.70	339.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 12

08/04/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE TO D. MUN AND D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/04/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS CONCERNING SAME (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/04/09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING TEXTRON STIPULATION(.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/05/09	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF AMENDMENT TO APA AND CORRESPONDENCE TO R. CAVALIERE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.30	217.50
08/05/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING THIRD AMENDMENT	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/05/09	E-MAIL TO A. MASDAL REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL NOTICE OF CONTRACT ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT (.1); REVIEW SCHEDULES FOR RELATED CONTRACTS (.3)	CAVALIERE 12	.40	194.00
08/05/09	E-MAILS TO/FROM D. DILWORTH AND B. SULLIVAN REGARDING TRIPLE R LEASE AMENDMENT (.4); PREPARE NOTICE OF THIRD AMENDMENT TO APA (.4); REVIEW THIRD AMENDMENT TO APA (.2); PHONE CALL WITH D. MUN REGARDING STIPULATION (.1); PHONE CALL WITH J. MCCLELLAND REGARDING AMENDMENT TO APA (.2); E-MAIL TO D. MYERS, M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. MUN REGARDING STIPULATION ALLOWING CLAIM (.3); E-MAIL TO D. MYERS, M. BROWNSTEIN, D. MUN AND J. MCCLELLAND REGARDING AMENDMENT/STIPULATIONS (.2); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM S. WILLIAMS REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM B. SULLIVAN REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL NOTICE (.1)	CAVALIERE 12	2.00	970.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 13

08/06/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING AMENDMENT TO APA AND NOTICE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/06/09	PHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING ISSUES PERTAINING TO TEXTRON AGREEMENT (.2); PHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS AND J. MCCLELLAND REGARDING ATTEMPT AT RESOLUTION OF CLAIM ISSUES (.4); E-MAILS WITH J. MCCLELLAND AND D. MYERS REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	.80	388.00
08/06/09	E-MAIL TO D. MYERS REGARDING SALE PROCESS ISSUES	CAVALIERE 12	.10	48.50
08/06/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE CONCERNING TEXTRON STATUS	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/07/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE CONCERNING WELLSPRING/SALES PROCESS	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/07/09	E-MAILS WITH J. MCCLELLAND AND D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON RESOLUTION (.2); E-MAIL TO M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 12	.30	145.50
08/07/09	E-MAILS REGARDING SALE PROCESS ISSUES BETWEEN D. MYERS AND M. ARMESTO	CAVALIERE 12	.50	242.50
08/10/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE TO CHECKERS CONCERNING POTENTIAL ACQUIRORS AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/10/09	CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING DEPOSITION, SALE AND TEXTRON SETTLEMENT	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/10/09	PHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING VARIOUS SALE ISSUES	CAVALIERE 12	.30	145.50
08/10/09	REVIEW OBJECTION TO SALE FILED BY TOWNSHIP OF MUSKEGON	CAVALIERE 12	.10	48.50
08/11/09	PHONE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING PARTICIPATION IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH INTERESTED BIDDER	CAVALIERE 12	.20	97.00

08/11/09	E-MAIL FROM D. MYERS REGARDING ISSUES PERTAINING TO TEXTRON SETTLEMENT	CAVALIERE 12	.10	48.50
08/11/09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM D. MUN AND D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON SETTLEMENT (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	.30	145.50
08/11/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS REGARDING SALE AND SETTLEMENT WITH COMMITTEE (.2); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE (.1); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.50	362.50
08/12/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS REGARDING STIPULATION AND SETTLEMENT WITH CHECKERS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE (.1); REVIEW OF NOTICE OF ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT OF CONTRACTS (.2); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO PRAETORIAN REGARDING SALE (.2); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE AND ISSUES WITH TEXTRON SETTLEMENT (.4); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE AND PRAETORIAN CONCERNING ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO SALE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRAETORIAN AND POTENTIAL PURCHASER (.5); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING VARIOUS SALE ISSUES (.3)	BROWNSTEIN 12	2.10	1,522.50
08/12/09	PHONE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. MYERS REGARDING CURE NOTICE ISSUES AND TEXTRON SETTLEMENT (.4); PHONE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND M. ARMESTO REGARDING BID EXTENSION (.3); E-MAILS WITH D. MUN REGARDING FORM OF ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT IN WORD AND FORWARD SAME TO M. ARMESTO AND L. LEVITSKY (.3);	CAVALIERE 12	1.80	873.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 15

PHONE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO, M.
BROWNSTEIN AND K. JOHNSTON
REGARDING BID EXTENSION (.5);
E-MAILS WITH D. MYERS REGARDING
SAME (.3)

08/12/09	PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING INTERESTED BIDDER (.3); E-MAILS WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING INTERESTED BIDDER AND POSSIBLE EXTENSION OF BID DEADLINE (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	.50	242.50
08/13/09	E-MAILS WITH M. ARMESTO AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING INTERESTED BIDDER'S DESIRE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH FRANCHISOR AND COPIES OF AMENDED LEASES (.4); E-MAILS WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAIL FROM M. ARMESTO TO K. JOHNSTON REGARDING MEETING (.1); E-MAILS WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING BIDDER QUALIFICATIONS (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	.90	436.50
08/14/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING TEXTRON STIPULATION AND PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/14/09	TELECONFERENCE WITH D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING AMENDMENT TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND SETTLEMENT STIPULATION (.3); REVIEW OF SETTLEMENT STIPULATION AND COMMENTS TO SAME AND RELATED ORDER (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.50	362.50
08/14/09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING TEXTRON STIPULATION AND CHANGES TO SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS AND D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND MOTION (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.40	290.00
08/14/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PAUL WEISS REGARDING STIPULATION AND CHANGES TO SAME (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 16

08/14/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/14/09	REVIEW VARIOUS SALE ISSUES AND TRANSITER TO M. BROWNSTEIN WHILE ON VACATION (1.2); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.5); REVIEW VARIOUS EMAILS CONCERNING TEXTRON SETTLEMENT (.7)	CAVALIERE 12	2.40	1,164.00
08/14/09	TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING CHANGES TO APA TO REFLECT SETTLEMENT WITH TEXTRON (INCLUDES REVIEW OF AMENDMENT AND PROPOSED STIPULATION) (.6); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.4)	CARICKHOFF 12	1.00	450.00
08/17/09	REVIEW OF MOTION AND SETTLEMENT STIPULATION WITH TEXTRON AND COMMENTS TO SAME (.4); CONFERENCE WITH T. GUILFOYLE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO MCCLELLAND AND D. MYERS REGARDING SAME (.3)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.80	580.00
08/17/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BECK REGARDING CASH FLOWS AND POSITION OF COMMITTEE (.2); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. BECK AND L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PRAETORIAN REGARDING MARATHON EQUITY (.1); REVIEW OF SCHEDULES TO APA AND CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO D. MYERS REGARDING SALE AND SETTLEMENT WITH TEXTRON (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. CARICKHOFF AND T. GUILFOYLE REGARDING MOTION TO SETTLE WITH TEXTRON (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS CONCERNING TEXTRON SETTLEMENT AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO T. GUILFOYLE REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.2);	BROWNSTEIN 12	1.40	1,015.00

08/17/09	EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND T. GUILFOYLE REGARDING STIPULATION WITH BUYER, DEBTORS AND TEXTRON AND MOTION TO APPROVE SAME (.4); CONFERENCE WITH T. GUILFOYLE REGARDING MOTION TO SHORTEN (.1)	CARICKHOFF 12	.50	225.00
08/17/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF THE STIPULATION AND MOTION TO SHORTEN (.2); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE, MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF THE STIPULATION AND STIPULATION (.8); PREPARE MOTION TO SHORTEN AND PROPOSED FORM OF ORDER (1.0); DISCUSS MOTION TO SHORTEN WITH D. CARICKHOFF (.1)	GUILFOYLE 12	2.10	535.50
08/18/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. RILEY REGARDING SALE AND ISSUES RELATED TO CLOSING	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/18/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PRAETORIAN REGARDING SALE PROCESS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. DOSTER CONCERNING ISSUES FROM PRAETORIAN AND CORRESPONDENCE TO PRAETORIAN CONCERNING SAME (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.40	290.00
08/18/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING BOOKS AND RECORDS (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. DOSTER AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE TO B. DOSTER (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DOSTER AND L. LEVITSKY CONCERNING BOOKS AND RECORDS (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.60	435.00
08/18/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND AMENDMENT TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/18/09	REVIEW OF REVISIONS TO TEXTRON STIPULATION AND MOTION (.3); CHANGES TO SAME (.3); EMAIL TO ALL PARTIES CONCERNING STIPULATION(.1); TELEPHONE	BROWNSTEIN 12	3.60	2,610.00

CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY
REGARDING STIPULATION AND MOTION
(.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE
FROM D. MYERS REGARDING
STIPULATION AND MOTION (.1);
CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS
REGARDING STIPULATION AND MOTION
(.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
J. MCCLELLAND REGARDING
STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. BECK
REGARDING EXTENSION OF TIME TO
FILE OBJECTIONS TO SALE (.1);
RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J.
WILLS REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH
COMMITTEE AND TEXTRON (.2);
REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R.
BECK REGARDING SAME (.1);
CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH
D. MYERS AND J. MCCLELLAND
REGARDING STIPULATION (.2);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.
GUILFOYLE REGARDING MOTION TO
SHORTEN NOTICE (.1); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM J.
MCCLELLAND WITH TEXTRON
STIPULATION AND CHANGES TO SAME
(.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO ALL
PARTIES CONCERNING RECENT
VERSION (.1); REVIEW OF CHANGES
TO APA AND CORRESPONDENCE TO D.
MUN REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW
OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
TEXTRON STIPULATION (.1);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D.
MUN REGARDING AMENDMENTS AND
DOCUMENTS REGARDING FILING WITH
COURT (.3); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH T. GUILFOYLE
REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS
CONCERNING FINAL STIPULATION
(.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO
D. MYERS CONCERNING CHANGES AND
CLOSING (.2); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM J.
MCCLELLAND CONCERNING SIGNATURE
PAPERS OF OTHER COUNSEL (.1)

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 19

08/18/09	REVIEW DRAFT OF 3RD AMENDMENT TO APA (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MUN REGARDING THIRD AMENDMENT (.3)	ABRAHAMS 12	.70	455.00
08/18/09	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SHORTEN REGARDING TEXTRON SETTLEMENT (.3); OBTAIN AND REVIEW THIRD AMENDMENT TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND NOTICE (.2); VARIOUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND N. MORALES REGARDING MOTION, STIPULATION, AND THIRD AMENDMENT TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.5); PREPARE NOTICE OF MOTION, NOTICE OF PROPOSED THIRD AMENDMENT TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND REVISE MOTION AND STIPULATION (.8); PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (.8)	GUILFOYLE 12	2.60	663.00
08/18/09	EFILE NOTICE OF 3RD AMENDMENT TO APA, EFILE MOTION REGARDING NOTICE TO SHORTEN TIME AND MOTION UNDER RULE 9019	MORALES 12	2.50	675.00
08/19/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRAETORIAN REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. RILEY REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.2); REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS TO SALE BY LANDLORD (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DOSTER AND L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE AND CLOSING ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND DEBTORS' OBLIGATIONS IN CONNECTION WITH CLOSING (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. RILEY REGARDING ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH SALE (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES AND SALE ISSUES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO	BROWNSTEIN 12	2.60	1,885.00

PRAETORIAN WITH RESPECT TO SALE
ISSUES (.2)

08/19/09	REPLY EMAIL TO R. CAVALIERE ATTACHING OBJECTION OF CREDITOR R&R CAPITAL, LLC, TO NOTICE OF (I) DEBTORSÆ REQUEST FOR AUTHORITY TO ASSUME, ASSIGN AND SELL CERTAIN EXECUTORY CONTRACTS AND UNEXPIRED LEASES, AND (II) DEBTORS PROPOSED CURE AMOUNTS	MOODY	12	.10	21.00
08/20/09	CORRESPONDENCE TO CREDITORS COMMITTEE REGARDING EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE OBJECTIONS TO SALE	BROWNSTEIN	12	.10	72.50
08/20/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. ARMESTO REGARDING SALE HEARING	BROWNSTEIN	12	.30	217.50
08/20/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. WILLS REGARDING SALE ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN	12	.30	217.50
08/20/09	CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY, A. MASDAL AND G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SALE AND CLOSING ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN	12	.50	362.50
08/20/09	DISCUSSION WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SALE (CLOSING) (.1); AND EMAIL TO D. MUN REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN, L. LEVITSKY AND A. MASDAL REGARDING SALE CLOSING/SALE ISSUES (.5)	ABRAHAMS	12	.90	585.00
08/20/09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. BOCSKAI FROM ALTES-SETLA REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND FORWARD SAME AND AMENDMENTS	MORALES	12	.40	108.00
08/21/09	CONFERENCE WITH T. GUILFOYLE CONCERNING ORDER SHORTENING TIME FOR HEARING AND REVIEW OF MEMO FROM T. GUILFOYLE REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW OF ORDER SIGNED BY COURT (.1); CONFERENCE WITH N. MORALES AND T. GUILFOYLE AND N. MORALES REGARDING SERVICE OF SAME (.1)	BROWNSTEIN	12	.40	290.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 21

08/21/09	REVIEW OF BIDDING PROCEDURES ORDER AND CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW OF NOTICE OF MOTION REGARDING AUCTION, SALE OBJECTIONS AND TIMING OF SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. WILLS REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MUN REGARDING CLOSING AND CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING AGREEMENT (.1); REVIEW OF APA REGARDING VARIOUS COSTS (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE AND ISSUES CONCERNING R&R (.2); REVIEW OF CLOSING CHECKLIST (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING CLOSING CHECKLIST AND RELATED ISSUES (.1); CONFERENCE WITH N. MORALES REGARDING MEMO CONCERNING AUCTION AND SALE HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.1); MEMO TO ALL PARTIES REGARDING STATUS OF BIDS (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	1.80	1,305.00
08/21/09	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. MASDAL WITH COBRA INFORMATION AND FROM D. MUN WITH CLOSING AGENDA AND REVIEW SAME (.9); DISCUSSION WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (ESCROW DETAILS AND CURE COSTS) (.1)	ABRAHAMS 12	1.00	650.00
08/21/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE PERIOD (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE PERIOD (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. MORALES REGARDING SERVICE OF ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE PERIOD (.2)	GUILFOYLE 12	.50	127.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 22

08/24/09	CONFERENCE WITH N. MORALES REGARDING CANCELLATION OF COURT REPORTER FOR ACTION (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.4); CORRESPONDENCE TO COMMITTEE AND CHECKERS REGARDING OPEN ISSUES (.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS REGARDING SALE (.1); REVIEW OF OBJECTION OF CREDITORS COMMITTEE TO SALE (.4); INITIAL REVIEW OF MOTION REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT CONCERNING CONFIDENTIAL OBJECTION OF COMMITTEE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING COMMITTEE OBJECTION (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING COMMENTS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ORDER ISSUES (.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES REGARDING SALE AND PAYMENTS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.1); REVIEW OF LETTER FROM R. CAVALIERE TO STATE OF MICHIGAN CONCERNING SALE ISSUES (.1); REVIEW OF CONFIDENTIAL OBJECTION OF CREDITORS COMMITTEE TO SALE (.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES AND RELATED EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES AND ESCROW (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MUN (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MUN REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND CLOSING ISSUES (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND CLOSING ISSUES (.2); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MUN, D. MYERS AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE AND CLOSING ISSUES (.3);	BROWNSTEIN 12	3.80	2,755.00
----------	---	---------------	------	----------

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 23

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L.
LEVITSKY REGARDING SALE ISSUES
(.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
D. MYERS REGARDING SALE (.1);
CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE
REGARDING SALE (.2)

08/24/09	PREPARE PROFFER OF L. LEVITSKY IN SUPPORT OF SALE MOTION (1.4); PREPARE PROFFER OF M. ARMESTO IN SUPPORT OF SALE (1.2); PHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING EQUIPMENT LEASES TO BE ASSUMED (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. MUN AND T. LINDSEY REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAIL TO T. LINDSEY AND D. MUN REGARDING COPIES OF CURE NOTICES (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING COORDINATION OF EFFORTS ON SALE (.4); REVIEW COMMITTEE'S OBJECTION TO SALE (.4); REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL CONFIDENTIAL OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW COMMITTEE'S MOTION TO ALLOW FILING OF CONFIDENTIAL OBJECTION AND UNDERLYING MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE (.7); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING COMMITTEE OBJECTION (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. WILLS REGARDING COMMITTEE OBJECTION AND SALE ISSUES (.3); E-MAILS WITH J. WILLS AND D. MYERS REGARDING UPDATED CASH ISSUES (.3); PHONE CALL WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING COMMITTEE OBJECTION AND ACTUAL CASH ISSUES (.5); E-MAIL TO M. ARMESTO REGARDING PROFFER (.1); E-MAIL TO L. LEVITSKY REGARDING PROFFER (.1); E-MAILS WITH J. MCCLELLAND REGARDING TEXTRON ISSUES (.2); REVIEW JUNE 5TH SIDE LETTER AGREEMENT (.1); E-MAILS WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. MUN REGARDING REIMBURSEMENT OF SEPTEMBER RENT (.3); VARIOUS CONFERENCES WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND OBJECTIONS (.3)	CAVALIERE 12	7.60	3,686.00
----------	--	--------------	------	----------

08/24/09	DISCUSSION WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING EXCLUDED COSTS AND CLOSING ISSUES (.2); REVIEW APA (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MUN REGARDING CLOSING CHECKLIST (.1)	ABRAHAMS 12	.60	390.00
08/25/09	REVIEW COMMITTEE OBJECTION AND SUPPLEMENTAL OBJECTION (.5); RETRIEVE AND REVIEW CASELAW CITED IN COMMITTEE OBJECTION (.8); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING PREPARATION OF SALE HEARING (1.0); E-MAILS WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING CASH FLOW ISSUES AND OTHER ITEMS RELATIVE TO SALE (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING OPERATIONS (.2); E-MAILS WITH J. WILLS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF SALE HEARING (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING MASDAL COBRA AGREEMENT (.1); PREPARE QUESTIONS FOR POSSIBLE TESTIMONY OF L. LEVITSKY IN PREPARATION OF SALE HEARING (1.2); E-MAILS WITH J. WILLS REGARDING STATUS OF CASH FLOW AND SETTLEMENT (.3); E-MAILS WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF CASE (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING STATUS AND HEARING (.2); REVIEW FIRST DRAFT OF SALE ORDER (.9); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. MYERS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING REVISION TO SALE ORDER (.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. MYERS, M. BROWNSTEIN AND J. WILLS REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.2); E-MAILS WITH T. LINDSEY AND D. MUN REGARDING SCHEDULE TO SALE ORDER (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	7.80	3,783.00
08/25/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS REGARDING ASSET SALE AND SETTLEMENT WITH LEASE (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO D.	BROWNSTEIN 12	4.30	3,117.50

MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES
(.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
J. WILLS REGARDING SALE AND
RESOLUTION OF ISSUES (.3);
REVIEW OF PROEFFER'S OF L.
LEVITSKY AND PRAETORIAN AND
COMMENTS TO SAME (.7); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT
REGARDING RENTAL OBLIGATIONS
(.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING PAYMENT OF SEPTEMBER
RENT (.1); REVIEW OF
CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE
REGARDING SEPTEMBER RENT (.1);
REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM D.
MYERS REGARDING SEPTEMBER RENT
(.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
D. CARICKHOFF AND R. CAVALIERE
REGARDING COURT HEARING (.2);
REVIEW OF PROPOSED SALE ORDER
(.8); DRAFTING SESSION WITH R.
CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE ORDER
(.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
D. MYERS AND R. CAVALIERE
REGARDING SALE ORDER (.8);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J.
WILLS REGARDING PROVISIONS SALE
OF ORDER AND OVERALL SETTLEMENT
(.2)

08/25/09	EMAILS WITH D. MUN REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MUN; FURTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MUN CONCERNING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN (AT HOME) REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.1)	ABRAHAMS 12	.90	585.00
08/25/09	REVIEW COMMITTEE'S OBJECTION TO SALE (.5); TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE HEARING (.3); PREPARE FOR SALE HEARING (.4)	CARICKHOFF 12	1.20	540.00
08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MCCLELLAND CONCERNING CLOSING AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 26

08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE AND PAUL WEISS REGARDING AMENDMENT NO. 3 AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE WITH RESPECT TO ISSUES RAISED BY U.S. TRUSTEE REGARDING SALE ORDER (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MYERS (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PAUL WEISS CONCERNING AMENDMENT NO. 3 AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/26/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM T. LINDSEY REGARDING WIRE INSTRUCTIONS AT CLOSING	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/26/09	REVIEW OF PROPOSED SALE ORDER AND COMMENTS TO SAME (1.6); MEETING WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE COUNSEL, D. MYERS AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE HEARING AND SALE ORDER (.9)	BROWNSTEIN 12	2.50	1,812.50
08/26/09	CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING APPROVAL OF SALE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/26/09	REVIEW E-MAILS CONCERNING FOURTH AMENDMENT AND SALE ORDER	CAVALIERE 12	.30	145.50
08/26/09	REVIEW LEAF AGREEMENT (.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 12	.40	194.00
08/26/09	REVIEW AND REVISE SALE ORDER (.7); CONFERENCES WITH M. BROWNSTEIN, D. CARICKHOFF, D. MYERS AND J. WILLS REGARDING COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER (.9); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS WITH M. CARBULLIDO REGARDING THIRD AMENDMENT (.2); REVIEW E-MAILS FROM J. MCCLELLAND AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING CLOSING (.2)	CAVALIERE 12	2.00	970.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 27

08/26/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING CLOSING MATTERS/WIRE INSTRUCTIONS (.4); ARRANGE FOR ESCROW ACCOUNT TO BE OPENED (.4); DISCUSSION WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING CLOSING (.1); REVIEW DRAFT SALE ORDER (.3)	ABRAHAMS 12	1.20	780.00
08/26/09	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING PROPOSED SALE ORDER	CARICKHOFF 12	.40	180.00
08/27/09	REVIEW OF ORDER REGARDING TEXTRON	BROWNSTEIN 12	.10	72.50
08/27/09	FINAL REVISIONS TO SALE ORDER (1.0); VARIOUS CONFERENCES WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.6); PHONE CALLS WITH D. MYERS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING REVISIONS TO SALE ORDER (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING MINOR COMMENTS TO ORDER (.2); E-MAIL TO D. MYERS REGARDING COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER (.2); VARIOUS PHONE CALLS WITH D. MUN REGARDING EXHIBIT B CURE NOTICE (.3)	CAVALIERE 12	2.90	1,406.50
08/27/09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS OF T. LINDSEY REGARDING EXHIBIT TO SALE ORDER RELATING TO ASSUMED LEASES (.2); REVIEW CHART REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAIL TO D. MYERS REGARDING STATUS OF ORDER (.1); E-MAILS WITH D. MUN REGARDING EXHIBIT TO SALE ORDER (.2); E-MAIL TO/FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING WIRE PAYMENTS AND PRO RATION OF RENT FOR 8/31/09 (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1); E-MAIL FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING SAME AND FORWARD TO G. ABRAHAMS AND M. BROWNSTEIN (.1); PHONE CALL WITH D. MUN REGARDING EXHIBIT B AND REVIEW EXHIBIT D (.8); E-MAILS WITH A. MASDAL, T. LINDSEY, D. MUN AND D. MYERS REGARDING CURE NOTICE (.5)	CAVALIERE 12	2.40	1,164.00

08/27/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE AND A. MASDAL REGARDING CLOSING (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING CLOSING (.1); REVIEW OF PROPOSED CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND COMMENTS TO SAME (.5); CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS, D. MUN AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE TO T. LINDSEY REGARDING WIRE TRANSFER (.1); REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON ASSIGNMENT AGREEMENT (.3); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. CARBILLITO OF PAUL WEISS REGARDING FOURTH AMENDMENT AND SIGNATURE PAGES (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1); REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING ADJUSTMENTS (.1); REVIEW OF SALE ORDER AND COMMENT TO SAME (.5); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING (.4); DRAFTING SESSION WITH R. CAVALIERE AND D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ORDER (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. COLANTONIO, R. CAVALIERE AND G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING CLOSING (.4); REVIEW OF SALE ORDER AS REVISED AND EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING CLOSING AND ISSUES CONCERNING SAME (.3); REVIEW OF ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO ORDER (.3); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SAME (.2); DRAFTING SESSION WITH D. MYERS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO D. MYERS AND CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING VENDOR CAPITAL ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING CLOSING (.2); REVIEW OF MODIFICATIONS TO EXHIBIT B TO LEASE AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS CONCERNING RESOLUTION OF ISSUES (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	5.70	4,132.50
----------	---	---------------	------	----------

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 29

08/27/09	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM S. TARR AND E-MAIL TO M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING AUTHORIZED DEPOSITORY (.2); E-MAIL TO T. LINDSEY REGARDING WIRE INSTRUCTIONS FOR CLOSING (.1); PHONE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN, D. MYERS, D. MUN AND L. LEVITSKY REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.4); REVIEW TEXTRON ORDER SIGNED BY COURT (.1); E-MAIL TO J. MCCLELLAND, D. MYERS AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1); PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING CHANGE FUND ISSUE AND REVIEW OF AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SAME (.1);	CAVALIERE 12	1.30	630.50
08/27/09	PREPARE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.2); VARIOUS DISCUSSIONS WITH R. CAVALIERE AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING CLOSING (.4); NUMEROUS EMAILS CONCERNING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); DRAFT AND REVISE DOCUMENTS (.7); REVIEW CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND MARK UP SAME (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. COLANTONIO AND D. MUN REGARDING CLOSING (.5)	ABRAHAMS 12	4.10	2,665.00
08/27/09	DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING PROPOSED SALE ORDER (INCLUDES EMAIL AND TELECONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE) (1.2); REVIEW REVISED SALE ORDER AND EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES REGARDING SAME (.8)	CARICKHOFF 12	2.00	900.00
08/27/09	DRAFT AND REVIEW CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.5); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH G. ABRAHAMS AND D. MUN REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW ASSIGNMENT AND ASSUMPTION OF REAL PROPERTY LEASES (.8); DRAFT SIDE LETTER REGARDING INVENTORY RECEIVED ON AUGUST 31, 2009 (.9)	COLANTONIO 12	3.70	1,017.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 30

08/28/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO SALE (.3); PARTICIPATION IN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH VARIOUS LAWYERS FROM PAUL WEISS AND R. CAVALIERE, AND SUBSEQUENTLY WITH COMMITTEE COUNSEL CONCERNING ISSUES REGARDING SALE AND POTENTIAL RESOLUTIONS OF SAME (.8)	BROWNSTEIN 12	1.10	797.50
08/28/09	REVIEW OF VARIOUS E-MAILS CONCERNING ISSUES RELEVANT TO SALE	BROWNSTEIN 12	.50	362.50
08/28/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM T. LINDSEY REGARDING SALE PROPERTY TAX ALLOCATIONS (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL CONCERNING CLOSING ADJUSTMENTS (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/28/09	REVIEW OF CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND CONFERENCES WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SAME (.6); E-MAILS WITH A. MASDAL REGARDING TAX RECONCILIATION ISSUE AND FORWARD SAME TO D. MYERS (.3); E-MAILS WITH D. MYERS REGARDING EXHIBIT "B" TO ORDER (.7); E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW FINAL VERSION OF SALE ORDER (1.0); E-MAIL TO J. WILLS REGARDING COMMITTEE'S APPROVAL OF SALE ORDER (.1); DRAFT ENCLOSURE LETTER TO COURT (.4); E-MAILS WITH PARTIES REGARDING NEW LANGUAGE TO SALE ORDER ADDRESSING TAX ISSUES (.5); PARTICIPATE IN SEVERAL CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CHECKERS REPRESENTATIVES AND COUNSEL AND J. WILLS REGARDING TAX ISSUES (1.3); PHONE CALLS WITH J. WILLS ON VARIOUS SALE ORDER ISSUES (.7); PHONE CALLS WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING UPDATE ON SALE ORDER ISSUES (.3); VARIOUS CONFERENCE CALLS TO CHAMBERS REGARDING ENTRY OF ORDER AND RESERVATION OF RIGHTS ISSUES (.4); PHONE CALLS WITH T. MOODY	CAVALIERE 12	7.60	3,686.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 31

REGARDING DELIVERY OF ORDER AND
STATUS (.2); CONFERENCE CALLS
AND E-MAILS WITH N. MORALES
REGARDING FILING OF
CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL OF SALE
ORDER (.3); VARIOUS CONFERENCE
CALLS WITH L. LEVITSKY AND A.
MASDAL REGARDING TAX ISSUES AND
CLOSING ISSUES (.5)

08/28/09	REVIEW E-MAILS CONCERNING CLOSING ON SALE (.4); REVISE RESOLUTIONS (.6); NEGOTIATIONS REGARDING ADJUSTMENTS (.7); DISCUSSIONS WITH D. MUN ET AL CONCERNING CLOSING AND ISSUES, WITH STATES (1.2); DISCUSSIONS WITH R. CAVALIERE CONCERNING UPCOMING CLOSING AND ISSUES (.4)	ABRAHAMS	12	3.10	2,015.00
08/28/09	FINALIZE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING SALE ORDER (.7); REVIEW REVISIONS TO SALE ORDER AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.5)	CARICKHOFF	12	1.20	540.00
08/28/09	COORDINATE WITH N. MORALES AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING FILING AND HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS REGARDING CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL ATTACHING PROPOSED SALE ORDER WITH VARIOUS EXHIBITS	MOODY	12	.70	147.00
08/28/09	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND PROPOSED SALE ORDER AND EFILE SAME	MORALES	12	1.50	405.00
08/29/09	REVIEW OF VARIOUS EMAILS, FROM R. CAVALIERE, D. MYERS, C. ABRAHAMS, J. WILLS, AND D. MUN REGARDING RESERVATION OF RIGHTS, SALE ORDER, CLOSING ISSUES, CURE COSTS, AND EVENTS OF AUGUST 28, 2009 (.7); REVIEW RECENT VERSION OF SALE ORDER (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING STATUS (.2)	BROWNSTEIN	12	1.20	870.00
08/29/09	CONFERENCE TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO SALE ORDER	BROWNSTEIN	12	.20	145.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 32

08/29/09	CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING REAL ESTATE TAX ADJUSTMENTS AND OTHER REAL ESTATE OBLIGATIONS (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/29/09	E-MAILS WITH L. LEVITSKY AND A. MASDAL REGARDING TAX ISSUES AS PART OF CURE	CAVALIERE 12	.30	145.50
08/29/09	PHONE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING STATUS OF CLOSING/SALE ISSUES	CAVALIERE 12	.20	97.00
08/30/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES	BROWNSTEIN 12	.20	145.00
08/31/09	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM PAUL WEISS REGARDING CLOSING AND FUNDING AS WELL AS RESERVATION ISSUE (.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING STATUS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING REVIEW OF ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR INTERPRETATION OF TAX ISSUES (.3); RETRIEVE AND REVIEW SALE ORDER ENTERED BY THE COURT (.4); E-MAILS TO M. BROWNSTEIN AND D. MYERS REGARDING ENTRY OF SALE ORDER (.1); RETRIEVE AND REVIEW EXHIBITS TO SALE ORDER (.3); REVIEW CERTAIN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.4); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING INVENTORY ISSUES (.1); E-MAILS FROM G. ABRAHAMS AND D. MUN REGARDING WIRE PROCEEDS (.4); REVIEW E-MAILS FROM A. MASDAL AND L. LEVITSKY REGARDING RECEIPT OF WIRE PROCEEDS AND TRANSFER OF ESCROW FUNDS (.2); E-MAIL TO G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING COPY OF SALE ORDER (.1)	CAVALIERE 12	2.70	1,309.50
08/31/09	CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ESCROW AGREEMENT (.1); REVISIONS TO LETTER AGREEMENT (.2); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW	CAVALIERE 12	.50	242.50

E-MAILS FROM D. MUN REGARDING
SAME (.1)

08/31/09	CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MASDAL REGARDING TRIPLE R LEASE ADJUSTMENTS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SALE CLOSING ISSUES (.2); REVIEW OF CONTRACT AND SALES AGREEMENT WITH G. ABRAHAMS AND R. CAVALIERE AND TACTICS AND STRATEGY DISCUSSION REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY ESCROW AND CONCERNS ABOUT TAXES (.4); REVIEW OF E-MAIL FROM D. MYERS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE REGARDING J. WILLS (.1); REVIEW OF E-MAILS FROM G. ABRAHAMS TO D. MYERS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.1); RESPONSIVE E-MAILS (.1); REVIEW OF ORDER SIGNED BY COURT CONCERNING SALE (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WATER ISSUES (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. DOSTER (.1); REVIEW OF EXECUTED CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.4); REVIEW OF ESCROW AGREEMENT AND COMMENTS TO SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. ABRAHAMS TO D. MUN AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MUN REGARDING REVISED ESCROW AGREEMENT (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. MUN REGARDING SALE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. ABRAHAMS TO D. MUN (.1); RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING ESCROW AND ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO INITIAL DEPOSIT (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO BOOKKEEPING (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. MUN (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. MYERS REGARDING ESCROW (.2);	BROWNSTEIN 12	3.70	2,682.50
----------	---	---------------	------	----------

08/31/09	REVIEW NUMEROUS E-MAILS RELATED TO SALE CLOSING (.4); REVIEW EXECUTION VERSIONS OF ALL CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CHECKERS' COUNSEL REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES/ESCROW (1.1); EXCHANGE SIGNATURES (.4); ARRANGE FOR ESCROW ACCOUNT TO ACCEPT WIRE TRANSFER (.4); DRAFT ESCROW AGREEMENT AND REVIEW REVISIONS (1.3); DISCUSSIONS WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND R. CAVALIERE REGARDING REAL ESTATE TAX ISSUE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. LEVITSKY AND A. MASDAL REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.2)	ABRAHAMS	12	5.70	3,705.00
12	TOTAL FOR SALE OF ASSETS/ASSET PURCHASE AGR		130.40		73,327.50
17	HEARINGS - ATTENDANCE/PREPARATION				
08/21/09	REVIEW OF DRAFT OF AGENDA AND COMMENTS TO SAME	BROWNSTEIN	17	.10	72.50
08/21/09	REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA FOR AUGUST 26 HEARING AND EMAIL N. MORALES REGARDING SAME	CARICKHOFF	17	.60	270.00
08/21/09	DRAFT, PREPARE AGENDA LETTER FOR AUGUST 26 HEARING AND PREPARE BINDER FOR HEARING	MORALES	17	7.00	1,890.00
08/24/09	REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA NOTICE (.2); E-MAILS WITH D. CARICKHOFF AND N. MORALES REGARDING AGENDA LETTER AND HEARING BINDER (.3)	CAVALIERE	17	.50	242.50
08/24/09	FINALIZE AGENDA AND REVIEW HEARING BINDER FOR CHAMBERS	CARICKHOFF	17	.90	405.00
08/24/09	PREPARE SALE MOTION AND HEARING BINDERS	MORALES	17	6.00	1,620.00
08/25/09	REVIEW OF PLEADINGS IN CONNECTION WITH PREPARATION OF HEARING ON VARIOUS MATTERS, INCLUDING SALE MOTION	CAVALIERE	17	1.70	824.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 35

08/25/09	RETRIEVE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS PER R. CAVALIERE REGARDING PREPARATION FOR 8/26/09 HEARING	MORALES 17	.40	108.00
08/26/09	PREPARATION FOR HEARING INCLUDING REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS (1.2); DISCUSSIONS WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING HEARING (.5)	BROWNSTEIN 17	1.70	1,232.50
08/26/09	ATTENDANCE AT SALE HEARING AND MEETING IN COURT	BROWNSTEIN 17	1.00	725.00
08/26/09	PREPARATION FOR HEARING INCLUDING PREPARATION OF PRESENTATION OUTLINE (1.3); REVISIONS TO PROFFERS (.7); CONFERENCES WITH M. BROWNSTEIN, L. LEVITSKY AND M. ARMESTO REGARDING SAME (.5)	CAVALIERE 17	2.50	1,212.50
08/26/09	ATTENDANCE AT SALE HEARING	CAVALIERE 17	1.20	582.00
08/26/09	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SALE HEARING	CARICKHOFF 17	3.80	1,710.00
17	TOTAL FOR HEARINGS - ATTENDANCE/PREPARATION	27.40	10,894.50	
19	NON-WORKING TRAVEL TIME			
08/26/09	TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FROM HEARING	CAVALIERE 19	1.80	873.00
08/26/09	TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FROM HEARING IN DELAWARE	BROWNSTEIN 19	2.80	2,030.00
08/26/09	TRAVEL FROM NEW YORK TO DELAWARE BEFORE SALE HEARING	BROWNSTEIN 19	.80	580.00
19	TOTAL FOR NON-WORKING TRAVEL TIME	5.40	3,483.00	"Reduced to 1,741.50"
21	OTHER LITIGATION			
08/06/09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM R. BECK REGARDING S. FOX DEPOSITION IN CONNECTION WITH SALE	CAVALIERE 21	.20	97.00
08/06/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. BECK CONCERNING DEPOSITION OF S. FOX	BROWNSTEIN 21	.10	72.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 36

08/10/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BARBER OF PAUL WEISS CONCERNING DEPOSITION OF EMPLOYEE AND CHECKERS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BECK REGARDING DEPOSITION AND SCHEDULING OF SAME (.3); REVIEW OF NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.2); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING DEPOSITION OF CHECKERS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE AND J. MINTZ REGARDING DEPOSITIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. CORNISH REGARDING DEPOSITIONS (.2)	BROWNSTEIN 21	1.30	942.50
08/10/09	PHONE CALL WITH L. LEVITSKY REGARDING OPEN ISSUES INCLUDING COMMITTEE REQUESTS AND DEPOSITIONS OF CHECKERS REPRESENTATIVES (.3); E-MAILS AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. BAUM REGARDING DEPOSITION (.2); E-MAIL TO J. MINTZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW SCHEDULE OF DEPOSITION TOPICS (.1); PHONE CALL WITH J. MINTZ AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING DEPOSITION (.3); E-MAIL TO J. MINTZ REGARDING DEPOSITION MATERIALS (.1)	CAVALIERE 21	1.20	582.00
08/10/09	DISCUSS ISSUES RELATED TO DEPOSITION OF T. LINDSEY WITH M. BROWNSTEIN AND R. CAVALIERE (.2); REVIEW MATERIALS PROVIDED IN CONNECTION WITH DEPOSITION OF T. LINDSEY (.2)	MINTZ 21	.40	102.00
08/11/09	REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF T. LINDSEY	CAVALIERE 21	.10	48.50
08/11/09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING DEPOSITION (.1); E-MAIL TO R. BECK REGARDING SAME (.2); PHONE CALL WITH J. MINTZ REGARDING SAME (.1)	CAVALIERE 21	.40	194.00

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 37

08/11/09	DISCUSS ADDITIONAL 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION WITH R. CAVALIERE (.1); REVIEW FIRST DAY DECLARATION IN PREPARATION TO ATTEND 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF T. LINDSEY (1.4); REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.1)	MINTZ	21	1.60	408.00
08/12/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. CAVALIERE TO R. BECK REGARDING DEPOSITION, RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO ALL PARTIES CONCERNING DEPOSITION (.1)	BROWNSTEIN	21	.30	217.50
08/12/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PAUL WEISS REGARDING DEPOSITION AND RESPONSIVE CORRESPONDENCE	BROWNSTEIN	21	.20	145.00
08/12/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MINTZ REGARDING DEPOSITION	BROWNSTEIN	21	.20	145.00
08/12/09	E-MAILS WITH R. BECK AND M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING DEPOSITION ISSUES	CAVALIERE	21	.30	145.50
08/12/09	VARIOUS E-MAILS CONCERNING S. FOX DEPOSITION (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. CRONIN REGARDING ATTENDANCE AT DEPOSITION (.2)	CAVALIERE	21	.50	242.50
08/12/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING DEPOSITION ASSIGNMENT (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (.2)	CRONIN	21	.40	114.00
08/12/09	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION WITH T. LINDSEY (6.1); PREPARE REPORT ON DEPOSITION TO M. BROWNSTEIN AND R. CAVALIERE (.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING SUMMARY (.2)	MINTZ	21	7.10	1,810.50
08/13/09	REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF S. FOX (.1); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM J. MINTZ REGARDING DETAILED SUMMARY OF DEPOSITION OF T. LINDSEY (.2)	CAVALIERE	21	.30	145.50

ALSET OWNERS LLC, ALTES LLC, SETLA LLC AND
FILE NUMBER: 131878-01601
INVOICE NO.: 1022606

Sep 22, 2009

PAGE 38

08/13/09	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEPOSITION FROM J. MINTZ CONCERNING ISSUES RAISED (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. CAVALIERE REGARDING DEPOSITION (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 21	.20	145.00
08/13/09	REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS UTILIZED AT DEPOSITION IN CONNECTION WITH ISSUES RAISED	BROWNSTEIN 21	.80	580.00
08/13/09	REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (.8); ATTEND DEPOSITION OF S. FOX (3.9); DRAFT E-MAIL TO R. CAVALIERE REGARDING SUMMARY OF S. FOX DEPOSITION (1.0)	CRONIN 21	5.70	1,624.50
08/14/09	REVIEW OF DEPOSITION SUMMARY CONCERNING S. FOX	BROWNSTEIN 21	.10	72.50
08/17/09	REVIEW CREDITORS COMMITTEE EXHIBITS IN CONNECTION WITH DEPOSITION	ABRAHAMS 21	1.30	845.00
08/20/09	REVIEW OF DEPOSITION NOTICE OF S.FOX	BROWNSTEIN 21	.80	580.00
08/20/09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MYERS REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. ABRAHAMS REGARDING SAME (.1)	BROWNSTEIN 21	.40	290.00
08/25/09	EMAIL TO M. BROWNSTEIN REGARDING T. LINDSEY DEPOSITION	MINTZ 21	.10	25.50
21	TOTAL FOR OTHER LITIGATION	24.00	9,574.50	

TOTAL SERVICES DUE \$123,874.00