

EXHIBIT A

**ATTACHMENT A
TO FEE APPLICATION**

**PROFESSIONALS
OCTOBER 1, 2009 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2009**

Name of Professional Individual	Position, year assumed position, prior relevant experience, year of obtaining relevant license to practice	Hourly Billing Rate (including changes)	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Neil Gilmour	Managing Director	\$425.00	5.50	\$2,337.50
Jim Fox	Managing Director	\$450.00	7.00	\$3,150.00
Sabir Abdoullaev	Consultant	\$195.00	.50	\$97.50
TOTAL			13.00	\$5,585.00

Blended Rate: \$429.62

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Hours	Fees
Case Administration-050	.50	\$97.50
Creditor Committee-064	.70	\$315.00
Preparation of Application-074	1.00	\$425.00
Plan of Reorganization-107	4.50	\$1,912.50
Sale of Business & Related Issues-115	6.30	\$2,835.00
Total	13.00	\$5,585.00

Client: ALSET OWNERS COMMITTEE

November 20, 2009

Invoice# 7919

Client: ALSET OWNERS COMMITTEE
Fox, Jim **Managing Director**

Date	Task	Tmkp	Description	Hours Worked	Rate	Fees Billed
08/17/09	115	JF	Preparations for and participation in conference call with Counsel to plan for Committee call on the subject of the sale process update.	1.20	450.00	\$540.00
08/17/09	115	JF	Preparation for and participation in conference call update with Creditors Committee to discuss the status of the sale process, including the status of discussions with Marathon Equity and the Johnston Group.	1.80	450.00	\$810.00
08/17/09	115	JF	Review of e-mails and other discussion related to Marathon, Wellspring and Marathon's decision to not go forward.	1.70	450.00	\$765.00
08/18/09	064	JF	Review of minutes and other follow-up related to recent Committee conference call.	0.70	450.00	\$315.00
08/18/09	115	JF	Correspondence and dialogue related to the acquisition interest of the Johnston Group and attendant meetings with the Checkers Franchisor	1.60	450.00	\$720.00
Totals for: Fox, Jim				7.00	450.00	\$3,150.00

Gilmour, Neil **Managing Director**

Date	Task	Tmkp	Description	Hours Worked	Rate	Fees Billed
10/09/09	107	NG	Review draft plan of reorganization and discuss comments with counsel.	0.90	425.00	\$382.50
10/09/09	074	NG	Review and approve quarterly fee application.	0.20	425.00	\$85.00
10/14/09	107	NG	Begin review of liquidating trust agreement. Discuss with J. Wills.	0.30	425.00	\$127.50
10/15/09	074	NG	Review and edit time diaries.	0.20	425.00	\$85.00
10/20/09	074	NG	Review interim fee order.	0.10	425.00	\$42.50
10/21/09	107	NG	Call with J. Wills to review comments on draft trustee agreement.	0.60	425.00	\$255.00
10/21/09	107	NG	Review draft trustee agreement.	2.10	425.00	\$892.50
10/21/09	107	NG	Conference call with Debtor and Committee counsel regarding trustee agreement and plan of reorganization.	0.60	425.00	\$255.00
10/22/09	074	NG	Review and finalize monthly fee application.	0.50	425.00	\$212.50
Totals for: Gilmour, Neil				5.50	425.00	\$2,337.50

Abdoulleev, Sabir **Consultant**

Date	Task	Tmkp	Description	Hours Worked	Rate	Fees Billed
10/27/09	050	SA	Researched bankruptcy court docket for requested fee-app information.	0.50	195.00	\$97.50
Totals for: Abdoulleev, Sabir				0.50	195.00	\$97.50

TOTALS : 13.00 \$5,585.00