Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Exhibit Page 1 of 11

EXHIBIT B

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 708 Filed 05/24/19 Entered 05/24/19 13:32:42 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 14

DURO DYNE NATIONAL CORP.

Services and Disbursements Related to Serving as Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants April 1, 2019 through April 30, 2019

Description of Services Description of Services Description of Services Description of Services	<u>Time</u>	Charge
Review District Court Clerk's notice; draft note to Caplin team (4/1/19)	.1	\$32.50
Draft correspondence to Judge Shipp re: courtesy copies of <i>pro hac vice</i> motion (4/2/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review various docket notices/calendar all deadlines and dates (4/4/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review and file certification of no objection (4/5/19)	.2	\$65.00
Prepare and file certification of no objection for Fialcowitz monthly fee statement (4/5/19)	.2	\$65.00
Prepare and file certification of no objection for Gilbert monthly fee statement (4/5/119)	.2	\$65.00
Prepare and file certification of no objection for Charter Oak monthly fee statement (4/5/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review and file redacted and sealed versions of Munich amended and restated settlement agreement (4/8/19)	.8	\$260.00
Review and file redacted and sealed versions of MidStates amended and restated settlement agreement (4/8/19)	.7	\$227.50
Review and file redacted and sealed versions of Federal amended and restated settlement agreement (4/8/19)	.8	\$260.00

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 708 Filed 05/24/19^{ge} Entered 05/24/19 13:32:42 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 14

Description of Services (continued) Review and respond to e-mail correspondence	<u>Time</u>	<u>Charge</u>
from Gilbert firm re: miscellaneous tasks (4/8/19)	.3	\$97.50
Prepare and file certification of service (4/9/19)	.1	\$32.50
Telephone conference with Brad Deal of BMC Group re: service tasks (4/10/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law (4/15/19)	1.4	\$455.00
Review US Trustee's supplemental briefing on appeal; update Caplin team (4/22/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review and respond to Gilbert e-mails re: monthly fee statement (4/23/19)	.1	\$32.50
Draft e-mail to Caplin team re: monthly fee statement (4/23/19)	.1	\$32.50
Preparation of monthly fee statement (4/25/19)	1.0	\$325.00
Review and file Gilbert monthly fee statement (4/25/19)	.4	\$130.00
Review and file Caplin monthly fee statement (4/25/19)	.4	\$130.00
Review and file Charter Oak monthly fee statement (4/25/19)	.4	\$130.00
Prepare and file cert of service (4/29/19)	.1	\$32.50
Review J Prol correspondence to the District Court responding to U.S. Trustee supplemental briefing; update Caplin team (4/29/19)	.2	\$65.00

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 708 Filed 05/24/19⁹⁹ Entered 05/24/19 13:32:42 Desc Main Document Page 10 of 14

Description of Services (continued) Review MidStates reply to North River	Time	Charge
opposition; update Caplin team (4/29/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review Committee's reply to North River/US Trustee objections (4/30/19)	1.8 10.6	<u>\$585.00</u> \$3 ,445.00
<u>Description of Disbursement</u> Alphgraphics charges for filing related copies (4/9/19)		<u>Charge</u> \$193.84
Alphagraphics charges for filing related copies (4/29/19)		\$107.48 \$301.32

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 771 Filed 06/25/19 Entered 06/25/19 15:45:16 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 14

DURO DYNE NATIONAL CORP.

Services and Disbursements Related to Serving as Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants May 1, 2019 through May 31, 2019

Description of Services Review revised version of Brief in Opposition	<u>Time</u>	<u>Charge</u>
to Objectors Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusion of Law (5/3/19)	.9	\$292.50
Review North River's objection to Plan Proponents' Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law; update Caplin team (5/3/19)	.4	\$130.00
Review/file Caplin certification of no objection (5/6/19)	.3	\$97.50
Prepare and file certification of no objection for Gilbert monthly fee statement (5/6/19)	.3	\$97.50
Prepare and file certification of no objection for Charter Oak monthly fee statement (5/6/19)	.3	\$97.50
Prepare and file a certification of no objection for Fialcowitz monthly fee statement (5/6/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation of second interim fee application (5/7/19)	1.9	\$617.50
Review and file Charter Oak second interim fee application (5/7/19)	.7	\$227.50
Review and file Caplin & Drysdale second interim fee application (5/7/19)	.8	\$260.00
Review J. Liesemer e-mail re: North River (5/8/19)	.1	\$32.50
Review draft reply brief to North River's objection to settlement (5/14/19)	.6	\$195.00

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 771 Exhibito 6/25 Plage 6 notered 08/27/19 15:45:16 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 14

<u>Description of Services (continued)</u> Review correspondence from Young Conway	<u>Time</u>	Charge
to the Court (5/20/19)	.1	\$32.50
Review U.S. Trustee supplemental submission to the Court; update Caplin team (5/21/19)	.3	\$97.50
Attendance on Court Solutions conference call for Judge Kaplan's rulings on plan confirmation and approval of proposed settlements with insurers (5/22/19)	1.2	\$390.00
Review and respond to J. Wehner e-mail re: miscellaneous issues (5/22/19)	.1 .	\$32.50
Review and respond to Peggy of Gilbert re: monthly fee statement issues (5/22/19)	.1	\$32.50
Preparation of sixth monthly fee statement (5/23/19)	1.2	\$390.00
Review and file Caplin sixth monthly fee statement (5/24/19)	.4	\$130.00
Review and file Charter Oak sixth monthly fee statement (6/24/19)	.4	\$130.00
Review and file Gilbert sixth monthly fee statement (6/24/19)	.3	\$97.50
Preparation and filing of certification of service (5/29/19)	.2	\$65.00
Attendance on plan proponents' conference call (5/30/19)	.7	\$227.50
Attendance on conference call with Court re: follow up on rulings (5/31/19)	.3	\$97.50 \$3,835.00

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 771 Filed 06/25/19 Entered 06/25/19 15:45:16 Desc Main Document Page 10 of 14

Description of Disbursement	<u>Charge</u>
Fee charged by Court Solutions to appear by phone	\$50.00
Fee charged by Court Solutions to appear by phone Alphgraphics charges for filing related copies/second fee applications for Caplin, Gilbert, Charter Oak and	\$50.00
Fialcowitz (5/8/19)	<u>\$231.27</u> \$4,166.27
Total amount due this invoice	\$4,166.27

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 798 Filed 07/25/19 Entered 07/25/19 10:36:06 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 13

DURO DYNE NATIONAL CORP.

Services and Disbursements Related to Serving as Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants June 1, 2019 through June 30, 2019

Description of Services Telephone conference with court clerk to	<u>Time</u>	<u>Charge</u>
see if appearance required on 6/7 (6/5/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review T. Freedman e-mail to the Court re: third amended plan and revised trust distribution procedures (6/7/19)	.2	\$65.00
Attendance on conference call with the Court (6/7/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review J. Wehner e-mail re: drafts (6/7/19)	.1	\$32.50
Review various court orders (6/10/19)	.1	\$32.50
Preparation and filing of certification of no objection – Fialcowitz monthly fee statement (6/10/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation and filing of certification of no objection – Gilbert monthly fee statement (6/10/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation and filing of certification of no objection – Charter Oak monthly fee statement (6/10/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review and filing of certification of no objection – Caplin & Drysdale (6/10/19)	.1	\$32.50
Preparation of monthly fee statement (seventh) (6/24/19)	1.4	\$455.00

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 798 Filed 09/25/1999 Profered 07/25/19 10:36:06 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 13

Description of Services (continued)	<u>Time</u>	<u>Charge</u>
Review and file Gilbert's seventh monthly fee statement (6/25/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review and file Caplin & Drysdale's seventh monthly fee statement (6/25/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review and file Charter Oak's seventh monthly fee statement (6/25/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review US Trustee's objection (6/25/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation of certification of service (6/26/19)	<u>.2</u> 4.3	\$65.00 \$1,397.00
Description of Disbursement Alphagraphics charges for filing related copies/sec		<u>Charge</u>
fee statements for Caplin, Gilbert, Charter Oak and Fialcowitz (5/8/19)	i	\$82.53
Fee charged by Court Solutions for conference cal Attendance	ĺ	\$50.00 \$132.53
Total amount due this invoice		\$1,529.53

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 836 Filed 08/25/19 108/25/19 17:52:55 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 13

DURO DYNE NATIONAL CORP.

Services and Disbursements Related to Serving as Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants July 1, 2019 through July 31, 2019

Description of Services Preparation and filing of certification of no	<u>Time</u>	<u>Charge</u>
objection – Fialcowitz monthly fee statement (7/8/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation and filing of certification of no objection – Gilbert monthly fee statement (7/8/19)	.2	\$65.00
Preparation and filing of certification of no objection – Charter Oak monthly fee statement (7/8/19)	.2	\$65.00
Review and filing of certification of no objection – Caplin & Drysdale (7/8/19)	.1	\$32.50
Respond to request from Judge Kaplan's chambers for proposed form of orders (7/11/19)	.8	\$260.00
Review findings of fact and conclusions of law for confirmation; update Caplin team (7/16/19)	.7	\$227.50
Preparation of monthly fee statement (eighth) (7/24/19)	1.4	\$455.00
Draft e-mail to Gilbert re: monthly fee statement (7/24/19)	.1	\$32.50
Review and file Gilbert's eighth monthly fee statement (7/25/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review and file Caplin & Drysdale's eighth monthly fee statement (7/25/19)	.3	\$97.50
Review and file Charter Oak's eighth monthly fee statement (7/25/19)	.3	\$97.50

Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 847-2 Filed 08/27/19 Entered 08/27/19 15:54:06 Desc Case 18-27963-MBK Doc 836 Filed 08/25/19 Entered 08/25/19 17:52:55 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 13

Review and respond to Caplin team e-mails (7/25/19)	2	\$65.00
Preparation of certification of service (7/26/19)	<u>.2</u> 5.0	\$65.00 \$1,625.00
Description of Disbursement Alphagraphics charges for filing related copi		Charge
fee statements for Caplin, Gilbert, Charter O Fialcowitz	ak anu	\$90.20