

Exhibit A

984868.0000001

James A. Knauer, as Chapter 11 Trustee, Eastern Livestock Co., LLC

Proforma Ending 4/29/2011

Task	Index	Date	Timekeeper	Name	Title	Hours	Amount	Narrative
B001	13177511	12/27/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 55.50	Eastern Livestock Bankruptcy: Telephone call with J. Carr regarding new engagement
B001	13177558	12/27/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 55.50	E-mail from J. Carr forwarding e-mail from H. Schuyler
B001	13177595	12/28/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 166.50	Review docket sheet in preparation for conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13177599	12/28/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 555.00	Participate in conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13180172	12/29/2010	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 560.00	Telephone call with Trustee and professionals regarding asset recovery from other companies and related matters
B001	13179723	12/29/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 166.50	Review pleadings from interpleader cases
B001	13179731	12/29/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.70	\$ 943.50	Eastern Livestock Bankruptcy: Conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13179742	12/29/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 222.00	Study Emergency Motion for Expedited Hearing and exhibits thereto for background information
B001	13179753	12/29/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$ 333.00	Review pleadings in Fifth Third lawsuit in Ohio state court
B001	13179760	12/29/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 277.50	Study memorandum from E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's transactions and related documents
B001	13188485	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 55.50	Research regarding trustee's subpoena power to non-parties under Bankruptcy Rule 9016
B001	13188487	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 55.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding litigation strategy
B001	13188491	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.00	\$ 1,110.00	Conference call with J. Knauer, E. Lynch, et al
B001	13188503	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 277.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding removal procedures
B001	13188507	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.30	\$ 721.50	Study background information regarding Gibson family and affiliated entities
B001	13188513	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.20	\$ 666.00	Analyze sample kite transactional documents and other documents related to alleged fraud supplied by E. Lynch
B001	13188516	12/30/2010	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 166.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding sample kite documents
B001	13189759	1/3/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.80	\$ 1,053.00	Participate in conference call with J. Carr, J. Knauer, et al. regarding potential claims and asset recoveries
B001	13192931	1/4/2011	10806	Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.50	\$ 262.50	Conference call with J. Carr et al. regarding nature of fraud, theories of recovery and potential defenses; discuss fraud recovery strategies for check kites and falsified borrowing base
B001	13193633	1/4/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	4.60	\$ 2,691.00	Meetings at debtor's offices with trustee and trustee's agents regarding potential sources of asset recovery and strategies for achieving recoveries
B001	13193642	1/4/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Conference call with attorney for secured creditor Fifth Third regarding asset recovery
B001	13200046	1/6/2011	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.40	\$ 518.00	Conference call with client related to asset recovery
B001	13200298	1/6/2011	10806	Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.50	\$ 262.50	Conference with W. Ponader regarding background for preference analysis and basis for urgent determination
B001	13199653	1/6/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Provide instruction to H. Mappes regarding requirements for removal of various state court interpleader actions
B001	13202954	1/7/2011	10732	Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$ 332.00	Call with T. Hall regarding background, discussions of "must do" vs. "may do", economics of preference review, known history regarding company operations (.4); review SOFA and schedules (.4)
B001	13209300	1/11/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding case law on removal/transfer of interpleader actions
B001	13212757	1/12/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call from J. Knauer regarding agreed procedure for Cattlemen's discovery
B001	13214868	1/13/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.00	\$ 1,755.00	Meeting with trustee and co-counsel
B001	13219232	1/14/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Review stipulated protective order proposed by Fifth Third Bank
B001	13219243	1/14/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for D. Caruso regarding Jeff Parsons "partnership" cattle
B001	13219245	1/14/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding Jeff Parsons
B001	13223120	1/17/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Review e-mails regarding Jeff Parsons/Scott Lynsey/AgriBeef cattle
B001	13223127	1/17/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding Jeff Parsons/Scott Lynsey/AgriBeef cattle
B001	13223134	1/17/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$ 877.50	Meeting with J. Carr et al. regarding action plan
B001	13223159	1/17/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.50	\$ 1,462.50	Revise Fifth Third's proposed Stipulated Protective Order
B001	13222864	1/17/2011	15996	DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Strategy meeting to discuss recovery of assets and status of case
B001	13226596	1/18/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Study legal research memo from J. Carr regarding Fifth Third's asserted security interest in cattle sold to East-West Trucking
B001	13226602	1/18/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Read and reply to e-mail from E. Lynch regarding site visit to Cattlemen's
B001	13226607	1/18/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's performance records
B001	13228593	1/19/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Make further revision to draft Stipulated Protective Order
B001	13228756	1/19/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to R. LaTour and E. Richardson with revised draft Stipulated Protective Order
B001	13228761	1/19/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with counsel for Fifth Third regarding revisions to proposed Stipulated Protective Order
B001	13235971	1/21/2011	10732	Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	E-mail exchange with T. Hall regarding asset forfeiture
B001	13236258	1/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding U.S. Attorney seizure of Your Community Bank account
B001	13235271	1/21/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read e-mail from K. Britt (Vorys) and study his proposed revisions to draft Stipulated Protective Order
B001	13235283	1/21/2011	10847	Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for K. Britt (Vorys) regarding changes to draft Stipulated Protective Order

B001	13235294	1/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.40	\$	819.00	Conference call with Trustee, agent and co-counsel Calls with T. Hall regarding asset forfeiture issue (.2); meeting with S. Claffey regarding asset forfeiture issue, rights of government under statute (.4); review Madoff and other
B001	13239824	1/24/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.00	\$	830.00	materials, related B & D memorandum (.6); begin research (.8)
B001	13239057	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.00	\$	550.00	Preparation, telephone call J. Bosco, R. LaTour, J. Knauer, T. Hall and E. Lynch regarding U.S. Attorney seizure Your Community Bank accounts, buy contracts and other issues
B001	13239069	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Research regarding seizure law
B001	13238434	1/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research "buyer in ordinary course" and validity of Cattlemens' alleged purchase money security interest
B001	13238383	1/24/2011	18503 Britton, Kayla D.	Associate	1.50	\$	292.50	Research case law on fraud and the creation of a sham security interest
B001	13242180	1/25/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.40	\$	1,411.00	Research regarding asset forfeiture
B001	13245129	1/26/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.70	\$	1,535.50	Continue research regarding asset forfeiture issues in preparation for T. Hall January 27, 2011 meeting, prepare "short memo" review
B001	13246448	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	E-mails and draft letter to W. Downs regarding cooperation with Trustee
B001	13244999	1/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding U.S. Attorney asset seizures and related issues
B001	13245000	1/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Review and revise draft adversary complaint for misappropriation of endorsed checks
B001	13245004	1/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Review and comment on draft letter to unrepresented individual, W. Downs
B001	13246048	1/26/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft letter to W. Downs
B001	13249020	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$	770.00	E-mails McGill regarding Heine settlement and draft contract term agreement
B001	13249022	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mails regarding Downs and other issues
B001	13251346	1/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding possible claim in East-West case on adversary proceeding regarding proceeds from sale of cattle at Cattlemen's feedlot
B001	13257098	1/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$	585.00	Conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13259409	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.90	\$	526.50	Conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13259415	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Review and comment on revised draft letter to potential informant W. Downs
B001	13262402	2/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review draft adversary complaint against Downs, Seals and McDonald and forward same to J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al. with explanation
B001	13266445	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail from J. Carr regarding letter to Plaintiffs' counsel in federal interpleader cases
B001	13266446	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to S. Eikenberry and H. Mappes regarding communication with Plaintiffs' counsel in state interpleader cases and status of those cases
B001	13266449	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Review suggested agenda for upcoming conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al.
B001	13266451	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mails from S. Eikenberry regarding state court interpleader cases
B001	13266456	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and forward to J. Carr with my comments e-mail from S. Eikenberry with engagement letter from Kansas local counsel
B001	13266460	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and forward to J. Carr with my comments e-mail from S. Eikenberry with engagement letter from Colorado local counsel
B001	13266463	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and forward to J. Carr with my comments e-mail from S. Eikenberry with engagement letter from Wisconsin local counsel
B001	13266466	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding accounts receivable information on parties to state court interpleader actions
B001	13266468	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Study DSI background information on transactions at issue in Texas interpleader case
B001	13266479	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Study Eastern Livestock Co.'s audited financials for information regarding Okie Farms
B001	13266481	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to J. Knauer, J. Carr, et al. regarding Okie Farms
B001	13272127	2/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Begin review of memorandum by DeNeal on application of PASA to ELC
B001	13270420	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$	877.50	Conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr et al. regarding pending issues
B001	13283135	2/4/2011	17474 Pearcy, Jennifer A.	Associate	4.10	\$	1,209.50	Research accord and satisfaction and governing law for contract dispute in Indiana
B001	13283136	2/4/2011	17474 Pearcy, Jennifer A.	Associate	0.50	\$	147.50	(B1) Communications with W. Ponader and T. Hall regarding research
B001	13275894	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Review research, memorandum and leads case regarding non-application of PSA to ELC (not "packer") and conference with D. DeNeal
B001	13275909	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	E-mails J. Knauer et al. regarding various issues regarding cattle purchase sale contracts
B001	13274583	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Study Okie Farms operating agreement and amendment to operating agreement
B001	13274600	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$	468.00	Analysis of potential value to ELC estate of cattle in Cattlemen's custody
B001	13275836	2/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.10	\$	759.50	Continue research on application of PASA trust to ELC and whether ELC qualifies as a "Packer"
B001	13277491	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mail J. Knauer et al. info from McGill regarding Heine \$236K A/P
B001	13277504	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding PSA research
B001	13278008	2/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail from J. Massouh (Cattlemen's counsel) regarding sale of cattle lots 1338 and 1339
B001	13278019	2/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to J. Massouh regarding Okie Farms
B001	13278021	2/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.30	\$	760.50	Analysis of Cattlemen's sales and remaining inventory
B001	13278023	2/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.10	\$	643.50	E-mail to J. Knauer, J. Carr and T. Hill regarding Cattlemen's analysis
B001	13282389	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Review e-mails regarding Cattlemen's and the \$ involved in Cattlemen's dispute and Okie 48% equity
B001	13285080	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Review e-mails regarding SOLM claim (including DIS valuation of SOLM contacts) regarding "assignment" of contracts by which ELC agreed to buy cattle
B001	13285085	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.10	\$	605.00	Conference with J. Knauer and T. Hall regarding SOLM and Superior matters
B001	13285093	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Draft letter to counsel SOLM and letter to counterparty sellers
B001	13285097	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Revise letter to counterparty sellers to Superior

B001	13285100	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mail from and telephone call Jeff Todd regarding SOLM
B001	13286616	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.40	\$ 1,320.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, E. Lynch, T. Hall, C. Pierce, R. Stanley, et al. regarding Superior, SOLM, Friona, Cattlemen's and other issues
B001	13286281	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's book value and liquidation value of ELC's interest in Cattlemen's
B001	13286288	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr et al. regarding potential claims
B001	13287159	2/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.60	\$ 637.00	Participate in conference call regarding asset collection and pursuit of claims
B001	13295687	2/14/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.60	\$ 249.00	Telephone call with E. Barnes to Abilene note, possible settlement (.3); telephone call with T. Hall regarding same (.1); prepare e-mail to J. Knauer, E. Lynch regarding same (.2)
B001	13294957	2/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Telephone call J. Knauer regarding SOLM
B001	13291875	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Draft contract termination and settlement agreements
B001	13291883	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Draft contract termination and settlement agreements
B001	13291916	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Draft motion and order for 2004 examination of Thomas Gibson
B001	13291939	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Research Superior Livestock bankruptcy Review documents regarding Garrett/Edwards Community litigation and Thompson Hine statement, telephone call J. Kopf (Thompson Hine attorney for Garrett) regarding \$20K
B001	13296036	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	payable to ELC from litigation and e-mail regarding wire transfer Review documents and preparation for conference telephone call with J. Knauer, E. Lynch et al. regarding Cattlemens resolving Friona transfer of inter pleader, SOLM, Supreme, USA
B001	13296135	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$ 880.00	W. KY, litigation, other issues
B001	13296137	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	E-mail to and from M. McGill (Heine attorney) regarding documents and demand regarding \$236K A/R from Heine
B001	13296141	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	E-mails and telephone call with R. Plourde (SOLM counsel) and J. Knauer to resolve SOLM matter
B001	13296144	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Revise letters to SOLM counterparties / sellers regarding completion of sale contracts with SOLM
B001	13294907	2/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.70	\$ 994.50	Strategy conference call with J. Knauer, J. Carr et al.
B001	13296339	2/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Draft motions and orders for Gibson 2004 Examination and ELC 2004 Examination
B001	13298937	2/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$ 110.00	E-mails E. Lynch and J. Knauer regarding Arrow and other issues
B001	13300708	2/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding Arrowhead and conference with T. Hall
B001	13301116	2/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Receive report from S. Eikenberry on T. Gibson 341 meeting
B001	13307238	2/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from S. Eikenberry regarding Crow Hollow LLC
B001	13307519	2/21/2011	18503 Britton, Kayla D.	Associate	1.00	\$ 195.00	Research deadline for objecting to Gibsons' exemption schedule Confer with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding considerations for preparing filters for use in preference analysis, gauges for recovery(.4); telephone call with E. Lynch regarding preference
B001	13310918	2/22/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$ 332.00	review (.4)
B001	13310147	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mails K. McConnell regarding Agribeeef
B001	13310151	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Telephone call K. McConnell and J. Knauer regarding Agribeeef and 3/2 meeting
B001	13310155	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Review Agribeeef documents
B001	13310159	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	E-mails Stahl and other contract counterparties
B001	13310386	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding status Agribeeef, Supreme and other matters
B001	13310397	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding Agribeeef and proposal assignment
B001	13316939	2/23/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.10	\$ 456.50	Work on developing preference filters (.8); revise budget to reflect preference work week of February 20 (.3)
B001	13313306	2/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mails Agribeeef regarding meeting
B001	13330356	2/24/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$ 373.50	Attention to Abilene, Texas Food Note settlement (.5); telephone call with T. Hall; prepare e-mail to E. Lynch regarding same (.4)
B001	13316717	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$ 880.00	E-mails from D. Donnellon regarding Cactus and ECC financing, conference with R. Stanley and e-mails J. Knauer, E. Lynch and D. Donnellon regarding proposed call and issues raised
B001	13316733	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mails regarding motion to extend time to oppose T. Gibson discharge
B001	13316761	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mails regarding hearing in T. Gibson bankruptcy regarding abandonment of LLC interests
B001	13316762	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	Preparation and conference telephone call J. Knauer, T. Hall regarding Superior, Cactus, Friona, Cattlemens, C&M, other issues
B001	13316016	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with J. Carr and D. DeNeal regarding cattle at Cactus feedlot purportedly owned by Eastern Cattle
B001	13316104	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Study background documents regarding cattle at Cactus feedlot purportedly owned by Eastern Cattle Company
B001	13316109	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for Cactus counsel J. Lovell
B001	13316116	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to J. Knauer, J. Carr, E. Lynch et al. regarding cattle at Cactus feedlot purportedly owned by Eastern Cattle Company
B001	13316123	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding Cactus/Eastern Cattle
B001	13316230	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Conference call with D. Donnellon and D. Caruso regarding Cactus/Eastern Cattle
B001	13316233	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	Exchange e-mails with E. Lynch regarding Cactus/Eastern Cattle situation
B001	13316406	2/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read e-mail from J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's sale of lots 1343 and 1341 and forward same to Trustee and co-counsel with comments
B001	13315344	2/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Review and research relationship with Cactus and Eastern Cattle Co.
B001	13319999	2/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mail Thompson Hine regarding wiring Garrett \$
B001	13320542	2/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$ 294.00	Advise and assist with drafting of adversary complaints

B001	13325650	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail from J. Massouh regarding capacity of Cattlemen's feedlots
B001	13325652	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer et al. regarding capacity of Cattlemen's feedlots
B001	13330357	2/28/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	4.00	\$ 1,420.00	Review and analyze documents related to Nu Technologies, C&M Cattle and Atkinson matters; conference with L. Lynch regarding same; conference with T. Hall regarding same
B001	13330081	3/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$ 1,045.00	Review Agrib Beef documents, telephone call E. Lynch, telephone call K. McConnell (ABC's counsel), e-mails to and from K. McConnell et al. regarding March 2 meeting
B001	13330096	3/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding telephone call with USA W. Kentucky regarding seized UCB account
B001	13330181	3/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Review and revise release regarding Thompson Hine/Garrett and e-mails Kopf et al.
B001	13331054	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding Agri-Beef and BBL situations
B001	13330479	3/1/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	1.50	\$ 532.50	Conference with T. Hall and L. Lynch regarding issues related to Nu Technologies; review documents regarding same; research regarding effect of acceptance of payment from Nu Technologies; conference with D. DeNeal regarding Edens matter
B001	13330316	3/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Phone calls with C. Pierce and S. O'Neill regarding E. Edens
B001	13334262	3/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	3.60	\$ 1,980.00	Review documents, meeting Agrib Beef representatives, meeting with J. Knauer and E. Lynch et al. regarding Agrib Beef
B001	13335394	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.00	\$ 1,755.00	Meeting with representatives of AgriBeef
B001	13335503	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.20	\$ 702.00	Meeting with E. Lynch et al. regarding Agri-Beef situation
B001	13334609	3/2/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	1.80	\$ 639.00	Meeting with T. Hall and DSI regarding Nu Technologies, C&M Cattle and BACA matters
B001	13334892	3/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Revise form letter regarding payments on cattle sales
B001	13341490	3/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Consider strategies for interpleader matters in which the interpleader did not purchase cattle directly from Eastern
B001	13337318	3/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.80	\$ 1,540.00	Meeting with J. Knauer, E. Lynch, P. O'Malley, T. Hall and R. Stanley regarding areas of recovery and projected ranges recovery
B001	13336708	3/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.90	\$ 1,111.50	Meeting with J. Knauer et al. regarding valuation of potential recoveries
B001	13336740	3/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from D. Donnellon (First Bank)
B001	13341359	3/3/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	1.50	\$ 532.50	Conference with DSI regarding issues related to various account receivables, including Atkinson & Baker; review documents regarding same
B001	13342311	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mails regarding Agrib Beef
B001	13342316	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding Northern Livestock Video Auction
B001	13342172	3/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone call with D. Donnellon regarding asset recovery issues
B001	13341230	3/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Call with and research Northern Livestock Video Auction's claim to payment from Nu Technology regarding cattle sold pursuant to a contract with ELC
B001	13341239	3/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Revise Seals and Downs complaint
B001	13344436	3/7/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	Telephone call with S. O'Neill regarding Abilene promissory note matter, background, next steps
B001	13344960	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Review and revise letter response to Superior regarding Friona and conference with R. Stanley regarding delivery date of Superior cattle
B001	13344787	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Study Cattlemen's draft Confidentiality Agreement and Fifth Third's proposed revisions
B001	13344795	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Reply to e-mail from R. LaTour (Fifth Third counsel) regarding revisions to Cattlemen's draft Confidentiality Agreement
B001	13344816	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Reply to e-mail from J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's draft Confidentiality Agreement
B001	13344911	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding revisions to Cattlemen's draft Confidentiality Agreement
B001	13344916	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to R. LaTour with redline Cattlemen's Confidentiality Agreement
B001	13344924	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's financial information and Confidentiality Agreement
B001	13351309	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mail E. Lynch et al. regarding Agrib Beef and need for contracts
B001	13354016	3/9/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$ 373.50	Participated on conference call with U.S. Attorney's Office regarding discussions on forfeiture issue (.8); telephone call with J. Carr regarding same (.1)
B001	13354024	3/9/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	E-mail exchange with E. Barnes regarding Abilene note, follow-up with S. O'Neill
B001	13352256	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	E-mails to and from B. Cole regarding AgriBeef and to E. Lynch et al. regarding obtaining copies of contracts
B001	13350992	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding Okie-Cattlemen's-Fifth Third situation
B001	13350999	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour about stopping default judgment proceedings against Okie Farms
B001	13351317	3/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$ 171.50	Participate in call with U.S. Attorney's office
B001	13359590	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	E-mail from and to Cole of Agrib Beef
B001	13354632	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Study e-mail from D. Caruso regarding 401 head at Friona being claimed by the Gibson trustee
B001	13354648	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to D. Caruso regarding 401 head at Friona
B001	13354651	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding 401 head at Friona
B001	13360638	3/10/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 71.00	Communicate with P. O'Malley and W. Ponader regarding Abilene, Texas matter
B001	13354034	3/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$ 318.50	Research Indiana law on restrictive endorsements and enforceability of words "full and final payment"
B001	13365380	3/11/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	E-mail exchange with E. Barnes regarding mortgage securing Abilene Note
B001	13359613	3/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	E-mail Cole regarding possible resolution Fletcher matter with Supreme
B001	13362365	3/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	E-mail from E. Lynch; e-mails Cole et al. regarding Agrib Beef/Fletcher
B001	13362370	3/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Telephone call B. Cole
B001	13367021	3/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Review material regarding Agrib Beef



B001	13365593	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mails from E. Lynch regarding 401 head at Friona
B001	13365776	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement and motion for default judgment against Okie Farms
B001	13365780	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review receivership order and conference with J. Carr regarding same
B001	13365785	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Massouh regarding draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13365791	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's and regarding disputed 401 and 126 head of cattle at Friona
B001	13365795	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to J. Knauer's e-mail regarding 401 and 126 disputed cattle at Friona
B001	13370750	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.60	\$	936.00	Status and planning conference call with Trustee, Trustee's agent and co-counsel
B001	13370807	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to J. Massouh regarding 401 and 126 head at Friona Study additional proposed revisions by Cattlemen's and Fifth Third's counsel to the draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement and send e-mail to J. Massouh and R. LaTour with
B001	13373195	3/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$	409.50	responses and further changes
B001	13373220	3/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone call with J. Lovell's assistant regarding cattle on feed at Cactus under the name of Eastern Cattle
B001	13373227	3/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mails to D. LeBas regarding cattle on feed at Cactus under the name of Eastern Cattle
B001	13373244	3/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone call with D. LeBas regarding cattle on feed at Cactus under name of Eastern Cattle Co.
B001	13375963	3/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails regarding Seals and other matters
B001	13376052	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$	409.50	Study RSI report forwarded by J. Knauer
B001	13376061	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh regarding final edits to draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13376066	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh with execution copy of Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13376163	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer requesting signature on Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13376172	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review First Bank's Motion for Rule 2004 subpoena to major feedlots
B001	13379610	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Status and strategy regarding actions regarding Superior, Agribeeff and Joplin
B001	13380333	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Review report from Wells Fargo forensic account and J. Knauer e-mail regarding possible claim against auditors
B001	13380344	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Review J. Knauer memorandum regarding redemption sale of ELC equity in livestock association
B001	13379968	3/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and forward to J. Knauer e-mail from R. LaTour with partially executed copy of Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13379989	3/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$	877.50	Meeting with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding potential claims
B001	13379999	3/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Conference with H. Mappes regarding Seals/Downs complaints
B001	13380019	3/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding accountancy statute of limitations
B001	13378013	3/21/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$	51.00	Conference with R. Stanley discussing research issue regarding accountant claims
B001	13379054	3/21/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.50	\$	127.50	Begin researching applicable statute of limitations for Indiana and Kentucky
B001	13382187	3/22/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	124.50	Confer with T. Hall regarding strategy 547/548 actions now, provide forms of Complaint
B001	13381691	3/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	Review files regarding Agribeeff claim; telephone call E. Lynch and conference with D. DeNeal regarding Agribeeff claim
B001	13381718	3/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference with T. Hall and e-mail E. Lynch regarding SOLM
B001	13381774	3/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research potential tortious interference claim against Agribeeff
B001	13381335	3/22/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$	204.00	Continue researching Indiana statute of limitations for accountant actions
B001	13386765	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mails regarding computer data retrieval and other issues
B001	13386425	3/23/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone call and e-mail with J. Knauer regarding Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13386435	3/23/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Massouh and R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B001	13386336	3/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Draft purchase money report and exhibit listing proceeds
B001	13386349	3/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Phone call with AC Forensics regarding current state of ELC electronic data and potential for forensic recovery efforts
B001	13386391	3/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Research claims against Agribeeff and compare Agribeeff "cover contracts" to ELC underlying buy contracts
B001	13385633	3/23/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.70	\$	433.50	Research Kentucky statute of limitations for accountant actions
B001	13389904	3/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Agribeeff
B001	13390742	3/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Conference with H. Mappes regarding results of her research on statute of limitations for claim against ELC's independent auditors
B001	13389659	3/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.10	\$	514.50	Research tortious interference claims against Agribeeff and Superior; begin drafting response letter to Agribeeff
B001	13388522	3/24/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.60	\$	408.00	Finish statute of limitations research; conference with R. Stanley regarding same; begin drafting memo
B001	13407600	3/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	E-mails to Cole et al. regarding Agribeeff
B001	13392271	3/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft settlement letter to Agribeeff
B001	13391818	3/25/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.50	\$	382.50	Complete first draft of accountant statute of limitations memo
B001	13397132	3/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Call with E. Lynch regarding proceeds in escrow account and Trustee's Purchase Money report and update exhibit
B001	13397142	3/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Call with E. Lynch regarding ELC Buy Contracts vis a vis Agribeeff and revise settlement letter to Agribeeff
B001	13397191	3/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Review complaint and advise with respect to adversary procedure, summons form, and course of discovery
B001	13395600	3/28/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$	204.00	Revise and finalize memo regarding statute of limitations
B001	13400205	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Conference call with counsel for Friona and Superior regarding 301 head on feed at Friona in Superior's name
B001	13400211	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Leave voicemail for T. Hall regarding 301 head on feed at Friona in Superior's name

B001	13400213	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review e-mail from J. Massouh regarding 301 head at Friona and forward same to co-counsel with explanation
B001	13400220	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$	409.50	Read H. Mappes' draft memo regarding statute of limitations for negligence claim against auditor and confer with H. Mappes regarding same
B001	13400226	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Study Cattlemen's information received from J. Massouh
B001	13400232	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's information
B001	13400234	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	E-mail to J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's information
B001	13400235	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and forward with comments to J. Knauer, J. Carr and T. Hall an e-mail from S. Eikenberry regarding attempts by Florida entities to assert liens on cattle
B001	13399343	3/29/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$	318.50	Research 307 head of cattle on feed with Friona (and accompanying yard sheets) that Superior claims rights to pursuant to alleged assignment
B001	13399571	3/29/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$	204.00	Conference with R. Stanley strategizing regarding standing issues implicating statute of limitations for accountant claims; begin researching same
B001	13403121	3/30/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Study letter from J. Huffaker (Cattlemen's counsel) regarding tax roll-forward and other issues with Okie's interest in Cattlemen's
B001	13403176	3/30/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Leave voicemail for J. Huffaker regarding Okie/Cattlemen's
B001	13403191	3/30/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's/Okie
B001	13403204	3/30/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone conference with J. Lovell regarding Cactus
B001	13403111	3/30/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.90	\$	465.50	Review Northern Livestock complaint and correspondence and research potential claims against Northern Livestock
B001	13401910	3/30/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.60	\$	663.00	Continue follow-up standing research regarding accountant claims
B001	13405947	3/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Telephone conference with R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's and Cactus
B001	13405280	3/31/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$	294.00	Call with E. Lynch regarding and draft correspondence to counsel for Northern Livestock Video Auction regarding cattle sale to Nu Technologies and case pending in Montana
B001	13411052	4/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.40	\$	343.00	Further research on tortious interference and fraudulent transfer claims to assess validity of potential claims against Northern Livestock and Agribeeef
B001	13411135	4/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft proofs of claim for claims against Gibson and East West trucking estates
B001	13410266	4/1/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$	229.50	Continue looking into accountant standing issues and 544 analysis; e-mail to R. Stanley regarding same
B001	13414976	4/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$	204.00	Conference with R. Stanley discussing standing issues; begin revising statute of limitations memo to address standing issues
B001	13419510	4/5/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	332.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding additional information, request for telephone call in connection with preparing preference filter; work on preparing "preference filter"
B001	13417989	4/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	E-mails regarding various issues including N. Livestock Video and Nichols claim to SOLM cattle
B001	13417997	4/5/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review and comment on H. Mappes' revised draft memo on statutes of limitations for potential claims against ELC; outside auditors
B001	13418163	4/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Calls with DSI regarding receivables from East-West Trucking and Gibsons
B001	13418176	4/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Advise regarding potential contract settlement with J. Faris, Agribeeef and Northern Livestock Video Auction
B001	13417352	4/5/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.60	\$	918.00	Complete revisions and additions to memo regarding potential accountant negligence claim Conference call with A. Omori, P. O'Malley and E. Lynch regarding additional information regarding categories of transferees for 90 day preference filter (1.0); work on document
B001	13424920	4/6/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.30	\$	954.50	(1.3)
B001	13424926	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Review Response by Friona et al. to First Bank's request for 2004 examination
B001	13424930	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Voicemail for J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's
B001	13420959	4/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Draft proofs of claim for filing in Gibson and East-West bankruptcies
B001	13426096	4/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00	E-mails regarding Seals
B001	13425049	4/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Huffaker containing offer to purchase Okie Farm's interest in Cattlemen's
B001	13425052	4/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Exchange of e-mails with J. Knauer regarding Cattlemen's offer to purchase Okie's interest
B001	13425056	4/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Knauer regarding potential accountant liability
B001	13423821	4/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Revise and finalize proofs of claim for Gibson and East-West cases
B001	13424784	4/7/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$	25.50	E-mail with J. Knauer regarding potential accountant malpractice claim Telephone call with A. Omori regarding follow-up on standard contracts, review contracts regarding "spot purchase", forward contracts, complete draft of "preference filter"
B001	13430318	4/8/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.10	\$	1,286.50	regarding preliminary preference analysis
B001	13429212	4/8/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$	157.50	Conference with W. Ponader regarding format for preference analysis and prior "preference books" we have prepared
B001	13428096	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.40	\$	1,404.00	Strategy and planning meeting with J. Carr et al., including conference call with J. Knauer
B001	13428100	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Leave voicemail for M. Sandlin regarding G. Seals
B001	13428134	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone call with J. Huffaker regarding Cattlemen's
B001	13428144	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding plan for Seals meeting and 2004 exams
B001	13428154	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Voicemail for R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's
B001	13428181	4/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Read and reply to e-mails from C. Pierce and P. O'Malley regarding Friona & Cactus receivables
B001	13430804	4/8/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	106.50	Review correspondence related to Abilene Foods matter and C&M matter
B001	13426727	4/8/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.60	\$	153.00	Conference with R. Stanley discussing investigation strategy
B001	13428353	4/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.20	\$	660.00	Review and revise POCs for East-West Trucking and T. Gibson bankruptcies
B001	13430004	4/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding POC East-West/Gibsons
B001	13431100	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour (Fifth Third) regarding Cattlemen's and statute of limitations for claim against accountants

B001	13430790	4/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.00	\$	735.00	Research and draft "Statement of Claim" for proofs of claims to be filed in Gibsons and East-West bankruptcies
B001	13430021	4/11/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$	51.00	Telephone conference with D. DeNeal discussing documents
B001	13432565	4/12/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Review Florida law concerning transfer of title, with regard to cattle auctioneers' claims in Wisconsin interpleader matter
B001	13434523	4/12/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	83.00	Confer with J. Carr regarding draft preference filter; prepare e-mail to DSI explaining filter, seeking input
B001	13432450	4/12/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.70	\$	994.50	Teleconference with Trustee, Trustee's agent and co-counsel regarding Superior and other issues
B001	13432356	4/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Revise and file proof of claim in East-West bankruptcy
								Call with L. Lynch regarding comments/questions regarding preference filter (.4); revise document to add processes on "directed transfers" (.6); prepare e-mail to B&D team
B001	13441554	4/13/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.40	\$	581.00	regarding DSI follow-up questions on Branch managers as insiders, categorization of analysis (.3); follow-up e-mail exchange with DSI regarding insiders (.1)
B001	13437427	4/13/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Conference call with Monty Haiar regarding Northern Livestock Video Auction and Nu Technologies
B001	13444394	4/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Study court filings regarding First Bank's motion for 2004 examinations from three major feedlots
B001	13440574	4/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Revise proof of claim for filing in Gibson case
B001	13440580	4/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.90	\$	465.50	Further research on potential claims against Agribeeff and draft settlement letter
B001	13444195	4/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Agribeeff and response to Cole
B001	13444329	4/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	6.00	\$	3,510.00	Omnibus hearing, including hearing on First Bank's request for issuance of 2004 examination orders and objections thereto
B001	13447328	4/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Read and reply to series of e-mails regarding changes to order on 2004 examination productions by feedlots
B001	13451946	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from M. Robinson regarding changes to agreed entries resolving discovery disputes between First Bank and major feedlots
B001	13451955	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$	409.50	Conference with J. Hanlon regarding design of 2004 examination program
B001	13451959	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to M. Sandlier regarding G. Seals
B001	13451960	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding Gary Seals
B001	13451353	4/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.40	\$	343.00	Draft letter and subpoena to Royal Beef
B001	13451410	4/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Coordinate receipt of discovery requests from Your Community Bank
B001	13451426	4/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Revise and finalize statement of claim for proof of claim in Gibson case
B001	13453577	4/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails regarding Hoodenpyle and other matters
B001	13453294	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.90	\$	465.50	Research and revise settlement letter to Agribeeff
B001	13453297	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.70	\$	416.50	Research and draft Contract Termination and Settlement Agreement with Ralph Hoodenpyle
B001	13453305	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Revise and circulate proof of claim for Gibson case
B001	13453315	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Revise and circulate subpoena and letter to Royal Beef
B001	13452828	4/20/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$	76.50	Attention to document/discovery database and loading of recent productions
								Conference with T. Hall, telephone call with J. Knauer and telephone call with R. LaTour regarding Superior and proposed settlement agreement regarding payment of accounts
B001	13457113	4/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.10	\$	605.00	receivable from 13 cattle sellers and sale/deposit of proceeds regarding Friona cattle
								Review and revise letter to Agribeeff and review documents regarding Agribeeff setoff claims; conference with D. DeNeal and R. Stanley regarding research interference with contract
B001	13457116	4/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.50	\$	825.00	claims and e-mails J. Knauer et al. regarding Agribeeff
B001	13457117	4/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Review e-mails regarding Hoodenpyle and other issues
B001	13456770	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$	877.50	Study cases and statutes relating to Superior adversary proceeding
B001	13456775	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone call with J. Carr regarding Agri-Beef
B001	13456783	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail from J. Donnellon with list of suspicious persons and Gibson affiliates
B001	13456801	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding Joplin and other inventory/receivables issues
B001	13456222	4/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Revise Agribeeff settlement letter and research Indiana case law on tortious interference with a contractual relationship
B001	13456235	4/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Revise and finalize settlement agreement with Hoodenpyle
B001	13458131	4/21/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	80.00	Office conference with J. Hanlon regarding Eastern Livestock Civil Seizure Complaint
B001	13460022	4/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, E. Lynch et al. and e-mails regarding scheduling, Agribeeff, Hoodenpyle, Edens, Royal Beef et al
B001	13460047	4/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Review and revise letter to Cole regarding Agribeeff
B001	13460067	4/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mail Kopf regarding funds held by Thompson Hine and D. Garrett
B001	13459859	4/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.90	\$	465.50	Finalize Agribeeff settlement letter; finalize Hoodenpyle settlement; review Superior position statement; update J. Carr on discussions with Northern Livestock Video Auction
B001	13459873	4/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Revise statement of claim in Gibsons' bankruptcy
B001	13469589	4/22/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	2.30	\$	920.00	Office conference with T. Hall to discuss verified complaint; begin review of remission rules and regulations; brief review of seizure warrants
B001	13469619	4/25/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	40.00	Correspond with A. Sullivan regarding Verified Complaint
								Confer with L. Lynch and A. Omori regarding status of preference analysis, reports and schedules to be issued per filters, critical nature of gathering, reporting data that matches up
B001	13467456	4/26/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	166.00	data for cattle receipts
B001	13466931	4/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$	880.00	Further revise letter to Cole (Agribeeff) and telephone call, e-mail E. Lynch et al. regarding Superior payment to Piedmont, Tate and Superior
B001	13468564	4/26/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research and draft letter to D. Domina rejecting settlement offer extended on behalf of Nu Technologies and research after Domina settlement offers



B001	13469643	4/26/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	3.60	\$	1,440.00	Telephone conference with A. Sullivan regarding verified complaint and civil forfeiture action; respond to telephone call from T. Hall regarding same; e-mail correspondence with T. Hall regarding verified complaint and next steps; review remission rules and regulations regarding civil forfeiture actions
B001	13481219	4/27/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	83.00	Prepare e-mail to J. Carr regarding "directed transfers" to be identified per filters, other follow-up
B001	13470083	4/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	E-mail from E. Lynch regarding Agribeeef and Tate, Piedmont, review and revise letter to Cole
B001	13469217	4/27/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Review and finalize settlement letter to Agribeeef
B001	13474180	4/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Review and revise letter to Domina regarding return of check and settlement regarding Nu Technologies et al.; conference with D. DeNeal
B001	13473490	4/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.00	\$	735.00	Research and revise settlement letter to Nu Technologies
B001	13487860	4/28/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	5.70	\$	2,280.00	Review correspondence from T. Hall regarding verified complaint; continue research on response to verified complaint and options for Trustee to consider; begin draft of information regarding response to verified complaint
B001	13480864	4/29/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding research to respond to Cole regarding AgriBeef regarding nature of "transfers" that are bases for Trustee claims
B001	13476522	4/29/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Research and draft summary of Bankruptcy Code definition of "transfer" for purposes of settlement discussions with Agribeeef, especially with regard to contract terminations
B001	13487891	4/29/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	2.20	\$	880.00	Telephone conference with J. Hanlon regarding timing of response to verified complaint; continue draft of correspondence to T. Hall and J. Carr regarding trustee options to respond to verified complaint
B002	13187708	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.50	\$	857.50	Draft sales procedure motion
B002	13187717	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$	318.50	Draft turnover/protective order motion
B002	13193503	1/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	6.00	\$	2,220.00	Meet with Trustee and consultant regarding asset recovery possibilities and conference telephone calls with lenders regarding strategy and budget
B002	13193655	1/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Telephonic court hearing regarding disposition of executory contracts
B002	13196778	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$	880.00	Review and revise motion to complete sales of cattle delivered pre-petition and conference with T. Hall
B002	13199269	1/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.50	\$	857.50	Draft, revise and file motions, orders, and exhibits seeking authority to sell cattle and establish procedures for asserting claims against "Purchase Money"
B002	13216607	1/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$	703.00	Meeting with Trustee and consultant on matters related to asset recovery
B002	13212580	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Telephone call J. Knauer and T. Hall regarding status and strategy regarding executory purchase contracts and other matters
B002	13216610	1/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.50	\$	925.00	Conference with Trustee, et al. regarding orders, asset recovery, status of removals, etc.
B002	13216611	1/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Meeting with R. Stanley regarding Cattlemen's documentation
B002	13215060	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails E. Lynch and J. Knauer regarding Parsons, assignment of contracts and other issues
B002	13217115	1/13/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$	196.00	Revise orders on Trustee sale motions
B002	13220076	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Review and revise order regarding sale motion and payment for cattle delivered pre-petition
B002	13227963	1/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Revise Cattlemen's proposed Order
B002	13227983	1/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.30	\$	851.00	Research Farm Act of 1985 and lien preservation and priority
B002	13229620	1/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$	555.00	Review new proposed revisions to order on Cattlemen's stay relief and participate in conference telephone call
B002	13229636	1/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$	740.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles (attorney for creditors) regarding changes to cattle sales proceeds motion and receipt of proceeds for Worrell cattle sales; contracts taken by Superior and research same with client
B002	13229641	1/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$	259.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding issues related to cattle sale
B002	13229643	1/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Attend to Miller and other contract sales issues on payment receipts
B002	13226996	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Review letter from McGill regarding Heine contract; e-mail to J. Knauer et al.
B002	13229657	1/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$	740.00	Conference call with client regarding asset recovery
B002	13229804	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mail Fifth Third (Bosco/LaTour) regarding proposal for settlement with sellers under open buy contracts and assumption and assignment to buyers of contracts
B002	13235593	1/20/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Telephone call with Superior Livestock and client regarding contracts and potential use to sell cattle
B002	13235594	1/20/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding Superior
B002	13235997	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	E-mails Fifth Third et al. regarding attempting to resolve buy contracts, including Heine contract
B002	13231572	1/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Draft form assignment and notice of intent to sell contracts
B002	13235603	1/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$	555.00	Conference telephone call related to Cattlemen's and other issues for potential litigation
B002	13235621	1/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding asset recovery
B002	13236282	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Revise letter to McGill (Heine counsel) and telephone call M. McGill
B002	13245326	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Respond to miscellaneous questions on open matters
B002	13245331	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Revise letter to USDA
B002	13245335	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Review assumption/assignment of contracts and propose changes
B002	13245338	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Identify contract parties to make a demand on and review new contract listing
B002	13245343	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Brief review of asset forfeiture cases
B002	13243755	1/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Conference telephone call with client and Fifth Third Bank regarding contracts assignment/settlement
B002	13245227	1/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Revise letter to USDA for DeNeal and send
B002	13245229	1/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Draft letter to contract counter parties; circulate and revise
B002	13245233	1/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$	592.00	Telephone call with D. Caruso regarding asset forfeiture status and continue research on intersection of bankruptcy and forfeiture statutes

B002	13239065	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Review and revise letter to contract sellers cattle regarding settlement or assignment
B002	13239083	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding "to do" items and telephone J. Knauer regarding proposal to assume and assign buyer contracts
B002	13245197	1/25/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Telephone call with D. Caruso regarding turnover motion on Global and intersection with US Attorney seizures
B002	13245217	1/25/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.40	\$ 518.00	Conference telephone call related to contracts and other matters to recover assets
B002	13243855	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	Draft response to M. McGill (attorney for Heine) and e-mails to and from E. Lynch, M. McGill and J. Knauer; finalize and send to M. McGill
B002	13243861	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails to and from E. Lynch regarding possible "assignment" of buy contracts to forward contract buyers
B002	13243864	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Review and revise draft assumption and assignment of buy contacts
B002	13245161	1/26/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$ 481.00	Telephone call with A. Fast at USDA regarding enforcement actions against ELC and review complaint sent; search registered entity database for registrations of Gibson entities
B002	13245163	1/26/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Continue conforming contract letters to sellers for delivery
B002	13245175	1/26/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Discuss seizure/forfeiture law and bankruptcy in preparation for meeting with U.S. Attorney
B002	13246440	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Review and revise form of assumption and assignment agreement regarding buy contract and e-mails J. Knauer et al.
B002	13247602	1/27/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	Meeting with U.S. Attorney and J. Knauer and D. Caruso regarding seizure of estate property by U.S. Attorney pursuant to post-petition warrants
B002	13263072	1/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Follow-up on further forfeiture and seizures; telephone call with client
B002	13263097	1/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Attend to new e-mails on certain specific transactions related to redirected payments of monies owed to ELC
B002	13251715	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails McGill regarding agreement with Heine
B002	13256282	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	E-mails McGill regarding Heine deal
B002	13256288	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	Review revised Heine term agreement
B002	13256299	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$ 880.00	Preparation for and meeting with J. Knauer, E. Lynch et al. regarding ELC buy contracts, Cattlemen's, and various other issues
B002	13266971	2/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Conference call on assets and letters to accounts
B002	13270253	2/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Revise letter to contract parties and compare to other communications
B002	13258476	2/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Review and revise letter to contract buyers of cattle and e-mail J. Knauer et al.
B002	13258489	2/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails J. Knauer, H. Schuyler; review materials; conference with P. Moffit regarding mailing letters to contract sellers of cattle
B002	13258503	2/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$ 715.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, E. Lynch, et al. regarding contract claims, Heine, Cattlemen's, U.S. Attorney seizure and other issues
B002	13264224	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	E-mails to McGill (Heine's counsel) and J. Knauer regarding closing Heine \$94K deal
B002	13264235	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Review documents regarding Nu Technology Torrington and other transactions
B002	13270043	2/3/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Telephone call with J. Hanlon regarding challenge to bank account seizure
B002	13270049	2/3/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding potential actions against large parties to maximize recoveries
B002	13272130	2/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Communications related to asset forfeiture and warrants with US attorney and counsel for Your Community Bank
B002	13272132	2/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Conference telephone call with client regarding open matters on attorney recovery
B002	13270438	2/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	Review e-mails to and from J. Knauer et al. and other information regarding various issues regarding ELC open buy and sell contracts including Nu Technology and Tarkington
B002	13280331	2/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Telephone call with D. Caruso regarding asset forfeiture warrants and further meeting with US Attorney
B002	13280347	2/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$ 703.00	Continue review and revisions to demand letter to account debtors and finalize for sending
B002	13275891	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	E-mails J. Knauer, M. McGill et al. regarding Heine payment of \$94K and documents regarding A/R from Heine of \$236
B002	13275898	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails J. Knauer et al. regarding communications regarding Supreme and claims to ELC contracts
B002	13280377	2/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$ 1,110.00	Meeting with Superior Livestock Co. on contracts and cattle
B002	13280380	2/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Review Superior documents to prepare for meeting on assigned contracts
B002	13285132	2/9/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Telephone call with people from Cattle Co. regarding letter that reject contracts
B002	13285139	2/9/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding Superior "assigned" contracts that are on the open contract list
B002	13285143	2/9/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Confirm with E. Lynch regarding ELC having no interest in cattle at Kuner feedlot identified by D. LeBas
B002	13292415	2/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Conference telephone call with J. Knauer and J. Carr regarding Superior and SOLM assignment of contracts
B002	13292417	2/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Revise letter to Superior "assigned" contract parties
B002	13287202	2/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Draft contract termination and settlement agreements for BACA and Donica
B002	13292373	2/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.00	\$ 1,480.00	Go through all open items and create action updates and work plans for issues
B002	13295319	2/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Coordinate with U.S. Attorney's office for further meeting on assets seized
B002	13295322	2/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Attention to various account receivables and collection efforts
B002	13295370	2/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Review updates, notes on assets, and other matters from DSI and trustee regarding asset recovery and update action items
B002	13295000	2/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Review documents regarding Thompson Hine and Garrett P.N.
B002	13295375	2/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$ 555.00	Conference telephone call on open matters and asset recovery
B002	13295384	2/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Review correspondence on settle of First Bank Stay Relief and request for yard sheets for verification
B002	13295397	2/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Begin review of Your Community Bank document production
B002	13301052	2/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Revise agreement with Superior and follow-up on drafting due from C. Bowles

B002	13301057	2/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Conference regarding lawsuits to be filed on receivable accounts
B002	13306412	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Telephone call with counsel for heritage regarding settlement of AR/setoffs
B002	13306504	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Review documents and further conference telephone call on Heritage Feeders Receivable Account with counsel for Heritage and send same 9019 motion
B002	13306509	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Review stay relief motion (Gibson-Peoples Bank)
B002	13306526	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding open account receivables
B002	13306532	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Telephone call with W. Ponader regarding blending budgets of legal, consulting, and trustee
B002	13306424	2/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Begin adversary proceeding action against Nu Technologies
B002	13306450	2/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Update all action items for asset collection
B002	13306455	2/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Respond to Superior's proposed motion regarding collection of payables on "assigned" contracts
B002	13306461	2/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Review C&M cattle receivables and propose action to collect
B002	13307661	2/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Review e-mail from Newbern (attorney) related to stay violation in trying to collect accounts (Hermann) owed to ELC
B002	13307970	2/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Confer for filing objection to exemptions in Gibson bankruptcy
B002	13307981	2/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Draft and send letter to Newbern attorney advising of stay violation regarding attempt to direct collection of certain accounts receivable to Eastern (Hermann, Miller)
B002	13310690	2/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding open action items and strategies for collection
B002	13310700	2/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$ 703.00	Draft 4 release/terminations of contract and payment of receivables (Varner, McCarey-Denny, Courtney, Donica)
B002	13310719	2/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Review, respond and update collection of assets status and actions to initiate
B002	13315669	2/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.50	\$ 925.00	Meeting with DSI in New Albany to review open action items for collection
B002	13315678	2/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Follow-up on Superior agreement and collection of accounts with C. Bowles
B002	13315683	2/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Follow-up on deadlines in Gibson case on exemptions /dischargeability
B002	13315692	2/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Telephone call with client and J. Carr regarding open items and financing and review new responses from persons owing ELC on accounts
B002	13315724	2/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Address communications regarding Eastern Cattle Co. and asset recovery
B002	13320004	2/25/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Review Superior Auction issues and other open collection issues
B002	13328663	2/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Telephone call with counsel for JVCO, LLC (A. Benton) regarding demand for payment and the fact that Superior and others were paid based on asserted assignments
B002	13328697	2/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Attend to various e-mails, telephone calls related to assets-receivable collections, life insurance, etc.
B002	13328711	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Review responses of Glen Cattle and Perschbacker to demands for payment
B002	13328719	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.80	\$ 1,036.00	Telephone call with US Attorney's office regarding seized assets and cooperation regarding claims ; conference with J. Carr regarding strategic options
B002	13328726	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Review joinder to Trustee's objection (Peoples) in Gibson bankruptcy
B002	13328730	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles on Superior's claims and review and revise motion and letters regarding same (B. Stanley)
B002	13328739	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Review information on new open accounts receivable and discuss collection (Nu Technologies, Nuckols, etc.)
B002	13336724	3/2/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.20	\$ 1,184.00	Meeting with DSI regarding open accounts receivable and collection and resolution of disputes
B002	13336727	3/2/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$ 555.00	Strategy discussion regarding cattle auction houses and assigned contracts
B002	13336729	3/2/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$ 1,110.00	Meeting with AgriBeef representatives and counsel regarding assigned contracts
B002	13338172	3/3/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.40	\$ 888.00	Meeting with Trustee and DSI regarding open collection issues
B002	13342899	3/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$ 37.00	Discuss bond claim protocols issues with D. DeNeal
B002	13344732	3/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Call with C. Bowles regarding superior matter and follow-up with Stanley
B002	13350547	3/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Response to conference with Carr/St Stanley regarding Superior statement
B002	13350548	3/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.10	\$ 777.00	Review and revise Superior motion, letter agreement, and letters to contract cattle sellers
B002	13351313	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	E-mail to lits regarding law of interference of contracts/business relations and conversation with R. Stanley
B002	13349155	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mails from T. Hall regarding modifications to joint motion pertaining to deputies contracts (Superior) and letters to account parties regarding same
B002	13354039	3/9/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Call with J. Hanlon and W. Ponader regarding preparation for call with U.S. attorney on seizure
B002	13354048	3/9/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Finalize revisions to superior agreements on open contracts and send to C. Bowles and J. Carr
B002	13360920	3/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Continue follow-up on Superior's contracts
B002	13358171	3/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh regarding draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B002	13357867	3/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Review and respond to numerous e-mails regarding asset recoveries
B002	13363644	3/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Telephone call with S. Porterfield (counsel for cattle seller) regarding claims process and Texas interpleader
B002	13363662	3/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Update action list of open items for collecting assets in preparation for update telephone call
B002	13363665	3/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Finalize Superior motion and form of letter
B002	13417923	3/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Further follow-up on Heritage Feeders settlement proposal
B002	13418005	3/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.40	\$ 888.00	Strategy telephone call on asset recovery and follow-up on issues raised
B002	13418007	3/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Review and revise documents received on Superior motion and letters

B002	13418008	3/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Telephone call related to Joplin and issues raised on contract assignments (C. Bowles)
B002	13370754	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone call from J. Huffaker regarding draft Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B002	13370755	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Review and analyze revised draft of Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B002	13370771	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Telephone calls with J. Massouh and R. LaTour regarding revised draft of Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B002	13370778	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	E-mail to J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding revised draft of Cattlemen's confidentiality agreement
B002	13369178	3/16/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	106.50	Work on Baca settlement motion; review communicate regarding Abilene Foods
B002	13376740	3/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Review settlement motion and documents regarding Heritage Feeders
B002	13376763	3/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$	222.00	Telephone call with D. Caruso regarding cattle being sold, amounts owed and asset seizure funds
B002	13376765	3/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Attend to open issues on "assigned contracts" regarding Superior/Joplin and others
B002	13379392	3/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Review and revise motion to extend time to object to exemptions (Gibson case)
B002	13379368	3/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Telephone call with DSI regarding Superior's list of open accounts
B002	13379403	3/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$	740.00	Strategy meeting on recovery of assets
B002	13379427	3/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$	481.00	Attend to numerous e-mails regarding open account receivable matters
B002	13379429	3/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Review motion regarding Heritage Feeders for settlement
B002	13383808	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Review settlement motion with Heritage Feeders and send to trustee for approval
B002	13383811	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Review settlement motion with BACA and revise same
B002	13383812	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Begin review of Atkinson litigation to collect receivables
B002	13383814	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Telephone call with S. Newsom regarding Cactus/Nichols action and review pleadings to potentially seek enforcement of stay against Nichols
B002	13383820	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Telephone call with DSI regarding SOLM and review documents sent regarding SOLM settlement
B002	13387590	3/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Review and revise settlements for payment receipts and investigate new account amounts
B002	13387606	3/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.80	\$	666.00	Work on Superior litigation matter
B002	13397163	3/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding Superior type transactions and recovery of payments
B002	13397168	3/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Review transaction explanation of Heritage and MMB Livestock and telephone call with E. Lynch
B002	13397180	3/24/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Review e-mails, assertions, open issues regarding Eastern cattle and sales by Cactus Feeders
B002	13389901	3/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mails regarding cattle sale and T. Gibson agreement to allow the sale
B002	13417950	3/25/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Address issue related to monies received from BACA that includes broad release
B002	13397135	3/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Telephone calls with L. Lynch regarding Freeman cattle sales; draft escrow agreement
B002	13397140	3/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Telephone call with A. Sullivan, U.S. Attorney's Office, regarding turnover of Gibson funds
B002	13397149	3/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Telephone call to Superior counsel regarding filing motion
B002	13403863	3/30/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$	481.00	Continue to attend to various e-mails and open matters on account collection and asset recovery
B002	13411723	4/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Attend to open issues on Superior dispute
B002	13411728	4/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$	222.00	Telephone call with J. Lovell regarding Cactus/Nichols dispute and potential 2004 exam
B002	13418343	4/5/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$	592.00	Meeting with Superior and with First Bank counsel on contracts and cattle
B002	13420490	4/6/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Attend to receivable collection and settlement motions
B002	13424963	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Telephone call from J. Huffaker regarding Okie Farms
B002	13428071	4/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$	1,110.00	Meet and discuss with client litigation strategy and receivable collection
B002	13429105	4/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	E-mail regarding tax issues Okie
B002	13430719	4/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$	222.00	Telephone calls with C. Bowles and M. Shaiken regarding Superior
B002	13430834	4/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$	703.00	Numerous e-mails and telephone calls related to cattle at Friona that superior claims and wants payment to it rather than escrow in disputed amounts and send issue e-mail
B002	13439546	4/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Telephone calls with C. Bowles regarding agreed order on receivables and review changes
B002	13435989	4/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$	481.00	Telephone call to C. Bowles regarding Superior; discussions with J. Carr and J. Jaffe
B002	13450296	4/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Respond to e-mail regarding asset forfeiture complaint and seizure
B002	13450303	4/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.70	\$	629.00	Conference call with trustee and bank counsel regarding asset forfeiture and Superior issues
B002	13450316	4/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Follow-up with US Attorney and Your Community Bank regarding asset seizure of account and review complaint
B002	13451698	4/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.50	\$	825.00	Conference telephone call R. LaTour, J. Knauer, and T. Hall regarding Superior and US Attorney and Your Community Bank seizure complaint
B002	13451717	4/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Review seizure complaint and conference with T. Hall
B002	13456699	4/20/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$	296.00	Review and revise settlement draft by DeNeal of ELC/Hoodenpyle
B002	13456599	4/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Further discussions related to Superior and potential agreement on open accounts with Superior, DSI and Trustee
B002	13456730	4/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Telephone call with DSI regarding invoicing on open accounts that have been discovered
B002	13461137	4/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Conference with E. Lewis regarding seizure complaint and response
B002	13461139	4/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$	259.00	Telephone call with Superior lawyers regarding Friona and send further explanation to client
B002	13459851	4/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Research ownership of and equity in "Moore Farm"; begin drafting motion to sell free and clear of liens



B002	13466365	4/25/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.00	\$ 1,480.00	Conference meeting with client, litigation team and DSI on litigation filings and strategy
B002	13462962	4/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Draft motion to assign interest in real estate contract to C. Schumann
B002	13474051	4/26/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Communications with Superior and Heritage regarding resolution of certain matters
B002	13468562	4/26/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$ 318.50	Revise motion to assign interest in land installment contract to Schuchmann and proposed order thereon
B002	13468571	4/26/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Calls with Gibson trustee counsel regarding stay relief motion filed by Pickett County and research legal description of property to match with appraisal
B002	13484479	4/29/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles regarding Superior and agreement letter
B002	13484503	4/29/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Conference regarding Superior and outcome of conversations with Seals and his lawyer
B002	13476515	4/29/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Revise and finalize motion and order to sell interest in land sale contract to Schuchmann
B003	13230399	12/27/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.30	\$ 123.00	Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding miscellaneous potential tasks
B003	13230415	12/27/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.20	\$ 82.00	Correspondence with J. Carr and D. DeNeal regarding same
B003	13178620	12/28/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 350.00	Conference telephone call with Chapter 11 Trustee (Knauer)
B003	13186349	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 140.00	Respond to e-mail regarding employment of DSI and payment of claims between petition date and order for relief and research regarding same
B003	13186351	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$ 35.00	(NC) Conference call with B. Stanley, E. Lynch, J. Knauer regarding litigation and discovery parameters
B003	13186352	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 700.00	Review and revise motion to authorize sale procedures
B003	13186353	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 700.00	Draft and file motion for authority to settle forward purchase contracts
B003	13186354	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 420.00	Coordinate with client and DSI regarding employment and affidavit
B003	13186357	12/30/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 700.00	Conference with Trustee, DSI, R. Stanley, H. Mappes regarding potential fraud and asset recovery and case/litigation strategy
B003	13186873	12/31/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 280.00	Continue draft of motion to set aside sale proceeds
B003	13193465	1/3/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$ 1,110.00	Telephone call with Trustee regarding status and strategy in case (2.0); review and revise motions for sale of cattle and establishment of trust for potential lien and PSA claims (1.0)
B003	13196957	1/5/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$ 1,110.00	Review and revise motions to complete prior cattle sales and establish procedures for selling cattle inventory and conference with J. Carr regarding same
B003	13206669	1/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$ 222.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding status of actions and negotiation on cash use Meetings with T. E. Hall and K. Britton regarding additional background on case; nature of preliminary preference review, status of obtaining needed information, cash use issues
B003	13206952	1/10/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.40	\$ 581.00	(1.0); review proposed engagements to prepare Cash Use Motion and Order
B003	13222920	1/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$ 555.00	Meeting with E. Lynch regarding outstanding accounts and other matters for resolution
B003	13246460	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding conversation with Fast of USDA regarding ELC license issues Participate in "all-hands" status conference call with Trustee regarding review of work, issues, actions (2.0); begin research regarding accord and satisfaction issue, pass research to J.
B003	13271227	2/4/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.80	\$ 1,162.00	Pearcy for completion; review cases identified by J. Pearcy (.8)
B003	13278418	2/7/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.80	\$ 747.00	Further work regarding accord and satisfaction question
B003	13275889	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Review and revise T. Hall draft letter to account debtors
B003	13278435	2/8/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.10	\$ 871.50	Complete accord and satisfaction memo
B003	13294949	2/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Review e-mail from J. Todd regarding SOLM, review SOLM documents, telephone call Todd and e-mail Todd and his partner regarding SOLM partial settlement
B003	13330261	3/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$ 220.50	Draft form letter seeking payment on completed cattle sold and explaining protections of order
B003	13365804	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail from D. Donnellon regarding request for information on sources of Trustee collections
B003	13365810	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch forwarding D. Donnellon's request for information on sources of Trustee's collections
B003	13372859	3/16/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.50	\$ 622.50	Participate in Fee professional call
B003	13372215	3/17/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$ 171.50	Research use of forensic data expert to recover information from hard drives
B003	13381765	3/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Draft Trustee's Purchase Money Claim Report
B003	13420480	4/6/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.20	\$ 1,184.00	Meeting with J. Bosco regarding status of collections; actions; open issues (Carr, Knauer, DSI in attendance)
B003	13421812	4/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.70	\$ 935.00	Meeting with J. Bosco (Fifth Third), J. Knauer et al. regarding status and strategy including purchase of Farris 100 head
B003	13421816	4/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding status and strategy litigation matters
B003	13427662	4/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Draft text for letter to send to J. Ferris
B003	13427668	4/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.80	\$ 686.00	Participate in conference call with counsel for Northern Livestock Video Auction and research time at which Fifth Third's lien attached to specific cattle at issue
B003	13439530	4/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	Strategy call on litigation matters and follow-up specifically on Superior
B003	13434451	4/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$ 1,045.00	Meeting with J. Knauer et al. regarding S. Gibson/Royal Beef checks (.5), Superior/Friona 302 head of cattle (1.0), Okie sale (.4)
B003	13434461	4/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Telephone call LaTour regarding Okie and Superior/Friona
B003	13432365	4/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Participate in strategy call regarding Superior, proofs of claim, account receivable collections, Scott Gibson/Royal Beef dispute and Friona
B004	13185905	12/27/2010	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.40	\$ 80.00	Voicemail and e-mail messages with J. Carr (.2); review docket regarding Eastern Livestock bankruptcy following e-mail messages from D. DeNeal and H. Mappes (.2)
B004	13178451	12/27/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.50	\$ 787.50	Conference with H. Mappes, R. Stanley and telephone call J. Knauer regarding status and strategy Obtain pleadings for T. Hall (.4); meeting with J. Carr, T. Hall, H. Mappes and D. DeNeal (.9); consultation with T. Hall, H. Mappes and D. DeNeal regarding next steps (.3); obtain additional pleadings (.9); obtain dockets and pleadings from related cases (.5); draft appearances for T. Hall regarding related cases (.5)
B004	13185913	12/28/2010	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.50	\$ 700.00	
B004	13178619	12/28/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 105.00	Review and revise appearances regarding related Chapter 11 cases



B004	13178562	12/28/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.80	\$ 945.00	Conference with T. Hall and conference telephone call with J. Knauer et al. regarding status and strategy
							Draft notices of bankruptcy regarding interpleader actions and prepare subfiles for same (1.8); revise appearances (.2); create master status spreadsheet regarding Eastern Livestock's case following review of docket (1.0); status teleconference with J. Carr, T. Hall and D. DeNeal (1.7); create master status spreadsheet regarding Thomas Gibson's case following review of docket (.6); create master status spreadsheet regarding East-West Trucking's case following review of docket (.6); internet search for Court addresses regarding
B004	13187918	12/29/2010	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	6.70	\$ 1,340.00	notices of bankruptcy to be filed in various jurisdictions (.4); revise notices following consultation with T. Hall (.4)
B004	13178567	12/29/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$ 997.50	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding pleadings, e-mails and conference telephone call J. Knauer et al. regarding status and strategy
							Prepare copies of documents and working file for J. Carr (1.9); consultation with P. Moffit regarding same and service issues (.2); scan signature page and revise/finalize T. Hall's affidavit (.4); begin drafting task code memos (.2); update document library (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file appearances for T. Hall in two related cases (.4); set up calendar and worksites regarding three cases (.7); revise/finalize notices of bankruptcy and prepare file and service copies of same (1.1); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve emergency motion to settle contracts following consultation with T. Hall (.4); draft motion/order for emergency hearing (.4); update master status spreadsheet (.2); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve application to employ DSI (.4)
B004	13187978	12/30/2010	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	5.40	\$ 1,080.00	electronically file and serve application to employ DSI (.4)
B004	13186642	1/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Research statutory trust created by Packers and Stockyards Act and effect on bankruptcy estate
B004	13186665	1/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.10	\$ 269.50	Research and draft insert for contract settlement motion on authorization to settle a class of controversies
B004	13186671	1/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$ 367.50	Research claims procedures under PSA in bankruptcy
B004	13194546	1/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$ 715.00	Review background documents including various pleadings
B004	13187706	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Review pleadings in case and related bankruptcies and assist with scheduling deadlines
B004	13187754	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	4.00	\$ 980.00	Research Packers and Stockyards and affect of statutory trust created for benefit of suppliers
							Work on updating calendar concerning upcoming hearing dates and objection deadlines (.7); draft motion/order to extend time to file schedules and statement of financial affairs (.9); meeting with J. Carr, T. Hall, D. DeNeal, H. Mappes, B. Stanley and J. Knauer (1.8); draft/revise notice of telephonic hearing and forward to K. Goss following consultation with T. Hall (.5); scan documents into document library (.2); begin performing business entity searches (.8); import contact information (.2); finalize, electronically file and serve notice of telephonic hearing (.2); e-mail K. Goss concerning dial-in information (.1); update master status spreadsheets and calendars (.8)
B004	13195206	1/3/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	6.20	\$ 1,302.00	telephonic hearing (.2); e-mail K. Goss concerning dial-in information (.1); update master status spreadsheets and calendars (.8)
B004	13194549	1/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$ 880.00	Review background documents and pleadings
B004	13194554	1/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.80	\$ 990.00	Conference with team regarding status and strategy
							Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding status and strategy including emergency motion regarding settlement executory contracts regarding sale of cattle and meeting on January 4, 2011
B004	13194566	1/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.10	\$ 605.00	2011
B004	13194568	1/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding January 4 meeting
B004	13191513	1/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$ 367.50	Strategy meeting and call with Trustee
							Meet with E. Lynch and C. Pierce of Development Specialists, Inc. and set up work space (.7); update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendars (.5); revise, finalize and distribute task code memos (.5); create list of UCC searches (.2); work on organizational chart (.4); e-mail messages with C. Pierce regarding copies of checks (.1); meeting with J. Carr, T. Hall, B. Stanley, H. Mappes, J. Knauer and E. Lynch (1.0); status consultation with T. Hall (.2); perform numerous business entity and individual searches on Kentucky Secretary of State's website and create spreadsheet summarizing connections (2.9)
B004	13195355	1/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	6.50	\$ 1,365.00	State's website and create spreadsheet summarizing connections (2.9)
B004	13193497	1/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Participate in telephonic hearing on authority to settle contracts
B004	13194578	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with J. Knauer regarding status and strategy telephonic hearing regarding motion to settle executory contracts regarding purchase of cattle, other matters
B004	13194586	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	Participate in telephonic hearing regarding motion to settle executory contracts
B004	13194587	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Telephone call various creditors/contract counter party counsel
B004	13194590	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	4.70	\$ 2,585.00	Conference with J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding status and strategy regarding various matters
B004	13194599	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.80	\$ 990.00	Telephone calls representatives Fifth Third and Wells Fargo regarding conduct of case and funding of administrative expenses
B004	13194683	1/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Revise motion to extend time to file schedules and statement
B004	13191247	1/4/2011	16227 Nansen, Olianamailevanu L.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$ 52.50	Research Pacer regarding motion for order authorizing trustee to settle a class of contracts; upload proposed order for same; e-mails and telephone conference regarding same
							Consultation with C. Pierce and A. Omari (.1); revise entity chart (.1); create list of UCC searches to perform (.1); consultations with A. Omari regarding schedules and statement of financial affairs (.5); import and begin working on schedules and statement of financial affairs (3.6); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.9); import pleadings from T. Gibson case (.7); import pleadings from East-West Trucking case (.7)
B004	13200313	1/5/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	6.70	\$ 1,407.00	Gibson case (.7); import pleadings from East-West Trucking case (.7)
B004	13196775	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.60	\$ 1,430.00	review documents; draft proposal to Fifth Third regarding course of action and funding; e-mail J. Knauer et al.
B004	13196779	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding various matters
							Look up additional entity names on Secretary of State websites and update chart (.4); teleconference with J. Carr, T. Hall, D. DeNeal, H. Mappes, J. Knauer, E. Lynch, P. O'Malley and C. Pierce (1.0); meeting with A. Omari (.7); continue working on schedules and statement of financial affairs (.7); draft motions for emergency hearings following telephone call from D. DeNeal (.9); revise, finalize and electronically file motion to extend time to file schedules (.4); revise, finalize and electronically file two emergency motions and two motions for expedited hearing (.8); consultation with K. Goss regarding expedited hearing date (.1); draft hearing notices (.4); revise, finalize and electronically file hearing notices (.2); draft appearances for J. Carr and T. Hall (.3); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.5)
B004	13201341	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	6.40	\$ 1,344.00	appearances for J. Carr and T. Hall (.3); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.5)

B004	13199566	1/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$ 715.00	Conference telephone call with J. Knauer et al. regarding memorandum regarding course of action and Fifth Third funding
B004	13199582	1/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.20	\$ 660.00	Revise memorandum regarding actions and funding and e-mail R. LaTour
B004	13199609	1/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding conversation with C. Bowles and other status and strategy
B004	13199203	1/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.40	\$ 343.00	Strategy call to discuss various issues
B004	13199273	1/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Draft motions for emergency hearings
							Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendars (1.2); review local rules regarding employment applications and e-mail K. Goss regarding same (.2); obtain creditor matrix (.1); prepare hearing files for T. Hall (.7); begin working on creditor list following voicemail and e-mail messages (.2); revise, finalize and electronically file appearances following consultation with D. DeNeal (.3); perform UCC searches on Indiana Secretary of State's website and print/organize results and begin creating search results matrix (1.2);
B004	13201346	1/7/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	5.00	\$ 1,050.00	revise, finalize and electronically file objections following consultations with T. Hall (.9); create case summary chart (.2)
B004	13202534	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$ 715.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding memorandum regarding course of action and funding
B004	13202536	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$ 880.00	Revise memorandum
B004	13202540	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	E-mails J. Knauer et al.
B004	13202546	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Conference with D. DeNeal and T. Hall regarding Cattleman motion for relief from stay and review and e-mail subpoena to Fifth Third regarding checks
B004	13201971	1/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Strategy meeting with J. Carr and T. Hall
B004	13202234	1/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Read and research supplements to stay relief motions
							Continue updating UCC search results matrix (.8); telephone calls with T. Hall and K. Goss regarding hearing (.2); draft agenda (.7); set up auto-forward rules regarding notices of electronic filing following telephone call from W. Ponader (.3); update chart following internet search regarding additional business entity names (.6); scan and import file-marked copies of notices of bankruptcy (.3); update calendar (.3); update hearing files (.1); update master status spreadsheet, service list and agenda following review of recently filed
B004	13207918	1/10/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.30	\$ 903.00	pleadings (1.0)
B004	13205436	1/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails D. DeNeal, T. Hall et al. regarding conference telephone call with Fifth Third regarding funding and stay relief motions
B004	13204656	1/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Draft motion for turnover and injunction
B004	13204657	1/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Draft proposed order granting turnover/injunction motion
B004	13204658	1/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$ 73.50	Draft correspondence to creditor constituencies regarding payments to Trustee
B004	13204659	1/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.80	\$ 441.00	Research and review cases and support cited by Friona, Cactus Growers, et al. in support of their stay relief motions and in response for Trustee's pleadings
B004	13204661	1/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Negotiate and draft stipulation resolving Republic Bank stay relief motion
							Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and agenda following review of recently filed pleadings (1.2); revise, finalize and electronically file agenda following consultation with D. DeNeal (.4); telephone calls with T. Hall and K. Goss regarding hearing issues (.2); e-mail messages with K. Goss regarding Judge's appearance at hearing following consultation with J. Carr (.1); update hearing date chart and calendar (.1); organize files (.3); perform additional business entity searches, update summary chart and distribute to team (.9); update hearing files (.1); e-mail messages with H. Schuyler and H. Mappes concerning dockets (.2); forward employment application pleadings to W. Ponader and D. Foster
B004	13217070	1/11/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.00	\$ 840.00	(.1); create list of agenda items regarding East-West Trucking case (.4)
B004	13209132	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Conference with D. DeNeal and T.Hall regarding status and January 12 hearings
B004	13209142	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	Telephone calls J. Knauer regarding status and January 12 hearings and request by Wells Fargo for conference
B004	13209172	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Conference telephone call with Wells Fargo and counsel regarding forensic accounting and other issues
B004	13209175	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$ 1,045.00	conference with J. Knauer regarding special counsel and memorandum and work on response regarding objection to retention B&D
B004	13208514	1/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	5.00	\$ 1,225.00	Research and prepare for hearings set for January 12th on five stay relief motions and Trustee's sale motions
B004	13208528	1/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$ 367.50	Draft motion for turnovers of information and to enjoin transfers of assets
B004	13221901	1/12/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.40	\$ 84.00	Revise, finalize and electronically file amended agenda following consultation with D. DeNeal (.2); update master status spreadsheet (.2)
B004	13212575	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding hearing regarding motions for relief from stay and Trustee motions regarding sale of cattle and resolution accounts receivable
B004	13211717	1/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Draft demand letter to GIPSA regarding PSA claims
B004	13211725	1/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.40	\$ 588.00	Assist with preparations for stay relief and sale procedure hearings
							Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendars following review of recently filed pleadings (1.1); update hearing date chart (.1); revise response (.4); draft agenda (.5);
B004	13223942	1/13/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.20	\$ 462.00	e-mail messages with D. DeNeal regarding calendar dates (.1)
B004	13220177	1/13/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.60	\$ 255.00	Communication with J. Carr and prepare for working group meeting
B004	13215001	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$ 495.00	Review pleadings and documents, preparation agenda for all-hands meeting
B004	13215011	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.30	\$ 1,265.00	Meeting with J. Knauer et al. regarding course of action
B004	13217110	1/13/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Strategy meeting regarding outstanding issues and litigation going forward
							Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.6); e-mail messages with P. Moffit regarding transcript (.1); draft, finalize and electronically file
B004	13223979	1/14/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.00	\$ 210.00	appearances for R. Stanley (.3)
B004	13222924	1/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	Review and revise draft orders for Trustee motions and review orders proposed by Friona
B004	13224128	1/14/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.30	\$ 127.50	Telephone call with J. Carr regarding status and open issues
B004	13220087	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Conference telephone call R. LaTour and litigation regarding protective order; review protective order and conference with R. Stanley and e-mail

B004	13220090	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding Friona documents
B004	13220093	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	E-mails J. Knauer, J. Carr III, E. Lynch regarding various issues
B004	13219246	1/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research priority of agister liens with respect to prior perfected blanket liens
B004	13224636	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$	306.00	Review various pleadings from bankruptcy case and Texas district court intervenor case
B004	13224637	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.60	\$	544.00	Meet with J. Carr and others to discuss upcoming tasks and strategies
B004	13222885	1/17/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research Gibson's ability to obtain a discharge if he invokes the Fifth Amendment and steps needed to object to discharge
B004	13228007	1/18/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Telephone conference with assistant for attorney in Kansas state interpleador case concerning pleadings
B004	13226853	1/18/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.00	\$	210.00	Update master status spreadsheets and service lists following review of recently filed pleadings (.6); revise Hoover Hull employment pleadings (.3); e-mail messages with D. DeNeal and H. Schuyler regarding contracts (.1)
B004	13226954	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen exam proposed order regarding partial relief from stay
B004	13226971	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Conference telephone call counsel for Cattlemen and Fifth Third regarding order and January 20 exam
B004	13226985	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Conference with R. Stanley and T. Hall regarding Cattlemen and DSI representative demanding documents
B004	13227014	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.10	\$	605.00	Conference telephone call Bosco (Fifth Third), R. LaTour, T. Hall and J. Knauer regarding funding chapter 11 expenses, contracts to purchase cattle and possible Fifth Third financing
B004	13227025	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	Review and revise memorandum to R. LaTour regarding funding chapter 11
B004	13227028	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00	Conference with T. Hall
B004	13225828	1/18/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Begin drafting letter to account debtors
B004	13230713	1/19/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.50	\$	105.00	E-mail messages with D. DeNeal regarding court reporter following review of 341 notices (.2); update master status spreadsheets and service lists following review of recently filed pleadings (.3)
B004	13229660	1/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$	703.00	Collate comments to order; revise and send to client
B004	13229790	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.00	\$	1,100.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, E. Lynch, other DSI, T. Hall, D. DeNeal regarding various issues including work plan, Cattlemen transaction, dealing with open contracts, investigation
B004	13228470	1/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Strategy meeting to discuss collection of receivables, settling of contracts, depositions, turnover order and more
B004	13228471	1/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Revise emergency protective/turnover motion
B004	13228472	1/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Coordinate reporter for Gibson 341 meeting and review schedules
B004	13236649	1/20/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.20	\$	252.00	Update master status spreadsheet following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); create hearing files for 341 meetings regarding T. Gibson and East-West Trucking (.7); update master service list (.1); obtain subpoena form for J. Carr (.1); e-mail Connor & Associates regarding court reporter (.1)
B004	13235597	1/20/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Continue review and revisions of orders to attempt agreement with parties regarding form of order
B004	13236005	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding various issues
B004	13236013	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	E-mails E. Lynch, J. Knauer et al. regarding info regarding various issues
B004	13236018	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Draft letter to McGill, Heine's attorney
B004	13231577	1/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Research validity of purchase money security interest in a sham of disguised sale over prior perfected party in same collateral
B004	13239428	1/21/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.10	\$	231.00	Update master status spreadsheet and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4); submit request for court reporter and e-mail messages regarding same (.2); perform UCC searches on Indiana Secretary of State's website (.2); consultation with T. Hall regarding branches (.3)
B004	13235616	1/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Continue negotiation on orders for Trustee's motion
B004	13235624	1/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding 341 hearing and potential questions
B004	13236150	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.60	\$	880.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer et al. regarding various issues including Cattlemen exam, Heine and other buy contracts, Gibson and E-W 341
B004	13236157	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Gibson 341
B004	13236170	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with D. DeNeal and Hanlon regarding possible Fifth Amendment issues
B004	13236387	1/21/2011	15994 Kimmerling, Kevin M.	Associate	1.10	\$	330.00	Research 5th Amendment issues for D. DeNeal for bankruptcy hearing prep
B004	13236695	1/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$	294.00	Strategy conference call
B004	13236709	1/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	4.00	\$	980.00	Prepare for 341 meeting of Thomas and Patsy Gibson and East-West Trucking by reviewing relevant documents drafting categories of questioning, and researching effect of Fifth Amendment on discharge and issues relevant thereto
B004	13236884	1/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Draft outline and prepare for Gibson 341 meeting
B004	13236886	1/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Draft outline and prepare for East-West 341 meeting
B004	13245340	1/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Review and comment on 341 examination areas
B004	13236895	1/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.70	\$	416.50	Update outlines for 341 meetings and review relevant documents
B004	13236905	1/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Review documents produced by Fifth Third for transfers to Gibsons
B004	13242007	1/24/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Send follow-up e-mail to possible local counsel in Wisconsin interpleador case
B004	13243761	1/24/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.30	\$	693.00	Revise, finalize and upload orders following consultation with T. Hall (.4); e-mail messages with K. Goss regarding same (.1); begin reviewing documents produced by Fifth Third and consultations with P. Moffit and J. Johns regarding database of same (1.2); search PACER and Kentucky's District Court concerning seizure warrants (.3); telephone call to Clerk of Kentucky's District Court website concerning seizure warrants (.3); scan and electronically file amended affidavit following consultation with T. Hall (.3); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.7)

B004	13239048	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Review documents and preparation for conference telephone call with J. Bosco, R. LaTour, et al.
B004	13238160	1/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Assist with litigation aspects of budget
B004	13242058	1/25/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.60	\$	204.00	Research possible local counsel for Colorado case and telephone conference with T. McNamara regarding case and acting as local counsel
B004	13244576	1/25/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.10	\$	651.00	E-mail messages with S. Korn and H. Mappes regarding service of subpoena on Your Community Bank (.2); search document library for information regarding process server (.1); e-mail messages with D. DeNeal regarding service of bar date notice (.1); work on master service list regarding same (1.7); draft letter to Affordable Process Service (.2); telephone call from H. Mappes regarding subpoena issues (.3); update master status spreadsheets, calendars and hearing date chart (.5)
B004	13243863	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$	770.00	Telephone call J. Knauer and conference telephone call J. Knauer, E. Lynch, T. Hall regarding buy contracts, U.S. Attorney seizure and develop with D. Caruso, Fifth Third funding fees and expenses, and other issues
B004	13247539	1/26/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Attempt to contact local counsel in Texas for Texas interpleader case
B004	13247544	1/26/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Send follow-up e-mail to local counsel in Colorado case
B004	13250033	1/26/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	5.00	\$	1,050.00	Update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.3); telephone call to A. Springman regarding importing list of creditors (.1); consultation with D. DeNeal regarding filings (.1); revise response and prepare appendix for filing (.3); work on updating extensive creditor list (2.0); begin preparing bar date notice for service on global service list (.2); scan exhibits to appendix (.4); obtain copy of Packers & Stockyard Act for T. Hall (.4); e-mail E. Lynch, C. Pierce and D. DeNeal regarding service of bar date notice (.1); revise/finalize letter and file copies to H. Roudebush regarding service of subpoena on Your Community Bank (.3); e-mail H. Mappes regarding same (.1); finalize global service list for service of bar date notice (.3); review global service list to delete duplicates and note missing information (.5)
B004	13246445	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Review e-mails regarding various issues including e-mail regarding J. Knauer as trustee for USDA bond
B004	13245485	1/26/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$	157.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding Kentucky US Attorney seizure and experience in Bayou Fund case regarding side by side bankruptcy and federal restitution payment distributions
B004	13254336	1/27/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone call with B. Bass, potential local counsel for Texas interpleader case
B004	13254338	1/27/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Follow-up on e-mail from Colorado local counsel
B004	13250045	1/27/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.80	\$	798.00	Update master status spreadsheets (.3); continue updating extensive creditor list (2.2); consultation with D. DeNeal regarding supplemental objection (.1); draft certificate of service regarding bar date notice (.3); draft appendix and table of contents for D. DeNeal (.3); revise, finalize and electronically file supplemental objection and appendix (.6)
B004	13249017	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding funding proposal, US Attorney and Heine settlement
B004	13254430	1/28/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Follow-up on contact with possible local counsel for state interpleader cases
B004	13254434	1/28/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Follow-up with B. Stanley concerning plan of action in state interpleader cases
B004	13254268	1/28/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.10	\$	441.00	Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); attention to service issues regarding bar date notice (.1); consultation with D. DeNeal regarding PASA claims (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file certificate of service (.2); work on schedules and statement of financial affairs (1.5)
B004	13251721	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	E-mails regarding update call
B004	13260300	1/31/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone call with local counsel for Wisconsin case
B004	13260301	1/31/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Send follow-up e-mail to potential local counsel for Texas case
B004	13258179	1/31/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.50	\$	525.00	Update master status spreadsheets and calendars (.6); organize files (.3); status meeting with J. Carr, D. DeNeal, B. Stanley, T. Hall, J. Knauer and E. Lynch (1.1); search Oklahoma Secretary of State's website for information regarding Okie Farms (.5)
B004	13255348	1/31/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Strategy conference call
B004	13261713	2/1/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	5.00	\$	1,050.00	Work on schedules (4.0); status teleconference (J. Carr, T. Hall, D. DeNeal, J. Knauer, E. Lynch) (.8); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.2)
B004	13259897	2/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Conference call to discuss various issues and strategy
B004	13264824	2/2/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.00	\$	840.00	Attention to messages from claimants regarding purchase money claims (.2); obtain corporate documents regarding Okie Farms (.3); continue working on schedules and statement of financial affairs (3.5)
B004	13264208	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Draft agenda for February 3 call regarding various "to do" issues
B004	13264244	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	E-mails from E. Lynch et al. regarding Cattlemens and other issues
B004	13264338	2/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Review documents to be provided for Cattlemen's
B004	13264341	2/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Review depositions and 341 transcripts for relevant testimony
B004	13269702	2/3/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.80	\$	588.00	Continue working on schedules and statement of financial affairs (1.2); prepare working draft workbooks of same for T. Hall (.6); scan court reporter invoice and e-mail messages with H. Schuyler regarding same (.2); review claims to determine if claimants are listed on draft schedules (.2); e-mail A. Omari regarding status and open items (.2); update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.4)
B004	13269379	2/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	E-mails regarding Heine and various issues
B004	13266360	2/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research applicability of Packers & Stockyards statutory trust to ELC
B004	13266363	2/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$	73.50	Draft correspondence to creditors seeking information
B004	13266365	2/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Review schedules and SOFA

B004	13276022	2/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.60	\$ 756.00	Status teleconference with J. Carr, T. Hall, B. Stanley, D. DeNeal and J. Knauer (1.3); set up auto-forward of calendar reminders and prepare report for H. Schuyler (.5); update hearing date chart (.4); search Kentucky Secretary of State's website for corporate information on additional entities and e-mail D. DeNeal regarding same (.4); consultation with T. Hall regarding budget issue and e-mail K. Mitchell regarding same (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file joinder (.4); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.5)
B004	13270458	2/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.70	\$ 935.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, DSI et al. regarding various issues including open sale and buy contracts, settlement proposals Nu Technology, Tarkington et al.; Cattleman's; Friona; U.S. Attorney W.D. Kentucky; research regarding rights of unpaid sellers and their PSA claims; motions filed in Gibson case for relief from stay and abandonment
B004	13270226	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.60	\$ 392.00	Strategy conference call
B004	13270240	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$ 490.00	Research and draft memo on applicability of PASA trust to ELC
B004	13270317	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$ 73.50	Draft letter to D. Domina
B004	13270324	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Draft joinder to Gibson trustee's objection to motion to compel abandonment of membership interests
B004	13284148	2/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Follow-up with local counsel in Wisconsin case involving engagement letter
B004	13278227	2/7/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.70	\$ 357.00	Update master status spreadsheets, calendars and hearing date chart (.8); prepare hearing file (.3); e-mail messages with K. Goss regarding order upload (.1); draft, finalize and electronically file appearances for D. DeNeal in three cases (.5)
B004	13282985	2/8/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.30	\$ 693.00	Obtain copy of Fifth Third's proof of claim for W. Ponader (.1); download/import all proofs of claim (.6); prepare hearing files regarding Eastern Livestock and East-West Trucking hearing (.1)
B004	13280389	2/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Telephone call with Court regarding procedural issues on Friday's hearings as to time set for evidence, etc.
B004	13277499	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding Cattleman's
B004	13284270	2/9/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Call and message to potential local counsel in Texas matter
B004	13284439	2/9/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.90	\$ 399.00	Finalize hearing files (.3); telephone call to Court regarding telephonic hearing (.1); status e-mail messages with A. Omari (.1); import proofs of claim (.1); draft notice of telephonic hearing following e-mail message from K. Goss (.2); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve motion to pay receiver following e-mail message from T. Hall (.7); update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4)
B004	13286494	2/9/2011	13062 Fleming, John F.W.	Associate	0.60	\$ 195.00	Discuss lien review summary with W. Ponader; search database for samples
B004	13280575	2/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.80	\$ 441.00	Conference call to discuss Friday's hearings, DIP financing pleadings and status of collections
B004	13280582	2/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Review revised documents related to Cattleman's and replacement of previously produced documents
B004	13280589	2/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Participate in hearing on motion to compel abandonment of membership interests in Gibson case
B004	13284373	2/10/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Telephone conference with R. Cox (counsel in Texas)
B004	13285808	2/10/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.50	\$ 525.00	E-mail messages with C. Wharton regarding additional extension of time to file schedules (.1); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve extension motion (.5); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve agenda (.4); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.5); update calendars (.2); prepare check requests (.1); telephone call and e-mail messages from W. Ponader regarding cash collateral motion (.2); organize files (.3); prepare for all creditor notice (.2)
B004	13292362	2/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	Review and comment on Statement of Financial Affairs and Schedules prepared by DSI
B004	13290543	2/11/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.30	\$ 903.00	Attention to service of notice on all creditors (.4); draft, finalize and electronically file certificate of service (.4); update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.2); revise cash collateral motion and order (.4); telephone call to W. Ponader regarding service issues (.4); continue working on schedules and statement of financial affairs (2.5)
B004	13292368	2/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.50	\$ 555.00	Prepare for and attend telephonic hearing on Texas interpleader
B004	13290505	2/11/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$ 157.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding avoidance action discovery and magnitude
B004	13301346	2/14/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.00	\$ 340.00	Review transcript from previous 341 hearing
B004	13301348	2/14/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$ 136.00	Strategize with D. DeNeal concerning upcoming continued 341 hearing
B004	13295544	2/14/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	5.20	\$ 1,092.00	Obtain bankruptcy docket regarding Superior Livestock Auction for D. DeNeal (.3); continue working on schedules and SOFA (3.8); update master status spreadsheets and calendars (.6); import proofs of claim (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file joinder following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.2); organize notes and drafts schedules (.2)
B004	13301653	2/15/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding strategy for continuation of Gibson 341 hearing
B004	13301657	2/15/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$ 238.00	Continue review of transcript from previous 341 hearing and prepare for continuation of same
B004	13301666	2/15/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Conference with B. Stanley regarding status and what information we may want to try to get from T. Gibson in continuation of 341 hearing
B004	13295535	2/15/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.20	\$ 42.00	Attention to service of order
B004	13299754	2/16/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.00	\$ 840.00	Download/import proofs of claim (.2); update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.3); draft, finalize and electronically file certificate of service (.3); update service lists (.1); prepare hearing file regarding Gibson case (.2); continue working on schedules and SOFA (1.3); work on inserting addresses to schedule of purchase contracts (1.6)
B004	13301053	2/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Continued discussion and negotiations over language of pretrial hearing order and send drafts to court
B004	13302933	2/17/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.20	\$ 882.00	Update master status spreadsheets (.2); revise, finalize and upload order following e-mail message from T. Hall (.2); work on updating addresses for sales contracts parties, including internet search (telephone, tax records, etc.) (3.7); download/import proofs of claim (.1)



B004	13301058	2/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Telephonic conference with Court; revise and upload order on Texas interpleader
B004	13302937	2/18/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.70	\$ 777.00	Update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.4); continue updating addresses for sales contracts parties, including internet search (telephone, tax records, etc.) (2.0); prepare draft schedules, statement of financial affairs, and exhibits following voicemail message from W. Ponader (.9); review Trustee information and extract monthly operating report documentation following e-mail messages with H. Schuyler (.4)
B004	13312057	2/21/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	4.50	\$ 945.00	Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.3); continue updating creditor addresses, including internet search (telephone, tax records, etc.) (4.2)
B004	13311682	2/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Review e-mail from E. Lynch concerning money owed by BMG and related issues
B004	13312108	2/22/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.30	\$ 693.00	Continue working on address list matrix to be uploaded (.8); update master status spreadsheets and service lists (.3); e-mail messages with L. Young regarding matrix issues (.1); voicemail message from and telephone call to claimant (.3); organize files (.3); scan and distribute letters received regarding contracts (.4); work on creditor verification pleading (.2); e-mail messages with S. Eyster regarding creditor list filing (.2); e-mail message to J. Brown regarding purchase money claim protocol following e-mail message from J. Carr (.3); internet search for contact information regarding Solm, Inc. (.3); e-mail messages with H. Schuyler regarding re-issuance of contract letters (.1)
B004	13321285	2/23/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.20	\$ 252.00	Update hearing date chart and calendar (.3); review Gibson docket concerning status of 341 hearing (.1); draft 3/11 agenda (.3); e-mail messages with C. Wharton and J. Knauer regarding creditor list (.1); finalize/electronically file same (.4)
B004	13312347	2/23/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	E-mail and telephone conference with W. Ponader and J. Johns regarding document review from 5/3 subpoena production
B004	13317203	2/24/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Review e-mails related to Eastern Cattle
B004	13322877	2/24/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.90	\$ 189.00	Update master status spreadsheet (.1); draft/revise motion/order for extension of time following e-mail message from T. Hall (.6); voicemail message from S. Eyster (.1); respond to claimant (.1)
B004	13315337	2/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$ 171.50	Draft motion to extend deadline to object to Gibsons' discharge
B004	13322891	2/25/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.50	\$ 105.00	Voicemail messages with R. Bryant concerning creditor matrix (.1); revise, finalize and electronically file extension motion following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.3); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
B004	13320466	2/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$ 220.50	Revise and finalize motion for extension of time to object to Gibson discharge
B004	13325713	2/28/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$ 170.00	Revise and finalize draft letters to plaintiffs' counsel in Wisconsin and Kansas actions
B004	13324207	2/28/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.70	\$ 147.00	Update master status spreadsheets, calendar and hearing date chart following review of recently filed pleadings
B004	13331441	3/1/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.10	\$ 231.00	Review dockets of three cases and update master status spreadsheets, hearing date chart and calendar (.5); revise, finalize and electronically file joinder following consultation with D. DeNeal (.1); voicemail message to C. Williams at Connor & Associates (.1); draft notice of submission regarding revised exhibit following voicemail message from W. Ponader (.3); telephone call from W. Ponader regarding draft (.1)
B004	13336120	3/2/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.00	\$ 420.00	Review recent appearances and update service list (.1); draft appearance for W. Ponader (.1); finalize notice of submission of revised exhibit (.3); finalize, electronically file and serve appearance and notice (.4); revise motion/order vacating requirement (.3); draft motion/order shortening notice (.4); draft, finalize, electronically file and serve notice of telephonic hearing (.3); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
B004	13334888	3/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.10	\$ 269.50	Draft order on motion to vacate requirement for "Responsive Pre-hearing Statements" along with motion to expedite treatment thereon
B004	13343916	3/3/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.40	\$ 84.00	Update master status spreadsheet following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); determine budget estimate and e-mail messages with W. Ponader regarding same (.2)
B004	13343968	3/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.70	\$ 777.00	Update master status spreadsheets, hearing date chart and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.3); continue revising schedules and statement of financial affairs (3.0); download and import filed proofs of claim (.4)
B004	13342874	3/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Court conference call on interpleader removal agreement
B004	13342897	3/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Negotiate employment of claimant noticing agent required by local court rules
B004	13343775	3/4/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding Agri-Beef contract dispute and UCC article 2 issues
B004	13349149	3/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$ 136.00	Conference with S. O'Neill concerning strategy on Atkins matter
B004	13351104	3/7/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	8.70	\$ 1,827.00	Continue revising and updating schedules and statement of financial affairs (6.0); revise retention application (.1); draft motion/order to shorten and limit notice (.6); update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar (.4); internet search for creditor addresses (.7); revise disclaimer (.1); telephone call and e-mail messages with A. Springman regarding importing of Schedule F creditor information (.2); telephone call from H. Schuyler regarding filing issues (.2); status consultation with T. Hall (.1); e-mail message to Amarillo Court Reporting regarding status of invoice (.1); revise objections following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.2)
B004	13344738	3/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	SOFA/schedules review and revision
B004	13344974	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding schedules and SOFA including signature by Trustee
B004	13344903	3/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Review and revise schedules and SOFA prior to filing
B004	13349275	3/8/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Review e-mail related to new Oklahoma state court lawsuit
B004	13349283	3/8/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$ 34.00	Telephone call and message to Perschebacher's atty
B004	13352542	3/8/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.60	\$ 336.00	Electronically file schedules and statement of financial affairs (.4); finalize, electronically file and serve objections following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.4); update agenda (.1); update master status spreadsheet and calendar (.7)

B004	13359251	3/9/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.70	\$	777.00	Review recent pleadings and update master status spreadsheets, hearing date chart and service lists (.5); revise agenda and prepare hearing files (1.3); obtain schedules and SOFA for D. DeNeal (.1); draft bar date motion, notice, and order (1.4); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve objections following consultation with D. DeNeal (.4)
B004	13359311	3/10/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	Update master status spreadsheets, service lists, calendar and hearing date chart following review of recently filed pleadings (.7); update hearing files (.1); e-mail messages with K. Goss and D. LeBas regarding telephonic hearing (.1); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve response and agenda (.9)
B004	13354338	3/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$	37.00	Review and revise agenda for March 11, 2011 hearing
B004	13361127	3/11/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.70	\$	357.00	Obtain copies of pleadings for T. Hall regarding hearing (.4); update master status spreadsheet (.4); revise bar date motion, order and notice (.9)
B004	13360919	3/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.50	\$	925.00	Prepare for and attend telephonic court hearing (stay relief, etc.) and attend to changes to response per Superior
B004	13359339	3/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft amended trustee response, motion to remove initial trustee response, and order thereon
B004	13357864	3/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Review and revise order on claims/noticing agent
B004	13357865	3/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Review and revise motion to set bar dates
B004	13365903	3/14/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.40	\$	294.00	Update master status spreadsheet, calendar and hearing date chart following review of recently filed pleadings (.9); work on list of twenty largest creditors following e-mail message from C. Wharton (.5)
B004	13363635	3/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Telephone call with bankruptcy clerk regarding order on claims agent and revise motion to set claims bar date and order to employ
B004	13367732	3/15/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$	306.00	Strategize with B. Stanley concerning interpleader complaints and deadlines for removal and begin to conduct research concerning same
B004	13369705	3/15/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.30	\$	273.00	Revise BMC employment order (.6); draft appearances for R. Stanley, J. Carr and H. Mappes regarding two adversary proceedings (.4); forward list of creditors to C. Wharton (.1); revise, finalize and upload order (.1); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
B004	13417919	3/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00	Further follow-up on engaging claims/noticing agent and coordinate with Clerk's office on order
B004	13374445	3/16/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	4.50	\$	1,530.00	Continue research concerning requirements for removal and deadlines for same
B004	13380528	3/16/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	E-mail local counsel in interpleader matters concerning plan for removal
B004	13373516	3/16/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.00	\$	420.00	Revise bar date motion and exhibits (.5); update master status spreadsheet and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.6); telephone call from H. Schuyler regarding responses (.1); work on updated address list (.8)
B004	13374472	3/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	2.10	\$	714.00	Draft notice of removal for Wisconsin case and review case law related to same
B004	13376819	3/17/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.80	\$	798.00	Update master status spreadsheets and service lists following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); continue working on updated creditor address list, including internet searches (3.0); revise, finalize and electronically file same following consultation with D. DeNeal (.3); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve bar date motion (.2); telephone call from H. Mappes regarding adversary proceeding filings (.1)
B004	13372132	3/17/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$	196.00	Draft motion for enlargement of time to object to Debtors' exemptions in Gibson case and order thereon
B004	13377441	3/18/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Revise notice of removal and review research material related to whether removal is to district court or bankruptcy court
B004	13379841	3/18/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.90	\$	399.00	Revise, finalize and upload financing order following telephone call from J. Carr (.2); e-mail messages with K. Goss regarding same (.1); review creditor list to confirm inclusion of affected parties following e-mail message from T. Hall (.4); revise, finalize and electronically file joinder in Gibson case following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.3); prepare fax cover letter transmitting proof of claim form and filing instructions to M. E. Ross (.4); update master status spreadsheet following review of recently filed pleadings (.5)
B004	13379378	3/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Coordinate and conference with claims agent regarding docketing and handling claims
B004	13379383	3/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Respond to request to have 341 hearing telephonic
B004	13379394	3/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Attend to motion to extend assumption/rejection of leases and exclusivity
B004	13375768	3/18/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft motion and order to extend deadline to assume or reject leases of nonresidential real property
B004	13389055	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Review copies of pleadings already in our possession regarding the Colorado state court interpleader action to determine what other steps need to be taken to obtain missing pleadings and/or motions to file with notice of removal
B004	13389057	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Review copies of pleadings already in our possession regarding the Kansas state court interpleader action to determine what other steps need to be taken to obtain missing pleadings and/or motions to file with notice of removal
B004	13389065	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Review copies of pleadings already in our possession regarding the Wisconsin state court interpleader action to determine what other steps need to be taken to obtain missing pleadings and/or motions to file with notice of removal
B004	13389072	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	E-mail local counsel in Colorado interpleader action about next steps and obtaining docket and additional pleadings
B004	13389075	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	E-mail local counsel in Kansas interpleader action about next steps and obtaining docket and additional pleadings
B004	13389078	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	E-mail local counsel in Wisconsin interpleader action about next steps and obtaining docket and additional pleadings
B004	13389082	3/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.30	\$	442.00	Conduct additional research concerning whether removal should be to district court or bankruptcy court and research local rules concerning same
B004	13383120	3/21/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.40	\$	84.00	Update master status spreadsheet following review of recently filed pleadings (.1); draft notice of change of address (.2); e-mail messages with B. Bakhshian of BMC (.1)
B004	13379605	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Meeting with T. Hall and R. Stanley regarding strategy regarding chapter 5 "may do" actions
B004	13380046	3/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from T. Johnston (attorney for creditor Gabriel Moreno) regarding creditors meeting and 2004 exam of T. Gibson
B004	13378580	3/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Draft motion and order to extend exclusive periods; revise motion and order to extend deadline to assume leases of nonresidential real property
B004	13378585	3/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Research procedure for moving escrow cash to operating cash free and clear of purchase money claims
B004	13389237	3/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.70	\$	578.00	Attention to drafting removal papers for Kansas state court action

B004	13389243	3/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.90	\$	646.00	Attention to drafting removal papers for Colorado state court action Contact court clerk and plaintiff's attorney in Kansas case concerning obtaining state court pleadings necessary to file with notice of removal, review and mark documents still needed and follow-up concerning same
B004	13389249	3/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00	
B004	13389254	3/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Telephone conference with plaintiff's attorney in Wisconsin case concerning obtaining state court pleadings and follow-up concerning same
B004	13389266	3/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone conference with Colorado local counsel
								Prepare for adversary proceeding filing (.2); telephone call from S. O'Neill regarding motion to approve compromise and settlement (.1); e-mail messages with K. Goss regarding notice procedures (.1); search Secretary of State websites (Indiana and Kentucky) for corporate information regarding various iterations of Eastern Livestock following e-mail message from J. Knauer and forward findings regarding same (.6); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve motion to extend exclusivity and motion to extend lease assumption period for D. DeNeal (1.0); revise, finalize and electronically file adversary complaint and appearances regarding W. Downs following e-mail messages and consultation with H. Mappes (.6); voicemail message from and telephone call to claimant M. E. Ross (.1); update master status spreadsheets, master service lists and calendar (.5)
B004	13383700	3/22/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.20	\$	672.00	
B004	13383802	3/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding response to Donnellon's request for information
B004	13381779	3/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Revise and finalize motions requesting extensions on exclusivity and deadline to assume leases
B004	13389285	3/23/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$	238.00	Revise Wisconsin removal and e-mail local counsel concerning same
B004	13389289	3/23/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00	Revise Colorado removal and e-mail local counsel regarding same
B004	13389295	3/23/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00	Revise Kansas removal and e-mail local counsel regarding same
B004	13389301	3/23/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Review additional state court pleadings received in Wisconsin case and review same, versus docket, to ensure we have everything necessary for removal notice
B004	13386757	3/23/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.60	\$	126.00	Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4); revise, finalize and electronically file notice of address change (.2)
B004	13387603	3/23/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$	37.00	Respond to Trustee request regarding computer records
B004	13396906	3/24/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	4.10	\$	1,394.00	Final revisions to notices of removals in state court actions and attention to organizing exhibits, particularly state court pleadings for same
B004	13396911	3/24/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone call with Colorado local counsel
B004	13396914	3/24/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Telephone call with Kansas local counsel
B004	13392920	3/24/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.40	\$	84.00	E-mail messages with A. Omari regarding monthly operating report (.1); forward bar date notice to K. Goss and M. Turner following consultation with T. Hall (.2); update master status spreadsheet and calendar (.2)
B004	13397265	3/25/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.70	\$	147.00	Search Secretary of State websites (Indiana and Kentucky) for corporate information regarding Eastern Cattle Co. following e-mail message from J. Knauer and forward findings regarding same (.2); update master status spreadsheet (.1); review address updates received from C. Pierce (.4)
B004	13392279	3/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Revise Purchase Money Report and Exhibit
B004	13399999	3/29/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	2.30	\$	782.00	Conduct research concerning whether there is statute or case law with regard to transferring funds interpleaded in a state court action into the federal court once it is removed to federal court
B004	13400006	3/29/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00	Draft motion to release and transfer funds
B004	13400009	3/29/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Review UCC filing received from Wisconsin state court plaintiff and related documents
B004	13400457	3/29/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.90	\$	189.00	Update master status spreadsheets and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4); download creditor matrix and compare to recent address updates and e-mail messages with E. Dixon regarding same (.3); e-mail messages with T. Ballard, K. Goss and H. Mappes regarding status of adversary proceeding and summons (.2)
B004	13404582	3/30/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	4.00	\$	1,360.00	Review pleadings in Oklahoma matter filed by Nichols and conduct research related to standing to enforce stay related to lawsuit brought against third party and not the debtor, and whether a trustee has standing to pursue fees, costs and damages for violation of automatic stay under 362(k)(1)
B004	13404592	3/30/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Outline thoughts concerning Oklahoma matter and possible strategy for same
B004	13404598	3/30/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Strategize with B. Stanley concerning Oklahoma matter
B004	13402834	3/30/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.50	\$	315.00	Consultation with D. DeNeal regarding service of notices (.1); e-mail messages with V. Bakhshian regarding matrix (.1); e-mail messages with case manager E. Dixon following review of matrix and comparison to recent address updates (.4); revise bar date notice following e-mail messages with K. Goss (.2); update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.4); revise, finalize and upload bar date order (.1); internet search for A. Sullivan's contact information (.1); forward creditor matrix to same (.1)
B004	13402840	3/30/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	Update master status spreadsheet following review of pretrial order and summons entered in Downs adversary proceeding (.3); telephone call to H. Mappes regarding service issues and case calendar (.3); attention to service of documents on defendant W. Downs (.6); prepare certificate of service (.2); create case calendar and insert upcoming deadlines and hearing dates (.4)
B004	13403093	3/30/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Calls with Court regarding exclusivity, lease assumption, and extension of time to object to Gibsons' exemptions; attend to service issues and hearing dates
B004	13408817	3/31/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Draft and finalize e-mails to other counsel in Colorado and Wisconsin matters
B004	13416177	3/31/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.30	\$	273.00	Prepare list of current reminders set regarding Downs adversary proceeding for H. Mappes (.2); update creditor matrix and forward to BMC (1.1)
B004	13405271	3/31/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$	73.50	Assist with service of bar date, exclusivity and lease assumption notices
B004	13412053	4/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Review e-mails regarding various matters
B004	13416194	4/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	Update master status spreadsheets and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.6); prepare document binders for upcoming 341 meeting of creditors for T. Hall and J. Knauer (.9); finalize and electronically file certificate of service in adversary proceeding (.3)

B004	13451672	4/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Prepare materials and review for 341 hearing
B004	13416350	4/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Voicemail from and telephone call with R. LaTour regarding 341 creditors meeting
B004	13415864	4/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$	318.50	Review responses to motion for 2004 exam and research validity of objections Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.3); draft proofs of claim following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.3); electronically file certificate of service (.1)
B004	13418556	4/5/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.70	\$	147.00	Attend 341 hearing
B004	13418341	4/5/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.80	\$	666.00	Review e-mail from attorney for a number of potential claimants in Wisconsin matter Update hearing date chart (.2); draft agenda (.3); update master status spreadsheets, master service list and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4); voicemail message from and telephone call to S. Mays regarding creditor matrix (.1)
B004	13421743	4/6/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Telephone call from J. Lovell (Cactus) regarding February 2011 monthly operating report
B004	13421986	4/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.00	\$	210.00	E-mail to J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding Cactus Feeders receivable
B004	13424935	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh (Friona) regarding February 2011 monthly operating report
B004	13424938	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to J. Knauer and E. Lynch regarding Friona receivable
B004	13424946	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Draft motion and order withdrawing exclusivity motion
B004	13424952	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Look at law relating to purchase money security interest and perfection and priorities related to same
B004	13421433	4/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$	73.50	E-mail S. Newbern, attorney for multiple parties in Wisconsin interpleader matter
B004	13426254	4/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.4); revise adversary proceeding calendar (.2); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve motion to withdraw (.3); upload order (.1); revise agenda (.1); review claims received and create summary chart regarding same (.7)
B004	13426257	4/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Farris
B004	13425138	4/7/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	Calls with DSI regarding J. Farris
B004	13426095	4/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Research fraudulent transfer law in ELC's grant of mortgage to Peoples Bank of Pickett County to secure loan to Gibsons individually
B004	13423826	4/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Draft motion to transfer case in Wisconsin interpleader matter and revise motions to transfer in Colorado and Kansas matters
B004	13423880	4/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.80	\$	441.00	E-mail plaintiffs' counsel in Wisconsin and Colorado state interpleader matters concerning motion to transfer funds
B004	13426260	4/8/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	2.70	\$	918.00	Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings
B004	13426262	4/8/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Meeting with R. Stanley J. Hanlon, T. Hall. D. DeNeal and telephone call J. Knauer regarding investigation 2004 exams (1.2), Okie (.4), Farris (.4)
B004	13428465	4/8/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$	63.00	Participate in strategy call
B004	13429046	4/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.00	\$	1,100.00	Initial look at law relating to title of goods, to address issues raised by counsel for multiple defendants in Wisconsin matter
B004	13427589	4/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.40	\$	343.00	Internet search for Barren County, KY court information following e-mail message from T. Hall (.2); telephone call to Clerk regarding need for case information (.2); review and forward small claims related pleadings to T. Hall and C. Pierce (.1); update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); update list of claims received (.2); search Harrison County, IN land records following consultation with D. DeNeal (.3)
B004	13430652	4/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00	Reply to e-mail from J. Massouh (Friona) regarding February 2011 monthly report
B004	13434491	4/11/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.20	\$	252.00	Follow-up with Texas court concerning participating in hearing via telephone
B004	13431107	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.8); e-mail messages with S. Maddox of NCR and D. DeNeal regarding lien search estimate (.2); revise agenda and create list of items to be heard regarding T. Gibson and East-West Trucking cases (.2); finalize/electronically file proof of claim in East-West Trucking case (.1); draft/finalize letter to Trustee M. Walro transmitting copy of same (.3); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve supplemental objection following consultation with D. DeNeal (.2)
B004	13432556	4/12/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Attend to agenda and other procedural matters for hearing
B004	13437408	4/12/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	E-mail to J. Lovell (Cactus) regarding Feb. 2011 monthly financial statement
B004	13439535	4/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Review/assemble e-mail messages and documentation regarding corporate evolution of Eastern Livestock following e-mail message from J. Knauer (1.0) create binder and table of contents regarding same for submission to US Premium Beef (.6); prepare hearing files for T. Hall (.5); revise agenda (.1); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
B004	13432441	4/12/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Draft/revise letter to S. Miller at US Premium Beef regarding corporate evolution of Eastern Livestock (1.2); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve agenda (.6); prepare hearing files (1.0); update master status spreadsheet (.3); update calendar (.1); telephone call from J. Knauer regarding need for valuation of property in Greene County, Missouri (.1)
B004	13440911	4/13/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.30	\$	483.00	Continue research of forward contract issues and consideration of additional defenses
B004	13442632	4/14/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	3.30	\$	693.00	E-mails concerning status conference for proposed AP
B004	13441894	4/14/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.60	\$	315.00	Develop investigation strategy
B004	13441897	4/14/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$	105.00	Draft, finalize and electronically file appearances (Carr, Jaffe, Hall, Stanley and DeNeal) following e-mail message from R. Stanley
B004	13442063	4/14/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.30	\$	132.00	Internet search for property information land brokers in Greene County, Missouri following e-mail message from J. Knauer (.6); telephone call to Dean Coder regarding need for property estimate (.4); voicemail and e-mail messages from S. O'Neill regarding filing of adversary proceeding (.3); update master status spreadsheets (.2)
B004	13442644	4/15/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.00	\$	210.00	Telephonic participation in omnibus hearing



B004	13443851	4/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.40	\$	343.00	Participate in hearing on Peoples Bank stay relief motion and First Bank and Trust Company's 2004 Examination request
B004	13451553	4/18/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$	63.00	Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings
B004	13451557	4/18/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.20	\$	42.00	Prepare draft adversary proceeding cover sheet for S. O'Neill regarding Atkinson Livestock Market matter
B004	13450291	4/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$	37.00	Telephone call with Wells Fargo attorney regarding RSI
B004	13448098	4/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	E-mails J. Knauer et al. regarding various issues
B004	13456443	4/19/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone conference with local counsel in Kansas matter Search PACER for possible seizure complaint filed against T. Gibson following consultation with T. Hall (.4); finalize/upload order following e-mail message from D. DeNeal (.1);
B004	13452784	4/19/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.20	\$	462.00	update master status spreadsheets and calendar (.8); internet search regarding Royal Been and Irsik & Doll Feed Services (.7); revise subpoena (.2)
B004	13451401	4/19/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$	196.00	Phone calls with creditors regarding case administration
B004	13453551	4/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$	1,045.00	Review Nichols affidavit in Cactus action, review and revise letter to Cole regarding Agribeeef and conference with D. DeNeal
B004	13453311	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Assist with production and review of Your Community Bank document production Update master status spreadsheets, service lists and calendar following review of recently filed pleadings (.7); arrange for delivery of corporate history book and draft letter to U.S. Premium Beef to J. Knauer (.3); telephone call and e-mail message from D. Coder regarding value of Missouri property (.2); e-mail messages with J. Knauer and C. Pierce regarding same (.1); e-mail messages with H. Roudebush of Affordable Process Service regarding Kansas subpoena (.1); scan and copy executed subpoena (.1) draft/finalize letter transmitting
B004	13457338	4/21/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.80	\$	378.00	same to H. Roudebush (.2); attention to payment of local Kansas counsel's invoice (.1)
B004	13456737	4/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$	444.00	Update on status of actions from different parts of case and begin to update action items
B004	13456789	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail from E. Lynch regarding Mid-America/E-4
B004	13464956	4/22/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$	63.00	Search PACER for seizure complaint against T. Gibson (.2); update master status spreadsheet (.1)
B004	13459989	4/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.60	\$	222.00	Conference telephone call on updated litigation strategy
B004	13461156	4/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$	481.00	Continue to prepare for update meeting with client on Monday
B004	13460029	4/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding Superior and telephone call R. LaTour regarding Superior and Friona and U.S. Attorney
B004	13460909	4/22/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$	105.00	Review e-mails regarding AgriBeef and "all hands" meeting for April 25
B004	13463491	4/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.70	\$	935.00	Review documents regarding Superior, U.S. Attorney seizure, Hoodenpyle, Agribeeef, Nichols, Atkinson draft complaint, Edens, and B4
B004	13463502	4/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding litigation support and adding K. Toner to litigation team Meeting E. Lynch, P. O'Malley, J. Knauer, T. Hall, R. Stanley, K. Toner regarding Superior claims, fraudulent transfer claims against Nichols, Edens, Grant and Scott Gibson (GP Cattle);
B004	13463527	4/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	3.70	\$	2,035.00	Bynum and Dietrich and other matters
B004	13463768	4/25/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$	157.50	Review and revise Pre-Trial Statement
B004	13463904	4/25/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.10	\$	52.50	E-mail B. Stanley regarding same
B004	13462788	4/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	4.10	\$	1,004.50	Strategy meeting to discuss collection actions, Superior, Seals, Downs, and preferences
B004	13467286	4/26/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Follow-up with local counsel concerning state interpleader matters; telephone conference with T. McNamara
B004	13467119	4/26/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.10	\$	21.00	E-mail messages with T. Hall regarding monthly operating report
B004	13466940	4/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	E-mails regarding Greenbaum fee application, receipt funds from Thompson Hine and other matters
B004	13466384	4/26/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.50	\$	262.50	Conference with B. Stanley regarding Pre-Trial statement and transition of responsibility to K. Toner, scope of preference/fraudulent transfer counterclaims
B004	13471902	4/27/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00	Send various follow-up e-mails to other counsel in state interpleader matters; telephone conference with counsel for People's Bank Update master status spreadsheets (.4); forward certificates of service regarding claim notices in regards to bond claimants following e-mail and voicemail messages from L. Batten at Kroger Gardis (.3); calendar upcoming hearing dates and deadlines (.4)
B004	13479234	4/27/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.10	\$	231.00	Telephone call from H. Mappes regarding continuance of hearing (.1); e-mail messages with K. Goss and E. Dixon regarding same (.1); draft motion and order for continuance (.4)
B004	13470111	4/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	E-mails regarding Thompson Hine, Garrett, and other matters
B004	13482347	4/28/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.60	\$	126.00	Update master status spreadsheets following review of recently filed pleadings (.2); update hearing date chart (.2); revise, finalize and electronically file second extension motion (.2)
B004	13482350	4/28/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.20	\$	42.00	Revise order continuing hearing following e-mail message from H. Mappes
B004	13474174	4/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	E-mails regarding payment Thompson Hine (Garrett), Seals, Agribeeef (from Cole et al.) and Domina
B004	13473716	4/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$	196.00	Draft second motion to extend time to object to Gibsons' claimed exemptions and proposed order thereon
B004	13484339	4/29/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$	63.00	Update master status spreadsheet (.2); attention to receipt of proofs of claim (.1)
B004	13484340	4/29/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.30	\$	63.00	Revise, finalize, electronically file and serve motion for continuance following e-mail message from H. Mappes (.2); upload order (.1)
B004	13484342	4/29/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.80	\$	168.00	[Friona adversary proceeding] Download lengthy complaint (.4); draft appearances for K. Toner and S. Eikenberry (.4)
B004	13484493	4/29/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Telephone call with L. Batten regarding bond claimants
B004	13480857	4/29/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Conference with R. Stanley and T. Hall regarding negotiations with Seals and strategy regarding claims against Seals and other branch managers and possible settlement
B005	13191530	1/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research claims process for unpaid cattle supplies under PASA
B005	13196679	1/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.10	\$	269.50	Review sales procedure motions and draft notice of purchase money claim bar date
B005	13200052	1/6/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$	111.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles, counsel for Superior Auction



B005	13222900	1/17/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$	196.00	Research claims asserted in Texas interpleader and effect on priority of Fifth Third's lien
B005	13236713	1/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Revise and finalize form of assignment and notice
B005	13236719	1/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$	318.50	Research validity of purchase money security interest obtained by fraud
B005	13243859	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00	Review markup to proposed letter to contract sellers
B005	13243476	1/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Research bond claims and creditors to receive notice of Purchase Money Bar Date Telephone call with S. White regarding preparation, considerations regarding Hoover analysis of Fifth Third claim, gather relevant information, documentation of Fifth Third claim,
B005	13278441	2/8/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.10	\$	456.50	proof of claim; begin review of UCC filing reports in Kentucky and Indiana
B005	13277513	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails W. Ponader regarding review Fifth Third POC and Hoover Hull
B005	13277136	2/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.80	\$	441.00	Research case law on reclamation claims and priority disputes between unpaid cattle producers and blanket lien holders
B005	13285210	2/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Update bond claims spreadsheet
B005	13285212	2/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.10	\$	514.50	Research Texas reclamation law
B005	13296356	2/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.30	\$	73.50	Respond to creditor inquiries regarding claim forms and procedures
B005	13315338	2/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Respond to creditor questions concerning purchase money claims
B005	13328735	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.10	\$	37.00	Telephone call to D. Donnellon regarding e-mail
B005	13342865	3/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Call with D. Donnellon regarding discovery and other matters
B005	13341245	3/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$	318.50	Draft 503(b)(9) Bar Date Motion
B005	13351303	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with W. Ponader regarding March 11 hearing and communication with Hoover Hull regarding allowance of Fifth Third POC
B005	13351318	3/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft bar date motion
B005	13359587	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Telephone calls and e-mails E. Lynch, W. Ponader et al. regarding due diligence regarding Fifth Third POC and hearing
B005	13381824	3/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Calls with BMC regarding claims process, background, bar dates and procedures
B005	13386344	3/23/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Review filed claims and analyze validity of purchase money claims
B005	13389649	3/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Draft Exhibit to Purchase Money Report
B005	13415868	4/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$	294.00	Update analysis of "Purchase Money Claims"
B005	13418182	4/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Update purchase money claim list
B005	13429086	4/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Telephone call Northern Livestock Video
B005	13431072	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.20	\$	702.00	Calculate amount of ELC's claim against East-West Trucking for cattle fed at Cattlemen's and send e-mail to D. DeNeal regarding same
B005	13433493	4/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Research Northern Livestock Video Auction's complaint and fact situation and prepare questions in advance of conference call
B005	13456230	4/21/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Revise and send letter and subpoena to Royal Beef
B005	13459867	4/22/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Research purchase money claims and ability to transfer proceeds from escrow to operating account
B005	13476568	4/29/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.70	\$	416.50	Review filed proofs of claim for purposes of updating Motion to Transfer Funds from escrow to operating account; further research validity of purchase money claims
B007	13230378	12/24/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.30	\$	123.00	Telephone call with J. Carr and J. Knauer regarding engagement as counsel to Trustee
B007	13230385	12/26/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.40	\$	164.00	Telephone call with D. Fisher, Fifth Third, regarding Eastern Livestock engagement as counsel for Trustee and potential conflict waiver
B007	13185906	12/27/2010	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.60	\$	320.00	Begin drafting employment application, affidavit and order
B007	13230391	12/27/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.50	\$	205.00	Telephone call with D. Fisher and J. Hubbard regarding B&D's potential engagement as Trustee's counsel and obtaining consent for same
B007	13178623	12/28/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$	700.00	Draft letter to obtain consent from Wells Fargo regarding loan participant with Fifth Third and coordinate conflict waiver
B007	13178625	12/28/2010	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	140.00	Review and revise employment application
B007	13230406	12/28/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.30	\$	123.00	Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding Wells Fargo's role in case
B007	13230409	12/28/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	1.60	\$	656.00	Coordinate obtaining consents from Wells Fargo for B&D engagement
B007	13230412	12/28/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.50	\$	205.00	Draft consent letter
B007	13230423	12/29/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.20	\$	82.00	Review revised Wells Fargo consent letter
B007	13230428	12/29/2010	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.20	\$	82.00	Correspondence with G. Heck regarding same
B007	13187703	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Draft Baker & Daniels employment application including affidavit and proposed order
B007	13187704	1/2/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Draft DSI employment application including affidavit and proposed order
B007	13202941	1/7/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	83.00	Review J. Carr memo to Fifth Third regarding terms of B & D engagement by Trustee
B007	13213343	1/11/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	3.30	\$	1,402.50	Review and analyze First Bank objection (.8); research issues concerning relationship with Fifth Third and disinterestedness standard (2.5)
B007	13210654	1/11/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.50	\$	1,037.50	Confer with J. Carr and D. Foster regarding First Bank & Trust objection (.4); review filings (.6); research regarding Section 327 issues (1.5)
B007	13217802	1/12/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	3.40	\$	1,445.00	Drafting response to objection of First Bank to B&D engagement
B007	13215606	1/12/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.80	\$	1,577.00	Drafted Trustee's response, follow-up research Section 327
B007	13220176	1/13/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	1.00	\$	425.00	Finalize response to First Bank objection
B007	13216158	1/13/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.60	\$	664.00	Confer with D. Foster regarding Response regarding Trustee engagement of Baker & Daniels (.3); follow-up on Envirodyne facts (.5); revised draft (.8)
B007	13215005	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Review W. Ponader draft response to objection to engagement
B007	13219107	1/14/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.60	\$	249.00	Telephone call with T. Hall regarding First Bank issue (.2); telephone call with D. Donnellon regarding First Bank issue, "bottom line" issues (.4)

B007	13220095	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	Telephone call J. Hoover regarding engagement special counsel; review and revise application and conference with D. DeNeal regarding employment Hoover Hall
B007	13219238	1/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Draft employment application for Hoover & Hull
B007	13219230	1/16/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$ 207.50	Prepare detailed e-mail to J. Carr, J. Burns, T. Hall regarding discussions January 14 with D. Donnellon, recitation of facts that may resolve First Bank objection to Baker & Daniels engagement
B007	13229613	1/17/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$ 333.00	Further attention to First Bank's objection to employment
B007	13227093	1/17/2011	10605 Foster, David A.	Partner	0.30	\$ 127.50	Conference with W. Ponader regarding First Bank response
B007	13222420	1/17/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.00	\$ 415.00	Review J. Burns comments regarding facts regarding First Bank objection to Baker & Daniels' engagement, input from T. Hall, D. Foster (.3); revise recitation of information to be sent to First Bank (.2); telephone call with J. Burns for further comment (.2); finalize information to provide Donnellon and prepare e-mail regarding same (.3)
B007	13222858	1/17/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Revise Hoover Hull employment application
B007	13225799	1/18/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Finalize Hoover Hull employment application
B007	13230016	1/19/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	Telephone call with T. Hall regarding meeting with Donnellon January 20, 2011, other information
B007	13235963	1/21/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.40	\$ 581.00	Confer with T. Hall regarding January 20 discussions with First Bank counsel on objection to engagement (.2); prepare e-mail to D. Donnellon regarding same (.2); prepare Amended Hall Affidavit (.8); prepare e-mail to D. Donnellon delivering revised Affidavit (.2)
B007	13239883	1/24/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.20	\$ 498.00	Further e-mail discussion with D. Donnellon regarding First Bank issues on Amended Affidavit (.6); further amend Affidavit with limited additional changes (.3); final e-mail exchange with Donnellon regarding filing of Amended Affidavit, First Bank position (.3)
B007	13245122	1/26/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 124.50	Telephone call with J. Carr regarding withdrawal of First Bank Objection, follow-up telephone call regarding timing of withdrawal
B007	13277522	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$ 110.00	E-mail E. Lynch regarding DSI employment order
B007	13292423	2/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles regarding fees for Receiver and fees for administrative claims for filing the involuntary
B007	13343917	3/3/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	1.00	\$ 210.00	Draft application to employ The BMC Group following e-mail message from T. Hall
B007	13343969	3/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.50	\$ 105.00	Revise employment application and affidavit regarding The BMC Group
B007	13352543	3/8/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	0.90	\$ 189.00	Revise application to employ BMC (.2); draft notice of submission concerning Feil declaration (.2); revise, finalize, electronically file and serve same (.5)
B007	13438018	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding proposed meeting with Gary Seals and attorney
B007	13477525	4/28/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 83.00	E-mail exchange with A. Omori regarding other professionals' fees and expenses, data needed for March 2011 Open Report
B008	13212584	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$ 110.00	Conference with D. Foster regarding response to objection to employment
B008	13217888	1/13/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.40	\$ 210.00	Participate in meeting with J. Knauer and follow-up with W. Ponader regarding strategy to address First Bank objection
B008	13463021	4/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$ 294.00	Review Greenebaum Doll application for administrative expenses and research potential objections
B008	13469232	4/27/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Draft limited objection to Greenbaum fee request
B009	13207186	1/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$ 185.00	Conference call with Fifth Third and counsel cash use and DIP Loan
B009	13207189	1/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Telephone call with J. Knauer regarding status of objections; cash use
B009	13220082	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$ 330.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding funding, Cattlemen, Friona, production of checks, and other issues
B009	13223874	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.60	\$ 1,430.00	Review amended schedules and research regarding Food Security Act, 9-320 of UCC and draft memorandum regarding lien rights to Cattlement cattle
B009	13229629	1/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$ 481.00	Review 13 week budget from Receiver; telephone call with Bank regarding funding for administration; revise budget on fees related to mandatory
B009	13239076	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding law relating to Cattlemen motion and PMSI
B009	13245132	1/26/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.20	\$ 498.00	Begin work on cash use/DIP financing motion
B009	13246450	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with W. Ponader regarding preparation motion and agreed order regarding DIP financing and use of cash collateral regarding Fifth Third funding fees and expenses
B009	13252130	1/27/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.60	\$ 1,494.00	Draft Motion for Cash Use and Post-Petition Financing
B009	13251701	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Review and revise funding memorandum and e-mail to LaTour et al.
B009	13256300	1/31/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.40	\$ 996.00	Revise DIP Motion, prepare JMC revised memo to R. LaTour 1/28/2011, work on Interim Order
B009	13263397	2/2/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$ 373.50	Continued drafting/revising Financing Motion and Order
B009	13270339	2/3/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.50	\$ 622.50	Revise Financing Order
B009	13271256	2/4/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.80	\$ 747.00	Complete drafts of Financing Motion, Final Order
B009	13280369	2/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Continue work on budget for financing-dividing time worked into categories
B009	13275900	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails R. LaTour regarding financing and Cattlemen's
B009	13275903	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Review and revise financing pleadings
B009	13278439	2/8/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 124.50	Review revisions to finance motion and order regarding preparation for February 9, 2011 telephone call with Fifth Third
B009	13277509	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$ 770.00	Review and revise pleadings regarding Fifth Third financing
B009	13277113	2/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.20	\$ 49.00	Research ELC bond
B009	13282191	2/9/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.10	\$ 1,286.50	Participated in "all hands" telephone call plus Fifth Third regarding status of various issues (1.5); prepare further revisions to Financing Motion and Order, finalize proposed final versions, prepare e-mail circulating same (1.6)
B009	13282391	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$ 715.00	Conference telephone call LaTour et al. regarding funding, Cattlemen's and other Friona topics
B009	13282392	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$ 385.00	E-mails J. Knauer regarding telephone call with LaTour

B009	13282393	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Review LaTour comments and funding pleadings
B009	13284505	2/10/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	332.00	Further revise Financing Motion and Order per R. LaTour comments February 9-P.M., adding information regarding applicable paragraph numbers (.7); prepare e-mail distributing same for review (.1)
B009	13284513	2/10/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.80	\$	747.00	Provide information to S. White regarding Hoover Hull analysis, prepare e-mail to S. White regarding same (.5); late afternoon changes to Motion and Order per J. Bosco comments, telephone call with R. LaTour regarding same (.6); prepare forms regarding secured claim review (.7)
B009	13290347	2/11/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.00	\$	830.00	Preparation for telephone call with J. Hoover and S. White regarding HH representative of Trustee regarding Fifth Third (.9); conference call with J. Hoover, S. White regarding details, general issues/questions for consideration of required analysis (.6); review notice requirements per Rules, telephone call with S. Herendeen regarding issues on 20 largest list, other gaps in information, revise/finalize Motion on Cash Use and Trustee loan accordingly (.5)
B009	13286609	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Review and revise motion for funding by Fifth Third and e-mails LaTour et al.
B009	13301026	2/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Revise budget and discuss with W. Ponader
B009	13300218	2/16/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.20	\$	913.00	Work on budget
B009	13298932	2/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with W. Ponader and T. Hall regarding budgets for Fifth Third financing
B009	13300303	2/17/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	166.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour on DSI questions related to financing, questions on carve-out, available funds, status of budget
B009	13300704	2/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding financing motion
B009	13306519	2/18/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$	259.00	Telephone call discussing 13 week budget for Fifth Third
B009	13303611	2/18/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.00	\$	830.00	Work on ELC Budget (1.2); review DSI data (.3); telephone call with E. Lynch regarding DSI data input (.4); contact J. Knauer regarding budget input (.1)
B009	13307972	2/21/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$	148.00	Correct formulas in cash use budget and review
B009	13307320	2/21/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.30	\$	539.50	Complete 13 week budget (1.1); prepare e-mail to Trustee and Trustee professionals regarding needed information (.2)
B009	13310694	2/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Conference with J. Carr and W. Ponader regarding financing and preference recovery
B009	13310699	2/22/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.30	\$	481.00	Telephone call with C. Bowles regarding proposed cash use and DIP funding and telephone call with W. Ponader regarding release and waiver language of proposed order and creditors' concerns
B009	13310898	2/22/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.60	\$	664.00	Discussions with T. Hall, J. Carr regarding issue with provisions of Financing Order, review draft documents accordingly (.8); telephone call with R. LaTour regarding issue, changes required to proposed Order (.5); e-mail exchange with DSI, KGR and Hoover Hull regarding Budget, data status (.3)
B009	13310140	2/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.70	\$	385.00	Conference with and e-mails W. Ponader and T. Hall regarding finance motion and creditor concerns regarding release of claims
B009	13310747	2/22/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$	157.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding financing issues generated by form of draft order
B009	13316935	2/23/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	332.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding paragraph 9(B) issues (.2); prepare e-mail to J. Carr, T. Hall regarding same (.1); telephone call with S. White regarding questions of HH budget items (.5)
B009	13313302	2/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference with W. Ponader and T. Hall regarding funding arrangement and possible release of Fifth Third
B009	13330364	2/24/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$	373.50	Work on Budget; continue work toward resolving Financing Order issues, e-mails regarding Hoover Hull access to IConnect, telephone call with S. White regarding Budget, other questions
B009	13316764	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference telephone call J. Knauer, T. Hall regarding financing motion other admin matters
B009	13330450	2/25/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.80	\$	747.00	Review J. Knauer Budget information, attention to merging information; telephone call with E. Lynch regarding needed DSI information; work on extending Budget through May 22; telephone call to R. LaTour regarding Fifth Third agreement regarding resolution of Financing Order
B009	13319957	2/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with W. Ponader and e-mails regarding funding proposal Fifth Third
B009	13330523	2/28/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.60	\$	664.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding issues on Financing Order, negotiated resolution (.4); draft proposed language, confer with J. Carr regarding approval (.3); finalize language (.3); prepare e-mail to DSI regarding Budget information needed; further work on Budget (.6)
B009	13324125	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with W. Ponader and e-mails regarding financing motion and order
B009	13328746	3/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.50	\$	185.00	Telephone call with W. Ponader regarding budget and begin filling in same for go forward
B009	13330585	3/1/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.40	\$	581.00	Revised Financing Order regarding February 28 agreement, finalized Notice of Submission (.4); additional DSI data, finalized first 13 week Budget, prepared e-mail to R. LaTour regarding same (.7); prepared template for second 13 week Budget through May 22; prepared e-mail to J. Knauer, B&D, DSI regarding providing all needed information regarding estimated fees and expenses, week by week (.3)
B009	13330114	3/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails regarding financing motion and order
B009	13335843	3/2/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.90	\$	788.50	Analyze data necessary to compare "actual" to "estimates" in preparation for Budget meeting (.5); participate in meeting with T. Hall and DSI regarding Budget issues; review Budget, follow upwork regarding inputting, revising projections (1.4)
B009	13334309	3/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Meeting E. Lynch and P. O'Malley of DSI regarding budgeting for financing motion
B009	13341495	3/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Attention to budget issues
B009	13337569	3/3/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	2.60	\$	1,079.00	Conference call with R. LaTour, J. Bosco, DSI and W. Ponader regarding review of Budget, bank issues, questions (.7); prepare e-mail to J. Carr and J. A. Knauer regarding providing Wells Fargo with copy of Budget (.2); revise Budget through May 29 per T. Hall and D. DeNeal input, further revisions, regarding-calculate aggregate sums, add BMC data (1.6); e-mail exchange with R. Stanley regarding Seals & Down and interpleader matters (.1)
B009	13337297	3/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Draft list of major areas recovery for financing motion
B009	13342895	3/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$	74.00	Address questions related to amended order on cash use/DIP funding
B009	13344334	3/4/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.90	\$	788.50	Continued work on Budget through May 29, prepare/respond to multiple e-mails with Baker & Daniels lawyers, DSI, Trustee regarding estimates for work and expenses through May 29

B009	13342312	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	E-mails regarding financing motion
B009	13344411	3/6/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	166.00	Review P. O'Malley Budget format, respond to questions on "must do", "may do" designations
								Respond to issues raised by D. Donnellon regarding Financing Motion (.4); review final proposed Budget through May 29, telephone call with E. Lynch, P. O'Malley regarding
B009	13344433	3/7/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.30	\$	539.50	questions, issues on same (.8) follow-up with J. Knauer regarding missing data (.1)
B009	13344965	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding financing motion
B009	13344972	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Telephone call R. LaTour regarding Superior, Cattlemen's and Agribeeff
B009	13345181	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference with W. Ponader regarding financing motion and Donnellon
B009	13344896	3/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Research and provide support to W. Ponder for response to First Bank objection to DIP financing motion
								Telephone calls with J. Carr regarding status on Hoover Hull work (.2); telephone calls with S. White regarding memorandum delivered to Trustee, conclusion that no basis to object
B009	13349342	3/8/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.30	\$	539.50	to Fifth Third claim; follow-up telephone calls and e-mails to S. White regarding same, creditors' objections to Financing Motion (1.1)
B009	13351306	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	Review objections to financing motion
B009	13349375	3/8/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$	157.50	Conference with W. Ponader and review objections to Financing Motion
								Review of objections to financing (.7); telephone call with J. Carr regarding HH work on analysis of Fifth Third claim, follow-up telephone call with S. White and related e-mails
B009	13354009	3/9/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	1.50	\$	622.50	regarding need to assess what Proof of Claim in the correct amount (.8)
B009	13352252	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	4.80	\$	2,640.00	Review objections, draft, review and revise response to objections regarding financing motion, e-mails J. Knauer, S. White, W. Ponader et al. and conference with W. Ponader
B009	13354334	3/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$	259.00	Review and revise response to objections to cash use
								Participated in "all hands" telephone call regarding review of Objections to Financing Motion, preparation for March 11 hearing (1.4); telephone call with S. White and J. John
B009	13354172	3/10/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	3.90	\$	1,618.50	regarding Iconect access (.1); telephone call with R. LaTour regarding Bank Budget review (.4); follow-up via multiple telephone calls and e-mail exchanges with DSI, Hoover, Hull, J. Knauer and R. Lynch regarding questions, progress, issues and resolutions regarding Fifth Third claim allowance and Budget approval (2.0)
								Review and revise response to objections regarding finance motion; conference telephone call J. Knauer, Hoover Hull, DSI et al. regarding hearing on finance motion, response to
B009	13359581	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.90	\$	1,595.00	objections and other matters
B009	13359584	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.90	\$	495.00	E-mails R. LaTour et al. regarding revisions to response to objections and arrange filing
B009	13359600	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Meeting with J. Knauer, e-mails Levin and Bowles regarding Supreme and issues regarding response to Supreme objection regarding financing motion
B009	13359602	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.50	\$	1,375.00	Meeting with objectors and Fifth Third regarding resolution objections
B009	13359607	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.90	\$	1,595.00	Hearing regarding financing motion
B009	13359366	3/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Research effect of allowance of claim on ability to later assert setoff or recoupment claims and assist with hearing
B009	13357862	3/13/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$	592.00	Begin revisions to financing order based on hearing and agreements
B009	13363649	3/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.90	\$	703.00	Complete review and revisions of cash use order
B009	13365410	3/14/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.60	\$	249.00	Review "actual" Baker & Daniels' fees regarding week of February 27 through March 5; prepare chart comparing same; e-mail to J. Carr, et al., regarding budget to actual, delta
B009	13362378	3/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.90	\$	1,045.00	Review and revise order on financing motion and e-mail to LaTour et al.
B009	13367015	3/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Telephone call LaTour; review and revise financing order, e-mail to Donnellon et al.
B009	13367016	3/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	E-mails Rogers, Donnellon et al. regarding financing order and telephone call LaTour
B009	13367018	3/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding Okie and Cattlemens
B009	13372868	3/16/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	124.50	Prepare comparison chart regarding Baker & Daniels Budget to Actuals for week of March 6 through March 12
B009	13371718	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.40	\$	770.00	Meeting J. Knauer et al. regarding various matters including financing motion, Agribeeff
B009	13371721	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.70	\$	935.00	Review and revise financing order, telephone call LaTour and draft e-mail to counsel and revised order
B009	13372614	3/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Telephone call counsel for Robert Nichols regarding interview regarding Agribeeff dispute and e-mail
B009	13372621	3/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.40	\$	1,320.00	E-mails with various counsel, telephone calls, regarding revisions to Financing Order and review and revise Financing Order
B009	13375960	3/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00	Arrange uploading financing order
B009	13379606	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Actions to seek determination that funds on hand constitute Fifth Third "cash collateral" under Financing Order
								Telephone call with E. Lynch regarding monthly roll forward of Budget, information to be revised to reflect "actuals" (.1); review latest updated actuals, prepare e-mail to DSI
B009	13404013	3/30/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	166.00	regarding update of budget data (.3)
B009	13426097	4/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00	E-mails Okie Farms
B009	13467464	4/26/2011	10732 Ponader, Wendy W.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$	207.50	Confer with L. Lynch regarding Budget, roll forward by four weeks, data required, other information
B010	13185396	12/27/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.40	\$	88.00	Conference with R. Stanley and J. Carr regarding litigation issues and background
B010	13186647	12/27/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$	66.00	Telephone conference with H. Schuyler regarding website and litigation list
B010	13186656	12/27/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$	198.00	Review background information and dockets available online
B010	13185397	12/28/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$	220.00	Conference call with T. Hall, D. DeNeal, J. Carr, J. Knauer, S. Laughlin, and E. Lynch regarding Eastern Livestock bankruptcy
B010	13186668	12/28/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$	198.00	Begin looking into interpleader cases
B010	13185400	12/29/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.30	\$	286.00	Preparation for and conference call with J. Knauer, E. Lynch, D. DeNeal, J. Carr, T. Hall, R. Stanley discussing status of case



B010	13189114	12/29/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$ 198.00	Research bankruptcy removal rule 9027 and review interpleader complaints
B010	13189117	12/29/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.20	\$ 264.00	Read and review 5/3 complaint and other background information in preparation for tomorrow's litigation strategy conference call
B010	13189118	12/29/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$ 44.00	Conference with T. Hall and D. DeNeal discussing deadlines and filing notices of bankruptcy
B010	13185399	12/30/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.00	\$ 440.00	Conference call with R. Stanley, J. Knauer, and E. Lynch regarding affiliate entities and potential litigation
B010	13186734	12/30/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.50	\$ 110.00	Follow-up conference with R. Stanley regarding strategy
B010	13186740	12/30/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$ 44.00	Conference with T. Hall and D. DeNeal regarding deadlines
B010	13186749	12/30/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$ 220.00	Begin assimilating and reviewing information from E. Lynch regarding corporate structure
B010	13186753	12/30/2010	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.50	\$ 110.00	Begin researching local rules in the interpleader states regarding procedure for removal to bankruptcy court and need for local counsel
B010	13189428	1/3/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.30	\$ 586.50	Telephone conference with J. Carr, D. DeNeal, T. Hall, R. Stanley discussing strategy and issues for follow-up
B010	13196196	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.50	\$ 892.50	Travel to and from New Albany
B010	13196207	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$ 204.00	Conference with R. Stanley and C. Pierce going through checks and accounts relating to G. Seals and W. Downs
B010	13196220	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.00	\$ 510.00	Begin drafting complaint against G. Seals and W. Downs and begin drafting document requests for subpoenas; conferences with R. Stanley regarding same
B010	13196229	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.30	\$ 586.50	Meetings with E. Lynch, C. Pierce, J. Knauer, R. Stanley, T. Hall, and J. Carr gathering facts and discussing strategy
B010	13196233	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$ 255.00	Conference call with same and 5/3 Bank regarding strategy and funding
B010	13196239	1/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.50	\$ 127.50	Conference call hearing with bankruptcy court
B010	13199604	1/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$ 110.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding removal and transfer interpleader actions
B010	13199314	1/6/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$ 255.00	Telephone conference with J. Carr, J. Knauer, E. Lynch, C. Pierce, S. Laughlin, T. Hall and D. DeNeal regarding proposal to Fifth Third, upcoming motions and other issues
B010	13199317	1/6/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.00	\$ 510.00	Research automatic stay and interpleader actions; begin drafting notice of removal for interpleader actions; conference with R. Stanley regarding same
B010	13199325	1/6/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.80	\$ 204.00	Continue drafting Seals & Downs complaint
B010	13199322	1/6/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$ 51.00	Draft subpoena for 5/3
B010	13203208	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Review and e-mail subpoena to Fifth Third regarding checks
B010	13201451	1/7/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.30	\$ 331.50	Continue research for Seals and Downs complaint
B010	13201889	1/7/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.00	\$ 510.00	Attention to hiring local counsel for interpleader actions and continue researching and drafting removal notice
B010	13207182	1/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.30	\$ 111.00	Discussion regarding stay or removal of interpleader actions with R. Stanley
B010	13204498	1/10/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.20	\$ 561.00	Work on motion to transfer Texas interpleader; conference with R. Stanley discussing strategy; begin researching jurisdictional issues relating to motion to transfer/motion to lift stay response
B010	13208667	1/11/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	4.80	\$ 1,224.00	Continue researching exclusivity of in rem bankruptcy jurisdiction as it relates to pending motions to lift the stay and removal of interpleader actions; conferences with T. Hall and R. Stanley strategizing regarding same
B010	13211701	1/12/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.00	\$ 765.00	Conferences with R. Stanley and D. DeNeal regarding stay relief hearing and discuss impact on interpleader actions; continue research for drafting Downs complaint
B010	13214845	1/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$ 877.50	Study N.D. Tex. interpleader complaints and exhibits
B010	13214859	1/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding strategy for dealing with interpleader actions
B010	13214866	1/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding strategy for interpleader cases
B010	13214620	1/13/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.30	\$ 586.50	Conference with J. Carr, J. Knauer, T. Hall, R. Stanley, and D. DeNeal discussing status and strategy going forward
B010	13214704	1/13/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.00	\$ 765.00	Follow-up research and analysis regarding interpleaders, subject matter jurisdiction, and transfers and conferences with R. Stanley regarding same
B010	13220092	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding litigation
B010	13218815	1/16/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.50	\$ 382.50	Continue drafting Downs complaint, specifically researching necessary elements of preference action, state fraudulent transfer claims, and turnover action
B010	13224650	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$ 170.00	Review interpleador complaints
B010	13224652	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Attempt to call attorneys for interpleador plaintiffs in state court action
B010	13224655	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Telephone conference with attorney for plaintiff in Kansas state action
B010	13224668	1/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$ 136.00	Online research concerning state court interpleador actions
B010	13223871	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	2.20	\$ 1,210.00	Meeting with team to discuss litigation and other issues including Cattlemen, Friona etc.
B010	13223879	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Conference with R. Stanley and T. Hall regarding Cattlemen
B010	13222063	1/17/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.80	\$ 459.00	Litigation strategy meeting with J. Carr, R. Stanley, T. Hall, S. Eikenberry, and D. DeNeal
B010	13222619	1/17/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.40	\$ 102.00	Update S. Eikenberry with interpleader information
B010	13222627	1/17/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	4.20	\$ 1,071.00	Complete first draft of Downs Complaint, including review of transfer documentation and researching additional legal issues
B010	13230541	1/18/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Review answer and counterclaim filed by Superior in the Kansas state case and related pleadings in that case
B010	13238036	1/24/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$ 25.50	Conference call with T. Hall regarding subpoena for Your Community Bank
B010	13241255	1/25/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	Telephone conference and follow-up e-mails with S. Laughlin regarding Your Community Bank subpoena
B010	13243393	1/25/2011	18503 Britton, Kayla D.	Associate	2.50	\$ 487.50	Research UCC law on fraud and the creation of sham security interests
B010	13246449	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding status and strategy regarding litigation
B010	13244136	1/26/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	Conference with R. Stanley discussing draft adversary complaint



B010	13250136	1/30/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.50	\$	382.50	Revise draft Downs complaint per R. Stanley's edits and add claims against Seals and McDonald; research elements of breach of fiduciary duty and conspiracy
B010	13255353	1/31/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.10	\$	269.50	Draft responses to Cattlemen's discovery requests
B010	13254564	1/31/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.30	\$	586.50	Research conspiracy claim; revise draft complaint and send to R. Stanley
B010	13259903	2/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Draft responses to Cattlemen discovery requests
B010	13268629	2/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$	170.00	Review order with regard to payment of funds concerning cattle sales and review state interpleader cases to determine whether and how such order affects funds interpled in those cases
B010	13268636	2/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone conference with plaintiff's counsel in Kansas state interpleader cases
B010	13266340	2/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Revise responses to Cattlemen's discovery requests
B010	13266349	2/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Review deposition and 341 transcripts for relevant testimony
B010	13270204	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.50	\$	367.50	Finalize and send documents in response to Cattlemen's production requests
B010	13271708	2/4/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	1.60	\$	704.00	Research and analysis of forfeiture issues relating to seizure warrant executed on Your Community Bank account; develop strategy regarding procedure to assert claim against seized funds; conference with T. Hall regarding strategy and interactions with U.S. Attorney's Office
B010	13283917	2/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Look up and send e-mails to plaintiffs' counsel in state interpleader cases concerning cattle sales
B010	13284266	2/9/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Conference with B. Stanley concerning Gibson 341 hearing
B010	13284347	2/9/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Gibson 341 hearing
B010	13280034	2/9/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$	25.50	Attention to e-mail from J. Knauer regarding draft adversary complaint
B010	13285145	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$	275.00	Conference T. Hall, J. Knauer, R. Stanley regarding Friona pretrial
B010	13286599	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	Conference with T. Hall and R. Stanley regarding Friona pretrial and research regarding 2-702/546/503(b)(a) and seller claimants in interpleader action
B010	13298988	2/15/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	71.00	Conference with B. Stanley regarding background regarding Seals & Downs and other adversary proceedings
B010	13301696	2/16/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	3.50	\$	1,190.00	Attend continuation of Gibson 341 hearing
B010	13302233	2/17/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	106.50	Conference with H. Mappes regarding background relating to Seals & Downs litigation
B010	13302238	2/17/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.60	\$	213.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding background relating to Atkinson & Edens matters
B010	13302843	2/18/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$	76.50	Conferences with R. Stanley and S. O'Neill regarding adversary complaints
B010	13302840	2/19/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	2.00	\$	510.00	Break draft Seals & Downs adversary complaint into two separate complaints and revise; add calculation of check totals to Seals complaint
B010	13311665	2/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Conference with B. Stanley concerning state court cases
B010	13313147	2/23/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	177.50	Conference with T. Hall regarding C&M Cattle and Nu Technologies matters; review files regarding same
B010	13322150	2/25/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	1.50	\$	532.50	Review documents related to potential adversary proceedings regarding Atkinson Livestock, Edens, Nu Technologies and C&M Cattle; communicate with L. Lynch regarding same; conference with D. DeNeal regarding same; conference with T. Hall regarding same
B010	13328686	2/28/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.70	\$	629.00	Conference regarding Superior and other pre-hearing statements (Carr, Stanley)
B010	13324121	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.30	\$	715.00	Conference with R. Stanley and T. Hall regarding Superior and response, Cattlemens, Friona
B010	13330099	3/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.80	\$	990.00	Draft response to Sup. regarding Friona and conference with R. Stanley regarding telephone call C. Bowles
B010	13329792	3/1/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	2.60	\$	1,144.00	Prepare for conference with U.S. Attorney's Office regarding status and seizure and forfeiture issues; conference with T. Hall regarding development of strategy for resolution of seizure and forfeiture issues
B010	13340575	3/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$	229.50	E-mail exchanges with R. Stanley, D. DeNeal and C. Pierce regarding Seals & Downs draft complaints; revise same
B010	13345028	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Conference with S. O'Neill regarding theories of recovery against Atkinson
B010	13345528	3/7/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	6.40	\$	2,272.00	Analysis of possible claims against Atkinson Livestock related to participation in kite scheme; research regarding Atkinson and Zeiene; draft Atkinson Adversary Complaint; conference with B. Stanley regarding same; communicate with E. Lynch regarding Atkinson, Baker, Nuckols and Abilene, Texas matters; conference with W. Ponader regarding Abilene, Texas matter
B010	13345173	3/7/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.60	\$	153.00	Attention to letter from G. Seals counsel; e-mail with D. DeNeal and R. Stanley regarding same; e-mail with C. Pierce regarding review of draft complaints
B010	13352621	3/9/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.40	\$	176.00	Conferences with T. Hall and E. Lewis regarding preparation and strategy for conference call with U.S. Attorney's Office; conference with E. Lewis regarding status report from same
B010	13361437	3/14/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.20	\$	306.00	Begin civil cover sheets for Seals & Downs actions; e-mail exchanges with J. Knauer and C. Pierce discussing draft complaints; revise exhibits to same
B010	13365849	3/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Conference with S. Eikenberry, T. Hall and H. Mappes regarding strategy for removal and transfer or other disposition of the state court interpleader cases
B010	13364075	3/15/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$	51.00	Conference with R. Stanley and e-mail exchanges with C. Pierce regarding adversary complaints and dollar amounts
B010	13364077	3/15/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$	51.00	Telephone conference with R. Stanley and S. Eikenberry regarding Bankruptcy Rule 9027
B010	13370794	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Conference with S. Eikenberry regarding removal of state court interpleader cases to federal court
B010	13370798	3/16/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to Trustee and co-counsel regarding removal of state court interpleader cases to federal court
B010	13367467	3/16/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$	76.50	Finish civil cover sheet information for Seals & Downs complaints
B010	13373250	3/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	Leave voicemail for J. Massouh regarding Friona interpleader
B010	13372795	3/17/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	4.20	\$	1,491.00	Draft 9019 motion and settlement agreement regarding Baca County Feed; finalize Atkinson Complaint; communicate with L. Lynch and D. DeNeal regarding same
B010	13372527	3/17/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$	25.50	E-mail exchange with S. Eikenberry discussing removal issues for interpleader actions
B010	13372532	3/17/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$	255.00	Finalize draft complaints and exhibits; e-mails with C. Pierce regarding same; e-mails and telephone conference with S. Herendeen discussing filing
B010	13376201	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Telephone call with attorney T. Johnston (for Gabriel Moreno) regarding Friona interpleader case

B010	13376203	3/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review and comment on S. Eikenberry's draft Notice of Removal for Wisconsin interpleader case Telephone conference with L. Lynch regarding draft complaints and revisions to same; e-mails and telephone conference with R. Stanley regarding communications with Seals's attorney
B010	13374784	3/18/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.60	\$ 153.00	
B010	13374791	3/18/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$ 25.50	E-mail S. Eikenberry regarding motion to transfer interpleader
B010	13380048	3/21/2011	12170 Castor, Amanda K.	Legal Assistant	0.10	\$ 20.00	Conference with S. Eikenberry regarding pleadings for removal
B010	13380049	3/21/2011	12170 Castor, Amanda K.	Legal Assistant	0.10	\$ 20.00	Call to plaintiff's counsel requesting copies of pleadings for removal
B010	13379957	3/21/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 142.00	Finalizing Atkinson Complaint Review e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with L. Lynch discussing potential edits complaints and discussing updated diverted check list; conference with R. Stanley strategizing regarding same; begin revising complaints
B010	13377997	3/21/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.70	\$ 433.50	
B010	13384046	3/22/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	4.20	\$ 1,491.00	Reviewing invoices regarding Atkinson matter; finalize Complaint regarding same; conference with S. Eikenberry regarding same; draft settlement documents for Baca E-mail exchanges with L. Lynch to finalize exhibits and complaints; conference with S. Laughlin regarding details for filing; update, finalize, and file Downs adversary complaint; e-mail copy of draft Seals complaint to attorney M. Sandlin
B010	13381334	3/22/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.80	\$ 459.00	
B010	13386440	3/23/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding Friona interpleader and related issues
B010	13390630	3/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Conference with S. Eikenberry regarding issues with removal of state court interpleader cases to federal court
B010	13390641	3/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from D. Donnellon requesting copy of Stipulated Protective Order negotiated between ELC Trustee and Fifth Third
B010	13390676	3/24/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Carr regarding Wisconsin interpleader action
B010	13394517	3/24/2011	12170 Castor, Amanda K.	Legal Assistant	1.20	\$ 240.00	Assemble Kansas pleadings in preparation of removal action Telephone conference with M. Sandlin, G. Seals counsel, discussing draft complaint and potential settlement discussion and e-mail summarizing same to J. Knauer, J. Carr, R. Stanley, and T. Hall
B010	13391817	3/25/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.70	\$ 178.50	
B010	13400195	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Read and reply to e-mails from S. Eikenberry regarding removal of state court interpleader cases
B010	13400199	3/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from T. Hall regarding Colorado interpleader case Telephone conference with M. Sandlin regarding proposed Seals complaint and upcoming meeting to discuss settlement; e-mail exchanges regarding same to J. Carr, J. Knauer, and R. Stanley
B010	13399548	3/29/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.60	\$ 153.00	
B010	13399560	3/29/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	Telephone conference with K. Goss in Judge Lorch's chambers regarding W. Downs summons and pretrial; conference with R. Stanley regarding same; e-mail J. Knauer regarding same
B010	13401912	3/30/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$ 255.00	Attention to court issuance of summons; review pretrial order; conferences with S. Herendeen regarding service and setting up case management
B010	13405971	3/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	Study e-mails and attached materials from J. Lovell regarding Oklahoma lawsuit by Nichols against Cactus involving funds at issue in Texas interpleader
B010	13405998	3/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Knauer regarding Texas interpleader case
B010	13406007	3/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to Trustee and co-counsel regarding R. Nichols affidavit in Oklahoma action against Cactus Growers
B010	13406011	3/31/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Knauer regarding status/interpleader cases
B010	13406553	3/31/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	E-mail exchanges with M. Sandlin (Seals attorney) regarding draft complaint and upcoming conference call Telephone conference with M. Sandlin discussing Seals complaint, checks on exhibit list and settlement issues; attention to follow-up e-mail from M. Sandlin regarding check list; analysis and e-mail summary of same to J. Knauer
B010	13410265	4/1/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$ 229.50	
B010	13414925	4/4/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$ 76.50	Telephone conference and e-mail exchange with M. Sandlin regarding settlement conference and draft complaint; e-mail with J. Knauer regarding same
B010	13418001	4/5/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Conference call with attorney for Gary Seals regarding potential settlement of claims
B010	13417365	4/5/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.40	\$ 357.00	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with M. Sandlin and R. Stanley regarding Seals complaint and settlement
B010	13423939	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study documents received from DSI regarding 125 head involved in Cactus interpleader allegedly sold by R. Nichols to Cactus
B010	13424199	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Lovell (counsel for Cactus) regarding Nichols interpleader claim
B010	13424206	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with J. Lovell (Cactus) regarding Nichols
B010	13424892	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with M. Sandlin regarding Gary Seals
B010	13424896	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review Cactus adversary complaint against R. Nichols et al
B010	13424902	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to J. Knauer et al. regarding Cactus adversary complaint against Nichols
B010	13425021	4/6/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from S. Eikenberry forwarding e-mail from attorney S. Newbern regarding Wisconsin interpleader Circulate Atkinson Complaint; review correspondence regarding Abilene Foods matter; review settlement correspondence regarding C&M Cattle; meet with P. O'Malley regarding above matters
B010	13424932	4/6/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.90	\$ 319.50	
B010	13420013	4/6/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.70	\$ 178.50	Telephone conference with M. Sandlin and R. Stanley regarding Seals complaint and possible resolution; e-mails with J. Knauer and T. Hall regarding same
B010	13425061	4/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail from M. Sandlin regarding Gary Seals
B010	13425066	4/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding G. Seals
B010	13424790	4/7/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.10	\$ 25.50	Attention to e-mail regarding Seals complaint/interview/settlement
B010	13431081	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour (Fifth Third) regarding Ohio lawsuit
B010	13431087	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding disputed cattle on feed at Friona claimed by Superior
B010	13431095	4/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review e-mails and correspondence from parties to Wisconsin interpleader case and conference with S. Eikenberry regarding same

B010	13434465	4/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Review Superior complaint and conference with R. Stanley
B010	13433498	4/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Review adversary complaint filed by Superior seeking declaratory judgment
B010	13438274	4/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Conference with J. Jaffe and J. Knauer regarding Superior adversary proceeding and claims against Superior
B010	13438730	4/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$ 110.00	E-mails J. Knauer et al. regarding Superior
B010	13437198	4/13/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	1.00	\$ 525.00	Extended conference with J. Carr regarding Superior lawsuit, background analysis of legal issues and strategies
B010	13437199	4/13/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	2.50	\$ 1,312.50	Quick review Superior complaint and begin research of derivative issues, strategy for response
B010	13437291	4/13/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.70	\$ 367.50	Several e-mails and conference with B. Stanley regarding background and strategy
B010	13438017	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call from attorney Clint Latham (Allen Dietrich) regarding interpleader claim
B010	13438060	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review and comment on S. Eikenberry's draft memo regarding state court interpleader cases
B010	13438065	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding issues raised by Superior's adversary proceeding
B010	13438077	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with J. Jaffe regarding Superior adversary
B010	13438089	4/13/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Research and analysis regarding allegations in Superior's adversary complaint
B010	13437429	4/13/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.80	\$ 931.00	Research Bankruptcy Code definitions of "commodity", "forward contract", "forward contract merchant", "swap agreement", "swap participant", and "settlement payment" for purposes of Superior declaratory judgment action
B010	13440120	4/14/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.30	\$ 442.00	Revise pleadings in state court proceedings and send follow-up e-mails to local counsel concerning whether motion to release funds should be filed in state or federal court and related issues
B010	13440126	4/14/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Telephone conference with court and participate in hearing concerning Texas interpleader
B010	13440646	4/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mails regarding Superior adversary status conference
B010	13444388	4/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding agenda items for omnibus hearing
B010	13444665	4/15/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Several e-mails concerning appearance, additional defense strategies
B010	13447439	4/15/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 142.00	Finalize Atkinson Complaint; communicate with S. Herendeen regarding same
B010	13443875	4/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.10	\$ 514.50	Research Superior's asserted defense to fraudulent and/or preferential transfer claims
B010	13455872	4/18/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Additional revisions to Colorado transfer documents
B010	13448306	4/18/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.40	\$ 210.00	Telephone conference with B. Stanley and T. hall regarding collateral Superior issues and suggestions for next steps
B010	13448313	4/18/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Review e-mail from T. Hall to J. Knauer with proposed Friona/ Superior partial settlement and response by B. Stanley
B010	13447143	4/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with T. Hall and J. Jaffe regarding Superior
B010	13447150	4/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and forward e-mail with copy of order transferring Friona interpleader to S.D. Indiana
B010	13456126	4/19/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$ 306.00	Revise pleadings in Colorado interpleader matters to combine motion to transfer funds with motion to authorize deposit of funds into court registry and e-mail local counsel and plaintiff's counsel concerning same
B010	13451766	4/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	E-mail from Downs counsel and conference with R. Stanley
B010	13451848	4/19/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Review status conference notes from Superior adversary and general case minute notes
B010	13451853	4/19/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Conference with B. Stanley regarding preparation of Pre-Trial Statement
B010	13451916	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mails to C. Pierce regarding G. Seals and W. Downs receivables
B010	13451924	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mails from C. Pierce regarding W. Downs receivables
B010	13451928	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding W. Downs receivables
B010	13451937	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail from C. Pierce regarding backup for G. Seals receivable
B010	13451941	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Voicemail from counsel for W. Downs
B010	13451945	4/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for A. Stosberg regarding W. Downs
B010	13450368	4/19/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.90	\$ 229.50	Work with J. Johns to load and review documents for Seals & Downs litigation; conference with R. Stanley regarding Seals interview
B010	13453564	4/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Conference with J. Jaffe regarding Superior and possible motion for summary judgment
B010	13453929	4/20/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.30	\$ 157.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding threatened timing of Superior MSJ and review rules regarding same
B010	13453284	4/20/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.30	\$ 760.50	Study Superior adversary complaint
B010	13453298	4/20/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with A. Stosberg regarding W. Downs adversary
B010	13453316	4/20/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.30	\$ 563.50	Research case law on definitions of forward contract and forward contract merchant
B010	13457102	4/21/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	E-mails and telephone conference with T. Hall regarding scheduling Pre-Trial Conference in Superior adversary
B010	13457103	4/21/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	Conference with B. Stanley regarding Pre-Trial Statement, conference
B010	13456723	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from M. Sandlin regarding G. Seals
B010	13456739	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to J. Knauer et al. regarding G. Seals
B010	13456751	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Voicemail from and reply voicemail to A. Stosberg regarding W. Downs
B010	13456759	4/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with T. Hall regarding Superior
B010	13458492	4/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	3.60	\$ 1,224.00	Attention to revising motions and orders in state interpleader matters in order to combine motion to transfer case with motion to transfer funds and e-mail local counsel concerning same; e-mail atty for multiple defendants in Wisconsin matter
B010	13459667	4/22/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	5.50	\$ 3,217.50	Work on draft Defendant's Statement for inclusion in Joint Pretrial Statement in Superior adversary proceeding

B010	13467249	4/25/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.60	\$ 544.00	Further revisions to motions to transfer in state interpleader matters
B010	13463508	4/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Review and revise pre-hearing settlement regarding Superior claims and defenses
B010	13463597	4/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Read and reply to e-mail from M. Sandlin regarding G. Seals
B010	13463601	4/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Study recent case law under Bankruptcy Code Section 546(e)
B010	13463604	4/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.00	\$ 1,755.00	Meeting with J. Knauer, DSI personnel and co-counsel
B010	13463610	4/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with Superior counsel C. Moore regarding preliminary pretrial statement
B010	13463616	4/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from attorney C. Latham regarding Allen Dietrich claim in Texas interpleader action
B010	13464625	4/25/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	4.00	\$ 1,760.00	Meet with R. Stanley regarding pending litigation background and participate in staff strategy meeting with Trustee, DSI, R. Stanley, J. Carr, and T. Hall
B010	13464981	4/25/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 35.50	Conference with S. Herendeen regarding Atkinson adversary complaint
B010	13462981	4/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.80	\$ 196.00	Review Superior position statement and find case law cites
B010	13464505	4/25/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.20	\$ 306.00	Participate in strategy meeting with R. Stanley, J. Carr, J. Knauer, D. DeNeal, T. Hall, and DTS
B010	13466934	4/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding Superior and transfers within 90 day from PT SM
B010	13466498	4/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.50	\$ 877.50	Meeting with J. Hanlon and K. Paulson regarding potential consulting services
B010	13466562	4/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.30	\$ 1,930.50	Continue work on preliminary pretrial statement for Superior adversary proceeding
B010	13466602	4/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mail to C. Moore with Defendant's Statement for preliminary pretrial statement in Superior adversary proceeding
B010	13470369	4/26/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 132.00	Exchange e-mails with E. Lynch regarding communicating about records for adversary proceeding with Superior
B010	13470373	4/26/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.90	\$ 396.00	Review and edit pretrial statement and conferences with R. Stanley
B010	13470374	4/26/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	2.10	\$ 924.00	Begin research and analysis of Superior's "forward contracts" arguments
B010	13465250	4/26/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.10	\$ 280.50	Conference with R. Stanley regarding Seals interview; review relevant documents in preparation for same
B010	13465144	4/26/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	1.70	\$ 748.00	Develop investigative strategy for identification and recovery of assets
B010	13470096	4/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding discovery additional payments to Seals not shown on SOFA
B010	13469338	4/27/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.20	\$ 105.00	E-mails B. Stanley, et al. regarding Superior Pre-Trial lawyer conference
B010	13469387	4/27/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.40	\$ 210.00	Review final joint Superior Pre-Trial Statement and e-mail B. Stanley regarding topics to cover in conference
B010	13469651	4/27/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Preparation for G. Seals interview
B010	13469655	4/27/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference call with C. Latham and B. Johnston regarding Dietrich & Bynum claims in Friona interpleader
B010	13469664	4/27/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Review e-mail from C. Moore (Superior's counsel) with draft joint pretrial statement
B010	13469668	4/27/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	E-mail to T. Hall et al. regarding points to address at attorneys conference for Superior adversary
B010	13479983	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 220.00	Dictate notes from meetings
B010	13479991	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 88.00	Exchange e-mails regarding attorneys conferences
B010	13480009	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$ 264.00	Meet with H. Mappes and R. Stanley regarding Gary Seals
B010	13480020	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 220.00	Participate in conference calls with R. Stanley
B010	13480025	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 88.00	E-mails regarding W. Downs' answer deadline and interview
B010	13480030	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 220.00	Review pretrial submission from C. Moore and R. Stanley's comments
B010	13480037	4/27/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 220.00	Initial research of P&S Act registration requires for possible response to Superior
B010	13468576	4/27/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.60	\$ 408.00	Review documents and meeting with R. Stanley and K. Toner to prepare for G. Seals interview/meeting tomorrow
B010	13476974	4/28/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	E-mail counsel for plaintiffs in Kansas and Wisconsin matters; e-mail Superior attorney concerning Kansas matter
B010	13472449	4/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Prepare for attorneys conference with Superior counsel
B010	13472456	4/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with K. Toner regarding issues in Superior adversary case
B010	13474108	4/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.00	\$ 1,755.00	Meeting with G. Seals and counsel
B010	13480234	4/28/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$ 308.00	Prepare for and participate in attorneys' conference regarding pretrial schedule and submission
B010	13480237	4/28/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 132.00	Strategize regarding UCC and 546(e) issues
B010	13480243	4/28/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	4.00	\$ 1,760.00	Prepare for and participate in G. Seals interview
B010	13480247	4/28/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 88.00	Read J. Carr letter to W. Cole regarding recovery of ELC contracts
B010	13471540	4/28/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.40	\$ 867.00	Attend meeting/interview with G. Seals and counsel and J. Knauer, R. Stanley, J. Hanlon, and K. Toner
							Telephone conference with A. Stosberg regarding motion for continuance of pretrial conference and interview dates; revise draft motion regarding same; e-mail S. Herendeen
B010	13471541	4/28/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.40	\$ 102.00	regarding filing of same; e-mail with K. Toner and R. Stanley with update
B010	13472732	4/28/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	3.20	\$ 1,408.00	Meeting and settlement conference with G. Seals and counsel; develop strategy for investigation and resolution of claims against Seals
B010	13476937	4/29/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$ 238.00	E-mail local counsel in interpleader matters concerning motions to transfer; telephone conference with D. Abt (attorney for plaintiff in Wisconsin interpleader matter)
B010	13480292	4/29/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding Gary Seals
B010	13480366	4/29/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 88.00	Attention to Appearance in Friona, et al. interpleader
B010	13480371	4/29/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$ 352.00	Study trustee's public notices and updates on Gibson bankruptcy for use in witness exams
B010	13480373	4/29/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 132.00	Respond to C. Moore regarding joint statement



B010	13480378	4/29/2011	12011 Toner, Kevin M.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	88.00	Read document request to G. Seals
B010	13475479	4/29/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.20	\$	51.00	Attention to filing motion to continue pretrial; e-mails with S. Herendeen and A. Stosberg regarding same
B010	13475480	4/29/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	0.30	\$	76.50	E-mail to M. Sandlin summarizing the follow-up items stemming from the G. Seals meeting/interview
B010	13480274	4/29/2011	16634 Myers, Zachary A.	Associate	0.20	\$	49.00	Review and analyze correspondence on forfeiture and remission issues
B010	13480162	4/29/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.50	\$	220.00	Review and analysis of forfeiture complaint and related materials
B011	13229801	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Gibson 341 meeting
B011	13239071	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00	Conference with D. DeNeal regarding Gibson and East-West 341
B011	13238429	1/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	4.50	\$	1,102.50	Participate in 341 meetings
B011	13291870	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$	122.50	Meeting with S. Eikenberry in preparation for Gibsons' continued 341 meeting
B011	13296352	2/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$	98.00	Meeting with S. Eikenberry regarding Gibson 341 meeting
B011	13304317	2/18/2011	12981 O'Neill Ghuman, Shiv	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	71.00	Review background information regarding adversary proceedings; communicate with H. Mappes regarding same
B011	13315341	2/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50	Revise motions for 2004 exams Review existing Federal Forfeiture Law research and provide input to W. Ponader on the scope and reach of the Federal Forfeiture Laws and defenses which may be asserted by the
B012	13254107	1/24/2011	10773 Claffey, Stephen A.	Partner	0.90	\$	472.50	Estate
B013	13191526	1/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$	294.00	Draft objection to Cattlemen stay relief motion in East-West Trucking case
B013	13194678	1/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.30	\$	563.50	Draft objection to Cattlemen stay relief motion
B013	13194941	1/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Draft objection to stay relief motion filed by Friona, J&F and Cactus Growers
B013	13196651	1/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$	245.00	Revise objection to Cattlemen stay relief motion
B013	13196660	1/5/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.50	\$	857.50	Draft and research objection to stay relief motion filed by Friona, Cactus and J&F
B013	13200055	1/6/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$	370.00	Conference related to objections to stay relief motions
B013	13199575	1/6/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$	440.00	Review and revise objection to motion relief from stay regarding interpleader and conference with D. DeNeal
B013	13199281	1/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.00	\$	490.00	Draft and revise objection to stay relief motion filed by Friona et al.
B013	13199287	1/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.60	\$	392.00	Draft objection to stay relief motion filed by Republic Bank & Trust Co.
B013	13206663	1/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.50	\$	1,665.00	Review and respond to objections filed related to stay relief motions and supplemental objections
B013	13201967	1/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	2.50	\$	612.50	Finalize and file objections to stay relief motions
B013	13207192	1/10/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.00	\$	1,480.00	Review new filings in case related to stay relief and begin to prepare for hearing
B013	13209250	1/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from T. Hall regarding motion for relief from stay for Texas interpleader action
B013	13209255	1/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Conference with T. Hall regarding strategy for dealing with interpleader actions
B013	13209261	1/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Conference with H. Mappes regarding jurisdictional issues in interpleader actions
B013	13209303	1/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Conference with T. Hall and H. Mappes regarding operation to stay relief in interpleader actions and related issues
B013	13216601	1/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.00	\$	1,110.00	Finalize preparation for hearings in Eastern and East West on Stay Relief Motions and Trustee's Motions
B013	13216605	1/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.20	\$	814.00	Hearing and negotiation of settlement for discovery and continuance in East West Trucking
B013	13216606	1/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$	740.00	Hearing on stay relief motions and Trustee's motion
B013	13212646	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.10	\$	55.00	Telephone call A. Morris attorney Republic regarding lift stay resolution
B013	13218972	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail from J. Knauer regarding Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13218978	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	E-mail to J. Massouh (counsel for Cattlemen's) regarding Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13219106	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Read and reply to e-mails from D. Donnellon (attorney for First Bank & Trust) regarding Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13219124	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's video deposition
B013	13219136	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13219145	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail from D. Donnellon regarding Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13219157	1/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	E-mail to J. Knauer regarding questions raised in Donnellon e-mail concerning Cattlemen's deposition
B013	13223267	1/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Review drafts of proposed agreed entry for partial stay relief sought by Cattlemen's Feedlot
B013	13223280	1/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50	E-mail to attorneys for other interested parties regarding proposed entry on Cattlemen's motion for stay relief
B013	13223294	1/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50	Make additional revisions to proposed agreed entry on Cattlemen's motion for stay relief
B013	13223298	1/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00	Receive report from J. Carr and T. Hall on potential lines of questioning for Cattlemen's deposition/2004 exam
B013	13223308	1/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	E-mail to counsel for other parties with revised draft of agreed entry on Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13225455	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	Study Cattlemen's revised draft agreed entry partially granting motion for stay relief and compare to prior redline drafts
B013	13226535	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$	585.00	Conference call with J. Carr and R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's 2004 examination
B013	13226560	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$	585.00	Conference call with counsel for other interested parties regarding draft agreed entry partially granting Cattlemen's motion for stay relief Review e-mail from Cattlemen's counsel with proposed final revisions to draft agreed entry partially granting motion for stay relief and forward same to J. Carr and T. Hall with
B013	13226568	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00	comments
B013	13226581	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50	Reply to e-mail from D. Donnellon regarding order of examination and exhibits for Cattlemen's 2004 exam
B013	13226590	1/18/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.20	\$	1,287.00	Prepare for Cattlemen's 2004 exam, including selection of exhibits and e-mail to Cattlemen's counsel regarding missing documents



B013	13228539	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mails from R. LaTour and J. Donnellon regarding Cattlemen's 2004 examination
B013	13228545	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to all counsel regarding availability of video hookup for Cattlemen's examination
B013	13228550	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	Continue fact gathering for Cattlemen's examination
B013	13228562	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$ 468.00	E-mail to counsel for other parties with copies of exhibits for Cattlemen's examination
B013	13228574	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	Telephone call with E. Lynch concerning information for use in Cattlemen's 2004 examination
B013	13228579	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.10	\$ 1,813.50	Work on examination outline for Cattlemen's 2004 examination
B013	13228584	1/19/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	E-mails from and phone call with C. Pierce regarding cash flow in Cattlemen's transactions with East-West Trucking and Eastern Livestock
B013	13232220	1/20/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$ 409.50	Continue and complete outline preparation for Cattlemen's 2004 examination
B013	13232225	1/20/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone call from R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's
B013	13232229	1/20/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	7.90	\$ 4,621.50	Conduct 2004 exam of Cattlemen's Feedlot, LTD
B013	13243869	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding Cattlemen and response
B013	13241377	1/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	7.00	\$ 4,095.00	Work on draft opposition to Cattlemen's motion for stay relief in East-West bankruptcy
B013	13243461	1/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Revise supplemental response to Cattlemen's motion in East-West and research relevant case law
B013	13245169	1/26/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.40	\$ 148.00	Review additional pleading draft in Cattlemen's lawsuit
B013	13246447	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.10	\$ 605.00	Review and revise additional response to Cattlemen's motion and conference with D. DeNeal
B013	13244960	1/26/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review and revise draft supplemental opposition to Cattlemen's stay relief motion in East-West case
B013	13246295	1/26/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.10	\$ 269.50	Revise supplemental objection to Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13249007	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	3.20	\$ 1,760.00	Review and revise supplemental objection to Cattlemen's motion, e-mail and telephone call R. LaTour regarding objection; conference with D. DeNeal
B013	13249297	1/27/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$ 220.50	Finalize and file supplemental objection to Cattlemen's stay relief motion and appendix
B013	13251323	1/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding East-West Trustee and First Bank withdrawing objections to Cattlemen's stay relief motion on East-West case
B013	13270265	2/1/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.80	\$ 296.00	Review documents and -commission structure regarding Cattlemen's action
B013	13259362	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Review and comment on D. DeNeal's draft response to Cattlemen's requests for production of documents in connection with stay relief motion in East-West case
B013	13259366	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Exchange e-mails with D. DeNeal regarding production of documents to Cattlemen's in connection with stay relief motion in East-West case
B013	13259383	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Research regarding deadline for response to Cattlemen's document requests under Bankruptcy Rules
B013	13259390	2/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to R. LaTour and K. Britt (counsel for Fifth Third) regarding extension of protective order for Fifth Third documents to apply to East-West case
B013	13270419	2/2/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Continue review of documents being produced related to Cattlemen's and begin preparation for hearing
B013	13264209	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	Review pleadings regarding motions to abandon and for relief from stay filed in T. Gibson case
B013	13262151	2/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Read and reply to e-mails from E. Lynch regarding documents responsive to Cattlemen's document requests
B013	13262197	2/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Study completion of documents provided by E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's Lot 1220
B013	13262216	2/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to E. Lynch and D. DeNeal regarding compilation of documents concerning Cattlemen's Lot 1220
B013	13270051	2/3/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding responses to Cattlemen's document production request
B013	13266488	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study documents from E. Lynch regarding Cattlemen's Lot 1296
B013	13266492	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Read and reply to e-mail from E. Lynch regarding document collection for response to Cattlemen's document requests
B013	13266505	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$ 468.00	Study transcript of 341 meeting in East-West case for possible use in connection with opposition to Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13266511	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Follow-up e-mail to Fifth-Third's counsel (R. LaTour and K. Britt) regarding protective order issues for production of documents to Cattlemen's
B013	13266521	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's document requests
B013	13266536	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's document requests
B013	13266550	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding timing of response to Cattlemen's document request
B013	13266561	2/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.50	\$ 1,462.50	Review and organize debtor's documents for production in connection with Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13272128	2/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.30	\$ 851.00	Begin reviewing documents related to Friday's hearings on Cattlemen's and interpleader
B013	13270427	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Study additional ELC documents for possible production to Cattlemen's
B013	13270432	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding document production to Cattlemen's
B013	13270439	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding Cattlemen's document request to Fifth Third and possible production of Fifth Third documents to Cattlemen's
B013	13270479	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.30	\$ 760.50	Prepare additional debtor documents for production to Cattlemen's
B013	13270485	2/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Massouh regarding response to Cattlemen's document requests
B013	13279882	2/7/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.00	\$ 370.00	Conference call with participants in Texas interpleader action and discuss with R. Stanley
B013	13275905	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$ 165.00	Conference with D. DeNeal and e-mails regarding Gibson hearings regarding motion relief from stay
B013	13274615	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail from J. Massouh regarding exhibits for hearing on Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13274623	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding hearing on Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13274750	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Conference call with counsel for Texas interpleader plaintiffs regarding their motion for stay relief
B013	13274780	2/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$ 409.50	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13275840	2/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Prepare for and participate in hearing on First Bank & Trust motion for emergency hearing as stay relief motion
B013	13278160	2/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's

B013	13277405	2/8/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	3.50	\$ 892.50	Research interpleader actions and availability of attorneys' fees for interested plaintiffs for R. Stanley in anticipation of pretrial conference regarding relief from stay
B013	13280916	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.10	\$ 643.50	Conference call with R. LaTour (Fifth Third counsel), J. Carr et al. regarding Cattlemen's and Friona stay relief motions
B013	13280932	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone calls with J. Massouh regarding Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13281001	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	E-mails to R. LaTour, J. Carr, J. Knauer et al. regarding Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13281007	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with J. Young (East-West Trustee's counsel) regarding Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13281034	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Read and reply to e-mail from E. Lynch regarding additional document requests
B013	13281038	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$ 234.00	Study cases relating to interpleader plaintiff's ability to recover attorneys fees
B013	13281039	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$ 468.00	Finish review of transcript of East-West Trucking 341 meeting for testimony related to Cattlemen's
B013	13281072	2/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Study cases regarding priority of secured lender versus unpaid seller for purposes of preparing for pre-trial hearing of Texas interpleader plaintiffs' stay relief motion
B013	13280599	2/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Draft joinder to Trustee's objection to First Bank stay relief motion in Gibson case
B013	13280035	2/9/2011	16611 Mappes, Harmony A.	Associate	1.00	\$ 255.00	Follow-up research regarding fees in interpleader actions and conference with R. Stanley regarding same
B013	13285208	2/10/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$ 147.00	Review and begin drafting response to GE stay relief motion
B013	13292391	2/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.70	\$ 259.00	Draft order on pretrial conference hearing in Texas interpleader
B013	13292393	2/11/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.20	\$ 444.00	Telephone call with client regarding open issues and asset recovery
B013	13286302	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding Friona stay relief motion
B013	13286321	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.00	\$ 585.00	Participation in pre-trial conference on motion for stay relief by Friona et al.
B013	13286425	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference call with counsel for interested parties regarding discovery issues
B013	13286527	2/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Review and comment on draft pre-hearing order for Friona stay relief motion
B013	13295313	2/14/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Continue to negotiate order on pretrial hearing
B013	13295030	2/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$ 220.00	Review and revise draft agreed entry regarding First Bank and Trustee motion for relief stay and conference with D. DeNeal
B013	13291479	2/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mails from J. Lovell and D. LeBas regarding proposed pretrial order on stay relief motions by Friona et al.
B013	13291498	2/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study movants' redline of draft pre-hearing order on motion for stay relief regarding Texas interpleader action and propose revisions to same
B013	13291511	2/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding revisions to pre-hearing order regarding Friona motion for stay relief
B013	13291537	2/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study and comment on D. Donnellon's proposed revisions to draft pre-hearing order on Texas interpleader stay relief motion
B013	13291560	2/14/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone conference with J. Massouh regarding Friona stay motion and Cattlemen's stay motion Calls with counsel for GE Capital and First Bank and Trust regarding stay relief motions; revise and finalize joinder objection regarding First Bank motion for stay relief; review and
B013	13291932	2/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$ 171.50	revise agreed entry regarding First Bank stay relief
B013	13295374	2/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	1.60	\$ 592.00	Review proposed revisions to pre-hearing order on Texas Interpleader; discuss with R. Stanley; revise order and recirculate
B013	13294962	2/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study and discuss with T. Hall reconciliation of opposing parties' proposed edits to draft pretrial conference order regarding stay relief motion for Texas interpleader action
B013	13294968	2/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour (Fifth Third counsel) regarding stay relief motions - Friona and Cattlemen's
B013	13294977	2/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Review and comment on draft pretrial order regarding Friona stay relief motion
B013	13296346	2/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Review, revise and comment on agreed order regarding First Bank stay relief motion in Gibson bankruptcy; serve request for production of documents regarding same
B013	13308714	2/17/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Conference with B. Stanley regarding Gibson 341 hearing and interpleader matters
B013	13301103	2/17/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference call with Judge Lorch regarding form of pretrial order on Friona stay relief motion
B013	13306430	2/19/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.20	\$ 74.00	Send e-mail to GE counsel for agreed entry on stay relief
B013	13311660	2/22/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.80	\$ 612.00	Detailed review of state court interpleader complaints and outline facts and issues related to same
B013	13317260	2/23/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$ 272.00	Draft and revise letter concerning payments for cattle bought directly from Eastern in Kansas state interpleader action
B013	13313859	2/23/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with J. Massouh and J. Huffaker regarding Cattlemen's and Friona stay relief motions
B013	13314016	2/23/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to J. Knauer, J. Carr et al. regarding Cattlemen's and Friona stay relief motions
B013	13320863	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Telephone call from J. Massouh regarding Friona stay relief motion
B013	13320869	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Study draft of Agreed Entry and Order for Friona stay relief motion prepared by Friona's counsel
B013	13320965	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to R. LaTour et al. regarding Texas interpleader plaintiffs' proposed Agreed Entry and Order for limited stay relief
B013	13321662	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with J. Massouh (Friona's counsel) regarding draft Agreed Entry and proposed Order for limited stay relief for Texas interpleader action
B013	13321668	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$ 351.00	Study Superior Livestock's pre-hearing statement regarding stay relief for Texas interpleader action
B013	13321670	2/25/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	E-mail to J. Carr et al. regarding Superior Pre hearing Statement
B013	13320529	2/25/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.30	\$ 318.50	Review and draft notes regarding Superior brief
B013	13324106	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.80	\$ 440.00	Review Superior pre-hearing settlement
B013	13324901	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Study pre-hearing statement by Bynum Ranch et al. regarding Texas interpleader action
B013	13325018	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with attorney James B. Johnston (Bynum Ranch et al.) regarding Bynum Ranch's pre-hearing statement

B013	13325025	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	2.00	\$ 1,170.00	Conference with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding Superior pre-hearing statement and potential responses
B013	13325032	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Voicemail from J. Massouh regarding Friona stay relief motion
B013	13325040	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to R. LaTour et al. regarding draft Agreed Entry for Friona stay relief motion
B013	13325054	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Friona stay relief motion and related pre-hearing statements
B013	13325059	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with R. LaTour regarding draft Agreed Entry on Friona stay relief and pre-hearing statements
B013	13325072	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for J. Massouh regarding approval of draft Agreed Entry
B013	13325076	2/28/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to E. Lynch regarding Bynum Ranch pre-hearing statement
B013	13323383	2/28/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	3.50	\$ 857.50	Research and begin drafting "Responsive Pre-hearing Statement" regarding Texas interpleader stay relief and Superior claims
B013	13329381	3/1/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Review file and online docket for Texas interpleader complaints and forward same to B. Stanley
B013	13328747	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read and reply to e-mail from J. Massouh with revised draft Agreed Entry and Order on Friona stay relief
B013	13328754	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer et al. regarding Agreed Entry for Friona stay relief
B013	13328764	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.70	\$ 409.50	Telephone calls with E. Lynch regarding Bynum Pre-Hearing Statement
B013	13328771	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Read lengthy e-mail from D. Donnellon
B013	13328899	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to J. Knauer, J. Carr et al. regarding Donnellon e-mail
B013	13329538	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$ 351.00	Work on Responsive Pre-Hearing Statement for Bynum Group
B013	13330834	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for J. Johnston (attorney for Bynum Group) regarding pre-hearing statement
B013	13330855	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference call with T. Hall and C. Bowles (Superior's counsel) regarding Friona interpleader and related matters
B013	13330871	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Conference with T. Hall regarding procedural mechanisms for resolving Superior's issues
B013	13330889	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Conference with J. Carr regarding response to Superior's pre-hearing statement
B013	13330907	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with J. Johnston regarding Bynum Group Pre-hearing Statement
B013	13330918	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for C. Bowles (Superior counsel) regarding Superior Pre-hearing Statement
B013	13330936	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.90	\$ 526.50	Work on draft motion to vacate requirement for responsive pre-hearing statements
B013	13330962	3/1/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to C. Bowles (Superior's counsel) and J. Johnston (Bynum Group's counsel) regarding draft motion to vacate requirement for responsive pre-hearing statements
B013	13330283	3/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$ 171.50	Draft and file joinder to trustee's objection to stay relief motion filed by Peoples Bank of Pickett County
B013	13330292	3/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Revise proposed order regarding GE's motion for relief from stay
B013	13330310	3/1/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.40	\$ 98.00	Research merits of stay relief motions filed by FPC financial and John Deere
B013	13337918	3/2/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$ 68.00	Strategize with R. Stanley concerning interpleader actions
B013	13335505	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Review draft order vacating requirement for responsive pre-hearing statements for Texas interpleader stay motion
B013	13335509	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	E-mail to C. Bowles (Superior) and J. Johnston (Bynum) with draft order vacating requirement for responsive pre-hearing statements for Texas interpleader stay motions
B013	13335513	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Voicemail and e-mail from C. Bowles regarding responsive pre-hearing statements in connection with Texas interpleader stay motion
B013	13335520	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	E-mails from J. Massouh (Friona's counsel) and K. Goss (Court deputy) regarding Judge Lorch's request for a telephonic conference on the Texas interpleader stay motions
B013	13335528	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Telephone call with C. Bowles regarding responsive purchasing statements in connection with Texas interpleader stay relief motions
B013	13335594	3/2/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Telephone call with J. Johnston regarding Bynum transaction
B013	13337292	3/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.20	\$ 660.00	Review and revise pre-hearing settlement regarding Friona and counter to Superior settlement
B013	13336755	3/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$ 58.50	Leave voicemail for J. Massouh regarding Friona and Cattlemen's stay motions
B013	13336763	3/3/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.20	\$ 702.00	Study J. Carr's draft response to Superior's pre-hearing statement and revise same into the form of a draft letter to Superior's counsel
B013	13336653	3/3/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.50	\$ 122.50	Review and revise trustee's draft "Responsive Pre-hearing Statement"
B013	13341416	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.50	\$ 275.00	conference with R. Stanley regarding Friona/Superior and pretrial conference
B013	13342180	3/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with R. LaTour (Fifth Third) regarding Texas interpleader stay motions and pre-hearing statements
B013	13342189	3/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$ 292.50	Telephone conference with Court regarding Texas interpleader stay relief motions
B013	13342196	3/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with J. Johnston regarding Bynum Group pre-hearing statement
B013	13349174	3/7/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$ 102.00	Review interpleader matters to determine what parties are represented by counsel and e-mail counsel for plaintiff in Colorado interpleader matter concerning same
B013	13344966	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$ 175.50	Analysis of Bynum Cattlemen stay relief motion
B013	13344998	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Further analysis of Superior stay relief claim
B013	13345011	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding Superior stay relief motion
B013	13345018	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$ 351.00	Conference call with R. LaTour and J. Carr regarding Superior stay relief motion
B013	13345022	3/7/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$ 117.00	Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Bynum stay relief motion
B013	13344901	3/7/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.00	\$ 245.00	Research and draft limited objections to stay relief motions filed by FPC Financial and Deere & Company

							Review and revise response to C. Bowles (Superior) regarding pre-hearing statement regarding Friona interpleader; e-mail J. Knauer et al.; conference with R. Stanley and T. Hall
B013	13351300	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	1.70	\$	935.00 regarding financing of contracts with Friona et al. to sell cattle
B013	13349158	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50 Conference with J. Carr and T. Hall regarding theories for defeating Superior's relief from stay claims
B013	13349165	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50 E-mail from J. Massouh regarding Fifth Third's motion for default judgment against Okie
B013	13349170	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50 E-mail to R. LaTour requesting forbearance from seeking default judgment against Okie
B013	13349182	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00 Review and comment on J. Carr's revised draft letter to C. Bowles in response to Superior's pre-hearing statement
B013	13349191	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00 Exchange voice mails with R. LaTour regarding Fifth Third's motion for default judgment against Okie Farms as it relates to the Cattlemen's issue
B013	13349198	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00 Telephone call with C. Bowles regarding response to Superior's pre-hearing statement and related issues
B013	13349315	3/8/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00 Telephone call with J. Massouh regarding Friona interpleader stay relief issues
B013	13347641	3/8/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50 Finalize and file limited objections to FPC and Deere stay relieve motions
B013	13352326	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.40	\$	220.00 Telephone call C. Latham, attorney for Dietrich regarding amounts paid in to Friona interpleader
B013	13351033	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.30	\$	175.50 Read and reply to various e-mails regarding continuance of Cattlemen's stay relief motion
B013	13351036	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50 E-mail to counsel of record regarding attorneys' conference
B013	13351070	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00 Read and reply to e-mails from counsel for other parties regarding attorneys' conference
B013	13351077	3/9/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00 Read and reply to e-mail from S. Weigand (First Bank counsel) regarding protective order
B013	13351368	3/9/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.20	\$	294.00 Draft and file objection to stay relief motion filed by Peoples Bank
B013	13365439	3/10/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00 Review agreed entry regarding Texas interpleader action and call and message to Perschenbacher's attorney
B013	13354485	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50 E-mail to counsel of record regarding attorneys' conference
B013	13354517	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.10	\$	58.50 E-mail from J. Donnellon regarding discovery
B013	13354530	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50 Teleconference with D. LeBas, J. Massouh and R. LaTour regarding Friona interpleader
B013	13354536	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.40	\$	819.00 Attorneys' teleconference regarding discovery and interpleader issues
B013	13354539	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.50	\$	292.50 Conference with J. Carr regarding planning for March 11 hearing
B013	13354590	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	1.80	\$	1,053.00 Work on memorandum to all counsel of record regarding interpleaders and potential Superior AP
B013	13354597	3/10/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	234.00 Read and reply to e-mail from D. Donnellon regarding proposed plan for managing interpleaders and Superior adversary proceeding
B013	13363355	3/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00 Attention to issues related to Colorado interpleader matter and call to attorney for Perschenbacher
B013	13358168	3/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	4.50	\$	2,632.50 Omnibus hearing
B013	13417920	3/15/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	0.90	\$	333.00 Review and revise orders on stay relief in ELC and E/W Trucking for Deere and FPC Financial Research and advise regarding adversary proceeding structure and scheduling with respect to transfer of Interpleaders (1.2); revise discovery production connection with Texas
B013	13375806	3/18/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.80	\$	441.00 Interpleader (0.6)
B013	13381712	3/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.20	\$	110.00 Conference with T. Hall regarding possible stay violation R. Nichols
B013	13404588	3/30/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00 Telephone conference with counsel for plaintiff in Colorado interpleader matter
B013	13404602	3/30/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00 Draft e-mail to other counsel in Wisconsin interpleader matter concerning general strategy
B013	13414183	4/4/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00 E-mail counsel for plaintiffs in state interpleader matters concerning joining in motion to transfer funds
B013	13417790	4/4/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$	238.00 Conduct research related to transferring state interpleader matters, which have been removed to bankruptcy court, to the Southern District of Indiana Bankruptcy court
B013	13417791	4/4/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.20	\$	408.00 Begin work on motion to transfer venue in Kansas action
B013	13417666	4/5/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.10	\$	374.00 Work on preparing motions to transfer funds in Wisconsin and Colorado matters
B013	13417669	4/5/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00 Revise motion to transfer case to Southern District of Indiana in Kansas interpleader matter
B013	13417672	4/5/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$	238.00 Begin work on revising Kansas motion to transfer case to Southern District of Indiana for Colorado case, including incorporating Colorado case law and reflecting Colorado facts Send follow-up e-mails to other counsel in state interpleader matters concerning plans an soliciting responses concerning whether they will object or agree to transferring funds and
B013	13417674	4/5/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00 case
B013	13420953	4/6/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.90	\$	465.50 Research Peoples Bank of Pickett County stay relief motion and draft supplemental objection
B013	13430614	4/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00 Review notice of appearance in Colorado interpleader matter
B013	13430622	4/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00 Review e-mail from attorney for multiple defendants in Wisconsin matter
B013	13430643	4/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.80	\$	272.00 Review local rules from Texas bankruptcy court concerning participating in video hearing and/or participating by telephone
B013	13430654	4/11/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.30	\$	102.00 Strategize with B. Stanley concerning transfers and Wisconsin issues
B013	13430774	4/11/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.90	\$	220.50 Revise supplemental objection to motion for relief from stay filed by Peoples Bank and Trust Company of Pickett County
B013	13432537	4/12/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	1.90	\$	646.00 Revise motions to transfer in three state court interpleader matters
B013	13432547	4/12/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.90	\$	306.00 Draft memo concerning status of interpleader matters and future plans for same
B013	13432433	4/12/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	117.00 Respond to e-mail from J. Huffaker regarding draft motion for continuance
B013	13432354	4/12/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50 Revise and file supplemental objection to stay relief motion filed by Peoples Bank and Trust Company of Pickett County
B013	13440039	4/13/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.40	\$	136.00 Revise memo concerning interpleader matters



B013	13437428	4/13/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.70	\$	171.50	Calls with Gibson Trustee and appraiser regarding stay relief motions filed by PBI Bank and Peoples Bank and Trust Company of Pickett County, respectively
B013	13440132	4/14/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.50	\$	170.00	Revise memo concerning interpleader matter on including information about Texas interpleader and e-mail J. Knauer regarding same
B013	13440570	4/14/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	0.60	\$	147.00	Negotiate regarding stay relief motion filed by Peoples Bank and Trust of Pickett County
B013	13443750	4/15/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	E-mail plaintiff's attorney in Colorado interpleader action
B015	13286593	2/11/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.10	\$	44.00	Review and analysis of seizure warrant
B015	13296349	2/15/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	1.60	\$	392.00	Participate in strategy conference call
B015	13424038	4/7/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.50	\$	220.00	Review and analysis of transcript from East-West 341 meeting of creditors
B015	13456460	4/21/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.40	\$	176.00	Review and analysis of forfeiture complaint regarding seized funds; conference with T. Hall regarding same
								Copy data received from counsel to the network for further analysis and review.; process Electronically Stored Information into a database compatible format for review; troubleshoot processing exception errors.; create and modify database to reflect attorney and review requirements; load FT000001 - FT010844 into said database; create review
B017	13258785	1/24/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	2.50	\$	575.00	batches for review team.
B017	13326734	2/24/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	1.00	\$	230.00	Consult with case team on document review strategies
B017	13417500	3/10/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	1.00	\$	230.00	Telephone conference call regarding how to identify potential relevant electronic document sources.
								Copy data received from counsel to the network for further analysis and review.; Process Electronically Stored Information into a database compatible format for review; troubleshoot processing exception errors.; modify database to reflect attorney and review requirements; load ED-JK 0000001 - ED-JK 00000177 into said database; create review
B017	13492058	4/19/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	1.00	\$	230.00	batches for review team.
								Copy data received from counsel to the network for further analysis and review.; Process Electronically Stored Information into a database compatible format for review; troubleshoot processing exception errors.; Create and modify database to reflect attorney and review requirements; load ED-3RD 0000001 - ED-3RD 00002583 into said database;
B017	13492100	4/20/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	2.50	\$	575.00	create review batches for review team.
								Copy data received from counsel to the network for further analysis and review.; Process Electronically Stored Information into a database compatible format for review; troubleshoot processing exception errors.; modify database to reflect attorney and review requirements; load ED-JK 00000178 - ED-JK 00000228 into said database; create review
B017	13492109	4/22/2011	17950 Johns, Joshua M.	Other	1.00	\$	230.00	batches for review team.
B018	13237547	1/19/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.70	\$	238.00	Attention to locating local counsel for state court interpleader actions
B018	13241264	1/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Follow-up telephone conference with local counsel for Kansas interpleader case
								Conference with J. Carr and D. DeNeal regarding Fifth Amendment issues and strategy for Gibson's deposition; review and analysis of Fifth Amendment caselaw regarding waiver of
B018	13236475	1/21/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	1.20	\$	528.00	privilege; review and analysis regarding DOJ policies
B018	13268677	2/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Review engagement letters from local counsel and e-mail B. Stanley regarding same
B018	13268680	2/3/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.10	\$	34.00	Telephone conference and message to plaintiff's counsel in Wisconsin interpleader case
B018	13271680	2/3/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.30	\$	132.00	Conference with T. Hall regarding seizure warrant executed on account at Your Community Bank
B018	13297715	2/15/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.20	\$	88.00	Conference with E. Lewis regarding seizure warrant issues
B018	13301812	2/15/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	2.20	\$	880.00	Telephone conferences with J. Hanlon regarding seizure warrants of accounts related to bankruptcy action; review documents related to seizure warrants
B018	13365881	3/9/2011	17619 Lewis, Erin R.	Of Counsel	1.40	\$	560.00	Prepare for telephone call with U.S. Attorney's Office, Trustee and related parties; update to J. Hanlon regarding call
B018	13372892	3/16/2011	18746 Barberio, Gregory J.	Other	0.30	\$	69.00	Conference call with D. DeNeal regarding the possibility of a computer forensic investigation; follow-up with C. Pierce from DSI.
								Conference call with C. Pierce of DSI regarding possible forensic investigation of computer system; follow-up with D. DeNeal regarding findings and conference call; research
B018	13372827	3/17/2011	18746 Barberio, Gregory J.	Other	0.80	\$	184.00	regarding forensic techniques.
								Receive hard drives containing computer images; download and install appropriate viewing software; review content of said computers; follow-up D. DeNeal regarding findings and
B018	13385986	3/23/2011	18746 Barberio, Gregory J.	Other	1.30	\$	299.00	follow-up with forensic vendor on potential next steps
B018	13419319	4/5/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	1.10	\$	484.00	Conference with R. Stanley regarding facts and strategy for investigation
B018	13427892	4/8/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	2.70	\$	1,188.00	Review status of facts and proceedings, and develop strategy for investigation and recovery of assets; develop investigative strategy
B018	13440030	4/13/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone conference with local counsel in Colorado matter
B018	13436440	4/13/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.30	\$	132.00	Develop investigation strategy
B018	13450941	4/19/2011	16928 Hanlon, James P.	Partner	0.50	\$	220.00	Develop investigation strategy
B018	13458486	4/21/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	0.20	\$	68.00	Telephone conference with Colorado local counsel
B018	13480351	4/29/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	0.40	\$	210.00	Conference with J. Carr regarding Agribeef claim and inventory of litigation and discovery needs
B020	13430058	4/11/2011	10762 Bennett, Donald P.	Cash Partner	0.20	\$	100.00	Review proposal to purchase Okie Farms interest in Cattlemen's Feedlot
B020	13430064	4/11/2011	10762 Bennett, Donald P.	Cash Partner	0.60	\$	300.00	Conference with J. Carr
B020	13430035	4/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.60	\$	330.00	Conference with D. Bennett regarding proposal to purchase Okie Farms interest in Cattlemens and tax issue
B020	13457118	4/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	E-mail D. Bennett regarding Okie
B020	13459630	4/22/2011	10762 Bennett, Donald P.	Cash Partner	0.40	\$	200.00	Prepare e-mail to J. Carr regarding information needed for tax analysis; review additional information
B020	13460056	4/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	E-mail D. Bennett and E. Lynch regarding Okie Farms
B020	13470446	4/27/2011	10762 Bennett, Donald P.	Cash Partner	0.80	\$	400.00	Review and analysis of tax returns and financial statements
B020	13480862	4/29/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	0.30	\$	165.00	Telephone calls to counsel for Cattlemen's and conference with D. Bennett regarding sale of interest in Okie
B022	13195372	1/4/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.00	\$	420.00	Travel to Eastern Livestock in New Albany



B022	13193495	1/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	3.50	\$ 1,295.00	Travel to and from Eastern headquarters in New Albany
B022	13194576	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	3.60	\$ 1,980.00	Travel to and from New Albany
B022	13193660	1/4/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	4.00	\$ 2,340.00	Travel to and from debtor's office in New Albany for meetings with trustee and trustee's agents at debtor's offices
B022	13201342	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	2.00	\$ 420.00	Travel from New Albany to Indianapolis
B022	13216603	1/12/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.20	\$ 1,554.00	Travel to and from New Albany for hearing
B022	13238423	1/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	4.00	\$ 980.00	Travel to New Albany for 341 meeting in Gibsons and East-West Trucking bankruptcies
B022	13247600	1/27/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.50	\$ 1,665.00	Travel to and from Louisville Kentucky to meet with US Attorney on forfeiture and asset seizure
B022	13279893	2/8/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	4.00	\$ 1,480.00	Travel
B022	13299581	2/16/2011	10286 Eikenberry, Shawna M.	Of Counsel	4.50	\$ 1,530.00	Travel time to and from New Albany for Gibson 341 hearing
B022	13359597	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	3.70	\$ 2,035.00	Travel to and from New Albany
B022	13358163	3/11/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	3.00	\$ 1,755.00	Travel to and from New Albany for omnibus hearing
B022	13418353	4/5/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	2.00	\$ 740.00	Travel to and from new Albany for 341 hearing (split with other client in New Albany)
B022	13444332	4/15/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	4.40	\$ 2,574.00	Travel to and from New Albany for omnibus hearing

FEES 1686.40 \$ 635,649.50

3700262	12/28/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 15.48	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3700263	12/29/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 20.94	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3719643	12/31/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.28	Computerized Research - Other PACER - December 2010
3719650	12/31/2010	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 55.92	Computerized Research - Other PACER - December 2010
3698826	1/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.80	Duplication Costs
3709425	1/4/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 117.30	Mileage - - Vendor: Terry E. Hall Travel to/from New Albany, IN re Eastern Livestock
3704356	1/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 117.30	Mileage - - James Carr - Travel to/from New Albany, IN to attend hearing
3698994	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 45.45	Duplication Costs
3698995	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.90	Duplication Costs
3698996	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3698997	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3698998	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3698999	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.10	Duplication Costs
3699000	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3699001	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.70	Duplication Costs
3699002	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.65	Duplication Costs
3699003	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 18.60	Duplication Costs
3699004	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 53.85	Duplication Costs
3699005	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3699006	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 45.45	Duplication Costs
3699007	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3699008	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3699009	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3699010	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3699011	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3699012	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3699013	1/5/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3696974	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 19.89	Meals/Entertainment - - Vendor: Sarah B. Laughlin Meal Expenses - Travel to New Albany, IN to meet with client
3696975	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 139.74	Mileage - - Vendor: Sarah B. Laughlin Travel to New Albany, IN to meet with client
3696976	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 219.78	Travel/Lodging - - Vendor: Sarah B. Laughlin Hotel - Travel to New Albany, IN to meet with client
3703628	1/6/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 76.59	Travel/Lodging - - Vendor: Sarah B. Laughlin Hotel - Travel to New Albany, IN to meet with client to assist with preparation of bankruptcy schedules and statement of financial affairs
3698829	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 18.75	Duplication Costs
3698832	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs

3698835	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3698838	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3699014	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.75	Duplication Costs
3699015	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.25	Duplication Costs
3699016	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.10	Duplication Costs
3699017	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3699018	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3699019	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3699020	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.20	Duplication Costs
3699021	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.80	Duplication Costs
3699022	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3699023	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.10	Duplication Costs
3699024	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3699025	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.10	Duplication Costs
3699026	1/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3702695	1/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.40	Duplication Costs
3702972	1/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.95	Duplication Costs
3702973	1/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.95	Duplication Costs
3715306	1/11/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 1.03	Jay Jaffe Mastercard - Search Fees - - Vendor: Texas Secretary of State - Business entity search
3702974	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.75	Duplication Costs
3702975	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.25	Duplication Costs
3702976	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3702977	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.80	Duplication Costs
3702978	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3702979	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3702980	1/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3719264	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.64	Telephone Soundpath Conferencing
3719265	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 29.70	Telephone Soundpath Conferencing
3719266	1/12/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 147.48	Telephone Soundpath Conferencing
3715307	1/13/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 3.08	Jay Jaffe Mastercard - Search Fees - - Vendor: Texas Secretary of State - Business entity search
3701178	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.20	Other Copying Expenses Tabs
3702595	1/13/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 36.00	Duplication Costs
3699392	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 209.00	Transcript Charge - - Vendor: Greenebaum Doll & McDonald PLLC Split cost for copy of transcript of 01/12/11 hearing in Eastern Livestock Co., LLC
3702598	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 29.70	Duplication Costs
3710728	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 35.58	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3710745	1/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 902.54	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3706613	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.20	Color Duplication
3706680	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706681	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706682	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706683	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3706684	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706685	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706686	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706687	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3706688	1/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.95	Duplication Costs
3705348	1/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.15	Duplication Costs
3706283	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.45	Duplication Costs
3706286	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.15	Duplication Costs
3706689	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3706690	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3725657	1/19/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 40.31	Telephone Soundpath Conferencing
3706691	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.60	Duplication Costs

3706692	1/20/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.50	Duplication Costs
3706289	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.50	Duplication Costs
3706292	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3729759	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 19.19	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3729760	1/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.56	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3706852	1/21/2011	10847 Stanley, Robert K.	Cash Partner	\$ 7.96	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3708572	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs
3708573	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.85	Duplication Costs
3708574	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.30	Duplication Costs
3708575	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 25.65	Duplication Costs
3708576	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 25.65	Duplication Costs
3708577	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.10	Duplication Costs
3708578	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 103.20	Duplication Costs
3708579	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.10	Duplication Costs
3708580	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.25	Duplication Costs
3708581	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.25	Duplication Costs
3708582	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.20	Duplication Costs
3708583	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.45	Duplication Costs
3708584	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 7.35	Duplication Costs
3708585	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.70	Duplication Costs
3708586	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.70	Duplication Costs
3708587	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708588	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.70	Duplication Costs
3708589	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.50	Duplication Costs
3708590	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.70	Duplication Costs
3708591	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 7.35	Duplication Costs
3708592	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708593	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708594	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs
3708595	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3708596	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.50	Duplication Costs
3708597	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.00	Duplication Costs
3708598	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.00	Duplication Costs
3708599	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.45	Duplication Costs
3708600	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.40	Duplication Costs
3708601	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.20	Duplication Costs
3708602	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708603	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs
3708604	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708605	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.60	Duplication Costs
3708606	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3708607	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.40	Duplication Costs
3708608	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 27.75	Duplication Costs
3708609	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708610	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708611	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3708612	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3708613	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3708614	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.90	Duplication Costs
3708615	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.30	Duplication Costs
3708616	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.30	Duplication Costs
3708617	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.00	Duplication Costs
3708618	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.00	Duplication Costs

3708619	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.40	Duplication Costs
3708620	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3708621	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.40	Duplication Costs
3708622	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3708623	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708624	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708625	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708626	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3708627	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708628	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	123.45	Duplication Costs
3708629	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	123.45	Duplication Costs
3708630	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708631	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708632	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708633	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708634	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708635	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708636	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708637	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708638	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708639	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708640	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708641	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708642	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.30	Duplication Costs
3708643	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708644	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708645	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3708646	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708647	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3708648	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3708649	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708650	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708651	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708652	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708653	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708654	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3708655	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708656	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708657	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708658	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708659	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.90	Duplication Costs
3708660	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708661	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708662	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708663	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708664	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708665	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708666	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708667	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708668	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708669	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708670	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708671	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs

3708672	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708673	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	103.20	Duplication Costs
3708674	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708675	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	103.20	Duplication Costs
3708676	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708677	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708678	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708679	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708680	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	34.80	Duplication Costs
3708681	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708682	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708683	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.85	Duplication Costs
3708684	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708685	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708686	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	34.80	Duplication Costs
3708687	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.85	Duplication Costs
3708688	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	103.20	Duplication Costs
3708689	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708690	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.30	Duplication Costs
3708691	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708692	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708693	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708694	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708695	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708696	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708697	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708698	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708699	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708700	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708701	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708702	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708703	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3708704	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708705	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.90	Duplication Costs
3708706	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708707	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708708	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708709	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708710	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708711	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708712	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708713	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708714	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708715	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708716	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708717	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708718	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708719	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708720	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3708721	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3708722	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3708723	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708724	1/24/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs



3708725	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3708726	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.75	Duplication Costs
3708727	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 27.75	Duplication Costs
3708728	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 72.60	Duplication Costs
3708729	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 132.75	Duplication Costs
3708730	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708731	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 27.75	Duplication Costs
3708732	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 132.75	Duplication Costs
3708733	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708734	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 77.40	Duplication Costs
3708735	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 77.40	Duplication Costs
3708736	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 27.75	Duplication Costs
3708737	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 77.40	Duplication Costs
3708738	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 28.05	Duplication Costs
3708739	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 28.05	Duplication Costs
3708740	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 72.90	Duplication Costs
3708741	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 72.90	Duplication Costs
3708742	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3708743	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 78.90	Duplication Costs
3708744	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 133.35	Duplication Costs
3708745	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708746	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708747	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3708748	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 78.90	Duplication Costs
3708749	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 133.35	Duplication Costs
3708750	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708751	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3708752	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3708753	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3708754	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3708755	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3708756	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3708757	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3708758	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3708759	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3729761	1/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 22.27	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3709205	1/24/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	\$ 112.20	Mileage - - Vendor: Dustin DeNeal Travel to/from New Albany for 341 meeting in Gibsons & East-West Trucking bankruptcies
3708760	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.05	Duplication Costs
3708761	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.80	Duplication Costs
3708762	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.80	Duplication Costs
3708763	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.20	Duplication Costs
3708764	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.10	Duplication Costs
3708765	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.20	Duplication Costs
3708766	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3708767	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.95	Duplication Costs
3708768	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.95	Duplication Costs
3708769	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.80	Duplication Costs
3708770	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.80	Duplication Costs
3708771	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.10	Duplication Costs
3708772	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.20	Duplication Costs
3708773	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.80	Duplication Costs
3708774	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs
3708775	1/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs

3708776	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.75	Duplication Costs
3708777	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.75	Duplication Costs
3708778	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3708779	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708780	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.75	Duplication Costs
3708781	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708782	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.80	Duplication Costs
3708783	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.80	Duplication Costs
3708784	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.80	Duplication Costs
3708785	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.75	Duplication Costs
3708786	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.35	Duplication Costs
3708787	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708788	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708789	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3708790	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708791	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708792	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3708793	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708794	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.40	Duplication Costs
3708795	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.40	Duplication Costs
3708796	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708797	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708798	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.15	Duplication Costs
3708799	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3708800	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708801	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.05	Duplication Costs
3708802	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708803	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3708804	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708805	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708806	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3708807	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.25	Duplication Costs
3708808	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3708809	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708810	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708811	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708812	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708813	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708814	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3708815	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708816	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.15	Duplication Costs
3708817	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708818	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708819	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3708820	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708821	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708822	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.15	Duplication Costs
3708823	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708824	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708825	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.15	Duplication Costs
3708826	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3708827	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708828	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.05	Duplication Costs



3708882	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708883	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.45	Duplication Costs
3708884	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.65	Duplication Costs
3708885	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708886	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708887	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.35	Duplication Costs
3708888	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708889	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.25	Duplication Costs
3708890	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3708891	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.25	Duplication Costs
3708892	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3708893	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708894	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.60	Duplication Costs
3708895	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708896	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.80	Duplication Costs
3708897	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708898	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.60	Duplication Costs
3708899	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.10	Duplication Costs
3708900	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708901	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.60	Duplication Costs
3708902	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3708903	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	5.10	Duplication Costs
3708904	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708905	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.60	Duplication Costs
3708906	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3708907	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708908	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708909	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.60	Duplication Costs
3708910	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708911	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708912	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708913	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.45	Duplication Costs
3708914	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708915	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3708916	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.65	Duplication Costs
3708917	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708918	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708919	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3708920	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3708921	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708922	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.35	Duplication Costs
3708923	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.50	Duplication Costs
3708924	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708925	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.80	Duplication Costs
3708926	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708927	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708928	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3708929	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708930	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3708931	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3708932	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.05	Duplication Costs
3708933	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3708934	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs





3708988	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708989	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.35	Duplication Costs
3708990	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3708991	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3708992	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3708993	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3708994	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3708995	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3708996	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3708997	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3708998	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3708999	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709000	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709001	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3709002	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709003	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3709004	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3709005	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3709006	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709007	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709008	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3709009	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709010	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3709011	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3709012	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3709013	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709014	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.65	Duplication Costs
3709015	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709016	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.30	Duplication Costs
3709017	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	9.90	Duplication Costs
3712979	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	852.50	Transcript Charge - - Vendor: Amarillo Court Reporting, Inc. Roy Heitschmidt
3712980	1/25/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	158.50	Transcript Charge - - Vendor: Amarillo Court Reporting, Inc. Robert Rufenacht
3713976	1/26/2011	10414	Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$	8.01	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3709018	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709019	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709020	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709021	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709022	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709023	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709024	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709025	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709026	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709027	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709028	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709029	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709030	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709031	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709032	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709033	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709034	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709035	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709036	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709037	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs

3709038	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709039	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709040	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709041	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709042	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709043	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709044	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709045	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709046	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709047	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3709048	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709049	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709050	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709051	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709052	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709053	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709054	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709055	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709056	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709057	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.25	Duplication Costs
3709058	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.25	Duplication Costs
3709059	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709060	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.25	Duplication Costs
3709061	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709062	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.70	Duplication Costs
3709063	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709064	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709065	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.70	Duplication Costs
3709066	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.25	Duplication Costs
3709067	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709068	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709069	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709070	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709071	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709072	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709073	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709074	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709075	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709076	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709077	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709078	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3709079	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709080	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.20	Duplication Costs
3709081	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709082	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.50	Duplication Costs
3709083	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709084	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709085	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709086	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3709087	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3709088	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3709089	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.50	Duplication Costs
3709090	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs

3709091	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3709092	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709093	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3709094	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709095	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709096	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709097	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3709098	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.50	Duplication Costs
3709099	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709100	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709101	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3709102	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3709103	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709104	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709105	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709106	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.75	Duplication Costs
3709107	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709108	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709109	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.90	Duplication Costs
3709110	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.50	Duplication Costs
3709111	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709112	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3709113	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709114	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.80	Duplication Costs
3709115	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709116	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709117	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709118	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3709119	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709120	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709121	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.45	Duplication Costs
3709122	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709123	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709124	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709125	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709126	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709127	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709128	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3709129	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709130	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.20	Duplication Costs
3709131	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3709132	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709133	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.35	Duplication Costs
3709134	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.55	Duplication Costs
3709135	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709136	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	4.05	Duplication Costs
3709137	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.40	Duplication Costs
3709138	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3709139	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.85	Duplication Costs
3709140	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709141	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.95	Duplication Costs
3709142	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3709143	1/26/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.45	Duplication Costs

3709144	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.75	Duplication Costs
3709145	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.85	Duplication Costs
3709146	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3709147	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3709148	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3709149	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3709150	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.75	Duplication Costs
3709151	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3709152	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3709153	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3709154	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3709155	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3709156	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3709157	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3709158	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3709159	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3709160	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3709161	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3709162	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3709163	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3709164	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.75	Duplication Costs
3713974	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 8.01	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3724877	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3724878	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.25	Duplication Costs
3724879	1/26/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3707184	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 198.00	Duplication Costs
3712075	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 83.00	Service of Process - - Vendor: Affordable Process Service Your Community Bank
3729325	1/27/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3709165	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3709166	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3709167	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3709168	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 25.95	Duplication Costs
3709169	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3709170	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.15	Duplication Costs
3709171	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3709172	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3709173	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 9.00	Duplication Costs
3709174	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.50	Duplication Costs
3709175	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.20	Duplication Costs
3709176	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.15	Duplication Costs
3709617	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 32.45	Other Copying Expenses DVD Burning
3724880	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3747145	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 426.85	Transcript Charge - - Vendor: Connor + Associates Transcription of 341 Creditors Meeting (East West Trucking)
3747146	1/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 665.00	Transcript Charge - - Vendor: Connor + Associates Transcription of 341 Creditors Meeting (Gibson)
3718756	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1,166.28	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3718769	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.56	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3719856	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 15.00	Computerized Research - Other IN.gov - January 2011
3729764	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 20.69	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3739643	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 49.84	Computerized Research - Other PACER - January 2011
3739656	1/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 29.84	Computerized Research - Other PACER - January 2011
3715313	2/1/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 5.20	Jay Jaffe Mastercard - Search Fees - - Vendor: Oklahoma Secretary of State - Business entity search
3740403	2/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 24.81	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3715311	2/2/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 12.48	Jay Jaffe Mastercard - Search Fees - - Vendor: Oklahoma Secretary of State - Business entity search

3715312	2/2/2011	10414	Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$	12.48	Jay Jaffe Mastercard - Search Fees - - Vendor: Oklahoma Secretary of State - Business entity search
3714225	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.62	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714226	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.64	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714227	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.31	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714228	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714229	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.98	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714230	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714231	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.83	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714232	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714233	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.14	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714234	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714235	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714236	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.81	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714237	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714238	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714239	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714240	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714241	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.70	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714242	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714243	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	11.33	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714244	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.70	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714245	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.64	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714246	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	9.88	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714247	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	11.89	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714248	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	10.63	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714249	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	11.89	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714250	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.63	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714251	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	9.88	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714252	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714253	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.64	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714254	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.14	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714255	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714256	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	15.87	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714257	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.62	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714258	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.83	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714259	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714260	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714261	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714262	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714263	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714264	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	11.89	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714265	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714266	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714267	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	27.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714268	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714269	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714270	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714271	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714272	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.14	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714273	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714274	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714275	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	15.58	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714276	2/2/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.98	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx



3714277	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.82	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714278	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714279	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714280	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.14	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714281	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.09	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714282	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714283	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714284	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	11.89	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714285	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.64	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714286	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.64	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714356	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	26.58	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714357	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	26.58	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714358	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.08	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714359	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714360	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.09	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714361	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	26.58	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714362	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	14.83	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714364	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.14	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714366	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.90	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714368	2/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	16.62	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3724881	2/3/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	12.30	Duplication Costs
3740404	2/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	23.33	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3714287	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	\$	8.01	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714288	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	\$	26.98	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714370	2/4/2011	15996 DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	\$	8.01	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3713833	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.20	Duplication Costs
3713834	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.40	Duplication Costs
3713835	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.25	Duplication Costs
3713836	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	7.50	Duplication Costs
3713837	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.45	Duplication Costs
3713838	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.55	Duplication Costs
3713839	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	8.25	Duplication Costs
3713840	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	6.00	Duplication Costs
3724882	2/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3713841	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	82.50	Duplication Costs
3713842	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3713843	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	1.65	Duplication Costs
3713844	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	84.15	Duplication Costs
3713845	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	13.95	Duplication Costs
3713846	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	27.45	Duplication Costs
3713847	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3713848	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.60	Duplication Costs
3713849	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3713850	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	2.10	Duplication Costs
3713851	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.15	Duplication Costs
3713852	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs
3713853	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.00	Duplication Costs
3713854	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3713855	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3713856	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.30	Duplication Costs
3713857	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	3.30	Duplication Costs
3713858	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.45	Duplication Costs
3713859	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$	0.75	Duplication Costs

3713860	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3713861	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 61.65	Duplication Costs
3724883	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3724884	2/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 14.85	Duplication Costs
3711611	2/8/2011	10806 Jaffe, Jay	Partner	\$ 22.62	Cellular Telephone Charge -- Vendor: Jay Jaffe Client phone call
3713862	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.40	Duplication Costs
3713863	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3713864	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3720151	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 14.41	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3720782	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 133.61	Postage
3724885	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 54.30	Duplication Costs
3740405	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 19.11	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3740406	2/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.62	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3713865	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 49.50	Duplication Costs
3713866	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3713867	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3713868	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Duplication Costs
3713869	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.35	Duplication Costs
3713870	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3713871	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 7.65	Duplication Costs
3713872	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.75	Duplication Costs
3713873	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 49.50	Duplication Costs
3724886	2/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3713428	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.42	Postage Postage
3713528	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 22.80	Duplication Costs Manual Enter B&W Scan
3713532	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 50.00	Other Copying Expenses CD Burning
3713536	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 7.00	Other Copying Expenses Bates Label
3713540	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 32.45	Other Copying Expenses Folding
3713544	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.32	Other Copying Expenses Drilling
3713611	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.34	Other Copying Expenses 1.5 Ring Binder
3720783	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 285.56	Postage
3720784	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 30.58	Postage
3724887	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 108.00	Duplication Costs
3724888	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 97.95	Duplication Costs
3729401	2/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 90.08	Telephone Soundpath Conferencing
3720598	2/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2,104.69	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3717970	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 8.80	Postage Postage
3724889	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.00	Duplication Costs
3740407	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 19.10	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3740408	2/15/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.27	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3720152	2/16/2011	10563 Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 10.21	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3714598	2/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 115.00	Local Travel - - Vendor: Shawna M. Eikenberry Trip to and from New Albany, IN - Courthouse
3717824	2/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.00	Other Copying Expenses Folding
3724890	2/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.05	Duplication Costs
3756122	2/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 9.42	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3718526	2/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3729326	2/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.15	Duplication Costs
3740411	2/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 8.61	Telephone Telspan Worldwide Conferencing
3721351	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 798.35	Transcript Charge -- Vendor: Connor + Associates 341 Creditors Meeting, Vol. II
3739784	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.72	Computerized Research - Other PACER - February 2011
3739785	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.08	Computerized Research - Other PACER - February 2011
3739792	2/28/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.12	Computerized Research - Other PACER - February 2011
3724891	3/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.40	Duplication Costs

3724892	3/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.90	Duplication Costs
3724893	3/2/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.90	Duplication Costs
3724894	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3724895	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.20	Duplication Costs
3724896	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3727140	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 4.05	Duplication Costs
3727142	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 34.20	Duplication Costs
3727144	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.30	Duplication Costs
3756109	3/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 35.02	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3733132	3/7/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.25	Duplication Costs
3733135	3/8/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3734416	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 8.25	Duplication Costs
3734418	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.60	Duplication Costs
3734420	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.15	Duplication Costs
3734538	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3756091	3/9/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 17.66	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3755652	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 32.19	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3756242	3/10/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 100.48	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3745774	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 117.30	Mileage -- James Carr - Travel to/from New Albany, IN to attend hearing
3756107	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 74.30	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3756108	3/11/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 189.94	Telephone Soundpath Worldwide Conferencing
3755654	3/14/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.29	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3735281	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 35.15	Telecopy
3736619	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 15.90	Duplication Costs
3737425	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.40	Duplication Costs
3737427	3/16/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.40	Duplication Costs
3735327	3/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 34.71	Postage Postage
3736622	3/17/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 117.60	Duplication Costs
3735287	3/18/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.80	Telecopy
3744395	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 6.00	Duplication Costs
3744730	3/21/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3742134	3/22/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 13.30	Telecopy
3745561	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3745562	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.75	Duplication Costs
3745563	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3745564	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3745565	3/23/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.30	Duplication Costs
3742533	3/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2.85	Other Copying Expenses Folding
3745566	3/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 29.70	Duplication Costs
3745567	3/24/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.75	Duplication Costs
3744400	3/25/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 9.15	Duplication Costs
3744623	3/29/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 77.70	Duplication Costs
3763972	3/30/2011	10414 Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 18.74	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3745382	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3755646	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 2,764.62	Local Counsel -- Vendor: Fleeson Gooing Coulson & Kitch, LLC Professional Services and Disbursements thru 03/31/11
3763196	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 203.52	Computerized Research - Other PACER - March 2011
3764311	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 178.72	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3764329	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 198.61	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3764338	3/31/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 80.66	Computerized Research - Westlaw
3748748	4/1/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3750901	4/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 84.60	Duplication Costs
3751062	4/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 27.30	Duplication Costs
3751064	4/4/2011	10771 Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 48.90	Duplication Costs

3748257	4/5/2011	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 58.65	Mileage - - Vendor: Terry E. Hall Travel to/from New Albany for 341 hearing
3764019	4/6/2011	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 22.09	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3764020	4/8/2011	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 63.46	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3764022	4/8/2011	10563	Hall, Terry E.	Partner	\$ 66.07	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3750904	4/8/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 75.15	Duplication Costs
3752742	4/12/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Other Copying Expenses Tabs
3752748	4/12/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 5.50	Other Copying Expenses 2 Ring Binder
3753852	4/12/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3754492	4/12/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.60	Duplication Costs
3774274	4/12/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 19.78	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3752754	4/13/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Other Copying Expenses Tabs
3753854	4/13/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 11.55	Duplication Costs
3752703	4/14/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.22	Other Copying Expenses Drilling
3752760	4/14/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3.44	Other Copying Expenses .5 Ring Binder
3753836	4/14/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 12.45	Duplication Costs
3756317	4/15/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 131.78	Mileage - - Vendor: Robert K. Stanley Mileage to/from New Albany for Omnibus hearing
3764485	4/19/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 3,504.16	Local Counsel - - Vendor: Davis Graham & Stubbs LLP Professional Services and Disbursements thru 03/31/11
3764158	4/21/2011	10414	Herendeen, Sarah B.	Legal Assistant	\$ 8.31	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3759495	4/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 7.95	Duplication Costs
3759498	4/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.15	Duplication Costs
3759501	4/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.80	Duplication Costs
3760103	4/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.45	Duplication Costs
3764482	4/21/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1,310.21	Local Counsel - - Vendor: Michael Best & Friedrich LLP Professional Services and Disbursements thru 03/31/11
3758233	4/22/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 0.50	Other Copying Expenses Drilling
3758342	4/22/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.35	Other Copying Expenses Tabs
3758348	4/22/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 1.72	Other Copying Expenses .5 Ring Binder
3774276	4/22/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 8.91	Telephone TelSpan Worldwide Conferencing
3764733	4/25/2011	15996	DeNeal, Dustin R.	Associate	\$ 8.31	Postage/Air/Express Delivery FedEx
3762086	4/27/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 47.40	Duplication Costs
3762089	4/28/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 15.45	Duplication Costs
3778325	4/30/2011	10771	Carr, James M.	Partner	\$ 132.24	Computerized Research - Other PACER - April 2011

COSTS \$ 26,021.06

Client Manager J.M. Carr  
 Matter Manager 10771 J.M. Carr Proforma No. 1273962 as of 04/30/11  
 Client 0984868 James A. Knauer, as Chapter 11 Trustee, Requested By eliteman on 06/01/11  
 Matter 0984868.0000001 Eastern Livestock Co., LLC

TIME SUMMARY

Timekeeper	Classification	Hours	Matter Rate	Matter Value	Rate 1 Value	Last Date
10762 Bennett, D.P.	Partner	2.00	500.00	1,000.00	1,000.00	04/27/11
10771 Carr, J.M.	Partner	243.20	550.00	133,760.00	133,760.00	04/29/11
10771 Carr, J.M.	Partner	5.20	525.00	2,730.00	2,730.00	04/29/11
10773 Claffey, S.A.	Partner	0.90	525.00	472.50	472.50	01/24/11
10605 Foster, D.A.	Partner	8.90	425.00	3,782.50	3,782.50	01/17/11
10605 Foster, D.A.	Partner	4.50	410.00	1,845.00	1,845.00	01/17/11
12981 Ghuman-O'Neill, S.	Partner	29.50	355.00	10,472.50	10,472.50	04/25/11
10563 Hall, T.E.	Partner	269.70	370.00	99,789.00	99,789.00	04/29/11
10563 Hall, T.E.	Partner	13.80	350.00	4,830.00	4,830.00	04/29/11
16928 Hanlon, J.P.	Partner	17.60	440.00	7,744.00	7,744.00	04/29/11
10806 Jaffe, J.	Partner	12.10	525.00	6,352.50	6,352.50	04/29/11
10847 Stanley, R.K.	Partner	212.20	585.00	124,137.00	124,137.00	04/29/11
10847 Stanley, R.K.	Partner	10.50	555.00	5,827.50	5,827.50	04/29/11
12011 Toner, K.M.	Partner	17.00	440.00	7,480.00	7,480.00	04/29/11
10286 Eikenberry, S.M.	Of Counsel	81.60	340.00	27,744.00	27,744.00	04/29/11
17619 Lewis, E.R.	Of Counsel	17.70	400.00	7,080.00	7,080.00	04/29/11
10732 Ponader, W.W.	Of Counsel	97.90	415.00	40,628.50	40,628.50	04/28/11
18503 Britton, K.D.	Associate	5.00	195.00	975.00	975.00	02/21/11
15996 DeNeal, D.R.	Associate	291.30	245.00	71,368.50	71,368.50	04/29/11
13062 Fleming, J.F.W.	Associate	0.60	325.00	195.00	195.00	02/09/11
15994 Kimmerling, K.M.	Associate	1.10	300.00	330.00	330.00	01/21/11
16611 Mappes, H.A.	Associate	95.70	255.00	24,403.50	24,403.50	04/29/11
16611 Mappes, H.A.	Associate	11.30	220.00	2,486.00	2,486.00	04/29/11
16634 Myers, Z.A.	Associate	0.20	245.00	49.00	49.00	04/29/11
17474 Percy, J.A.	Associate	4.60	295.00	1,357.00	1,357.00	02/04/11
12170 Castor, A.K.	Legal Assistant	1.40	200.00	280.00	280.00	03/24/11
10414 Herendeen, S.B.	Legal Assistant	201.60	210.00	42,336.00	42,336.00	04/29/11
10414 Herendeen, S.B.	Legal Assistant	17.60	200.00	3,520.00	3,520.00	04/29/11



Client Manager J.M. Carr  
 Matter Manager 10771 J.M. Carr Proforma No. 1273962 as of 04/30/11  
 Client 0984868 James A. Knauer, as Chapter 11 Trustee, Requested By eliteman on 06/01/11  
 Matter 0984868.0000001 Eastern Livestock Co., LLC

Timekeeper	Classification	Hours	Matter Rate	Matter Value	Rate 1 Value	Last Date
16227 Nansen, O.L.	Legal Assistant	0.30	175.00	52.50	52.50	01/04/11
18746 Barberio, G.J.	Other	2.40	230.00	552.00	552.00	03/23/11
17950 Johns, J.M.	Other	9.00	230.00	2,070.00	2,070.00	04/22/11
Total Services		1,686.40		635,649.50	635,649.50	

TASK SUMMARY

Task Description	Hours	Value
B001 Asset Analysis and Recovery	290.90	126,472.50
B002 Asset Disposition	202.30	77,327.00
B003 Business Operations	48.80	18,472.50
B004 Case Administration	469.10	140,494.00
B005 Claims Administration and Objections	30.70	9,022.00
B007 Fee/Employment Applications	39.90	14,879.00
B008 Fee/Employment Objections	2.40	761.00
B009 Financing	110.20	50,941.50
B010 Litigation	229.20	84,924.00
B011 Meetings of Creditors	7.30	2,054.50
B012 Plan and Disclosure Statement	.90	472.50
B013 Relief From Stay Proceedings	175.90	78,816.00
B015 Business Analysis	2.60	832.00
B017 Data Analysis	9.00	2,070.00
B018 Litigation Consulting	14.30	5,518.00
B020 Tax Issues	3.50	1,825.00
B022 Travel	49.40	20,768.00
	1,686.40	635,649.50