100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63972 File # 10067-032

Re: Tardif v FAMOB AG - HELITEPS AG

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees	a' → w		
08/27/10	СВН		inal preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for ervice of complaint.			\$30.00
09/22/10	СВН	Final preparation without prejudice.		of voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	•••		0.40	\$60.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hop	okins		0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.40	_	\$60.00	
			Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					0.75
	Total Cost	s Advanced			<del></del>	\$0.75
			Total Invoi	ce	-	\$60.75
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE		\$60.75
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.	00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63973 File # 10067-033

Re: Tardif v Frank Forstmann

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		<u>L</u>	egal Fees			
09/22/10	СВН	Final preparation of and fil without prejudice.	ing notice o	f voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
10/06/10	AB	Review and revise Notice Dismissal.	to Withdrav	v Notice of Voluntary	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
02/23/11	АВ	Follow up with P. Esser re: status of settlement. Conference with V. Lambdin to review and discuss Notice of Voluntary Dismissal for purposes of facilitating settlement and status of same.			0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00
		Total Legal Fees			0.60	\$117.00
FEE SUMM. Professiona		Но	urs	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bl	ye		0.20	\$210.00	\$42.00	
Alexandra Bl	ye	C	).20	\$225.00	\$45.00	
Colleen B Ho	pkins	C	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.60		\$117.00	
		Costs	s Advance	1		2.00
	Copying					0.30
	Total Cos	sts Advanced				\$0.30
			Total Invoi	ce	<u></u>	\$117.30
		1	OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE	<del>.</del>	\$117.30

Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 3 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-033 File # 10067-033 Inv. # 63973

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63974 File # 10067-034

Re: Tardif v Hlfzi Tuerkoglu

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
08/12/10	СВН	Prepare and file r complaint.	notion to extend dea	dline for service of	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
09/24/10	СВН	Final preparation without prejudice.		f voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	15(8 B)		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hop	kins		0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	ees	· 	0.50	<u> </u>	\$75.00	
			Costs Advanced	<b>1</b>		
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.44
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$1.49
			Total Invoi	ce		\$76.49
			OUTSTAND	DING BALANCE	1	\$76.49
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.	.00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63975 File # 10067-035

Re: Tardif v Paul Wachowski

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
08/12/10	СВН	Prepare and file complaint.	motion to extend de	adline for service of	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
09/23/10	СВН	Final preparation without prejudice		of voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	ALS A		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMM						
Professiona	al		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopkins			0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.50	_	\$75.00	
			Costs Advance	ed		
	Copying					1.80
	Postage					0.44
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.24
			Total Invo	ice		\$77.24
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE	<del></del>	\$77.24
TRUST BAL	ANCE	\$0	.00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63976 File # 10067-036

Re: Tardif v Peter-Ed De Jong

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Two the first control of the f	Legal Fees			
08/11/10	CBH	Prepare and file mo	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			\$45.00
09/20/10	СВН	Final preparation of without prejudice.	f and filing notice o	of voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees			0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMM/ Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hop	okins	¥:	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.50	_	\$75.00	
			Costs Advance	d		STEP AND DE
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					1.05
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.10
			Total Invoi	ce		\$77.10
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE	<del> </del>	\$77.10
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.00	)			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63977 File # 10067-037

Re: Tardif v Reinhold Schnitzer

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/27/10	СВН	Final preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
10/12/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/16/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/08/10	AB	Review and revise proposed Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
12/13/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion to Extend Service Deadline pursuant to revisions from Chambers, for purposes of filing.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
12/21/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extra Judicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	AB	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely resame.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 8 of 60

		Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapte 10067-037	r 7 Trustee	File # 100 Inv. # 639	
02/22/11	АВ	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withd Issuance of Request for Service Abro proceeding with opening of miscellan District Court in order to properly effe Complaint through Hague Convention	oad for purposes of eous case in U.S ct service of Original	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00
02/22/11	АВ	Revise Request for Service Abroad d Court for use by District Court upon of Miscellaneous Case and mail same to District Court.	0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50	
02/28/11	АВ	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Carpursuant to direction of Clerk of Cour Court of MDFL.	0.50hr \$225.00/hr	\$112.50	
		Total Legal Fees		4.10	\$864.00
FEE SUMMA			_		
Professiona	ı	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	re	2.90	\$210.00	\$609.00	
Alexandra Bly	/e	1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Hop	kins	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
Total Legal F	ees	4.10		\$864.00	lia
		Costs Advance	d		
	Copying				4.65
	Postage				0.98
	•	Advanced	Į.		\$5.63

TRUST BALANCE \$0.00

Total Invoice

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

\$869.63

\$869.63

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63978 File # 10067-038

Re: Tardif v Ulrich & Klaudia Kramer

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/14/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend the deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/21/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	AB	Review and consider status of case and status of filing Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely re: same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/24/11	AB	Update and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service and exhibit.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
02/22/11	AB	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withdrawal of Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for purposes of proceeding with opening of miscellaneous case in U.S District Court in order to properly effect service of Original Complaint through Hague Convention.	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 10 of 60

		Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapt 10067-038	er 7 Trustee	File # 100 Inv. # 639	
02/22/11	АВ	Revise Request for Service Abroad Court for use by District Court upon Miscellaneous Case and mail same District Court.	opening of	0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50
02/28/11	АВ	Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous C	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Case in District Court, pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court's office for District Court of MDFL.		
		Total Legal Fees		3.90	\$816.00
FEE SUMMA		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bl	ve	2.60	\$210.00	\$546.00	
Alexandra Bl	-	1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Ho	-	0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00	
Total Legal F	ees	3.90	_	\$816.00	
387.02 0 AX33		Costs Advanc	ed		3 A C 7 M A S A
	Copying				4.20
	Postage				0.78
	Total Cos	sts Advanced			\$4.98
		Total Inv	oice		\$820.98

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

\$820.98

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63979 File # 10067-039

Re: Tardif v Balta Enterprises, Ltd.

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Secretary of the second		Legal Fees		
08/31/10	СВН	Prepare and file amended certificate of service to correct mailing address.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
09/03/10	АВ	Review and investigation of proper address for service on defendant. Correspondence to V. Lambdin and C. Hopkins re: same and notice of withdrawal of motion to extend service deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
09/03/10	СВН	Prepare and file notice of withdrawal of motion to extend the deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
09/06/10	AB	Reviewed and revised Notice of Withdrawal of Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
09/07/10	СВН	Final preparation of and filing notice of withdrawal of motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
01/21/11	АВ	Review and consider status of pleadings for purposes of preparation and consideration of grounds to move for default, and in preparation of interoffice conference with R. Elgidely re: status of case.	0.50hr \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
01/24/11	AB	Draft, revise and file Motion for Default against Defendant.	0.60hr \$210.00/hr	\$126.00
		Total Legal Fees	2.40	\$456.00

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 12 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-039

File # 10067-039 Inv. # 63979

Professional	Hours	Rate	Amount
Alexandra Blye Colleen B Hopkins	1.60 0.80	\$210.00 \$150.00	\$336.00 \$120.00
Total Legal Fees	2 40	:4	\$456.00

		Costs Advanced	
	Copying		3.75
05/18/2010	Fedex Airbill No. 79862059743	26.25	
	Total Costs Advanced		\$30.00
		Total Invoice	\$486.00
		OUTSTANDING BALANCE	\$486.00
TRUST BALA	NCE 9	00.03	

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63980 File # 10067-040

Re: Tardif v Marshall Increas Corporation

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Participant of the same of the		Legal Fees		
06/14/10	AB	Receipt and review of Motion for Default. Reviewed same and circulated to R. Elgidely.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
09/10/10	АВ	Sunbiz search of corporation for update of proper service address. Follow correspondence with P. Esser re: confirmation of german address for registered agent.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
09/10/10	АВ	Correspondence to R. Elgidely re: analysis of service on registered agent in U.S. and moving for default vs. re-serving on german address.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
09/29/10	АВ	Multiple correspondence with R. Elgidely re: motion for default vs. re-service of complaint. Review and consider status of corporation in U.S., available address for service in Germany and cost of service through Hague Convention.	0.50hr \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft Plaintiff's Motion to Extend Deadline to Serve Complaint Nunc Pro Tunc.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
11/23/10	JJR	Review of correspondence from Aly Blye regarding Marshall Increase Corporation and Michaela Dorner; research regarding same; preparation of response to A. Blye regarding results.	0.40hr \$135.00/hr	\$54.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/21/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	АВ	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 14 of 60

Robert E.	<i>Tardif, Jr.</i> 10067	Chapter 7 -040	Trustee	

File # 10067-040 Inv. # 63980

01/21/11	AB	of Request	I consider status of case an for Service Abroad and up eparation for status meeting	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00		
02/22/11	AB	Issuance of proceeding District Cou	ze and file Notice of Withdra f Request for Service Abroa with opening of miscellane irt in order to properly effec hrough Hague Convention.	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00		
02/22/11	АВ	Court for us Miscellaned	Revise Request for Service Abroad directed to Bankruptcy  Court for use by District Court upon opening of  Miscellaneous Case and mail same to Clerk of Court for District Court.  0.30hr  \$225.00/hr				
02/28/11	AB	Abroad for	evise Motion for Issuance o filing in Miscellaneous Case direction of Clerk of Court's DFL.	0.50hr \$225.00/hr	\$112.50		
		Total Legal	Fees		5.70	\$1,182.00	
FEE SUMM	ARY:						
Professiona	il		Hours	Rate	Amount		
Alexandra Bly	/e		4.30	\$210.00	\$903.00		
Alexandra Bly	/e		1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00		
JoJo Russo			0.40	\$135.00	\$54.00		
Total Legal F	ees		5.70	£.	\$1,182.00		
			Costs Advanced				
						44.05	

	Costs Advan	ced	A WILLIAM TO SERVICE OF THE SERVICE
	Copying		11.25
	Postage	Ce Ce	0.61
	Accurint - Online Research		48.88
05/18/2010	Fedex Airbill No. 793495453035 (10067-040) Fed	19.77	
	Total Costs Advanced		\$80.51
	Total Inv	voice	\$1,262.51
	OUTSTA	ANDING BALANCE	\$1,262.51

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63981 File # 10067-041

Re: Tardif v Flair Immobilien GMBH

Statement for Services Rendered Through

	izm, idus na silika	Legal Fees		
08/12/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
10/12/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/26/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Request.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	AB	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely resame.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
02/22/11	АВ	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withdrawal of Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for purposes of proceeding with opening of miscellaneous case in U.S District Court in order to properly effect service of Original Complaint through Hague Convention.	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 16 of 60

		Robert E.	Tardif, Jr. Chaptei 10067-041	r 7 Trustee	File # 100 Inv. # 639	
02/22/11	АВ	Court for use by Di	Revise Request for Service Abroad directed to Bankruptcy Court for use by District Court upon opening of Miscellaneous Case and mail same to Clerk of Court for District Court.			\$67.50
02/27/11	AB	Abroad for filing in	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Case in District Court, pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court's office for District Court of MDFL.			
		Total Legal Fees	83C		3.90	\$816.00
FEE SUMMA			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bl	ye		2.60	\$210.00	\$546.00	
Alexandra Bi	ye		1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Hop	pkins		0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00	
Total Legal F	ees		3.90		\$816.00	
			- Costs Advance			- (0°.41°-)
	Copying					3.90
	Postage			5		1.42
	Total Cos	ts Advanced				\$5.32
			Total Invoi	ce		\$821.32
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE		\$821.32

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63982 File # 10067-042

Re: Tardif v Alfred Holzer

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/24/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
10/04/10	AB	Review and revise Order Granting Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/12/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Time.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/21/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	AB	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely resame.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
02/22/11	AB	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withdrawal of Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for purposes of proceeding with opening of miscellaneous case in U.S District Court in order to properly effect service of Original Complaint through Hague Convention.	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00

## 

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee

File # 10067-042

\$45.00

\$150.00

		10067-042	Inv. # 63982		
02/22/11	АВ	Revise Request for Service Abroad di Court for use by District Court upon o Miscellaneous Case and mail same to District Court.	pening of	0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50
02/28/11	АВ	Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Cas	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Case in District Court, pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court's office for District Court of MDFL.		
		Total Legal Fees		4.10	\$858.00
FEE SUMM Profession		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Blye Alexandra Blye		2.80 1.00	\$210.00 \$225.00	\$588.00 \$225.00	

Total Legal Fees	4.10	\$858.00
	Costs Advanced	
Copying		3.75
Postage		1.96
Total Costs Advanced	Leave	\$5.71
	Total Invoice	\$863.71
	OUTSTANDING BALANCE	\$863.71

0.30

TRUST BALANCE

Colleen B Hopkins

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63983 File # 10067-043

Re: Tardif v. Bernd Schultze

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
08/19/10	СВН	Prepare and file mo complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			\$45.00
09/23/10	СВН	Final preparation of without prejudice.	Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	45		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMM			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopkins			0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	Total Legal Fees		0.50	_	\$75.00	
			Costs Advance	d		
Parameter Control of the Control of	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.98
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.03
			Total Invo	ice		\$77.03
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE		\$77.03
TRUST BAL	ANCE	\$0.00	)			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63984 File # 10067-044

Re: Tardif v DR. THOMAS HEWEL

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
08/23/10	СВН	Prepare and file n complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			\$45.00
09/23/10	СВН		Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	e9 &		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMMA			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Professiona	1			Nate		
Colleen B Hop	kins		0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	Total Legal Fees		0.50	_	\$75.00	
The second secon			- Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.98
	Total Costs	Advanced			<del></del>	\$2.03
			Total Invo	ice		\$77.03
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE		\$77.03
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.	00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63985 File # 10067-045

Re: Tardif v EWALD GADERMAIER

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Walter Commence of the Commenc	- Legal Fees			
08/27/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			\$30.00
09/20/10	СВН		Prepare and file notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice; review case docket.			\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees			0.40	\$60.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona		Si .	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopkins			0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00	
Total Legal Fees			0.40	-	\$60.00	
		, Co	osts Advance	ed		
	Copying					0.75
	Total Cost	s Advanced				\$0.75
			Total Invo	vice		\$60.75
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE	1	\$60.75
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.00				i.

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919

March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63986 File # 10067-046

Re: Tardif v ERNENPUTSCH GMBH

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
08/11/10	08/11/10 CBH Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00	
10/01/10	AB	Review and revi	Review and revise Order Granting Motion to Extend.			\$42.00
10/12/10	AB		Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.			\$42.00
11/03/10	АВ	Draft and file No	Draft and file Notice of Voluntary Dismissal.			\$63.00
		Total Legal Fees	S <sub>A tot</sub>		1.00	\$192.00
FEE SUMM	APV.		100			
Profession			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bl	lye		0.70	\$210.00	\$147.00	
Colleen B Ho	pkins		0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00	
Total Legal F	ees		1.00		\$192.00	
		THE RESERVE THE THE TANK THE PARTY OF THE PA	Costs Advanced			
	Copying					2.10
	Postage					2.03
	Total Costs	s Advanced				\$4.13
				7),		
			Total Invoi	ce		\$196.13

Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 23 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-046 File # 10067-046 Inv. # 63986

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

\$196.13

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63987 File # 10067-047

Re: Tardif v FRIEDRICH HERRLING

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/27/10	СВН	Final preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
10/04/10	AB	Review and revise Order Granting Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/12/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/16/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion to Extend Service Deadline pursuant to requested revisions from Court.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/26/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	АВ	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	АВ	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	АВ	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely resame.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 25 of 60

		Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 10067-047	File # 10067-047 Inv. # 63987		
02/22/11	AB	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withdr Issuance of Request for Service Abroa proceeding with opening of miscelland District Court in order to properly effect Complaint through Hague Convention	ad for purposes of eous case in U.S ct service of Original	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00
02/22/11	AB	Revise Request for Service Abroad di Court for use by District Court upon on Miscellaneous Case and mail same to District Court.	0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50	
02/27/11	AB	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Cas pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court Court of MDFL.	0.50hr \$225.00/hr	\$112.50	
		Total Legal Fees		4.20	\$885.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	re	3.00	\$210.00	\$630.00	
Alexandra Bly		1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Hop	kins	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
Total Legal Fo	ees	4.20	-	\$885.00	
		Costs Advanced			
	Copying				4.50
	Postage				0.88
	Total Costs	Advanced			\$5.38
		Total Invoid	ce	l	\$890.38

Page 2

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

\$890.38

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63988 File # 10067-048

Re: Tardif v KATJA GEBHARD

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Feb 28/11

08/23/10 CBH Prepare and complaint.			file motion to extend deadline for service of		0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
			otice of voluntary di f court docket.	smissal without	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees ,			0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMM/ Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopkins			0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal Fees			0.50	-	\$75.00	
			- Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.98
	Total Cost	s Advanced				\$2.03
			Total Invo	ice		\$77.03
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE	<del></del>	\$77.03
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.0	0			

--- Legal Fees ---

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63989 File # 10067-049

Re: Tardif v HEINRICH LOHMANN

TRUST BALANCE

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Feb 28/11

			Legal Fe	es			
09/23/10	СВН		Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees				0.20	\$30.00
FEE SUMM Profession			Hours		Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Ho	pkins		0.20		\$150.00	\$30.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.20			\$30.00	
			Costs Advan	ced			
	Copying						1.65
	Postage						0.44
	Total Costs	Advanced					\$2.09
			Total In	voice			\$32.09
			OUTST	ANDING I	BALANCE		\$32.09

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63990 File # 10067-050

Re: Tardif v JOHANN STRAUSS

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Feb 28/11

E CONTRACTOR DE		Control of the Contro	Legal Fee:		The street was been discounted and	and the state of the state of the
08/12/10 CBH Prepare and to complaint.			motion to extend de	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00	
09/24/10	СВН	Final preparation without prejudice		of voluntary dismissal	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
		Total Legal Fees	in c		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMMAR	RY:		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Professional				Nate		
Colleen B Hopk	ins		0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal Fee	es		0.50	_	\$75.00	
			Costs Advanc	ed	Mark Street	will be the bir
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.44
	Total Costs	s Advanced				\$1.49
			Total Inv	oice		\$76.49
			OUTSTA	NDING BALANCE		\$76.49
TRUST BALAN	NCE	\$0	0.00			

- I egal Fees - - -

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63991 File # 10067-051

Re: Tardif v KAISER WILHELM INTERNATIONAL LTD

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees		
08/14/10		СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
10/04/10		СВН	Meeting with A. Blye regarding dismissal/pending status of case; final preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.40hr \$150.00/hr	\$60.00
10/12/10		AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10		AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10		AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/21/10	ĕ	АВ	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10		АВ	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11		AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11		AB	Review and consider status of case and status of filing of Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely re: same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/24/11		AB	Update and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and Exhibit.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 30 of 60

File # 10067-051

\$942.38

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee

···			10067-051	Inv. # 63991		
02/22/11	AB	Issuance of Rec proceeding with District Court in	nd file Notice of Withdr quest for Service Abroa opening of miscellane order to properly effec gh Hague Convention	ad for purposes of eous case in U.S ct service of Original	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00
02/22/11	АВ	Court for use by	Revise Request for Service Abroad directed to Bankruptcy Court for use by District Court upon opening of Miscellaneous Case and mail same to Clerk of Court for District Court.			\$67.50
02/28/11	АВ	Abroad for filing	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Case in District Court, pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court's office for District Court of MDFL.			\$112.50
		Total Legal Fee	S		4,60	\$939.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	/e		2.90	\$210.00	\$609.00	
Alexandra Bly	/e		1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Hop	okins		0.70	\$150.00	\$105.00	
Total Legal F	ees		4.60	<del></del>	\$939.00	
			Costs Advanced	Í		
	Copying					2.40
	Postage					0.98
	Total Cost	ts Advanced				\$3.38
Total Invoice						\$942.38

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919

Total Costs Advanced ....

March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63992 File # 10067-052

\$1.35

Re: Tardif v KARL AUGUST RIEDER

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees			Harry Sandowall
06/11/10	АВ	Receipt, review and revisions to COS	for Notice of Pretrial.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
06/14/10	AB	Receipt and review of COS re: Notice	of Pretrial.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
06/22/10	AB		Receipt and review of correspondence from P. Esser re: potential defense to liability as net investor.		
06/22/10	АВ	Receipt and review of correspondenc P. Esser confirming net investor statu C. Hopkins re: Notice of Voluntary Disreview of same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00	
06/25/10	АВ	Drafted Motion For Voluntary Dismiss	Drafted Motion For Voluntary Dismissal and proposed Order.		
		Total Legal Fees		1.50	\$315.00
FEE SUMM	ARY.				
Profession		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bl	ye	1.50	\$210.00	\$315.00	
Total Legal Fees 1.50		en de la compansa de	\$315.00		
		Costs Advanced			We manufacture of
5-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00-00	Copying				1.35

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 32 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-052 File # 10067-052 Inv. # 63992

Total Invoice \$316.35

OUTSTANDING BALANCE \$316.35

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63993 File # 10067-053

Re: Tardif v KARL-HEINZ SPIESS

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		MINISTRACTION OF THE	Legal F	ees	and the state of t	
	06/22/10	AB	Receipt and review of information additional transfer changing statu Correspondence to C. Hopkins re Dismissal.	us to net investor.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
	06/22/10	AB	Receipt and review of Notice of \	/oluntary Dismissal.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
	06/25/10	AB	Drafted Motion For Voluntary Dis	missal and proposed Order.	0.50hr \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
	07/01/10	СВН	Final preparation of and upload r case.	Final preparation of and upload motion to voluntary dismiss case.		
	07/06/10	АВ		Receipt and review of Order granting Motion to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding and canceling 7/12/10 pre-trial conference.		
	07/06/10	СВН	Attention to order dismissing cas cancellation of pre-trial conference		0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
			Total Legal Fees		1.80	\$336.00
	FEE SUMMAR	Y:				Sa
	Professional		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Blye			1.10	\$210.00	\$231.00	
Colleen B Hopkins		ıs	0.70	\$150.00	\$105.00	
Total Legal Fees		S	1.80	a	\$336.00	

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 34 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-053

File # 10067-053 Inv. # 63993

Copying		0.60
Total Costs Advanced		\$0.60
	Total Invoice	\$336.60
	OUTSTANDING BALANCE	\$336.60

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63994 File # 10067-054

Re: Tardif v KLAUS FISCHER

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/27/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
10/01/10	АВ	Review and revise Order Granting Motion to Extend.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/12/10	АВ	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/16/10	АВ	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	АВ	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	АВ	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/26/10	АВ	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
01/21/11	AB	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for purposes of updating Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely re: same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 36 of 60

\$891.01

		Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-054		File # 10067-054 Inv. # 63994	
02/22/11	AB	Draft, finalize and file Notice of W Issuance of Request for Service A proceeding with opening of misce District Court in order to properly Complaint through Hague Conver	Abroad for purposes of Ilaneous case in U.S effect service of Original	0.20hr \$225.00/hr	\$45.00
02/22/11	AB	Revise Request for Service Abroad directed to Bankruptcy Court for use by District Court upon opening of Miscellaneous Case and mail same to Clerk of Court for District Court.		0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50
02/27/11	AB	Draft and revise Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for filing in Miscellaneous Case in District Court, pursuant to direction of Clerk of Court's office for District Court of MDFL.		0.50hr \$225.00/hr	\$112.50
		Total Legal Fees		4.20	\$885.00
FEE SUMMARY: Professional		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Blye		3.00	\$210.00	\$630.00	
Alexandra Bly	•	1.00	\$225.00	\$225.00	
Colleen B Hopkins		0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
Total Legal Fees		4.20		\$885.00	
		Costs Advar	nced		
	Copying				4.05
Postage *		A.1			1.96
Total Costs Advanced					\$6.01
Total Invoice				\$891.01	

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63995 File # 10067-055

Re: Tardif v KONRAD VOLKWEIN

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
06/28/10	АВ	Follow up with P. Esser re: translation of Answer.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/09/10	АВ	Receipt and review of COS. Revised same to provide for service of complaints through local counsel for Trustee in Germany.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
07/12/10	AB	Prepared for, attended and represented Trustee at pretrial conference before Judge Williamson in Tampa, FL.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
07/14/10	CBH	Prepare order continuing pre-trial conference.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
07/16/10	AB	Reviewed, revised and uploaded Order continuing pre-trial.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
08/12/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend the deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/12/10	CBH	Prepare and file motion to extend the deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/17/10	AB	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
08/31/10	CBH	Prepare and upload order granting trustee's motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.40hr \$150.00/hr	\$60.00
10/11/10	АВ	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint and Continuing Pretrial Conference.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/16/10	AB	Draft and revise Motion for Voluntary Dismissal and proposed order granting same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 38 of 60

## Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-055

File # 10067-055 Inv. # 63995

10/28/10   CBH								
Total Legal Fees   \$150.00/hr     Total Legal Fees   Total Legal Fee	10/28/10	СВН						\$60.00
FEE SUMMARY:         Professional         Hours         Rate         Amount           Alexandra Blye         3.20         \$210.00         \$672.00           Colleen B Hopkins         1.90         \$150.00         \$285.00           Total Legal Fees         5.10         \$957.00           - Costs Advanced Costs Advanced Costs Advanced Costs Advanced Costs Advanced Costs Advanced -	10/29/10	СВН				ate of service on order		\$45.00
Professional         Hours         Rate         Amount           Alexandra Blye         3.20         \$210.00         \$672.00           Colleen B Hopkins         1.90         \$150.00         \$285.00           Total Legal Fees         5.10         \$957.00           - Costs Advanced			Total Legal F	ees			5.10	\$957.00
Alexandra Blye Colleen B Hopkins 1.90 \$150.00 \$285.00  Total Legal Fees		RY:						
Colleen B Hopkins         1.90         \$150.00         \$285.00           Total Legal Fees         5.10         \$957.00           Copying         8.10           Postage         2.30           Total Costs Advanced	Professional			1	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopkins         1.90         \$150.00         \$285.00           Total Legal Fees         5.10         \$957.00           Copying         8.10           Postage         2.30           Total Costs Advanced	Alexandra Blve	)			3.20	\$210.00	\$672.00	
Total Legal Fees						·		
Copying   8.10     Postage   2.30     Total Costs Advanced   \$10.40     Total Invoice   \$967.40     OUTSTANDING BALANCE   \$967.40	Concert B Hopk				1.00	φ130.00	Ψ200.00	
Copying         8.10           Postage         2.30           Total Costs Advanced         \$10.40           Total Invoice         \$967.40           OUTSTANDING BALANCE         \$967.40	Total Legal Fe	es			5.10	_	\$957.00	
Postage Total Costs Advanced				Cc	osts Advance	d		A
Total Costs Advanced \$10.40  Total Invoice \$967.40  OUTSTANDING BALANCE \$967.40		Copying						8.10
Total Invoice \$967.40  OUTSTANDING BALANCE \$967.40		Postage						2.30
OUTSTANDING BALANCE \$967.40		Total Costs	Advanced					\$10.40
OUTSTANDING BALANCE \$967.40					Total Invo	ice		\$967.40
							<u></u>	
TRUST BALANCE \$0.00					OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE		\$967.40
	TRUST BALA	NCE		\$0.00			201	

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63996 File # 10067-056

Re: Tardif v KURT JUERGEN GOEHL

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		
08/23/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
10/04/10	AB	Review and revise Order Granting Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/12/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	АВ	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline, pursuant to requested revisions from Court.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/26/10	AB	Draft and revise Request for Service Abroad of Judicial Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance of same.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
12/27/10	АВ	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and exhibits.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of Request for Service of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
		Total Legal Fees	2.80	\$570.00

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 40 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-056 File # 10067-056 Inv. # 63996

Professional	Hours	Rate	Amount
Alexandra Blye Colleen B Hopkins	2.50 0.30	\$210.00 \$150.00	\$525.00 \$45.00
Total Legal Fees	2.80		\$570.00

. o.aoga ooo		2.00	ψ370.00
	C	osts Advanced	
Copying			3.15
Postage			1.96
Total Costs /	Advanced	La Carte	\$5.11
		Total Invoice	\$575.11
		OUTSTANDING BALANCE	\$575.11
TOUGT BALANCE	00.02		

TRUST BALANCE

\$0.00

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63997 File # 10067-057

Re: Tardif v RAZIM CRNIC

Statement for Services Rendered Through

	100 S 100 S 100 S 100		Legal Fees			
08/11/10	СВН	Prepare and file complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			\$45.00
09/20/10	СВН		Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$30.00
e		Total Legal Fees			0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hop	kins		0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.50	_	\$75.00	
			Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					2.40
	Postage					1.05
	Total Costs	Advanced			-	\$3.45
			Total Invo	ice		\$78.45
¥.			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE	-	\$78.45
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0	0.00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63998 File # 10067-058

Re: Tardif v RICHARD KEUHN

Statement for Services Rendered Through

	and the second s	Legal Fees		
07/02/10	АВ	Pulled and reviewed docket (.3), prepared for and conducted Rule 26(f) Conference (.5) with D. Schutt. Drafted proposed Rule 26(f) Report (1.0) and sent correspondence to D. Schutt regarding proposed Report and drafting of Agreed Order on Motion to Dismiss quashing service (.2).	2.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$420.00
07/09/10	AB	Receipt and review of COS. Revised same for filing.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/12/10	AB	Prepared for, attended and represented Trustee at pre-trial conference before Judge Williamson in Tampa, FL.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
07/14/10	СВН	Prepare order continuing pre-trial conference.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
07/16/10	АВ	Reviewed, revised and uploaded Order continuing pretrial.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/16/10	AB	Drafted proposed Agreed Motion to Quash and proposed Order. Circulated same to D. Schutt for review.	1.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$273.00
07/29/10	СВН	Review of docket; telephone call with JA regarding order denying motion to dismiss as moot.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
08/13/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/17/10	АВ	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and hearing on Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
08/31/10	СВН	Prepare and upload order granting motion to extend deadline and continue pretrial conference.	0.40hr \$150.00/hr	\$60.00

## 

		Rober	Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-058			067-058 998
10/11/10	АВ		se COS on Order Granti ne for Service of Compl rence	•	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/18/10	AB		Draft, revise and file Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss and Order granting same.			\$105.00
11/23/10	СВН	Prepare certifi case.	Prepare certificate of service on order dismissing adversary case.			\$45.00
11/24/10	AB		Review and revise COS on Order Granting Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss.			\$42.00
		Total Legal Fe	es		8.00	\$1,596.00
FEE SUMMARY:			Haura	Pata	Amount	
Professiona	11		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	/e		6.60	\$210.00	\$1,386.00	

Total Legal Fees	<u>-</u>	8.00	\$1,596.00	
	°C	osts Advanced		
Copying				11.85
Postage				0.75
Total Costs Advance	ced			\$12.60
				-
		Total Invoice		\$1,608.60
		OUTSTANDING BALANCE		\$1,608.60
TRUST BALANCE	\$0.00			

1.40

\$150.00

\$210.00

Colleen B Hopkins

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 63999 File # 10067-059

Re: Tardif v VETTER SONJA

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Feb 28/11

--- Legal Fees ---

			Legairees.	CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF THE	Carrie de la resta de la Seguina de la constante de la constan	THE STATE OF THE STATE OF
08/14/10	СВН	Prepare and file mo	epare and file motion to extend deadline for service of mplaint. 0.30hr			
09/23/10	СВН	Final preparation owithout prejudice.	Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal vithout prejudice.			\$30.0
		Total Legal Fees	± • €:		0.50	\$75.00
FEE SUMMA			Haves	Doto	A	
Professional			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopk	kins		0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
Total Legal Fe	es		0.50		\$75.00	
			- Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					2.10
	Postage					0.78
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.88
			Total Invoi	ce	-	\$77.88
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE		\$77.88
TRUST BALA	NCE	\$0.0	0			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64000 File # 10067-060

Re: Tardif v DR. HANS-JUERGEN FROEHLICH

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			- Legal Fees				
08/27/10	СВН	Final preparation of an service of complaint.	nal preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for ervice of complaint. 0.20hr \$150.00/hr				
09/20/10	СВН		Prepare and file notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice; review of case docket.			\$30.00	
		Total Legal Fees			0.40	\$60.00	
FEE SUMMA	ARY:						
Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount		
Colleen B Hopkins			0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00		
Total Legal Fo	ees		0.40	5: a	\$60.00		
			osts Advance	<b>d</b>			
	Copying					2.40	
	Total Costs	s Advanced			<del></del>	\$2.40	
			Total Inva	ioo		CO 40	
			Total Invo	ice		\$62.40	
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE		\$62.40	
TRUST BALA	NCE	\$0.00					

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64001 File # 10067-061

Re: Tardif v Alexander Zaja

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees		vi sandine
06/01/10	AB	Prepared and revised Alias Summons. Circulated same to V. Lambdin for filing and service.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
06/22/10	AB	Analysis of defenses to liability re: undisclosed trustee serving as investor of others' money.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/12/10	AB	Prepared for, attended and represented Trustee at Pretrial Conference before Judge Williamson in Tampa, Florida.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
07/14/10	СВН	Prepare order continuing pre-trial conference.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
07/16/10	AB	Reviewed, revised and uploaded Order continuing pre-trial.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
08/12/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend time for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/17/10	АВ	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and hearing on Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
08/31/10	СВН	Prepare and upload order granting motion to extend deadline for service of complaint and continue pre-trial conference.	0.40hr \$150.00/hr	\$60.00
10/11/10	АВ	Revise COS for Order (I) Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint; (II) Granting Motion to Dismiss in Part; and (III) Continuing Pretrial Conference.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
11/17/10	AB -	Draft and revise Second Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
12/14/10	AB	Draft and revise Order granting Second Motion for Extension of Service Deadline.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

# 

\$1,648.50

		Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 1 10067-061	Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-061			
12/21/10	АВ	Draft and revise Request for Service Al Documents. Draft Motion for Issuance		1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00	
12/27/10	AB	Revise and finalize Motion for Issuance Service Abroad and exhibits.	e of Request for	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00	
01/08/11	AB	Finalize and file Motion for Issuance of of Judicial or Extrajudicial Documents.	Request for Service	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00	
01/21/11	АВ	of Request for Service Abroad and upd	Review and consider status of case and Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad and update Pending Cases Chart in preparation for status meeting with R. Elgidely re:			
01/24/11	АВ	Update and file Motion for Issuance of and exhibit.	Request For Service	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00	
02/22/11	АВ	Issuance of Request for Service Abroac proceeding with opening of miscellaneous	Draft, finalize and file Notice of Withdrawal of Motion for Issuance of Request for Service Abroad for purposes of proceeding with opening of miscellaneous case in U.S District Court in order to properly effect service of Original Complaint through Hague Convention			
02/22/11	АВ	Revise Request for Service Abroad direction Court for use by District Court upon open Miscellaneous Case and mail same to District Court.	ening of	0.30hr \$225.00/hr	\$67.50	
02/25/11	AB	Multiple conference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance of Request for Service in Misconference calls with J. Bowers Issuance call with J. Bowers Issuance calls with J. Bowers Issuance call with J. Bowers Issuance calls with J. Bowers Issuance call wit		1.00hr \$225.00/hr	\$225.00	
		Total Legal Fees		8.00	\$1,648.50	
FEE SUMMAR Professional	Y:	Hours	Rate	Amount		
Alexandra Blye Alexandra Blye Colleen B Hopkin	าร	5.60 1.50 0.90	\$210.00 \$225.00 \$150.00	\$1,176.00 \$337.50 \$135.00		

	Costs	s Advanced		
	Copying			8.40
	Postage			1.42
08/20/2010	Airport Parking (10067-061) Alexandra Bl	lye		43.00
	Total Costs Advanced		_	\$52.82
	-	Total Invoice	_	\$1,701.32

8.00

Total Legal Fees ...

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 48 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-061 File # 10067-061 Inv. # 64001

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

\$1,701.32

TRUST BALANCE

\$0.00

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64002 File # 10067-062

Re: Tardif v B.K. Finanz Service GmbH

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Feb 28/11

--- Legal Fees ---

		THE MUSICIPAL PROPERTY OF THE PARTY OF THE P		The state of the s		
07/01/10	AB	Receipt and review attached Answer by analysis of issues.		0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00	
08/11/10	СВН	Prepare and file mo complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend the deadline for service of complaint.			\$45.00
09/13/10	СВН	Prepare and file not docket.	Prepare and file notice of voluntary dismissal; review of docket.			\$60.00
		Total Legal Fees			1.00	\$168.00
FEE SUMMA						
Professiona	ıl		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Blye			0.30	\$210.00	\$63.00	
Colleen B Hop	okins		0.70	\$150.00	\$105.00	
Total Legal F	ees	_	1.00	<del></del>	\$168.00	
	was with the same of the		Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					0.75
	Postage					0.98
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$1.73
			Total Invoi	ce		\$169.73
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE		\$169.73
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.00	)			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64003 File # 10067-063

Re: Tardif v Balance Invest GmbH & Co.

Statement for Services Rendered Through

	THE PROPERTY OF THE PARTY OF TH		Legal Fee	S		
08/11/10	СВН	Prepare and file complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline to serve complaint.			\$45.00
09/17/10	CBH		Final preparation of and filing notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$45.00
		Total Legal Fee	9S		0.60	\$90.00
FEE SUMMA	RY:					
Professional			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Hopk	tins		0.60	\$150.00	\$90.00	
Total Legal Fe	es		0.60	_	\$90.00	
			Costs Advanc	ed		
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.98
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.03
			Total Inv	roice		\$92.03
			OUTSTA	NDING BALANCE		\$92.03
TRUST BALA	NCE	\$	0.00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64004 File # 10067-064

Re: Tardif v Barbara Huber

Statement for Services Rendered Through

		Legal Fees	AMERICA STREET	
06/08/10	AB	Receipt and review of Answer to Complaint. Correspondence to B. Elgidely re: same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
07/09/10	AB	Receipt and review of COS. Revised same for filing.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/12/10	AB	Prepared for, attended and represented Trustee at pre-trial conference before Judge Williamson in Tampa, FL.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
07/14/10	СВН	Prepare order continuing pre-trial conference.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
07/29/10	СВН	Telephone call with JA; re-upload order continuing pre-trial conference.	0.20hr \$150.00/hr	\$30.00
08/13/10	СВН	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/16/10	СВН	Prepare and file amended certificate of service on trustee's motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/17/10	АВ	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and hearing on Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline and Defendant's Motion to Dismiss.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
08/31/10	СВН	Prepare and upload order granting motion to extend deadline for service of complaint and continue pretrial conference.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
10/11/10	АВ	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint and Continuing Pretrial Conference.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
10/16/10	AB	Draft and revise Motion for Voluntary Dismissal and proposed order granting same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 52 of 60

#### Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-064

File # 10067-064 Inv. # 64004

10/29/10	СВН		Final preparation of and filing certificate of service on order dismissing case; service of order.			\$45.00
		Total Legal Fees	es e		4.60	\$870.00
FEE SUMM/ Professiona			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	/e		3.00	\$210.00	\$630.00	
Colleen B Hop			1.60	\$150.00	\$240.00	
Total Legal F	ees		4.60	-	\$870.00	
			Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					8.55
	Postage					2.61
	Total Cost	s Advanced				\$11.16
			Total Invoi	ce		\$881.16
			OUTSTANI	DING BALANCE		\$881.16

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64005 File # 10067-065

Re: Tardif v Baur Finanzkonzept GmbH

Statement for Services Rendered Through

	Senioninger	Legal Fees		
07/06/10	AB	Receipt and review of Notice of Pretrial.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/06/10	АВ	Receipt and review of Motion to Dismiss.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/06/10	AB	Correspondence to R. Elgidely re: responding to Motion to Dismiss.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/08/10	AB	Receipt and review of COS for Notice of Pretrial. Revised same for filing.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
07/13/10	AB	Analysis of Motion to Dismiss; correspondence to M. Mark re: same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
07/13/10	MAM	Review and Analysis of Defendant's Motion to Dismiss; Legal Research regarding MDFL Local Rules Pertaining to Admission to Practice and Appearances of Attorneys; and Drafted Correspondence to R. Elgidely and A. Blye regarding Case Strategy Issues relating to Defendant's Motion to Dismiss and Motion to Strike same.	1.80hr \$240.00/hr	\$432.00
07/27/10	AB	Receipt and review of correspondence with P. Esser re: Notice of Pre-Trial and forwarding same to German Counsel for the Defendant.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00
08/06/10	АВ	Correspondence to P. Esser confirming contact information for German counsel representing defendant.  Correspondence to V. Lambdin re: Amended COS for Notice of Pre-trial.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00
08/06/10	AB	Drafted and Revised Motion to Strike and for Sanctions (3.2). Circulated same to R. Elgidely with brief summary of authority (.2).	3.40hr \$210.00/hr	\$714.00

## Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 54 of 60

File # 10067-065 Inv. # 64005

\$1,982.02

\$1,982.02

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-065

08/06/10	АВ		Receipt and review of COS for Summons and Complaint, and Notice of Pretrial. Revised and filed same.				\$42.00
08/11/10	СВН	Prepare and file complaint.	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.			0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
08/17/10	АВ	conference and	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and hearing on Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline and Defendant's Motion to Dismiss.				\$210.00
08/31/10	СВН		order granting molaint and continue		extend deadline for conference.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00
09/28/10	AB		Draft and revise Order Granting Amended Motion For Voluntary Dismissal.				\$63.00
09/28/10	AB		Review and revise Motion for Voluntary Dismissal. Draft and revise Amended Motion for Voluntary Dismissal.			0.40hr \$210.00/hr	\$84.00
		Total Legal Fee	S			9.30	\$1,971.00
FEE SUMMA Professiona			Hours		Rate	Amount	
Alexandra Bly	e		6.90		\$210.00	\$1,449.00	
Marilee A Marl			1.80		\$240.00	\$432.00	
Colleen B Hop	kins		0.60		\$150.00	\$90.00	
Total Legal Fe	es		9.30		_	\$1,971.00	
			Costs Advar	nced			
	Copying						9.60
	Postage						1.42
	Total Cost	s Advanced					\$11.02

Page 2

Total Invoice

\$0.00

TRUST BALANCE

**OUTSTANDING BALANCE** 

#### Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 55 of 60

## Genovese Joblove & Battista, P.A.

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64006 File # 10067-066

Re: Tardif v BGV Luethi Erwin

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			
09/17/10	СВН	Final preparation o without prejudice.	of and filing notice o	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00	
		Total Legal Fees .	* *		0.30	\$45.00
FEE SUMM Profession			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Ho	pkins		0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.30	_	\$45.00	
		_	- Costs Advance	1		
	Copying					0.30
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$0.30
			Total Invoi	ce		\$45.30
			OUTSTAND	DING BALANCE		\$45.30
TRUST BAL	ANCE	\$0.0	0			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64007 File # 10067-067

Re: Tardif v Christian Brey

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees			THE WEST CONTRACTOR
08/11/10	СВН	Prepare and file complaint.	e motion to extend the	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00	
09/17/10	СВН	Prepare and file prejudice.	Prepare and file notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$45.00
		Total Legal Fee	es		0.60	\$90.00
FEE SUMM						
Professiona	al .		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Colleen B Ho	pkins		0.60	\$150.00	\$90.00	
Total Legal F	ees		0.60	·	\$90.00	
			Costs Advance	d		
	Copying					1.05
	Postage					0.98
	Total Costs	Advanced				\$2.03
			Total Invo	ice		\$92.03
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE	-	\$92.03
TRUST BAL	ANCE	\$	0.00			

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64008 File # 10067-068

Re: Tardif v CM Consult AG

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fees				
08/27/10	СВН		Final preparation of and filing motion to extend deadline for service of complaint. 0.20hr				
09/20/10	СВН	Final preparation without prejudice.	Final preparation of and file notice of voluntary dismissal without prejudice.			\$30.00	
		Total Legal Fees	v		0.40	\$60.00	
FEE SUMM/			Hours	Rate	Amount	ž'	
Colleen B Hop	pkins		0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00		
Total Legal F	ees		0.40		\$60.00		
Pennikanah sebat sa masa			- Costs Advance	d			
	Copying					1.05	
	Postage					0.98	
	Total Costs	Advanced			<del></del>	\$2.03	
			Total Invo	ice		\$62.03	
			OUTSTAN	DING BALANCE		\$62.03	
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.	00				

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64009 File # 10067-069

Re: Tardif v Dieter and Christiane Huck

Statement for Services Rendered Through

			Legal Fee	S-1-			
07/30/10	СВН	Receipt and review of s preparation of second c controversy.			0.50hr \$150.00/hr	\$75.00	
08/25/10	AB		Forrespondence with P. Esser re: terms of settlement 0.30hr greement with Dieter and Christiane Huck. \$210.00/hr				
11/22/10	AB	Review docket and stat Voluntary Dismissal.	eview docket and status of case; draft and revise Motion for 0.50hr sluntary Dismissal. \$210.00/hr				
11/24/10	AB	Revise Motion for Volur granting same for filing.	Revise Motion for Voluntary Dismissal, draft proposed Order granting same for filing.			\$63.00	
		Total Legal Fees			1.60	\$306.00	
FEE SUMMA Professiona		ŀ	Hours	Rate	Amount		
Alexandra Bly Colleen B Hop			1.10 0.50	\$210.00 \$150.00	\$231.00 \$75.00		
Total Legal F	ees		1.60		\$306.00		
			Total Inve	oice	···-	\$306.00	
			OUTSTAN	NDING BALANCE	<del> </del>	\$306.00	
TRUST BALA	ANCE	\$0.00					

100 Southeast Second Street, 44th Floor Miami, Florida 33131 Telephone (305) 349-2300 Facsimile (305) 349-2310 Employer ID# 65-0518134

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 8695 College Parkway Suite 1220 Fort Myers, FL 33919 March 25, 2011 Inv. # 64010 File # 10067-070

Re: Tardif v Dr. Matthias Grassmann

Statement for Services Rendered Through

Legal Fees							
07/01/10	АВ	Receipt and review of correspondence with attached German Answer by Defendant re: translation and explanation of Defendant's arguments.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00			
08/13/10	CBH	Prepare and file motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00			
08/16/10	СВН	Prepare and file amended certificate of service of motion to extend deadline for service of complaint.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00			
08/17/10	АВ	Prepared for, attended and represented client at pre-trial conference and hearing on Trustee's Motion to Extend Service Deadline.	1.00hr \$210.00/hr	\$210.00			
08/31/10	СВН	Prepare and upload order granting motion to extend time for service of complaint and continued pre-trial conference.	0.30hr \$150.00/hr	\$45.00			
10/11/10	AB	Draft and revise COS on Order Granting Trustee's Motion to Extend Deadline for Service of Complaint and Continuing Pretrial Conference.	0.20hr \$210.00/hr	\$42.00			
11/15/10	AB	Draft Motion for Voluntary Dismissal and proposed Order granting same.	0.30hr \$210.00/hr	\$63.00			
		Total Legal Fees	2.70	\$513.00			

# Case 9:08-bk-04360-MGW Doc 605-5 Filed 03/31/11 Page 60 of 60

Robert E. Tardif, Jr. Chapter 7 Trustee 10067-070 File # 10067-070 Inv. # 64010

FEE SUMMARY:
--------------

Professional	Hours	Rate	Amount
Alexandra Blye	1.80	\$210.00	\$378.00
Colleen B Hopkins	0.90	\$150.00	\$135.00
Total Legal Fees	2.70		\$513.00

Cost	s Advanced	
Copying		5.55
Postage		1.73
Total Costs Advanced		\$7.28
	N N	
	Total Invoice	\$520.28
	OUTSTANDING BALANCE	\$520.28

TRUST BALANCE

\$0.00