

**EXHIBIT B – PRE-PETITION FEES OF FOWLER WHITE BURNETT, P.A.**  
**CASE NO. 9:08-BK-04360-ALP**  
**CASE NO. 9:08-BK-04365-ALP**

**DETAIL**

| <b>Date</b> | <b>Description</b>  | <b>Timekeeper</b> | <b>Hours</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|-------------|---|-------------------|--------------|---------------|
| 10/4/2007   | Initial meeting with client, open matter  | KIB               | 1            | \$365.00      |
| 10/5/2007   | Conference S. Soto, J. Martinez re garnishment at Wachovia, SunTrust Bank, discovery, bond issues                           | KIB               | 0.4          | \$146.00      |
| 10/5/2007   | Phone call to Shutts & Bowen, S. Goldman, re assets of U. Engler, pending discovery   | KIB               | 0.2          | \$73.00       |
| 10/5/2007   | Phone call to C. Thier re Engler, PCO Client Management LLC, search corporate records                                       | KIB               | 0.4          | \$146.00      |
| 10/5/2007   | Meet with client, discuss several issues of facts and legal strategy  | KIB               | 1            | \$365.00      |
| 10/5/2007   | Several calls to client/from client   | KIB               | 0.4          | NC            |
| 10/5/2007   | Copy client file, organize and review   | KIB               | 0.3          | NC            |
| 10/5/2007   | Phone call from client re possible consolidation of cases of several plaintiffs   | KIB               | 0.1          | NC            |
| 10/8/2007   | Correspondence from client, preliminary review, and respond   | KIB               | 0.25         | NC            |
| 10/10/2007  | Perform numerous court, web and/or autotrack searches regarding Ulrich Felix Engler, etc.; Discuss same with Kirsten Baier; | EQG               | 2.6          | \$325.00      |
| 10/10/2007  | Conference EG re asset/background search  | KIB               | 0.1          | \$36.50       |
| 10/10/2007  | Review additional background search documents   | KIB               | 0.2          | \$73.00       |
| 10/10/2007  | Conference EG re Wachovia account information   | KIB               | 0.1          | \$36.50       |
| 10/10/2007  | Conference JM re preparation of complaint   | KIB               | 0.2          | NC            |
| 10/10/2007  | Prepare documents for litigation, file organization   | KIB               | 0.5          | NC            |
| 10/10/2007  | Phone call to client, advise re status  | KIB               | 0.1          | NC            |
| 10/10/2007  | Phone call from client, discuss strategy and additional concerns  | KIB               | 0.2          | NC            |
| 10/11/2007  | Phone conference S. Soto, J. Hofman re Wachovia   | KIB               | 0.2          | \$73.00       |
| 10/15/2007  | Phone call from client re status  | KIB               | 0.1          | NC            |

|            |  |     |      |          |
|------------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 10/18/2007 | Review client documents in preparation for drafting of complaint; conference with K. Baier regarding same; conference with S. Soto regarding ability to assert a claim for securities fraud under Florida's Statute. | JXM | 4.1  | NC       |
| 10/18/2007 | Conference JM re facts   | KIB | 0.2  | \$73.00  |
| 10/19/2007 | Continue preparation of complaint.   | JXM | 2.1  | NC       |
| 10/19/2007 | Phone call to client, update re status   | KIB | 0.1  | NC       |
| 10/22/2007 | Preparation of Complaint.  | JXM | 1.4  | NC       |
| 10/24/2007 | Conference JM re hearing, TRO, phone call to client re status, conference JM re facts, investment programs   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 10/24/2007 | Continue preparation of complaint.   | JXM | 4.1  | NC       |
| 10/25/2007 | E.G. re update of pending litigation reports and records, correspondence to client re same   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 10/25/2007 | Preparation of complaint and motion for temporary injunction without notice.   | JXM | 4    | NC       |
| 10/26/2007 | Discussions with Ms. Baier regarding additional searches for Ulrich Engler / Richie Engler; Perform same and discuss search results with Ms. Baier;  | EQG | 5.8  | \$725.00 |
| 10/26/2007 | Conference J.M., E.G. re case status, litigation, assets search update   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 10/26/2007 | Review additional documents, E.G. re property records  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 10/26/2007 | Conference E.G. re search results, search of additional names, addresses   | KIB | 0.2  | \$73.00  |
| 10/26/2007 | Review additional research, background documents for U. Engler   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 10/26/2007 | Finalize complaint; preparation of motion for emergency temporary injunction.  | JXM | 5    | NC       |
| 10/26/2007 | Review of complaint, motion, conference J.M., prepare correspondence to client re same, and verification   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 10/26/2007 | Prepare correspondence to client re same   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 10/30/2007 | Telephone conference with Kirsten Baier regarding additional searches pertaining to Ulrich Engler/ Richie Engler;  | EQG | 0.2  | \$25.00  |
| 10/30/2007 | Conf. E.G., prepare correspondence to client re complaint, factual questions, review response, documents   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 11/2/2007  | Further research in preparation for hearing on emergency motion for temporary injunction.                                   | JXM | 3    | NC       |
| 11/2/2007  | Phone call from client re status, review of client's e-mail, address client's concerns, follow-up re status of hearing date | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 11/7/2007  | Phone call from client, re status,  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 11/12/2007 | Phone call from client re case status, open issues  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 11/13/2007 | Office conference re status, phone call to client re motion, hearing date, receive/review correspondence                    | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 11/14/2007 | Review background search documents  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 11/14/2007 | Follow up on bank information, account records at Wachovia bank, several phone calls re same                                | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 11/14/2007 | Several phone calls to Lee County Court and scheduling of emergency hearing   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 11/14/2007 | Prepare fax correspondence to Court re same   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 11/14/2007 | EJ re service of complaint, motion  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 11/14/2007 | EJ re proposed revisions of complaint and motion, scheduling  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 11/14/2007 | Phone call from client, advise and discuss  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 11/15/2007 | Phone call from Lee County court, J.A. for J. McIver  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 11/15/2007 | Phone call to client re same, documentation of emergency  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 11/15/2007 | Address revisions of motion, prepare memorandum re additional records and substantiation of emergency, conf. JXM            | KIB | 0.7  | NC       |
| 11/15/2007 | Conference with K. Baier regarding motion for injunction relief; begin amendment of same.                                   | JXM | 1    | NC       |
| 11/15/2007 | Review client documents, prepare translations   | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 11/16/2007 | Perform searches in Lee County and Charlotte County in search of new information;   | EQG | 1.3  | \$162.50 |
| 11/16/2007 | E.G. re update of litigation records  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 11/16/2007 | Review additional records   | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 11/16/2007 | Correspondence from client, respond   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 11/19/2007 | Prepare affidavit re bank accounts  | KIB | 1.3  | \$474.50 |
| 11/19/2007 | Prepare 2 mails to JM re same   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 11/19/2007 | Continue work on translations, revisions  | KIB | 2.4  | \$876.00 |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 11/19/2007 | Review and analyze emails from K. Baier regarding developments with Engler.   | JXM | 0.3  | \$105.00 |
| 11/20/2007 | Work on file; EG and CB re: international arrest warrant documentation,   | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 11/21/2007 | Client correspondence; respond  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 11/26/2007 | Conducted comprehensive research to locate information regarding the alleged international warrant regarding Ulrich Engler; multiple conversations with the FBI Liaison in Germany; and prepared a memorandum to file regarding findings. | CWB | 2.25 | \$247.50 |
| 11/26/2007 | Client correspondence re arrest warrants, office conference re status, revisions of complaint, conference CB re international warrant   | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 11/26/2007 | Several conferences CB, phone conference T. Kohl re update, revise documents, review amended complaint  | KIB | 1.2  | \$438.00 |
| 11/26/2007 | Prepare correspondence to T. Kohl   | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 11/26/2007 | Preparation of amended complaint to allege Engler is concealing whereabouts; research on service of process in that situation.  | JXM | 5.2  | NC       |
| 11/27/2007 | Several correspondence from T. Kohl re arrest warrants, pending investigations, results, respond  | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 11/27/2007 | Review of file and preparation of subpoena for deposition to Spiegel & Utrera, P.A. as registering agents of Private Commercial Office, Inc. and the individual with the most knowledge of the whereabouts of Ulrich Engler.              | CWB | 0.75 | \$82.50  |
| 11/27/2007 | Preparation of amended motion for temporary injunction.   | JXM | 3    | NC       |
| 11/27/2007 | Review office memo CB re same, organize file  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 11/28/2007 | Correspondence from German counsel, respond, phone call from client, discuss additional developments, amended complaint, pending deposition, motion for preliminary injunction, office conference re status of service on defendants      | KIB | 0.8  | \$292.00 |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 11/29/2007 | Revise/finalize KIB affidavit in support of motion for injunction   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 11/29/2007 | Continue preparation of amended motion for temporary injunction.  | JXM | 1.7  | NC       |
| 11/30/2007 | Begin preparation of subpoena to banks.   | JXM | 1.1  | \$385.00 |
| 11/30/2007 | Review revisions of Motion for Injunction, draft affidavit for T. Kohl  | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 12/3/2007  | Correspondence T. Kohl re draft of affidavit of T. Kohl; prosecutor statement; office conference re same  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 12/3/2007  | Finalize draft of affidavit, correspondence to T. Kohl  | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 12/4/2007  | Office conference re motion for injunction, review motion, prepare further revisions; correspondence from T. Kohl re affidavit, revise affidavit, prepare response to T. Kohl; further review of documents, organization of proof of assets (motor vehicles, real property, corporate records) for motion | KIB | 1.8  | \$657.00 |
| 12/5/2007  | Prepare for deposition of Spiegel & Utrera P.A.; telephone call to Spiegel & Utrera regarding same; review and analyze letter sent by Spiegel & Utrera regarding lack of knowledge of whereabouts of Engler.  | JXM | 1    | \$350.00 |
| 12/5/2007  | Review issue of diligent search for service by publication and compliance with requirements; continue review of search documents  | KIB | 1.2  | \$438.00 |
| 12/5/2007  | Office conference re status of service, deposition, conference JM re revisions of motion  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 12/5/2007  | Review of file and prepared Motion to Compel Spiegel & Utrera, P.A., Registered Agent for Defendant, Private Commercial Office, Inc., to appear for deposition and for Sanctions.   | CWB | 1.75 | NC       |
| 12/6/2007  | Phone calls to T. Kohl re affidavit, Austrian Supervisory Agency re pending investigations  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 12/6/2007  | Continue work on file, documents, analyze real properties ownership, further revise motion, receive and review correspondence and affidavit from T. Kohl, prepare response, office conference re same   | KIB | 1.8  | \$657.00 |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 12/6/2007  | Phone call from client re case status, address client's questions   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/7/2007  | Office conference re motion, service  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/10/2007 | Review revised motion, further modify motion, office conference re same   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 12/11/2007 | Research constructive trust, resulting trust  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/11/2007 | Revise motion, coordinate exhibits  | KIB | 1    | NC       |
| 12/11/2007 | Review status of service, motion to compel, review filed documents, prepare correspondence to client re same  | KIB | 0.6  | NC       |
| 12/11/2007 | Began conducting research on constructive trusts in preparation of motions being filed before the court.  | CWB | 1    | NC       |
| 12/12/2007 | Review additional research re constructive trust for real property and motor vehicles, RB re same   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 12/12/2007 | Office conference re process service, affidavit of diligent search, final revisions of motion   | KIB | 0.7  | NC       |
| 12/12/2007 | Continued comprehensive internet research on Lexis on Constructive Trusts and relevant case law, in preparation of motions being filed before the court.  | CWB | 2    | NC       |
| 12/13/2007 | Work on file and continue analysis of documents; phone call to T. Kohl re affidavit; phone call from client re status and open issues; office conference and discuss our recommendation to client   | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 12/13/2007 | Continue review and analysis of real estate transactions, encumbrances and title updates, for real properties, analysis of 2 real estate transaction for 450 k and 600 k, further search public records, name identity issue for Richie and Ulrich Engler, order certified title search | KIB | 1.4  | \$511.00 |
| 12/13/2007 | Research substituted service, office conference re expedited service  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/13/2007 | Review verification, exhibits, JM re same   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/13/2007 | Prepare correspondence to client  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 12/14/2007 | Research corporate records of State of Idaho for information pertaining to Douglas Investments LLC; Research corporate records of State of Florida for corporate information pertaining to Deep Creek Developments; Research Charlotte County Property Appraiser's Office for information pertaining to the three units and the lots as to ownership and value of property; Map searches of properties as to location and adjacent properties; Title Searches for units and lots; Review title search and obtain copies of documents for current owners and open mortgages; | LF  | 3    | \$390.00 |
| 12/14/2007 | C.B. re review vehicle records, lien searches, organize documents   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 12/14/2007 | LF re title search, follow chain of title, encumbrances, several properties   | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 12/14/2007 | Review title report for condominium property and lots 6 and 7, Illinois corp. records for Douglas Investments, prepare file memo  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 12/14/2007 | Review Deep Creek Condominium search records, review file memo, revise  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 12/14/2007 | Research Florida Div. of Corporations for developer license records; research Porches of Deep Creek rental business by buyer, research misc. addresses  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 12/14/2007 | E.J. re service returns status, correspondence to court for hearing   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/14/2007 | Prepare additional correspondence regarding real properties and status of case to client  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 12/17/2007 | Conducted comprehensive research on automobiles currently registered to Engler for purposes of continued litigation into this matter.   | CWB | 2.75 | \$302.50 |
| 12/17/2007 | CB re car titles, review, discuss valuation   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 12/17/2007 | Review client correspondence, office conference re filing of motion   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/17/2007 | Review affidavit from T. Kohl conference EJ/JM re service and return of process; finalize exhibits to motion and correspondence to Court  | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |

|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 12/17/2007 | Finalize emergency motion.  | JXM | 0.8  | NC       |
| 12/18/2007 | Follow up on service of complaint, returns of service   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/18/2007 | Review client correspondence, respond   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/19/2007 | Complete pending litigation search, state and federal   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 12/19/2007 | Phone calls to process server, confirm service on Private Commercial Office, review return of service on U. Engler  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/19/2007 | Phone call from client, search case records for alleged attachment, respond to client's questions re status and collection of assets, including a contingency fee agreement, attachment bond                                  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/19/2007 | Prepare correspondence to client  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 12/20/2007 | Several phone calls re process service returns, review corporate return of service for Private Commercial Office, returns of non-service  | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 12/20/2007 | Prepare correspondence to Judge re motion for preliminary injunction, hearing date  | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 12/20/2007 | Several calls to/from Attorney Subpoena Service, UPS Store at Cape Coral for service address, research and coordinate statutory mailbox service (FS 48.031(6))  | KIB | 0.8  | NC       |
| 12/21/2007 | Several calls to process service, confirm receipt of additional service documents for PC Client Management, Inc., filing of return of service and issuance of additional summons, return of documents, correspondence re same | KIB | 0.8  | NC       |
| 12/26/2007 | Phone call to process server, confirm private mailbox service on U. Engler, return of service filed of 12-21-07, answer due date January 10, 2008   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/26/2007 | Phone call to Court, JM re hearing on motion for preliminary injunction, calendar for January 2, 2008   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/27/2007 | Research records for PCO Client Management, A. Neumeier-Fuchs, find real property in subject's name, research corp. background, individuals,  | KIB | 0.7  | \$255.50 |
| 12/27/2007 | Verify service on court docket on U. Engler, calendar response  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |



|            |   |     |      |          |
|------------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 12/27/2007 | Follow up on service on PCO Client Management, Inc., review return of non-service, prepare for filing, prepare alias summons, phone call to process server re same, verify mailing address                                  | KIB | 1    | NC       |
| 12/27/2007 | Review return of service on Private Commercial Office, prepare for filing, phone call to process server re same   | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 12/28/2007 | Revised Summons for service to Secretary of State; and conducted internet research to confirm process of service by the Secretary of State.   | CWB | 1.25 | NC       |
| 12/28/2007 | Phone calls to process servers, follow up on Federal Express delivery   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 12/28/2007 | Prepare further summons for service on PCO Client Management, Inc. for Fla. Secretary of State, research applicable statute, conference CB re same; revise summons, correspondence to process server and phone call re same | KIB | 0.9  | NC       |
| 12/28/2007 | Correspondence from process servers re procedure of service and respond   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 12/31/2007 | Discussion with KB regarding Angelika Neumeier-Fuchs; Perform numerous searches regarding A. Neumeier-Fuchs; Meet and discuss outcome of my searches with KB;   | EQG | 2    | \$250.00 |
| 12/31/2007 | Review file records for other service address for A. Neumeier-Fuchs; order Autotrack search, one call to B. Gorman re return of service and further summons for PCO Client Management                                       | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 12/31/2007 | Phone call Ody's service, confirm non-service on PCO Client Management, A. Neumeier-Fuchs   | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 12/31/2007 | Prepare further summons, correspondence to process service; research notice of conversion claim requirements  | KIB | 1    | NC       |
| 1/2/2008   | Perform additional searches for KB regarding A. Neumeier-Fuchs and discuss same with KB;  | EQG | 1    | \$125.00 |
| 1/2/2008   | EG re further background search for Angelika Neumeier-Fuchs, review records   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |

|          |  |     |      |          |
|----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/2/2008 | Review additional records for Angelika Neumeier-Fuchs  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 1/3/2008 | Phone call to process server re service on Angelika Neumeier-Fuchs; conference CB, ED re status of service returns, documentation for bank subpoenas; conf. JM re same; review draft subpoenas   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 1/3/2008 | Preparations for continued attempted service on defendants and/or default issues and preparation of upcoming events.   | CWB | 1    | NC       |
| 1/3/2008 | Analysis of additional requirements to ensure proper service on all defendants.  | JXM | 0.8  | NC       |
| 1/3/2008 | Phone call to client, advise re status of case, correspondence to client   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 1/4/2008 | Prepared Notice of Deposition regarding SunTrust and Wachovia; and prepared Subpoenas Duces Tecum for SunTrust and Wachovia.   | CWB | 1.75 | \$192.50 |
| 1/4/2008 | Phone call to process server re A. Neumeier Fuchs, instruct re repeated attempts; request and review phone records for A. Neumeier Fuchs, corporate address for PCO Client Management at residence, other companies activities, longtime association with U. Engler since 1998 | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 1/7/2008 | Review state and federal records, court dockets; phone calls to/from process server re pending service on PCO Client Management  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 1/8/2008 | Review notices of depositions of banks' custodians; follow up on service on PCO Client Management  | KIB | 0.2  | \$73.00  |
| 1/9/2008 | Review subpoenas issued to banks SunTrust, Wachovia, conference B. Becker re same; phone call to process server re service on A. Neumeier-Fuchs, affidavits of service, conf. C. Becker re entry of default motions  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 1/9/2008 | Prepared Motions for Default and Defaults regarding PCO, Inc. and Ulrich Engler.   | CWB | 1.25 | NC       |
| 1/9/2008 | Conference C. Becker, review motions for entry of default  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 1/9/2008 | Phone call from client and discuss status and circumstances of case in detail  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/10/2008 | Receive/review correspondence from SunTrust bank, re subpoenas, conference JM/CB re same;  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 1/11/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client re bank subpoenas, default motions; conference CB and confirm filings; prepare client correspondence re federal/state cases search. | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 1/14/2008 | Telephone conference with representative of Wachovia regarding amount of documents to be produced.   | JXM | 0.3  | \$105.00 |
| 1/16/2008 | Phone calls to process service re PCO Client Management, Inc. service; follow up on service returns, subpoena service to banks; prepare correspondence to client     | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 1/17/2008 | Conference EJ re service, receive, review returns of service, prepare correspondence to client.  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 1/18/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss bank subpoenas, costs, outlook on litigation, detailed discussion of client's questions  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 1/23/2008 | Phone conf. with SunTrust Bank record custodian, re: costs of documents and order statements of account(s) at flat fee, prepare confirmation re same, conf. CB       | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 1/23/2008 | Receipt and review of SunTrust response to subpoena for documents; and sent facsimile confirming we only want the Account Statements at this time.                   | CWB | 0.75 | \$82.50  |
| 1/24/2008 | Telephone conferences with the Lee County Clerk regarding the default against Engler.  | CWB | 1    | NC       |
| 1/24/2008 | Office conference (CB) re default entry against Engler, motion for default against PC Client Management, default judgment  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 1/25/2008 | Review client correspondence and documents re same; conference EG re litigation for update re: pending litigation by Urban & Thier.                                  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 1/25/2008 | Handle incoming call from KB requesting a search of lawsuits represented by Urban & Thier, etc.; Begin search of same;   | EQG | 0.8  | \$100.00 |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/25/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss case developments in detail, discuss procedure and steps taken by other plaintiffs and Urban & Thier, P.A.   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 1/25/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 1/28/2008 | Perform numerous searches throughout different counties in Florida in order to find new lawsuits against Ulrich Engler, PCO Client Management Inc., etc.; Conference with attorney to discuss outcome of my search and my findings in Orange County Florida; Back and forth phone calls with the Orange County Court to obtain numerous pleading in the matter of Congro Finanz AG v. Private Commercial Office, etc.; Back and forth communications with outside service obtained to acquire court pleadings; | EQG | 6.3  | \$787.50 |
| 1/28/2008 | Various calls with K. Baier regarding Judgment obtaining by Congro Finanz A.G; analysis of benefits of an involuntary Bankruptcy.  | JXM | 1    | \$350.00 |
| 1/28/2008 | Conference/correspondence E.G. re documents retrieval from Orange County case; request additional documents; review entries of writs of garnishment.   | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 1/28/2008 | JM conference re discovery against Urban & Thier, A. Neumeier-Fuchs  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 1/28/2008 | Conference E.G. re Orange County case, review documents, conferences JM, RN re analysis and strategy has pending litigation and filing an involuntary bankruptcy petition.   | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 1/28/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 1/29/2008 | Receive and review correspondence from client; receive and review first set of documents from Orange County Clerk's office; phone calls from W.F. Greenberg, Orange County Service, conference E.G. re remaining documents, conference CB re lien recordings, status of motor vehicles   | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/29/2008 | Receive and review second set of documents from Orange County Court; receive and review Motion to Quash Service and dismiss complaint against PCO Client Management, re same, conference JM re deposition; conference JM re notices of conversion; review notices of conversion, discuss timing, and effect on default judgment, order and review search on Martina Hartwich | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 1/29/2008 | Various discussions with K. Baier regarding Congro; Review and analyze pleadings in Congro file; Review and analyze motion to quash service filed by PCO client; telephone conference with process server regarding same.  | JXM | 1.8  | \$630.00 |
| 1/29/2008 | Receive and review court pleadings from Orange County; Discussions with KB regarding same; Continue to assist KB with searches regarding various parties;  | EQG | 2.1  | \$262.50 |
| 1/29/2008 | Assisted with immediate issues regarding getting the Final Judgment in this matter as well as the Default against PCO Client Management.   | CWB | 2.75 | NC       |
| 1/29/2008 | Conference RGN/JM, analyze issues and procedure for involuntary bankruptcy application against defendants, address funding, and pursuit of claims, recommendations to client, review requirements for creditors' application.  | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 1/29/2008 | Office conference with KIB regarding potential for challenge to other parties' judgment liens; involuntary bankruptcy; and other alternatives.   | RGN | 0.5  | \$200.00 |
| 1/29/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client, and provide initial documents for Orange County case, attempt to call client and leave message.  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 1/29/2008 | Phone call to client and discuss developments and Orange County case in detail, analyze recommendations to client and details of the recommended involuntary bankruptcy  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/30/2008 | Follow a lead into the Collier County Court and inform KB that Congro Finanz AG was also suing Douglas Investments; Obtain numerous assignments involving numerous parties from KB in the pursuit of information regarding Ulrich Engler, etc.; Back and forth discussions with KB to keep her apprised of my findings; Receive and review additional court pleadings from the Orange County Court and discuss same with KB; | EQG | 5.8  | \$725.00 |
| 1/30/2008 | Conference E.G re additional research in other counties re Douglas Investments and involved individuals; review additional documents from Orange County Court, EG re same, phone call from W.F. Greenberg re sealed documents  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 1/30/2008 | Receive and review lis pendens and docket sheet of case v. Douglas Investment; review Orange County docket update  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 1/30/2008 | Continued handling issues resulting from our attempts to secure default judgments against defendants.  | CWB | 1    | NC       |
| 1/30/2008 | Receive and review court's denial of entry of default on U. Engler; prepare revised return of service, conference server re same;  | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 1/30/2008 | Analysis of affidavit of involuntary bankruptcy; conference with Baier regarding same.   | JXM | 0.5  | \$175.00 |
| 1/30/2008 | Office conference with KIB re involuntary bankruptcies; review forms; determine that they must be three separate cases; discussion re obtaining local co-counsel in the Middle District of Florida in order to avoid potential "hometown issues."  | RGN | 0.5  | \$200.00 |
| 1/30/2008 | Receive and review several correspondence from client, including attached documents re assignment of claims  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 1/30/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss additional documents, strategy, proposed settlement with Engler, surrogates  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |

|           |   |     |      |          |
|-----------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 1/31/2008 | Conference JM, CB, EJ and review notice of deposition of A. Neumeier-Fuchs and re-service; same re-notice of deposition of M. Hartwich, review subpoenas  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 1/31/2008 | Continue to follow through with various assignments from KB as we continue to search for related lawsuits, including but not limited to searches using Sunbiz, PACER and/or various court county links; Back and forth conferences with KB to discuss several findings; Back and forth telephone calls and/or facsimiles with court services to obtain additional documents from Orange County;                 | EQG | 6.7  | \$837.50 |
| 1/31/2008 | Conference EG and review Notice of removal and pleadings in case against Douglas Investments, request additional documents, review additional searches re Deep Creek Development, Engler Land Sales,.   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 1/31/2008 | Continuing working on issues regarding defaults against defendants; prepared new Pluries Summons against PCO; telephone conferences with API, new investigative and process serving company in Lee County; prepared Subpoena DT for Deposition of Angelika Fuchs; and prepared correspondence to API for service of process of Summons and Amended Complaint and Subpoena DT for Deposition for Angelika Fuchs. | CWB | 2.75 | NC       |
| 1/31/2008 | Conference JM, CB, EJ re service on U. Engler, review and revise renewed motion for entry of default coordinate with process server, coordinate refiling and submission to court  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 1/31/2008 | Conference with K. Baier regarding pending issues; various telephone calls to court regarding default against Engler.   | JXM | 1    | NC       |
| 1/31/2008 | Preparation of, revision of Affidavits of Claims and Limited Power of Attorney re proposed involuntary Chapter 7 cases.   | RGN | 1    | \$400.00 |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 1/31/2008 | Conference RN re applications for involuntary bankruptcy; possible settlement strategy, conference JM re same; strategy in pending case  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/1/2008  | Conference CB re service on A. Neumeier-Fuchs, summons, subpoena for deposition  | KIB | 0.2  | \$73.00  |
| 2/1/2008  | EG re Court documents on additional case filing, review additional filings on 3 cases,   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/1/2008  | Receive and discuss court pleadings with KB;   | EQG | 0.8  | NC       |
| 2/1/2008  | Phone call from client, discuss new developments new case filings, removal of case against Douglas Investments to federal court, discovery to Autoquest, receipt of bank records and effects on case, insolvency filing and proposed settlement, discuss details of client's claim and handling in insolvency proceeding, proposed documentation and internal agreements, strategy and procedure information | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/4/2008  | Review and revise draft applications for involuntary petitions, client documents re internal agreements with other creditors.  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 2/4/2008  | Phone conference with client re status, pending issues re litigation, insolvency, documentation for other creditors.   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/4/2008  | Receive and review additional correspondence and documents from client   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 2/5/2008  | Review client correspondence and documents re issue of FBI involvement, assignment of claims, conference LA Sanchez and discuss filing of a complaint with the FBI, review King & Krieg Inc. information   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/5/2008  | Telephone conferences with Process Server/Investigators API regarding effectuating service on PCO Client and/or Fuchs and prepared documents to and for API.   | CWB | 1.5  | NC       |
| 2/5/2008  | Conference EJ re status of revised motion for default, filing of amended return of service, setting motion for hearing   | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |



|          |  |     |      |          |
|----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 2/5/2008 | Office conference with RN re response from R. Carlton and required information, further analyze and discuss interest/usury issue and commissions paid, involvement of FBI, effect on client's claims           | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/5/2008 | Conference CB re service on PCO Client Management, to proceed as in Congro Finanz  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 2/5/2008 | Office continue conference with R.N. re insolvency procedure, collection and criminal prosecution issues, conference call to Roberta Colton and leave message  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/5/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client and advise of details re insolvency proceeding, claims, costs   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 2/6/2008 | Receive and review motion to quash bank subpoenas and for protective order from S. Burkhardt, correspondence from JM to opposing counsel re deposition of M. Hartwich  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/6/2008 | Conference CB, JM, EJ re Wachovia bank records, additional SunTrust Bank records, conference CB re status of service on PCO Client Management  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/6/2008 | Review and analyze motion for protective order regarding subpoenas issued to banks; conference with C. Becker and K. Baier regarding same; begin review of Wachovia documents.                                 | JXM | 1.5  | \$525.00 |
| 2/6/2008 | Review additional documents in cases filed by Congro Finanz/Primus/Hima, subpoenas to SunTrust Bank, Bank of America   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/6/2008 | Dealt with matters regarding service of process for PCO; and follow-up with API regarding service of process of PCO Client Management.   | CWB | 1.5  | NC       |
| 2/6/2008 | Analysis of issues regarding whether a party who files a limited appearance to contest service of process can file other or additional pleadings concurrently therewith without waiving the limited appearance | TWA | 2.1  | NC       |
| 2/6/2008 | Conference RN, draft case notes memorandum for RN, R. Colton re conflict check, correspondence re: same.   | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 2/6/2008  | Phone call to client re pending issues, creditors for insolvency application, usury interest issue, client's distributor agreement, analysis of actions by German distributors, involvement of FBI, and options for recovery of funds  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/7/2008  | Comprehensive review of bank records produced by SunTrust and Wachovia regarding PCO Client Management and Private Commercial Management to locate wire transfers of significant amounts.  | CWB | 3.75 | \$412.50 |
| 2/7/2008  | Conference EJ re filing of return of service on U. Engler, filing of renewed motion for entry of default, confirmation of assigned judge   | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 2/7/2008  | Review correspondence RN, RC re conflicts.   | KIB | 0.2  | \$73.00  |
| 2/8/2008  | Finalized SunTrust and Wachovia bank records review to identify significant wire transfers.  | CWB | 1.75 | \$192.50 |
| 2/8/2008  | Receive and analyze additional court documents for pending cases; prepare memorandum to JM/CB re service and non-objection in Congro case.   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/8/2008  | Check Collier, Orange, Lee and Charlotte County Courts for any new developments; Scan same to KB for her review; Begin to organize / categorize files in light of the many searches performed;   | EQG | 1.8  | \$225.00 |
| 2/8/2008  | EJ correspondence re new judge, review letter from JM re deposition of M Hartwich  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 2/11/2008 | Prepared memorandum regarding bank records; and sent correspondence to API on update regarding service of process for PCO Client Management.   | CWB | 1.75 | \$192.50 |
| 2/11/2008 | Conference CB re bank records review, request additional records   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/11/2008 | Review/revise applications/statement of claims for involuntary bankruptcy; review issue of usury interest, promissory notes/loan agreements, constructive trust, claim for commissions issue, correspondence, conference RGN re applications, claims and interest, commissions and nature of investment vs. loans. | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |

|           |   |     |      |          |
|-----------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 2/11/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss billing, payments and current/future terms  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 2/12/2008 | Conference CB re SunTrust, Wachovia records, review Memorandum from CB  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/12/2008 | Continued to deal with matters regarding service of process of PCO Client Management, Inc.  | CWB | 1    | NC       |
| 2/12/2008 | Conference with K. Baier regarding involuntary proceeding and whether to halt litigation.   | JXM | 0.2  | \$70.00  |
| 2/12/2008 | Conference RGN, JM re continued litigation and costs, respond to client   | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 2/13/2008 | Continued to deal with issues regarding the bank records subpoenaed and produced and the service of process for PCO.  | CWB | 1.5  | \$165.00 |
| 2/13/2008 | Review details of bank records, incoming, outgoing vs. sweep transactions with CB, discuss request for additional bank records  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/13/2008 | Receive/review appearance of co-counsel by Webner Miller for PCO Client Management, forward to client   | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 2/13/2008 | Phone call from client, detailed discussion of developments and strategy re insolvency proceedings, proceeding against A. Neumeier-Fuchs  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/14/2008 | Review of bank records, conferences with attorneys' on records and preparation of letters to Wachovia Bank and SunTrust regarding additional documents and continued compliance with subpoenas duces tecum previously served. | CWB | 3.25 | \$357.50 |
| 2/14/2008 | Review correspondence to banks requesting additional account documents; analyze, prepare recommendation to client for future steps  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/14/2008 | Receive/review returns of service of complaint, subpoena, etc. on PCO Client Management, forward to client  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |
| 2/15/2008 | Receive/review client correspondence and documents, review and request monthly account statements, phone call from client   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 2/19/2008 | Conducted internet searches in Charlotte and Orange Counties to update docket reports regarding cases involving Engler; searched the US Middle District Court for updated docket reports on cases involving Engler; and review and updated docketing information in Lee County on the case herein. | CWB | 2.25 | \$247.50 |
| 2/19/2008 | Review additional litigation search documents, review federal court pleadings in Congro Finanz/Douglas Investment case, motion to strike defenses and in JP Morgan case, writ of garnishment served on SunTrust Bank, Cape Coral   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/19/2008 | Receive and review documents from additional two creditors, Schmitt, Mueller and revise affidavits of claim  | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 2/19/2008 | Receive, review and analyze correspondence and documents from client re interest/yield payments, draft letter to defendants to waive usury interest if any, respond to client re documents and wire of deposit for insolvency application  | KIB | 1.3  | \$474.50 |
| 2/19/2008 | EJ re confirmation of hearing on default motion for H. Engler, analyze pending motions and status of case and prepare memorandum to JM   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 2/20/2008 | Revise letter to debtors re calculation of interest rate for return on investment  | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/20/2008 | Finalize revision of insolvency applications   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 2/22/2008 | Further revise three affidavits of claim, revise usurious interest letter, add demand under note; office conference re same with RGN, discuss possible litigation upon filing of insolvency.   | KIB | 0.5  | NC       |
| 2/22/2008 | Further revise usurious interest letter, prepare memo to RGN   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 2/25/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss insolvency and proposed affidavits of claims.  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |

|           |  |     |      |          |
|-----------|--|-----|------|----------|
| 2/27/2008 | Phone call to C. Thier, J. Urban, leave detailed message for both C. Thier and John Urban; prepare correspondence to client, provide additional documents and copies re pending matters  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 2/27/2008 | Docket and documents review in preparation of upcoming hearing.  | CWB | 1.75 | NC       |
| 2/27/2008 | Office conference (EJ) re hearing on 3/3/08 on our revised motion for default against U. Engler  | KIB | 0.1  | NC       |
| 2/27/2008 | Phone call from client, discuss status of case, possible settlement of case; issues for insolvency application, representation of other creditors  | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 2/28/2008 | Preparations for upcoming hearing.   | CWB | 1.5  | NC       |
| 2/29/2008 | Phone call from client inquiring regarding settlement possibilities advise that there was no response from Urban & Thier; assignment of claims and asset report for of U. Engler, receipt/review correspondence/documents and advise; conf. E.G./C.B. regarding recorded liens, additional entries in pending cases; searched of countries; review entries, recordings | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 2/29/2008 | Finalized preparations for hearing for Renewed Motion for Default, etc.  | CWB | 1.5  | NC       |
| 2/29/2008 | Prepare for hearing on motion for default and motion for protective order.   | JXM | 1    | NC       |
| 3/3/2008  | Conducted internet research to locate updated information regarding other matters in Orange County regarding Ulrich Engler; check official records in Lee, Charlotte, and Collier Counties for Engler recording of judgments; and prepared proposed Default and letter to Judge for signature of Default.  | CWB | 2.25 | \$247.50 |
| 3/3/2008  | JM conference re entry of default against U. Engler, status of default and answer re PCO   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 3/3/2008  | Prepare for and attend hearing on motion for default (including travel); preparation of email to K. Baier regarding results of hearing.  | JXM | 3    | NC       |

|          |   |     |      |          |
|----------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 3/3/2008 | Conference JM re entry of default against U. Engler, and answer re PCO prepare client correspondence  | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 3/3/2008 | Review and analyze bankruptcy issues respond to client inquiry as to filing multiple claims of other creditors in insolvency action, issue of assignment of claims and type of claims   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 3/4/2008 | Review and analyze PCO motion to dismiss.   | JXM | 0.5  | NC       |
| 3/4/2008 | Receive/review motion to dismiss by PCO Client Management, Inc.; conference RGN re insolvency application; continue analysis of 3 claims and representative claims, client's commissions; review case file and client documents; review claims against A.N.F., client correspondence re: same | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 3/5/2008 | CB re status of garnishment on judgments, review JP Morgan case status and additional documents/pleadings filed garnishment answer by SunTrust, response re. additional bank accounts and funds, prepare update to RGN re same  | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 3/5/2008 | Conducted extensive review of documents reports regarding Orange County cases involving Engler to locate any Garnishees' answers; and telephone conference with Judge Roche's chambers to identify the reason for the hearing of March 10, 2008.  | CWB | 1.75 | \$192.50 |
| 3/5/2008 | Office conference with KIB; revise Affidavit of Claim; analysis; telephone communication with Roberta Colton, Esq.  | RGN | 0.9  | \$360.00 |
| 3/5/2008 | Conference RGN re revised insolvency application, address issue of loan and interest claims vs. investment returns; provide JP Morgan and investigation documents to RGN and discuss  | KIB | 0.5  | \$182.50 |
| 3/5/2008 | Several phone calls from client, discuss motion to dismiss filed by PCO client, investor documents provided by client, details of client claims, discuss proof of circumstances of investment, review and analyze miscellaneous documents and advise  | KIB | 0.75 | NC       |

|           |   |     |      |          |
|-----------|---|-----|------|----------|
| 3/5/2008  | Organize file   | KIB | 0.1  | NC       |
| 3/5/2008  | Receive, review and analyze client correspondence re Urban Thier, CB re 3-10-08 hearing, correspondence to client   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 3/6/2008  | Additional telephone conferences with Judge Roche's chambers in Orange County to identify scheduled hearing of March 10, 2008 regarding the Congro matter.  | CWB | 0.5  | \$55.00  |
| 3/6/2008  | Office conference re revised insolvency applications, usury interest letter, joining of creditors, redraft usury interest letter  | KIB | 0.6  | \$219.00 |
| 3/6/2008  | Prepare correspondence to client re application for insolvency, addition of other creditors   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 3/11/2008 | Revise affidavits of claims and interest waiver letter, finalize documents, prepare blank claim affidavits and correspondence to client and instructions  | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 3/11/2008 | Trust Account transactions re insolvency advance  | KIB | 0.1  | NC       |
| 3/11/2008 | Organize file   | KIB | 0.25 | NC       |
| 3/12/2008 | Receive/review documents for claims of 3 creditors, telephone call from client re same; discuss documents, investment vs. loan character of transactions; provide copies of exhibits to Motion for Injunction to client | KIB | 0.4  | NC       |
| 3/12/2008 | Receive/review client documents re representative agreement with U. Engler, analyze and respond to client   | KIB | 0.4  | \$146.00 |
| 3/13/2008 | Prepare memorandum with overview of claims and judgments, background for insolvency filing  | KIB | 1    | \$365.00 |
| 3/14/2008 | Revise memorandum of claims and judgments for insolvency filing   | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 3/14/2008 | Further Analyze and prepare client documents for insolvency filing  | KIB | 0.3  | \$109.50 |
| 3/17/2008 | Organize file, documents for insolvency   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 3/19/2008 | Conference RN   | KIB | 0.25 | \$91.25  |
| 3/21/2008 | Telephone call from client, discuss status and details of insolvency filing   | KIB | 0.3  | NC       |
| 3/25/2008 | Conference JM re hearing on motion to dismiss filed by PCO Client Management  | KIB | 0.2  | NC       |

|           |  |     |              |                    |
|-----------|--|-----|--------------|--------------------|
| 3/25/2008 | Phone call from client and discuss representation of additional creditors, address miscellaneous questions from client   | KIB | 0.25         | NC                 |
| 3/26/2008 | Office conference re data for petition, confirm deadline for filing (JG)   | KIB | 0.2          | \$73.00            |
| 3/27/2008 | Conducted internet research in an attempt to locate Ulrich Engler's Social Security Number.  | CWB | 1            | \$110.00           |
| 3/27/2008 | Completed involuntary petition for Chapter 7 for Engler and Corporation. Prepared summons for involuntary petitioner for Engler and Corporation. Prepared Motion for RGN to appear pro hac vice in Middle District of Florida. | JSG | 3            | \$480.00           |
| 3/27/2008 | Conference JG re filing of documents for insolvency, required information, review and provide documentation, conference JG re nature of claim and analysis   | KIB | 0.4          | \$146.00           |
| 3/27/2008 | Review documents; telephone communication with Roberta Carlton; instruct JSG re drafting; review and revise involuntary petitions.   | RGN | 1.5          | \$600.00           |
| 3/27/2008 | Prepare correspondence to client re additional affidavits of claim against Private Commercial Office, Inc.   | KIB | 0.3          | NC                 |
| 3/28/2008 | Receive/review correspondence and remaining affidavits of claim from client, respond, office conference re same and filing; receive/review correspondence to R. Colton, Tampa; follow up on of filing documents                | KIB | 0.6          | \$219.00           |
|           |  |     | <b>TOTAL</b> | <b>\$33,303.75</b> |