

EXHIBIT A

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

(302) 571-6600
(800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

THE BRANDYWINE BUILDING
1000 WEST STREET, 17TH FLOOR
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

(302) 571-1253 FAX
www.ycst.com

P.O. Box 391
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

TAX I.D. No. 51-0082644

TO: c/o David Heller
Latham & Watkins
Sears Tower, Suite 5800
233 South Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606

11/21/2011

File No. 070649.1001

For Professional Services Rendered For:

Bill No. 40349623

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

Total Fees.....	\$	66,986.50
Total Expenses		<u>5,717.24</u>
Total.....	\$	<u>72,703.74</u>

WHEN REMITTING PAYMENT, KINDLY REFERENCE FILE NO. **070649.1001** AND SEND TO THE ATTENTION
OF **ACCOUNTING DEPT.**

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
 Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

AGGREGATE TIME SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

TASK CODE	TASK DESCRIPTION	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL AMOUNT
B001	Case Administration	25.40	8,968.00
B002	Court Hearings	46.00	13,173.50
B003	Cash Collateral/DIP Financing	3.60	1,882.00
B004	Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports	32.30	11,468.50
B005	Lease/Executory Contract Issues	6.90	2,586.50
B006	Use, Sale or Lease of Property (363 issues)	29.10	12,228.50
B007	Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions	2.60	1,027.00
B008	Meetings	8.90	3,648.50
B011	Other Adversary Proceedings	4.60	644.00
B014	General Corporate Matters	1.10	187.00
B015	Employee Matters	2.90	1,218.50
B017	Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues	29.20	9,621.00
B018	Fee Application Preparation	1.30	182.00
B020	Utility Services	0.50	151.50
Totals		194.40	\$ 66,986.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
 Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

ATTORNEY TIME SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

Task B001		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Case Administration		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	5.20	x \$	395.00	= 2,054.00
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	6.00	x \$	625.00	= 3,750.00
Morgan Seward	Associate	8.40	x \$	280.00	= 2,352.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	5.80	x \$	140.00	= 812.00
Totals:		25.40			\$ 8,968.00

Task B002		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Court Hearings		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	8.20	x \$	395.00	= 3,239.00
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	5.30	x \$	625.00	= 3,312.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	14.80	x \$	280.00	= 4,144.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	17.70	x \$	140.00	= 2,478.00
Totals:		46.00			\$ 13,173.50

Task B003		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Cash Collateral/DIP Financing		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	1.30	x \$	395.00	= 513.50
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	2.10	x \$	625.00	= 1,312.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	0.20	x \$	280.00	= 56.00
Totals:		3.60			\$ 1,882.00

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
 Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

Task B004		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	20.20	x \$	395.00	=	7,979.00
Maris J. Kandestin	Associate	4.90	x \$	375.00	=	1,837.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	4.60	x \$	280.00	=	1,288.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	2.60	x \$	140.00	=	364.00
Totals:		32.30			\$	11,468.50

Task B005		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Lease/Executory Contract Issues		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	6.30	x \$	395.00	=	2,488.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	0.10	x \$	280.00	=	28.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.50	x \$	140.00	=	70.00
Totals:		6.90			\$	2,586.50

Task B006		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Use, Sale or Lease of Property (363 issues)		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	8.80	x \$	395.00	=	3,476.00
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	9.30	x \$	625.00	=	5,812.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	10.00	x \$	280.00	=	2,800.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	1.00	x \$	140.00	=	140.00
Totals:		29.10			\$	12,228.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
 Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

Task B007		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	1.10	x \$	395.00	=	434.50
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	0.50	x \$	625.00	=	312.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	1.00	x \$	280.00	=	280.00
Totals:		2.60			\$	1,027.00

Task B008		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Meetings		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	7.90	x \$	395.00	=	3,120.50
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	0.80	x \$	625.00	=	500.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.20	x \$	140.00	=	28.00
Totals:		8.90			\$	3,648.50

Task B011		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Other Adversary Proceedings		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	4.60	x \$	140.00	=	644.00
Totals:		4.60			\$	644.00

Task B014		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
General Corporate Matters		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Melissa Romano	Paralegal	1.10	x \$	170.00	=	187.00
Totals:		1.10			\$	187.00

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
 Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

Task B015		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Employee Matters		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	1.30	x \$	625.00	= 812.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	1.30	x \$	280.00	= 364.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.30	x \$	140.00	= 42.00
Totals:		2.90		\$	1,218.50

Task B017		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	3.00	x \$	395.00	= 1,185.00
Michael R. Nestor	Partner	4.00	x \$	625.00	= 2,500.00
Morgan Seward	Associate	20.20	x \$	280.00	= 5,656.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	2.00	x \$	140.00	= 280.00
Totals:		29.20		\$	9,621.00

Task B018		<u>Total</u>	<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Fee Application Preparation		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	1.30	x \$	140.00	= 182.00
Totals:		1.30		\$	182.00

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

Task B020		<u>Total</u>		<u>Hourly</u>		<u>Total</u>
Utility Services		<u>Hours</u>		<u>Rate</u>		
Kara Hammond Coyle	Associate	0.10	x \$	395.00	=	39.50
Morgan Seward	Associate	0.40	x \$	280.00	=	112.00
Totals:		0.50			\$	151.50
Aggregate Total:		194.40			\$	66,986.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
Billing Period Through October 31, 2011

AGGREGATE TIME SUMMARY PAGE BY INDIVIDUAL

		<u>Total Hours</u>		<u>Hourly Rate</u>	=	<u>Total</u>
MNEST	Michael R. Nestor, Partner	29.30	\$	625.00	=	18,312.50
KCOYL	Kara Hammond Coyle, Associate	62.10	\$	395.00	=	24,529.50
MKAND	Maris J. Kandestin, Associate	4.90	\$	375.00	=	1,837.50
MSEWA	Morgan Seward, Associate	61.00	\$	280.00	=	17,080.00
MROMA	Melissa Romano, Paralegal	1.10	\$	170.00	=	187.00
TBOLL	Troy Bollman, Paralegal	36.00	\$	140.00	=	5,040.00
	Total:	194.40			\$	66,986.50

TIME DETAIL GROUPED BY TASK CODE

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/02/11	Review issues and correspondence regarding timing through sale closing	MNEST	B001	0.40
10/03/11	Discuss upcoming filings and hearing preparation with M. Seward re: critical dates	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/03/11	Review and revise critical dates calendar re preparation for circulation to client team	KCOYL	B001	0.30
10/03/11	Correspondence with client team re revisions to critical dates calendar	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/03/11	Multiple correspondence with Matt Warren, Alicia Weis and Sarah Barr re service of sale motion and various first and second day pleadings	KCOYL	B001	0.50
10/03/11	Review application record and related materials for the receivership application of Graceway Canada	MNEST	B001	0.40
10/03/11	Review/revise critical dates calendar of short/long term task and objectives	MNEST	B001	0.40
10/03/11	Draft motion re: motion to shorten for Protocol motion	MSEWA	B001	0.80
10/03/11	Discuss upcoming filings and hearing preparation with K. Coyle re: critical dates	MSEWA	B001	0.20
10/03/11	Prepare initial critical dates calendar	TBOLL	B001	1.00
10/04/11	Correspondence from Varouj Bakhshian re updates to creditor matrix	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/04/11	Correspondence with co-counsel, client and Alvarez re scheduling of hearings and general logistics	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/04/11	Multiple correspondence with Joe Latham, co-counsel, client and Alvarez re Graceway Canada receivership and protocol	KCOYL	B001	0.40
10/04/11	Multiple correspondence (4) with client team re: scheduling sale hearing and related hearing dates	MSEWA	B001	0.10

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/04/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/05/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/05/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of pro hac motion for Josef Athanas	TBOLL	B001	0.30
10/06/11	Draft notice re: notice of commencement	MSEWA	B001	1.10
10/06/11	Correspond with S. Barr of Latham re: upcoming filing deadlines	MSEWA	B001	0.10
10/07/11	Review and revise notice re: notice of commencement	MSEWA	B001	0.30
10/10/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re preparation of equity security holders list	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/10/11	Prepare binder of materials re: initial debtor interview	TBOLL	B001	1.60
10/10/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/11/11	Work with T. Bollman and M. Seward re: coordinate hearing preparation for 10/17/2011 hearing	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/11/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re equity holders list	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/11/11	Work with T. Bollman and K. Coyle re: coordinate hearing preparation for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B001	0.10
10/11/11	Match pleadings with the docket	TBOLL	B001	0.20
10/12/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Chris Ward re questions for Value Recovery Fund	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/12/11	Correspondence with Joanna Wu re questions regarding Value Recovery Fund	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/12/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re master conflicts list and issues with Value Recovery Fund	KCOYL	B001	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/12/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re draft Non-Disclosure Agreement with Committee	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/12/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren and Caroline Reckler re review of open issues	KCOYL	B001	0.50
10/12/11	Review Committee confi and correspondence regarding same	MNEST	B001	4.00
10/12/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/13/11	Correspondence with Jason Steele and Joe Athanas re Non-Disclosure Agreement with Committee	KCOYL	B001	0.10
10/13/11	Review motion record re: record of motions from Canadian proceeding	MSEWA	B001	0.40
10/13/11	Draft notice and file re: motion record from Canadian proceeding	MSEWA	B001	0.40
10/13/11	Telephone call with M. Warren re: discuss filing of motion record from Canadian proceeding	MSEWA	B001	0.20
10/13/11	Correspond with client team including Canadian counsel re: discuss filing and notice for motion record from Canadian proceeding	MSEWA	B001	0.20
10/13/11	Work with C. Desours of Goodman and R. Rebeck of U.S. Bankruptcy Court re: set up video conferencing with Canadian court	MSEWA	B001	0.50
10/13/11	Work with client team re: review and file agenda for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B001	0.40
10/13/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/14/11	Review critical dates from client re: upcoming critical dates	MSEWA	B001	0.20
10/14/11	Correspond with T. Bollman re: updates to critical dates for client	MSEWA	B001	0.10
10/14/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/14/11	Review critical dates calendar	TBOLL	B001	0.20
10/15/11	Multiple correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Mike Nestor and Jason Steele re Non-Disclosure Agreement with Committee	KCOYL	B001	0.40
10/17/11	Work with A. Weis of Latham, M. Finnegan and BMC Group re: coordinate service of all second day orders and sale notice	MSEWA	B001	0.40
10/17/11	Correspond with T. Bollman re: service of SEC of bankruptcy related documents	MSEWA	B001	0.10
10/17/11	Download all second day orders and coordinate service with the noticing agent	TBOLL	B001	0.40
10/17/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/18/11	Review and revise calendar regarding short and long term dates and deadlines	MNEST	B001	0.50
10/18/11	Work with M. Nestor and C. Reckler re: cancellation notice for 10/21/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B001	0.20
10/18/11	Review and update critical dates calendar	TBOLL	B001	0.40
10/18/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/19/11	Meet with M. Seward re: upcoming hearing dates and deadlines	KCOYL	B001	0.30
10/19/11	Meet with K. Coyle re: upcoming hearing dates and deadlines	MSEWA	B001	0.30
10/19/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/20/11	Review and revise critical dates calendar	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/20/11	Correspondence with K. Coyle and T. Bollman re: upcoming hearings and critical dates	MSEWA	B001	0.10
10/20/11	Update critical dates calendar	TBOLL	B001	0.20
10/20/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/21/11	Work with K. Coyle and T. Bollman re: upcoming filings and coordination	MSEWA	B001	0.30
10/21/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/24/11	Multiple correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Alicia Weis, and Matt Warren re: amended order re: Cross-Border Insolvency Protocol	KCOYL	B001	0.40
10/24/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Alicia Weis re: revisions to Certification of Counsel re: Amended Order re: Cross Border Insolvency Protocol	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/24/11	Review and revise Certification of Counsel re: Amended Order re: Cross Border Insolvency Protocol	KCOYL	B001	0.20
10/24/11	Review issues re: cross border protocol	MNEST	B001	0.30
10/24/11	Draft and multiple revisions to certification re: certification of counsel for amended protocol order	MSEWA	B001	1.30
10/24/11	Review and revise order and create blackline re: cross-border protocol order	MSEWA	B001	0.60
10/24/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/26/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/27/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
10/28/11	Review docket and circulate any related pleadings to the working group	TBOLL	B001	0.10
Sub Total				25.40

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/03/11	Review and revise Amended Notice of Second Day Hearing re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B002	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/03/11	Prepare draft amended notice re: second day pleadings and related hearing	TBOLL	B002	0.40
10/04/11	Telephone calls with chambers re omnibus hearing dates	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/05/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren and Joe Latham re revised bankruptcy hearing schedule	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/05/11	Review and revise Second Amended Notice of Second Day Hearing re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/05/11	Prepare draft of second amended hearing notice regarding second day pleadings	TBOLL	B002	0.40
10/07/11	Correspondence to Lori Johnson re joint bid procedures hearing logistics	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/10/11	Review and revise Second Amended Notice of Second Day Hearing re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/10/11	Review and revise Agenda re October 17 hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.30
10/10/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re revisions to Notice of Rescheduled Hearing Time	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/10/11	Prepare draft agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.20
10/10/11	Prepare and finalize for filing notice of rescheduled hearing time	TBOLL	B002	0.60
10/11/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren and Alicia Weis re review of open issues in preparation for second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.80
10/11/11	Telephone call to Chambers re scheduling issues	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/11/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re revisions to agenda	KCOYL	B002	0.30
10/11/11	Prepare binder of materials re: agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.00
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and M. Seward re: revising second day orders and preparing for second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.60

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and M. Seward revising agenda re: 10/17/2011 hearing agenda	KCOYL	B002	0.40
10/12/11	Correspondence to Chambers re logistics regarding joint Bid Procedures Hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/12/11	Review and revise Second Day Orders re preparation for second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	1.10
10/12/11	Review and revise agenda re second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.60
10/12/11	Teleconference with client team re preparation for second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.90
10/12/11	Multiple telephone calls with Chambers re scheduling issues	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/12/11	Review agenda regarding DIP hearing	MNEST	B002	0.20
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and K. Coyle re: revising second day orders and preparing for second day hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.60
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and K. Coyle revising agenda re: 10/17/2011 hearing agenda	MSEWA	B002	0.40
10/12/11	Correspond with M. Warren of Latham re: blacklines for U.S. Trustee for hearing preparation	MSEWA	B002	0.10
10/12/11	Work with A. Weis of Latham re: preparing orders for all second day relief	MSEWA	B002	0.30
10/12/11	Assist in preparation of materials for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.80
10/12/11	Update agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.60
10/12/11	Prepare draft and finalize for filing notice of rescheduled hearing re: the DIP motion	TBOLL	B002	0.60
10/13/11	Multiple correspondence (5) with Morgan Seward, Troy Bollman and Matt Warren re revisions to agenda for second day hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/13/11	Review issues/logistics and correspondence re: joint hearing with U.S./Canada	MNEST	B002	0.60

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/13/11	Update and finalize hearing binders re: agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.00
10/13/11	Finalize for filing agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.50
10/14/11	Numerous correspondence and telephone calls re: Committee issues and hearing on October 17, 2011	MNEST	B002	0.70
10/14/11	Work with T. Bollman re: amending agenda for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.10
10/14/11	Review, revise and file amended agenda re: first amended agenda for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.60
10/14/11	Assist in preparation of materials re: hearing scheduled for October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.30
10/14/11	Prepare amended agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.60
10/14/11	Update hearing binders re: agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.80
10/14/11	Finalize for filing amended agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.40
10/15/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re Committee comments on final orders (preparation for second day hearing)	KCOYL	B002	0.30
10/15/11	Draft second amended agenda and circulate to client team re: 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.80
10/16/11	Work with co-counsel and T. Bollman re: revise orders and prepare for hearing	MSEWA	B002	3.90
10/16/11	Prepare copies of filings and send to client for review re: hearing preparation for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.40
10/16/11	Review, revise and file amended agenda re: 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.60
10/16/11	Assist in preparation of materials re: hearing scheduled for October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	2.00

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/17/11	Review issues and meeting and telephone calls with all parties regarding second day/bid procedures hearing (2.3); represent debtors at hearing regarding same (1.2)	MNEST	B002	3.50
10/17/11	Review and revise orders and organize documents for client and witness re: prepare for 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	4.20
10/17/11	Attend hearing (including time waiting to be heard) re: 10/17/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	2.10
10/17/11	Assist in preparation of materials re: hearing scheduled for October 17, 2011	TBOLL	B002	1.30
10/18/11	Correspondence and telephone calls with parties and court regarding adjournment of DIP hearing	MNEST	B002	0.30
10/18/11	Prepare draft agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 21, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.30
10/18/11	Prepare notebook re: agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 21, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.30
10/19/11	Review and revise agenda re October 21 hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.30
10/19/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re revisions to agenda for October 21 hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/19/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re amended agenda adjourning DIP hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/19/11	Review and revise amended agenda re adjournment of DIP hearing	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/19/11	Multiple correspondence (7) re: status of 10/21/2011 DIP hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.30
10/19/11	Review, revise and file agenda re: 10/21/2011 hearing	MSEWA	B002	0.40
10/19/11	Update (.2) and finalize for filing and coordinate service (.4) of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 21, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.60
10/19/11	Prepare, finalize for filing and coordinate service of amended agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on October 21, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.40

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Telephone call to Lori Johnson re: scheduling hearing date	KCOYL	B002	0.10
10/31/11	Correspondence with Joe Athanas and Matt Warren re: adjournment of Allocation Motion	KCOYL	B002	0.20
10/31/11	Prepare draft agenda of matters re: hearing scheduled for November 7, 2011	TBOLL	B002	0.60
Sub Total				46.00

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/11/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re draft Final DIP Order	KCOYL	B003	0.20
10/11/11	Numerous correspondence with committee counsel regarding telephone conference on 10/12 and revised DIP order and bid procedures	MNEST	B003	1.20
10/12/11	Correspondence with client team re potential adjournment of DIP hearing	KCOYL	B003	0.20
10/12/11	Review and revise Notice of Rescheduled Hearing re DIP Motion	KCOYL	B003	0.10
10/12/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re revisions to Notice of Rescheduled Hearing re DIP Motion	KCOYL	B003	0.10
10/12/11	Correspondence regarding DIP motion, hearing and issues regarding same	MNEST	B003	0.40
10/12/11	Correspondence (7) with client team re: rescheduled DIP hearing	MSEWA	B003	0.20
10/18/11	Multiple correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Joe Athanas and Mike Nestor re status update on DIP issues	KCOYL	B003	0.30
10/20/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren and Alicia Weis re: amended notice of Valuation Motion	KCOYL	B003	0.10
10/20/11	Review and revise amended notice of Valuation Motion re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B003	0.10

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/21/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren, Joe Athanas and Mike Nestor re: question regarding board member	KCOYL	B003	0.20
10/27/11	Review revised interim DIP and provide comments re: same	MNEST	B003	0.50
Sub Total				3.60

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/04/11	Correspondence with Mike Panacio re initial debtor interview materials	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/05/11	Multiple correspondence with co-counsel and Alvarez team re preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/07/11	Correspondence with Hamish Allanson and Caroline Reckler re preparation for initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B004	0.40
10/07/11	Multiple correspondence with client team re: status of initial debtor interview materials	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/10/11	Work with T. Bollman and M. Seward re: preparation of materials for initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/10/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren, Tom Hill and Caroline Reckler re preparation of Initial Operating Report	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/10/11	Multiple correspondence with Hamish Allanson and Tom Hill re preparation of initial debtor interview materials	KCOYL	B004	0.50
10/10/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re questions for UST regarding Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/10/11	Draft letter to Mike Panacio re initial debtor interview materials; review and revise same	KCOYL	B004	0.90
10/10/11	Multiple correspondence with Matt Warren re preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/10/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren re preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/10/11	Teleconference with Latham, Alvarez and client re preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	2.10
10/10/11	Work with T. Bollman and K. Coyle re: preparation of materials for initial debtor interview	MSEWA	B004	0.30
10/10/11	Draft and revise notice re: notice of commencement	MSEWA	B004	0.80
10/11/11	Correspondence with Justin Schmaltz re initial operating report	KCOYL	B004	0.20
10/11/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Matt Warren re issue regarding Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.20
10/11/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Tom Hill re disbursements to report to UST	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/12/11	Meet with M. Seward re: discuss revisions to and filing of initial operating report	KCOYL	B004	0.20
10/12/11	Meet with M. Seward re: discuss revisions to and filing of initial operating report	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/13/11	Correspondence with Mike Panacio re initial debtor interview materials	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/13/11	Multiple correspondence with Justin Schmaltz and John Bowles re preparation of initial operating report	KCOYL	B004	0.40
10/13/11	Correspond with L. Bailey at Latham and J. Schmaltz at Alvarez re: preparation of initial operating report	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/14/11	Multiple correspondence with John Bowles, Morgan Seward and Justin Schmalz re preparation of Initial Operating Report	KCOYL	B004	0.50
10/14/11	Telephone call with J. Schmaltz of Alvarez and J. Bowles from Graceway re: discuss initial operating report revisions and filing	MSEWA	B004	0.30
10/14/11	Review and file report re: initial operating report	MSEWA	B004	0.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/14/11	Correspond with U.S. Trustee re: filing of initial operating report	MSEWA	B004	0.10
10/14/11	Work with client team re: follow up questions to initial operating report	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/14/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of initial operating report	TBOLL	B004	0.30
10/18/11	Work with Morgan Seward re initial debtor interview follow-up questions	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/18/11	Work with M. Warren of Latham and K. Coyle re: follow up questions from U.S. Trustee to initial debtor interview	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/19/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Matt Warren and Mike Nestor re initial debtor interview follow-up questions	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/19/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re revisions to Global Notes, Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/19/11	Review and revise Global Notes, Schedules and Statements re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B004	2.70
10/19/11	Correspondence to Juliet Sarkessian and Mike Panacio re initial debtor interview follow-up questions	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/19/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren re preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/20/11	Teleconference with Bankruptcy Analyst and client team re: preparation of monthly operating report	KCOYL	B004	0.30
10/20/11	Teleconference with client, Alvarez and Latham re: preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.50
10/20/11	Correspondence with Mike Panacio and Juliet Sarkassien re: preparation of monthly operating report	KCOYL	B004	0.20
10/20/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re: preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Multiple correspondence with Matt Warren and Alvarez team re: initial debtor interview materials	KCOYL	B004	0.70
10/20/11	Review and revise Global Notes re: preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.80
10/20/11	Meet with K. Coyle re: discuss coordination of filing of schedules and statements	MSEWA	B004	0.30
10/21/11	Teleconference with client team re: preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	1.00
10/24/11	Correspondence with Jodi Ehrenhofer and Matt Warren re: updates to Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/24/11	Teleconference with client team re: revisions to Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	1.20
10/24/11	Multiple telephone calls with Alicia Weis and Matt Warren re: revisions to GLObal Notes	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/25/11	Correspondence from John Bellamy re: revisions to 2015.3 Statement	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/25/11	Multiple correspondence with Matt Warren and Alvarez team re: revisions to Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.70
10/26/11	Telephone call with M. Warren of Latham re: discuss status of schedules and statements	MSEWA	B004	0.20
10/27/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren re: preparation of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/27/11	Interoffice conference with K. Coyle re: schedules and statements	MKAND	B004	0.10
10/27/11	Briefly review same	MKAND	B004	0.30
10/27/11	Work with K. Coyle and M. Kandestin re: coordinate filing of schedules and statements	MSEWA	B004	0.30
10/28/11	Multiple correspondence with Matt Warren, Justin Schmaltz and Tom Hill re: revisions to Schedules and Statements and Global Notes thereto	KCOYL	B004	1.10
10/28/11	Prepare for conference call re: schedules and statements	MKAND	B004	0.40

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/28/11	Attend conference call with Debtors, financial advisors, and co-counsel	MKAND	B004	3.80
10/28/11	Emails with K. Coyle (x2) re: same and M. Seward (x5) re: revisions to schedules and statements	MKAND	B004	0.30
10/28/11	Multiple correspondence (5) with M. Kandestin re: filing and revisions to schedules and statements	MSEWA	B004	0.40
10/29/11	Correspondence with John Bellamy, Justin Schmaltz, and Brian Shrader re: revisions to Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.20
10/30/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis re: revisions to Global Notes	KCOYL	B004	0.10
10/31/11	Multiple correspondence with Justin Schmaltz, Jodi Ehrenhofer, Alicia Weis and Matt Warren re: revisions to Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B004	0.60
10/31/11	Multiple correspondence with Alicia Weis, Hamish Allanson and Matt Warren re: revisions to 2015.3 Statement	KCOYL	B004	0.70
10/31/11	Review and file documents re: schedules and statements	MSEWA	B004	0.40
10/31/11	Finalize for filing schedules and statements	TBOLL	B004	2.00
10/31/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of periodic report	TBOLL	B004	0.30
Sub Total				32.30

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/10/11	Correspondence with Mike Nestor and Joe Athanas re Amerisource Bergen customer service letter	KCOYL	B005	0.10
10/20/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren re: preparation of cure notice	KCOYL	B005	0.30
10/20/11	Multiple correspondence with Alicia Weis and Matt Warren re: revisions to Cure Notice	KCOYL	B005	0.60

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Review and revise Cure Notice re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B005	0.70
10/20/11	Multiple correspondence with BMC Group, YCST team and Latham re: service of cure notice	KCOYL	B005	0.30
10/21/11	Telephone calls with Matt Warren re: revision to Cure Notice	KCOYL	B005	0.30
10/21/11	Multiple correspondence with client team re: revisions to amended cure notice	KCOYL	B005	0.70
10/21/11	Review and revise Amended Cure Notice re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B005	0.90
10/26/11	Telephone calls with Alicia Weis and Matt Warren re: preparation of lease rejection motion	KCOYL	B005	0.70
10/26/11	Telephone call from A. Weis of Latham re: rejection of contracts related issues	MSEWA	B005	0.10
10/27/11	Telephone call to Alicia Weis re: lease rejection procedures	KCOYL	B005	0.10
10/29/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis, Matt Warren and Caroline Reckler re: review of Lease Rejection Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B005	0.20
10/30/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren, Caroline Reckler and Alicia Weis re: revisions to Lease Rejection Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B005	0.20
10/31/11	Telephone call to Alicia Weis re: revisions to Lease Rejection Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B005	0.20
10/31/11	Review and revise Lease Rejection Procedures Motion re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B005	0.70
10/31/11	Multiple correspondence with Alicia Weis re: revisions to Lease Rejection Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B005	0.30
10/31/11	Prepare notice and finalize for filing motion to authorize procedures to reject certain leases and contracts	TBOLL	B005	0.50
Sub Total				6.90

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/03/11	Correspondence from Vaughn Barber re inquiry from CRB re acquisition of Graceway assets	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/03/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren and Joe Athanas re interested buyers	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/03/11	Correspondence with client team re preparation for bid procedures/sale hearing	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/03/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re motion to shorten re Canadian protocol motion	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/03/11	Telephone conference with debtor team regarding sale issues, timing, allocation and strategy	MNEST	B006	1.40
10/03/11	Review precedent and distribute same to J. Athnas regarding bid procedures/overbids	MNEST	B006	0.60
10/04/11	Review and revise Motion to Shorten Notice re Canadian Protocol Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.40
10/04/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis and Caroline Reckler re revisions to Motion to Shorten Notice re Canadian Protocol Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/04/11	Review numerous correspondence and telephone calls regarding sale process, timeline and strategy	MNEST	B006	1.10
10/04/11	Draft motion re: motion to shorten protocol motion	MSEWA	B006	1.10
10/04/11	Review motion re: protocol motion	MSEWA	B006	0.30
10/04/11	Correspondence (7) with client team re: filing and preparation of Canadian protocol motion	MSEWA	B006	0.30
10/06/11	Correspondence with Joe Latham re logistics for joint bid procedures hearing	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/07/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re order shortening notice of Canadian Protocol Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/07/11	Work with Matt Warren and Mike Nestor re value of Graceway Canada	KCOYL	B006	0.50
10/07/11	Correspondence with M. Warren regarding allocation motion and research precedent regarding same	MNEST	B006	1.40

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/10/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re questions regarding bid procedures	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/10/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis re revisions to Allocation Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/11/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re draft Bid Procedures	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/11/11	Correspondence with client team re response to UST's questions regarding Bid Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.40
10/11/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re revised Bid Procedures	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and M. Seward re: resolve service issues related to DIP hearing notice	KCOYL	B006	0.40
10/12/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re comments to Bid Procedures Motion; review same	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/12/11	Correspondence with Joe Latham and Caroline Reckler re preparation for Joint Bid Procedures Hearing	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/12/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Caroline Descours re issues related to Graceway Canada Bidding Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/12/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re draft Final DIP Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/12/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian, Mike Nestor, Matt Warren and Caroline Reckler re sale procedures issues	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/12/11	Work with T. Bollman and K. Coyle re: resolve service issues related to DIP hearing notice	MSEWA	B006	0.40
10/13/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Mike Nestor re sale procedures	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/13/11	Multiple correspondence (11) with Caroline Descours, Joe Latham, Caroline Reckler, Matt Warren and Alicia Weis re Graceway Canada Bidding Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/13/11	Multiple correspondence (10) with Caroline Descours, Rob Rebeck and Morgan Seward re video-teleconferencing for Joint Bid Procedures Hearing	KCOYL	B006	0.40
10/13/11	Review sale motion for filing/service (.7); review Canadian motion of record and related documents re: filing in U.S. Court (.5); review revised bid procedures/notices and correspondence to committee re: same (.3)	MNEST	B006	1.50
10/13/11	Telephone call with M. Warren re: discuss sale objection deadline and procedures	MSEWA	B006	0.30
10/13/11	Work with M. Nestor re: sale objection deadline and procedures	MSEWA	B006	0.10
10/14/11	Multiple correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Mike Nestor, Jason Steele and Rafael Zahralddin-Aravena re Committee's comments to Bid Procedures Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.50
10/14/11	Discuss deadline for sale objection with M. Nestor and M. Finnegan re: sale procedures	MSEWA	B006	0.20
10/14/11	Correspond with M. Warren of Latham re: sale objection deadline and procedures	MSEWA	B006	0.10
10/14/11	Work with co-counsel drafting notice and file multiple blacklines re: bid procedures order and exhibits	MSEWA	B006	2.60
10/14/11	Work with BMC Group and T. Bollman re: service of notice of blackline of bid procedures	MSEWA	B006	0.20
10/14/11	Review objection re: objection to bid procedures filed by committee	MSEWA	B006	0.40
10/14/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of blacklined bid procedures order	TBOLL	B006	0.30
10/15/11	Multiple correspondence with client team re: objection to and correlating revisions to customer programs order	MSEWA	B006	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/16/11	Review issues with Latham regarding bid procedures; second day hearing and open issues regarding same	MNEST	B006	1.30
10/16/11	Review issues with Latham re: bid procedures/2nd day hearing and open issues re: same	MNEST	B006	1.30
10/17/11	Correspondence from Caroline Descours re Canadian Bidding Procedures Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/17/11	Review allocation motion	MNEST	B006	0.40
10/17/11	Work with co-counsel reviewing and filing motion re: valuation motion	MSEWA	B006	1.90
10/19/11	Review and revise Amended Notice of Allocation Motion re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/20/11	Work with M. Warren of Latham and K. Coyle re: filing contract notice	MSEWA	B006	0.40
10/20/11	Finalize for filing cure notice	TBOLL	B006	0.30
10/21/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Joe Latham and Caroline Descours re: Canadian sale issues	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/21/11	Correspondence with M. Warren and K. Coyle re: revised contract notice	MSEWA	B006	0.20
10/21/11	Review and file notice re: revised contract notice	MSEWA	B006	0.60
10/21/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of amended cure notice	TBOLL	B006	0.40
10/24/11	Correspondence from Alan Tennebaum re: EPA issues with Galderma Sale Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/24/11	Multiple correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Jason Steele re: issues related to Allocation Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/24/11	Correspond with M. Warren of Latham re: preparation for sale hearing	MSEWA	B006	0.10
10/25/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis, Matt Warren and Caroline Reckler re: Supplement to Allocation Motion	KCOYL	B006	0.30

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/25/11	Review and revise Supplement to Allocation Motion re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B006	0.30
10/25/11	Review correspondence and issues from EPA re: sale order and resolution	MNEST	B006	0.30
10/25/11	Review and file supplement re: supplement to valuation motion	MSEWA	B006	0.60
10/28/11	Telephone call to Afco re: insurance premium payments	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/28/11	Telephone call and correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re: filing of Schedules and Statements	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/28/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re: revisions to Galderma Sale Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/29/11	Correspondence from My Chi To re: revisions to Galderma Sale Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/29/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re: revisions to Galderma Sale Order	KCOYL	B006	0.10
10/30/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler, Matt Warren and Alicia Weis re: revisions to sale order	KCOYL	B006	0.20
10/31/11	Telephone call with Matt Warren re: adjournment of Allocation motion and related issues	KCOYL	B006	0.30
Sub Total				29.10

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/11/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis and Matt Warren re draft proof of claim; review and revise same	KCOYL	B007	0.30
10/14/11	Review issue raised by committee to orders for Monday hearing and correspondence re: same	MNEST	B007	0.50
10/14/11	Work with A. Weis of Latham re: revisions to and final version of second day orders	MSEWA	B007	0.80
10/15/11	Multiple correspondence with client team re: objections to and correlating revisions to 503(b)(9) order	MSEWA	B007	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Correspondence with Alicia Weis, Matt Warren and BMC Group re: service of 503(b)(9) Notice	KCOYL	B007	0.20
10/31/11	Multiple correspondence with Alicia Weis and Varouj Bakhshain re: Bar Date Noticing preparation	KCOYL	B007	0.60
Sub Total				2.60

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/03/11	Multiple correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re initial debtor interview preparation	KCOYL	B008	0.30
10/03/11	Multiple correspondence with Jodi Ehrenhofer, Varouj Bakhshian and Matt Warren re preparation for initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B008	0.60
10/04/11	Correspondence with Paul Krolicki re contact information for top 20 unsecured creditors (UST solicitation for formation meeting)	KCOYL	B008	0.10
10/04/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B008	0.30
10/04/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re initial debtor interview preparation	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/05/11	Correspondence with Mike Panacio and Juliet Sarkessian re initial debtor interview preparation and scheduling of 341 meeting	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/05/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren and Caroline Reckler re initial debtor interview preparation and scheduling of 341 meeting	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/06/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/06/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and Matt Warren re initial debtor interview	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/07/11	Correspondence from Juliet Sarkessian re scheduling of 341 meeting	KCOYL	B008	0.10

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/07/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler re scheduling of 341 meeting	KCOYL	B008	0.10
10/10/11	Multiple correspondence with Joe Athanas, Caroline Reckler and Mike Nestor re formation of Committee	KCOYL	B008	0.30
10/10/11	Telephone calls and correspondence with Joanna Wu re formation of Creditors' Committee	KCOYL	B008	0.30
10/10/11	Review and revise Notice of Commencement re preparation for filing	KCOYL	B008	0.80
10/10/11	Multiple correspondence (12) with Alicia Weis, Varouj Bakhshian and Matt Warren re revisions to, and issues related to service of, the 341 notice	KCOYL	B008	0.60
10/10/11	Teleconference with Latham, Alvarez and client re preparation for Formation Meeting	KCOYL	B008	0.30
10/11/11	Prepare for and attend formation meeting	KCOYL	B008	2.80
10/11/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re formation of Committee	KCOYL	B008	0.10
10/11/11	Correspondence with Troy Bollman and Varouj Bakhshian re service of 341 Notice	KCOYL	B008	0.20
10/11/11	Prepare binder of materials re: formation meeting	TBOLL	B008	0.20
10/15/11	Numerous correspondence and telephone calls re: Committee comments to NDA (.4); review comments/revisions re: same (.4)	MNEST	B008	0.80
Sub Total				8.90

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/04/11	Prepare notice and finalize for filing Canadian protocol motion (.4), and finalize for filing and coordinate service of related motion to shorten (.3)	TBOLL	B011	0.70
10/17/11	Assist in preparation of filing (.8) and finalize for filing and coordinate service (.4) of motion determining value of assets re: Graceway Canada Company	TBOLL	B011	1.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Prepare and finalize for filing amended notice with respect to the valuation motion	TBOLL	B011	0.40
10/24/11	Assist in preparation of filing and finalize for filing certification of counsel re: amended order approving cross-border insolvency protocol	TBOLL	B011	2.00
10/25/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of supplement to the valuation motion	TBOLL	B011	0.30
Sub Total				4.60

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/13/11	File notice of motion of record re: Graceway Canada	MROMA	B014	0.60
10/13/11	Prepare and coordinate for filing of notice of motion of record re: Graceway Canada	MROMA	B014	0.50
Sub Total				1.10

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/14/11	Telephone call with M. Warren of Latham re: discuss status of U.S. Trustee's objection to employee wage order	MSEWA	B015	0.20
10/14/11	Telephone call with M. Warren of Latham and M. Nestor re: discuss status of U.S. Trustee's objection to employee wage order	MSEWA	B015	0.20
10/17/11	Numerous telephone calls and correspondence with UST, Committee and Debtors reps regarding employee wage motion, severance, issues regarding same for hearing	MNEST	B015	1.30
10/17/11	Draft certification re: certification of counsel for revised employee wage motion	MSEWA	B015	0.50
10/17/11	Review, revise and file certification re: certification of counsel for revised employee wage motion	MSEWA	B015	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/17/11	Review and revise order and submit to Court re: revised employee wage motion	MSEWA	B015	0.20
10/17/11	Finalize for filing certification of counsel re: final order for employee wages motion	TBOLL	B015	0.30
Sub Total				2.90

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/04/11	Correspondence with Sarah Barr re Hogan/Lovells retention	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/05/11	Correspond with A. Mason re: status of Young Conaway conflict search	MSEWA	B017	0.10
10/07/11	Review issues, affidavit and related documents regarding YCST retention application	MNEST	B017	1.40
10/07/11	Draft affidavit re: supplemental affidavit of M. Nestor for Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.40
10/07/11	Review conflict report re: Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	4.10
10/10/11	Review report re: conflict search report	MSEWA	B017	5.10
10/11/11	Review report re: conflict search report	MSEWA	B017	2.90
10/11/11	Review and revise affidavit re: M. Nestor supplemental affidavit to Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.30
10/12/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian re comments to Lazarad retention order	KCOYL	B017	0.10
10/13/11	Review numerous correspondence and telephone calls with US Trustee re: comments/issues with YCST and all other debtor retention applications/orders (1.1); review/revise versions of supplemental disclosure and retention order re: YCST to resolve issues of US Trustee (.7)	MNEST	B017	1.80
10/13/11	Review and revise M. Nestor affidavit re: Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.40

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/13/11	Review and revise order re: Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/13/11	Review and comment on revisions to ordinary course professionals order re: U.S. Trustee's suggested revisions	MSEWA	B017	0.50
10/13/11	Work with conflicts and accounting personnel re: Young Conaway retention conflicts searches	MSEWA	B017	0.30
10/14/11	Correspondence from Sarah Barr re supplemental A&M Declaration	KCOYL	B017	0.10
10/14/11	Correspondence and telephone calls re: Committee objections to Lazard retention and request for adjournment of same	MNEST	B017	0.40
10/14/11	Review objection re: objection to Lazard retention filed by committee	MSEWA	B017	0.30
10/14/11	Review and revise supplemental affidavit for M. Nestor to reflect U.S. Trustee's comments re: Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.40
10/14/11	Review and revise order to reflect U.S. Trustee's comments re: Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.30
10/14/11	Correspond with M. Nestor and J. Sarkessian of U.S. Trustee's Office re: Young Conaway retention application revisions	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/14/11	Review and file affidavit re: supplemental affidavit of M. Nestor in support of Young Conaway retention	MSEWA	B017	0.40
10/14/11	Review and file affidavit re: supplemental affidavit in support of Alvarez retention	MSEWA	B017	0.40
10/14/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of supplemental affidavit of Michael R. Nestor in support of application to retain YCST	TBOLL	B017	0.30
10/14/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of supplemental declaration of Thomas Hill in support of application to retain Alvarez & Marsal	TBOLL	B017	0.20
10/16/11	Review and file supplemental affidavit re: PricewaterhouseCoopers retention	MSEWA	B017	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/18/11	Correspondence (3) with M. Warren and A. Weis re: blank affidavit for ordinary course professionals	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/18/11	Review and file supplement re: J. Athanas declaration supplement to Latham retention	MSEWA	B017	0.30
10/18/11	Correspondence with ordinary course professionals re: submission of affidavits	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/18/11	Correspond with T. Bollman re: status of Young Conaway retention order	MSEWA	B017	0.10
10/18/11	Finalize for filing supplemental declaration of Josef Athanas re: retention of Latham & Watkins LLP	TBOLL	B017	0.20
10/19/11	Correspondence with Joy Monahan re retention of Edwards Wildman	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/19/11	Teleconference with Matt Warren and Joy Monahan re retention of Edwards Wildman	KCOYL	B017	0.30
10/20/11	Work with Mike Nestor re: retention of Edwards Wilard	KCOYL	B017	0.10
10/20/11	Correspondence with Justin Schmaltz and Matt Warren re: OCP Affidavit of Brown Edwards	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/20/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren re: retention of Edwards Wildman	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/21/11	Correspondence with Matt Warren and Lisa Meadows re: OCP affidavit of Brown Edwards	KCOYL	B017	0.30
10/21/11	Correspondence with Joy Monahan and Matt Warren re: revisions to Edwards Wildman retention application	KCOYL	B017	0.30
10/21/11	Review and revise Edwards Wildman retention application re: preparation for filing	KCOYL	B017	0.40
10/21/11	Review, revise and file application re: application to retain Edwards Wildman	MSEWA	B017	1.20
10/21/11	Prepare notice re: application to retain and employ Edwards Wildman Palmer	TBOLL	B017	0.20

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Graceway Pharma Holding Corp.
File No. 070649.1001

Invoice No. 40349623

11-21-2011

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/25/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of first monthly fee application of YCST	TBOLL	B017	0.30
10/27/11	Review and revise YCST October fee application for filing and service	MNEST	B017	0.40
10/27/11	Review and file re: supplemental affidavit to Latham retention	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/27/11	Prepare notice of filing of ordinary course professional affidavit	TBOLL	B017	0.50
10/28/11	Correspondence with Caroline Reckler and client team re: issues with FTI retention	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/28/11	Review, revise and file notice re: notice of ordinary course professionals affidavit filing	MSEWA	B017	0.20
10/28/11	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of filing of ordinary course professional affidavit for Brown Edwards	TBOLL	B017	0.30
10/30/11	Multiple correspondence with Mike Nestor and Mike Benn re: Committee's motion to retain FTI	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/31/11	Correspondence with Juliet Sarkessian and Caroline Reckler re: application to retain Edwards Wildman	KCOYL	B017	0.20
10/31/11	Legal research re: indemnity for committee's financial advisors	MSEWA	B017	1.30
Sub Total				29.20

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/20/11	Prepare first monthly fee application of YCST	TBOLL	B018	1.30
Sub Total				1.30

Date	Description	Attorney	Task Code	Time
10/13/11	Review and comment on revisions to final order re: U.S. Trustee's suggested revisions to final utilities order	MSEWA	B020	0.40

