

**EXHIBIT A**



EDWARDS WILDMAN PALMER LLP  
 525 OKEECHOBEE BOULEVARD, SUITE 1600  
 WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33401  
 +1 561 833 7700 MAIN +1 561 655 8719 FAX  
 edwardswildman.com

## Invoice

*Wire Instructions:*

Bank of America  
 Westminster St., Providence, RI 02903  
 Acct# 000156917009  
 ABA Wire Transfer # 026009593  
 ABA ACH Payment # 011500010  
 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N  
 DUNS# 361207116

**Please Note New**  
*Remittance Address*  
 P.O. Box 416395  
 Boston, MA 02241-6395  
 Fed. Id #05-0135015  
 12136 F9STD

Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC  
 Attention: John A. Bellamy, Executive Vice President & General Counsel  
 Legal Department  
 340 Martin Luther King Jr. Blvd  
 Suite 500  
 Bristol, TN 37620  
 U.S.A.

December 9, 2011

Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC/General IP and Corporate  
 Client Number: 54610  
 Invoice Number: 09293011

*Summary Page - Please refer to detail attached for further information.*

Legal Services:	\$ 15,757.00
Disbursements:	\$ 3,884.50
<b>Total Invoice:</b>	<b>\$ 19,641.50</b>

*Bills for legal services, disbursements and charges are due within 30 days. Bills not paid within 30 days will be assessed a late payment charge equal to 1% per month until paid in full.*

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.



EDWARDS WILDMAN PALMER LLP  
525 OKEECHOBEE BOULEVARD, SUITE 1600  
WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33401  
+1 561 833 7700 MAIN +1 561 655 8719 FAX  
edwardswildman.com

## Invoice

*Wire Instructions:*

Bank of America  
Westminster St., Providence, RI 02903  
Acct# 000156917009  
ABA Wire Transfer # 026009593  
ABA ACH Payment # 011500010  
Swift Code: BOFAUS3N  
DUNS# 361207116

**Please Note New  
Remittance Address**  
P.O. Box 416395  
Boston, MA 02241-6395

Fed. Id #05-0135015  
12136 F9STD

Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC  
Attention: John A. Bellamy, Executive Vice President & General Counsel  
Legal Department  
340 Martin Luther King Jr. Blvd  
Suite 500  
Bristol, TN 37620  
U.S.A.

December 9, 2011

Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC/General IP and Corporate  
Client Number: 54610  
Invoice Number: 09293011

*Summary Page - Please refer to detail attached for further information.*

Legal Services:	\$ 15,757.00
Disbursements:	\$ 3,884.50
<b>Total Invoice:</b>	<b>\$ 19,641.50</b>

### *Remittance Copy*

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.



EDWARDS WILDMAN PALMER LLP  
 525 OKEECHOBEE BOULEVARD, SUITE 1600  
 WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33401  
 +1 561 833 7700 MAIN +1 561 655 8719 FAX  
 edwardswildman.com

## Invoice

*Wire Instructions:*

Bank of America  
 Westminster St., Providence, RI 02903  
 Acct# 000156917009  
 ABA Wire Transfer # 026009593  
 ABA ACH Payment # 011500010  
 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N  
 DUNS# 361207116

**Please Note New  
 Remittance Address**  
 P.O. Box 416395  
 Boston, MA 02241-6395

Fed. Id #05-0135015  
 12136 F9STD

Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC  
 Attention: John A. Bellamy, Executive Vice President & General Counsel  
 Legal Department  
 340 Martin Luther King Jr. Blvd  
 Suite 500  
 Bristol, TN 37620

December 9, 2011

For Professional Services Rendered

Client Number: 54610  
 Invoice Number: 09293011

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
1	9/29/2011	General IP and Corporate	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	N/A	Review docket regarding upcoming deadlines with respect to outstanding actions.	2.8	\$1,400.00
64	9/29/2011	Patent Infringement Lawsuit for Immune	Moore Barbara L.	804	N/A	Review announcement of sale of Graceway and related correspondence among team.	0.4	\$260.00

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.

Invoice # 09293011  
 Client Number: 54610  
 December 9, 2011  
 Page 4

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
64	9/30/2011	Patent Infringement Lawsuit for Immune	Moore Barbara L.	804	N/A	Conference with A. O'Connor regarding status and sale of Graceway.	0.3	\$195.00
67022	9/30/2011	Imidazonaphth yridines, Patent No., 6,624	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67062	9/29/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review of claim language in foreign and US cases in light of file history (0.7); review foreign claims regarding possible strategies (0.7); correspond with associate regarding upcoming deadline (0.2).	1.6	\$800.00
67062	9/29/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	US	Review of office action, examiner's remarks and claim language.	1.5	\$750.00
67062	9/30/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	US	Draft and revise amendment and response.	2.2	\$1,100.00

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.

Invoice # 09293011  
 Client Number: 54610  
 December 9, 2011  
 Page 5

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
67062	9/30/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review correspondence from associate regarding possibilities for extensions of deadline (0.3); correspond with associate regarding same (0.3).	0.6	\$300.00
67062	9/30/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67062	9/30/2011	METHOD OF TREATING ACTINIC KERATOSIS	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67063	9/29/2011	PACKAGING FOR 1-(2-METHYLPROPYL)-1H-IMID	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review communication from associate regarding filing of Extension of Time (0.3); correspond with associate regarding same (0.4).	0.7	\$350.00
67063	9/30/2011	PACKAGING FOR 1-(2-METHYLPROPYL)-1H-IMID	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review communication from associate confirming receipt of instructions.	0.1	\$50.00

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.

Invoice # 09293011  
 Client Number: 54610  
 December 9, 2011  
 Page 6

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
67063	9/30/2011	PACKAGING FOR 1-(2-METHYLPROPYL)-1H-IMID	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67064	9/30/2011	IMMUNE RESPONSE MODIFIER FORMULATIONS CO	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67065	9/30/2011	PROCESS FOR PREPARING 2-METHYL-1-(2-METH	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67188	9/30/2011	GEL FORMULATIONS FOR TOPICAL DRUG DELIVE	Regan Katie	A239D	Foreign	Draft reminder letters; review client instructions; payment of annuity or maintenance fee.	0.5	\$300.00
67919	9/29/2011	1) Method and Packages to Enhance Safety	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review communication from associate regarding filing of extension of time (0.3); correspond with associate regarding same (0.4).	0.7	\$350.00

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.

Invoice # 09293011  
 Client Number: 54610  
 December 9, 2011  
 Page 7

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
67919	9/30/2011	1) Method and Packages to Enhance Safety	Piffat Kathryn A.	846	Foreign	Review communication from associate confirming receipt of instructions.	0.1	\$50.00
83136	9/30/2011	Lower-strength imiquimod formulations an	Daley William J.	846	US	Draft and review substitute specification and clean versos of substitute specification.	1.2	\$570.00
83136	9/30/2011	Lower-strength imiquimod formulations an	Daley William J.	846	US	Revise and review substitute specification.	1.2	\$570.00
83136	9/30/2011	Lower-strength imiquimod formulations an	Russett Mark D.	846	US	Draft response to office action, including claim amendments (1.0); office conference with P. Manso regarding same (.2); draft papers regarding same including terminal disclaimers and substitute specification (.7); office conference with W. Daley regarding same (.3); draft information disclosure statement (.5); review filing response and related U.S. Patent and Trademark office papers (.6).	3.3	\$1,485.00

REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.



Invoice # 09293011  
 Client Number: 54610  
 December 9, 2011  
 Page 8

Matter	Date	Short Matter Name	Timekeeper	Action Code	Country	Narrative	Billed Hours	Billed Amount
83136	9/30/2011	Lower-strength imiquimod formulations an	Russett Mark D.	846	US	Draft response to office action, including claim amendments (.4); office conference with P. Manso regarding same (.2); prepare related papers, including terminal disclaimers and substitute specification (.7); office conference with W. Daley regarding same (.2); prepare information disclosure statement (.5); review filing response and related papers (.6).	2.6	\$1,170.00
83136	9/30/2011	Lower-strength imiquimod formulations an	Manso Peter J.	846	US	Prepare and submit amended claims for office action (2.3); review and revise response (2.6); review and revise office action and prior art (1.9); review application (1.4); conferences with M. Russett (.4).	8.6	\$4,257.00
<b>TOTAL FEES DUE</b>							<b>31.4</b>	<b>\$15,757.00</b>

REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK

BOSTON · CHICAGO · FT LAUDERDALE · HARTFORD · LONDON · LOS ANGELES · MADISON NJ · NEW YORK · NEWPORT BEACH  
 PROVIDENCE · STAMFORD · TOKYO · WASHINGTON DC · WEST PALM BEACH · HONG KONG (associated office)  
 This invoice may include charges for professional services rendered by fee earners of Edwards Wildman Palmer UK LLP.

The partnerships of Edwards Angell Palmer & Dodge LLP and Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon LLP merged on October 1, 2011.  
 The new firm's name is Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP.