

EXHIBIT B

In re: Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC, *et al.*

Task Billing Summary Page

Re: In re Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC, *et al.* Case No. 11-13036

	<u>Previous Billed</u>	<u>Current Bill</u>	<u>Total</u>
Case Administration	\$3,632.00	\$0.00	\$3,632.00
Asset Analysis Recovery	\$9,430.00	\$0.00	\$9,430.00
Asset Disposition	\$13,062.00	\$3,054.00	\$16,116.00
Relief From Stay/Adequate Protection Pro	\$285.00	\$0.00	\$285.00
Meetings of and Communications with Cred.	\$10,817.00	\$0.00	\$10,817.00
Employment & Retention Application EGS	\$24,149.00	\$0.00	\$24,149.00
Employment & Retention Application Other	\$28,891.00	\$591.00	\$29,482.00
Fee/Applications and Invoices – EGS	\$12,841.50	\$2,577.50	\$15,419.00
Fee Objections EGS	\$1,374.50	\$354.00	\$1,728.50
Fee Applications and Invoices – Others	\$12,765.50	\$2,866.00	\$15,631.50
Fee Objections – Others	\$5,940.50	\$1,032.00	\$6,972.50
Lease and Contract-Assumption, Rejection	\$5,902.50	\$122.00	\$6,024.50
Non-Working Travel	\$24,149.00	\$0.00	\$24,149.00
Business Operations	\$3,416.00	\$369.50	\$3,785.50
Employee Benefits/Pensions	\$244.00	\$0.00	\$244.00
Financing/Cash Collections	\$15,901.00	\$305.00	\$16,206.00
Claims and Plan	\$366.00	\$0.00	\$366.00
Claims Administration and Objections	\$3,082.50	\$769.50	\$3,852.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	\$16,264.50	\$2,527.00	\$18,791.50
Other	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Court Hearings	\$19,051.50	\$3,520.50	\$22,572.00
Schedules and Statements	\$2,827.00	\$0.00	\$2,827.00
Litigation	\$2,672.50	\$1,329.50	\$4,002.00
Total	\$240,731.50	\$19,417.50	\$260,149.00



www.elliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189

John Bellamy
Graceway Pharmaceuticals, LLC
340 Martin Luther King, Jr., Blvd, Suite 5800
Briston TN 37620
United States of America

June 8, 2012
Bill Number 108834
File Number 60357-001

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: In re Graceway Pharmaceuticals

LEGAL SERVICES

Through March 31, 2012

Table with 4 columns: Date, Code, Description, and Hours. Rows include entries for 03/01/12 with codes CLS, RXZ and various descriptions of legal services such as summarizing applications, preparing for hearings, and analyzing orders.

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/01/12	RXZ	[B176-] E-mails from L. Shaw re: Fifth Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period January 1, 2012 to January 31, 2012 filed by Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP	0.20 Hrs
03/01/12	RXZ	[B320-] E-mails from L. Shaw re: debtors' disclosure statement (.1) and summary and recommendation e-mail from J. Teele re: same and related attachments (.3)	0.40 Hrs
03/01/12	RXZ	[B320-] Teleconference with S. Kinsella regarding hearing preparations	0.30 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B320-] Analyze Amended Disclosure Statement (blackline)	0.40 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Order approving Debtors' 1st Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B320-] Analyze Order extending exclusivity period	0.10 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Hogan Lovells Response to claim objection	0.10 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B320-] Analyze Certification of Counsel re proposed Disclosure Statement Order	0.20 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B175-] Email exchange with FTI (M. Greenberg) re upcoming fee application hearing	0.10 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B320-] Analyze Order entered approving Disclosure Statement	0.20 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Order approving Order re rejection of Masergy contract/settlement stipulation	0.20 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B165-] Analyze Order authorizing scope of PWC's retention	0.10 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B170-] Analyze revised 2nd Quarterly Fee Application package for Elliott Greenleaf; instructions to L. Shaw re same	0.40 Hrs
03/01/12	SAK	[B320-] Email from J. Teele re Disclosure Hearing proceedings and related issues	0.10 Hrs
03/02/12	CLS	[B320-] Review, summarize and forward Amended Disclosure Statement for the First Amended Joint Plan (.8) Order Extending Debtors' Exclusive Periods Within Which to File a Chapter 11 Plan and to Solicit Acceptance Thereto (.3)	1.10 Hrs
03/02/12	CLS	[B310-] Summarize Order Sustaining Debtors' First Omnibus (Non-Substantive) Objection to Claims (.2)	0.20 Hrs
03/02/12	CLS	[B430-] Update critical dates	0.40 Hrs
03/02/12	RXZ	[B310-] E-mail from L. Shaw re: Response of Hogan Lovells US LLP to Notice of Objection regarding Claims	0.10 Hrs
03/02/12	SAK	[B210-] Analyze Debtors' Monthly Operating Report for January 2012	0.10 Hrs
03/05/12	RXZ	[B210-] E-mail from T. Snow re: MOR and analyze same	0.30 Hrs
03/05/12	SAK	[B320-] Analyze Notice of Confirmation hearing	0.10 Hrs
03/05/12	SAK	[B320-] Multiple emails from L. Shaw re upcoming Confirmation deadlines	0.10 Hrs
03/05/12	TMS	[B210-] Review docket and forward monthly operating report to J. Teele and N. Stefanelli	0.10 Hrs
03/05/12	TMS	[B430-] Review docket regarding Confirmation Hearing and numerous emails regarding pertinent dates/deadlines to Committee Professionals	0.20 Hrs
03/06/12	LMB	[B430-] Analyze multiple motions, orders and related documents for purposes of supplementing critical date memos	1.10 Hrs
03/06/12	RXZ	[B230-] E-mail from H. Allanson re: variance report	0.10 Hrs
03/06/12	RXZ	[B310-] E-mails from M. Warren re: post petition invoices for 3M	0.20 Hrs

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/06/12	SAK	[B430-] Instructions to L. Bugda re revisions to Critical Dates memos; review same	0.40 Hrs
03/08/12	RXZ	[B310-] Analyze letter to Judge Walsh re: claim for \$5,600 filed by Dr. M. Shane Chapman and related e-mail from T. Snow	0.10 Hrs
03/08/12	RXZ	[B230-] Analyze Graceway Variance Report and related e-mail from Debtors counsel	0.20 Hrs
03/08/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Dr. S. Chapman's response to 3rd Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/08/12	SAK	[B176-] Finalize Certificate of No Objection re FTI's 4th Monthly Fee Application and Certificate of Service	0.20 Hrs
03/08/12	SAK	[B171-] Finalize Certificate of No Objection re Elliott Greenleaf's 4th Monthly Fee Application and Certificate of Service	0.20 Hrs
03/08/12	TMS	[B310-] Review docket and summarize and email claim filed by Dr. Shane Chapman	0.10 Hrs
03/08/12	TMS	[B171-] Review docket for objections and preparation of CNO to EG 4th monthly fee application (.4); prepare COS (.1); file and effectuate service (.7)	1.20 Hrs
03/08/12	TMS	[B176-] Review docket for objections (.1) preparation of CNO to FTI's 4th monthly fee application (.3); prepare COS (.1); file and effectuate service (.7)	1.20 Hrs
03/08/12	TMS	[B175-] Update critical dates memorandum and conference with M. Braverman regarding same	0.10 Hrs
03/09/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Certification of Counsel re Debtors' GTCR Settlement Motion	0.20 Hrs
03/10/12	RXZ	[B175-] E-mail from N. Stefanelli re: Lowenstein Sandler's Fourth Monthly Fee Application	0.10 Hrs
03/12/12	CLS	[B170-] Prepare EG's 5th Fee Application (.8); prepare Notice to Fee Application (.3); prepare COS and service distribution (.6); edit and revise fee application (.3); prepare summary charts to fee application time summary and expenses (.6)	2.60 Hrs
03/12/12	CLS	[B175-] Prepare Notice for Lowenstein's 4th Monthly Fee (.2); prepare COS and service distribution (.7); assemble and file application (.4); complete service (1.0)	2.30 Hrs
03/12/12	RXZ	[B600-] Analyze Order Authorizing the Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with GTCR and forward to paralegals	0.20 Hrs
03/12/12	RXZ	[B175-] E-mail from N. Steffanelli re: fee application for LS and forward same to S. Kinsella and paralegals	0.10 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B175-] Finalize Lowenstein Sandler's 4th Monthly Fee Application, Notice, multiple Exhibits and Certificate of Service (.3); instructions to L. Shaw re revisions to same (.1)	0.40 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B170-] Analyze and revise Exhibit B for Elliott Greenleaf's 5th Monthly Fee Application; (.3); instructions to T. Snow re same (.1)	0.40 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B170-] Finalize Elliott Greenleaf's 5th Monthly Fee Application, Notice, multiple Exhibits and Certificate of Service (.4); instructions to L. Shaw (.1)	0.50 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Order re GTCR settlement	0.10 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B176-] Email from L. Shaw re upcoming fee application deadlines	0.10 Hrs
03/12/12	SAK	[B310-] An Debtors' Notice of Partial Withdrawal of Third Omnibus Claims Objection (CVS)	0.10 Hrs
03/12/12	TMS	[B170-] Supplement Exhibit for EG's 5th monthly application	0.70 Hrs

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/13/12	CLS	[B170-] Serve Notice to 2002 service list and Application to Notice parties (1.6); forward fee application to J. McStravick and P. Rooney (.1); distribute to clients and counsel (.1) calendar deadlines (.2)	2.00 Hrs
03/13/12	CLS	[B175-] Review e-mail from Debtors regarding Proposed Order for Fee Application hearing (.2); pull and review all fee interim applications filed by EG, Lowenstein and FTI and forward to RXZA for review (.3) respond to e-mails from M. Greenberg (.1); reply to Debtors (.1)	0.70 Hrs
03/13/12	CLS	[B320-] Update critical dates calander	0.30 Hrs
03/13/12	CLS	[B600-] Receive and forward to professionals Order Authorizing the Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with GTCR (.2)	0.20 Hrs
03/13/12	RXZ	[B600-] E-mail summary re: GTCR order and COC from T. Snow	0.10 Hrs
03/13/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mails to and from J. Teele re: fee application hearing and related folow up with paralegals	0.30 Hrs
03/13/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mails to and from J. Teele re: fee application hearing and appearance	0.20 Hrs
03/13/12	RXZ	[B175-] E-mails to and from L. Shaw re: quareteley fee applicaiton hearing (.2) and analyze memo on fee applicaiton deadlines re: same (.2)	0.40 Hrs
03/13/12	SAK	[B170-] Finalize revised Elliott Greenleaf 5th Monthly Fee Application package and instructions to T. Snow and L. Shaw re revisions and filing/service of same (.2); conference with R. Zahralddin re additional revisions downward (.1)	0.30 Hrs
03/13/12	SAK	[B175-] Email from Debtors' counsel re 1st Qtr fee applications; review Certification of Counsel and proposed Order drafts	0.20 Hrs
03/13/12	TMS	[B600-] Review docket for signed Order regarding settlement agreement with GTCR and email Committee and Committee Professionals summarizing the Order and forwarding the related documents regarding same	0.20 Hrs
03/14/12	CLS	[B430-] Review and summarize Agenda for Hearing scheduled for March 16, 2012	0.20 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B430-] Analyze agenda (.2) e-mails and calls from co-counsel (.3) follow up with paralegals on hearing (.1)	0.60 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B170-] Prepare for quarterly fee application hearing	1.10 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails re: disposition of furniture and other miscellaneous assets	0.30 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B430-] Instructions to L. Shaw re: upcoming hearing preparation	0.20 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mail from L. Shaw to committee professionals re: hearing	0.20 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mails to and from J. Teele re: appearance (.2) same re: FTI (.1)	0.30 Hrs
03/14/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails to and from M. Warren re: Further Asset Sales	0.20 Hrs
03/14/12	SAK	[B175-] Email exchange with Debtors' counsel re omnibus fee application order	0.10 Hrs
03/14/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Certification of Counsel re Debtors' 2nd Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/14/12	SAK	[B175-] Analyze Certification of Counsel re proposed Order for 1st Interim fee applications	0.10 Hrs
03/14/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Certification of Counsel re Debtors' 3rd Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/14/12	SAK	[B430-] Analyze Notice of Agenda re 03/16/12 hearing; email exchange with R. Zahralddin and co-counsel re same	0.20 Hrs

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/15/12	CLS	[B175-] Prepare Notice for 5th Monthly Fee Application of FTI (.2); prepare COS to 5th Monthly Fee Application (.2); prepare service distribution (.6); file with Court (.3); serve application on Notice parties (.5); serve Notice on 2002 service list (1.0); calendar objection deadline and forward filed copy to client (.1); calendar objection deadline send invitations (.1); review and respond to numerous e-mails regarding application (.1)	3.10 Hrs
03/15/12	CLS	[B175-] Receive and review Omnibus Hearing Order regarding Fee Applications (.2)	0.20 Hrs
03/15/12	CLS	[B430-] Update Delaware deadlines for critical dates memo	0.30 Hrs
03/15/12	RXZ	[B175-] Analyze signed Order approving interim fee applications and forward to paralegals for handling and distribution to committee professionals	0.20 Hrs
03/15/12	RXZ	[B310-] Analyze claim objection orders	0.20 Hrs
03/15/12	RXZ	[B175-] E-mail from K. Coyle re: instructions from Chambers re: hearing (.1) calls to committee professionals and coordinate telephonic appearances with paralegals (.2)	0.30 Hrs
03/15/12	RXZ	[B130-] Call with M. Warren re: further asset sales	0.20 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B430-] Email from Debtors' counsel re preparation for upcoming hearing	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B175-] Finalize FTI's 5th Monthly Fee Application, Notice, multiple Exhibits and Certificate of Service (.4); instructions to L. Shaw re revisions (.1)	0.50 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B430-] Email from Debtors' counsel re hearing cancellation	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B430-] Analyze Amended Notice of Agenda (hearing cancelled)	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B176-] Multiple emails from L. Shaw re upcoming fee application deadlines	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Order approving 2nd Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	SAK	[B310-] Analyze Order approving 3rd Omnibus Claims Objection	0.10 Hrs
03/15/12	TMS	[B176-] Emails to Committee Professionals regarding cancelled hearing and review docket for Order and email Committee Professionals signed order (.1); emails to/from FTI regarding certification of counsel (.1)	0.20 Hrs
03/15/12	TMS	[B430-] Update critical dates and email to Committee Professionals and Committee regarding upcoming hearing dates and deadlines	0.20 Hrs
03/16/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mail and attachments from M. Warren re: draft agreement with the real estate broker	0.30 Hrs
03/16/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mail and attachments from M. Warren re: two final Purchase Agreements received for FF&E	0.50 Hrs
03/17/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails to and from Debtors, first and second lien lenders, and co-counsel and (.3) analyze revised Purchase Agreement incorporating the Debtors comments (.4), redline (.3), and the draft Sale Motion/Order (.5)	1.50 Hrs
03/21/12	CLS	[B430-] Update critical dates Delaware deadlines (.4); update fee application deadlines (.3)	0.70 Hrs
03/21/12	RXZ	[B130-] Analyze Motion to Authorize the Debtors to (A) Sell Certain Property Outside the Ordinary Course of Business to JG Resources, LLC and (B) Abandon Certain Expendable Property	0.40 Hrs
03/21/12	RXZ	[B600-] Analyze Debtors' Motion for an Order Authorizing Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with Edwards Wildman Palmer LLP	0.30 Hrs
03/21/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails to and from first lien lender counsel re: comments to further asset sales motion	0.40 Hrs

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/21/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails to and from debtors, first and second lien lenders, and co-counsel (.3) re: Bristol FFE Purchase Agreement and redline and analyze attachments (.4)	0.70 Hrs
03/21/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Debtors' motion to approve settlement with EWP	0.20 Hrs
03/21/12	SAK	[B130-] Analyze Debtors' motion to sell property to JG Resources and abandon certain property	0.30 Hrs
03/22/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mails to T. Snow re: hearing schedule	0.20 Hrs
03/22/12	TMS	[B430-] Emails to/from R. Zahralddin regarding upcoming hearings and review of docket regarding same	0.10 Hrs
03/23/12	RXZ	[B600-] Analyze Motion to Shorten Time for Notice of the Hearing to Consider the Debtors' Motion Pursuant to Sections 105 and 363 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 9019 for an Order Authorizing the Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with Humana Inc. and forward same to paralegals	0.20 Hrs
03/23/12	RXZ	[B210-] Analyze Fifth Notice of Filing of OCP Affidavit (CT Corporation System)	0.20 Hrs
03/26/12	RXZ	[B230-] Analyze e-mails from A.C. Weis re: closing of bank account	0.20 Hrs
03/26/12	RXZ	[B320-] Analyze Graceway Confirmation Order (.8) and related e-mails (.2)	1.00 Hrs
03/26/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Debtors' Motion to approve settlement with Humana and motion to shorten re same	0.30 Hrs
03/26/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Order approve Motion to shorten re Humana settlement approval motion	0.10 Hrs
03/27/12	RXZ	[B165-] Analyze Debtors' application to retain TCI Group (.2) and related e-mails from the debtor (.1)	0.30 Hrs
03/27/12	RXZ	[B600-] Analyze Order Shortening Time for Notice of the Hearing to Consider the Debtors' Motion Pursuant to Sections 105 and 363 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 9019 for an Order Authorizing the Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with Humana Inc. and forward to paralegals	0.20 Hrs
03/27/12	SAK	[B170-] Email exchange with L. Shaw re fee application status	0.10 Hrs
03/28/12	RXZ	[B130-] E-mails to and from Debtors counsel and first lien lenders counsel re: further asset sales	0.30 Hrs
03/28/12	RXZ	[B165-] Analyze updated TCI Group Retention Application, Order and related documents	0.40 Hrs
03/29/12	SAK	[B430-] Analyze Order setting omnibus hearing dates and instructions to paralegals re same	0.10 Hrs
03/30/12	CLS	[B430-] Review and forward Agenda for April 2, 2012 hearing to professionals (.2); update 2002 service list with address change (.2)	0.40 Hrs
03/30/12	RXZ	[B600-] E-mail to and from C. Shaw re Motion to Shorten Time for Notice of the Hearing to Consider the Debtors' Motion Pursuant to Sections 105 and 363 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 9019 for an Order Authorizing the Debtors to Enter into a Settlement Agreement with Humana	0.10 Hrs
03/30/12	RXZ	[B430-] E-mails to and from T. Snow re: objection deadlines for pending motions and hearing date	0.30 Hrs
03/30/12	RXZ	[B430-] Analyze certification of counsel re: hearing dates and forward to T. Snow for handling	0.20 Hrs

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

03/30/12	RXZ	[B176-] Analyze Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses (Sixth) for the period February 1, 2012 to February 29, 2012 Filed by Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP (.3) and forward to T. Snow for handling and summary (.2)	0.50 Hrs
03/30/12	SAK	[B600-] Analyze Debtors' motion to approve settlement with CVS and motion to shorten re same	0.20 Hrs
03/30/12	TMS	[B600-] Email Committee Professionals and calendar objection deadline of motion to approve compromise re: Debtors settlement agreement with Edwards Wildman	0.10 Hrs

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES \$19,417.50

LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

BUGDA, LISA M.	1.10 Hrs	200 /hr	\$220.00
Shaw, C. Liana	14.90 Hrs	225 /hr	\$3,352.50
Snow, Theresa M	4.40 Hrs	225 /hr	\$990.00
Kinsella, Shelley A.	8.50 Hrs	420 /hr	\$3,570.00
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X.	18.50 Hrs	610 /hr	\$11,285.00
	47.40 Hrs		\$19,417.50

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

COPYING

03/08/12	[] Device Cost	58.40
03/12/12	[] Device Cost	42.90
03/13/12	[] Device Cost	35.40
03/15/12	[] Device Cost	10.80
03/15/12	[] Device Cost	27.00
		\$174.50

DELIVERY/COURIER SERVICE

03/26/12	[] RELIABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL032601 DTD 03/15/12: PROFESSIONAL SERVICE PERIOD: 03/01-03/15/12: YCST + UST ON 3/12/12 FOR SAK	15.00
03/26/12	[] RELIABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL032601 DTD 03/15/12: PROFESSIONAL SERVICE PERIOD: 03/01-03/15/12: 2 HD ON 3/12/12 FOR RXZ	15.00
03/26/12	[] RELIABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL032601 DTD 03/15/12: PROFESSIONAL SERVICE PERIOD: 03/01-03/15/12: YCST + UST ON 3/15/12 FOR LCS	15.00
		\$45.00

Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses \$219.50

RETAINER AMOUNT	\$33,867.52
LESS PRIOR PAYMENTS APPLIED	<u>-\$19,637.00</u>
TOTAL THIS BILL	<u>\$0.00</u>
GRAND TOTAL DUE	<u><u>\$0.00</u></u>
RETAINER BALANCE	\$14,230.52

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

****WE NOW ACCEPT PAYMENT BY CREDIT CARD. IF INTERESTED
PLEASE CONTACT PAT ROONEY AT (215) 977-1014*****