

EXHIBIT F

September 14, 2015

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee
(needs to be provided)

Attorneys at Law

311 South Wacker Drive
Suite 3000
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100182893

Re: Asset Sales
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0011

Chicago
Springfield

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED
THROUGH JULY 31, 2015:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$49,704.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	49,704.50
BALANCE DUE	<u>\$49,704.50</u>



PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS

Statement No: 100182893

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Asset Sales

May 13, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee and Jason Brookner regarding non-disclosure agreements (1.0).	1.00
May 15, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee and Ted Gavin regarding sale of inventory (1.0).	1.00
May 20, 2015	RSL	Review of Gulf Packaging closing and loan documents in connection with sale issues (1.0).	1.00
May 20, 2015	SAD	Review due diligence package (1.5).	1.50
May 22, 2015	DJE	Draft objection to sale procedures motion (0.9); review sale procedures in connection with same (0.2); revise objection based upon comments of Shelly DeRousse (0.2).	1.30
May 22, 2015	SAD	Draft and revise objection to sale motion (1.5).	1.50
May 27, 2015	SAD	Review and revise draft sale order (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding draft sale order (0.7); e-mail correspondence with Ramunas Venclovas regarding draft sale order (0.4).	2.10
May 28, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ramunas Venclovas (committee member) regarding draft sale order (0.2).	0.20
May 28, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with debtor regarding revised sale order (0.4).	0.40
Jun 1, 2015	SAD	Review marketing report (0.5).	0.50
Jun 9, 2015	SAD	Review sales reports from Ted Gavin (1.0).	1.00
Jun 9, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding sale process (0.5).	0.50
Jun 10, 2015	RSL	Review of notice of sale to Anderson Hay and e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding same (0.3).	0.30
Jun 10, 2015	SAD	Review proposed sale of assets (1.0); review debtor's financials for same (1.0); review sales status (0.7); review notice of sale from Jason Brookner (0.4).	3.10

September 14, 2015

Jun 17, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin, Shelly DeRousse and Michael Schwartzmann regarding proposed sale dates (0.3).	0.30
Jun 19, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner and Ted Gavin regarding sale process (0.6); telephone conference with Ted Gavin and Jason Brookner regarding sale motion (0.5); review GPI sales report and payroll report (0.5); review draft sale motion, bidding procedures, notice and order (0.9).	2.50
Jun 19, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding sale motion (0.2); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding sale (0.6); e-mail correspondence with Julius Polenz regarding sale issues (0.4); review various reports from debtor for same (2.5).	3.70
Jun 22, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding proposed bid procedures (0.1); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1); review and revise draft sale procedures (1.2); e-mail correspondence to Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1).	1.50
Jun 22, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding sales procedures (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Michael Schwartzmann regarding sales procedures (0.8); review of draft sales procedure motion, notice, bidding procedures, asset purchase agreement and order (0.9).	2.20
Jun 22, 2015	SAD	Review reports regarding asset sale and marketing (1.8); telephone conference with Michael Schwartzmann regarding sale and other issues (1.0); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding sale (0.6); conference with Richard Lauter regarding sale procedures (0.5).	3.90

Jun 23, 2015	DJE	Revise comments to proposed sale procedures (0.3); e-mail correspondence to Jason Brookner (counsel for debtor) regarding same (0.1); review debtor's revisions to sale procedures (0.4); conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (0.4); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same and sale procedures order (0.2); revise draft sale procedures and sale procedures order based upon same (0.6); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Ted Gavin regarding same (0.4).	2.50
Jun 23, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Michael Schwartzmann regarding sales procedures (1.0); conference with Joe Frank regarding sales procedures (0.3).	1.30
Jun 24, 2015	DJE	E-mail correspondence from Jason Brookner (counsel for debtor) regarding proposed sale procedures (0.1).	0.10
Jun 24, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding sale procedures (1.0); telephone conference with Ted Gavin and Jason Brookner regarding sales procedures (0.6).	1.60
Jun 25, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Joe Frank regarding sale procedures (0.5).	0.50
Jun 26, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding July 1st presentation to creditors' committee on status of sale process (0.6).	0.60
Jun 29, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence to Devon Eggert regarding June 30th hearing on sales procedures (0.2); review procedures and order for same (0.5); telephone conference with Michael Schwartzmann and Shelly DeRousse regarding sale process (0.8); multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding June 30th hearing on sale procedures (0.8).	2.30

Jun 30, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding June 30th hearing on sales procedures (1.0); court appearance before Judge Hollis regarding sales procedures (1.0); preparation for June 30th hearing on sale procedures including review of changes of FCC to bidding procedures, notice and order (1.5).	3.50
Jun 30, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Katie Gleason regarding sale motion (0.4); review debtor's reports and documents for same (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Michael Schwartzmann regarding sales reports (0.7); conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (1.0).	3.10
Jul 1, 2015	SAD	Review weekly sale report (0.4).	0.40
Jul 1, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditor's committee, Ted Gavin, Jason Brookner, Fred Cross and Michael Schwarzmman regarding sale of assets (1.1); prepare for same (0.2).	1.30
Jul 6, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding sale reports (0.4).	0.40
Jul 7, 2015	SAD	Review changes to sale procedures order (0.4); review sales reports (0.6).	1.00
Jul 8, 2015	SAD	Review of sales report (0.4).	0.40
Jul 9, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding sale deadlines (0.3)	0.30
Jul 9, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse and Jason Brookner regarding stalking horse bid (0.6).	0.60
Jul 10, 2015	RSL	Review Gulf Packaging sale documents and multiple e-mail correspondence with creditor's committee regarding same (1.0).	1.00
Jul 13, 2015	SAD	Review week 7 sales report (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding sale (0.1); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding report (0.4).	0.90
Jul 13, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding assets (0.3).	0.30
Jul 13, 2015	RSL	Review of sales report and conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.5).	0.50

Jul 14, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding stalking horse offer (0.3).	0.30
Jul 14, 2015	SAD	Review proposed sale terms (0.5); telephone conference with Jason Brookner and Ted Gavin regarding same (0.6).	1.10
Jul 14, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Shelly DeRousse regarding stalking horse bid (0.9).	0.90
Jul 15, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding asset sale (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding stalking horse bidder (0.2); review proposed sale agreement (0.7); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding inventory list (0.4); review inventory list (0.5).	2.20
Jul 15, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditor's committee regarding sale (1.2); review of inventory report (0.6); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding position of FCC on stalking horse bid (0.4).	2.20
Jul 17, 2015	SAD	Conference with Richard Lauter regarding auction (0.9).	0.90
Jul 17, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding July 29th auction sale (0.9).	0.90
Jul 20, 2015	SAD	Review weekly report from Fred Cross (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Ramunas Venclovas regarding sale status (0.5); e-mail correspondence with A. J. LaRosa regarding inventory (0.4) review GPI report (0.5).	1.90
Jul 21, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee working group regarding debtor's sale motion (0.3).	0.30
Jul 21, 2015	JEH	Pull sale motion for Shelly DeRousse (0.1); e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding July 28, 2015 hearing (0.1).	0.20

Jul 21, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz and Ramunas Venclovas regarding sale (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding sale (0.4); review sale documents and filings (0.8); conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (1.0); e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin and Fred Cross regarding inventory (0.3); e-mail correspondence with A. J. LaRosa regarding sale (0.3); draft e-mail correspondence to committee regarding sale issues (0.7); telephone conference with Ted Gavin regarding asset sale (0.7).	4.60
Jul 21, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding sale of inventory to Gulf Atlantic and multiple e-mail correspondence with creditor's committee regarding same (1.0); review sale motion regarding Gulf Atlantic and related documents (1.0).	2.00
Jul 22, 2015	SAD	Review debtor's reports (1.5); review sale documents and release language for GAPCO (2.0); e-mail correspondence with R. Mett regarding proposed revisions (0.4); telephone conference with Ted Gavin regarding GAPCO (0.7).	4.60
Jul 22, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditor's committee regarding sale of inventory to Gulf Atlantic (1.1); telephone conference with Ted Gavin regarding release language in sale documents (0.5); telephone conferences with Rick Meth regarding release language in sale documents (0.7); telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding release language in sale documents (0.7).	3.00
Jul 23, 2015	SAD	Conference with Richard Lauter regarding sale issues (1.0).	1.00
Jul 23, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding release language in sale documents (1.0).	1.00
Jul 24, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee regarding GAPCO sale (1.0).	1.00
Jul 27, 2015	ELJ	Review e-mail correspondence from working group regarding resolution of motion to sell certain assets to Gulf Atlantic (0.2).	0.20
Jul 27, 2015	SAD	Review revised sale order (0.5); review weekly sales report (0.4).	0.90

Jul 28, 2015	ELJ	Prepare for hearing on sale to GAPCO (0.5); attend same (1.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding revisions to proposed order and APA (0.6); telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.1): conferences with working group, including debtor's counsel and GAPCO counsel (0.5).	3.10
Jul 29, 2015	SAD	Attend auction (3.5); meeting with debtor's counsel regarding sale of assets (0.8); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Rick Meth regarding release language (0.9); revise sale agreement (0.6).	5.80
Jul 29, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding auction and discussion with buyer regarding release language (0.3).	0.30
Jul 30, 2015	ELJ	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding motion to sell assets to GAPCO and revisions to release language (0.3).	0.30
Jul 30, 2015	SAD	Review sale agreement and release language (0.5); conference with Elizabeth Janczak regarding sale hearing (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding sale and hearing (0.2); prepare for hearing (0.5); attend sale hearing (1.0).	2.70
Jul 30, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding July 30th court hearing (0.2).	0.20

FEE SUMMARY

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	6.00	410.00	\$2,460.00
Lauter, Richard S.	32.90	655.00	\$21,549.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	51.00	480.00	\$24,480.00
Janczak, Elizabeth L.	3.60	325.00	\$1,170.00
Hazdra, Jacqueline E.	0.20	225.00	\$45.00
TOTAL HOURS	93.70		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$49,704.50</u>