

EXHIBIT E

September 14, 2015

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee
(needs to be provided)

,

Attorneys at Law

311 South Wacker Drive
Suite 3000
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100182891

Re: Committee Meeting and Governance
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0009

*Chicago
Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED
THROUGH JULY 31, 2015:

| | |
|-----------------------------------|---------------------------|
| FEEES FOR THIS STATEMENT | \$20,006.00 |
| DISBURSEMENTS | <u>0.00</u> |
| TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT | 20,006.00 |
| BALANCE DUE | <u>\$20,006.00</u> |



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**

Statement No: 100182891

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Committee Meeting and Governance

| | | | |
|--------------|-----|---|------|
| May 11, 2015 | RSL | Telephone conference with Gulf Packaging creditors committee regarding organization (1.0). | 1.00 |
| May 12, 2015 | ELJ | Revise Committee bylaws (0.8); telephone conference with Richard Lauter regarding initial open items for Committee call (0.1); draft Committee contact list (0.1). | 1.00 |
| May 12, 2015 | DJE | Review and revise draft bylaws (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with internal working group regarding status of initial open committee governance items (0.2). | 0.40 |
| May 12, 2015 | SAD | Prepare for committee meeting (0.1); participate in telephone conference meeting of the committee (1.5). | 1.60 |
| May 12, 2015 | RSL | Preparation for first meeting of Gulf Packaging creditors' committee (2.8); telephone conference with Gulf Packaging creditors' committee regarding organization and first day motions (1.5). | 4.30 |
| May 13, 2015 | RSL | Conference with creditors' committee regarding presentation by Ted Gavin (1.5); telephone conference and conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding May 13th committee meeting (1.0). | 2.50 |
| May 14, 2015 | RSL | Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding May 13th creditors' committee meeting follow-up (0.7). | 0.70 |
| May 25, 2015 | DJE | Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee working group regarding May 26 hearing and open issues for same (0.4). | 0.40 |
| Jun 1, 2015 | SAD | Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding open case issues (1.1). | 1.10 |
| Jun 3, 2015 | SAD | Attend committee call and financial advisor pitches (1.8); review financial advisor pitch materials (1.0). | 2.80 |
| Jun 10, 2015 | SAD | Prepare for committee meeting (0.9); attend committee call (1.2). | 2.10 |

| | | | |
|--------------|-----|--|------|
| Jun 17, 2015 | RSL | Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding several case issues (1.0). | 1.00 |
| Jun 17, 2015 | SAD | Prepare for committee call (1.7); prepare agenda for committee call (0.5); attend committee call (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dennis Kalten and Michael Schwartzmann regarding committee call (1.0). | 4.20 |
| Jun 24, 2015 | DJE | Review and prepare for June 24 committee call (0.8); attend same (1.1). | 1.90 |
| Jul 1, 2015 | SAD | Prepare agenda for committee call (0.5); e-mail correspondence to committee regarding committee call (0.3); attend committee call (1.1); prepare for committee call (0.7); revise agenda (0.2). | 2.80 |
| Jul 8, 2015 | SAD | Attend committee call (1.1); conference with Richard Lauter regarding committee call (0.5). | 1.60 |
| Jul 8, 2015 | RSL | Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding July 8th creditor's committee meeting (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding same (0.5). | 1.00 |
| Jul 14, 2015 | SAD | Prepare agenda for committee call (0.4); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding agenda (0.3). | 0.70 |
| Jul 15, 2015 | SAD | Prepare for committee call (0.6); attend committee call (1.2). | 1.80 |
| Jul 21, 2015 | SAD | Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding various issues and committee call (1.0). | 1.00 |
| Jul 22, 2015 | SAD | Prepare agenda for meeting (0.4); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding call (1.3); attend committee call (1.1). | 2.80 |
| Jul 28, 2015 | ELJ | E-mail correspondence to Committee regarding GAPCO sale and related issues (0.1). | 0.10 |
| Jul 29, 2015 | SAD | Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding sale and case status (1.1); prepare for committee call (0.7). | 1.80 |

FEE SUMMARY

| <u>TIMEKEEPER</u> | <u>HOURS</u> | <u>RATE</u> | <u>FEES</u> |
|-------------------|--------------|-------------|-------------|
| Eggert, Devon J. | 2.70 | 410.00 | \$1,107.00 |

4

September 14, 2015

| <u>TIMEKEEPER</u> | <u>HOURS</u> | <u>RATE</u> | <u>FEES</u> |
|-------------------------------------|--------------|-------------|--------------------|
| Lauter, Richard S. | 10.50 | 655.00 | \$6,877.50 |
| DeRousse, Shelly A. | 24.30 | 480.00 | \$11,664.00 |
| Janczak, Elizabeth L. | 1.10 | 325.00 | \$357.50 |
| | | | |
| TOTAL HOURS | 38.60 | | |
| | | | |
| TOTAL FEES | | | <u>\$20,006.00</u> |
| | | | |
| TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS | | | \$20,006.00 |

c:\bills\693761.bil