

## **GROUP EXHIBIT A**

February 10, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100197966

Re: Gulf Packaging Creditor's Committee  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0001

*Chicago*  
*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$49,713.00
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	49,713.00
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$49,713.00</u></b>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.***  
***INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***

Statement No: 100197966

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Gulf Packaging Creditor's Committee

Aug 3, 2015	DJE	E-mail correspondence to Shelly DeRousse regarding August 4 hearing (0.1).	0.10
Aug 4, 2015	DJE	Prepare subpoenas for issuance (0.4).	0.40
Aug 5, 2015	DJE	Additional preparation for finalizing and issuing 2004 subpoenas (0.4).	0.40
Aug 6, 2015	DJE	Finalize certain 2004 subpoenas for issuance (0.3); conference with Jackie Hazdra regarding open items for same (0.2); telephone conference with Dimitri Karczes (counsel for FCC) regarding subpoena to FCC (0.2).	0.70
Aug 6, 2015	JEH	Telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding revising and serving multiple subpoenas (0.1).	0.10
Aug 7, 2015	DJE	Finalize additional subpoenas for issuance (0.5).	0.50
Aug 7, 2015	JEH	Revise multiple rule 2004 subpoenas (2.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.2); coordinate service of same (1.3).	3.70
Aug 7, 2015	DJE	Finalize and issue 2004 subpoenas (0.6); telephone conference with Dimitri Karczes (counsel for FCC) regarding same (0.2).	0.80
Aug 11, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding 2004 discovery (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Jackie Hazdra regarding service of same (0.1).	0.30
Aug 11, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service chart (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with process servers regarding status of subpoena service (0.2); locate address for Paul Corley for subpoena service (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert and Elizabeth Janczak regarding same (0.1).	0.80

Aug 11, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence from Jason Brookner regarding discovery (0.2); conferences with Devon Eggert regarding case status and discovery (0.8).	1.00
Aug 12, 2015	JEH	Update status of subpoena service chart (0.1); multiple e-mail correspondence with process servers regarding same (0.2).	0.30
Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding open case issues (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Ted Gavin regarding information needed (0.5).	1.20
Aug 13, 2015	ELJ	Strategy conference with working group regarding chapter 11 plan and litigation claims (0.7).	0.70
Aug 13, 2015	JEH	Update status of subpoena service chart (0.1); multiple e-mail correspondence with process servers regarding same (0.1).	0.20
Aug 13, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter, Ted Gavin and Jason Brookner regarding case status (0.3); conference with Elizabeth Janczak and Devon Eggert regarding strategy (0.7); review documents from debtor (0.8).	1.80
Aug 13, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding open plan and cash collateral issues (0.3); conference with Shelly DeRousse and Elizabeth Janczak regarding open items for August 18 hearing, plan review and investigation of affiliates (0.7).	1.00
Aug 14, 2015	ELJ	E-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert and Jacqueline Hazdra regarding alternative service address for Carolina-Gulf Packaging subpoena (0.1).	0.10
Aug 14, 2015	DJE	Telephone conferences with subpoenaed parties regarding deadlines to provide responsive documents (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jackie Hazdra regarding same and status of service of subpoenas (0.2).	0.50

Aug 14, 2015	JEH	Update status of subpoena service chart (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with process servers regarding same (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding locating additional service addresses for same (0.3); locate additional service addresses (0.9); pull filed application to employ debtor's collection agent and motion to extend exclusivity period for Shelly DeRousse (0.2); review objections regarding same (0.6); draft notice of filing and certificate of service regarding same (0.3); file same (0.3).	3.10
Aug 14, 2015	ARB	Research current address of John Ragsdale for his subpoena (0.3).	0.30
Aug 14, 2015	SAD	Review motion to extend exclusivity (0.4); draft objection to motion to extend (1.5); review motion to appoint University Management (0.4); draft objection to motion to appoint (1.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding objections (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding objections and plan (0.8); multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmans regarding objections (0.6); multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmans regarding objections and documents needed (0.8).	6.50
Aug 17, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service chart (0.2).	0.20
Aug 17, 2015	DJE	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding preparation for August 18 hearing (0.3).	0.30
Aug 17, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin, Michael Schwarzmans and Shelly DeRousse regarding site visit and access to debtor's electronic information (0.5).	0.50

Aug 17, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence to creditors' committee regarding objections (0.5); review objections and prepare for hearing (0.6); conference with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding call to discuss case (0.1); multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding CPA, collection agent and site visit (0.6); e-mail correspondence with Katy Gleason regarding hearing (0.1).	2.20
Aug 18, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with George Apostolides regarding extension of subpoena response dates for several entities (0.2); e-mail correspondence to George Apostolides regarding same (0.2); e-mail correspondence with working group regarding additional information requested from debtor (0.3).	0.70
Aug 18, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin, Robert Lange and Michael Schwarzmann regarding site visit and access to electronic information (0.8); review of electronic financing information from debtor's accountant (0.7).	1.50
Aug 18, 2015	SAD	Prepare for hearing August 18 (1.3); attend hearing (1.2); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding hearing (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding discovery (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Jason Torf regarding discovery (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding discovery (0.4).	3.70
Aug 19, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Dimitri Karcazes regarding settlement conference (0.6).	0.60

Aug 19, 2015	SAD	Conference with Jason Torf and Michael Schwarzmann regarding document production (0.5); telephone conference with Michael Schwarzmann regarding documents requested (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding documents (0.7); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding documents needed (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding meeting (0.1); e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding case status (0.3).	3.10
Aug 20, 2015	RSL	Review electronic information from debtor's accountant (0.8); multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding same (0.2).	1.00
Aug 21, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Ted Gavin regarding resolution of case (1.0); e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding same (0.1).	1.10
Aug 24, 2015	DJE	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding open case issues, including subpoenas, plan and avoidance actions (0.4).	0.40
Aug 24, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service chart (0.5); review status of subpoenas served (0.3).	0.80
Aug 24, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding open case issues (0.5); prepare for meeting with debtor and FCC (0.8); conference with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.4).	1.70
Aug 25, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service status chart (0.2).	0.20
Aug 25, 2015	RSL	Preparation for settlement conference with debtor and lender (1.8); attendance at settlement conference with Ted Gavin, Jason Brookner, Dimitri Karcazes, and Shelly DeRousse regarding debtor's proposed plan (2.0).	3.80
Aug 25, 2015	SAD	Prepare for meeting (2.0); attending settlement meeting (2.0).	4.00
Aug 25, 2015	DJE	Attend portion of meeting with working group regarding open plan and case issues (0.7).	0.70
Aug 26, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Julius Pohlenz regarding bankruptcy strategy (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding strategy (0.5).	1.00

Aug 27, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Vito Gentile regarding case strategy (0.5); conference with Richard Lauter regarding committee and strategy (0.4).	0.90
Aug 28, 2015	RSL	Conference with Devon Eggert regarding settlement proposal to FCC (1.0).	1.00
Aug 31, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service chart (0.2).	0.20
Aug 31, 2015	RSL	Conference with Devon Eggert and Shelly DeRousse regarding motion to convert (1.5).	1.50
Sep 2, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena service tracking chart (0.2).	0.20
Sep 3, 2015	JEH	Update subpoena tracking chart (0.1).	0.10
Sep 4, 2015	ELJ	Draft notice of motion and certificate of service for motion to convert (0.1); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same and filing same (0.1); draft notice of filing limited objection to retention of ASK (0.1); file motion to convert and limited objection to ASK retention (0.3).	0.60
Sep 4, 2015	DJE	Review and revise motion to convert (0.5); and objection to ASK retention (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse and Elizabeth Janczak regarding same (0.2); telephone conferences with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	1.20
Sep 4, 2015	SAD	Draft motion to convert (2.5); draft objection to retention of ASK (1.0); review operating reports (0.5).	4.00
Sep 4, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding motion to convert (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin, Dimitri Karcazes, Devon Eggert and Shelly DeRousse regarding motion to convert (0.8); conferences with Shelly DeRousse and Devon Eggert regarding motion to convert (1.0).	2.50
Sep 8, 2015	KCS	Coordinate payment of motion to convert to chapter 7 (0.2); order transcript for motion to extend deadline for exclusivity (0.2).	0.40
Sep 8, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding hearing on ASK retention motion and plan (0.4); review proposed terms with respect to same (0.2); telephone conference with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.80



Sep 8, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding ASK (0.1); research issues relating to conversion (1.8).	1.90
Sep 8, 2015	RSL	Review lender demand letters (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding same (0.1).	0.30
Sep 9, 2015	ELJ	Attend hearing on objection to ASK retention application (1.0); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1).	1.10
Sep 9, 2015	JEH	E-mail correspondence with Katie Sheldon regarding payment for hearing transcript (0.1); pay fee for same (0.1); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding review of operating reports and cash collateral orders (0.1); pull same for review (0.3).	0.60
Sep 9, 2015	KCS	E-mail and telephone call from office of Jackie DiFini court reporter regarding transcript (0.1); e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert and Jackie Hazdra regarding same (0.1).	0.20
Sep 9, 2015	SAD	Review debtor's expenditures during case (1.0).	1.00
Sep 14, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding open issues regarding plan negotiations and lender issues (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding information for same (0.1).	0.50
Sep 15, 2015	RSL	Review demand letters to guarantors (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding same (0.2).	0.60
Sep 16, 2015	RSL	Conference with Devon Eggert and Shelly DeRousse regarding financial scenarios (1.0).	1.00
Sep 17, 2015	DJE	Review and prepare for telephone conference with working group regarding plan negotiations and open case issues (0.5); attend same (0.4).	0.90
Sep 28, 2015	RSL	Conference with Ted Gavin regarding hearing on motion to convert (0.5).	0.50
Sep 29, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Richard Lauter regarding committee call and case strategy (0.5).	0.50

Sep 30, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jeremy Kleinman and Jason Brookner regarding October 1st court hearing (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner, Jeremy Kleinman, Shelly DeRousse and Devon Eggert regarding October 1st court hearing (0.8); telephone conference with Michael Schwarzmman regarding update financial analysis and review same (0.7).	2.00
Oct 1, 2015	SAD	Attendance at hearing regarding conversion (1.2); prepare for hearing (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding hearing (0.1).	1.80
Oct 2, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with A.J. LaRosa regarding case analysis (0.4); telephone conference with Julius Pohlenz regarding case analysis (0.5); telephone conference with Richard Lauter regarding negotiations with debtor concerning global case issues (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding case administration and analysis (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding conversion (0.2).	1.90
Oct 20, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse and Jason Brookner regarding October 20th court hearing (0.4).	0.40
Oct 20, 2015	SAD	Prepare for hearing (0.7); attend hearing (1.5).	2.20
Oct 21, 2015	SAD	Multiple email correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding status of committee and debtor on various issues (0.4).	0.40
Oct 27, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner (counsel for debtor) regarding subpoenas (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding October 27 hearing (0.2); attend same (0.9).	1.30
Oct 27, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding background and litigation strategy (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding October 27th court hearing (0.2).	0.90
Oct 27, 2015	SAD	Multiple email correspondence with Rich Lauter regarding documents for trustee (0.1).	0.10

Oct 29, 2015	KCS	Receive phone message from Keith Reimer (former employee) of Gulf Packaging (0.1); telephone conference and e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.1).	0.20
Oct 29, 2015	ELJ	Attend hearing on motion to abandon personal property (1.2).	1.20
Oct 29, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Keith Reimer (former employee) regarding status of case (0.2).	0.20
Oct 30, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Mark Belfore regarding possibility of recovery by unsecured creditors (0.2).	0.20
Nov 3, 2015	SAD	Review draft orders (0.5); prepare for hearing (0.6); attend hearing (1.5).	2.60
Nov 3, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding November 3rd court hearing (0.6).	0.60
Nov 6, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding November 17th hearing (0.3).	0.30
Nov 9, 2015	SAD	Review Frank Gecker fee statement (0.4).	0.40
Nov 16, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner, Dimitri Karcazes and Jeremy Kleinman regarding hearing issues (0.5).	0.50
Nov 17, 2015	ELJ	Revise notice of withdrawal of motion to convert and certificate of service for same (0.1).	0.10
Nov 17, 2015	KCS	File notice of withdrawal of motion to convert (0.1).	0.10
Nov 19, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding various issues (0.8); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding various issues and case wind up (0.7).	1.50
Nov 20, 2015	SAD	Review orders (0.2); review hearing transcript (0.7).	0.90
Dec 1, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding debtor's motion to assume lease (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Joe Myers regarding trust issues (0.4); review multiple e-mail correspondence from creditors (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Jeremy Kleinman regarding hearing (0.1).	1.40
Dec 3, 2015	DJE	Review and prepare for December 3 hearing on several matters (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding same (0.2); attend same (0.7).	1.10

Dec 3, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding hearing (0.2).	0.20
Dec 4, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding trust (0.3).	0.30
Dec 9, 2015	SAD	Prepare for hearing (0.4); telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding hearing (0.4).	0.80
Dec 10, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding hearing (0.4); attend hearing (1.2); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding preference recovery (0.4).	2.00
Dec 11, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jason Brookner and Jeremy Kleinman regarding case closure issues (0.5).	0.50
Dec 17, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding hearing (0.3).	0.30
Jan 11, 2016	SAD	Various emails to and from Jason Brookner regarding case status (0.3).	0.30
Jan 14, 2016	SAD	Prepare for and attend hearing (1.3).	1.30
Jan 20, 2016	SAD	Various emails to and from Debtor's and FCC's counsel regarding trust (0.6); compare changes in pdf and email to Dimitri Karkasas (0.5); telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding trust agreement (0.1); telephone conference with Joe Meyers regarding trust.	1.80
Jan 21, 2016	SAD	Various email correspondence regarding final trust document and signatures to/from trustee and debtor's counsel (1.0).	1.00
Jan 22, 2016	JEH	Forward creditor trust agreement to Jeremy Kleinman per Shelly DeRousse's request (0.3).	0.30
Jan 22, 2016	SAD	Telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding: filing trust document (0.4).	0.40

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	12.80	410.00	\$5,248.00
Lauter, Richard S.	18.90	655.00	\$12,379.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	58.50	480.00	\$28,080.00
Janczak, Elizabeth L.	3.80	325.00	\$1,235.00
Bartlett, Alan	0.30	295.00	\$88.50

12

February 10, 2016

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Sheldon, Kathryn C.	0.90	280.00	\$252.00
Hazdra, Jacqueline E.	10.80	225.00	\$2,430.00
TOTAL HOURS	106.00		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$49,713.00</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$49,713.00</b>

c:\bills\708836.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100184796

Re: Litigation  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0002

*Chicago*

*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$8,545.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	8,545.50
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$8,545.50</u></b>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.  
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***

Statement No: 100184796

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Litigation

Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis (0.5).	0.50
Aug 21, 2015	SAD	Analyze insider claims (2.0).	2.00
Aug 21, 2015	SAD	Review and analyze insider claims (2.5).	2.50
Aug 25, 2015	SAD	Review transfers and related documents (2.0).	2.00
Aug 26, 2015	SAD	Analysis of insiders and related claims (2.0); review affiliate agreements (0.5).	2.50
Aug 27, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding preference actions (0.3); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.50
Aug 27, 2015	SAD	Research regarding insiders (2.3).	2.30
Sep 11, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding preferences to insiders (0.2).	0.60
Sep 17, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding pursuit of preference actions (0.3).	0.30
Sep 18, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis and discuss same with Devon Eggert (0.8); email correspondence with committee regarding potential claims (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Vito Gentile regarding claims issues (0.4).	1.60
Sep 18, 2015	RSL	Review debtor's analysis of preference actions (0.5).	0.50
Sep 21, 2015	DJE	Telephone call to Jeff Caruthers (counsel for Jeff, Carol and Bill Cutshall) regarding subpoenas (0.1); telephone conference with Michele Novak (counsel for several affiliates) regarding subpoena responses (0.2).	0.30
Sep 24, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Joe Steinfeld regarding preference actions (0.2).	0.20
Sep 25, 2015	SAD	Analyze claims of the estate (1.5).	1.50

3

February 11, 2016

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	0.30	410.00	\$123.00
Lauter, Richard S.	1.50	655.00	\$982.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	15.50	480.00	\$7,440.00
TOTAL HOURS	17.30		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$8,545.50</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$8,545.50</b>

c:\bills\695666.bil



November 20, 2015

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100187705

Re: Secured Creditor Issues  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0004

*Chicago  
Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2015:

FEEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$4,547.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	4,547.50
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$4,547.50</u></b>



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.  
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**

Statement No: 100187705

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Secured Creditor Issues

Aug 5, 2015	SRI	Conference and e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding lender issues (0.1).	0.10
Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Review budget to actual report (0.4).	0.40
Aug 13, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding FCC assertion of super priority claim and second cash collateral budget (0.8); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding same (0.2); review cash collateral order (0.4); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding second cash collateral budget (0.3) review of same (0.3).	2.00
Aug 13, 2015	SAD	Conference with Richard Lauter regarding cash collateral budget (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes and debtor's counsel regarding budget (0.3).	0.60
Sep 10, 2015	RSL	Review GPI cash collateral issues (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Ted Gavin regarding GPI cash collateral issues (0.7).	1.00
Sep 15, 2015	SAD	Review administrative expenses, paid and accrued and budget (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jeremy Van Etten regarding debtor's finances (0.4).	1.40
Sep 25, 2015	RSL	Review final proposed cash collateral budget (0.3).	0.30
Sep 29, 2015	SRI	Review collateral analysis (0.2) e-mail correspondence regarding same with Richard Lauter (0.1).	0.30
Sep 30, 2015	SRI	Review and coordinate scanning of all loan documents per request of Richard Lauter (0.6).	0.60
Sep 30, 2015	RSL	Review collateral analysis (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Rob Novotny regarding document request (0.2).	0.60

3

November 20, 2015

Sep 30, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse and Shira Isenberg regarding loan documents (0.4).	0.40
Oct 2, 2015	SAD	Review proposed cash collateral budget (0.3).	0.30

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Lauter, Richard S.	4.30	655.00	\$2,816.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	2.70	480.00	\$1,296.00
Isenberg, Shira R.	1.00	435.00	\$435.00
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>	<b>8.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL FEES</b>			<b><u>\$4,547.50</u></b>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$4,547.50</b>

c:\bills\698575.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100197969

Re: Other Professional Retention  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0006

*Chicago  
Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$2,213.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	2,213.50
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$2,213.50</u></b>



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.  
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**

Statement No: 100197969

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Other Professional Retention

Aug 13, 2015	DJE	Review and revise draft objection to University Management retention (0.6); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.80
Aug 14, 2015	DJE	Review and revise objection to retention of AR collection agent (0.2).	0.20
Aug 26, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding retention of ASK (0.2).	0.20
Aug 27, 2015	SAD	Review ASK retention motion (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding ASK (0.3).	0.70
Aug 28, 2015	RSL	Review motion to retain preference counsel (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding same (0.1).	0.40
Aug 31, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin regarding application to employ ASK Financial (0.3).	0.30
Oct 20, 2015	SAD	Review Gray Reed fee statement (0.4).	0.40
Nov 19, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding ASK retention (0.4).	0.40
Dec 7, 2015	JEH	Pull application to employ ASK LLC for Richard Lauter (0.2).	0.20
Dec 7, 2015	SAD	Conference with Richard Lauter regarding recitation of ASK (0.4); telephone conference Joe Myers regarding ASK (0.4).	0.80
Dec 10, 2015	ELJ	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding ASK retention and confirmation hearing (0.2).	0.20

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	1.00	410.00	\$410.00
Lauter, Richard S.	0.90	655.00	\$589.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	2.30	480.00	\$1,104.00

3

February 11, 2016

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Janczak, Elizabeth L.	0.20	325.00	\$65.00
Hazdra, Jacqueline E.	0.20	225.00	\$45.00
TOTAL HOURS	4.60		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$2,213.50</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$2,213.50</b>

c:\bills\708839.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100198113

Re: Plan and Disclosure Statement  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0007

*Chicago  
Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$86,676.00
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	86,676.00
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$86,676.00</u></b>



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.  
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**

Statement No: 100198113

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Plan and Disclosure Statement

Aug 11, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding plan status (0.4).	0.40
Aug 12, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding plan exclusivity issues (0.2); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.6).	0.80
Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Research regarding plan issues (0.8); telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.6).	1.40
Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Review proposed plan (1.0); multiple telephone conferences with Devon Eggert regarding plan (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding same (0.2).	1.70
Aug 13, 2015	DJE	Review and substantially revise debtor's draft plan of liquidation (1.8).	1.80
Aug 13, 2015	RSL	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding status of debtor's plan (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes, Ted Gavin, Jason Brookner and Shelly DeRousse regarding debtor's plan (0.8).	1.50
Aug 13, 2015	SAD	Review proposed plan (0.3); conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (0.7) .	1.00
Aug 14, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse and Devon Eggert regarding debtor's proposed plan (0.5).	0.50
Aug 14, 2015	SAD	Review and revised proposed plan (2.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding plan (0.5).	2.90
Aug 14, 2015	DJE	Additional revisions to proposed plan of liquidation (1.6); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.5).	2.10



Aug 17, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan revisions (0.4); telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding debtor's plan and strategic options (1.0).	1.40
Aug 20, 2015	RSL	Prepare list of issues regarding plan discussion with debtor (0.5).	0.50
Aug 21, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Dimitri Karcazes regarding settlement meeting to discuss plan issues (0.8).	0.80
Aug 24, 2015	RSL	Review debtor's proposed plan (0.7); telephone conference with Julius Pohlenz regarding August 25th meeting with debtor's representative (0.3).	1.00
Aug 26, 2015	SAD	Draft proposed plan terms (1.5).	1.50
Aug 27, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding proposed plan terms (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee members regarding plan (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding plan terms (0.4).	1.60
Aug 27, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding plan (0.3).	0.30
Aug 28, 2015	RSL	Review revised chapter 11 plan (0.5).	0.50
Aug 28, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan terms (0.4).	0.40
Aug 28, 2015	DJE	Preliminary review of revised plan from Jason Brookner (0.3).	0.30
Aug 31, 2015	RSL	Review of debtor's draft disclosure statement and proposed form of trust agreement (0.7).	0.70
Sep 1, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding potential plan terms (0.5); summarize status of same (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	1.00
Sep 2, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding FCC discussions for potential plan (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee regarding same (0.2).	0.40

Sep 2, 2015	SAD	Review FCC's plan terms (1.1); conference with Devon Eggert regarding FCC plan terms (0.2); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding FCC terms (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan (0.3); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding FCC position (0.4).	2.30
Sep 2, 2015	SAD	Analyze claims to determine insider versus non-insider and potential for payout to unsecured creditors (2.7).	2.70
Sep 3, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcases (counsel for FCC), Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan issues (0.6); conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (0.1); e-mail correspondence to Michael Schwarzmann regarding status of same (0.1).	0.80
Sep 3, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan negotiations (0.5).	0.50
Sep 3, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding committee call and plan proposal (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding FCC proposal (0.6); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan terms (0.5).	1.30
Sep 3, 2015	SAD	Review debtor's draft plan and disclosure statement (1.0); draft revised plan proposal (0.5).	1.50
Sep 4, 2015	SAD	Review proposed plan terms (0.5); review plan draft (0.7); draft email to committee regarding plan (0.7).	1.90
Sep 5, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan terms (0.5).	0.50
Sep 8, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding plan terms (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter, Devon Eggert, Ted Gavin and J. Brothner regarding plan (0.8).	1.20

Sep 8, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin, Dimitri Karcazes, Jason Brookner, Shelly DeRousse and Devon Eggert regarding motion to convert and revised plan (1.0); telephone conference with Ted Gavin, Jason Brookner and Dimitri Karcazes regarding motion to convert and revised plan terms (0.6); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding plan negotiations with debtor and FCC (0.7).	2.30
Sep 9, 2015	SAD	Review plan terms from Jason Brookner (0.4).	0.40
Sep 9, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding plan negotiations (1.0); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan negotiations and post petition interest and fees (0.4); conference with Devon Eggert regarding plan and fee payments (0.5).	1.90
Sep 10, 2015	DJE	Review transcript from motion to extend exclusivity for plan filing (0.2); e-mail correspondence to Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1).	0.30
Sep 11, 2015	SAD	Prepare analysis regarding potential plan (2.0).	2.00
Sep 14, 2015	SAD	Review draft plan terms (0.5); analysis for committee review of plan terms (2.6); telephone conference with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding plan (0.6); telephone conference with Michael Schwarzmann regarding analysis of plan and liquidation (0.5).	4.20
Sep 15, 2015	SAD	Review and revise liquidation analysis (2.0); e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding liquidation analysis (0.2); telephone conferences with Michael Schwarzmann regarding analysis (1.4); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding analysis and budget variance report (0.5); conference with Devon Eggert regarding liquidation analysis (0.7).	4.80
Sep 15, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding collateral values and cash for purposes of analyzing potential plan terms (0.3).	0.30

Sep 15, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding financial analysis of plan and Chapter 7 scenarios (0.6); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding status of committee approval of plan terms (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Devon Eggert and Jeremy Van Etten regarding GPI budget numbers (1.0).	1.90
Sep 16, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.4); telephone conferences with Michael Schwarzmann regarding plan analysis (1.2); review and revise liquidation analysis (1.4); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding information from debtor and analysis (0.5).	3.50
Sep 16, 2015	DJE	Review and comment on draft plan financial analysis (0.7); conferences with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.8); attend committee call regarding same (0.6).	2.10
Sep 16, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan negotiations (0.7); review revised plan of reorganization (0.5); review financial analysis regarding plan versus Chapter 7 scenarios (0.5).	1.70
Sep 16, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Wayne Weitz regarding liquidating trustee (0.4).	0.40
Sep 17, 2015	SAD	Review plan terms (0.6); review liquidation analysis (0.8); draft email to Dimitri Karcazes and Jason Brookner regarding committee terms (1.2); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan (0.6); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan terms (0.4).	3.60
Sep 17, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner and Dimitri Karcazes regarding plan negotiations (0.5); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding revised plan terms (0.5).	1.00
Sep 17, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding liquidating trustee position (0.4).	0.40

Sep 18, 2015	DJE	Conference with Shelly DeRousee regarding open plan issues and committee requests in connection with same (0.3); prepare summary of information for response to committee request (0.4).	0.70
Sep 21, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Michale Schwarzmann regarding plan negotiations (0.4); review latest plan draft (2.5).	2.90
Sep 24, 2015	DJE	Telephone call to Dimitri Karcazes regarding status of plan negotiations (0.1).	0.10
Sep 24, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin and Jason Brookner regarding motion to convert and finalization of plan terms (0.8).	0.80
Sep 25, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding rejection by FCC of creditors' committee counter offer on plan terms (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1).	0.40
Sep 28, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with committee regarding plan negotiations (0.4); review plan terms (0.5).	0.90
Sep 30, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding status of the plan (0.2).	0.20
Sep 30, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with John Pohlenz regarding plan (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert regarding plan (0.1).	0.40
Sep 30, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding plan and conversion (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding September 30th committee meeting and plan terms (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Ted Gavin and Jason Brookner regarding plan negotiations and discussions with counsel for FCC (0.9).	2.30
Oct 2, 2015	SAD	Review plan draft (1.0).	1.00
Oct 2, 2015	RSL	Multiple email correspondence with Jason Brookner, Shelly DeRousse and Ted Gavin regarding final cash collateral budget and plan negotiation (0.6); telephone conferences with working group regarding same (0.4); multiple email correspondence with Devon Eggert and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan terms (0.7).	1.70

Oct 5, 2015	DJE	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding open plan issues (0.3).	0.30
Oct 5, 2015	SAD	Review and revise draft plan (2.1); conference with Devon Eggert regarding same (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.6); review comments of Richard Lauter to plan (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.2).	3.40
Oct 5, 2015	RSL	Revised liquidating plan (1.4); multiple email correspondence with Jason Brookner and Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.4).	1.80
Oct 6, 2015	SAD	Review plan and mark-up (2.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding plan (0.2); conference with Devon Eggert regarding changes to plan (0.7); telephone conferences with Jason Brookner regarding plan timing (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.4); telephone conference with Julius Pohlenz regarding trustee selection and plan negotiations (0.5).	4.30
Oct 6, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding proposed revisions to plan (0.2).	0.20
Oct 6, 2015	RSL	Multiple email correspondence with Jason Brookner, Ted Gavin and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan modifications (0.4); telephone conferences with working group regarding same (0.4).	0.80
Oct 6, 2015	RSL	Multiple email correspondence with Steve Victor of DSI regarding liquidating trustee engagement (0.6).	0.60
Oct 6, 2015	RSL	Telephone call with Julius Pohlenz and Shelly DeRousse regarding candidates for liquidating trustee (0.4).	0.40
Oct 7, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding plan terms (0.3).	0.30
Oct 7, 2015	SAD	Review and revise proposed plan (2.5); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding proposed plan (0.3).	2.80

Oct 7, 2015	RSL	Conference with Steve Victor regarding potential liquidating trustee engagement for DSI (1.0); telephone call with creditor's committee regarding liquidating plan (1.0).	2.00
Oct 8, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan negotiations (0.4); prepare information for trustee candidates (1.0); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding trustee (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding trustee (0.2).	2.00
Oct 8, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding potential liquidating trustee candidates (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes, Jason Brookner and Shelly DeRousse regarding plan issues (0.7); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding plan issues (0.3).	1.50
Oct 9, 2015	SAD	Conference with D. Kaltan regarding Crowe Horwath materials (0.4); research trustee candidates (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Julius Pohlenz regarding trustees (0.2); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding trustee candidates (0.4).	1.50
Oct 12, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding potential liquidating trustees (0.2).	0.20
Oct 12, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter regarding trustee selection (0.2).	0.20

Oct 12, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding liquidating trustee candidates and oversight committee (0.4); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding liquidating trustee candidates and oversight committee (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with Dave Asmann regarding liquidating trustee and case background (0.5); telephone conference with Dave Asmann regarding liquidating trustee and case background (0.5); e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding liquidating trustee candidates (0.2); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding liquidating trustee candidates (0.3).	2.20
Oct 13, 2015	DJE	Conference with Richard Lauter and Shelly DeRousse regarding liquidating trustee selection issues (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee regarding same (0.4).	0.70
Oct 13, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with David Asman regarding post confirmation trust (1.0); e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.1).	1.10



Oct 13, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Remunas Venclovas, Julius Pohlenz and Shelly DeRousse regarding liquidating trustee candidates (0.9); multiple e-mail correspondence with Fred Caruso and Steve Victor regarding liquidating trustee opportunity (0.2); telephone conference with Fred Caruso and Steve Victor regarding liquidating trustee opportunity (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with Joe Myers regarding liquidating trustee interviews (0.4); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding liquidating trustee interviews (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwartzmann regarding liquidating trustee interviews (0.3); telephone conference with Michael Schwartzmann regarding liquidating trustee interviews (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner and Dimitri Karcazes regarding liquidating plan (0.7); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding plan and liquidating trustee interviews (0.7).	4.00
Oct 14, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Fred Caruso regarding background and interviewing for liquidating trustee (0.1); telephone conference with Fred Caruso regarding background and interviewing for liquidating trustee (0.2); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding liquidating trustee candidates (0.4).	0.70
Oct 15, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann, Joe Myers and David Asmann regarding presentation materials for liquidating trustee interviews (0.6); telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding interview for liquidating trustee (1.0); telephone conference with Michael Schwarzmann regarding interviews for liquidating trustee (0.4); telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding oversight committee and liquidating trustee (0.4); telephone conference with Sandor Jacobson regarding liquidating trustee position and background on case (0.5).	2.90

Oct 19, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding retention of liquidating trustee (0.3); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding retention of liquidating trustee (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding retention of liquidating trustee (0.7).	1.40
Oct 20, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann, Joe Myers and Sandor Jacobson regarding October 21st creditors' committee meeting for trustee selection (0.7); multiple e-mail correspondence with David Asmann regarding October 21st creditors' committee meeting (0.5); telephone conference with David Asmann regarding October 21st creditors' committee meeting (0.7).	1.90
Oct 22, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding plan status and open items for same (0.3).	0.30
Oct 23, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Rob Novotny, Judy McHenry, Asami Cillo and Shelly DeRousse regarding selection of liquidating trustee (0.5).	0.50
Oct 26, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Judy McHenry, Joe Myers, Dimitri Karcazes, Shelly DeRousse, Mark Belfore regarding selection of liquidating trustee (0.8); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding retention of liquidating trustee (0.6).	1.40
Oct 26, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding trustee selection for plan (0.5).	0.50
Oct 28, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding liquidating plan (0.5); research regarding background material for liquidating trustee (1.0); multiple e-mail correspondence with Joe Myers regarding same (0.6); telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding selection of liquidating trustee and action items (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding same (0.6).	3.10

Oct 28, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Michael Schwarzmann regarding trustee selection (0.4); multiple email correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding trustee (0.1).	0.50
Oct 29, 2015	SAD	Review latest revisions to plan and disclosure statement (0.9); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding plan (0.3).	1.20
Oct 30, 2015	DJE	E-mail correspondence from Jeremy Kleinman regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (0.2).	0.20
Nov 3, 2015	RSL	Review plan and disclosure statement (1.0).	1.00
Nov 4, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding open plan issues (0.3).	0.30
Nov 4, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding disclosure statement (0.8); multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner, Dimitri Karcazes and Devon Eggert regarding plan support letter and combined hearing on plan and disclosure statement (0.4); telephone conference with Jason Brookner, Dimitri Karcazes and Devon Eggert regarding plan support letter and combined hearing on plan and disclosure statement (0.6).	1.80
Nov 12, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding plan confirmation (0.5).	0.50
Nov 16, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding open plan issues (0.2).	0.20
Nov 16, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Dimitri Karcazes and Jason Brookner regarding trustee's advisory board (0.5); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse, Dimitri Karcazes and Jason Brookner regarding trustee's advisory board (0.7).	1.20
Nov 17, 2015	ELJ	Draft creditor trust agreement (2.9).	2.90
Nov 17, 2015	SAD	Draft notice of motion to withdraw (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Devon Eggert and Elizabeth Janczak regarding notice (0.1); conference with Dimitri Karcazes, Jason Brookner and Jeremy Kleinman regarding trustee board and hearing (0.6); attend hearing (1.7).	3.00

Nov 18, 2015	ELJ	Continue drafting creditor trust agreement and compare to plan provisions (2.6).	2.60
Nov 19, 2015	ELJ	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding creditor trust agreement (0.2).	0.20
Nov 19, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Tina Hughes regarding plan trust board (0.6); e-mail correspondence with Tina Hughes regarding creditor trust (0.3); telephone conference with Andrea Gonzalez regarding creditor trust board (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence to debtor regarding creditor trust (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence to Dimitri Karcazes regarding creditor trust (0.2).	2.70
Nov 23, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding landlord issues (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding trustee board (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Tina Hughes regarding trustee board (0.3); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding call (0.3).	1.20
Nov 23, 2015	SAD	Review plan (0.7).	0.70
Nov 24, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse, Jason Brookner, Dimitri Karcazes, Devon Eggert and Ted Gavin regarding trustee's advisory board (1.0).	1.00
Nov 24, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes (counsel for lender) regarding revisions to creditor trust agreement (0.1); multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding same (0.1); review draft revisions to creditor trust agreement (0.3); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.70
Nov 24, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Dimitri Karcazes regarding trust and other issues (0.5).	0.50
Nov 25, 2015	RSL	Review plan supplement and exhibits (1.3).	1.30
Nov 25, 2015	DJE	Attend portions of telephone conference regarding revisions to creditor trust agreement (0.4); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.60

15

February 11, 2016

Nov 25, 2015	SAD	Review proposed changes to trust from lender (0.9); telephone conference with Jason Brookner and Dimitri Karcazes regarding revisions to plan and trust (1.3); multiple conferences with Devon Eggert regarding trust revisions (0.7).	2.90
Nov 30, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding objection to plan classification submitted by Mark Collins (0.2).	0.20
Dec 2, 2015	SAD	Review e-mail correspondence from Jason Brookner regarding equity changes to plan (0.4); review trust and plan (0.9).	1.30
Dec 3, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding plan revisions (0.3).	0.30
Dec 14, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding confirmation issues (0.4); telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding trust issues and administrative expenses (0.6).	1.00
Dec 15, 2015	SAD	Prepare for confirmation hearing (0.7); attend confirmation hearing (1.5); conference with Joe Myers regarding plan implementation (0.6); telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding plan confirmation (0.4).	3.20
Dec 16, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Alexander J. LaRosa regarding plan and trust (0.4).	0.40
Dec 16, 2015	DJE	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding confirmation hearing and open items for effective date of plan (0.2).	0.20
Dec 21, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding plan (0.6); e-mail correspondence with trust board (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes regarding trust engagement (0.2).	1.10
Dec 30, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding open issues for plan going effective (0.4).	0.40
Dec 30, 2015	SAD	Various email to and from Jeremy Kleinman regarding plan effective date (.5); email from Joe Myers regarding plan and trust (.3); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding plan implementation (.8); telephone conference with Devon Eggert regarding plan and trust (.4).	2.00

16

February 11, 2016

Dec 31, 2015	SAD	Telephone conference with Jeremy Kleinman regarding effective date of plan (.5); various emails to and from Jeremy Kleinman regarding plan (.4).	0.90
Jan 9, 2016	DJE	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding open issues for plan and creditor trust (0.2).	0.20
Jan 12, 2016	SAD	Telephone conference with Joe Myers and Dimitri Karcazes regarding finalizing trust agreement (0.6); review various email correspondence from J. Myers regarding trust agreement (0.4); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding trust document (0.3).	1.30
Jan 13, 2016	SAD	Review and revise trust agreement (0.5); email trust agreement to parties (0.3).	0.80
Jan 14, 2016	SAD	Draft trust agreement (0.4); various email correspondence to Debtor's counsel, Dimitri Karcazes and/or Joe Myers regarding trust agreement (0.4); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding trust (0.5).	1.30
Jan 15, 2016	SAD	Revise trust agreement (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Joe Myers and Dimitri Karcazes regarding the trust agreement and collection issues (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Dimitri Karcazes enclosing revised agreement (0.3).	1.00

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	16.20	410.00	\$6,642.00
Lauter, Richard S.	53.70	655.00	\$35,173.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	89.60	480.00	\$43,008.00
Janczak, Elizabeth L.	5.70	325.00	\$1,852.50
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>	<b>165.20</b>		
<b>TOTAL FEES</b>			<b><u>\$86,676.00</u></b>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$86,676.00</b>

17

February 11, 2016

c:\bills\708983.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100190784

Re: Committee Meeting and Governance  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0009

*Chicago*

*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$22,159.00
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	22,159.00
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$22,159.00</u></b>



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.**  
**INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**



Statement No: 100190784

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Committee Meeting and Governance

Aug 11, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding agenda for August 12 committee call (0.2); multiple e-mail correspondence with working group regarding same (0.2).	0.40
Aug 11, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with creditors' committee regarding status, sale and other issues (0.3).	0.30
Aug 12, 2015	DJE	Review and prepare for committee telephone conference (0.2); attend same (0.7).	0.90
Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee conference call (1.2); attend committee conference call (0.7); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding meeting (0.3); prepare draft agenda (0.4).	2.60
Aug 17, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with committee members regarding open case issues (0.8); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding follow-up items based upon same (0.1).	0.90
Aug 17, 2015	SAD	Attend creditors' committee meeting (0.8); e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding same (0.2).	1.00
Aug 19, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence to committee members regarding case status and meeting topics (1.0); attend committee call (0.5); e-mail correspondence with A. LaRosa regarding meeting (0.2).	1.70
Aug 26, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.6); attend committee call (1.0).	1.60
Sep 3, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding plan negotiations (0.8); review and prepare for same (0.2).	1.00
Sep 3, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee meeting (0.7); attend committee meeting (0.8).	1.50
Sep 9, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.6); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding call (0.4); attend committee call (0.8).	1.80

Sep 16, 2015	SAD	Attendance at committee telephonic meeting (1.1); prepare for committee call (0.9); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding analysis (0.3); e-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding committee call and strategy (0.2).	2.50
Sep 16, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding financial scenarios (1.1).	1.10
Sep 22, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Richard Lauter and Devon Eggert regarding committee call (0.2).	0.20
Sep 23, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding meeting and status of plan discussions (0.2).	0.20
Sep 29, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (1.1); attend committee call (1.0).	2.10
Sep 30, 2015	DJE	Telephone conferences with Shelly DeRousse regarding September 30 committee call (0.5); telephone conference with Richard Lauter regarding same (0.1); review and prepare for same (0.2); attend same (1.0).	1.80
Sep 30, 2015	JEH	Multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone conference with Susan Anderson regarding committee telephonic conference scheduled for September 30, 2015 (0.3).	0.30
Sep 30, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.6); attend committee call (1.0); telephone conference with Devon Eggert to prepare for committee call (0.5).	2.10
Oct 2, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.9); attend committee call (1.0).	1.90
Oct 2, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding open plan issues and committee call (0.3).	0.30
Oct 2, 2015	RSL	Telephone call with creditor committee (1.0); preparation for October 2 meeting of creditor's committee (0.8).	1.80
Oct 7, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.6); attendance at committee call (0.8).	1.40

Oct 13, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with committee regarding meeting time and trustee selection (0.3); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding meeting (0.4).	0.70
Oct 14, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding committee meeting (0.2).	0.20
Oct 15, 2015	DJE	Telephone conference with committee regarding trustee selection issues (0.5).	0.50
Oct 15, 2015	SAD	Attendance at committee telephone conference regarding trustee selection (0.5); prepare for same (0.4).	0.90
Oct 21, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with creditors' committee members regarding October 21st meeting on selection of liquidating trustee (0.8); telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding interviews with liquidating trustee candidates (1.5).	2.30
Oct 21, 2015	SAD	Prepare for committee call (0.5); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding same (0.2); email to committee regarding same (0.4); attend committee call (1.5) email to Rich Lauter regarding same (0.2).	2.80
Oct 23, 2015	SAD	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding vote on trustee (0.5); multiple email correspondence with Michael Schwartzmann regarding same (0.4).	0.90
Oct 28, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding October 28th creditors' committee meeting for trustee selection (0.7).	0.70
Oct 28, 2015	SAD	Email correspondence to committee regarding trustee selection, sale procedures and committee meeting (0.5); telephone conference with Joe Myers regarding committee call (0.2).	0.70
Nov 11, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with committee regarding weekly meeting (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding weekly meeting (0.1).	0.30
Nov 19, 2015	SAD	E-mail correspondence with committee regarding plan and next meeting (0.4); review e-mail correspondence from committee members (0.4).	0.80

5

February 11, 2016

Nov 24, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with creditors' committee regarding liquidating plan (1.2).	1.20
Nov 24, 2015	SAD	Review plan and disclosure statement in preparation of committee call (1.8); attend committee call (0.9).	2.70

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	5.00	410.00	\$2,050.00
Lauter, Richard S.	8.10	655.00	\$5,305.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	30.70	480.00	\$14,736.00
Hazdra, Jacqueline E.	0.30	225.00	\$67.50
TOTAL HOURS	44.10		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$22,159.00</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$22,159.00</b>

c:\bills\701654.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100187710

Re: Asset Sales  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0011

*Chicago*  
*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$3,579.00
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	3,579.00
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$3,579.00</u></b>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.***  
***INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***

Statement No: 100187710

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Asset Sales

Aug 4, 2015	DJE	Review proposed notice of various de minimis asset sales (0.2); e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding same (0.4).	0.90
Aug 11, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee working group regarding proposed asset sales (0.2).	0.20
Aug 13, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with committee regarding proposed inventory sale (0.2).	0.20
Sep 17, 2015	SAD	Review two sale notices (0.5); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding sale notices (0.2).	0.70
Sep 17, 2015	RSL	Review notices of Multifab and Caliber asset sales (0.3).	0.30
Sep 25, 2015	SAD	Review notice of asset sale (0.4); e-mail correspondence with committee regarding asset sale notice (0.2).	0.60
Oct 14, 2015	SAD	Review weekly sales report (0.3).	0.30
Oct 19, 2015	DJE	E-mail correspondence with committee working group regarding proposed changes to sale procedures order (0.6).	0.60
Oct 19, 2015	SAD	Review asset sale proposed terms (0.4); email correspondence to committee regarding asset sale (0.4); email correspondence to Michael Schwarzmann regarding asset sale (0.3).	1.10
Oct 20, 2015	SAD	Review asset reports (0.5).	0.50
Oct 22, 2015	RSL	Telephone conference with Jason Brookner regarding modification of inventory sales procedures (0.5).	0.50

February 11, 2016

Oct 27, 2015	DJE	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding motion to amend de minimis asset sale procedures (0.2); review draft of same (0.1); telephone conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.1).	0.40
Oct 27, 2015	SAD	Multiple email correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding asset sale procedures (0.2).	0.20
Oct 28, 2015	SAD	Review proposed sale procedures (0.5); multiple e-mail correspondence with committee members regarding sale process (0.5).	1.00

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	2.30	410.00	\$943.00
Lauter, Richard S.	0.80	655.00	\$524.00
DeRousse, Shelly A.	4.40	480.00	\$2,112.00
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>	<b>7.50</b>		
<b>TOTAL FEES</b>			<b><u>\$3,579.00</u></b>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$3,579.00</b>

c:\bills\698580.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100183001

Re: Schedule and Reports  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0012

*Chicago*

*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$519.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	519.50
BALANCE DUE	<u><b>\$519.50</b></u>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.  
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***



February 11, 2016

Statement No: 100183001

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Schedule and Reports

Aug 11, 2015	SAD	Rview Fred Cross weekly report for Week 10 (0.4).	0.40
Aug 18, 2015	RSL	Review GPI weekly reports (0.2).	0.20
Aug 24, 2015	RSL	Review GPI weekly reports (0.3).	0.30

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEEES</u>
Lauter, Richard S.	0.50	655.00	\$327.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	0.40	480.00	\$192.00
TOTAL HOURS	0.90		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$519.50</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$519.50</b>

c:\bills\693871.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100197972

Re: Claim Analysis  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0013

*Chicago*  
*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$1,043.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	1,043.50
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$1,043.50</u></b>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.***  
***INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***

2

February 11, 2016

Statement No: 100197972

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Claim Analysis

Dec 2, 2015	SAD	Review debtor's objection to priority claims (0.5); review multiple e-mail correspondence to claims objections (0.5).	1.00
Dec 8, 2015	ELJ	Conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding potential claims against insiders and other transferees (0.7).	0.70
Dec 8, 2015	SAD	Conference with Elizabeth Janczak regarding claims analysis (0.7).	0.70

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
DeRousse, Shelly A.	1.70	480.00	\$816.00
Janczak, Elizabeth L.	0.70	325.00	\$227.50
TOTAL HOURS	2.40		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$1,043.50</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$1,043.50</b>

c:\bills\708842.bil

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100198115

Re: Expenses  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0015

*Chicago*  
*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$0.00
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>4,882.73</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	4,882.73
BALANCE DUE	<u><b>\$4,882.73</b></u>



***PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.***  
***INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS***

February 11, 2016

Statement No: 100198115

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Expenses

**DISBURSEMENTS**

Jul 1, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9863658	38.55
Jul 9, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9821571	27.95
Jul 15, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9829799	30.50
Jul 22, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9840291	38.90
Jul 29, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9869042	29.00
Aug 10, 2015	DJE	Other Outside Services VENDOR: Denver Attorney Services, LLC INVOICE#: DVA2015006638 DATE: 8/10/2015 08/07/15 Service of Process of subpoena 050004990650	130.54
Aug 12, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9875442	37.15
Aug 13, 2015	DJE	Other Outside Services VENDOR: LaSalle Process Servers INVOICE#: 53165 DATE: 8/13/2015 08/13/15 Service of process of six subpoenas 050004941938	1,200.00
Aug 15, 2015	DJE	Other Outside Services VENDOR: Special Delivery Service, Inc. INVOICE#: 484975 DATE: 8/15/2015 08/10/15 Service of Process Fees 050005012323	974.75
Aug 17, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9881496	27.90

3

February 11, 2016

Aug 17, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9881775	4.85
Aug 19, 2015	DJE	Other Outside Services VENDOR: AGLS Process Serving & Court Services INVOICE#: 152001FRPEIL DATE: 8/19/2015	138.00
Aug 19, 2015	DJE	08/11/15 Service of Process fees 050005012398 Other Outside Services VENDOR: Barefoot Professional Investigations INVOICE#: 1002 DATE: 8/19/2015	472.70
Aug 19, 2015	SAD	08/12/15 - 08/16/15 Service of process on John Ragsdale 050005012364 Telephone	5.65
Aug 20, 2015	JEH	Conference call 9884404 Other Outside Services VENDOR: LaSalle Process Servers INVOICE#: 53196 DATE: 8/20/2015	256.50
Aug 22, 2015	DJE	08/17/15 Service of Process of Subpoena 050004990224 Other Outside Services VENDOR: Special Delivery Service, Inc. INVOICE#: 485488 DATE: 8/22/2015	589.50
Aug 26, 2015	RSL	08/12/15 Service of Process Fees 050005023018 Telephone	10.80
Aug 26, 2015	RSL	Conference call 9896859 Telephone	34.90
Aug 29, 2015	DJE	Conference call 9896860 Other Outside Services VENDOR: Special Delivery Service, Inc. INVOICE#: 486001 DATE: 8/29/2015	285.00
Sep 3, 2015	JCW	08/21/15 Service of Process service 050005090764 Subpoena fee VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT09/03/15; DATE: 9/3/2015	130.54
Sep 16, 2015	RSL	08/11 Subpoena Service Telephone	31.40
Sep 23, 2015	RSL	Conference call 9927459 Telephone Conference call 9938394	2.95

4

February 11, 2016

Sep 29, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9945572	27.55
Sep 30, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9949071	24.90
Oct 2, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9953397	25.55
Oct 7, 2015	JCW	Court Reporter's Fee - Transcript Copy VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT10/07/15; DATE: 10/7/2015 09/09 Transcript Fee	157.00
Oct 7, 2015	JCW	Filing Fee VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT10/07/15; DATE: 10/7/2015 09/08 Filing Fee for Motion to Convert in the Gulf Packaging case	15.00
Oct 7, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9959841	1.95
Oct 7, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9959842	24.25
Oct 15, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9972602	13.60
Oct 21, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9980996	47.60
Oct 28, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 9991962	7.25
Nov 4, 2015	RSL	Telephone Conference call 10002976	3.60
Jan 21, 2016	JCW	Other Fees VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT01/21/16; DATE: 1/21/2016 12/31 NJ corporate status report for Gulf Packaging	6.25
Jan 21, 2016	JCW	Other Fees VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT01/21/16; DATE: 1/21/2016 12/31 NJ corporate status report for Gulf Packaging	6.25

5

February 11, 2016

Jan 21, 2016	JCW	Other Fees VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT01/21/16; DATE: 1/21/2016 12/29 NJ corporate status report for Gulf Packaging	18.75
Jan 21, 2016	JCW	Other Fees VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: STMT01/21/16; DATE: 1/21/2016 12/29 OK corporate status report for Gulf Packaging	5.20

**DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY**

Telephone	496.75
Subpoena fee	130.54
Other Fees	36.45
Filing Fee	15.00
Court Reporter's Fee - Transcript Copy	157.00
Other Outside Services	4,046.99
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	<u>\$4,882.73</u>

**TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS** **\$4,882.73**

c:\bills\708985.bil