

February 11, 2016

FEIN #36-3238755

Gulf Packaging Creditors Committee  
(needs to be provided)

,

*Attorneys at Law*

311 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3000  
Chicago, Illinois 60606-6677  
Tel 312.360.6000

Statement No. 100184796

Re: Litigation  
Client Matter ID No. 30501-0002

*Chicago*

*Springfield*

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED  
THROUGH JANUARY 22, 2016:

FEEES FOR THIS STATEMENT	\$8,545.50
DISBURSEMENTS	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CURRENT STATEMENT	8,545.50
BALANCE DUE	<b><u>\$8,545.50</u></b>



**PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.**  
**INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE ADDED AFTER 30 DAYS**

Statement No: 100184796

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: Litigation

Aug 12, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis (0.5).	0.50
Aug 21, 2015	SAD	Analyze insider claims (2.0).	2.00
Aug 21, 2015	SAD	Review and analyze insider claims (2.5).	2.50
Aug 25, 2015	SAD	Review transfers and related documents (2.0).	2.00
Aug 26, 2015	SAD	Analysis of insiders and related claims (2.0); review affiliate agreements (0.5).	2.50
Aug 27, 2015	RSL	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Shelly DeRousse regarding preference actions (0.3); conference with Shelly DeRousse regarding same (0.2).	0.50
Aug 27, 2015	SAD	Research regarding insiders (2.3).	2.30
Sep 11, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis (0.4); e-mail correspondence with Michael Schwarzmann regarding preferences to insiders (0.2).	0.60
Sep 17, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Jason Brookner regarding pursuit of preference actions (0.3).	0.30
Sep 18, 2015	SAD	Review preference analysis and discuss same with Devon Eggert (0.8); email correspondence with committee regarding potential claims (0.4); multiple e-mail correspondence with Vito Gentile regarding claims issues (0.4).	1.60
Sep 18, 2015	RSL	Review debtor's analysis of preference actions (0.5).	0.50
Sep 21, 2015	DJE	Telephone call to Jeff Caruthers (counsel for Jeff, Carol and Bill Cutshall) regarding subpoenas (0.1); telephone conference with Michele Novak (counsel for several affiliates) regarding subpoena responses (0.2).	0.30
Sep 24, 2015	RSL	E-mail correspondence with Joe Steinfeld regarding preference actions (0.2).	0.20
Sep 25, 2015	SAD	Analyze claims of the estate (1.5).	1.50

February 11, 2016

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Eggert, Devon J.	0.30	410.00	\$123.00
Lauter, Richard S.	1.50	655.00	\$982.50
DeRousse, Shelly A.	15.50	480.00	\$7,440.00
TOTAL HOURS	17.30		
TOTAL FEES			<u>\$8,545.50</u>
<b>TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS</b>			<b>\$8,545.50</b>

c:\bills\695666.bil