

Date	Description	Hrs	Amount
10/15/2018	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ALABAMA TAX EXPERT GARY BOYD AND TITLE COMPANY; EMAIL AND TELEPHONE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SCOPE OF SERVICE AND INVOICING AND CURRENT MISSING INFORMATION	2.8	\$700.00
10/15/2018	REVIEW MASTER CREDITOR SPREADSHEET AND TAX CERTIFICATE DOCUMENTS FOR INCOMPLETE TAX INFORMATION FROM ALABAMA AND DISTINGUISH MUNICIPALITY OWNED CERTIFICATES FROM INVESTOR OWNED FOR GARY BOYD	2.0	\$500.00
10/15/2018	REVIEW LETTER FROM TITLE COMPANY FROM NOTICING SERVICE	0.2	\$50.00
10/15/2018	REVIEW NEW BID INFORMATION AND REQUEST CONFIRMATION OF BIDDING DEPOSIT FROM TITLE COMPANY	0.5	\$125.00
10/15/2018	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BIDDER; REVIEW PROOF OF FUNDS FROM BIDDER AND REVIEW CONTRACT; CIRCULATE THE SAME TO INVOLVED PARTIES	1.1	\$275.00
10/15/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH RS LENDING ATTORNEY REGARDING BIDS	0.3	\$75.00
10/15/2018	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DON FITZGERALD REGARDING CONTRACT REFERENCE TO BANKRUPTCY CODE; REVIEW CONTRACT; CONFERENCE WITH FRANK WOLFF REGARDING THE SAME	0.5	\$125.00
10/15/2018	SUBMIT BID TO TITLE COMPANY AND REQUEST INPUT FROM UNDERWRITER ON ORDER APPROVING SALE; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE SAME	0.3	\$75.00
10/16/2018	REVIEW NEW FILING OF FORECLOSURE IN WISCONSIN FROM INFORMATION RECEIVED BY BCHH; REVIEW NOTICING MATRIX TO CONFIRM PARTY WAS NOTICED OF BANKRUPTCY; FORWARD TO ATTORNEY FRANK WOLF REQUESTING NOTICE OF BANKRUPTCY TO BE SENT	0.8	\$200.00
10/16/2018	REVIEW WEBSITE VIEWERS REPORT SUBMITTED BY VENDOR BMC	0.2	\$50.00
10/16/2018	REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATED MASTER SPREADSHEET OF CREDITORS AND CALCULATIONS OF PAYOUT OF SALE PROCEEDS AT CURRENT BID AMOUNTS; PROVIDE ESTIMATE FOR CREDITOR RS LENDING OF AMOUNT OF PAYOUT ANTICIPATED AT CURRENT SALE PRICE	3.6	\$900.00
10/16/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH MILWAUKEE CLERK REGARDING 2854 N 28TH STREET PROPERTY; REQUEST SCAN OF DEED FROM TITLE COMPANY	0.2	\$50.00
10/17/2018	REVIEW PROPERTIES TITLE ABSTRACTS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY ANDREW BLACK REGARDING INGKSTER ILLINOIS PROPERTIES QUIET TITLE ACTIONS	0.5	\$125.00
10/17/2018	ARRANGE FOR RETURN OF DEEDS FOR COMPLETE SIGNING FROM TITLE COMPANY BCHH	0.3	\$75.00
10/18/2018	REVIEW RETURNED MAIL LIST PROVIDED BY VENDOR BMC GROUP	0.1	\$25.00
10/18/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PRIOR OWNER KAJA HOLDINGS REGARDING PROPERTY 1106 PAUL FREDRICKS ST LOUISIANA; REVIEW TITLE AND SUBMIT INFORMATION ON RELEASE OF PROPERTY TO KAJA	0.4	\$100.00
10/18/2018	REVIEW PROPOSED SALE ORDER DRAFTED BY FRANK WOLFF	1.0	\$250.00
10/18/2018	FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH KAJA HOLDINGS REGARDING 1106 PAUL FREDRICKS PROPERTY	0.2	\$50.00
10/18/2018	DRAFT FEE APPLICATION FOR SUBMITTAL TO COURT FOR APPROVAL	1.6	\$400.00
10/18/2018	DRAFT EXHIBIT FOR FEE APPLICATION WITH SUM OF ALL BILLABLE ITEMS	0.6	\$150.00
10/19/2018	REVISE FEE APPLICATION FOR SUBMITTAL	0.2	\$50.00
10/19/2018	UPDATE AND REVISE MASTER CREDITOR SPREADSHEET FOR CALCULATION OF PAYMENTS TO CREDITORS AT CURRENT AND POTENTIAL BID AMOUNTS	2.1	\$525.00
10/19/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH BROKER REGARDING BIDDERS	0.3	\$75.00
10/19/2018	CONTACT ORIGINAL PARTIES SHOWING INTEREST IN THE PORTFOLIO; PROVIDE AUCTION INFORMATION AND WEBSITE AND INVITE TO SUBMIT BIDS	3.3	\$825.00
10/22/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TITLE COMPANY AND GARY BOYD REGARDING ALABAMA TAX INFORMATION	0.6	\$150.00
10/22/2018	FURTHER CORRESPONDENCE WITH GARY BOYD AND BCHH REGARDING TAX CERTIFICATES	0.5	\$125.00
10/22/2018	ASSEMBLE INFORMATION FOR NOTICES OF ABANDONMENT; COMPARE ORIGINAL PURCHASE CONTRACT TO RS LENDING PROPERTY LIST AND CURRENT AUCTION PROPERTY LIST	1.4	\$350.00
10/22/2018	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM BIDDER TO BROKER AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH BROKER REGARDING THE SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BIDDER	1.9	\$475.00
10/22/2018	REVIEW PROOF OF FUNDS INFORMATION FROM BIDDER; CONDUCT DUE DILIGENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH FRANK WOLFF REGARDING NECESSARY INFORMATION FOR PROOF OF FUNDS	1.6	\$400.00
10/22/2018	REVIEW FEE APPLICATION SUBMITTED BY BCHH	0.6	\$150.00
10/22/2018	REVISE FEE APPLICATION	0.2	\$50.00
10/23/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH BROKER, RS LENDING ATTORNEY AND FRANK WOLFF REGARDING NEW BID AND PROOF OF FUNDS ISSUES	0.8	\$200.00
10/23/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH TITLE COMPANY BCHH REGARDING ERRORS IN FEE APPLICATION AND REQUESTING REVISIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING THE SAME	0.8	\$200.00
10/23/2018	REVIEW FEE APPLICATION FOR VENDOR BMC GROUP	0.4	\$100.00
10/23/2018	REVIEW COURT APPROVED AGREEMENT FOR TITLE COMPANY BCHH AND COMPARE TO FEE APPLICATION DRAFT	0.4	\$100.00

Date	Description	Hrs	Amount
10/23/2018	FOLLOW UP WITH TITLE COMPANY CLARIFYING INFORMATION FROM CONFERENCE CALL AND REDUCTION IN AMOUNT INCLUDED IN FEE APPLICATION	0.3	\$75.00
10/23/2018	REVIEW REVISED FEE APPLICATION FROM BCHH	0.2	\$50.00
10/23/2018	REVIEW QUESTION FROM TITLE COMPANY REGARDING ALABAMA TAX INFORMATION AND NEED FOR ADDITIONAL SIGNATURES TO OBTAIN	0.3	\$75.00
10/24/2018	REVIEW UPDATED ALABAMA TAX INFORMATION	0.2	\$50.00
10/24/2018	REVIEW COMMENTS AND REVISIONS FROM RS LENDING ATTORNEY CHRIS THOMPSON ON FINAL SALE ORDER AND RELATED CASELAW	1.1	\$275.00
10/24/2018	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 1312 PRINCETON AV ALABAMA PROPERTY AND TAX INFORMATION FROM VENDOR GARY BOYD	0.2	\$50.00
10/25/2018	SUBMIT NECESSARY BANKRUPTCY CASE INFORMATION TO VENDOR GARY BOYD	0.2	\$50.00
10/25/2018	DETAIL BILLING ESTIMATE OF TITLE COMPANY BCHH AND COMPARE TO NUMBERS SUBMITTED	2.4	\$600.00
10/26/2018	FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH BIDDER REQUESTING CONTRACT IN WORD FORMAT	0.2	\$50.00
10/26/2018	REVIEW ORIGINAL PROPOSAL FROM BROKER TODD WOHL AND ESTIMATE COMMISSION AND SALE MARKETING EXPENSES FOR CALCULATION OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES; UPDATE SPREADSHEET AND REVISE PAYOFF ESTIMATES	2.0	\$500.00
10/29/2018	REVIEW AND REVISED DEBTORS SALES MEMORANDUM; RESEARCH AND SUPPLEMENT WITH ADDITIONAL INFORMATION	2.1	\$525.00
10/29/2018	CONTACT POTENTIAL BIDDER REFERRED FROM TITLE COMPANY BCHH; FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH BIDDER	0.6	\$150.00
10/30/2018	PROVIDE DETAILED BREAKDOWN OF HOW TO SUBMIT A BINDING BID TO BIDDER AND EXPLAIN PARTIES AND OBLIGATIONS OF BIDDERS	1.0	\$250.00
10/30/2018	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CHRIS HOLDEN AND RESEARCH NEW FORECLOSURE ACTION FOR MICHIGAN PROPERTY	0.2	\$50.00
10/30/2018	REVIEW WEEKLY MAILING ACTIVITY REPORT FROM VENDOR BMC GROUP	0.1	\$25.00
10/30/2018	SUBMIT INFORMATION ON AUCTION TO POTENTIAL BUYER	0.2	\$50.00
10/30/2018	REVIEW REVISED LIEN AMOUNT INFORMATION FROM TITLE COMPANY BCHH AND COMPARE TO EXISTING SPREADSHEET; ANALYZE FOR CHANGES IN PAYOUT TO RS LENDING	1.7	\$425.00
10/30/2018	FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH BIDDER REGARDING NECESSARY DEPOSITS	0.2	\$50.00
10/30/2018	REVIEW EIGHT NOTICES RELATED TO QUIET TITLE ACTIONS FORWARDED BY RS LENDING ATTORNEY DON FITZGERALD; RESEARCH PROPERTY STATUSES AND ACTION NEEDED; ADVISE RS LENDING ON SUGGESTED ACTION	3.2	\$800.00
10/31/2018	PROVIDE AUCTION UPDATED TO TITLE COMPANY BCHH	0.3	\$75.00
10/31/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH BIDDER AND FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH BROKER AND RS LENDING ATTORNEY	0.5	\$125.00
10/31/2018	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DON FITZGERALD REGARDING SURPLUS FUNDS AND CALCULATIONS FOR PAYOFFS OF LIENS; PREPARATION FOR THE SAME	2.2	\$550.00
11/1/2018	FOLLOW UP WITH BIDDER THROUGH BCHH AND PROVIDE DETAILED BIDDING INFORMATION	0.5	\$125.00
11/1/2018	REVIEW MEMORANDUM OF LAW DRAFT	0.3	\$75.00
11/1/2018	REVISED UPDATED SPREADSHEET WITH ADDITIONAL TAX INFORMATION PROVIDED BY BCHH; UPDATE LIEN PAYMENT CALCULATIONS	1.9	\$475.00
11/1/2018	REVIEW WEBSITE ACTIVITY REPORT	0.2	\$50.00
11/1/2018	PROVIDE INFORMATION ON REVISED LIEN CALCULATIONS AND POTENTIAL PAYOFF AMOUNTS AT VARIOUS BID LEVELS TO RS LENDING ATTORNEYS DON FITZGERALD AND CHRIS THOMPSON	0.3	\$75.00
11/2/2018	CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY WORKING WITH FORMER OWNER KAJA HOLDINGS REGARDING TRUST INFORMATION AND SIGNATURES FOR ABANDONED PROEPRTY	0.8	\$200.00
11/2/2018	CALCULATE NECESSARY BIDS TO NET POSITIVE FUNDS TO RS LENDING AND EFFECT OF EACH AMOUNT OF INCREASED BID PRICE ON RS PAYMENT	2.1	\$525.00
11/2/2018	PROVIDE DETAIL OF NECESSARY FUNDING METHODS TO MAKE AUCTIONS SUCCESSFUL AT CURRENT HIGH BIDS; ANALYSIS OF THE SAME	1.0	\$250.00
11/5/2018	LOCATE AND PROVIDE COPY OF ORDER REGARDING RELEASE OF 1106 PAUL FREDRICK STREET PROPERTY TO THIRD PARTY THROUGH KAJA HOLDINGS	0.3	\$75.00
11/5/2018	DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR MODIFICATION OF 363 SALE ORDER TO ALLOW REDIRECTION OF FUNDS TO COVER PROPERTY TAX SHORTFALLS	2.0	\$500.00
11/5/2018	REVIEW SUPPLIMENTAL FEE APPLICATION FROM VENDOR BMC GROUP	0.3	\$75.00
11/5/2018	CONFIRM AND REVIEW RECEIPT OF BID DEPOSIT	0.3	\$75.00
11/5/2018	CIRCULATE NEW BID INFORMATION	0.3	\$75.00
11/6/2018	REVIEW WEEKLY WEBSITE UPDATE FROM BMC GOUP	0.1	\$25.00
11/6/2018	REVIEW EXPENSES SUBMITTED BY BROKER TODD WOHL AND COMPARE TO CONTRACT	0.5	\$125.00
11/6/2018	REVISE AND SUBMIT REDLIEN OF SALES MEMORANDUM	1.9	\$475.00
11/6/2018	CONFERENCE WITH FRANK WOLFF REGARDING REVISING 363 ORDER FOR DISTRIBUTION OF SALE PROCEEDS	0.3	\$75.00

Date	Description	Hrs	Amount
11/7/2018	REVIEW AND REVISE LANGUAGE FOR MODIFYING DISTRIBUTION TO RS LENDING	0.9	\$225.00
11/7/2018	REVISE UPDATED SPREADSHEET OF LIENS AND PAYOUTS WITH UPDATED TAX INFORMATION; ANALYZE UNDER CURRENT BID	0.8	\$200.00
11/7/2018	REVIEW DRAFT FORM DECLARATION OF SUCCESSFUL BIDDER FROM RS LENDING ATTORNEY DON FITZGERALD	0.2	\$50.00
11/7/2018	REVIEW REVISED FINAL SALE ORDER FROM ATTORNEY FRANK WOLFF	0.2	\$50.00
11/7/2018	CONFERENCE WITH BROKER ON FINAL BIDS; COORDINATE THE SAME	1.4	\$350.00
11/7/2018	REVIEW REVISIONS FROM DON FITZGERALD TO SALE ORDER	0.2	\$50.00
11/8/2018	COORDINATE AND SOLICIT FINAL BIDS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH BIDDERS AND INVOLVED PARTIES; REVIEW AND SUBMIT FINAL BID INFORMATION	4.8	\$1,200.00
11/9/2018	DRAFT AND EDIT EXHIBITS FOR FINAL SALE ORDER; REVIEW 363 ORDER AND CONFORM DEFINITIONS AND CALCULATION METHODS; CONFERENCE WITH FRANK WOLFF AND PARALEGAL REGARDING THE SAME	1.8	\$450.00
11/9/2018	REVISE MASTER SPREADSHEET WITH UPDATED CALCULATIONS CONTAINING CURRENT HIGHEST BID PRICE AND CALCULATE ESTIMATE OF PROCEEDS TO RS LENDING AND SUBMIT THE SAME TO DON FITZGERALD	2.1	\$525.00
11/9/2018	REVIEW AND REVISED BUYERS DECLARATION	0.4	\$100.00
11/9/2018	CONFORM DEFINITIONS IN FINAL SALE ORDER	0.3	\$75.00
11/9/2018	UPDATE PARALEGAL FOR FRANK WOLFF OF NEEDED INFORMATION IN EXHIBIT TO FINAL SALE ORDER AND TERMS TO REFERENCE	0.6	\$150.00
11/9/2018	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM US TRUSTEE REGARDING FINAL SALE ORDER AND ANALYZE FOR ISSUES INTERFERING WITH SALE; CONFERENCE WITH FRANK WOLFF REGARDING PROBLEM WITH POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO SALE	1.2	\$300.00
11/9/2018	RESEARCH TOTAL WEBSITE TRAFFIC FOR EVIDENCE PROFFER ON MARKETING	0.8	\$200.00
	<b>TOTAL FOR EDWARD J FORE</b>	<b>80.5</b>	<b>\$20,125.00</b>