EXHIBIT A

Fees

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6699

Writer's E-Mail mnestor@ycst.com

Jagged Peak, Inc. 3000 Bayport Drive, Suite 250 Tampa, FL 33607 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: November 19, 2019 50010327 100150.1001

Invoice through October 31, 2019

Re: Board of Directors Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$	42,505.50
Disbursements	\$ <u></u>	45.30
Total Due This Invoice	\$	42,550.80

Jagged Peak, Inc.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: November 19, 2019 50010327 100150.1001

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	Description	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
09/16/19	JHUGH	Review notice of bankruptcy filing	0.10	97.50
09/16/19	JHUGH	Coordinate revising and finalizing minutes	0.20	195.00
09/17/19	JHUGH	Further follow up emails on board minutes	0.20	195.00
09/17/19	JHUGH	Review memo from V. Hamm re: draft of 9/15 minutes; review minutes of 9/16 meeting; revise minutes and forward to V. Hamm; follow up emails	0.70	682.50
09/17/19	JHUGH	Emails re: board meeting	0.10	97.50
09/18/19	JHUGH	Emails re: comments to minutes from R. Lai and follow up emails	0.20	195.00
09/18/19	JHUGH	Memo from V. Hamm re: minutes and review same	0.30	292.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Emails with M. Nestor re: board call	0.10	97.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Emails with VHAMM re: board minutes	0.10	97.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Review memo from director re: status of sale process	0.10	97.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Emails with counsel re: status and minutes	0.10	97.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Review agenda for meeting and emails re: call	0.10	97.50
09/19/19	JHUGH	Participate in board of directors meeting	0.90	877.50
09/20/19	JHUGH	Make additional changes to Board minutes per comments from R. Lai	0.50	487.50
09/20/19	JHUGH	Work with R. Hart in further revising board minutes	0.60	585.00
09/20/19	RHART	Updates to board meeting minutes; conference and emails with J. Hughes re: same	0.50	170.00
09/21/19	RHART	Emails re: finalized version of minutes	0.10	34.00
09/21/19	JHUGH	Review and revise minutes of board meetings and multiple emails with V. Hamm forwarding same	0.50	487.50
09/23/19	JHUGH	Memo from R. Lai re: minutes	0.10	97.50
09/23/19	JHUGH	Forward memo and analysis to N. Rubin	0.30	292.50
09/23/19	JHUGH	Multiple follow up emails re: minutes and handling revisions	0.30	292.50
09/23/19	JHUGH	Telephone conference with N. Rubin re: minutes	0.20	195.00
09/23/19	JHUGH	Emails and telephone conference with V. Hamm re: minutes	0.20	195.00
09/23/19	JHUGH	Review corrected minutes per V. Hamm	0.20	195.00
09/23/19	JHUGH	Conference with R. Hart re: minutes and emails re: same	0.20	195.00
09/23/19	RHART	Emails re: meeting minutes; conference with J. Hughes re: same	0.30	102.00
09/24/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with board re: status of minutes and special committee	0.40	390.00
09/26/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: status of bankruptcy hearing	0.10	97.50
09/26/19	RHART	Emails re: meeting minutes with J. Hughes, M. Nestor; conference with J. Hughes	0.30	102.00

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 4 of 12

Date	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
09/26/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with Board and YCST team re: revisions to minutes	0.40	390.00
09/26/19	JHUGH	Telephone conference with counsel re: revisions to minutes	0.30	292.50
10/02/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: next board meeting	0.30	292.50
10/02/19	JHUGH	Emails and conference with committee counsel re: status of meetings, next steps	0.40	390.00
10/02/19	JHUGH	Follow up emails re: status of board/special committee	0.30	292.50
10/03/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: next board meeting; emails with YCST team	0.30	292.50
10/04/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: board meeting, next steps	0.30	292.50
10/05/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: board meetings	0.10	97.50
10/06/19	JHUGH	Emails with board members re: status	0.20	195.00
10/07/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with R. Hart re: minutes, next meeting	0.30	292.50
10/07/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails from board members re: meetings	0.20	195.00
10/07/19	JHUGH	Work with R. Hart on further revising board minutes; follow up conferences and emails	1.10	1,072.50
10/07/19	JHUGH	Forward newest drafts of minutes to working group with memo	0.30	292.50
10/07/19	RHART	Updates to meeting minutes and various emails re: same; conference with J. Hughes re: status of same	0.70	238.00
10/08/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: next board meeting; emails with R. Hart re: status	0.30	292.50
10/08/19	RHART	Emails re: board meeting	0.10	34.00
10/09/19	JHUGH	Participate in call with M. Nestor and counsel re: status and board meeting	0.50	487.50
10/09/19	MNEST	Review correspondence from counsel to SP (.3) and conduct teleconference with JP counsel and special committee counsel re same (.4)	0.70	693.00
10/09/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: board meeting and SingPost status	0.20	195.00
10/09/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: call with counsel	0.20	195.00
10/09/19	JHUGH	Review background materials on boards and forward to counsel	0.40	390.00
10/09/19	RHART	Review letter from SP directors and review emails re: same	0.30	102.00
10/10/19	JHUGH	Multiple follow up emails re: call	0.30	292.50
10/10/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails re: next board meeting; multiple emails with counsel re: organizational documents	0.30	292.50
10/10/19	JHUGH	Telephone conference with counsel re: issues for board meeting	0.20	195.00
10/10/19	JHUGH	Review agenda and emails for meeting	0.30	292.50
10/10/19	MNEST	Review issues re board agenda/meeting and process re same (.8); numerous teleconferences with counsel for parties re same (.8); conduct board call (1.0)	2.60	2,574.00
10/10/19	RHART	Telephonic attendance at board meeting; emails re: same and conference with J. Hughes re: same re: potential issues during meeting	1.50	510.00

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 5 of 12

Date	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	<u>Amount</u>
10/11/19	JHUGH	Multiple follow up emails re: materials from the special committee	0.30	292.50
10/11/19	JHUGH	Participate in call with counsel re: next steps after board call	0.20	195.00
10/11/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with YCST team re: follow up to board meeting; multiple emails with counsel	0.40	390.00
10/11/19	RHART	Call with advisors re: meeting, next steps	0.60	204.00
10/13/19	JHUGH	Memo from counsel re: most recent draft of board minutes; multiple follow up emails; review prior drafts of minutes	0.30	292.50
10/13/19	JHUGH	Memo to board of directors re: minutes and status of revisions to same	0.30	292.50
10/13/19	JHUGH	Review special committee minutes	0.20	195.00
10/14/19	JHUGH	Memo from J. Golden re: board information and next board call; follow up emails	0.40	390.00
10/15/19	JHUGH	Review status of mid-September meeting minutes	0.30	292.50
10/15/19	JHUGH	Emails re: board meeting	0.10	97.50
10/16/19	JHUGH	Review emails re: board meetings	0.20	195.00
10/16/19	JHUGH	Review memo and attachment re: Nespresso	0.10	97.50
10/17/19	JHUGH	Memo from M. Nestor re: special committee; follow up emails with counsel	0.40	390.00
10/17/19	JHUGH	Review committee resolutions and prior emails	0.30	292.50
10/17/19	JHUGH	Emails with Gibson Dunn re: request for documents	0.30	292.50
10/18/19	JHUGH	Telephone to counsel re: memo to Sing Post counsel; multiple emails; telephone conference with counsel re: next steps	0.60	585.00
10/18/19	JHUGH	Review revised minutes per R. Hart	0.20	195.00
10/18/19	JHUGH	Review draft of minutes and forward comments to R. hart	0.40	390.00
10/18/19	JHUGH	Review Gibson Dunn letter to counsel	0.10	97.50
10/18/19	RHART	Draft meeting minutes from 10/10 meeting; edits to same; review letter from counsel to SingPost directors	1.60	544.00
10/20/19	JHUGH	Review memo and attachments re: board meeting; review memo and attachment re: special committee meeting	0.30	292.50
10/21/19	JHUGH	Review multiple emails and attachments re: board action; telephone conference with counsel re: impact of transaction; telephone conference with M. Nestor re: status; multiple follow up emails	1.40	1,365.00
10/21/19	JHUGH	Review email and attachment for materials to be filed with the court; emails with M. Nestor re: same	0.30	292.50
10/21/19	JHUGH	Review follow up emails and attachment re: new board	0.30	292.50
10/21/19	RHART	Various emails re: meeting minutes	0.20	68.00
10/22/19	JHUGH	Telephone conference with M. Nestor re: special committee status	0.20	195.00
10/22/19	JHUGH	Emails and attachments with counsel re: special committee resolutions	0.40	390.00

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 6 of 12

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
10/22/19	JHUGH	Review and forward resolutions to co-counsel and follow-up emails re: same; emails with R. Hart re: committee resolutions	0.30	292.50
10/22/19	JHUGH	Work on retention papers to be filed with Bankruptcy Court	0.60	585.00
10/22/19	JHUGH	Emails with counsel re: status of special committee and bankruptcy	0.20	195.00
10/22/19	JHUGH	Follow up emails and attachments from T. Pakrouh re: retention materials	0.30	292.50
10/22/19	JHUGH	Participate in call with counsel and M. Nestor re: committee and bankruptcy status	0.30	292.50
10/22/19	MNEST	Teleconference/correspondence with parties re pending disputes and parameters for resolving same	0.50	495.00
10/22/19	CCATH	Assist in preparation of YCST retention application	0.40	114.00
10/22/19	RHART	Attention to emails re: finalized minutes	0.20	68.00
10/22/19	TPAKR	Multiple emails with M. Nestor, J. Hughes, and C. Cathcart redrafting YCST retention papers (.2); draft same (4.0)	4.20	1,680.00
10/23/19	JHUGH	Work with T. Pakrouh and bankruptcy counsel re: filings with the Nevada court; revise documents and forward; follow up emails	1.30	1,267.50
10/23/19	JHUGH	Review emails and attachments re: agreement on governance issues	0.30	292.50
10/23/19	JHUGH	Emails re: status of retention papers; work with T. Pakrouh re: status of retention papers; multiple emails	0.50	487.50
10/23/19	JHUGH	Review follow up emails on stipulated governance issues	0.30	292.50
10/23/19	CCATH	Assist in preparation of YCST retention application	0.10	28.50
10/23/19	RHART	Emails re: resolutions; review same	0.20	68.00
10/23/19	TPAKR	Review connection report and analyze same (4.5); conferences with M. Nestor and J. Hughes re: same (.2)	4.70	1,880.00
10/23/19	TPAKR	Multiple emails with M. Nestor, J. Hughes, and co-counsel re: finalizing YCST retention papers re: same (.2); multiple emails with A. Masone re: connections report issues (.2)	0.40	160.00
10/23/19	TPAKR	Finalize and file YCST retention papers	1.90	760.00
10/24/19	JHUGH	Review emails and attachments re: stipulation and consent on governance issues; review multiple follow up emails	0.60	585.00
10/24/19	JHUGH	Review final drafts of resolutions on governance of company	0.10	97.50
10/24/19	JHUGH	Emails from board, counsel and M. Nestor re: status of governance issues	0.40	390.00
10/25/19	JHUGH	Review memo and attachment re: board meeting and global agreement; review multiple follow up emails from directors and counsel	0.70	682.50
10/25/19	JHUGH	Review emails re: further agreements and resolutions re: board meetings and processes going forward	0.40	390.00
10/26/19	JHUGH	Review documents forwarded in response to information requests; multiple follow up emails from counsel	0.30	292.50

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 7 of 12

Date	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	Hours	Amount
10/27/19	JHUGH	Review emails from counsel re: board status and document requests	0.30	292.50
10/29/19	JHUGH	Review multiple emails and attachments from counsel and CRO re: board update and status of sales process	0.40	390.00
10/30/19	RHART	Emails re: upcoming board meeting	0.20	68.00
10/30/19	MNEST	Conduct call with board members, special committee and counsel	1.60	1,584.00
10/30/19	JHUGH	Review materials forwarded to Board by CRO; review materials forwarded by Gibson for agenda	0.20	195.00
10/30/19	JHUGH	Participate in update call for Board by advisors and CRO	1.00	975.00
10/30/19	JHUGH	Review follow up email and analysis re: status per CRO	0.20	195.00
10/31/19	JHUGH	Review memo and attachment re: sale notice and bid procedures; review follow up emails	0.20	195.00
10/31/19	JHUGH	Follow up emails on budget and status	0.10	97.50
		Total	54.90	\$42,505.50

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 8 of 12

Jagged Peak, Inc.Invoice Date:November 19, 2019Invoice Number:50010327

Matter Number: 100150.1001

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	Timekeeper Title	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Amount
CCATH	Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	0.50	285.00	142.50
JHUGH	James P. Hughes	Partner	31.00	975.00	30,225.00
MNEST	Michael R. Nestor	Partner	5.40	990.00	5,346.00
RHART	Ryan D. Hart	Associate	6.80	340.00	2,312.00
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	11.20	400.00	4,480.00
Total			54.90		\$42,505.50

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE 1000 NORTH KING STREET WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391 WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial (302) 571-6699

Writer's E-Mail mnestor@ycst.com

Jagged Peak, Inc. 3000 Bayport Drive, Suite 250 Tampa, FL 33607 Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: December 9, 2019 50010703 100150.1001

Invoice through November 30, 2019

Re: Board of Directors Representation

CURRENT INVOICE

Amount Due	\$ 47,820.80
Previous Balance Due	\$ 42,550.80
Total Due This Invoice	\$ 5,270.00
Professional Services	\$ 5,270.00

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 10 of 12

Jagged Peak, Inc.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: December 9, 2019 50010703 100150.1001

Time Detail

Date	<u>Initials</u>	Description	Hours	Amount
11/01/19	JHUGH	Memo from Gibson re: additional request for documents	0.10	97.50
11/04/19	JHUGH	Review memo from J. Rosenthal attaching requested financial and other company information; review multiple emails re: requested documents	0.20	195.00
11/07/19	JHUGH	Emails with YCST team and Gibson Dunn re: update meeting and status	0.30	292.50
11/07/19	RHART	Attendance at telephonic board meeting	1.70	578.00
11/07/19	JHUGH	Review agenda for meeting and follow up emails	0.30	292.50
11/07/19	JHUGH	Follow up emails with YCST team re: status and next steps	0.20	195.00
11/07/19	JHUGH	Participate in update board call re: company status and bids on assets	1.70	1,657.50
11/08/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with Force 10 re: professional fees	0.20	195.00
11/08/19	JHUGH	Conference with counsel re: status of case and status of professional fees	0.30	292.50
11/08/19	MNEST	Review status of issues and review of board meeting (.4); teleconference with counsel for SP and J. Hughes (.4)	0.80	792.00
11/08/19	JHUGH	Review billings and prepare memo for counsel and baord re: professional fee; multiple emails	0.50	487.50
11/10/19	JHUGH	Multiple emails with M. Nestor and Force10 and emails with Sing Post counsel	0.20	195.00
		Total	6.50	\$5,270.00

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	Hours	Rate	Amount
JHUGH	James P. Hughes	Partner	4.00	975.00	3,900.00
MNEST	Michael R. Nestor	Partner	0.80	990.00	792.00
RHART	Ryan D. Hart	Associate	1.70	340.00	578.00
Total			6.50		\$5,270.00

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

Case 19-15959-mkn Doc 435-1 Entered 01/14/20 19:28:20 Page 12 of 12

Jagged Peak, Inc.

Invoice Date: Invoice Number: Matter Number: November 19, 2019 50010327 100150.1001

Cost Detail

<u>Date</u>	Description	Quantity	Amount
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	10.00	1.00
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	3.00	0.30
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	12.00	1.20
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	13.00	1.30
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	5.00	0.50
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	8.00	0.80
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	4.00	0.40
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	9.00	0.90
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	12.00	1.20
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	7.00	0.70
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	15.00	1.50
10/22/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	6.00	0.60
10/23/19	Docket Retrieval / Search	17.00	1.70
10/23/19	Photocopy Charges Duplication BW	137.00	27.40

Cost Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Docket Retrieval / Search	17.90
Reproduction Charges	27.40

Total

Total \$45.30

\$45.30