Attorney or Professional Name, Address, Telephone and FAX		. '	
GARY WATTS, CPA			
GLASSRATNER			
3391 Peachtree Road, N.E., Suite 110			
Atlanta, GA 39326 Telephone No.: (678) 904-1990			
Facsimile No.: (678) 904-1991			
racsume no (ordy so			
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA			
			Chapter 11 Case Number
In re:		1	8:08-bk-13150-RK & 8:08-bk-13151-RK
JAMES C. GIANULIAS			8:08-DK-13130-KK & 8:08-DK-13131-KK
In re:			Professional Fee Statement
CAMEO HOMES, a California corporation			
*			Number: 21
			Month of: April, 2010
	_	1	
	D	cbtor	
	1		ClearPatron
1. Name of Professional:	╧		GlassRatner
2. Date of entry of order approving employment of the professional:		'	October 22, 2008
	+,	5 0	
	+	-+	
4. Less: Total amount of pre-petition services rendered and expenses:	- -	0	
5. Balance of funds remaining on date of filing of petition:	:	50	
6. Less: Total amount of all services rendered per prior fee statements: (Line 6 is not used when filing Statement Number 1).	١ .	- 967	,605.93
7. Less: Total amount of services and expenses this reporting period:		- 6,90	58.94
8. Balance of funds remaining for next reporting period:	+	\$ 0	
	Щ.	-	
DETAILED DOCUMENTATION SUPPORTING THE PROFESSIONAL F. DURING THIS REPORTING PERIOD HAS BEEN SERVED ON THE UNIDETAILED DOCUMENTATION WILL BE PROVIDED BY THE PROFES AND COSTS WILL BE WITHDRAWN FROM THE TRUST ACCOUNT IN UNLESS AN OBJECTION IS FILED WITH THE CLERK OF THE COURT ABOVE WITHIN 10 DAYS FROM THE DATE OF SERVICE OF THIS ST	ITE SSIC N T I A	D ST ONA HE A NO S	FATES TRUSTEE. A COPY OF THE L TO ANY PARTY UPON REQUEST. FEES AMOUNT STATED IN ITEM 7 ABOVE SERVED ON THE PROFESSIONAL NAMED
9. Total number of pages attached hereto:	Τ		3
The above is a true and correct statement of fees earned and expenses incurred	de	g t	he indicated reporting period.
Dated: May 2010	4	4	
GlassRatner	土	14	
Type Name of Professional Sign	atu	re of	Professional
Gary Watts, CPA			
	atu	re of	Attorney for Professional (if applicable)
DE OFFICIALLY FOR OF A TE	`` \	ביו אים	(Page 1 of 2) USTLA-
Revised February 2002 PROFESSIONAL FEE STATE	IVI.	CN I	(rage 1 of 2)



May 17, 2010

Invoice #:14178

GIANULIAS-CAMEO HOMES CREDITORS' COMMITTEE VICTOR A. SAHN SULMEYERKUPETZ PC 333 SOUTH HOPE STREET, 35TH FLOOR LOS ANGELES CA 90071

In Reference To: Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of James C Gianulias and Cameo Homes

For professional services rendered during the period April 01, 2010

through April 30, 2010

Name		 Hours	Rate	Amount
Gary Watts, CPA		7.20	335.00	\$2,412.00
Jeanette Ashley		5.10	205.00	\$1,045.50
Joey Marelle, CPA		0.60	165.00	\$99.00
Tess Wolff		22.70	150.00	\$3,405.00
			Hours	Amount
Total Professional Service Fees	·		35.60	\$6,961.50
Out-of-Pocket Expenses:				
Pacer charges				7.44
Total expenses				\$7.44
	•		-	
Total amount of this bill				\$6,968.94

Billing Recap by Professional

Wiring Instructions:

Bank: Wachovia Bank, N.A.

ABA Num: 061000227 Accnt Name: GlassRatner Advisory & Capital Group, LLC

Accnt Num: 2000050446515

Tax ID Number: 58-2660177

Jeanette Ashley	Professional	Date	Description	Hours	Amount
Jeanette Ashley	ategory 020: Business	Operations			
Jeanette Ashley			Review MOR Analysis and comments to T Wolff	0.50	\$102.5
Tess Wolff					
MOR analysis for summary schedule by bank account					
Tess Wolff	ress vvoiii			0.40	Ψ00.0
Update pivot table to prepare summary by bank account	T \A/-166			4.00	#005.0
Tess Wolff	i ess vvoitt	4/1/2010		1.90	\$285.0
Jeanette Ashley		•			1
Jaanette Ashley	Tess Wolff	4/1/2010		0.80	\$120.0
Tess Wolff	Janualla Aablay	4/0/0040		0.20	. 644.0
Tess Wolff	•				
Tess Wolff					
Tess Wolff	Tess Wolff	4/2/2010		2.30	\$345.0
Continuous update data to narrow down categories			and continuously update data to narrow down categories		*
Continuous y update data to narrow down categories	Tess Wolff	4/2/2010	Create summary schedule of receipts from pivot table and	2.30	\$345.0
Tess Wolff					******
Dank account	Toss Wolff	4/5/2010		1.60	\$240.0
Tess Wolff	ress vvoiii	4/3/2010	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1.00	Ψ 2 +0.0
Jeanette Ashley	T > > 100	4/5/0040		4.40	
Jeanette Ashley	i ess vvoitt	4/5/2010		1.40	\$210.0
Jeanette Ashley					
Jeanette Ashley	Jeanette Ashley	4/7/2010	Review Professional fees worksheet and reconcile to GR AR	0.90	\$184.5
Deanette Ashley	Ioanotto Achlov	4/7/2010	Correspondence with E Miller to decuments needed	0.10	\$20 F
Jeanette Ashley	Jeanette Asmey	. 4///2010		0.10	φ20.0
Tess Wolff 4/7/2010 Call w/J Ashley. re professional fees analysis 0.10 \$15.6 Tess Wolff 4/8/2010 Analyze and compare professional fees from schedule by J. 1.50 \$225.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/18/2010 Review Professional fee monthly analysis, email follow up comments to T Wolff 0.30 \$61.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/19/2010 Review correspondence from T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.20 \$41.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various Cameo Homes receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.20 \$180.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.90 \$285.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedule and update professional fee schedule and update professional fees schedule and update professional fees schedule and update professional fees schedule analysis profesional fees schedule analysis professional fees schedule analysis professional				0.40	
Tess Wolff	-				
McFadden to MORs	Tess Wolff				
Jeanette Ashley	Tess Wolff	4/8/2010	Analyze and compare professional fees from schedule by J.	1.50	\$225.0
Comments to T Wolff			McFadden to MORs		
Jeanette Ashley	Jeanette Ashlev	4/18/2010	Review Professional fee monthly analysis, email follow up	0.30	\$61.5
Jeanette Ashley					·
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 2.30 \$345.6 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various Cameo Homes receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.20 \$180.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.90 \$285.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account Schedule 0.70 \$105.0 Gary Watts, CPA 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account Schedule 0.70 \$105.0 Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G \$246.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ash	leanette Ashley	4/19/2010		0.20	\$41 0
Comments/questions for debtor					
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various Cameo Homes receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.20 \$180.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.90 \$285.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update schedul	ress vvoiii	4/19/2010		2.50	φ5 4 5.0
Schedules on MOR analysis 1.90 \$285.0					
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 1.90 \$285.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account Schedule Schedule 0.70 \$105.0 Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$20.6 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 1.20 \$246.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010	Tess Wolff	4/19/2010		1.20	\$180.0
on MOR analysis Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account Schedule 3 on MOR analysis Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account Schedule Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis Schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0			schedules on MOR analysis		
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account schedule 0.70 \$105.0 Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 1.20 \$246.0 Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 0.60 \$90.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5	Tess Wolff	4/19/2010	Update various JCG receipts and disbursements schedules	1.90	\$285.0
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update various G Companies and Mesa Mgmt receipts and disbursements schedules on MOR analysis 2.30 \$345.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account schedule 0.70 \$105.0 Gary Watts, CPA Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 1.20 \$246.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 0.60 \$90.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/			on MOR analysis	•	
disbursements schedules on MOR analysis Tess Wolff	Tess Wolff	4/19/2010		2.30	\$345.0
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Review updated professional fee schedule and update Schedule 3 on MOR analysis Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account schedule Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.			•		
Schedule 3 on MQR analysis 10.70 \$105.0	Toos Welff	4/40/2040		0.40	\$60.0
Tess Wolff 4/19/2010 Update receipts and disbursements by bank account schedule 0.70 \$105.00 Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.50 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.50 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.00 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 1.20 \$246.00 Watts Watts 0.40 \$60.00 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 0.60 \$90.00 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.00 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.00 Ategory 060: Employment / Fee Applications 0.20 \$41.00 Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.00	ress vvoiii	4/ 19/2010		0.40	φου.υ
Schedule Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 Ategory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0	- AA4 155	4/40/0040		0.70	
Gary Watts, CPA 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$33.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G 1.20 \$246.0 Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 Ategory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0	less Wolff	4/19/2010		0.70	\$105.0
Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis 0.10 \$20.5 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0		•			
Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 \$246.0 \$	Gary Watts, CPA	4/20/2010	Call with J Ashley re MOR Analysis	0.10	
Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Call with T Wolff re MOR analysis 0.40 \$82.0 \$246.0 \$	Jeanette Ashley	4/20/2010	Call with G Watts re MOR Analysis	0.10	\$20.5
Jeanette Ashley 4/20/2010 Review/revise MOR analysis and issue discussion draft to G Watts Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0				0.40	\$82.0
Watts					
Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call with J Ashley re MOR analysis 0.40 \$60.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare comments/questions for debtor 0.60 \$90.0 Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0					•
Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Analyze MOR analysis schedules to prepare 0.60 \$90.0 comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 comments for debtor 27.20 \$4,340.5 compared to the second of the second	Tess Wolff	4/20/2010		0.40	\$60.0
comments/questions for debtor Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0					
Tess Wolff 4/20/2010 Call w/J Ashley re analysis of MORs and comments for debtor 0.40 \$60.0 27.20 \$4,340.5 tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0	ress vvoiii	4/20/2010		0.60	φ90.0
tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0	Tess Wolff	4/20/2010		0.40	\$60.0
tegory 060: Employment / Fee Applications Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0					
Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0			_	27.20	\$4,340.5
Jeanette Ashley 4/9/2010 Review invoice and issue 0.20 \$41.0	togoni 060: Employee	nt / Eoo Anni	inations		
				0.20	\$41 0
	Souriotto / torney	70/2010			\$41.0

Case 8:08-bk-13150-RK Doc 696 Filed 06/08/10 Entered 06/08/10 16:29:30 Desc Main Document Page 4 of 8

JC Gianulias Cameo Homes

Category 100: Plan and Di	sclosure			
Jeanette Ashley		Discuss Napa property analysis with JM, review files and to G Watts	0.40	\$82.00
Joey Marelle, CPA	4/7/2010 I	Review of Napa Valley analysis; discuss with J Ashley	0.60	\$99.00
Gary Watts, CPA		Conversations with Counsel	1.50	\$502.50
Gary Watts, CPA	4/8/2010 1	Research information for Bank of the West requests	3.40	\$1,139.00
Gary Watts, CPA		Additional research in response to Bank of the West questions	2.10	\$703.50
Jeanette Ashley	4/9/2010 (Call with G Watts re info requested for Napa/Chardonnay	0.10	\$20.50
Gary Watts, CPA	4/9/2010 (Call with J Ashley re info requested for Napa/Chardonnay	0.10	\$33.50
			8.20	\$2,580.00
	7	Total Professional Fees	35.60	\$6,961.50
Out-of-Pocket Expenses				
	4/30/2010 F	Pacer charges		\$7.44
	1	Total Out-of-Pocket Expenses		\$7.44
	T	Total Amount of Invoice	35.60	\$6,968.94

Case 8:08-bk-13150-RK Doc 696 Filed 06/08/10 Entered 06/08/10 16:29:30 Desc Main Document Page 5 of 8

In re	(Short Title)		Chapter 11 Case Number:
JAMES C. GIANULIAS			8:08-bk-13150 & 8:08-bk-13151-RK
		Debtor	

PROOF OF SERVICE BY MAIL

STATE OF CALIFORNIA COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES

I am employed in the county of <u>Los Angeles</u>, State of California, in the office of a member of the bar of this Court at whose direction the service was made; I am over the age of 18 and not a party to the within action; and my business address is as follows:

333 South Hope Street, Thirty-Fifth Floor Los Angeles, CA 90071

On <u>June 8, 2010</u>, I served the foregoing PROFESSIONAL FEE STATEMENT on the interested parties at their last known addresses in this action by placing a true and correct copy thereof in a sealed envelope with first class postage thereon fully prepaid in the United States Mail at <u>Los Angeles</u>, California, addressed as follows:

SEE ATTACHED SERVICE LIST

[declare	under	penalty	of per	iury t	hat the	foregoi	ng is	s true	and	correct.

Dated: June 8, 2010

 Denise Givens
 /s/Denise Givens

 Print Name
 Signature

Case 8:08-bk-13150-RK Doc 696 Filed 06/08/10 Entered 06/08/10 16:29:30 Desc Main Document Page 6 of 8

Office of the United States Trustee Michael J. Hauser 411 West Fourth Street, Suite 9041 Santa Ana, CA 92701-8000

Attorneys for James C. Gianulias

Alan J. Friedman, Esq. Kerri A. Lyman, Esq. Irell & Manella LLP 840 Newport Beach Center Drive, Suite 400 Newport Beach, CA 92660

Special Counsel to Debtors

William N. Lobel, Esq. The Lobel Firm 840 Newport Center Drive, Suite 750 Newport Beach, CA 92660

Debtors

James C. Gianulias Cameo Homes 1105 Quail Street Newport Beach, CA 92660

Attorneys for Cameo Homes

Paul J. Couchot, Esq.
Garrick A. Hollander, Esq.
Winthrop Couchot P.C.
660 Newport Beach Center Drive, 4th Floor
Newport Beach, CA 92660-5946

John McFadden 1105 Quail Street Newport Beach, CA 92660 Email: johnm@gcompanies.com

COMMITTEE MEMBERS

California National Bank

Joshua D. Wayser, Esq. Katten Muchin Rosenman LLP 2029 Century Park East, Suite 2600 Los Angeles, CA 90067

Erin Austin, Esq.
David Evans and Associates, Inc.
320 SW Upper Terrace Drive, Suite 200
Bend, OR 97702

Attorneys for Housing Capital Company

Lance Jurich Loeb & Loeb 10100 Santa Monica Boulevard, Suite 2200 Los Angeles, CA 90067

Attorneys for PCR Services Corporation

Attn: Steve Nelson 1 Venture, Suite 150 Irvine, CA 92619

California National Bank

Jyotsna Desai Vice President, Asset Manager 221 South Figueroa Street, Suite 310 Los Angeles, CA 90012

Attorneys for Wachovia Bank

Marsha A. Houston, Esq. Reed Smith LLP 355 South Grand Avenue, Suite 2900 Los Angeles, CA 90071

REQUESTS FOR SPECIAL NOTICE

Attorneys for M.W. Housing Partners III, LP Steven G. Polard Perkins Coie LLP 1620 26th Street, 6th Floor Santa Monica, CA 90404 Attorneys for Pacific Western Bank

Larry G. Ivanjack, Esq./David K. Eldan, Esq. Parker, Miliken, Clark, O'Hara & Samuelian 555 South Flower Street, 30th Floor Los Angeles, CA 90071-2440

Case 8:08-bk-13150-RK Doc 696 Filed 06/08/10 Entered 06/08/10 16:29:30 Desc Main Document Page 7 of 8

Attorneys for Bank Of The West

Sue J. Hodges, Esq.
Matthew S. Walker, Esq.
Pillsbury Winthrop Saw Pittman LLP
12255 El Camino Real, Suite 300
San Diego, CA 92130-4088

Attorneys for California Bank & Trust

c/o Peter I. Duncan, Esq. Pyle Sims Duncan & Stevenson APC 401 "B" Street, Suite 1500 San Diego, CA 92101

Attorneys for Lucas Companies

Robert P. Goe, Esq. Goe & Forsythe, LLP 18101 Von Karman Avenue, Suite 510 Irvine, CA 92612

Attorneys for PNC Bank, National Association

Gary W. Marsh, Esq. MCKenna Long & Aldridge LLP 303 Peachtree Street NE, Suite 5300 Atlanta, GA 30308

Attorneys for Intervest Mortgage Investment Company

Mark C. Schnitzer, Esq. Reid & Hellyer, APC P.O. Box 1300 Riverside, CA 92502-1300

Michael W. Immell and Charles H. Immell as trustee of the M and C Immell Revocable Trust dated March 30, 1992 c/o Michael W. Immell 611 Anton Boulevard, 14th Floor Costa Mesa, CA 92626-7681

Attorneys for Famille Holdings LP

Mark McClanathan, Esq. 19800 MacArthur Boulevard, Suite 500 Irvine, CA 92612-2435

Attorneys for Pacific Mercantile Bank

Leonard M. Shulman, Esq. Shulman Hodges & Bastian LLP 26632 Towne Center Drive, Suite 300 Foothill Ranch, CA 92610

Sean T. Cork, Esq. Squire, Sanders & Dempsey LLP Two Renaissance Square 40 North Central Avenue, Suite 2700 Phoenix, AZ 85004-4498

Tian Gu

c/o Nathan Garn Parks and Oberhansley 27250 Via Industria, Suite B Temecula, CA 92590

Attorneys Gateway Plastering, Inc.; Gateway Insulation, Inc.; and Captial Drywall, LP

Marc S. Hines, Esq./Katherine S. Agbayani, Esq. Hines Smith Carder 3080 Bristol Street, Suite 540 Costa Mesa, CA 92626

Attorneys for Wells Fargo Bank, National Association

John H. Wunsch, Esq. Wells Fargo & Company 21680 Gateway Center Drive, Suite 280 Diamond Bar, CA 91765-2435

Attorneys for Marilyn Robbins Gianulias

Penelope Parmes, Esq. Rutan & Tucker, LLP 611 Anton Boulevard, Suite 1400 Costa Mesa, CA 92626-1931

Attorneys for DCFS Trust

Randall P. Mroczynski, Esq. Cooksey Toolen Gage Duffy & Woog 535 Anton Boulevard, Tenth Floor Costa Mesa, CA 92626

Attorneys Michael and Charles Immell; Philip Hamilton and Janet L. Hamilton as co-trustees

Weiland Golden Smiley Wang Ekvall & Strok Attn: Lei Lei Wang Ekvall Esq. 650 Town Center Dr., Suite 950 Costa Mesa, CA 92626-7021

Phillip D. Hamilton and Janet L. Hamilton as co-trustees of the Hamilton Family Trust u/d/t dated 7/11/90 c/o Phillip D. Hamilton 760 West 16th St., Suite C Costa Mesa, CA 92627

Attorneys for Victor Mahony

Andrew K. Mauthe, Esq. P.O. Box 51147 Irvine, CA 92619-1147

Attorneys for Laing/Sequoia Partners LLC and South Banning Properties LLC

Perry D. Mocciaro, Esq./Susan S. Davis, Esq. Cox, Castle & Nicolson LLP 2049 Century Park East, 28th Floor Los Angeles, CA 90067-3284

Patrick Fields, of Counsel Squire, Sanders & Dempsey LLP 555 South Flower Street, 31st Floor Los Angeles, CA 90071-2300

Attorneys for Wells Fargo Bank

John D. Schlotter, Esq. 1544 Old Alabama Road Roswell, GA 30076-2102 Case 8:08-bk-13150-RK Doc 696 Filed 06/08/10 Entered 06/08/10 16:29:30 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 8

Attorneys for County of Riverside, California A California Taxing Authority

Martha E. Romero Romero Law Firm 6516 Bright Avenue Whittier, CA 90601

Attorneys for Deutsche Bank Mortgage, Inc.

Dennis B. Arnold, Esq. Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher LLP 333 South Grand Avenue Los Angeles, CA 90071

PROFESSIONALS

Valuation Consultant and Expert

Douglas Main Deloitte Financial Advisory Services 191 Peachtree Street NE, Suite 1500 Atlanta, GA 30303-1924

Valuation Consultant and Expert

Rory Nomoto Deloitte Financial Advisory Services 350 S. Grand Avenue, Suite 200 Los Angeles, CA 90071-3462

Debtors' Financial Advisor

Ronald Greenspan / Dominic Santos FTI Consulting, Inc. 633 West 5th Street, 16th Floor Los Angeles, CA 90071-2027

Mark A. Nitikman, Esq. Debra Dietrich, Esq. Croudace, Dietrick & Parker LLP 4750 Von Karman Avenue Newport Beach, CA 92660

BMC Group 444 North Nash Street El Segundo, CA 90245

Financial Advisor to the Committee

Gary Watts
GlassRatner Advisory & Capital Group LLC
18500 Von Karman Avenue, Suite 390
Irvine, California 92612

Financial Advisor to the Committee

Ron Glass / Jeanette Ashley GlassRatner Advisory & Capital Group LLC 3391 Peachtree Road, Suite 110 Atlanta, GA 30326

Special Tax Counsel to the Committee

Mark Wallace, Esq. Stutman, Treister & Glatt PC 1901 Avenue of the Stars, 12th Floor Los Angeles, CA 90067

Debtors' Accountants

Tom D. O'Rourke, CPA Haskell & White 16485 Laguna Canyon Road, 3rd Floor Irvine, CA 92618