Cameo Homes, Inc. / James C. Gianulias Summary of FTI Consulting, Inc. Professional Fees By Professional For the Period June 1, 2009 Through September 7, 2010

Professional	Title	Rate	Hours	Total
Greenspan, Ronald	Senior Managing Director	\$885	1.4	\$1,239.00
Greenspan, Ronald	Senior Managing Director	\$825	0.5	\$412.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	54.4	\$36,720.00
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	96.0	\$60,000.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	51.7	\$22,748.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	97.7	\$37,126.00
•	Totals		301.7	\$158,245.50 ======

Notes:

- Certain professionals may be listed in the exhibits more than once with differing titles and/or
 hourly rates. This is due to periodic promotions and/or revisions to hourly rates (as disclosed in
 FTI's engagement letter with the Debtors). The titles and rates shown in the exhibits are reflective
 of the titles and rates in place at the time the work was performed by the professional.
- 2. FTI incurred additional fees after the Effective Date (September 7, 2010) of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization (Dated May 27, 2010), as Modified relating to the preparation of this Final Fee Application. Such fees total \$6,702.00, and are included and listed in these exhibits.

Exhibit A
Page 20

Cameo Homes, Inc. / James C. Gianulias Summary of FTI Consulting, Inc. Fees By Activity and Professional For the Period June 1, 2009 Through September 7, 2010

Activity/Professional	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Application for Employme	ent and Fee Application Prepa	<u>ration</u>		
Greenspan, Ronald	Senior Managing Director	\$885	0.7	\$619.50
Greenspan, Ronald	Senior Managing Director	\$825	0.5	\$412.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	14.7	\$9,922.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	7.2	\$4,500.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	24.8	\$10,912.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	16.9	\$6,422.00
	Activity T	otal	64.8	\$32,788.50
Bankruptcy Case Adminis	stration			
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	10.3	\$6,952.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	1.0	\$625.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	4.3	\$1,892.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	1.6	\$608.00
	Activity T	otal	17.2	\$10,077.50
Meetings / Information Re	quests - Debtors			
Sandefur, Kevin	r, Kevin Senior Consultant		1.6	\$608.00
	Activity T	otal	1.6	\$608.00
Meetings / Information Re	equests - UCC and Profession	<u>als</u>		
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	3.8	\$2,565.00
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	69.1	\$43,187.50
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	6.7	\$2,948.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	48.1	\$18,278.00
•	Activity T	otal	127.7	\$66,978.50
<u> Plan - Financial Analysis</u>				
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	8.7	\$5,872.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	12.7	\$7,937.50
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	9.3	\$4,092.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	20.2	\$7,676.00
	Activity T	otal	50.9	\$25,578.00
Plan/Disclosure Statemen				
Greenspan, Ronald	Senior Managing Director	\$885	0.7	\$619.50
		*		

EXHIBIT "B"

Page 1 of 2

Exhibit	в	
Page_	21	

Cameo Homes, Inc. / James C. Gianulias Summary of FTI Consulting, Inc. Fees By Activity and Professional For the Period June 1, 2009 Through September 7, 2010

Activity/Professional	<u>Title</u>	Rate	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Plan/Disclosure Statement				
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$675	16.9	\$11,407.50
Santos, Dominic	Managing Director	\$625	6.0	\$3,750.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$440	6.6	\$2,904.00
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	7.7	\$2,926.00
	Activit	y Total	37.9	\$21,607.00
Valuation - Market Research	!			
Sandefur, Kevin	Senior Consultant	\$380	1.6	\$608.00
	Activit	y Total	1.6	\$608.00
	TOTAL	S	301.7	\$158,245.50

Notes:

Certain professionals may be listed in the exhibits more than once with differing titles and/or hourly rates. This is due to periodic promotions and/or revisions to hourly rates (as disclosed in FTI's engagement letter with the Debtors). The titles and rates shown in the exhibits are reflective of the titles and rates in place at the time the work was performed by the professionals.

FTI incurred additional fees after the Effective Date (September 7, 2010) of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization (Dated May 27, 2010), as Modified relating to the preparation of this Final Fee Application. Such fees total \$6,702.00, and are included and listed in these exhibits.

Exhibit 8

Exhibit C FTI Consulting, Inc. Monthly Summary of Fees: Third Application Period

							December 2009 - St	eptember 7, 2010	
Activity Category	June 2009	July 2009	August 2009	September 2009	October 2009	November 2009	March 2010	Ξ	Total
Application for Employment and Fee Application Preparation	8	00.860,0	1,108.00	\$ 668.00	\$ 771.00	\$ 391.00	\$ 1,102.00 \$	21,058.00 \$	32,788.50
Bankruptcy Case Administration	908.00		200.00	•		125.00	742.50	8,102.00	10,077.50
Meetings / Information Requests - Debtors	•	•		304,00	304.00			•	608,00
Meetings / Information Requests - UCC & Professionals	5,472.50	0 5,825.00	32,468.00	17,700.00	•	•	•	5,513.00	66,978.50
Plan/Disclosure Statement		•				6,676.00	308.00	14,623.00	21,607.00
Plan/Disclosure Statement - Financial Analysis				•	5,784.00	9,829.50	6,250.00	3,714.50	25,578.00
Valuation - Market Research	304.0		304.00	•	•		•		608.00
Total	\$ 7,977.0	0 \$ 11,923.00	\$ 34,380.00	\$ 18,672.00	\$ 6,859,00	\$ 17,021.50	\$ 8,402.50 \$	53,010,50 \$	158,245.50
								The second secon	200

ptember 7, 2010) of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization (Dated May 27, 2010), as Modified Such fees total \$6,702.00, and are included and listed in these exhibits. (1) FTI incurred additional fees after the Effective Date (September relating to the preparation of this Final Fee Application. Such fee

Exhibit D
FTI Consulting, Inc.
Monthly Summary of Expenses: Third Application Period

											December 20	. 6	December 2009 - April 2010 -		
Expense Category	June 2009	60	July 2009		August 2009	Septe	September 2009	October 2009	November 2009	2009		S O	March 2010 September 7, 2010	1	Total
Auto/Park/Toll	69		↔	1	-	69	9.50	•	es l	١.	€9	** •		€	9.50
Electronic Data					•			9.12		,		,			9.12
Mileage					•		79.64	•					•		79.64
elephone		•			•		•	•			3.	37.00	30.00		67.00
Sub-total FTI Expenses	€		8			€9	89.14	\$ 9.12	æ		\$ 3,	37.00 \$	30.00	s	165.26
Third Party Appraiser Expenses ^[1]				,	•		1						1		ı
Grand Total Expenses	49	.	\$,	s	89.14	\$ 9.12	\$,	3	37.00 \$	30.00	55	165,26

[1] Per the Court Order Authorizing FTI's employment, the Court authorized the Debtors to pay FTI a \$100,000.00 post-petition retainer to be used solely for the purpose of compensating third party appraisers retained by FTI on behalf of the Debtors. FTI has received this retainer from the Debtors and applied \$32,499.69 against the retainer during the First Application Period and \$4,397.90 during the Second Application Period. No third party appraiser expenses were incurred in the Third Application Period.

Exhibit 7
Page 24

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classific	ation: Ap	oplication fo	r Employ	yment and	Fee Application Preparation
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/15/2009	1.0	380.00	Work on preparation of the May fee statement.
Greenspan, Ronald	\$825	06/17/2009	0.2	165.00	Review and approve May fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/17/2009	0.5	190.00	Work on preparation of the May fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/17/2009	0.5	312.50	Make edits to the May fee statement.
Greenspan, Ronald	\$825	06/22/2009	0.2	165.00	Review and approve final May invoice.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/30/2009	1.0	380.00	Resolve billing and payment issues associated with recently received payments.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/02/2009	0.3	114.00	Work on preparation of the June fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/02/2009	0.2	76.00	Resolve billing and payment issues associated with recently received payments.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/07/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of the June fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/13/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of the June fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/13/2009	0.1	62.50	Review and trade correspondence with counsel regarding the upcoming Interim Fee Application hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/13/2009	0.1	62.50	Review June time and expense detail.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/14/2009	0.4	152.00	Begin to prepare the Second Interim Fee Application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/15/2009	1.8	684.00	Work on preparation of the Second Interim Fee Application.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/15/2009	8.0	500.00	Review draft second interim fee application exhibits and provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI) for edits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/16/2009	8.0	304.00	Work on preparation of the Second Interim Fee Application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/17/2009	2.2	836.00	Continue to work on preparation of the Second Interim Fee Application.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/17/2009	3.0	1,875.00	Review and perform a quality review of the Second Interim Fee Application and exhibits provided by K. Sandefur (FTI) and make edits to narrative.
Greenspan, Ronald	\$825	07/20/2009	0.1	82.50	Review and approve the June fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/20/2009	1.5	570.00	Review and make edits to the Second Interim Fee Application.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/20/2009	0.3	187.50	Review updated Second Interim Fee Application and forward to R. Greenspan (FTI) for review.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/21/2009	0.4	250.00	Review, edit and finalize the Second Interim Fee Application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/22/2009	0.3	114.00	Finalize preparation of the Second Interim Fee Application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/28/2009	0.2	76.00	Resolve billing and payment issues associated with recently received payments.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/11/2009	0.2	76.00	Follow-up and resolve billing inquiries.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/11/2009	0.6	228.00	Prepare the July fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/11/2009	0.5	312.50	Review July fee statement and provide direction for K. Sandefur (FTI) for follow up.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/12/2009	0.1	38.00	Work on preparation of the July fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/14/2009	0.3	187.50	Review July fee statement exhibits and forward to R. Greenspan (FTI) and Debtors for comment.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/18/2009	0.2	76.00	Prepare the July fee statement for filing.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/19/2009	0.2	76.00	Respond to internal billing questions.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 1 of 15

Exhibit	E
Page_	25

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classific	cation: Ap	plication fo	r Employ	yment and	d Fee Application Preparation
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/31/2009	0.3	114.00	Review billing updates and make adjustments to internal schedules as needed.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/21/2009	0.4	152.00	Work on preparation of the August fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/22/2009	0.5	190.00	Work on preparation of the August fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/22/2009	0.4	250.00	Review August time and expense detail.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/24/2009	0.2	76.00	Make edits to the August fee statement per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/01/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of the August fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/08/2009	0.7	266.00	Work on preparation of the September fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/09/2009	0.3	114.00	Work on preparation of the September fee statement and resolve related billing issues.
Santos, Domínic	\$625	10/16/2009	0.2	125.00	Review time and expense exhibits for month of September.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/19/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of September fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/26/2009	0.3	114.00	Finalize the September fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/18/2009	0.5	190.00	Work on preparation of October fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/19/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of October fee statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/19/2009	0.2	125.00	Review October fees statement exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	12/01/2009	0.2	76.00	Prepare the October fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	12/01/2009	0.5	190.00	Prepare the November fee statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	12/03/2009	0.2	76.00	Work on preparation of the October and November fee statements.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	12/03/2009	0.4	250.00	Review the October and November fee statements.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	12/07/2009	0.3	114.00	Prepare the November and October fee statements for filing.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/23/2010	0.6	264.00	Resolve billing inquiries and application of payments resulting from Court ordered fee reimbursement procedures.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/24/2010	0.3	132.00	Resolve billing inquiries and application of payments resulting from Court ordered fee reimbursement procedures.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/12/2010	0.4	176.00	Prepare December 2009 through March 2010 fee statements and send to D. Santos (FTI) for review.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/28/2010	0.2	135.00	Review December through March fees and expenses and direct creation of appropriate exhibits and fee statements.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/30/2010	0.5	220.00	Prepare December 2009 through March 2010 fee statements.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/20/2010	0.7	308.00	Begin to prepare fee statements for April 2010 - July 2010.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/26/2010	2.8	1,232.00	Begin preparation of FTI's final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/26/2010	3.0	1,320.00	Continue to work on a draft of FTI's final fee application.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/26/2010	0.3	202.50	Provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI) regarding creation of final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/27/2010	2.5	1,100.00	Continue to work on a draft of the final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/27/2010	2.2	968.00	Work on a draft of the final fee application.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/29/2010	0.2	135.00	Review joint fee order.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/29/2010	1.1	742.50	Review and revise draft final fee application.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/29/2010	0.3	202.50	Continue to review draft final fee application.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 2 of 15

Exhibit_	E
Page	24

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed		Description
Activity Classific	cation: A _l	oplication fo	r Emplo	yment and	l Fee Application Preparation
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/30/2010	0.4	176.00	Discuss draft final fee application with D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/30/2010	0.6	264.00	Make edits to draft final fee application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/30/2010	1.0	675.00	Continue to review and edit the draft final fee application and forward additional comments to K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/30/2010	0.5	337.50	Review time detail entries and classifications from the Third Application Period.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/30/2010	2.2	1,485.00	Continue to review and edit the draft final fee application.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/30/2010	0.4	270.00	Discuss draft final fee application with K. Sandefur (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	08/02/2010	2.6	1,144.00	Make edits to draft final fee application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	08/02/2010	1.8	792.00	Make additional edits to draft final fee application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	08/02/2010	1.8	1,215.00	Review and edit draft final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	08/03/2010	0.4	176.00	Make edits to draft final fee application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	08/03/2010	1.0	675.00	Review draft final fee application and provide edits to K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	08/03/2010	0.6	405.00	Review revised draft final fee application and forward to R. Greenspan (FTI) for comment.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/09/2010	0.6	405.00	Review documents filed by the court regarding the effective date of the Debtors' Plan and due dates for final fee applications.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/09/2010	1.0	675.00	Review prior correspondence regarding draft final fee application, review draft final fee application, and draft related correspondence to R. Greenspan (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	09/13/2010	0.8	352.00	Work on draft of final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	09/14/2010	1.9	836.00	Work on draft of final fee application.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	09/16/2010	1.2	528.00	Work on draft of final fee application.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/21/2010	8.0	540.00	Review draft final fee appication exhibits and provide K. Sandefur (FTI) with comments and edits.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/21/2010	0.4	270.00	Review updated final fee application and accompanying declaration.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	09/22/2010	1.1	484.00	Make edits to final fee application per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/22/2010	0.4	270.00	Review draft final fee application and provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/22/2010	1.4	945.00	Review updated final fee application and related exhibits from K. Sandefur (FTI), edit where necessary, and forward to R. Greenspan (FTI) for comment.
Greenspan, Ronald	\$885	09/29/2010	0.7	619.50	Review, provide comments and approve final fee application
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	09/29/2010	1.0	440.00	Make edits to final fee application per comments of R. Greenspan (FTI) and D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	09/29/2010	0.5	337.50	Review and finalize final fee application and exhibits.
	Total For	Activity	64.8	\$32,788.50	

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 3 of 15

Exhibit	E
Page	27

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: B	ankruptcy C	ase Adn	<u>ainistratio</u>	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/01/2009	1.6	608.00	Review recent bankruptcy court motions and orders and respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/03/2009	0.4	250.00	Review court documents filed by counsel to the UCC.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/31/2009	0.4	250.00	Review and analyze court filing from SulmeyerKupetz regarding professional fees and study related exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/17/2009	0.2	125.00	Review court docket for case developments.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/24/2010	0.6	405.00	Dial-in to Court Call teleconference for Disclosure Statement hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/24/2010	0.5	337.50	Review amended Plan exhibits in preparation of Disclosure Statement hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/14/2010	0.3	202.50	Review fee and expense reimbursements received to date in preparation of today's Court hearing regarding fees.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/17/2010	0.2	135.00	Review and trade correspondence with counsel regarding upcoming court hearing on the Debtors' Disclosure Statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/19/2010	0.5	337.50	Participate in today's Court Hearing regarding the Debtors' Third Amended Disclosure Statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/19/2010	0.7	472.50	Review the Debtors' Third Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement exhibits in advance of today's hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/27/2010	0.7	472.50	Review the Debtors' filed Fourth Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement in advance of tomorrow's hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/28/2010	0.5	337.50	Dial in to court hearing on the Debtors' Disclosure Statement to address any Plan/Disclosure Statement issues that may arise.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/28/2010	0.8	540.00	Review the Debtors' Disclosure Statement exhibits and updated Plan and Disclosure Statement documents in preparation of hearing.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/08/2010	2.6	1,144.00	Prepare materials for Plan confirmation hearings on 7/9/2010.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/08/2010	1.4	616.00	Continue to prepare materials for Plan confirmation hearings on 7/9/2010.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/08/2010	0.3	132.00	Update billing summary detailing fees incurred and amounts collected to date in advance of fee/Plan confirmation hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/08/2010	1.0	675.00	Review and prepare documents in advance of confirmation hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/09/2010	2.5	1,687.50	Prepare for Plan confirmation hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/09/2010	1.0	675.00	Review FTI's 2nd Interim Fee Application and amounts collected in advance of fee/Plan confirmation hearing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/09/2010	1.0	675.00	Attend fee application/Plan confirmation hearing.
	Total Fo	r Activity	17.2	\$10,077.50	
Activity Classific	cation: M	eetings / Info	ormatio	n Requests	- Debtors
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/14/2009	0.8	304.00	Respond to information requests from the Debtors.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	8.0	304.00	Respond to questions from Debtors.
•	Total For	- Activity	1.6	\$608.00	

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 4 of 15

Exhibit <u>F</u>
Page <u>28</u>

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Mo	eetings / Inf	<u>ormation</u>	Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/10/2009	0.7	266.00	Respond to questions from D. Santos (FTI) regarding settlement analyses.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/10/2009	0.6	375.00	Review correspondence from Committee representatives and draft correspondence for settlement negotiations.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/10/2009	1.0	625.00	Participate on a conference call with S. Thigpen (G Companies), J. McFadden (G Companies), W. Lobel (Lobel) and A. Friedman (Irell) to discuss settlement negotiations.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/26/2009	1.0	380.00	Make edits to the settlement projections.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/27/2009	0.5	190.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/27/2009	1.0	625.00	Review settlement projection file from K. Sandefur (FTI) and forward to counsel for discussion.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/29/2009	2.8	1,064.00	Make edits to settlement analyses per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/29/2009	0.6	375.00	Review settlement valuations and provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/29/2009	0.1	62.50	Participate on a telephone call with A. Friedman (Irell) to discuss settlement projections.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/30/2009	0.4	152.00	Participate on a conference call with D. Santos (FTI), J. McFadden (G Companies), and S. Thigpen (G Companies) regarding settlement analyses.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/30/2009	1.6	608.00	Make edits to settlement analyses per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/30/2009	0.5	312.50	Review and analyze settlement valuation file prepared by K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/30/2009	0.3	187.50	Review updated settlement analyses.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	06/30/2009	0.4	250.00	Participate on a conference call with S. Thigpen (G Companies), J. McFadden (G Companies) and K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss settlment analyses.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/02/2009	1.2	456.00	Prepare tax related materials for the UCC tax advisor.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/02/2009	0.3	114.00	Participate on a telephone call with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss support needed for settlement projections.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/02/2009	0.7	266.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per revised tax estimates.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/02/2009	0.3	187.50	Participate on a telephone call with K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss support needed for settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/02/2009	0.6	375.00	Review and trade correspondence regarding support needed related to the settlement projections.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	07/06/2009	0.3	114.00	Respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) regarding settlement valuation figures.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/06/2009	0.4	250.00	Review settlement information requested by S. Thigpen (G Companies).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/21/2009	0.6	375.00	Review and respond to questions needed for brief to be provided to the settlement mediator.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/29/2009	0.5	312.50	Review settlement correspondence and provide update to R. Greenspan (FTI) in advance of settlement mediation planning call tomorrow.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 5 of 15

Exhibit	E
Page_	29

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: M	eetings / Inf	ormation	Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/29/2009	0.8	500.00	Review settlement term sheet and projections provided to the UCC in advance of conference call to discuss upcoming settlement mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/30/2009	0.8	500.00	Participate on a conference call with A. Friedman (Irell), W. Lobel (Lobel), S. Thigpen (G Companies), J. Gianulias (G Companies) and D. Gianulias (G Companies) to discuss upcoming mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/30/2009	0.5	312.50	Review prior files and correspondence in preparation of upcoming mediation call.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/30/2009	0.3	187.50	Provide update to R. Greenspan (FTI) regarding call on upcoming mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	07/31/2009	3.0	1,875.00	Review prior projections, analyses and correspondence in preparation of upcoming mediation meeting.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/03/2009	0.6	228.00	Respond to valuation questions of D. Santos (FTI) related to settlement negotiations.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/03/2009	1.5	937.50	Review analyses, correspondence and settlement issues in advance of mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	4.5	2,812.50	Breakout meetings during all-day mediation with M. Goldberg (Mediator) and Debtors and Debtor's professionals to discuss settlement offers and series of counterproposals from the UCC during mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	1.5	937.50	Participate in a meeting to discuss upcoming mediation with B. Lobel (Lobel), T. O'Rourke (Lobel), S. Thigpen (G Companies), J. Gianulias (G Companies), D. Gianulias (G Companies) and S. Conerty (G Companies) prior to mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	1.0	625.00	Participate in a meeting with T. O'Rourke (Haskell), S. Thigpen (G Companies), J. Gianulias (G Companies), D. Gianulias (G Companies) and S. Conerty (G Companies) to discuss results of mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	5.0	3,125.00	Breakout meetings/discussions during all-day mediation with the Debtors and/or Debtors' professionals to discuss/analyze settlement offers, cash flow projections and counterproposals made by the UCC.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	0.5	312.50	Opening/introductory meeting during all-day mediation meeting with M. Goldberg (Mediator), UCC and UCC professionals, Debtors and Debtor's professionals.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/04/2009	1.0	625.00	Side meeting during all-day mediation with M. Goldberg (Mediator), D. Main (Deloitte), G. Watts (GlassRatner) and R. Nomoto (Deloitte) to discuss settlement projections, valuations and items for next mediation meeting.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/05/2009	1.3	494.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per follow-up comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/05/2009	1.0	380.00	Make edits to settlement projections per mediation meetings on 8/4/09.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/05/2009	1.2	456.00	Respond to questions from D. Santos (FTI) regarding settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	0.7	437.50	Draft correspondence to R. Greenspan (FTI) to provide an update regarding mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	0.6	375.00	Draft an e-mail to counsel regarding updated draft cash flows for mediation and preliminary observations.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	0.7	437.50	Format and provide Deloitte cash flow files per mediation request.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	0.4	250.00	Participate on a telephone call with T. O'Rourke (Haskell) to discuss updated settlement cash flow projections.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 6 of 15

Exhibit	E
Page_	30

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Me	eetings / Inf	ormation	Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	0.5	312.50	Provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI) regarding edits to make to mediation cash flows.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/05/2009	2.8	1,750.00	Review iterations of updated mediation cash flow projections from K. Sandefur (FTI) and edit where necessary.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/06/2009	0.2	76.00	Review notes and respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) regarding settlement cash flow projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/06/2009	0.5	312.50	Participate on a telephone call with T. O'Rourke (Haskell) to discuss taxes used in mediation projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/06/2009	0.2	125.00	Participate on a conference call with D. Main (Deloitte) and R. Nomomoto (Deloitte) to discuss settlement cash flow projections
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/06/2009	0.8	500.00	Analyze ownership interests for use in mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/06/2009	0.7	437.50	Prepare file and send to D. Main (Deloitte) with commentary in advance of tomorrow's mediation call.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/06/2009	1.5	937.50	Review cash flow projections and other files in preparation of mediation call.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/07/2009	1.4	532.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/07/2009	0.5	190.00	Speak with D. Santos (FTI) regarding case status and analyses to complete.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/07/2009	0.9	342.00	Review notes/files and respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) regarding settlement cash flow projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	1.6	1,000.00	Review updated cash flow projections from G. Watts (GlassRatner) and analyze changes and stated assumptions.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	1.0	625.00	Review prior research and files in analyzing cash flow projections from G. Watts (GlassRatner).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	0.3	187.50	Draft update to counsel regarding information needed for upcoming mediation meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	0.6	375.00	Analyze rental information and develop schedule per information request from Deloitte.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	0.7	437.50	Review updated cash flow projections from K. Sandefur (FTI) and provide edits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	2.3	1,437.50	Participate in conference call with J. Goldberg (Mediator), D. Main (Deloitte), R. Nomomoto (Deloitte), G. Watts (GlassRatner) and 2 other GlassRatner professionals to discuss differences in cash flow projections and information needed for Monday.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	1.5	937.50	Review and analyze cash flow comparison file from G. Watts (GlassRatner).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/07/2009	0.5	312.50	Speak with K. Sandefur (FTI) to provide case status update and direction on analyses to complete.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/08/2009	2.5	950.00	Analyze cash flow projections from GlassRatner and provide comments to D. Santos (FTI)
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/08/2009	0.7	266.00	Review settlement cash flow projections for accuracy.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/09/2009	0.8	304.00	Respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) in preparation for mediation meetings.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/09/2009	0.6	375.00	Review and trade correspondence regarding mediation meeting tomorrow.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/09/2009	0.8	500.00	Review and analyze updated cash flow file from K. Sandefur (FTI) for use in mediation and distribute internally with comments
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/09/2009	0.6	375.00	Review and analyze information for potential use in mediation.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 7 of 15

Exhibit _	E
Page	31

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Mo	eetings / Inf	ormation	Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/10/2009	0.5	312.50	Print out and prepare documents in advance of mediation meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/10/2009	5.0	3,125.00	Participate in mediation meetings and in breakout sessions with Debtors and Debtors' professionals as well as joint sessions with UCC professionals.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/10/2009	0.3	187.50	Review information request from UCC to be provided by T. O'Rourke (Haskell) and provide comments.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/11/2009	0.3	187.50	Format and provide to GlassRatner excel version of mediation cash flow projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/11/2009	0.7	437.50	Analyze and prepare cash flow projections for Haskell & White to assist in their preparation of tax estimates for mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/12/2009	0.2	125.00	Participate on a conference call with T. O'Rourke (Haskell) and A. Kennedy (Haskell) to discuss tax projections in context of mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/12/2009	0.1	62.50	Participate on a telephone call with A. Kennedy (Haskell) to discuss tax file in context of mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/12/2009	0.4	250.00	Review ownership interest issues with respect to mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/26/2009	0.3	187.50	Review and analyze correspondence from T. O'Rourke (Haskell) regarding upcoming mediation meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/26/2009	0.2	125.00	Speak with T. O'Rourke (Haskell) regarding upcoming mediation meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/26/2009	0.6	375.00	Trade correspondence with counsel and client regarding upcoming mediation meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/26/2009	1.5	937.50	Review previously provided projections for use in upcoming settlement meeting.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	08/27/2009	0.2	125.00	Draft an e-mail update to R. Greenspan (FTI) regarding settlement negotiations.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/03/2009	1.1	687.50	Draft instructions and description of issues and send to K. Sandefur (FTI) with files for potential use in upcoming mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/04/2009	1.3	812.50	Review and forward files to K. Sandefur (FTI) for potential use in upcoming mediation.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/07/2009	1.0	380.00	Review files in preparation for upcoming mediation.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/08/2009	1.0	380.00	Review files and e-mail correspondence in preparation for upcoming mediation meetings with the UCC.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	1.2	456.00	Side meeting during all-day mediation with M. Goldberg (Mediator), G. Watts (GlassRatner) and R. Nomoto (Deloitte) to discuss settlement projections and valuations.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	4.5	1,710.00	Breakout meetings during all-day mediation with M. Goldberg (Mediator) and Debtors and Debtor's professionals to discuss settlement offers and series of counterproposals from the UCC during mediation.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	5.0	1,900.00	Breakout meetings/discussions during all-day mediation with the Debtors and/or Debtors' professionals to discuss/analyze settlement offers, cash flow projections and counterproposals made by the UCC.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	1.8	684.00	Make adjustments to cash flow projections to provide to UCC and UCC professionals during mediation meetings.

Exhibit <u>E</u>
Page <u>3L</u>

Page 8 of 15

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Me	etings / Inf	ormation	Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	1.0	380.00	Breakout meetings during all-day mediation with M. Goldberg (Mediator) and Debtors and Debtor's professionals to discuss settlement offers and series of counterproposals from the UCC during mediation.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/09/2009	0.5	190.00	Participate in a meeting to discuss upcoming mediation with B. Lobel (Lobel), T. O'Rourke (Haskell), S. Thigpen (G Companies), and J. Gianulias (G Companies) prior to mediation.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/09/2009	0.5	312.50	Exchange correspondence with K. Sandefur (FTI) regarding mediation meeting developments.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/10/2009	0.3	114.00	Provide status update from mediation meetings to D. Santos (FTI) and R. Greenspan (FTI) and discuss additional work products needed.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/10/2009	0.7	266.00	Participate on a call with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss mediation hearings and work products needed.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/10/2009	0.7	437.50	Participate on a call with K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss mediation hearings and work products needed.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/15/2009	1.7	646.00	Work on preparation of extended cash flow projections per mediation hearings.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/16/2009	1.1	418.00.	Work on preparation of extended cash flow projections per mediation hearings.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/16/2009	0.4	152.00	Review and respond to e-mail correspondence regarding cash flow extensions.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/17/2009	0.3	114.00	Participate on a call with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss extended settlement projections per the mediation meetings.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/17/2009	1.4	532.00	Work on preparation of extended cash flow projections per mediation hearings and distribute for review by the Debtor and counsel.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/17/2009	0.4	152.00	Review settlement term sheet and prepare questions/comments.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/17/2009	0.3	187.50	Participate on a call with K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss extended settlement projections per the mediation meetings.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/17/2009	0.2	125.00	Review correspondence regarding post settlement projections.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/21/2009	1.2	456.00	Review correspondence related to extended projections resulting from the mediation meetings and analyze accordingly.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/21/2009	0.9	342.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/21/2009	0.6	375.00	Review correspondence from the Debtors regarding settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/21/2009	0.7	437.50	Review and analyze cash flow projections prepared by K. Sandefur (FTI) for use in settlement negotiations, and follow up with comments.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/21/2009	0.8	500.00	Review and analyze draft settlement term sheet and redline version.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/21/2009	0.5	312.50	Review comments from J. McFadden (G Companies) regarding draft settlement term sheet.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/22/2009	1.0	380.00	Analyze and make edits to the extended cash flow projections resulting from the mediation meetings.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/22/2009	0.7	437.50	Review updated iterations of extended settlement projections from K. Sandefur (FTI) and provide feedback and edits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/22/2009	0.8	500.00	Investigate certain issues and draft correspondence on settlement projections to Debtors.

EXHIBIT "E"

xhibit <u>E</u>

Page 9 of 15

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Mo	eetings / Inf	ormation	Requests	- UCC and Professionals
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/23/2009	0.7	266.00	Review comments to settlement projections provided by the Debtors and discuss with D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/23/2009	1.1	418.00	Make edits to the settlement projections per discussion with D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	09/23/2009	0.3	114.00	Make additional edits to the settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/23/2009	0.4	250.00	Review and respond to questions from J. McFadden (G Companies) regarding cash flows.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/23/2009	0.6	375.00	Review revised settlement cash flow projections from K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/23/2009	0.3	187.50	Review and analyze additional comments from J. McFadden (G Companies) and operating estimates and provide direction to K. Sandefur (FTI) for implementation in projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/23/2009	0.4	250.00	Review updated settlement cash flow projections from K. Sandefur (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/23/2009	0.1	62.50	Participate on a call with J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/24/2009	0.3	187.50	Review, gather information and respond to correspondence from Haskell & White regarding settlement projections.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/25/2009	0.8	500.00	Review and analyze counterproposal term sheet from UCC and compare against prior term sheet draft.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/25/2009	0.3	187.50	Draft comments regarding draft term sheet to counsel and Debtors.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	09/30/2009	0.2	125.00	Review and analyze correspondence regarding settlement term sheet drafts.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/05/2010	1.1	742.50	Review e-mail correspondence regarding creditor information request and research available information to respond to the request.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/08/2010	1.0	440.00	Review the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization exhibits and supporting analyses and prepare for distribution in satisfaction of creditor request.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/08/2010	0.3	132.00	Review e-mail correspondence regarding creditor information request.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/08/2010	0.5	337.50	Perform additional research into available information for creditor request.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/08/2010	1.0	675.00	Participate in conference call with A. Friedman (Irell), creditor and creditor's counsel in regards to creditor information request.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/09/2010	0.7	308.00	Review and respond to e-mail correspondence regarding creditor inquiries.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/09/2010	1.6	704.00	Further review the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization exhibits and supporting analyses and prepare distribution in satisfaction of creditor request.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/11/2010	0.5	220.00	Review Debtor information file and prepare summary in response to creditor inquiries.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/12/2010	1.2	528.00	Correspond with J. McFadden (G Companies) and D. Santos (FTI) regarding the disclosure statement exhibits and creditor inquiries.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	04/12/2010	1.4	616.00	Review cash flows and related correspondence with D. Santos (FTI) in response to creditor inquiries.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/12/2010	0.4	270.00	Review and trade correspondence with counsel and Debtors' personnel regarding creditor information request.

EXHIBIT "E"

Page 10 of 15

Exhibit	E
Page	34

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	ication: M	eetings / Inf	<u>ormatio</u>	n Requests	s - UCC and Professionals
Santos, Dominic	\$675	04/12/2010	8.0	540.00	Review materials prepared by K. Sandefur (FTI) and distribute in satisfaction of creditor information request.
	Total For	Activity	127.7	\$66,978.50	
Activity Classifi	ication: Pl	an - Financi	al Analy	<u>sis</u>	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/21/2009	0.3	114.00	Analyze note amortization for Plan amendment.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/29/2009	0.5	190.00	Participate on a conference call with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss amendments to the Plan of Reorganization and related exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/29/2009	0.5	190.00	Review exhibits filed with the Debtor's original Disclosure Statement in preparation of updating for an amended Plan.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	10/29/2009	0.5	312.50	Participate on a call with K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss updates to Plan exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	0.7	266.00	Participate on a phone call with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss changes made to Plan exhibits and additional updates.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	1.3	494.00	Work on updates to the exhibits for amended Plan.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	2.4	912.00	Continue to work on updating the Plan projections and estimated distribution exhibits for amended Plan.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	2.7	1,026.00	Work on updating the Plan projections and estimated distribution exhibits for amended Plan.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	10/30/2009	0.9	342.00	Make edits to Plan exhibits per comments from D. Santos (FTI) and perform review.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	10/30/2009	0.7	437.50	Participate on a call with K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss preliminary updates made to Plan exhibits and additional edits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	10/30/2009	1.4	875.00	Review Plan exhibits and identify schedules/exhibits to update.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	10/30/2009	1.0	625.00	Review edits to Plan exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/02/2009	1.0	380.00	Make edits to amended Plan exhibits per e-mail correspondence with counsel.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/03/2009	1.1	687.50	Review updated Plan exhibits and outline areas to change/update.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/04/2009	1.7	646.00	Continue to make edits to Plan exhibits per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/04/2009	8.0	304.00	Make edits to Plan exhibits per comments of D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/04/2009	0.9	562.50	Continue to review updated Plan exhibits and outline changes for K. Sandefur (FTI) to implement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/05/2009	0.9	342.00	Respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) regarding amended Plan exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/05/2009	1.0	380.00	Review and make edits to the amended Disclosure Statement exhibits and send to counsel for comment.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/05/2009	0.7	437.50	Analyze unsecured claims in conjunction with preparation of Plan exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/05/2009	1.0	625.00	Review iterations of Plan exhibits based upon requested changes.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	2.3	874.00	Make edits to Plan exhibits per comments from D. Santos (FTI) and J. McFadden (G Companies).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	0.6	228.00	Make additional edits to the Plan exhibits.

EXHIBIT "E"

Exhibit ______

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Pla	<u>ın - Financi</u>	al Analys	<u>sis</u>	
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/06/2009	1.2	750.00	Analyze unsecured claims in conjunction with preparation of Plan exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/06/2009	2.4	1,500.00	Review iterations of Plan exhibits based upon requested changes.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/08/2009	0.8	304.00	Make edits to the Plan exhibits per correspondence with Counsel.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/08/2009	0.3	187.50	Review changes to Plan exhibits and have K. Sandefur (FTI) recirculate for review.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/09/2009	0.6	228.00	Make edits to Plan exhibits per e-mail correspondence with Counsel, the Debtors, and D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/09/2009	1.2	456.00	Make additional edits to Plan exhibits and Disclosure Statement narrative per comments of Counsel.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/09/2009	1.5	937.50	Review correspondence regarding edits to Plan figures and review updated exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/18/2010	0.7	308.00	Review files and analyses in preparation of amending exhibits to the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/18/2010	8.0	352.00	Make edits to exhibits to the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization per correspondence with the Debtor.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/18/2010	0.3	202.50	Speak with J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss updating projections in the Plan of Reorganization.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/18/2010	0.2	135.00	Participate on a conference call with T. O'Rourke (Haskell) and A. Kennedy (Haskell) to discuss updating exhibits to the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/18/2010	0.3	202.50	Review prior Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement exhibits and outline a plan for updating.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/21/2010	1.5	660.00	Make edits to exhibits to the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization and draft related commentary to D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/21/2010	1.0	675.00	Review and edit updated cash flow projections for the Plan of Reorganization.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/22/2010	1.5	660.00	Make edits to exhibits in the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization per correspondence with D. Santos (FTI) and counsel.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/22/2010	0.3	132.00	Prepare updated exhibits to the Debtors' Plan of Reorganization for filing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.5	337.50	Review updated exhibits for the Debtors' amended Plan of Reorganization.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.1	67.50	Participate in a follow-up call with J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss cash flow projections in the Plan.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.8	540.00	Review and research questions regarding cash flow projections in the Plan of Reorganization.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.3	202.50	Participate on a conference call with J. McFadden (G Companies) and S. Conerty (G Companies) regarding cash flow projections in the Plan.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.4	270.00	Participate on a conference call with T. O'Rourke (Haskell & White) and E. Frier (Irell) regarding cash flow projections in the Plan.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	0.3	202.50	Speak with J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss cash flow projections in the Plan.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	02/22/2010	1.8	1,215.00	Review and direct the revision of the cash flow projections in the Plan.

Page 12 of 15

EXHIBIT "E"

Exhibit <u>£</u> Page <u>3</u>6

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classifi	cation: Pla	<u>ın - Financi</u>	al Analy	<u>sis</u>	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/24/2010	0.2	88.00	Respond to questions of D. Santos (FTI) regarding exhibits in the Plan.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/24/2010	0.7	308.00	Participate on a conference call with D. Santos (FTI) and J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss amended Disclosure Statement exhibits and draft related correspondence.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/24/2010	1.1	484.00	Make edits to the Debtors' Disclosure Statement exhibits per meeting with D. Santos (FTI).
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/24/2010	0.5	220.00	Meet with D. Santos (FTI) to discuss edits to exhibits to the Debtors' Disclosure Statement.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/24/2010	1.2	528.00	Make edits to the Debtors' Disclosure Statement exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/24/2010	0.8	352.00	Research inquiry from counsel regarding payments per the Debtors' Plan and related correspondence with counsel, J. McFadden (G Companies) and D. Santos (FTI).
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/24/2010	0.2	135.00	Participate on a conference call with A. Friedman (Irell) and J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss Disclosure Statement exhibit updates.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/24/2010	0.5	337.50	Participate on a conference call with J. McFadden (G Companies) and K. Sandefur (FTI) to discuss Disclosure Statement exhibit updates.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/24/2010	0.5	337.50	Meet with K. Sandefur (FTI) to go over updates to the Debtors' Disclosure Statement schedules.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/24/2010	1.5	1,012.50	Review updated Disclosure Statement schedules prepared by K. Sandefur (FTI) and provide direction for follow up.
	Total For	Activity	50.9	\$25,578.00	
Activity Classifi	cation: Pla	an/Disclosu	re Staten	<u>1ent</u>	
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/02/2009	0.3	187.50	Trade correspondence regarding Plan development with counsel
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/03/2009	1.4	532.00	Review amended Disclosure Statement and prepare questions/comments for discussion.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/04/2009	0.7	437.50	Review draft Disclosure Statement and outline changes/updates.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/05/2009	1.2	750.00	Continue to review the amended Disclosure Statement and provide updates/edits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/05/2009	0.5	312.50	Trade correspondence regarding Plan development.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	2.0	760.00	Review draft Disclosure Statement and prepare comments and questions.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	1.4	532.00	Review the draft Plan, prepare comments as needed and distribute current drafts and exhibits to counsel and Debtors.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	0.4	152.00	Trade e-mail correspondence with J. McFadden (G Companies), D. Santos (FTI), and counsel regarding the amended Disclosure Statement and related exhibits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/06/2009	1.4	532.00	Review updated draft Disclosure Statement and prepare comments and questions.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/06/2009	1.6	1,000.00	Review Disclosure Statement and provide updates/edits based upon most recent changes to exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/06/2009	8.0	500.00	Review updated Plan and provide updates/edits based upon most recent changes to Disclosure Statement and Plan exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/07/2009	0.4	250.00	Review and trade correspondence regarding Disclosure Statement edits.

EXHIBIT "E"

it <u>E</u>

Page 13 of 15

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed	Total	Description
Activity Classific	ation: Pla	n/Disclosur	e Staten	<u>1ent</u>	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/08/2009	0.5	190.00	Review the updated Disclosure Statement and Plan, make edits as necessary, and re-distribute exhibits and drafts to Counsel and the Debtors.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	11/10/2009	0.6	228.00	Review the Debtor's amended Plan and Disclosure Statement filed on 11/9/09.
Santos, Dominic	\$625	11/10/2009	0.5	312.50	Review the Debtor's amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement filed on 11/9/09.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	02/23/2010	0.7	308.00	Review the Debtors' Second Amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/24/2010	1.0	675.00	Review the Debtors' Plan and Disclosure Statement and identify areas for potential update.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/25/2010	0.7	308.00	Review a draft of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and prepare comments for counsel.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	05/25/2010	2.6	1,144.00	Continue to review draft of Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and prepare comments for counsel.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/25/2010	0.4	270.00	Edit the Debtors' draft Fourth Amended Disclosure Statement and Plan documents.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/25/2010	0.5	337.50	Participate on a call with J. McFadden (G Companies) to discuss updates to the Disclosure Statement and exhibits.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	05/25/2010	1.6	1,080.00	Review the Debtors' draft Fourth Amended Disclosure Statemer and provide K. Sandefur (FTI) with direction on verification and edits.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/01/2010	1.1	484.00	Review and make edits to the declaration of D. Santos (FTI) in support of confirmation of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/02/2010	4.0	2,700.00	Work on declaration in support of Plan confirmation.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/02/2010	2.5	1,687.50	Review and make edits for draft declaration in support of Plan confirmation.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/02/2010	2.5	1,687.50	Review and provide edits for draft confirmation brief.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/02/2010	1.0	675.00	Review draft confirmation order and provide edits as necessary.
Greenspan, Ronald	\$885	07/06/2010	0.7	619.50	Review and comment on the declaration of D. Santos (FTI) in support of Plan confirmation.
Sandefur, Kevin	\$440	07/06/2010	1.5	660.00	Review drafts of Plan Confirmation documents (confirmation brief, confirmation order, and declarations) in advance of filing.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/06/2010	1.7	1,147.50	Review updated drafts of Plan Confirmation documents and edit where necessary.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/07/2010	0.8	540.00	Finalize declaration in support of Plan confirmation.
Santos, Dominic	\$675	07/29/2010	0.9	607.50	Review addendum to creditor's trust agreement and the Debtors Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, and trade related correspondence.
	Total For	Activity	37.9	\$21,607.00	
Activity Classific	ation: Va	luation - M	arket Re	esearch	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	06/29/2009	0.8	304.00	Review research materials regarding commercial real estate markets.

Exhibit <u>£</u>

Professional	Rate	Date	Hours Billed		Description
Activity Classifi	ication: Va	aluation - M	arket R	<u>esearch</u>	
Sandefur, Kevin	\$380	08/03/2009	0.8	304.00	Conduct research in response to valuation questions of D. Santos (FTI).
	Total For Activity		1.6	\$608.00	
Grand Total of Hours and Fees			301.7	\$158,245.50	

Notes:

Certain professionals may be listed in the exhibits more than once with differing titles and/or hourly rates. This is due to periodic promotions and/or revisions to hourly rates (as disclosed in FTI's engagement letter with the Debtors). The titles and rates shown in the exhibits are reflective of the titles and rates in place at the time the work was performed by the professionals.

FTI incurred additional fees after the Effective Date (September 7, 2010) of the Debtors' Fourth Amended Plan of Reorganization (Dated May 27, 2010), as Modified relating to the preparation of this Final Fee Application. Such fees total \$6,702.00, and are included and listed in these exhibits.

Exhibit <u>£</u> Page <u>39</u>