

**EXHIBIT A**

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
 Carl Marks Summary Timesheet  
 Privileged and Confidential

	\$ per Hour	Hours	Total
Mark Claster	\$ 750	1.5	\$ 1,125.00
Charles Beguslaski	\$ 550	57.9	\$ 31,817.50
Matt McInerney	\$ 350	38.5	\$ 13,475.00
Michael Gordon	\$ 300	56.9	\$ 17,070.00
Jen Venable	\$ 350	0.2	\$ 70.00
<b>Total</b>		<b>155.0</b>	<b>\$ 63,557.50</b>

Professional	\$ per Hour	November	Total
Mark Claster Hours	\$ 750	\$ 1,125.00 1.5	\$ 1,125.00 1.5
Charles Beguslaski Hours	\$ 550	\$ 31,817.50 57.9	\$ 31,817.50 57.9
Matt McInerney Hours	\$ 350	\$ 13,475.00 38.5	\$ 13,475.00 38.5
Michael Gordon Hours	\$ 300	\$ 17,070.00 56.9	\$ 17,070.00 56.9
Jen Venable Hours	\$ 350	\$ 70.00 0.2	\$ 70.00 0.2
<b>Total</b>		<b>\$ 63,557.50 155.0</b>	<b>\$ 63,557.50 155.0</b>

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
Mark Cluster - Detailed Timesheet

Date	Task	Description of Activity	Hours	Professional
11/13/2013	Committee	Attend committee conference call with debtor and debtors advisors. Follow up call with committee members.	1.5	Mark Cluster
			1.5	
		Total	1.5	

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
Charles Boguslaski - Detailed Timesheet

Date	Task	Description of Activity	Hours	Professional
11/12/2013	Objections/Declarations	Reviewed Bid Procedures	2.1	Charles Boguslaski
11/12/2013	Objections/Declarations	Reviewed APA	3.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/12/2013	Diligence	Reviewed CEO 1st day declaration	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/12/2013	DIP Financing	Reviewed DIP financing	1.8	Charles Boguslaski
11/12/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review of OSHR comments on bid procedures	0.7	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with debtor, counsel and advisors with UCC	1.0	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with UCC	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with D Posner re bid procedures objections	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with G Ffinizio re court schedule	0.1	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with D+P re bidders and sale process	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with Pillsbury re bid procedures	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with D Posner re Pillsbury comments to bid procedures.	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB and G Ffinizio re bidding procedures	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/14/2013	Diligence	Reviewed debtor/CM NDA for data room access	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Reviewed Pillsbury markup to bid procedures	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Reviewed and analyzed debtors KBIP	1.1	Charles Boguslaski
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Prepared comments and analysis to DIP financing.	2.4	Charles Boguslaski
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Reviewed OSHR DIP objections	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review of 363 TB engagements and fee levels	0.9	Charles Boguslaski
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Call with MG re TB fee research	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
11/16/2013	Diligence	Correspondence re diligence materials and data room.	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
11/18/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Prep and analysis for UCC call.	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/18/2013	Objections/Declarations	D&P fee analysis	1.1	Charles Boguslaski
11/19/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Review of marketing materials	1.3	Charles Boguslaski
11/19/2013	Meetings	Call with D&P and DSI to review sale and 13wk cash flow	0.8	Charles Boguslaski
11/19/2013	Objections/Declarations	Analysis of KBIP	1.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re UCC call, KBIP and sale	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call with UCC	1.0	Charles Boguslaski
11/20/2013	Diligence	Reviewed LTC and Talon buyer status	0.7	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Meetings	Process update meeting w/ CMAC team	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call w/ M Manning re KBIP	0.1	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Review and analysis of KBIP summary	0.7	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re KBIP	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Meetings	CMAC meetings re KBIP	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call with DSI re KBIP	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/21/2013	Objections/Declarations	Correspondence w OSHR re KBIP	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/22/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Analysis and presentation prep for UCC call re KBIP	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
11/22/2013	Committee	UCC call re KBIP	0.8	Charles Boguslaski
11/22/2013	Objections/Declarations	Call with OSHR re DIP and KBIP plan	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/22/2013	Meetings	Correspondence with D&P and OSHR re UH bidder.	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
11/22/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review of UCC statement re DIP	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
11/25/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review of UST KBIP objection	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/26/2013	Business Operations	Call with M Catania re bidder inquiry	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
11/26/2013	Cash Management	Review of 13wk update report	0.8	Charles Boguslaski
11/26/2013	DIP Financing	Review of final DIP budget and order	0.9	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of detailed divisional LTC P&L	2.3	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of detailed divisional Talon P&L	0.9	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review and analysis of medicare recoupments	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review and analysis of rapex program	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of daily KPIs	1.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of corp and employee org structure	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of AR schedules, aging and working capital	0.8	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of divisional payer mix	0.7	Charles Boguslaski
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of doubtful account write offs	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Committee	Review of potential bidders financial statements	0.7	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re potential bidder and sale process status.	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call with D&P and DSI re sale process and cash flow update	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Business Operations	Review of bidder log and comparison to past	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Cash Management	Review of 13wk cash flow variances and budget	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/3/2013	Committee	Preparation for UCC call	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/4/2013	Committee	UCC call to review open docket items, sale process and cash flow.	0.5	Charles Boguslaski
12/9/2013	Diligence	Review of the LTC APA	3.2	Charles Boguslaski
12/9/2013	Meetings	Discussion with G.F. re auction, bidders and APA	0.2	Charles Boguslaski
12/9/2013	Business Operations	Review of individual sites/territories operations/P&Ls	2.9	Charles Boguslaski
12/9/2013	Diligence	Review of APA disclosure schedules, assumed and rejected contracts.	2.4	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review of the potential bidder participation materials.	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Business Operations	Review of 13 week cash flow and report	0.6	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Business Plan	Review of bidder logs and sale process	0.4	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call with D&P and DSI re sale process and cash flow	0.8	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Meetings	Follow up call with D&P on LTC strategy	0.1	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Business Plan	Review of preliminary bid for Talon.	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re sale process	0.3	Charles Boguslaski
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call with DSI re potential LTC wind down	0.4	Charles Boguslaski

57.9

Total 57.9

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
 Matt McInerney - Detailed Timesheet

Date	Task	Description of Activity	Hours	Professional
11/13/2013	DIP Financing	Review DIP filings	2.2	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review CEO 1st day declaration	1.5	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review and comment on APA and bidding procedures	2.0	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review Otterbourg comments to bid procedures	0.4	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ debtor and committee counsels re: bid procedures	1.0	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ Otterbourg re bid procedures	0.3	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with D&P to review marketing process	1.0	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Diligence	Prepare supplement to buyer's list	0.5	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB and G Finizio re bidding procedures	0.2	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review KEIP filings	0.4	Matt McInerney
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with UCC	0.5	Matt McInerney
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review stalking horse's revisions to bidding procedures	0.2	Matt McInerney
11/14/2013	DIP Financing	Provide comments on DIP observations	0.3	Matt McInerney
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review Otterbourg DIP summary	0.4	Matt McInerney
11/15/2013	Diligence	Review sealed KEIP documents	0.2	Matt McInerney
11/15/2013	Diligence	Review Duff + Phelps marketing materials	2.0	Matt McInerney
11/15/2013	Meetings	Call w/ Mark Cutania re: revised bidding procedures	0.2	Matt McInerney
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review G Finizio email and attachment re: bidding procedures updates	0.3	Matt McInerney
11/18/2013	Business Plan	Review 13 week cash flow budget	1.0	Matt McInerney
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call w/ committee counsel prior to committee call	0.8	Matt McInerney
11/20/2013	Diligence	Review new data room files	0.9	Matt McInerney
11/20/2013	Committee	Weekly committee call	1.0	Matt McInerney
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call w/ committee counsel re: KEIP	0.5	Matt McInerney
11/20/2013	Diligence	Review new data room postings	1.3	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Diligence	Review new data room postings	0.4	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Diligence	Prepare KEIP salary summary	0.6	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Meetings	Process update meeting w/ CMAG team	0.6	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call w/ M Manning re: KEIP	0.1	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call w/ DSI re: KEIP	0.5	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Meetings	Internal CMAG meeting and call w/ committee counsel re: KEIP call with DSI	0.5	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Prepare KEIP presentation exhibits	0.6	Matt McInerney
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re KEIP	0.3	Matt McInerney
11/22/2013	Committee	Committee call re: KEIP	0.8	Matt McInerney
11/22/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB and D Posner re: follow up to committee call	0.2	Matt McInerney
11/25/2013	Diligence	Review updated data room materials, incl. 2011 Audit	0.4	Matt McInerney
11/26/2013	Diligence	Review docket (Trustee KEIP objection, DIP letter, retention applications)	0.9	Matt McInerney
11/26/2013	DIP Financing	Review final DIP order	0.3	Matt McInerney
11/26/2013	Meetings	Update call w/ DSI and D&P	0.6	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review new data room files	1.5	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review participation materials from potential bidder	2.0	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call w/ Committee counsel, CB, & MG	0.3	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review D+P marketing process update	0.4	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call w/ DSI and D+P	0.6	Matt McInerney
12/3/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Review cash flow; prepare variance presentation	1.2	Matt McInerney
12/4/2013	Diligence	Review new data room materials	0.8	Matt McInerney
12/4/2013	Committee	Preparation for UCC call	0.3	Matt McInerney
12/4/2013	Committee	Weekly committee call	0.5	Matt McInerney
12/9/2013	Meetings	Discussion with G.F. re auction, bids and APA	0.2	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review new data room materials from 12/5 through 12/10	2.3	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review updated cash flows and marketing process	0.6	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call w/ DSI and D+P	0.9	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Review DIP budget update presentation	0.3	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB, MG, & Otterbourg	0.3	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call w/ P O'Malley at DSI and MG & CB	0.2	Matt McInerney
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review term sheet from potential bidder	0.2	Matt McInerney

38.5

Total

38.5

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
 Michael Gordon - Detailed Timesheet

Date	Task	Description of Activity	Hours	Professional
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with D&P to review marketing process	1.0	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	DIP Financing	Review DIP filings	2.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review CEO 1st day declaration	1.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review APA and bidding procedures	2.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review Otterbourg comments to bid procedures	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ debtor and committee counsels re: bid procedures	1.0	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ Otterbourg re bid procedures	0.3	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Diligence	Prepare supplement to buyer's list and send to D+P	2.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB and G Finizio re bidding procedures	0.2	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Diligence	Review KEIP filings	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/13/2013	Meetings	Call with UCC	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/14/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review stalking horse's revisions to bidding procedures	0.2	Michael Gordon
11/14/2013	Diligence	IB fee research	5.0	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Call with CB re IB fee research	0.4	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review Otterbourg DIP summary	0.4	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Diligence	Review sealed KEIP documents	0.2	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Diligence	Review Duff + Phelps marketing materials	2.0	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Meetings	Call w/ Mark Catania re: revised bidding procedures	0.2	Michael Gordon
11/15/2013	Objections/Declarations	Review G Finizio email and attachment re: bidding procedures updates	0.3	Michael Gordon
11/18/2013	Business Plan	Review 13 week cash flow budget	1.0	Michael Gordon
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call w/ committee counsel prior to committee call	0.8	Michael Gordon
11/20/2013	Diligence	Review new data room files	0.9	Michael Gordon
11/20/2013	Committee	Weekly committee call	1.0	Michael Gordon
11/20/2013	Meetings	Call w/ committee counsel re: KEIP	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/20/2013	Diligence	Review new data room postings	1.3	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Diligence	Additional review of KEIP and schedules	1.2	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Prepare update presentation for Committee	1.3	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Diligence	Review new data room postings	0.4	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Meetings	Process update meeting w/ CMAG team	0.6	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call w/ M Manning re: KEIP	0.1	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call w/ DSL re: KEIP	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Meetings	Internal CMAG meeting and call w/ committee counsel re: KEIP call wit	0.5	Michael Gordon
11/21/2013	Meetings	Call with OSHR re KEIP	0.3	Michael Gordon
11/22/2013	Committee	Committee call re: KEIP	0.8	Michael Gordon
11/22/2013	Meetings	Call w/ CB and D Posner re: follow up to committee call	0.2	Michael Gordon
11/25/2013	Diligence	Review updated data room materials, incl. 2011 Audit	0.4	Michael Gordon
11/26/2013	Diligence	Review docket (Trustee KEIP objection, DIP letter, retention applicatio:	0.9	Michael Gordou
11/26/2013	DIP Financing	Review final DIP order	0.3	Michael Gordou
11/26/2013	Meetings	Update call w/ DSL and D&P	0.6	Michael Gordon
12/2/2013	Meetings	Internal meeting to discuss open items	0.3	Michael Gordon
12/2/2013	Diligence	Reviewed Bid Procedures	0.2	Michael Gordon
12/4/2013	Business Operations	Review of detailed divisional LTC-P&L and BS	2.0	Michael Gordon
12/2/2013	Business Operations	Review of detailed divisional Talon P&L and BS	1.5	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call with counsel to discuss CMAG retention and current bids	0.5	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Business Operations	Review of bidder log and comparison to past	0.4	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Presentations/Analysis	Review cash flow, prepare variance presentation	2.0	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review new data room files	1.5	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review participation materials from potential bidder	0.5	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Diligence	Review D+P marketing process update	0.4	Michael Gordon
12/3/2013	Meetings	Call w/ DSL and D+P	0.6	Michael Gordon
12/4/2013	Committee	Preparation for UCC call	0.4	Michael Gordon
12/4/2013	Committee	Weekly committee call	0.5	Michael Gordon
12/4/2013	Diligence	Review new data room materials	0.7	Michael Gordon
12/9/2013	Meetings	Discussion with G.F. re auction, bidders and APA	0.2	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review cash flow and marketing process update ahead of call	0.4	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Meetings	Cash flow and marketing process update with D+P	0.9	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call with DSL to discuss possible liquidation scenarios	0.4	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Meetings	Call with Otterbourg on feedback from Marathon and bid deadline exte:	0.6	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review new data room materials	1.8	Michael Gordon
12/10/2013	Diligence	Review term sheet from potential bidder	0.3	Michael Gordon
12/11/2013	Diligence	Research comparable medical services bankruptcies for liquidation anal	3.0	Michael Gordon
12/11/2013	Diligence	Put together framework for liquidation analysis based on research	2.5	Michael Gordon

56.9

Total 56.9

Laboratory Partners, Inc.  
 Jen Venable - Detailed Timesheet

Date	Task	Description of Activity	Hours	Professional
11/14/2013	External Research	LIBOR spread research pull plus Leveraged Lending qualitative reports downloaded from S&P LCD for Chuck.	0.2	Jen Venable
Total			0.2	
			0.2	