EXHIBIT A

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION Met-Coil Systems Corporation c/o Charles F. Kuoni, III 711 Ogden Avenue Lisle, IL 60532

JANUARY 15, 2004 5471.001/143591 PAGE 1

REGARDING: BANKRUPTCY

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TUUOMA
I	BANKRUPTCY FILINGS			
12/05/2003	Review and revise pleadings for filing and telephone conferences with J. Carignan, J. Harbour and M. Araki re same (4.20)	KAP	4.20	1,344.00
12/19/2003	Review and revise pleadings (2.0)	KAP	2.90	928.00
12/29/2003	Prepare motion to assume executory contracts, motion to approve access agreement, motions to approve settlement agreement and other motions for filing (5.20)	KAP	5.20	1,664.00
12/30/2003	Review and revise motions for filing (4.20)	KAP	4.20	1,344.00
12/31/2003	Review and revise motions for filing (2.0)	KAP	2.00	640.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY	FILINGS		5,920.00

DIP FINANCING/CASH COLLATERAL

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL S	SYSTEMS CORPORATION			7 15, 2004 01/143591 2
DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/30/2003	Review of correspondence, correspondence with KAP regarding DIP agreement (.3); review of DIP agreement regarding capital expenditures (.4)	KAS	.70	182.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR DIP FINAN	NCING/CASH	COLLATE	182.00
	AUTOMATIC STAY MATTERS			
12/30/2003	Conference with MAZ, ACW and KAP re HVAC motion to modify stay	RXB	.50	257.50
12/31/2003	Conference with ACW re HVAC motion and conference and emails with KAP re same	RXB	.50	257.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR AUTOMATIC	STAY MATT	ERS	515.00
	CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION			
12/01/2003	Meet with KAP re proofs of claim input (.3); input proofs of claim notes into b-linx (3.7)	KAB+	4.00	500.00
12/01/2003	Review and revise omnibus objections to claims (.50); conference with KAB re claim objections (.40); prepare e-mails to M. Araki re same (.30)	KAP	1.20	384.00
12/01/2003	Prepare e-mail to J. Drehrup re LeClercq claim (.10)	KAP	.10	32.00
12/02/2003	Continue inputting proofs of claim notes into b-linx (3.8); e-mails to/from KAP and M. Araki throughout the day re the	KAB+	5.50	687.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TUOMA
	<pre>same (.3); print remaining claims to be reviewed (.2); organize proofs of claim (1.2)</pre>			
12/03/2003	Meet with KAP re proofs of claim notes (.3); finish inputting notes into b-linx (1.6); create charts re claims possibly objected to as executory contracts and b-linx concerns, emails to/from KAP and M. Araki re same (.6); call to M. Araki re same (.3); conference telephonically with M. Araki and KAP re proofs of claim and omnibus objection review (.8); edit notes in b-linx per telephone conference (.6); print additional proofs of claim (.4); locate claims for ACW (.5)	KAB+	5.10	637.50
12/03/2003	Prepare e-mails to C. Kuoni, KAB and M. Araki re proofs of claim and objection process, telephone conferences with them re same and review and revise proofs of claim re same (3.50)	KAP	3.50	1,120.00
12/04/2003	Print attachments from M. Araki e-mail re exhibits to omnibus objection (.1); review proofs of claim and omnibus objection exhibits, note differences between b-linx notes and proofs of claim notes (2.1); meet with KAP re the same (.3); conference telephonically with M. Araki and KAP (.6); continue reviewing proofs of claim and exhibits with KAP (.4)	KAB+	3.50	437.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/04/2003	Telephone conference with KAB and M. Araki re revisions to omnibus objection schedules (1.0); review and revise same (1.40)	KAP	2.40	768.00
12/04/2003	Conferences with C. Kuoni re amendments and omnibus objection schedules (1.50)	KAP	1.50	480.00
12/05/2003	Telephone conference and e-mail with KAP re omnibus objections	RXB	.30	154.50
12/08/2003	Review American Express correspondence re claim (.1); review Second Omnibus Objection to claims (.2); review Third Omnibus objection (.1)	AEW	.40	98.00
12/08/2003	Print proofs of claim for ACW review (.1)	KAB+	.10	12.50
12/08/2003	Prepare e-mails re supplemental bar date and prepare notice re same (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/09/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re claim issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/12/2003	Telephone conference with A. Landis re Mejdrech/Schreiber claims (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/12/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and RXB re Mejdrech/Schreiber claims (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/13/2003	Telephone conference with M. Araki re ballot report (.40); conference with RXB re claims (.10)	KAP	.50	160.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
12/15/2003	Prepare letters to various counsel re claims issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/16/2003	Review and respond to e-mails re proofs of claim (.40); telephone conference with Debt Acquisition re split claims (.20)	KAP	.60	192.00
12/17/2003	Prepare notice of withdrawal (.30); review e-mails re litigation and claim issues (.40); telephone conference with R. Smith re American Express claim (.20); telephone conference with G. Hallam re Hunt demand letter and review same (.20)	KAP	1.10	352.00
12/19/2003	Prepare e-mail re extending deadline for Honeywell to file a reply to our claim objection (.1)	AEW	.10	24.50
12/19/2003	Telephone conference with R. Stodola re TruSeal claim (.10); telephone conference with D. Smith re DuPage County filing proof of claim (.20)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/19/2003	Attend to discovery and reply schedule re Honeywell claim and messages with Honeywell counsel and e-mails to DEM	RXB	.30	154.50
12/23/2003	Conference with counsel for Suburban Moving & Storage (.1); send e-mail to KAP and RXB re extension of time (.1); phone conference with DEM re Honeywell claim objection (.1)	AEW	.30	73.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/23/2003	Draft stipulation re Honeywell extension to file response to objection	DEM	.40	122.00
12/23/2003	Telephone conference with counsel for Puntero re claim and review claim information (.40); telephone conference with E. Liebovich re claim and status of case (.10)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/24/2003	Review docket to see if any responses have been filed to claim objection (.2); review claim of Suburban Moving & Storage (.2); research counsel for Suburban (.2); phone conference with counsel for Suburban Moving & Storage re extension of time to file response to claim objection (.1)	AEW	.70	171.50
12/26/2003	Review reply of the 3rd party defendants to Debtor's claim objection	AEW	.40	98.00
12/29/2003	Review response of third-party claimants to debtor's omnibus claim objection (.4); research cases cited by claimants in their response (.6); research section 502(e)(1)(B)(.4); draft reply memorandum (.9)	AEW	2.30	563.50
12/29/2003	Conference with AEW re reply re contribution claims	RXB	.20	103.00
12/29/2003	Research re cases involving CERCLA and contingent claims for contribution (2.5); correspondence with R. St. John	SKK	3.50	735.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COT	I. SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	re costs to date for LeClercq and Mejdrech suits (0.3); review Third-Party Defendants Proofs of Claim (0.7)			
12/30/2003	Research regarding 502(e) (.5); review cases cited by the Third-Party Defendants in their response (1.0); review the original proofs of claim (.5); draft response in support of first substantive omnibus claim objection (2.5)	AEW	4.50	1,102.50
12/30/2003	Review response to contribution claim objections and related documents in preparation for argument	RXB	.60	309.00
12/31/2003	Research re section 502(e)(1)(B) and 502(b)(.4); review claimants' proofs of claim and response(.5); conference with RXB(.2); draft and revise reply memorandum (2.0); draft motion for leave to file a reply brief(.5); conference with RXB re same (.2); conference with J. Harbour(.1); send e-mail to RXB and KAP with a draft of the brief(.2); prepare exhibits to the brief(.3); send e-mail to J. Harbour re same(.1)	AEW	4.50	1,102.50
12/31/2003	Locate claims for N. Peterman and calls to/from B-linx tech support (1.2); print claims (.4)	KAB+	1.60	200.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION
----------	---------	-------------

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/31/2003	Conference with AEW and review response re contribution claims (0.5) and conference with KAP re handling objections to other claims (0.2)	RXB	.70	360.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CLAIMS ADM	MINISTRAT	ION	11,967.50
	ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS			
12/02/2003	Office conference with RXB re Honeywell motion (.2); correspond with Mestek counsel re same (.2)	DEM	.40	122.00
12/03/2003	Conference with DEM re status of Travelers and Honeywell matters (.3)	AEW	.30	73.50
12/03/2003	E-mails with F. Citera, A. Kole, DEM, etc. re handling of Honeywell argument	RXB	.30	154.50
12/05/2003	Prepare for hearing on Motion for Summary Judgment and Motion to Dismiss in Honeywell	DEM	.30	91.50
12/08/2003	Assist RXB to prepare for hearing on Honeywell	AEW	.50	122.50
12/09/2003	Re Honeywell adversary, review briefs and prepare oral argument	RXB	2.50	1,287.50
12/10/2003	Conference with KAP regarding the Court's rulings in the Honeywell Adversary(.1); conference with DEM re same (.2)	AEW	.30	73.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/10/2003	Correspond with KAP and RXB re December 10 hearing (.2); office conference with AEW re remaining issues and discovery	DEM	.30	91.50
12/11/2003	Telephone conference with F. Citera re status of Honeywell matter and negotiations	RXB	.20	103.00
12/15/2003	Correspond with KAP and RXB re discovery (.6); correspond with A. Cole re same (.4); review Honeywell's written discovery (.5)	DEM	1.50	457.50
12/15/2003	Re Honeywell, review discovery and emails with KAP and DEM re same	RXB	.60	309.00
12/16/2003	Office conference with KAP and RXB re Honeywell discovery and strategy (.3); draft correspondence to R. Scheel and R. Blakeman re same (.3); review discovery requests (.4); office conference with CSC re discovery (.3); telephone conference with A. Cole re discovery and strategy (.4)	D EM	1.70	518.50
12/17/2003	Telephone conference with R. Scheel re responses to discovery (.3); review indemnity agreement (.3); investigate background facts (.3)	DEM	.90	274.50
12/18/2003	Review discovery request in Honeywell adversary	AEW	.20	49.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TNUOMA
12/18/2003	Prepare responses to discovery (.3); interview R. Blakeman (.4); interview R. Draebeck (.4); investigate background facts on negotiation of agreement and litigation (1); review Mestek discovery requests (.4); correspond with D. Biederman (.5)	DEM	3.00	915.00
12/19/2003	Telephone conference with R. Blakeman re response to discovery (.2); interview with J. Delvecchio (.5); review October 1994 board minutes (.3); strategize re discovery deadlines (.5); telephone conference with K. O'Neil re extensions (.3)	DEM	1.80	549.00
12/22/2003	Correspond with opposing counsel re stipulation	DEM	.20	61.00
12/23/2003	Review draft stipulation with Honeywell (.1); verify accuracy of information contained in the stipulation with respect to claim objection (.2); send e-mail re same (.1)	AEW	.40	98.00
12/23/2003	Correspond with opposing counsel re stipulation (.3); review and revise stipulations (1); telephone conference with local counsel re filing (.2); draft correspondence re stipulation (.3)	DEM	1.80	549.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/24/2003	Correspond with local counsel re stipulation (.3); telephone conference and correspondence with opposing counsel re stipulation (.3); review discovery (.4); interview D. Biederman re negotiation of indemnity agreement (.4); draft correspondence to R. Scheel re status and discovery requests (.8)	DEM	2.20	671.00
12/30/2003	Review notice of deposition and plaintiffs' discovery requests (.5); telephone conference with M. Prewitt re discovery (.6); correspond with D. Biederman re same (.4)	DEM	1.50	457.50
12/31/2003	Review recent case law on indemnification agreement liability	DEM	.30	91.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ADVERSARY	PROCEED	INGS	7,120.00
(CORPORATE MATTERS			
12/01/2003	Telephone conferences with J. Carignan and C. Kuoni re monthly operating report and prepare same (.60)	KAP	.60	192.00
12/03/2003	Prepare documents for Committee (.70)	KAP	.70	224.00
12/03/2003	Review and revise solicitation letter for stock auction	RXB	1.00	515.00
12/04/2003	Attend bi-weekly meeting (1.50)	KAP	1.50	480.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	YTTA	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/08/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re valuation (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/11/2003	Prepare e-mail re reclamation order and notice (.10); conference with KAB re claims sent to Committee and prepare e-mail re same (.20)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/11/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re claim against London distributor and conference with CSC re research re same	RXB	.20	103.00
12/15/2003	Telephone conference with K. Funk re water suppression line issues (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/15/2003	Telephone conference with D. Lerst re water bill (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/15/2003	Review and revise CBIZ letter (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/16/2003	Telephone conference with K. Funk, A. Bourlard, RXB and C. Kuoni re water suppression line (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/16/2003	Review and prepare e-mail re valuation report (1.30)	KAP	1.30	416.00
12/16/2003	Review valuation report and KAP and C. Kuoni emails re same	RXB	.50	257.50
12/17/2003	Research re jurisdiction question for RXB	CSC	4.50	787.50
12/17/2003	Prepare correspondence re documents to Committee (.10)	KAP	.10	32.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/18/2003	Research re jurisdiction question for RXB	CSC	3.50	612.50
12/30/2003	Attend telephonic board meeting (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/30/2003	Attend telephonic board meeting	RXB	.70	360.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CORPORATE	MATTERS		4,844.00
	TAX MATTERS			•
12/05/2003	Work on property tax timing issues and prepare e-mail to client re same	FHC	.40	148.00
12/10/2003	Work on property tax matter	FHC	.20	74.00
12/12/2003	Office conferences with FHC re appeal of tax assessment (0.2); review DuPage County Board of Review rules and place call to Board of Review re same (0.3)	CDB	.50	105.00
12/23/2003	Place call to DuPage County Board of Review re timing of assessment appeal (0.2); attention to appraisal and notes (0.2); draft email to FHC re same and status (0.1)	CDB	.50	105.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TAX MATTE	RS		432.00
	ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS			
12/02/2003	Telephone conference with K. Mack and K. Funk re conversation with B. Wallace, and telephone conference and emails with KAP re same	RXB	1.10	566.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/05/2003	Telephone conference with S. Bezark re hook up costs (.10); telephone conference with K. Mack re access agreement and IEPA issues (.50)	KAP	.60	192.00
12/18/2003	Attend and reply to e-mails re access agreements	RXB	.20	103.00
12/23/2003	Telephone conference with K. Mack and S. Bezark re environmental issues (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/29/2003	Telephone conference with K. Mack re environmental issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/31/2003	Review IEPA term sheet and telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONM	ENTAL MAT	TERS	1,245.50
	ENVIRONMENTAL LITIGATION			
12/01/2003	Review documents provided by Baker & Mckenzie	DME+	.30	30.00
12/01/2003	Review Third-Party Defendants' Reply Brief re Motion to Strike (0.3)	SKK	.30	63.00
12/02/2003	Review hearing transcripts with SSK (0.5); teleconferences with SKK re production to Third-Party Defendants (0.3); review documents related to third parties and discovery requests (.6)		1.20	120.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
12/02/2003	Telephone call with D. Sanders re Clayton engagement letters	DME+	.70	70.00
12/02/2003	Conference with SKK re discovery status (.3); review same (.6)	MAZ	.90	333.00
12/02/2003	Review hearing transcripts (0.5); teleconferences with G. Rovner re document production (0.5); teleconferences with DME re production to Third-Party Defendants (0.3); conference with MAZ re discovery status and consolidation (0.3)	SKK	1.60	336.00
12/04/2003	Teleconference with SKK re discovery issues (.2); review same (.6)	MAZ	.80	296.00
12/08/2003	Teleconference with R. Gibson at Lindy Manufacturing (0.2); conference with MAZ re discovery responses (0.3)	SKK	.50	105.00
12/09/2003	Teleconference with B. Lamer (counsel for Ames Supply Co.) re discovery extension (0.3); teleconference with opposing counsel representing Downers Grove Sanitary District re Met-Coil's discovery requests (0.3); conference with MAZ re 30(b)(6) deposition notices (0.2); review discovery in underlying actions (0.5); conferences with DME re 30(b)(6) notices (0.3); draft riders for 30(b)(6) deposition notices (1.5)	SKK	3.10	651.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORE	ORATION
-----------------------	---------

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/10/2003	Multiple conferences with SKK re consolidation (.4); conference with SKK re depositions of contributors and review notices re same (.4)	MAZ	.80	296.00
12/10/2003	Review Third-Party Defendants discovery requests (1.1); review discovery responses (0.8); teleconferences with B. Lamer (Ames Supply Co.) re extension of time re discovery deadline (0.5); draft motion to extend discovery deadline (1.4); teleconference with H. Haitjema (0.3); multiple conferences with MAZ re consolidation (0.4); conference with MAZ re depositions of contributors (.3)	SKK	4.80	1,008.00
12/11/2003	Teleconference with J. Leinenweber's clerk re correction letter (0.2); review and assist with responses to Third-Party Defendants' discovery requests (1); teleconferences with R. St. John (0.6); conference with SKK re discovery responses from Downers Grove Sanitary District (.3)	DME+	2.10	210.00
12/11/2003	Review motion to extend discovery date (.3); review various substitution motions (.1); review third party motion to strike expert (.3); review discovery strategy (.3)	MAZ	1.00	370.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET T	COTT.	CVCTTMC	CORPORATION
141 L'	LLUIII	- מושבונים ו	CORPORALION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/11/2003	Teleconference with J. Leinenweber's clerk re correction letter (0.2); review and outline Third-Party Defendants' discovery requests (1); teleconferences with R. St. John (0.6); teleconference with opposing counsel (Downers Grove Sanitary District) re discovery requests (0.2); teleconference with B. Lamer (0.2); review materials from H. Haitjema (1.5)	SKK	3.70	777.00
12/12/2003	Assist SKK in preparation of responses to Third-Party Defendants' discovery requests (4.0); review documents for potential production (.3)	DME+	4.30	430.00
12/12/2003	Conference with SKK re discovery continuances and strategy and review same (.8); review discovery propounded on MetCoil with SKK (.8); review additional expert issues and related discovery with SKK (.3); conference with expert re discovery (.5); conference with SKK re expert issues (.5); review and revise discovery responses to third parties (1.2); conference with DME re same (.5)	MAZ	4.60	1,702.00
12/12/2003	Correspondence with opposing counsel re discovery deadline extension and follow-up teleconference with B. Lamer re same (1); conference with MAZ re same (0.2); conferences with	SKK	8.70	1,827.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
	MAZ re discovery responses and objections and letter from Jones Day re Third-Party Defendants' failure to respond to discovery (1.5); draft edit and prepare Met-Coil's discovery responses and conferences with MAZ re same and related issues (4.0); teleconferences with R. St. John (0.5); teleconference with H. Haitjema (1.5)			
12/15/2003	Review pleadings and production documents for SKK (1.2); conference with SKK re potential discovery dispute and related documents (0.5); document review for SKK re discovery dispute (1.1); organize additional materials received from Baker & MacKenzie (0.9)	DME+	3.70	370.00
12/15/2003	Review Magistrate Schenkier's Scheduling Order and discovery requests and responses for all parties (1.8); draft and edit correspondence to J. Leinenweber (0.5); draft and edit correspondence to opposing counsel re failure to respond to discovery and untimeliness of Third-Party Defendants' discovery (2.7); correspondence with MAZ re edits to letter re discovery (0.5); conference with DME re production of documents (0.5); review documents for production to opposing counsel (0.5); review correspondence from opposing	SKK	7.30	1,533.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	counsel, follow-up correspondence with MAZ re same (0.8)			
12/16/2003	Draft letter for document production and preparation for service of same (1.2); conference with MAZ re protective orders and discovery dispute (0.2); search for same (0.7); conference with SKK re document production (0.7); organization of document production from all parties received from Baker & MacKenzie (2)	DME+	4.80	480.00
12/16/2003	Review documents re outstanding disputes (0.5); conference with SKK re same (.8); conference with DME re protective order (.2); review issues and research re inadvertent disclosure (1); correspondence with SKK re same (.6); conference with former counsel re same (.2); conference with SKK re consultants (0.7); conference with SKK re hearing and potential work on product issue (.8); review pleadings re expert issues (0.5)	MAZ	5.30	1,961.00
12/16/2003	Conferences with DME re documents produced to Third-Party Defendants (0.5); correspondence with MAZ re correspondence from Foley & Lardner (0.3); conference with RXB, KAP, DEM, and AEW re case strategy (0.5); conference with MAZ re discovery dispute (0.8);	SKK	8.50	1,785.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
	preparation for conference call with H. Haitjema (0.2); teleconference with H. Haitjema (0.6); conference with MAZ re consultants (0.7); review Rules of Professional Conduct (0.3); correspondence with R. St. John (0.2); teleconference with M. Ripani (0.3); correspondence with D. Biederman (0.2); conference with MAZ re potential work product and hearing before J. Leinenweber (0.8); edit correspondence to G. Rovner (0.3); review documents for production to opposing counsel (2.8)			
12/17/2003	Conferences with SKK re document production (0.4); review J. Leinenweber's consolidation memorandum opinion (0.3); organization of document production received by Baker & McKenzie (.5	DME+	1.20	120.00
12/17/2003	Search for Investigative Reports and correspondence re same per SKK (1)	LMR+	1.00	100.00
12/17/2003	Conference with SKK re consolidation and discovery strategy (.5); attended hearing re same (.8); conference with SKK re case strategy and discovery (.8); review same (.5); review bill (.5); conference with SKK re potential inadvertent disclosure issue (.5); letter to third party defendants re inadvertent disclosure (.5);	MAZ	5.20	1,924.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	review protective order re same (.4); review issues re motion to strike (.7)			
12/17/2003	Review discovery responses of Downers Grove Sanitary District	MAZ	.40	148.00
12/17/2003	Conference with MAZ re consolidation hearing and discovery strategy (0.5); attend hearing before J. Leinenweber on consolidation (0.8); review J. Leinenweber's consolidation memorandum opinion (0.3); conferences with MAZ re consolidation schedule and case strategy (0.8); conference with MAZ re potential inadvertent disclosure issue (0.5); conferences with DME re documents produced (0.4)	SKK	2.50	525.00
12/18/2003	Rearrange discovery boxes and label accordingly (3)	LMR+	3.00	300.00
12/18/2003	Conference with SKK re experts (.3); conference with D. Biederman and SKK (.2); review outstanding discovery issues (.6)	MAZ	1.10	407.00
12/18/2003	Teleconference with MAZ and D. Biederman (0.2); conference with MAZ re experts (0.3); teleconferences with S. Engle (Downers Grove Sanitary District) re discovery requests and Motion to Dismiss without prejudice (0.4); research re statute of limitations and discovery rule (1.2); document	SKK	3.40	714.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MPT.	COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION	[
171125 T	LLLU	C3 1 C3 1 E3 12 C3	CONFORMATION	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
	review of past production from Third-Party Defendants (1.3)			
12/19/2003	Search for documents in archived boxes per SKK (4)	LMR+	4.00	400.00
12/19/2003	Multiple conferences with SKK re discovery dispute (.8); conference with SKK re deposition notices, expert, discovery schedule (.3)	MAZ	1.10	407.00
12/19/2003	Teleconference with R. St. John and Clayton personnel (0.6); conferences with MAZ re discovery dispute and discovery schedule (1.1); research re inadvertent disclosure (2.6)	SKK	4.30	903.00
12/21/2003	Research re inadvertent disclosure (3)	SKK	3.00	630.00
12/22/2003	Conferences with DJC re inadvertent disclosure (0.4); research re inadvertent disclosure (6.3); review materials from H. Haitjema (0.3); teleconference with H. Haitjema (0.8)	SKK	7.80	1,638.00
12/23/2003	Continue to reorganize and rebox documents sent to GK from Chuhak (3); pull documents as specified by SKK (1)	LMR+	4.00	400.00
12/23/2003	Draft and edit correspondence to G. Rovner re inadvertent disclosure (2.3); review discovery proposal by Third-Party Defendants and review orders re previous schedule (0.5); correspondence	SKK	4.30	903.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	with MAZ re proposed discovery schedule and Met-Coil's response (0.3); document review of past production from Third-Party Defendants (1.2)			
12/24/2003	Edit and send correspondence to G. Rovner re inadvertent disclosure (0.3); document review of past production from Third-Party Defendants (1)	SKK	1.30	273.00
12/29/2003	Correspondence and teleconferences with consultants (2.7); review materials from consultants (0.5); read additional cases on inadvertent disclosure (1.2)	SKK	4.40	924.00
12/30/2003	Correspondence and teleconferences with consultants (2.3); review materials from consultants (0.7); correspondence with MAZ re joint response to Met-Coil's letter re inadvertent disclosure and use of attorney work product in Delaware bankruptcy filing (0.5); draft correspondence to G. Rovner re inadvertently disclosed work product (1.5)	SKK	5.00	1,050.00
12/31/2003	Sorting boxes from Chuhak and labeling contents (5)	LMR+	5.00	500.00
12/31/2003	Conference with SKK re expert issues	MAZ	.60	222.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TNUOMA
12/31/2003	Edits to correspondence to G. Rovner re inadvertent disclosure (0.7); conference with MAZ re expert issues (0.6); teleconference with opposing counsel re discovery schedule (0.3)	SKK	1.60	336.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONME	NTAL LITI	GATION	27,577.00
:	BANKRUPTCY HEARINGS			
12/04/2003	Revise agenda for hearing (.70); conference with N. Peterman and RXB re same (.30)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/08/2003	Prepare for hearing (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/09/2003	Prepare for hearing (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/10/2003	Prepare for and attend omnibus hearing (3.80)	KAP	3.80	1,216.00
12/10/2003	Omnibus hearing and preparation for and participation in Honeywell argument and other matters on call	RXB	3.70	1,905.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTO	Y HEARING	5	3,761.50
	FEE APPLICATIONS (GK)			
12/05/2003	Revise fee application (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/07/2003	Review and revise fee application (.90)	KAP	.90	288.00
12/11/2003	Review and revise billing entries and make sure time is placed in proper category	AEW	.40	98.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET -	COTT.	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION
11111			

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/16/2003	Begin drafting fee application (.6); calls to accounting re fee statement status (.1)	KAB+	.70	87.50
12/19/2003	Attention to Met-Coil fee application, call to accounting re the same	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/23/2003	Review and compare revised proforma with edited version and edit/revise proforma	KAB+	3.10	387.50
12/24/2003	Continue to revise fee statement/application	KAB+	1.60	200.00
12/29/2003	Calls to accounting re November proforma, e-mail KAP re the same	KAB+	.30	37.50
12/30/2003	Calls to/from accounting re November proforma (.3); review revised proforma (1.2); calculate hours and amounts for fee application, and continue drafting fee application (2); correspond with KAP re fee application (.3); pdf fee application and e-mail to J. Harbour and C. Kuoni (.4)	KAB+	4.20	525.00
12/30/2003	Review and revise fee application for filing (.80)	KAP	.80	256.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLIC	ATIONS	(GK)	2,038.00
	FEE APPLICATIONS (NON-GK)			
12/09/2003	Review fee applications of Committe and Legal Representative (.60)	KAP	.60	192.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLIC	ATIONS	(NON-GK)	192.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

METER COTT	CVCTEMS	CORPORATION
MTGT ~ COLL	- M Y M C M D	COMEDIA

			PAGE	20
DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
Ē	LAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			
12/01/2003	Review and revise Honeywell and Travelers descriptions	DEM	.80	244.00
12/01/2003	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re plan and litigation issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/01/2003	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Plan and Glossary of Terms (6.60)	KAP	6.60	2,112.00
12/01/2003	Telephone conference with creditors re claim and plan questions (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/01/2003	Review and revise plan and telephone conferences and emails with KAP re same	RXB	1.50	772.50
12/02/2003	Prepare for future claims representative meeting (.80); attend future claimants representative meeting (6.80); telephone conferences with RXB re same (.40); conference with S. Bezark, N. Peterman and F. Citera re same (.70)	KAP	8.70	2,784.00
12/02/2003	Various telephone conferences with KAP re meeting with experts for future claimants representative	RXB	.60	309.00
12/03/2003	Telephone conference with RXB and C. Kuoni re futures meeting, objections to claims, plan issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION
----------	---------	-------------

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	Telephone conference with N. Peterman et al. re objections to disclosure statement (1.0); telephone conference with N. Peterman, B. Wallace, J. Specter and T. Krueger re questions on plan/disclosure statement (1.0)	KAP	2.00	640.00
12/05/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman, RXB, M. Harrison, M. Araki, R. Beck re disclosure statement hearing (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/05/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and KAP re plan strategy, objections to disclosure statement and continuance of hearing, and sale procedures	RXB	.50	257.50
12/07/2003	Review Honeywell objection to sales procedures motion	RXB	.40	206.00
12/08/2003	Confer with RXB re developments and options	APS	.20	103.00
12/08/2003	Conferences with RXB re plan, objections to disclosure statement and litigation issues (2.0); telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (.80)	KAP	2.80	896.00
12/08/2003	Telephone conference with RXB and C. Kuoni re claimant issue and status of plan issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/08/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni and KAP and draft memo re plan alternatives (1.5); review objections to disclosure	RXB	1.80	927.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	statement and sale procedures (0.3)			
12/09/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, F. Citera and T. Cairns re futures number (.50); conference with N. Peterman and F. Citera re hearing and plan issues (.50); conference with RXB re same (.70)	KAP	1.70	544.00
12/09/2003	Conference with KAP re her conferences with Mestek and Future Claims Representative lawyers	RXB	.50	257.50
12/11/2003	Review claim charts and prepare listings of objections and class members for plan and voting (3.20)	KAP	3.20	1,024.00
12/12/2003	Further consideration to options in view of developments in court	APS	.30	154.50
12/12/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman re plan issues (.30); telephone conference with N. Peterman, RXB and E. Herron re status of futures work and comments to plan/disclosure statement (.80); prepare and revise claims charts for plan and voting (3.10)	KAP	4.20	1,344.00
12/12/2003	Telephone conference with E. Herron , N. Peterman, KAP etc. re plan terms and future claimants report (0.5); telephone conference with N. Peterman and KAP re claims and voting issues re settled claims	RXB	1.30	669.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	and review settlement agreement (0.7)			
12/13/2003	E-mails re plan modifications to deal with personal injury claims and re settled claims	RXB	.70	360.50
12/15/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re futures issues (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/15/2003	Conference with KAP re revising plan and scheduling	RXB	.20	103.00
12/16/2003	Conference with RXB re futures issues (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/17/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re futures issues (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/18/2003	Work with RXB re options and developments	APS	.10	51.50
12/18/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re plan terms and related issues	RXB	.50	257.50
12/19/2003	Update re negotiating developments and confer with RXB and KAP re strategy	APS	.20	103.00
12/19/2003	Conference with KAP re plan negotiations with various parties and strategy	RXB	.40	206.00
12/29/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman and RXB re plan and disclosure statement and other issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/29/2003	Review trust distribution procedures (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

PALES LLD	COTT	CVCCTTTMC	CORPORATION
1AI H∴ I . —	(()	S V S T HIVE	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PLAN/DIS	SCLOSURE S	STATEMENT	16,246.00
,	TRAVEL			
12/02/2003	Travel to Delaware for future claims representative meeting (4.0)	KAP	4.00	1,280.00
12/03/2003	Travel from Delaware (4.50)	KAP	4.50	1,440.00
12/04/2003	Travel to/from Lisle Facility (2.30)	KAP	2.30	736.00
12/09/2003	Travel to Wilmington for hearing (4.70)	KAP	4.70	1,504.00
12/09/2003	Travel to Wilmington for omnibus hearing	RXB	1.70	875.50
12/10/2003	Travel from Wilmington (5.90)	KAP	5.90	1,888.00
12/10/2003	Travel from Wilmington	RXB	4.00	2,060.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TRAVEL			9,783.50
:	EMPLOYEE MATTERS			
12/05/2003	Review e-mail re union negotiation status	MLS	.10	32.50
12/08/2003	Attention to e-mail from C. Kuoni re labor negotiations	MLS	.10	32.50
12/10/2003	Review letter from union	MLS	.10	32.50
12/11/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re labor issues (.2); review e-mails and fax re same (.4); research latest cases re same (.5)	MLS	1.10	357.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/12/2003	Research mandatory subject cases re health care issues (.80); e-mails with client re negotiations (.20)	MLS	1.00	325.00
12/15/2003	Review e-mails from, confer with client regarding and research re union contract and negotiation issues and strategy	MLS	2.50	812.50
12/19/2003	Review fax from C. Kuoni re union demands	MLS	.30	97.50
12/23/2003	Review e-mail of CBA and summary of negotiation points from client (.40); conference call re same (.60)	MLS	1.00	325.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE	MATTERS		2,015.00
	INSURANCE/REGULATORY MATTERS			
12/01/2003	Draft objection to Travelers' Motion to Defer Judgment and their Response to Debtor's Motion to Assume Settlement Agreement.	AEW	4.60	1,127.00
12/01/2003	Review KAP comments to revised brief on motion to transfer	DEM	.30	91.50
12/02/2003	Conference with DEM regarding objection and response to Travelers on Motion to Assume (.5); research re same (.4); review and revise objection (.3); send e-mail re same (.2)	AEW	1.40	343.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS COR	RPORATION
----------------------	-----------

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/02/2003	Conference with DEM regarding objection to Travelers' motion to abstain (.2); review revised motion (.3); send e-mail re same (.1)	AEW	.60	147.00
12/02/2003	Review and revise motion to transfer (2.5); telephone conference with AEW re same (.1); revise objection to motion to defer (2); telephone conference with AEW re same (.5); correspond with F. Citera re same (.3)	DEM	5.40	1,647.00
12/02/2003	Telephone conferences with R. Millner and KAP re Travelers settlement (0.6); review draft response to Travelers objection to motion to assume (0.5)	RXB	.90	463.50
12/03/2003	Send e-mail to DEM re motion to transfer venue and motion to file brief in excess of fifteen pages (.1)	AEW	.10	24.50
12/03/2003	Review Mestek's revisions to Motion to Transfer venue (.2)	AEW	.20	49.00
12/03/2003	Correspond with R. Bahe-Jachna, N. Peterman, J. Carignan re Objection to Motion to Defer (.7); correspond with RXB and AEW re motion to transfer and supporting memorandum (.6); office conference with KAP re edits to motions (.2); prepare motions for filing (1); draft motion for leave to file exhibit under seal and restricted under Rule 5005-4	DEM	5.90	1,799.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	(.4); revise motion to transfer (1); respond to committee's request for copy of settlement agreement, and office conferences with RXB and KAP re same (.8); review and revise Greenberg comments on motion and memorandum of law, incorporate same (1); review and revise letter to Creditors' committee (.2)			
12/03/2003	Review and revise Travelers pleadings (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/03/2003	Deal with confidentiality issue	RXB	.90	463.50
12/03/2003	Review brief in support of motion to transfer and e-mail DEM with comments (0.7); call to R. Millner re settlement possibility (0.1)	RXB	.80	412.00
12/04/2003	Telephone conferences with clerk of court re filing	DEM	.40	122.00
12/08/2003	Conference with DEM regarding potential settlement with Travelers (.2); review Travelers reply in support of its motion to defer judgment (.4); review settlement letter from counsel for Travelers (.2); assist RXB to prepare for hearing on 12/10 re Travelers (.3)	AEW	1.10	269.50
12/08/2003	Correspond with K. Martin re Travelers' briefing issues (.3); office conference with RXB re same and December 10	DEM	1.90	579.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TUUOMA
	hearing (.2); review KAP edits on Travelers' briefing (.2); correspond with K. Martin re same (.3); review Travelers' reply in support of motion to defer (.3); prepare for Travelers' hearings (.6)			
12/08/2003	Review and revise Travelers pleading (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/08/2003	Conferences with KAP and DEM re Travelers settlement and review settlement letter (0.5); review and draft e-mail re memo re Lindy litigation (0.7)	RXB	1.20	618.00
12/09/2003	Conference with DEM re motion to transfer venue	AEW	.20	49.00
12/09/2003	Prepare for and present motion to transfer before Judge Sonderby (1.5); prepare minute order (.4); office conferences with RXB and AEW re same (.3); review Traveler's reply brief on motion to defer Met-Coil's motion to assume (.5); review R. Bahe-Jachna's edits to Mestek's Response to Travelers' Request for Hearing in Iowa (.3); correspond with RXB, KAP and R. Bahe-Jachna re additional edits in light of Judge Sonderby's order transferring the Illinois case to Delaware (.7)	DEM	3.70	1,128.50
12/09/2003	Conferences with DEM, N. Peterman and F. Citera re motion to transfer Travelers Illinois action (0.5); e-mails	RXB	1.60	824.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MÉT-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	re Mestek pleading in Iowa action and review and comment on same (1.0); telephone message to R. Beck re Travelers motion (0.1)			
12/10/2003	Review revised Mestek pleading in Iowa Travelers' litigation (.3); correspond with R. Bahe-Jachna re same (.4)	DEM	.70	213.50
12/10/2003	Conference with R. Millner, et al. re settlement and telephone conference with R. Beck re same	RXB	.80	412.00
12/11/2003	Review Travelers reply in support of their motion to abstain (.20)	AEW	.20	49.00
12/12/2003	Review Travelers' reply in support of their motion for abstention and remand (.4); send e-mail to DEM re same (.1)	AEW	.50	122.50
12/12/2003	Review Travelers' reply in support of abstention and remand	DEM	.50	152.50
12/12/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, F. Citera, K. Martin and J. Berkeley re ACE (.80)	KAP	.80	256.00
12/15/2003	Review and revise AIG settlement agreement (1.40)	KAP	1.40	448.00
12/15/2003	Exchange of e-mails re Lindy matter with KAP and K. Martin (0.2); review and comment on draft AIG agreement and (0.4); attend to re CGU settlement negotiations (0.2)	RXB	.80	412.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
12/16/2003	Office conference with RXB and KAP re Travelers' litigation and settlement discussions	DEM	.20	61.00
12/16/2003	Conference call with J. Hooven, J. Berkeley, S. Bezark, N. Peterman and RXB re plan and potential settlement (.80); telephone conference with J. Berkeley, S. Bezark, N. Peterman and RXB re same and AIG settlement agreement draft (1.20)	KAP	2.00	640.00
12/16/2003	Attend to e-mails re ACE and CGU negotiations (0.5); conference call re insurance settlement and follow up call with co-counsel (0.7); attend to e-mail re Lindy hearing (0.1)	RXB	1.30	669.50
12/17/2003	Attend ACE conference call (.60); telephone conference with J. Berkeley and K. Martin re same and AIG memo (.30); attend AIG preparation conference call (1.0)	KAP	1.90	608.00
12/17/2003	Telephone conference with F. Citera re ACE and AIG negotiations (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/17/2003	Conference call re AIG settlement meeting and conference with KAP re same	RXB	1.00	515.00
12/18/2003	Attention to insurance settlements and motion to approve	APS	.20	103.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD
TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM
55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-C	OTT.	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/18/2003	Prepare for and attend AIG settlement meeting and conferences with RXB and C. Kuoni re same (7.8)	KAP	7.80	2,496.00
12/18/2003	Conference with KAP and APS re AIG settlement and documenting same	RXB	.50	257.50
12/19/2003	Review KAP comments to draft agreement and discuss same with KAP (0.3); review revised motion for stay of Iowa litigation (0.2); conference with KAP re Travelers and leave message for R. Millner re same (0.1)	RXB	.60	309.00
12/20/2003	Review insurance settlement draft in anticipation of preparation of draft seeking approval	APS	.20	103.00
12/29/2003	Conference with KAP re status of settlement motion re insurance (.1)	APS	.10	51.50
12/30/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman, J. Berkeley, S. Bezark re revisions to AIG Settlement Agreement and review and revise same (3.0)	KAP	3.00	960.00
12/30/2003	Review draft AIG settlement agreement and e-mail to and conference with KAP re same	RXB	.80	412.00
12/31/2003	Telephone conferences with J. Berkeley, N. Peterman, M. Hynes, E. Freed and W. McVisk re settlement agreement and	KAP	2.00	640.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	revise same (2.0)			
12/31/2003	Conference with KAP re motion and agreement re AIG settlement	RXB	.30	154.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR INSURANCE	/REGULATORY	MATTE	20,459.50
(CASE ADMINISTRATION			
12/01/2003	Locate Travelers case referred to the bankruptcy court and e-mail DEM re the same (.4); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.60	75.00
12/01/2003	Telephone conference with RXB re status (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/02/2003	Locate and print solicitation motion from court docket and have copies made (.5); draft letter re requests for motion, revise and edit the same (.5); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	1.20	150.00
12/03/2003	Attention to letter re solicitation motion and create labels for mailing (.4); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.60	75.00
12/03/2003	Meet with SKK re proof of claim form and information needed (.3)	KAB+	.30	37.50
12/03/2003	Respond to numerous e-mails and prepare documents re litigation and corporate issues (2.0)	KAP	2.00	640.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/03/2003	Conference with KAP and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re various issues, including committee financial advisor site visit, need for board meeting, plan issues, status of negotiations with future claimants representative, claims adjudications process, and other matters	RXB	1.40	721.00
12/03/2003	Conference with KAP re Proofs of Claim (0.3)	SKK	.30	63.00
12/04/2003	Call from D. Quinlan re proof of claim forms and bar date notices (.3); call and e-mail to M. Araki re the same (.2)	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/04/2003	Telephone conference with RXB re status (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/05/2003	Organize proofs of claim into binders for file room (.4); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2); print proofs of claim forms for ACW (.2)	KAB+	.80	100.00
12/05/2003	Respond to e-mails and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re various issues (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/05/2003	Attend to emails and telephone conference with KAP re various pending matters	RXB	.50	257.50
12/07/2003	Review and respond to RXB e-mails re various case issues (.10)	KAP	.10	32.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/07/2003	Attend to and deal with numerous e-mails related to various matters, including Travelers settlement, IEPA negotiations, claims handling, Padhiar action and staffing issues	RXB	1.20	618.00
12/08/2003	Call from D. Quinlan re proof of claim notice and concerns (.2); e-mail KAP and conference call with KAP and D. Quinlan re the same (.3); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.70	87.50
12/08/2003	Print fee applications from court docket (.2)	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/08/2003	Conference with KAP re various pending matters	RXB	.50	257.50
12/09/2003	Review various items filed in case	WEA	.30	73.50
12/09/2003	Print proofs of claim and claim register for R. Beck (2.8); calls to BMC re b-linx (.2); draft letter to R. Beck re same and e-mail KAP for review (.6); organize proofs of claims and have copies made (.2); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2); print pleading per KAP e-mail (.1)	KAB+	4.10	512.50
12/09/2003	Prepare and respond to e-mails re various litigation, hearing and plan issues (.70); conferences with RXB re same	KAP	1.00	320.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
	(.30)			
12/10/2003	File motion at district court for SKK	AXK+	.30	22.50
12/10/2003	Review proofs of claim to be mailed to R. Beck and edit letter re the same (.9); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	1.10	137.50
12/10/2003	Begin preparing proof of claim form for Met-Coil in Dynagear case	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/10/2003	Respond to e-mails re various case matters (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/11/2003	Review various items filed in case (.10)	AEW	.10	24.50
12/11/2003	Attention to proof of claim issues (.5) fax claim to R. Beck (.1)	KAB+	.60	75.00
12/11/2003	Create tabs and insert omnibus objections as well as the claims set forth into redwells (.6) e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.80	100.00
12/11/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re hearing and status of various administrative issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/11/2003	Conferences with RXB re status (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/11/2003	Review reclamation order CNO and e-mail re same (0.2)	RXB	.20	103.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/12/2003	Print fee application of Parente Randolph, pdf and e-mail to C. Kuoni (.4); e-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2); call from individual re Met-Coil questions (.4)	KAB+	1.00	125.00
12/15/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2); print additional proofs of claim from b-linx (3)	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/15/2003	E-mail SKK re proof of claim status	KAB+	.10	12.50
12/15/2003	Conferences with RXB re status (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/15/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman re numerous status issues (.80)	KAP	.80	256.00
12/16/2003	Attend bi-weekly team meeting	AEW	.60	147.00
12/16/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/16/2003	Conference with RXB re status (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/16/2003	Attend bi-weekly meeting (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/16/2003	Staff meeting re status and strategy and conference with KAP re negotiations with future claims representative	RXB	.80	412.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/17/2003	E-mail current filings from Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/18/2003	Review e-mails re administration issues (.10); review pleadings (.20)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/18/2003	Review and comment by e-mail re draft motion to extend exclusive period (0.6); conference with C. Kuoni and KAP re various matters, including claim against British distributor, water line problem, valuation issues, etc. (0.5)	RXB	1.10	566.50
12/19/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM (.2)	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/19/2003	Telephone conferences and e-mails with N. Peterman, DEM and RXB re Honeywell claim objection response (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/19/2003	Telephone conference with J. Harbour re filings (.10); prepare e-mail to C. Kuoni re outstanding items (.20)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/19/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re meetings and conference with RXB and APS re same	KAP	.30	96.00
12/19/2003	Conference with RXB re various status matters (.60)	KAP	.60	192.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/22/2003	Review various items filed in case	AEW	.20	49.00
12/22/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/22/2003	Prepare and review e-mails and respond to calls throughout the day re status, insurance letters and settlement agreement (.80)	KAP	.80	256.00
12/23/2003	E-mail to SKK re proof of claim	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/24/2003	Prepare, review and respond to e-mails re status (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/26/2003	Review on-line docket	AEW	.10	24.50
12/29/2003	Conference with SKK regarding filing Proof of Claim on behalf of Met-Coil in Dynagear bankruptcy	AEW	.20	49.00
12/29/2003	Update binder re court orders	KAB+	1.00	125.00
12/29/2003	Meet with SKK re proof of claim	KAB+	.10	12.50
12/29/2003	Telephone conference with RXB and C. Kuoni re status, including plan and disclosure statement (1.0)	KAP	1.00	320.00
12/29/2003	Prepare and review e-mails re insurance settlements and environmental issues (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/29/2003	Telephone conference with R. Perry re status (.20); telephone conference with C. Kuoni and J. Drerup re 624 Riedy landscape issue (.20)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/29/2003	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman and KAP, and C. Kuoni and KAP re status of various matters, e.g., future claims negotiations, plan issues, Travelers and Honeywell litigation and AIG negotiations, and conference with KAP re same and staffing and planning issues, and attend to emails re various matters	RXB	1.90	978.50
12/30/2003	Edit DynaGear proof of claim and meet with SKK re same	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/30/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/30/2003	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re claims issues, motions and litigation status (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/30/2003	Attend to various e-mails re several matters, including future claimants representative, committee fee requests, product liability claims, etc.	RXB	.50	257.50
12/30/2003	Draft Rider and prepare Proof of Claim for DynaGear bankruptcy (3); conferences with KAP re preparation of proof of claim (0.5)	SKK	3.50	735.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-CO	IT. QVQ	TEMC (qqnr	AGO	TION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TRUOMA
12/31/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/31/2003	Attention to DynaGear proof of claim and meet with SKK and LMR re the same	KAB+	.50	62.50
12/31/2003	E-mail current filings in Met-Coil proceedings to KAP and DEM	KAB+	.20	25.00
12/31/2003	Conference with C. Kuoni and RXB re settlement agreement and other outstanding issues (.30); conference with RXB re scheduling, hearing, motions and status of various matters (.60)	KAP	.90	288.00
12/31/2003	Conference with C. Kuoni re Proof of Claim (0.4); edits to and final preparation for filing of Proof of Claim in DynaGear bankruptcy (0.8); conferences with AEW re Met-Coil's Reply in Support of Omnibus Objection (0.6)	SKK	1.80	378.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CASE ADMI	NISTRATION		12,284.00
	GENL LIT (NON-ENVIRON'TAL)			
12/01/2003	Telephone conference with T. Drury re product liability case (.20); prepare e-mails re same (.10)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/02/2003	Meeting with MAZ re product injury litigation	ACW	.20	45.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

	·			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/02/2003	Conference with ACW re resolution of product liability cases (.3); review case re same (.5)	MAZ	.80	296.00
12/03/2003	Meeting with KAP re product liability injury cases	ACW	.80	180.00
12/03/2003	Conference with ACW re product liability claims (.80)	KAP	.80	256.00
12/04/2003	Review e-mail and complaints in product liability, injury actions	ACW	.50	112.50
12/05/2003	Prepare e-mail to A. McClure re Padhiar (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/08/2003	Telephone conferences with ACW re product liability cases (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/08/2003	Telephone conference with R. Vignali and RXB re Padhiar matter (.40)	KAP	.40	128.00
12/08/2003	Telephone conference with R. Vigrali and KAP and attend to and reply to e-mails and conference with KAP all re handling of Padhiar lawsuit	RXB	1.20	618.00
12/09/2003	Review damage information (.3); draft correspondence to R. Scheel re same (.3)	DEM	.60	183.00
12/10/2003	Conference with ACW re status of settlements	MAZ	.20	74.00
12/10/2003	Attend to e-mail re handling of Padhiar action	RXB	.20	103.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/11/2003	Review e-mails re Padhiar (.10)	KAP	.10	32.00
12/11/2003	Review A. McClure's e-mail re Padhiar case, conference with KAP re same and draft e-mail in response (0.7); telephone conference with F. Citera re same (0.3)	RXB	1.00	515.00
12/12/2003	Phone call with Puntero's counsel re case and possibility of settlement negotiations (.30)	ACW	.30	67.50
12/13/2003	Re Padhiar, e-mails to counsel re withdraw of appearance and with KAP re strategy	RXB	.40	206.00
12/15/2003	Meeting with KAP re product liability cases and phone call with C. Kuoni re same (.70); attention to settlement posture for same (.20)	ACW	.90	202.50
12/15/2003	Review demand letter (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00
12/15/2003	Conference with ACW and C. Kuoni re product liability cases (.60)	KAP	.60	192.00
12/16/2003	Conference with ACW re product liability cases and strategy re same (.8); e-mail to RXB re same (.1); review same (.5)	MAZ	1.40	518.00
12/16/2003	Attend to MAZ e-mail and conference with KAP re product liability cases	RXB	.20	103.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/17/2003	Telephone conference with R. Scheel (.2); review damages analysis for power outage (.4); draft demand letter to V. Quaranta (1.3); draft correspondence to R. Scheel re demand letter (.3)	DEM	2.20	671.00
12/17/2003	Conference with RXB re product liability cases (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
12/17/2003	Conference with ACW re administering product liability cases (.3)	MAZ	.30	111.00
12/17/2003	Attend to and draft e-mails re Padhiar (0.5); conference with MAZ re product liability cases and review emails re same (0.6)	RXB	1.10	566.50
12/18/2003	Review motion to lift stay re HVAC(.50); meetings with MAZ re settlement (.60); draft letter to R. Vignali re files (.50)	ACW	1.60	360.00
12/18/2003	Review additional power outage damage information	DEM	.30	91.50
12/18/2003	Conference with ACW re additional cases and strategy going forward	MAZ	.20	74.00
12/18/2003	Conferences with KAP and MAZ and attend to e-mail from C. Kuoni re handling of product liability claims	RXB	.70	360.50
12/19/2003	Meetings with MAZ, KAP and RXB re product liability cases	ACW	1.00	225.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
12/19/2003	Review revised damage calculations	DEM	.30	91.50
12/19/2003	Conferences with RXB, MAZ and ACW re product liability claims (.60)	KAP	.60	192.00
12/19/2003	Conference with ACW re status of product liability cases (.5); conference with RXB and KAP re same (.2)	MAZ	.70	259.00
12/19/2003	Conference with AEW, KAP and MAZ re product liability cases	RXB	.50	257.50
12/23/2003	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni and e-mails re product liability cases	RXB	.50	257.50
12/24/2003	Review revised damage calculations and correspondence from R. Scheel re same (.2); revise and finalize demand letter (.4)	D EM	.60	183.00
12/29/2003	Attention to local counsel issues and draft e-mail re same	ACW	1.00	225.00
12/29/2003	Correspond with C. Kouni re MQ Construction litigation	DEM	.30	91.50
12/29/2003	Review Clayton & Lambert litigation materials (.50)	KAP	.50	160.00
12/30/2003	Review complaint and meetings with MAZ and RXB re same	ACW	1.00	225.00
12/30/2003	Conference with RXB re product liability claims (.20)	KAP	.20	64.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312,201,4000 FAX 312,332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

METACOTI.	CYCTEMS	CORPORATION
IV: H: : : - (: () : : : ;	- כושם בכז כ	LURPURALIUN

JANUARY 15, 2004 5471.001/143591 PAGE 51

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS	TNUOMA
12/31/2003	Review pleadings in HVAC case and prepare for meeting with RXB re same (.60); meeting with RXB re HVAC case (.20)	ACW	1.00	225.00
12/31/2003	Office conference with C. Kouni re drafting complaint against MQ Construction	DEM	.20	61.00
12/31/2003	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re product liability cases (.30)	KAP	.30	96.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR GENL LIT	(NON-ENV	IRON'TAL	9,159.00
•	ASSET INVESTIGATION			
12/02/2003	Review recent case on alter ego and piercing corporate veil (.3); correspond with CSC re same (.2)	DEM	.50	152.50
12/10/2003	Update re alter ego decision and consider implications of same	APS	.10	51.50
12/10/2003	E-mails with DEM and TXL re archiving documents	CSC	.10	17.50
12/16/2003	Correspond with RXB and CSC re recent Third Circuit alter ego case	DEM	.30	91.50
12/16/2003	Office conference with RXB and KAP re alter ego investigation	DEM	.30	91.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ASSET INV	ESTIGATIO	N	404.50

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$ 136,146.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

JANUARY 15, 2004 5471.001/143591 PAGE 52

+ DENOTES PARALEGAL

ATTORNEY SUMMARY	·
ATTORNEY	HOURS
Alan P. Solow	1.40
David E. Morrison	41.70
Frederick H. Cohen	.60
Matthew A. Zapf	25.40
Michael L. Sullivan	6.20
Ronald Barliant	53.60
A. Colin Wexler	8.30
Andrew E. Weissman	25.70
C. Davin Boldissar	1.00
Catherine S. Carrigan	8.10
Kathryn A. Pamenter	144.10
Keith A. Sigale	.70
Salvador K. Karottki	85.20
Diane M. Ende+	18.30
Kristina A. Bunker+	47.50
Lauren M. Rosman+	17.00
Amy Kule+	.30
TOTAL TIME	485.10

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

JANUARY 15, 2004

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	JANUARY 15, 200 5471.001/14359: PAGE 53
SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	
Photogony Charges	1458.00
Photocopy Charges Telecopy Charges	963.32
Long Distance Telephone Charges	21.87
Federal Express 4-984-73891 11/26/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express	63.34
Federal Express 4-984-73891 11/26/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express	63.37
Deposition Transcript Fees - VENDOR: James Cheek, Court Reporter /Hearing	52.80
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	286.83
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	200.62
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	180.00
Luncheon Expenses SKK 11/18/03- VENDOR: Corner Bakery, Inc.	32.29
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	1318.26
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	277.21
Federal Express 4-985-14250 12/03/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express	37.12
Federal Express 4-985-14250 12/03/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express	43.42
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	64.80

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	JANUARY 15, 2004 5471.001/143591 PAGE 54
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	2.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. 50800 11/24/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter Nov	1733.46
29 - Dec 5, 2003 Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50800 11/24/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Local Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn	22.90
Pamenter 12/4/03 Telephone Charges - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter	135.87
Nov 17 & 22, 2003 Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter 12/2	72.43
Luncheon Expenses DGK 9/18/03 - VENDOR: Julia	53.24
Rea Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 50872 12/01/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	175.80
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 51166 12/08/03 -	12.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 51166 12/08/03 -	9.00
VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 51166 12/08/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JANUARY 15, 2004 5471.001/143591 PAGE 55
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 51166 12/08/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 51166 12/08/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. 51166 12/08/03 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		12.00
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter 12/9 - 12/10/03 Wilmington, DE		1562.93
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies		1185.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies		5943.60
Federal Express 4-985-93907 12/18/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express		88.64
Federal Express 4-985-93907 12/18/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express		58.60
Outside Photocopy Expenses - Oversize Copy Job - VENDOR: Pitney Bowes Management 11/4/03		15.00
Federal Express 1-532-37313 12/25/03 - VENDOR: Federal Express		22.20
Local Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter 12/18/03		5.00
Westlaw 11/30/03 - Invoice 805547560		48.76
Lexis-Nexis Legal Search Charges 11/30/03 Inv #0311047348		1371.26
Westlaw 11/30/03 - Invoice 805547560		1896.02
Westlaw 11/30/03 - Invoice 805547560		972.31
Westlaw 11/30/03 - Invoice 805547560		174.26
TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	\$	20,891.78
TOTAL THIS STATEMENT	\$ =	157,037.78