
EXHIBIT C

Summary of Time Records

August 1, 2003 to August 31, 2003

ALL MATTERS

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>August</u>	<u>Total</u>
Randall Lambert (RL)	Managing Director	11.9	11.9
Brent Williams (BW)	Vice President	113.7	113.7
Robert White (RW)	Associate	139.5	139.5
Gentry Klein (GK)	Analyst	133.7	133.7
Total		<u>398.8</u>	<u>398.8</u>

August

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Notes</u>	<u>Hours</u>
8/1/2003	R. Lambert	T/C with BW re: auction process, potential bidders; reviewed asset purchase agreement.	1.0
8/5/2003	R. Lambert	Reviewed key employee retention plan analysis; reviewed bidding procedures, asset purchase agreement; T/C with BW re: auction procedures.	2.5
8/6/2003	R. Lambert	Reviewed cash flow variance analysis; T/C with BW re: potential bidders; reviewed key employee retention plan analysis.	2.3
8/7/2003	R. Lambert	T/C with BW re: asset purchase agreement, potential bidders.	1.3
8/14/2003	R. Lambert	Reviewed analysis re: proposed fiber acquisition arrangement; T/C with BW re: same.	2.3
8/22/2003	R. Lambert	Met with BW re: transitional issues; reviewed asset purchase agreement; reviewed draft of case status presentation.	2.5
8/28/2003	R. Lambert	T/C with BW re: proposed fiber acquisition agreement, term sheet, asset purchase agreement.	1.0
		Total	11.9

August

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Notes</u>	<u>Hours</u>
8/1/2003	B. Williams	T/C with RW, GK re: objections to asset purchase agreement, bidding procedures order; prepared analysis re: same; T/C with Committee Counsel, RL re: potential bidders, asset purchase agreement.	5.5
8/4/2003	B. Williams	Reviewed key employee retention plan proposal; T/C with Committee Counsel re: same; T/C with Committee member re: liquidity outlook, sales process update.	4.5
8/5/2003	B. Williams	Trip to Delaware to meet with Committee Counsel, Debtors, Debtors' advisors re: asset purchase agreement, auction procedures, met with potential bidders re: same; T/C with RL re: same.	8.3
8/6/2003	B. Williams	Attended auction in Delaware; met with Committee Counsel, Committee member, Debtors, Debtors' advisors, RW re: asset purchase agreement, auction procedures, met with potential bidders re: same; T/C with RL re: same.	17.8
8/7/2003	B. Williams	Attended auction in Delaware; met with Committee Counsel, Committee member, Debtors, Debtors' advisors re: asset purchase agreement and related documents, auction procedures, met with potential bidders re: same; T/C with RL re: same; met with RW re: bid summary analysis.	10.3
8/8/2003	B. Williams	Attended hearing in Philadelphia re: asset purchase agreement; auction process; met with Committee Counsel re: same; met with winning bidder, proposed bidders re: same; T/C with RW re: proposed asset purchase agreement analysis.	6.0
8/9/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: sales hearing, proposed agreement with Qwest; reviewed asset purchase agreement.	3.5
8/10/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: sales process, asset purchase agreement; T/C with Debtors' financial advisors re: fiber sale analysis.	4.3
8/11/2003	B. Williams	Prepared for and attending hearing in Philadelphia re: sales process, asset purchase agreement; met with Committee Counsel re: same; met with bidders, reviewed analysis prepared by RW, GK re: purchase agreement comparison analysis.	7.5
8/12/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee, Committee Counsel re: key employee retention plan, sales hearing, asset purchase agreement; reviewed key employee retention plan presentation.	3.8
8/13/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: excluded fiber route proposal, asset purchase agreement related documents and schedules, T/C with RW re: liens analysis.	3.3
8/14/2003	B. Williams	Reviewed memo prepared by Committee Counsel; T/C with RW re: excluded assets; T/C with Committee member re: asset purchase agreement, sales process; T/C with RL re: proposed fiber acquisition arrangement.	4.5
8/18/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: case status, fee application, retention order; T/C with RW re: same; updated summary of hours.	3.0

8/19/2003	B. Williams	Met with RW re: network assets analysis; T/C with Committee Counsel re: transitional issues, termination agreements; reviewed cash flow variance analysis.	3.0
8/21/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: asset purchase agreement; proposed settlement agreement; reviewed analysis re: same; T/C with bidder re: transitional issues.	3.0
8/22/2003	B. Williams	Met with RW re: proposed fiber acquisition analysis, claims analysis; T/C with Committee member re: case status, upcoming hearings; met with RL re: transitional issues.	3.3
8/25/2003	B. Williams	Reviewed memo prepared by Committee Counsel re: Debtors' cash management system; T/C with Committee Counsel re: key employee retention plan motion; T/C with RW re: cash flow budget.	3.5
8/26/2003	B. Williams	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; reviewed analysis re: joint ventures; T/C with Committee Counsel re: termination agreements.	6.5
8/27/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: sales update, transitional issues; met with Company management, Debtors' advisors in Butte re: sale of excluded assets, cash flow forecast; reviewed analysis re: same; T/C with Committee member re: liquidity issues.	6.3
8/28/2003	B. Williams	Met with RW re: proposed fiber acquisition arrangement; T/C with RL re: same, asset purchase agreement; updated summary of hours.	3.0
8/29/2003	B. Williams	T/C with Committee Counsel re: revised asset purchase agreement; settlement agreement re: GSP; T/C with bidder re: transitional issues.	2.8
Total			113.7

August

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Notes</u>	<u>Hours</u>
8/1/2003	R. White	Reviewed statement of financial affairs; T/C with BW, GK re: objections to asset purchase agreement, bidding procedures order; prepared analysis re: same.	6.3
8/4/2003	R. White	T/C with GK re: bidding procedures; reviewed latest weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes; updated key employee retention plan analysis.	4.5
8/5/2003	R. White	Trip to Delaware to prepare for auction; reviewed proposed bids; prepared summary analysis re: proposed bids; met with GK re: same; met with Debtors' advisors re: same.	8.0
8/6/2003	R. White	Attended auction in Delaware; reviewed proposed asset purchase agreements; met with BW re: same; prepared analysis re: same; updated bid summary analysis, reviewed latest weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes.	18.0
8/7/2003	R. White	Attended auction in Delaware; updated bid summary analysis, met with BW re: same; reviewed proposed asset purchase agreements; prepared comparison analysis re: same; met with GK re: same; reviewed schedules to asset purchase agreement.	11.3
8/8/2003	R. White	Attended hearing in Philadelphia re: asset purchase agreement; auction process; met with Committee Counsel re: same; met with winning bidder, proposed bidders re: same; T/C with BW re: proposed asset purchase agreements; prepared analysis re: same; met with GK re: same.	7.3
8/10/2003	R. White	Reviewed analysis prepared by Debtors' financial advisors re: fiber sale; reviewed dark fiber acquisition analysis prepared by GK; reviewed bid summary comparison analysis.	5.5
8/11/2003	R. White	Reviewed latest weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes; T/C with Debtors' advisors re: same; updated analysis re: excluded assets; prepared analysis re: joint ventures.	5.0
8/12/2003	R. White	Updated key employee retention plan presentation; met with GK re: same; T/C with Committee, Committee Counsel re: same, sales process; T/C with Debtors re: excluded assets.	4.8
8/13/2003	R. White	Reviewed draft analysis re: liens; prepared analysis re: same; T/C with BW re: same; reviewed industry analysis re: dark fiber; updated case status presentation; updated cash flow budget analysis.	5.3
8/14/2003	R. White	T/C with Debtors, AT&T, GK re: liens summary analysis; updated analysis re: same; updated summary of hours; T/C with BW re: excluded assets.	3.5

8/15/2003	R. White	Met with GK re: asset purchase summary analysis; updated cash flow budget analysis; T/C with Debtors' advisors re: network assets; updated proposed bid analysis.	4.5
8/18/2003	R. White	T/C with Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow analysis; proposed excluded asset arrangement; T/C with BW re: retention order; reviewed correspondence from Committee Counsel re: objections to asset purchase agreement.	5.0
8/19/2003	R. White	Prepared analysis re: network assets; met with BW re: same; updated proposed fiber acquisition analysis; revised latest liens analysis.	3.8
8/20/2003	R. White	Reviewed latest weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes; updated key employee retention plan analysis; reviewed monthly operating report.	4.3
8/21/2003	R. White	T/C with Company management re: due diligence items, lien review, asset purchase agreement; reviewed correspondence from Committee Counsel re: proposed fiber acquisition deal; reviewed analysis re: asset sales; met with GK re: same.	5.0
8/22/2003	R. White	Prepared variance analysis re: monthly operating reports; met with BW re: proposed fiber acquisition analysis; updated claims analysis; T/C with Debtors' advisors re: same.	4.8
8/25/2003	R. White	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; updated excluded asset, cash flow budget analyses; T/C with BW re: same.	8.5
8/26/2003	R. White	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; updated claims analysis.	8.0
8/27/2003	R. White	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; updated liens analysis.	7.3
8/28/2003	R. White	Met with GK re: transitional issues; revised analysis re: proposed fiber acquisition arrangement; met with BW re: same; updated summary of hours.	4.3
8/29/2003	R. White	T/C with Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow budget; updated latest due diligence status presentation; reviewed weekly cash flow forecast and accompanying notes.	4.5
Total			139.5

August

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Notes</u>	<u>Hours</u>
8/1/2003	G. Klein	Updated dark fiber acquisition analysis; T/C with BW, RW re: objections to asset purchase agreement, bidding procedures order; prepared analysis re: same; revised comparable company key employee retention analysis.	6.0
8/4/2003	G. Klein	Prepared analysis re: summary of bids; T/C with RW re: bidding procedures; reviewed online case docket; updated comparable company analysis, database analysis; reviewed objections to asset purchase agreement.	5.3
8/5/2003	G. Klein	Trip to Delaware to prepare for auction; reviewed proposed bids; prepared summary analysis re: proposed bids; met with RW re: same; met with Debtors' advisors re: same.	8.0
8/6/2003	G. Klein	Attended auction in Delaware; reviewed proposed asset purchase agreements; prepared analysis re: same; updated bid summary analysis, updated cash flow analysis.	17.8
8/7/2003	G. Klein	Attended auction in Delaware; updated bid summary analysis, reviewed proposed asset purchase agreements; prepared comparison analysis re: same; met with RW re: same; reviewed schedules to asset purchase agreement.	10.5
8/8/2003	G. Klein	Attended hearing in Philadelphia re: asset purchase agreement; auction process; met with Committee Counsel re: same; met with winning bidder, proposed bidders re: same; met with RW re: proposed asset purchase agreement analysis.	6.0
8/9/2003	G. Klein	Reviewed comparable company SEC filings; checked online case docket; reviewed correspondence from Committee Counsel re: sales hearing; updated asset purchase agreement analysis.	5.0
8/10/2003	G. Klein	Updated liquidity analysis; reviewed memo re: asset purchase agreement; prepared analysis re: same; updated dark fiber acquisition analysis.	4.5
8/12/2003	G. Klein	Updated key employee retention plan presentation; met with RW re: same; updated working capital analysis; T/C with Committee, Committee Counsel re: key employee retention plan, sales process.	5.8
8/13/2003	G. Klein	Updated comparison summary re: asset purchase agreements; updated monthly financial statement analysis; reviewed industry news and brokerage reports.	4.3
8/14/2003	G. Klein	Updated excluded assets analysis; T/C with Company management, AT&T, RW re: liens summary analysis; reviewed analysis re: same.	3.8

8/15/2003	G. Klein	Revised database analysis; updated consolidated balance sheet, income statement analyses; reviewed asset purchase agreement; updated summary analysis; met with RW re: same.	4.5
8/18/2003	G. Klein	Reviewed correspondence prepared by Committee Counsel re: case status; updated fiber route analysis; revised comparable company key employee retention plan analysis.	4.8
8/19/2003	G. Klein	Updated latest due diligence presentation; revised liquidity, working capital analysis; reviewed SEC filings of comparable companies.	5.0
8/21/2003	G. Klein	Prepared analysis re: asset sales; met with RW re: same; reviewed online case docket; prepared summary of hours.	4.3
8/22/2003	G. Klein	Updated liquidity, cash flow analyses; revised status update presentation; reviewed weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes.	4.0
8/25/2003	G. Klein	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; checked online case docket.	8.5
8/26/2003	G. Klein	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: cash flow forecast, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; reviewed weekly cash flow variance analysis and accompanying notes.	8.0
8/27/2003	G. Klein	Trip to Butte to meet with Company management, Debtors' financial advisors re: excluded assets, lien review, transitional costs; prepared analysis re: same; revised status update presentation.	7.3
8/28/2003	G. Klein	Prepared updated case status presentation; updated analysis re: excluded assets; updated transitional issues analysis; met with RW re: same.	5.0
8/29/2003	G. Klein	Updated latest due diligence status presentation; reviewed latest claims analysis; checked online case docket; reviewed latest news stories.	5.3
Total			133.7