EXHIBIT A

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION Met-Coil Systems Corporation c/o Charles F. Kuoni, III 711 Ogden Avenue Lisle, IL 60532 JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 1

REGARDING: BANKRUPTCY

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

DATE	DESCRIPTION	<u>ATTY</u>	HOURS	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/01/04	Review and revise motions re contract and settlement (2.0)	RXB	2.00	1,060.00
05/04/04	Review and revise settlement motion (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/05/04	Review/revise motions for filing (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
05/06/04	Review and revise motions for filing (1.10); telephone conferences with A. Kelly re same and service (.50)	КАР	1.60	560.00
05/13/04	Prepare stipulation (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/14/04	Prepare status report (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/17/04	Review and revise sale order, sale notice, alter ego insert, estimation orders, agenda and status report (2.5)	КАР	2.50	875.00
05/18/04	Review omnibus response (.40); review and revise sale order, sale notice, solicitation procedure order, estimation stipulations (4.30); review committee motion and telephone conference with RXB re same (.60)	КАР	5.30	1,855.00
05/19/04	Review and revise objection to shorten notice (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/21/04	Review and revise solicitation order, sale order, sale notice and response to motion to compel (5.50); telephone conferences with A. Kelly and D. Butz re filings (1.0); telephone conferences with N. Peterman re same (.80); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status of filings (.30)	КАР	7.60	2,660.00
05/25/04	Telephone conferences with A. Kelly re hearing, certificates of service and filings (.50)	КАР	0.50	175.00
05/26/04	Review and comment on motion to stay (.30) SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY FILINGS	KAP	0.30	105.00 \$7,955.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 2	
05/14/04	Confer with RXB re inclusion of retainers SUB-TOTAL FOR DIP FINANCING/CASH COLLATERA	APS AL	0.20	106.00 \$106.00
05/05/04	Telephone call to E. Leibovich re status (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
05/07/04	Telephone conference with D. Walsh and S. Bezark re settlement offer (1.40); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.20)	KAP	1.60	560.00
05/08/04	Review claims for May 24th hearing (.70)	KAP	0.70	245.00
05/12/04	Review Village of Lisle claim (.50); telephone calls re hearing on claims (.70); review and comment on Honeywell term sheet (.80)	КАР	2.00	700.00
05/12/04	Telephone call to B. Shaw with N. Peterman re settlement (.20)	КАР	0.20	70.00
05/13/04	Telephone call with N. Peterman re settlement agreement comments (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/13/04	Research concerning Honeywell settlement and emails and telephone conferences with KAP and N. Peterman re term sheet and review re same (2.)	RXB	2.00	1,060.00
05/16/04	Review Village of Lisle claim and prepare e-mail re same (.40)	КАР	0.40	140.00
05/17/04	Review claims and prepare for hearing (.80); telephone conference with R. Vignali re Red River (.30)	KAP	1.10	385.00
05/18/04	Telephone conference with D. Walsh re Village of Lisle claim (.80); telephone conference with B. Wallace, R. Cuneo and S. Bezark re settlement (.50)	KAP	1.30	455.00
05/18/04	Telephone conference with M. Araki re executory contract chart, amended schedules and claims report (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
05/18/04	Telephone conference with A. Tennebaum, T. Krueger, N. Peterman and S. Bezark re USEPA negotiations (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
05/20/04	Telephone conference with M. Araki re amendments to schedules and objections to claims	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/22/04	Prepare e-mails re claims (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 3	3
05/25/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman, and M. Araki re claims call and reports for same (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
05/27/04	Prepare for and attend conference call re claims register (1.60); conference calls with C. Kuoni and RXB re claims issues and settlements (.40); telephone conference with N. Peterman and RXB re claims issues (1.0)	КАР	3.00	1,050.00
05/28/04	Review file re stipulations (.20); review correspondence re Scanlan claims (.20)	KAP	0.40	140.00
05/28/04	Prepare e-mails re bar date notice and changes to claims register (.40); telephone conferences with various creditors re reclassification of claims (1.40)	KAP	1.80	630.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION			\$6,520.00
05/03/04	Attention to requested documents	KAB+	0.10	13.00
05/03/04	Prepare audit letter for Mestek as of 04/30/04	DME+	0.70	73.50
05/03/04	Attend to emails re document production and 2004 exams	RXB	0.30	159.00
05/03/04	Review and revise motion to enter into contract (0.5); conference with A. Bourland, C. Kuoni and KAP re IEPA issues (0.2)	RXB	0.70	371.00
05/04/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni, RXB, N. Peterman and N. Filler re Committee meeting (1.0); review and revise TRS amendment and telephone conference with K. Mack and C. Kuoni re same (1.0)	КАР	2.00	700.00
05/04/04	Conferences with C. Kuoni and KAP re plan for meeting with creditors (2.5)	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
05/04/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, N. Filler, C. Kuoni and KAP re claims and planning for meeting (1.0)	RXB	1.00	530.00
05/04/04	Multiple conferences with C. Kuoni and RXB re agenda for meeting and claims issues (3.90); prepare correspondence and documents re 2004 production (1.0)	KAP	4.90	1,715.00
05/04/04	Create labels and label documents, retrieve requested documents, meetings with KAP re the same	KAB+	0.50	65.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	. SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 4	
05/05/04	Attend committee meeting (8.0); conferences with RXB and C. Kuoni re meeting (.50)	КАР	8.50	2,975.00
05/05/04	Telephone call to R. Perry re PBGC requests (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
05/05/04	Prepare for and attend settlement meeting with committee and Mestek representatives and conference with KAP re same	RXB	9.50	5,035.00
05/06/04	Telephone call with MLS and C. Kuoni re Aerotek contract (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/06/04	Telephone calls with Transhield and C. Kuoni re contract issues (.40)	КАР	0.40	140.00
05/06/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and RXB re 2004 examination (1.10); telephone call with M. Prewitt re same (.30)	КАР	1.40	490.00
05/07/04	Call from LMS re produced documents, service re gathering of same (.4)	KAB+	0.40	52.00
05/09/04	Prepare for 2004 examination (2.60)	KAP	2.60	910.00
05/10/04	Meet with KAP re produced documents (.1); file documents (.4)	KAB+	0.50	65.00
05/10/04	Telephone conference with M. Prewitt re 2004 exam (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/10/04	Prepare for Rule 2004 examination (5.30)	KAP	5.30	1,855.00
05/10/04	Conference with C. Kuoni re claims and Rule 2004 exam (2.)	RXB	2.00	1,060.00
05/11/04	Attend Rule 2004 examination (7.40); conference with SKK re GeoTrans (.10)	КАР	7.50	2,625.00
05/11/04	Attend telephonically C. Kuoni 2004 examination	RXB	7.50	3,975.00
05/11/04	Review of organizational documents, charter documents re annual meetings and director issues (.3); correspondence with KAP re company meeting issues (.10)	KAS	0.40	118.00
05/14/04	Review access agreement documents and letter agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/14/04	Meeting with RXB re issues related to intercompany debt	PMB	0.30	120.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/14784 PAGE 5	8
05/16/04	Obtain documents for Rule 2004 production (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/17/04	Prepare for 2004 examinations (1.5)	RXB	1.50	795.00
05/18/04	Attend S. Shea 2004 examination (8.5); telephone conferences and emails with KAP and E. Schwartz re committee motion to compel (1.)	RXB	9.50	5,035.00
05/19/04	Review tax sharing and subrogation issues	GLJ	2.00	920.00
05/19/04	Attention to review and indexing of boxes received from counsel	ERS+	1.50	187.50
05/19/04	Attend board meeting (1.50); draft board minutes (.30)	KAP	1.80	630.00
05/19/04	Attend N. Filler 2004 examination (5.8); telephone conference with E. Schwartz re response to committee motion to compel (0.6)	RXB	6.60	3,498.00
05/21/04	Teleconference with RXB re Rule 2004 production issues for objection (0.1) ; teleconferences with ERS re same (0.2); review objection, prior affidavits filed in matter, and edit objection (1.3) ; conference with KAP re edits to objection (0.3)	SKK	1.90	437.00
05/21/04	Telephone conferences and emails with M. Prewitt and R. Allen and conference and emails with KAP and SKK re response to committee motion to compel and review and revise draft objection (2.5)	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
05/21/04	Attention to review and indexing of boxes received from counsel	ERS+	2.50	312.50
05/24/04	Review of KAP correspondence re shareholders meeting (.1); review of company files re company charter documents (.1)	KAS	0.20	59.00
05/24/04	Review boxes of documents	CSM+	1.00	80.00
05/24/04	Meet with SKK and ERS re preparation for upcoming document production	KAB+	0.30	39.00
05/24/04	Telephone conference with SKK re production (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/24/04	Meet with SKK regarding producing Met-Coil correspondence files and review same	ERS+	6.00	750.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 6		
05/24/04	Teleconference with KAP re Rule 2004 production (0.2); conference with ERS re Rule 2004 production (0.3)	SKK	0.50	115.00
05/25/04	Office conferences with KAP, RXB, SKK, KAB and ERS re confirmation hearing, disclosure statement and discovery (4); telephone conference with KAP, RXB, SKK, KAB, ERS, M. Prewitt and N. Petermann re same (.4); review C. Kuoni Rule 2004 examination transcript (.6); plan additional Rule 2004 examinations of R. Stodola and R. Scheel (.3); correspond with C. Kuoni (.4); review order re motion to compel (.3)	DEM	6.00	1,950.00
05/25/04	Telephone conference re 2004 production issues (.8); meeting with DEM, SKK, and ERS re follow-up to same (1.2); retrieve and circulate materials re same (.3); review 2004 order and motion to compel (.4); review documents for production (3.5)	KAB+	6.20	806.00
05/25/04	Conference with KAP, DEM, SKK, and teleconference with M. Prewitt and N. Peterman re 2004 document production (1.1); emails with R. Beck re same (0.3); conference with DEM re same and emails with DEM and KAP re same (1.0); review and revise draft order (0.7)	RXB	3.10	1,643.00
05/25/04	Review sale memo and telephone conference with RXB re same (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/25/04	Teleconference with KAP, DEM, RXB, ERS, and Mestek counsel re Rule 2004 production (0.5); conference with RXB, KAP, DEM, and ERS re same (0.3); conference with DEM, KAB, and ERS re document and privilege review for Rule 2004 production (0.3); conference with KAB and ERS re privilege and document review (1); teleconferences with DEM re privilege issues (0.2); teleconference with ERS and KAB re Rule 2004 production (0.2)	SKK	2.50	575.00
05/25/04	Conference call and meeting with SKK, DEM and KAB regarding review of correspondence files in compliance with Rule 2004 Order (1.1); Review of boxes received from counsel for correspondence files to comply with Rule 2004 Order (5.90)	ERS+	7.00	875.00
05/25/04	Review of files, Met-Coil charter documents (.3); conference with KAP re shareholder meetings (.1)	KAS	0.40	118.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 7	
05/25/04	Sort through documents and tag all correspondence for copying	CSM+	2.00	160.00
05/25/04	Attend conference calls and meetings re Rule 2004 production (1.70)	KAP	1.70	595.00
05/26/04	Telephone conference with J. Berkeley re production of status letters to insurers	RXB	0.20	106.00
05/26/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz re payments to consultant (0.3); review ordinary course order, etc. and email to KAP re same (0.5)	RXB	0.80	424.00
05/26/04	Sort through documents and tag all correspondence for copying	CSM+	6.00	480.00
05/26/04	Conference with RXB, DEM, KAP, and KAB re Rule 2004 production (0.5); conference with ERS re Rule 2004 production (0.3)	SKK	0.80	184.00
05/26/04	Attend status meeting (1.30)	KAP	1.30	455.00
05/26/04	Office conference with RXB, SKK, and KAB re 2004 exam discovery issues (.7); review and edit proposed order (.5); telephone conference with RXB and E. Schwartz (.5)	DEM	1.70	552.50
05/26/04	Review of boxes for correspondence files in compliance with Rule 2004 Order (7)	ERS+	7.00	875.00
05/26/04	Review of organizational documents of Met-Coil (.1); drafting of memorandum to KAP re annual meetings, shareholder meetings, director elections (.3)	KAS	0.40	118.00
05/27/04	Office conferences with RXB and SKK re order concerning disclosure of privileged information to Committee (1); revise order (2.5); telephone conferences with R. Stodola and R. Scheel (.4); correspond with R. Beck re examinations (.3)	DEM	4.20	1,365.00
05/27/04	Conference with DEM and review and revise 2004 order	RXB	1.50	795.00
05/27/04	Sort through documents and tag all correspondence for copying	CSM+	6.50	520.00
05/27/04	Review boxes from counsel for environmental litigation correspondence to comply with Rule 2004 order	ERS+	7.00	875.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/14784 PAGE 8	8
05/27/04	Conference with ERS re Rule 2004 production (0.2); research re work product privilege (2.3)	SKK	2.50	575.00
05/27/04	Attention to production status and correspond with others re same	KAB+	0.30	39.00
05/28/04	Review and revise draft order and emails re 2004 examination	RXB	1.20	636.00
05/28/04	Conference with KAP re Rule 2004 production and follow- up teleconference with KAP and KAB re same	SKK	0.20	46.00
05/28/04	Review boxes for correspondence in environmental litigation files to comply with Rule 2004 order.	ERS+	6.00	750.00
05/28/04	Prepare e-mails re accounting for costs (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/28/04	Review M. Prewitt edits to order (.5); review KAP edits to order (.5); revise order (1.5); review RXB comments (.3); correspond with counsel re same (.4); correspond with R. Beck re 2004 exams (.3)	DEM	3.00	975.00
05/28/04	Attention to 2004 production	KAB+	0.30	39.00
05/29/04	Correspondence re document production (0.5); document review for Rule 2004 production (0.8)	SKK	1.30	299.00
05/29/04	Review and prepare EMails re 2004 exam	RXB	0.30	159.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CORPORATE MATTERS		5	\$56,314.00
05/03/04	Meet with TFM te tax appeal (.50); research appeal process for property tax assessments (2.50)	ALG	3.00	645.00
05/04/04	Research property tax appeal process	ALG	1.90	408.50
05/05/04	Meet with TFM re tax assessment appeal issue	ALG	0.20	43.00
05/06/04	Issues re PTAB and mechanics re paying under protest and appropriateness of same (.30); confer with ALG (.20)	TFM	0.50	242.50
05/20/04	Search for property information on sites near Lockformer, meet with SKK re same and e-mail to BAP re same	KAB+	0.30	39.00
05/21/04	Research re property owner and address re subpoena	BAP+	1.30	214.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	. SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 9	
05/25/04	Obtain appraisal and transmit same (.60); begin review of appraisal (.50); telephone conference with Real Estate Analysis re proposal for revised appraisal (.20)	TFM	1.30	630.50
05/25/04	Obtain title chain and tax bill information for specific tax identifications	BAP+	1.30	214.50
05/25/04	Conference with TFM re appraisal and follow-up conference with ERS re same (0.3)	SKK	0.20	46.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TAX MATTERS		\$	2,483.50
05/03/04	Prepare for and attend environmental meeting (2.50)	KAP	2.50	875.00
05/04/04	Telephone conference with S. Bezark, N. Peterman, K. Mack and C. Kuoni re environmental issues (.50); telephone conference with same, AG and IEPA re settlement (1.0)	КАР	1.50	525.00
05/05/04	Telephone conferences with S. Bezark re environmental meeting (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
05/05/04	Telephone call to K. Mack re water suppression line issues (.10)	КАР	0.10	35.00
05/06/04	Telephone conferences with S. Bezark and AG's office re environmental settlement (.50); telephone conference with K. Mack re Village of Lisle issues (.20)	КАР	0.70	245.00
05/07/04	Update from KAP re issues with State	APS	0.10	53.00
05/07/04	Numerous telephone conferences re water mains (1.20); telephone call with B. Wallace re status (.10)	KAP	1.30	455.00
05/10/04	Telephone conferences with IEPA, S. Bezark and C. Kuoni re environmental issues (.80)	КАР	0.80	280.00
05/13/04	Telephone conference with S. Bezark re environmental issues (.10); telephone call to RXB re same (.10)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/17/04	Telephone conference with T. Krueger re USEPA letter (.20)	КАР	0.20	70.00
05/19/04	Telephone call with B. Wallace re settlement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOON & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 10	
05/20/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni, S. Bezark, K. Mack, R. St. John, B. Wallace, M. Ryan re cleanup objectives (.50); telephone conference with D. Walsh re settlement (.30); telephone conference with B. Wallace and S. Bezark re settlement (.30)	КАР	1.10	385.00
05/26/04	Telephone conferences re IEPA settlement (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/28/04	Telephone conference with S. Bezark and J. Perry re Woodridge work (1.10)	KAP	1.10	385.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS			\$3,693.00
05/01/04	Review J. Connor report	DME+	2.00	210.00
05/03/04	Review letter to Tricon re discovery issues (.1); conference with SKK re same (.2); review letter to Flexible Steel re discovery (.1); review letter to Tricon re discovery (.1); review letter Bison Gear re discovery strategy (.4); conference with SKK re letters and reconsideration (1.2); review discovery strategy (1); review billing issue (.2)	MAZ	3.30	1,254.00
05/03/04	Correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultants (0.2) ; conferences with DME re subpoenas (0.3) ; teleconferences with consultant (0.7) ; follow-up correspondence with MAZ (0.2); review discovery responses (0.3) ; conferences with MAZ re discovery issues (1.2)	SKK	2.90	667.00
05/03/04	Review correspondence files from Chuhak and Baker & Mckenzie for third party discovery (2); review discovery previously sent to third parties (1.2); conferences with SKK re subpoenas (.3)	DME+	3.50	367.50
05/03/04	E-mails with SKK re letters to certain third-parties re delivery of documents for inspection	OLA	0.20	72.00
05/04/04	E-mails with SKK re discovery letter, re document production	OLA	0.40	144.00
05/04/04	Review various contributor discovery issues (.8); review issues re jury trial (.6)	MAZ	1.40	532.00
05/04/04	Review written discovery and letters to Tricon, Flexible Steel, Bison Gear and Morey (1); conference with SKK re same (.2)	DME+	1.20	126.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 11	
05/05/04	Review additional expert reports (1.6); review jury trial issues (.8); review discovery strategy for contributors (.7)	MAZ	3.10	1,178.00
05/05/04	Review correspondence from consultants (0.2) ; conference with DME re consultant (0.3) ; conference with DME re St. Joseph's Creek access issues (0.3)	SKK	0.80	184.00
05/05/04	Conference with SKK re consultant (.3); conference with SKK re St. Joseph's Creek access issues (.3); search correspondence and discovery file for previous correspondence (0.7); review documents received from S. Engle (2.5); amend subpoenas re access to St. Joseph's Creek (1)	DME+	4.80	504.00
05/06/04	Correspondence with MAZ and OLA re expert issues (0.2); correspondence with DME re subpoenas (0.2); correspondence with A. Madriz (0.3); teleconference with consultant (0.5); review Weston report (0.8); correspondence with KAP re expert issues (0.2); conference with DME re documents from S. Engle (0.3); teleconference with consultant (0.2); conference with MAZ re case status and discovery strategy (0.5); conferences with DME re action items (0.7); teleconference with DME and R. St. John (0.3); conference with DME re document production (0.3); teleconference with consultant (0.3); teleconference with A. Madriz (0.2); review materials from consultants (0.5); correspondence with C. Kuoni (0.2); conference with DME re correspondence from third-party defendants and previous production (0.7)	SKK	5.90	1,357.00
05/06/04	Conferences with SKK re document production and documents from S. Engle (.6); draft and edit subpoenas (1.3); correspondence with SKK re subpoenas (.5); conference with SKK re discovery issues (.7)	DME+	3.10	325.50
05/06/04	Conference with SKK re contribution actions and review e- mail re same (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/06/04	Conferences with SKK re action items (.7); review expert reports for additional information (1.1)	DME+	1.80	189.00
05/06/04	Conference with MAZ re contribution actions	RXB	0.30	159.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 12	
05/06/04	Conference with SKK re discovery status and strategy (.5); conference with RXB re same (.3); review rebuttal report of Dr. Ball (1.2); review other related expert report re same (.8)	MAZ	2.80	1,064.00
05/06/04	Correspondence with SKK re expert and other discovery issues (0.1) ; correspondence with SKK re consultants (0.1) ; correspondence with SKK re St. Joseph's Creek sediment sampling (0.2) ; review correspondence from third party defendants (0.1)	OLA	0.50	180.00
05/07/04	Conference with SKK re case status (.3); review contract (.1); correspondence with DME re discovery strategy (.2); review Parsons report (.7); review deposition notices (.4); conference with SKK re reconsideration (0.2)	MAZ	1.90	722.00
05/07/04	Organize produced documents into file surf folders for MAZ	AXK+	2.30	184.00
05/07/04	Review materials from consultants (0.3); conference with DRH re discovery issues (0.2); correspondence with consultant (0.2); conference with MAZ re case status (0.3); teleconference with consultant (0.5); correspondence with DME re consultant (0.3); conference with MAZ re reconsideration (0.2); correspondence with DME re letter from Collins firm and prior correspondence re same issues (0.3)	SKK	2.30	529.00
05/08/04	Conferences with SKK and RXB re contribution actions (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
05/08/04	Review prior correspondence with Collins firm re access (0.3); document review of third-party defendants production and compare with discovery responses (2); review expert reports in preparation for meeting (1.7)	SKK	4.00	920.00
05/08/04	Review documents from S. Engle and previously produced third party productions (3); review expert reports of J. Connor and R. St. John (1.5)	DME+	4.50	472.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 13	3	
05/10/04	Correspondence with DME and OLA re consultant (0.3); correspondence with RXB and KAP re Collins firm (0.2); preparation for meeting (0.8); meeting with consultant (and DME and then later with OLA and MAZ) (4); site visit with consultant, OLA, and MAZ (2.3); teleconference with E. Manzke (0.2); correspondence with S. Deeley (0.2); conference with consultant (0.8); conference with MAZ re action items (0.6); review subpoena issues and correspondence re same (0.3); teleconference with G. Rovner re subpoena issues (0.4); work on subpoena issue (0.5); follow-up correspondence with MAZ re same (0.3)	SKK	10.90	2,507.00
05/10/04	Correspondence with OLA and SKK re consultant (.3); review materials in preparation for meeting (.5); conference with consultant (3); search for additional maps per SKK (.7); draft and edit subpoenas (1.5)	DME+	6.00	630.00
05/10/04	E-mail from SKK re conference with consultant (0.1) ; review letters from opposing counsel re demand for follow- up on production (0.1) ; meeting with consultant, SKK and MAZ (1.8); site visit with consultant, OLA and SKK (2.3); correspondence with SKK re Collins firm (0.2)	OLA	4.50	1,620.00
05/10/04	Meeting with OLA, SKK and consultant (1.6); site visit with consultant, OLA, and SKK (2.3); conference with SKK re action items (.6); conference with RXB re valuation (.2); review same (.8)	MAZ	5.50	2,090.00
05/11/04	Review deposition notices (0.3); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.2); conference with MAZ, OLA, KAP, and DME re case status (0.5); conference with DME and OLA re discovery issues and action items (1); teleconference with OLA and R. St. John (0.3); draft motion to reconsider (1.5); teleconference with consultant and OLA (0.3); teleconference with E. Manzke (0.2); conference with OLA re disclosure issues (0.1); conference with OLA re case strategy (0.2); correspondence with KAP re case status (0.2); conference with DME re action items (0.3); teleconference with A. Madriz (0.2); correspondence with DME re action items (0.2); conference with OLA re discovery issues (0.2); conference with MAZ and DME re budget for case going forward (0.5)	SKK	6.20	1,426.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	, SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 14	
05/11/04	Draft deposition notices (1.3); conference with MAZ, OLA, SKK and KAP re case status (.5); conference with OLA and SKK re discovery issues and action items (1); conference and follow - up correspondence with SKK re action items (.5); conference with MAZ and SKK re budget and edit discovery plan budget (5); work on budget per MAZ (.5); review of deposition transcripts from any 30(b)(6) witnesses (1.2)	DME+	5.50	577.50
05/11/04	Meet with KAP, OLA, SKK, DME re discovery strategy and action items (.5); review same (.8); review discovery plan (.8); conference with DME and SKK re same (.5); review and revise deposition strategy (.5); conference with SKK re deposition notices (.2); conference with OLA re reconsideration (.1)	MAZ	3.40	1,292.00
05/11/04	E-mails with SKK re consultant invoices and budget going forward (0.2); conference with SKK re case strategy (0.2); conference with SKK re discovery issues (0.2); review draft subpoenas (0.1); conference with MAZ re reconsideration (0.1); correspondence with DME re subpoenas (0.1); conference with SKK and DME re discovery issues and action items (1.0); teleconference with SKK and consultant (0.2); teleconference with SKK and R. St. John (0.3); conference with SKK re disclosure issues (0.1); correspondence with SKK re access issues (0.1); correspondence with R. St. John (0.1)	OLA	2.60	936.00
05/12/04	Conference with OLA and DME re discovery issues (0.3); correspondence with consultant (0.2); teleconference with consultant, DME, and OLA (0.3); conferences with DME re consultants and discovery issues (0.7); conferences with OLA re discovery issues (0.3); conference with OLA and DME re discovery issues and action items (1.5); correspondence with E. Manzke (0.2); teleconference with G. Rovner re discovery issues (0.2); teleconference with consultant (0.2); draft and edit motion to reconsider (7.5)	SKK	11.40	2,622.00
05/12/04	Review document requests and interrogatories from prior discovery (2); compare to current discovery requests and incorporate into newest set of requests (2)	DME+	4.00	420.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL			JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 15	
05/12/04	Conference with DME and SKK re discovery issues (0.3); teleconference with SKK, DME and consultant (0.3); conference with SKK re discovery issues (0.3); review documents from third - party defendants (0.2); review work plan (0.1); conference with SKK and DME re discovery issues and action items (1.5); correpondence with Collins firm (0.1)	OLA	2.80	1,008.00
05/12/04	Review discovery plan (.8); teleconferences with DME re same (.2); outstanding action items (.5); review valuation issues (.5)	MAZ	2.00	760.00
05/12/04	Conference with OLA and SKK re discovery issues (.3); teleconference with consultant, OLA and SKK (.3); conferences with SKK re consultants and discovery issues (.7); conference with OLA and SKK re discovery issues and action items (1.0); review motion to reconsider for SKK (.7); continue review of third party discovery (1.5); teleconference with MAZ re discovery plan (0.2)	DME+	4.70	493.50
05/13/04	Correspondence with SKK re bifurcation order and discovery issues (0.2); follow-up correspondence with SKK re discovery responses (0.2); review access agreement (0.3); meeting with KAP, RXB, MAZ and SKK re case status (1.2); further review of access agreement (0.2); teleconference and correspondence with E. Manzke (0.2); conference with DME (0.1); conference with SKK re trifurcation order (0.2); teleconference with E. Manzke re access issues (0.3); review materials from consultant (0.1); conference with SKK re same (0.1); teleconference with DME re subpoenas (0.1); correspondence with SKK re discovery issues (0.1); e-mail to KAP re access issues (0.2); review correspondence from SKK re discovery issues (0.1); correspondence with KAP re access issues (0.1); review and edit access agreement (0.4); e-mail to E. Manzke re same (0.1); review materials from consultant (0.2)	OLA	4.50	1,620.00
05/13/04	Conference with MAZ, SKK, OLA and KAP re contribution actions (1.2); correspondence with C. Kuoni re same (0.3)	RXB	1.50	795.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 16	
05/13/04	Attend contribution action meeting (1.30); conference with RXB re same (.10)	KAP	1.40	490.00
05/13/04	Conferences with RXB, KAP, OLA and SKK re case status (1.2); conference with SKK re discovery strategy (.5); review same (1.1); review case costs (1.2); multiple conferences with DME re same (0.5); conferences with SKK and DME re same (.5)	MAZ	5.00	1,900.00
05/13/04	Conferences with MAZ re case status (.5); conference with SKK and MAZ re discovery strategy budget projections (.5); work on budget (for part with SKK) (5.6); teleconference with OLA re subpoenas (0.1); follow up correspondence with MAZ re same (.2); conference with OLA re discovery issues (0.2)	DME+	7.10	745.50
05/13/04	Review briefing on bifurcation motion (0.7); conference with MAZ re case status (0.5); conference with RXB, KAP, OLA and MAZ re case status (1.2); conference with DME and MAZ re budget projections and discovery plan (0.5); conferences with OLA re bifurcation order and discovery issues (0.3); teleconference with R. St. John (0.2); work on budget issues with DME (3.3); follow-up correspondence with MAZ re same (0.2); teleconference with consultant (0.3); review materials from consultant (0.2); correspondence with consultants (0.3)	SKK	7.70	1,771.00
05/14/04	Further correspondence with KAP re access issues (0.2); conference with SKK re access discovery issues (0.3); draft letter agreement to E. Manzke (1.0); review comments on letter agreement from SKK and KAP (0.2); revise same (0.1); conference with SKK re reconsideration (0.6); correspondence with E. Manzke re letter agreement (0.2); follow - up conference with SKK re action items (0.1); teleconference with SKK re additional discovery (0.2); teleconference with SKK and R. St. John (0.2); conference with SKK re discovery issues (0.4)	OLA	3.50	1,260.00
05/14/04	Conference with SKK re budget (.3); continue review of third party documents (2.3)	DME+	2.60	273.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 17	
05/14/04	Teleconference with consultant (0.3); edit motion (2.8); conference with OLA re discovery issues (0.3); teleconference with R. St. John (0.3); teleconference with OLA and R. St. John (0.2); conference with OLA re reconsideration (0.6); review draft letter to Collins (0.1); conferences with MAZ re discovery strategy and case status (0.6); teleconference with OLA re action items (0.1); teleconference with OLA re additional discovery (0.2); correspondence with OLA and KAP re letter to Collins (0.2); conference with DME re budget (0.3); conference with OLA re discovery issues (0.4)	SKK	6.40	1,472.00
05/14/04	Conference with RXB and C. Kuoni re case (.5); review budget issues (1.8); review discovery strategy (1.4); multiple conferences with SKK re same (.6)	MAZ	4.30	1,634.00
05/15/04	Review motion (0.4); correspondence with SKK and MAZ re case strategy (0.3)	OLA	0.70	252.00
05/17/04	Conference with OLA and MAZ re discovery issues (0.5); conference with MAZ re case strategy (0.3); conference with OLA re sampling of St. Joseph's Creek (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John (0.5); correspondence with R. St. John (0.2); correspondence with A. Madriz (0.1); correspondence with C. Kuoni (0.2): conferences with OLA re discovery issues and sampling issues (0.6); teleconferences with consultants (0.5); correspondence with MAZ re strategy issues (0.3); teleconference with OLA and consultant and follow-up re same (0.2); follow- up correspondence with MAZ re same (0.5)	SKK	4.40	1,012.00
05/17/04	Review discovery strategy (.8); review various e-mails re same (.3); review related issues re same (.8) conference with SKK and OLA re same (.5); conference with SKK re same (.3); review draft motion (.5); review issues re same (.6)	MAZ	3.80	1,444.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 18	
05/17/04	Teleconference with consultant and SKK (0.1); conference with SKK and MAZ re discovery issues (0.5); review materials re disclosure issues (0.6); correspondence with SKK re same (0.1); teleconference with E. Manzke re access agreement (0.1); conferences with SKK re sampling St. Joseph's Creek (0.1); teleconference with E. Manzke re comments on access agreement (0.7); conferences with SKK re discovery issues and sampling issues (0.6); correspondence with KAP re update on access agreement (0.2)	OLA	3.00	1,080.00
05/18/04	Review multiple issues re disclosures (.5); review various issues re testing (.4); review materials from consultant (.4); review correspondence re subpoenas (.3)	MAZ	3.80	1,444.00
05/18/04	Teleconference with consultant (0.3); correspondence with consultant (0.2); correspondence with G. Rovner (0.2); teleconference with OLA and S. Engle (0.2); teleconference with G. Rovner re St. Joseph's Creek sampling (0.2); correspondence with R. St. John (0.2); draft and edit amended subpoenas (0.7); teleconference with consultant (0.4); correspondence with C. Kuoni re strategy (0.2); conferences with OLA re access issues and action items (0.2); research re CERCLA defenses (0.7)	SKK	3.50	805.00
05/18/04	Conference with SKK re access issues (0.1); e-mails with SKK re contacting R. St. John (0.1); review correspondence from DGSD re sampling (0.2); follow - up correspondence with SKK re same (0.1); teleconference with SKK and S. Engle (0.2); conference with SKK re action items (0.1); correspondence with MAZ and SKK re testing (0.2); follow-up correspondence with SKK and MAZ re disclosure issue (0.1)	OLA	1.10	396.00
05/19/04	Review materials re disclosure issue (0.2) ; correspondence with SKK re disclosure issue (0.2) ; correspondence with SKK re discovery issues (0.1)	OLA	0.50	180.00
05/19/04	Teleconference with consultant (0.3) ; correspondence with D. Biederman (0.2) ; review materials re disclosure issue (0.3) ; teleconference with D. Biederman (0.3) ; follow - up correspondence re same (0.2) ; correspondence with C. Kuoni (0.2)	SKK	1.50	345.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 19	
05/20/04	Review materials re disclosure issue (1); conference with SKK re same (.2); conference with SKK re discovery and case strategy (.3); review same (.5); review consultant issue (.3); review testing and sampling issues (.5); review issues with consultant (1); review case description (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); review deposition issues (1); review hybrid issues (1)	MAZ	6.20	2,356.00
05/20/04	Correspondence with opposing counsel (0.3); review subpoenas (0.2); correspondence with D. Biederman (0.1); teleconference with A. Madriz (0.3); teleconferences with R. St. John re access issues (0.7); teleconference with E. Walsh and follow-up correspondence re same (0.4); conferences with MAZ re discovery issues and case strategy (0.7)	SKK	2.70	621.00
05/20/04	Teleconference with SKK re access issues and re call from Precision's counsel	OLA	0.20	72.00
05/21/04	Review letters from defendants re response to subpoenas (0.1); correspondence with MAZ and SKK re response from third party defendants (0.1); teleconference with SKK, M. Erzen and E. Walsh (0.5); follow - up conference with MAZ re hybrid defendants (0.4); conference with KAP re same (0.2); review access issues (0.2); conference with KAP re same (0.1); conference with MAZ and SKK re case strategy and discovery issues (0.4)	OLA	2.00	720.00
05/21/04	Review correspondence from third party defendants and review strategy (.6); conference with SKK and OLA re same (.4); conference with OLA re hybrid defendants (.2); review deposition strategy and of pending issues (1.1); review jury issues re same (.8)	MAZ	3.10	1,178.00
05/21/04	Conferences with SKK re document production, materials to consultants, and discovery issues (.8); review correspondence from third party defendants (.5); continue review of discovery and document production from third parties (2.2)	DME+	3.50	367.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 20	
05/21/04	Conferences with DME re document production, materials to consultants, and discovery issues (0.8); correspondence with D. Biederman (0.1); review materials to consultants (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John (0.5); review correspondence from third-party defendants (0.2); teleconference with E. Walsh, M. Erzen, and OLA (0.5); review access issues (0.3); conference with MAZ and OLA re case strategy and discovery issues (0.4); review reference manual re scientific evidence (0.7)	SKK	4.00	920.00
05/23/04	Correspondence with MAZ and SKK re response to third party defendants and strategy	OLA	0.20	72.00
05/24/04	Teleconference with SKK re correspondence from third party defendants and document production	DME+	0.40	42.00
05/24/04	Review court order and strategy re same (.8); review deposition extracts re contributors (.7); review potential issues for contributors discovery and depositions (0.8); conference with SKK re case status and action items (.5)	MAZ	3.30	1,254.00
05/24/04	Conference with MAZ re case status and action items (0.5) ; teleconferences with consultant (0.2) ; review sampling location for St. Joseph's Creek (0.1) ; teleconference with DME re third - party defendants and document production (0.4)	SKK	1.20	276.00
05/24/04	Correspondence with SKK re work plan	OLA	0.20	72.00
05/25/04	Teleconference with SKK re subpoenas	DME+	0.30	31.50
05/25/04	Review strategy re discovery of contributors (.7); review expert issues (.5); correspondence with OLA re same (.2)	MAZ	1.40	532.00
05/25/04	Teleconference with DME re subpoenas (0.3) ; teleconference with G. Rovner re creek sampling (0.2) ; teleconference with consultant (0.5) ; correspondence with consultant (0.3) ; review subpoenas and sampling locations (0.5); correspondence with D. Biederman (0.2) ; teleconference with R. St. John (0.2)	SKK	2.20	506.00

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 21	
05/26/04	Conference with RXB, DEM, KAP, OLA, KAB, and APS re case status and strategy (1); teleconferences with consultants (1.5); review subpoenas and location of sediment sampling (0.2); review correspondence from consultant (0.4); teleconference with G. Rovner and follow-up re same (0.2); correspondence with S. Engle and G. Rovner (0.2); conference with OLA re discovery isssues (0.5)	SKK	4.00	920.00
05/26/04	Meeting with KAP, KAB, APS, SKK and RXB re case status and strategy (1); correspondence with MAZ re case strategy and trial transcripts (0.2); conference with SKK re discovery issues (0.5); review materials on bifurcation (0.3)	OLA	2.00	720.00
05/27/04	Review motion and order on bifurcation (0.3) ; conference with SKK re same (0.2) ; teleconference with consultant and SKK (0.5) ; conference with SKK re action items (0.1) ; correspondence re access issues (0.1) ; correspondence with KAP re case strategy (0.1) ; correspondence with MAZ re discovery issues (0.3)	OLA	1.60	576.00
05/27/04	Conference with SKK re contribution actions	RXB	0.30	159.00
05/27/04	Correspondence with consultant (0.5); conference with OLA re case strategy (0.2); teleconference with OLA and consultant (0.5); call with OLA to R. St. John (0.1); correspondence with C. Benton (0.1); follow-up conference with OLA re action items (0.1); conference with RXB (0.3); review correspondence from third-party defendants (0.3); correspondence with R. St. John (0.2); review access issues (0.3)	SKK	2.60	598.00
05/28/04	Correspondence and teleconference with consultants (0.3) ; teleconference with counsel at Schopf & Weiss (0.2)	SKK	0.50	115.00
05/28/04	Review e-mail re contribution strategy issues (.1); review issues re same (.2); review additional work on site (.4); review issues re additional discovery (.3); conference with OLA re case strategy (.2); review strategy re contribution discovery (.6); review additional sampling issues (.3)	MAZ	2.10	798.00

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 22		
05/28/04	Conference with KAP re strategy issues (0.1) ; conference with MAZ re case strategy (0.2) ; correspondence with MAZ and SKK re case strategy (0.3) ; review materials re additional discovery (0.2) ; review correspondence from MAZ re scope of discovery (0.1) ; correspondence with MAZ re scope of discovery (0.3)	OLA	1.20	432.00
05/28/04	Emails re contribution actions	RXB	0.50	265.00
05/28/04	Retreive court proceeding transcript	CSM+	0.20	16.00
05/29/04	Review discovery issues and correspondence from third- party defendants	SKK	0.30	69.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL LITIGATION		\$	60,539.00
05/21/04	Prepare for omnibus hearing and conferences and telephone conferences and emails with KAP, N. Peterman and J. Wills re same (1.2)	RXB	1.20	636.00
05/21/04	Prepare for hearing (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/21/04	Review hearing agenda and retrieve materials for 5/24 hearing, assemble, and flag information to be discussed at hearing (2.5); help prepare documents for mass mailing (.3)	KAB+	2.80	364.00
05/22/04	Prepare for hearing (2.0); prepare e-mails related to same (.20)	KAP	2.20	770.00
05/23/04	Prepare for omnibus hearing re rule 2004 motion	RXB	2.00	1,060.00
05/24/04	Prepare for and attend omnibus hearing and argue Committee's Rule 2004 motion (3.9); conference with C. Kuoni after hearing re dealing with order (1.2)	RXB	5.10	2,703.00
05/24/04	Prepare for and attend omnibus hearing (6.00); respond to e-mails re hearing (.20); telephone conferences with B. Wallace and S. Bezark re hearing (.20); telephone conference with DEM re hearing and production (.20); telephone conference with K. Martin re insurance section of disclosure statement and hearing (.20)	КАР	6.80	2,380.00
05/24/04	Telephone conference with KAP re confirmation hearing preparation and discovery (.3); review correspondence re same (.3); prepare for telephone conference call (.3)	DEM	0.90	292.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 23	1
05/25/04	Prepare notice re hearing (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
05/25/04	Conference with RXB re upcoming hearings (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/26/04	Prepare e-mails re confirmation hearing (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
05/27/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly and RXB re hearing date (.20); telephone conference with E. Schwartz re hearing date (.20)	КАР	0.40	140.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY HEARINGS			\$9,045.50
05/07/04	Review pro forma and prepare e-mails re same (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
05/17/04	Attention to status of April pro forma	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/24/04	Review/revise April pro forma (2.5); draft/revise monthly fee application, make calculations and prepare charts for same (2.5)	KAB+	5.00	650.00
05/25/04	Calls from accounting, and attention to status of pro forma	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/25/04	Review invoice and fee application (1.0)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/26/04	Attention to fee statement, call to KAP re the same (.2); review, revise, and finalize same (1)	KAB+	1.20	156.00
05/28/04	Prepare fee application for filing, e-mail same SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLICATIONS (GK)	KAB+	0.20	26.00 \$1,339.00
05/01/04	Prepare alter ego insert to disclosure statement	RXB	1.50	795.00
05/03/04	Revise alter ego insert for disclosure statement (1.0); review C. Kuoni's spreadsheet re claims and Mestek contribution (0.7); conference with C. Kuoni and KAP re plan issues, including potential pay out and effect of remediation (1.0)	RXB	2.70	1,431.00
05/04/04	Instructions from RXB re plan feasibility research	AMS	0.30	63.00
05/04/04	Conference with AMS re research on plan issue (0.3); telephone conference with K. Mack re environmental aspects of plan (0.4)	RXB	0.70	371.00
05/05/04	Research re feasibility	AMS	2.00	420.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 24		
05/06/04	Review and revise various plan-related documents (5.5); conference with GFM re alternative disclosure statement to convenience class (0.3)	RXB	5.80	3,074.00
05/06/04	Review current plan and disclosure statement (1); draft disclosure statement to be used to solicit convenience class (2)	GFM	3.00	1,590.00
05/06/04	Research re plan feasibility	AMS	2.60	546.00
05/07/04	Attend and reply to emails and several telephone conferences with KAP and GFM re various plan and disclosure statement issues	RXB	1.20	636.00
05/07/04	Prepare e-mails to RXB re disclosure statement (.20); conferences with GFM re convenience class notice (.20)	КАР	0.40	140.00
05/07/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re plan documents (.50); prepare e-mail re same (.20)	KAP	0.70	245.00
05/08/04	Review and revise plan	RXB	4.50	2,385.00
05/09/04	Prepare and revise proposed document to be sent to Convenience Class	GFM	1.00	530.00
05/10/04	Conference with GLJ re tax issues under disclosure statement	BMF	0.30	120.00
05/10/04	Review and revise plan and disclosure statement and review claims re same	RXB	6.90	3,657.00
05/10/04	Discuss distribution and tax issues with client (.80); prepare for same (.70)	GLJ	1.50	690.00
05/10/04	Conference with GLJ and C. Kuoni re tax issues (1.1)	RXB	1.10	583.00
05/11/04	Conference with GLJ re net operating losses	BMF	0.30	120.00
05/11/04	Research re brief in support of confirmation	AMS	0.60	126.00
05/12/04	Review and revise plan documents (5.2); conference with KAP and telephone conference with N. Peterman re plan issues (1.0)	RXB	6.20	3,286.00
05/12/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and RXB re plan drafting and negotiations (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 25	}	
05/13/04	Review and revise disclosure statement (.70); telephone conference with RXB re same (.30); prepare e-mails re same (.30)	КАР	1.30	455.00
05/13/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz, etc. re plan voting issue (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00
05/13/04	Work on plan documents and e mails and telephone conferences with KAP re same	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
05/14/04	Conference with RXB re plan (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/14/04	Review and revise plan documents and emails and telephone conferences with KAP, C. Kuoni and N. Peterman re same	RXB	6.80	3,604.00
05/15/04	Draft portions of plan and disclosure statement	RXB	6.50	3,445.00
05/15/04	Review and revise amended plan, disclosure statement and glossary of terms	КАР	7.20	2,520.00
05/16/04	Prepare e-mails re plan issues and negotiations (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/17/04	Prepare supplementary Solicitation Letter to Class 4.1 Convenience Claims	GFM	1.00	530.00
05/17/04	Telephone conferences and emails with KAP and C. Kuoni re plan issues	RXB	0.90	477.00
05/18/04	Conferences with C. Kuoni re claims, exhibits to Disclosure Statement and Plan (2.0)	КАР	2.00	700.00
05/18/04	Telephone conference with E. Harron, N. Peterman and T. Cairns re Trust documents (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
05/19/04	Conferences with GLJ re treatment of debtor's net operating losses and research re same	BMF	1.30	520.00
05/19/04	Review and revise omnibus response, trust documents, plan, disclosure statement, glossary of terms, removal motion (9.40)	КАР	9.40	3,290.00
05/19/04	Telephone calls with N. Peterman, C. Kuoni, RXB re plan issues and documents (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
05/19/04	Various emails and telephone conferences with N. Peterman and KAP	RXB	1.10	583.00

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 26		
05/20/04	Review and revise Agenda, Glossary, Disclosure Statement, Plan and exhibits for filing to same and teleconferences with N. Peterman, C. Kuoni, S. Bezark, RXB re same	КАР	14.90	5,215.00
05/20/04	Review and revise plan documents and numerous conferences and emails with KAP and telephone conferences with N. Peterman re same	RXB	9.10	4,823.00
05/20/04	Review Plan documents and edit same (1); conference with KAP re edits to Plan document (0.3)	SKK	1.30	299.00
05/20/04	Review and revise disclosure statement (2.0) ; tax research re same (3.0) ; telephone calls with opposing counsel and client re same (1.0)	GLJ	6.00	2,760.00
05/20/04	Conferences with GLJ re tax issues relating to 'liquidating trust' and disclosure statement and research on same	BMF	2.30	920.00
05/20/04	Key-cite portion of disclosure statement and review of same	KAB+	3.00	390.00
05/25/04	Conference with KAP and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re marketing efforts and "script" and email re same	RXB	0.80	424.00
05/25/04	Prepare Second Amended Disclosure Statement section (1.0); telephone conferences with N. Peterman and K. Martin re same (.30)	КАР	1.30	455.00
05/25/04	Conference with RXB re confirmation brief	AMS	0.10	21.00
05/26/04	Review and revise for filing amended schedules, notice, second amended disclosure statement, fifth omnibus order and certificate of service and numerous conference calls re same (4.70)	КАР	4.70	1,645.00
05/26/04	Review and revise notice of second amended disclosure statement and insurance disclosure and conference with KAP re same and emails re same (1.2); telephone conference with E. Schwartz and KAP re scheduling confirmation hearing and emails with E. Harron, N. Peterman and KAP re same (0.8); telephone conference with E. Schwartz and DEM re hearing issues (0.5)	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
05/26/04	Participate in strategy meeting	APS	0.70	371.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 27	5
05/26/04	(Confirmation) Conference with RXB re status/confirmation brief	AMS	0.20	42.00
05/26/04	Office conference with RXB, KAP, APS, SKK, KAB and OLA re disclosure statement hearing and evidentiary issues (.8)	DEM	0.80	260.00
05/27/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz re confirmation issues (.3)	DEM	0.30	97.50
05/27/04	Conference with RXB re plan issues (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/27/04	Telephone conference with R. Beck, J. Wills, N. Peterman, and KAP re claims review and plan issues (1.1); telephone conference with N. Peterman and KAP re various claims and plan issues, and conference with KAP re same (1.3)	RXB	2.40	1,272.00
05/28/04	Telephone conference with R. Millner and review disclosure statement re trust agreement and disclosure statement (0.8)	RXB	0.80	424.00
05/28/04	Emails renotice to non-voting creditors and supplemental solicitation motion (0.5); review disclosure statement (0.4) SUB-TOTAL FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	RXB	0.90	477.00 61,457.50
05/05/04	Travel to/from O'Hare for meeting (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/05/04	Travel to O'Hare for settlement meeting	RXB	0.50	265.00
05/10/04	Travel to/from site (1.50)	MAZ	1.50	570.00
05/10/04	Travel to/from site with consultant (1.5)	SKK	1.50	345.00
05/10/04	Travel to Philadelphia for Rule 2004 exam (2.40)	KAP	2.40	840.00
05/10/04	Travel to site (0.8)	OLA	0.80	288.00
05/11/04	Travel from Philadelphia (2.90)	KAP	2.90	1,015.00
05/17/04	To New York for 2004 examinations	RXB	5.50	2,915.00
05/19/04	From New York	RXB	4.00	2,120.00
05/23/04	Travel to Wilmington (5.40)	KAP	5.40	1,890.00
05/23/04	Travel to Wilmington for hearing	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
05/24/04	Travel from Wilmington for omnibus hearing	RXB	6.00	3,180.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 28				
05/24/04	Travel from Wilmington (3.60) SUB-TOTAL FOR TRAVEL	KAP	3.60	1,260.00 \$16,188.00
05/03/04	Review independent contractor agreements and redline re same	MLS	0.20	71.00
05/06/04	Conference call with C. Kuoni, KAP re Aerotek	MLS	0.30	106.50
05/10/04	Confer with RXB, C. Kuoni re union dispute over outsourcing (.3); review contract and drafts re same and communicate to client re same (.4); voice mail exchange with KAP re confidentiality issue (.1)	MLS	0.80	284.00
05/14/04	Attention to dispute with union re outsourcing	MLS	0.50	177.50
05/24/04	Telephone conference with R. Scheel re employee discharge issue	DEM	0.30	97.50
05/25/04	Review and revise employee memo (.50) SUB-TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE MATTERS	KAP	0.50	175.00 \$911.50
05/04/04	Review and revise insurance letter and prepare e-mail re same (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/05/04	Telephone call to K. Martin re insurance letter (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
05/10/04	Telephone conference with K. Martin, J. Berkeley and C. Kuoni re insurance (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
05/13/04	Review and revise CGU settlement agreement (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
05/14/04	Attend CGU settlement call (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
05/16/04	Prepare insurance settlement motions (.30); prepare e-mails re same (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/17/04	Telephone conference with S. Bezark re ACE (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/19/04	Telephone call with W. McVisk re insurance hearing (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/28/04	Telephone conference with B. McVisk re settlement issues (.30); telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR INSURANCE/REGULATORY MATTI	ERS		\$1,470.00
05/01/04	Attend and reply to KAP emails re various issues (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 29	
05/03/04	Attend meeting with C. Kuoni re environmental meeting, claim issues, committee meeting (1.70); telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (.30); review and respond to phone messages, e-mails and mail (1.0); telephone conference with LMS re claims register correspondence (.10); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status (.10)	KAP	3.20	1,120.00
05/04/04	Review case dockets	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/05/04	Telephone call to M. Harrison re case status (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
05/06/04	Telephone conference with M. Harrison re status (1.10); telephone call with RXB re same (.10)	КАР	1.20	420.00
05/06/04	Various conferences and emails with KAP and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re 2004 examinations, claims assessments, and US Trustee	RXB	1.10	583.00
05/06/04	Call from KAP re status hearing, retrieve 2004 motion	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/10/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re status (.30); telephone conferences with RXB re same (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/11/04	Review e-mails (.20)	КАР	0.20	70.00
05/12/04	Review case dockets, notify others re same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/12/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re plan, contract issues, insurance settlements and other issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
05/13/04	Review dockets, prepare e-mail re notification of same, and retrieve pleadings for further review (.5); circulate access agreement to OLA (.2)	KAB+	0.70	91.00
05/13/04	Telephone call with C. Kuoni re status and term sheet comments (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
05/14/04	Prepare e-mails re plan, calls with CGU, futures rep call (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/14/04	Respond to numerous e-mails re board meeting, settlement agreement, plan issues, contracts, claims and other issues (.50)	КАР	0.50	175.00
05/16/04	Attend and reply to emails re various topics	RXB	0.50	265.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	. SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/14784 PAGE 30	8
05/17/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/17/04	Review case filings, prepare e-mail re same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/17/04	Review voluntary petition and e-mail KAP re same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
05/25/04	Call from KAP re upcoming events, retrieve court orders recently entered	KAB+	0.30	39.00
05/26/04	Attend Staff meeting (1.3)	RXB	1.30	689.00
05/26/04	Search for materials re claims	KAB+	0.40	52.00
05/26/04	Attend team meeting	KAB+	1.50	195.00
05/27/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly and KAP and telephone conference with E. Schwartz and KAP re scheduling issues	RXB	0.70	371.00
05/28/04	Review filings, and prepare notification e-mails re same SUB-TOTAL FOR CASE ADMINISTRATION	KAB+	0.20	26.00 \$5,436.00
05/03/04	Review and revise motion to settle Beck claim	RXB	0.30	159.00
05/04/04	Edit and revise MQ complaint (.5); office conference with CSC re same (.3)	DEM	0.80	260.00
05/04/04	Review client documents regarding timing of damage to equipment, (.3) revise complaint against MQ Construction (.8); revise per comments of DEM and conference with DEM re same (.4)	CSC	1.50	285.00
05/05/04	Telephone conferences with R. Scheel re MQ complaint (.3), revisions to same (.5)	CSC	0.80	152.00
05/06/04	E-mails with KAP re issues to watch in negotiating settlement of HVAC litigation	OLA	0.20	72.00
05/06/04	Correspond with C. Kuoni re complaint (.2); office conference with CSC re same (.1)	DEM	0.30	97.50
05/06/04	Conference with DEM re alterations to complaint (.1), revise same and message to R. Scheel following up on changes (.4)	CSC	0.50	95.00
05/19/04	Office conference with CSC re MQ Construction complaint	DEM	0.30	97.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONRDE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/14784 PAGE 31	18
05/19/04	Telephone call with B. Heller re HVAC (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
05/19/04	Conference with DEM re MQ complaint (.3), confer w/ group members re punitive damages standard (.5), revisions to complaint (.5)	CSC	1.30	247.00
05/20/04	Review revised complaint	DEM	0.30	97.50
05/26/04	Prepare e-mail re HVAC settlement (.10) SUB-TOTAL FOR GENL LIT (NON-ENVIRON'TAL)	KAP	0.10	35.00 \$1,667.50
05/04/04	Review and revise alter ego section of disclosure statement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
05/26/04	Memorandum to RXB, DEM and KAP re JTS decision dismissing alter ego complaint	GFM	1.00	530.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ASSET INVESTIGATION			\$635.00
	TOTAL FOR CONTRACTO			

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$ 235,760.50

+ DENOTES PARALEGAL

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 32

ATTORNEY SUMMARY

ATTORNEY	HOURS
Oscar L. Alcantara	32.70
Ronald Barliant	153.90
Philip M. Blackman	0.30
Barbara M. Flom	4.20
Gerald L. Jenkins	9.50
David E. Morrison	18.90
Terry F. Mortiz	1.80
Gerald F. Munitz	6.00
Alan P. Solow	1.00
Michael L. Sullivan	1.80
Matthew A. Zapf	57.90
Catherine S. Carrigan	4.10
Alais L.M. Griffin	5.10
Salvador K. Karottki	98.10
Kathryn A. Pamenter	174.70
Anne M. Sherry	5.80
Keith A. Sigale	1.40
Kristina A. Bunker+	25.60
Diane M. Ende+	55.70
Barbara A. Powers+	2.60
Erika R. Staggs+	37.00
Amy Kule+	2.30
Christopher S. Matthews+	15.70

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

JULY 7, 2004 5471.001/147848 PAGE 33

TOTAL TIME

716.10

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

JULY 7, 2004
5471.001/147848
PAGE 34

SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

Dhataaana Channa	1 010 70
Photocopy Charges Telecopy Charges	1,912.70
	663.36
Long Distance Telephone Charges	71.18
Luncheon Expenses RXB 4/8/04: - VENDOR: Corner Bakery, Inc.	121.16
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 53488 04/12/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	10.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 53488 04/12/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	40.70
Federal Express 1-725-96696 04/28/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	60.93
Federal Express 1-725-96696 04/28/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	333.75
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 53083 03/29/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 53083 03/29/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 53774 05/03/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	8.25
Federal Express 1-770-53052 05/05/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	60.68
Luncheon Expenses KAP 5/4/04: - VENDOR: Corner Bakery, Inc.	37.36
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Pitney Bowes Management Bates Label 4/23/04	4.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Pitney Bowes Management Bates Label 4/24/04	16.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Pitney Bowes Management 4/27/04 Bates Label	4.00
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter 5/10 & 5/11/04 Philadelphia, PA re Chuck Kuoni I	Rule 2004
Exam	501.47
Local Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 5/5/04	
	23.25
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant April 18-19, 2004 Wilmington, DE re: Hearing	1,858.30
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant April 11-12, 2004 Wilmington, DE re: Hearing	1,397.07
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54079 05/10/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	9.60
Federal Express 1-771-14345 05/13/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	194.44
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies 2 Copies of Boxes Outside SK	K Office -
Met-Coil	1,680.75
- VENDOR: It's Your Serve Rush Serve	225.00
Deposition Transcript Fees - VENDOR: Alan Solow of Charles F. Kouni - RCRS Services 5/13/04	1,068.70
Rush Serve - VENDOR: It's Your Serve	600.00
Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center	21.21
Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center	2.10
Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center	449.96
Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center	2.31

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	JULY 7, 24 5471.001/1 PAGE 35	
Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center Research Fees - VENDOR: Pacer Service Center Luncheon Expenses KAP 5/10/04 - VENDOR: Corner Bakery, Inc. Luncheon Expenses SKK 5/10/04 - VENDOR: Corner Bakery, Inc. Rush Serve - VENDOR: It's Your Serve Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54172 05/17/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Federal Express 1-771-73409 05/19/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express Luncheon Expenses KAP 5/18/04 - VENDOR: Sopraffina Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		7.07 46.20 42.36 84.43 75.00 17.00 227.24 33.82 12.60 25.20 4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		7.25 4.25
Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Velocity Courier Inc. Inv. 54266 05/24/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc. Outside Photocopy Expenses - VENDOR: Document Technologies Outside Photocopy Expenses - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copying, Bin Documents Outside Photocopy Expenses - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copying, Bin Documents		3 438 45
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies Copying Bind Documents Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies Copying, Bin		ing of 100.10
Documents Lexis-Nexis Legal Search Charges 04/30/04 Inv #0404005211 Westlaw 04/30/04 - Invoice 806524721 Westlaw 04/30/04 - Invoice 806524721	and Labe	102.80 1,329.29 2,737.88 191.76
TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	\$	28,263.45
TOTAL THIS STATEMENT	\$	264,023.95