

# **EXHIBIT A**

389	BUTZ	05/05/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to EC re: PoCs
389	BUTZ	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Katie re: motions and exhibits
389	BUTZ	05/11/04	B	B110	0.20	Email from Katie re: status update (.1); email to Katie re: status update for district court (.1)
389	BUTZ	05/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EC re: status report
389	BUTZ	05/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Katie re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to EC re: co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails from co-counsel re: district court status report
389	BUTZ	05/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails from EC re: district court status report
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Review agenda
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to EC re: CNO
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from and conf with EC re: CNO
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Katie re: status report
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Review status report; email to Katie re: status report
389	BUTZ	05/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Katie re: removal motion and CNO
389	BUTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EDS re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails to EDS re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EDS re: motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: court report
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: report to district court
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Call with Katie re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with ABK re: agenda; exclusivity; etc.
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with EC re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Research re: joint defense privilege for response to committee 2004 motion (.5); conf with ABK re: same (.2)
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.70	Conf with ABK re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: solicitation order and agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with EC re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.20	Draft cert for solicitation order
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: solicitation order
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: solicitation order and service
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Revise agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.30	Email to co-counsel, ABK and EC re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Barliant re: binder
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: objection to 2004 motion
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: service
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to Katie re: service
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.50	Prep for service
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel (KP) re: service parties
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with ABK and EC re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Call from co-counsel re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with ABK re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.40	Conf with ABK and EDS re: confirmation hrg dates
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re 4/19 transcript
389	BUTZ	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re settlement motions
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.60	Keyciting motions for filing
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.80	Preparing motions for filing
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.70	Filing and serving the settlement motions
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re filing of settlement motions
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	PC w/ K. Pamerter re service of settlement motions

\*----- TIME ENTRIES -----\*

ID	LAST NAME	DATE	STAT	TASK	BILLED HOURS
	Case Administration				
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.30
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.40
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.50
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.40
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.40
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.30
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.40
221	SCHWARTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/20/04	B	B110	0.50
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.20
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04	B	B110	0.30
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04	B	B110	0.10
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04	B	B110	0.30
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04	B	B110	0.30
389	BUTZ	05/05/04	B	B110	0.10

Emails to K. Pamerter re: schedule, etc.  
 Rev. G. Werkheiser email w\ term sheet  
 Rev K. Pamerter email re: agenda  
 Rev. and respond to K. Pamerter email re: Comm. motion to compel  
 Rev. Comm. Motion to shorten  
 Rev. local rules re: motion to shorten and motion to compel  
 Rev. Motion to Compel and exhibits attached thereto  
 Rev. docket re: motion to shorten and related pleadings  
 Rev. 2004 examination pleadings related to Comm. motion to shorten and motion to compel  
 Rev. and revise objection to motion to shorten  
 Rev. pleadings, transcript and docket re: Comm. motion to shorten objection  
 Conf. w\ D. Butz re: Comm. objection to motion to shorten  
 Conf. w\ D. Butz re: Comm. objection to motion to shorten  
 Rev. as filed objection to Comm. Motion to Shorten  
 Conf. w\ D. Butz re: objection to Comm. motion to shorten  
 Conf. w\ A. Kelly (and review of) re: removal motion, motion to compel, etc.  
 Tele. w\ K. Pamerter re: Motion to Compel, etc.  
 Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: motion to compel, etc.  
 Conf. w\ R. Allen re: motion to compel  
 Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: motion to compel  
 Conf. w\ D. Butz re: potential filings  
 Rev. discovery papers  
 Conf. w\ R. Allen re: response to motion to compel  
 Tele. w\ A. Kelly (and in part R. Allen) re: motion to compel  
 Tele. w\ A. Kelly, R. Allen and K. Pamerter re: Motion to Compel  
 Conf. w\ R. Allen re: Motion to Compel  
 Rev. case law re: discovery issues  
 Rev. K. Pamerter re: Motion to Compel  
 Rev. R. Allen email re: motion to compel  
 Rev. A. Kelly email re: motion to compel  
 Rev. A. Kelly email re: res.  
 Rev. response papers to Motion to Compel  
 Tele. w\ A. Kelly re: response to Motion to Compel  
 Tele. w\ R. Allen re: motion to compel  
 Teleconf. w\ D. Butz re: 5/24 hearing  
 Rev. removal motion  
 Rev. Hearing agenda  
 Rev. discovery papers  
 Rev. various orders  
 Rev. K. Pamerter email re: discl. notice w\ attachment  
 Rev. certification of counsel with attachments  
 Email from Katie re: POCs for notices

394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re service list
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re filing of settlement motions
394	KELLY	05/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Responding to K. Pamerter email re contact info
394	KELLY	05/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to DBB re stipulation
394	KELLY	05/14/04	B	B110	0.30	Reviewing objection to exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	05/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ E. Campbell re R. Barliant's request
394	KELLY	05/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to R. Barliant re MOR request
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re certifications of counsel
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20	Communicating w/ E. Campbell re certifications of counsel
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re certifications
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB & E. Campbell re filing procedures
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ EDS and E. Campbell re certifications of counsel
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ EDS re status
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re certifications of counsel
394	KELLY	05/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re filed certifications of counsel
394	KELLY	05/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re agenda
394	KELLY	05/20/04	B	B110	0.50	Reviewing agenda
394	KELLY	05/20/04	B	B110	0.90	Preparing and filing agenda for 5/24 hearing
394	KELLY	05/20/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ E. Campbell re service of agenda binders
394	KELLY	05/21/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ K. Pamerter re service of documents
394	KELLY	05/21/04	B	B110	0.30	Conf w/ E. Campbell re amended agenda
394	KELLY	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re amended agenda
394	KELLY	05/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamerter re amended agenda
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.30	Drafting amended agenda
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	2.00	5/24 hearing
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	2.70	Preparing for 5/24 hearing
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ E. Campbell re confirmation hearing date
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re confirmation hearing date
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ R. Howard re 6/22 hearing
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.40	Reviewing documents re 5/24 hearing
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re confirmation date
394	KELLY	05/24/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ F. Glass re hearing
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.20	Emails to K. Pamerter responding to questions
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.30	Conf w/ E. Campbell re 6/22 agenda
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re certificate of service
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.20	Email to K. Pamerter re confirmation hearing dates
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ E. Campbell re service of amended disclosure statement
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re upcoming filings
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.20	Email to R. Howard re expedited transcript
394	KELLY	05/25/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re 6/22 agenda
394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamerter re transcript
394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B110	0.20	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re filing of documents and service
394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ E. Campbell re filing and service of documents
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re filings
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ M. Harper re confirmation date
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamerter re confirmation hearing
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re confirmation hearing dates
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Message from clerk re confirmation hearing dates
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Pc w/ K. Pamerter & R. Barliant re confirmation dates
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re confirmation dates
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.60	Conf w/ DBB & EDS re confirmation dates
394	KELLY	05/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Message w/ R. Barliant confirmation hearing dates
394	KELLY	05/28/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ EDS re confirmation dates

394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B110	0.10	Message w/ clerk re confirmation dates
519	MCDANIEL	05/20/04 B	B110	4.50	File extraction, Hearing preparations for EJC
519	MCDANIEL	05/21/04 B	B110	2.00	Document Extraction, Case Management
519	MCDANIEL	05/24/04 B	B110	0.40	Document Extraction
533	MCGHEE	05/28/04 B	B110	0.30	Doc case management
560	TATE	05/03/04 B	B110	0.20	Review docket and update of case matters
560	TATE	05/05/04 B	B110	0.30	Docket research re: disposition of case matters
560	TATE	05/06/04 B	B110	0.30	Docket docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/07/04 B	B110	0.20	Docket research re: disposition of case matters
560	TATE	05/13/04 B	B110	0.30	Review docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/14/04 B	B110	0.20	Docket research re: disposition of case matters
560	TATE	05/17/04 B	B110	0.30	Review docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/18/04 B	B110	0.30	Review docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/19/04 B	B110	0.30	Review docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/21/04 B	B110	1.00	Review docket and update case matters
560	TATE	05/27/04 B	B110	1.00	Review docket and update case matters
597	CAMPBELL	05/05/04 B	B110	0.30	Case admin (.3)

Total Task: 9854.00

Meetings of & Communication With Creditors

209	DEHNEY	05/19/04 B	B150	0.20	Discussion w/EDS re: Comm. disputes
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	0.20	Conf. w/ R. Dehney re: Comm. disputes
221	SCHWARTZ	05/21/04 B	B150	0.20	Rev. Mestek response re: Comm. discovery
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B150	0.50	Review committee motion to shorten notice and 2004 motion
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B150	0.10	Email to EDS re: first impressions on committee 2004 and shorten motions
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B150	0.60	Conf call with RJD, EDS and committee counsel re: settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B150	0.20	Review emails from EDS re: motion to shorten for discovery by committee
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	0.10	Prep objection to committee motion for filing
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	0.40	Final edits to objection to committee motion; prep for filing
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	1.80	Research and draft objection to committee motion to shorten discovery request
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	0.20	Conf with EDS re: objection to motion to shorten committee motion
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B150	0.60	Conf with EDS and R Barliant re: objection to committee motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/20/04 B	B150	0.20	Conf with ABK re: research for objection to committee 2004 motion
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B150	0.10	Email from GTD re: confidential information in committee's motion

Total Task: 1421.00

Fee/Employment Applications

389	BUTZ	05/03/04 B	B160	0.10	Email from EC re: June 22 fee hrg date
389	BUTZ	05/03/04 B	B160	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: June 22 fee hrg date
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B160	0.10	Review 7th MNAT fee app
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B160	0.20	Review seventh interim fee application
389	BUTZ	05/28/04 B	B160	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: fee app
389	BUTZ	05/28/04 B	B160	0.10	Email to EC re: fee app
389	BUTZ	05/28/04 B	B160	0.10	Conf with ABK re: fee app and other filings

394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B160	0.60	Conf w/ EDS re ordinary course procedure
394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B160	0.30	Message w/ R. Barilant re ordinary course procedure
394	KELLY	05/26/04	B	B160	0.50	Reviewing ordinary course documents
394	KELLY	05/28/04	B	B160	0.20	Reviewing Goldberg fee application
594	CONWAY	05/04/04	B	B160	0.20	Discuss billing matters w/SG and EC
597	CAMPBELL	05/04/04	B	B160	1.60	Email acctg re proforma (.1);edit same (.4);chk status mnat fee req (.3);prep same (.8);
597	CAMPBELL	05/05/04	B	B160	1.20	Prep mnat fee app
597	CAMPBELL	05/06/04	B	B160	0.30	Prep mnat fee app for filing (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	05/12/04	B	B160	0.30	Edit mnat fee app (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	05/13/04	B	B160	0.50	Edit mnat fee request (.5)
597	CAMPBELL	05/17/04	B	B160	0.40	Chk dock re goldberg fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	05/28/04	B	B160	1.10	Prep noa re goldberg fee app (.3);prep cos re same (.1);prep same for efilling (.4);efiling same (.3)

Total Task: B160 8.00 1412.00

Avoidance Action Analysis

209	DEHNEY	05/13/04	B	B180	0.30	Call w/RB/GWW/EDS re: Honeywell issue
209	DEHNEY	05/13/04	B	B180	0.30	Discuss Honeywell w/EDS
209	DEHNEY	05/14/04	B	B180	0.10	EDS e-mails re: Honeywell settlement
209	DEHNEY	05/17/04	B	B180	0.10	E-mails to DBB re: Honeywell settlement
209	DEHNEY	05/17/04	B	B180	0.10	E-mails w/EDS, et. al. re: stip.
209	DEHNEY	05/18/04	B	B180	0.10	DBB e-mail re: versions of settlement
209	DEHNEY	05/18/04	B	B180	0.60	Conf. call w/EDS/DBB/comm. counsel re: settlement
209	DEHNEY	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Call w/EDS/DBB NP re: Honeywell settlement
209	DEHNEY	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: Honeywell issue
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.20	Conf. w\ R. Dehney (and in part G. Werkheiser) re: Honeywell
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.30	Conf. w\ W. Sudell re: Honeywell issue
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.20	Teleconf. w\ R. Dehney, G. Werkheiser and R. Barilant re: Honeywell issue
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.30	Honeywell issue
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: Honeywell issue
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04	B	B180	0.10	Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: Honeywell
221	SCHWARTZ	05/14/04	B	B180	0.10	Rev. S. Cousins email re: settlement agreement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/14/04	B	B180	0.10	Emails to and from R. Barilant re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/14/04	B	B180	0.10	Teleconf. w\ S. Cousins re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/14/04	B	B180	0.20	Rev. Honeywell settlement agreement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/14/04	B	B180	0.10	Email to G. Werkheiser and R. Dehney re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/17/04	B	B180	0.10	Conf. w\ G. Werkheiser re: settlement stip.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/17/04	B	B180	0.10	Emails to and from R. Dehney, et. al. re: stip.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/17/04	B	B180	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: Honeywell
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Teleconf. w\ D. Butz and R. Dehney re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Teleconf. w\ N. Peterman, R. Dehney and D. Butz re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Rev. revised settlement agreement versions
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.10	Conf. w\ G. Werkheiser re: settlement agmt.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Teleconf. w\ G. Werkheiser and N. Peterman re: Honeywell settlement language
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.10	Email to R. Barilant and K. Pamenter re: Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04	B	B180	0.20	Rev. and revise Honeywell settlement agreement language
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04	B	B180	0.10	Email to N. Peterman re: Honeywell stipulation

LINE NO	DESCRIPTION	DATE	PRO FORMA	AMOUNT	DETAILS
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04 B	B180	0.40	Teleconf. w\ R. Barilant and D. Butz re: Comm. mot. to compel and Honeywell settlement
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04 B	B180	0.10	Email to R. Barilant re: Honeywell Term Sheet
221	SCHWARTZ	05/19/04 B	B180	0.20	Conf. w\ D. Butz (and in part R. Dehney) re: Comm. motion to compel and Honeywell term sheet
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B180	0.10	Email to Greenberg re: stip
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from Greenberg re: stip
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B180	0.10	Review and execute stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from R Barilant re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from Greenberg re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/13/04 B	B180	0.10	Conf with EDS re: preapproval lock-ups
389	BUTZ	05/13/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: district court status report
389	BUTZ	05/13/04 B	B180	0.10	Emails with EC re: district court status report
389	BUTZ	05/13/04 B	B180	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: district court status report
389	BUTZ	05/14/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from R Barilant re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/14/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from R Barilant re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from EDS re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from committee counsel re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from EDS re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from RJD re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.20	Emails from RJD re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.40	Review research re: settlements
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.10	Draft version 1 of settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.10	Conf with EDS re: settlement draft
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.20	Draft version 2 of settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.10	Email to EDS, RJD and GWW re: versions of settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from GWW re: version of the Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.40	Email from GWW re: Honeywell settlement (.1); email from (1.); review GWW re: Honeywell settlement (.1); email from EDS re: settlement (.1); email to EDS, RJD and GWW re: settlement with GWW revisions (.1)
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from EDS re: Honeywell settlement
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B180	0.10	Email from EDS re: Honeywell term sheet
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B180	0.40	Review revised sale order (.1); prep cert for revised sale order (.2); email to co-counsel re: same
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B180	0.10	Call from co-counsel (KP) re: solicitation procedures order
597	CAMPBELL	05/11/04 B	B180	0.30	P/c w/ct re status rpt re New Hamp. dist ct case (.1);disc same w/DB (.1);email to co-counsel re same (.1)
Total Task:				10.00	3629.00
Other Contested Matters					
155	ALLEN	05/19/04 B	B190	0.20	Confer with E. Schwartz re motion to compel
155	ALLEN	05/20/04 B	B190	4.30	Response to motion to compel and matters related thereto
155	ALLEN	05/21/04 B	B190	4.10	Draft and revise response to motion to compel, and matters related thereto
155	ALLEN	05/24/04 B	B190	0.20	Follow up re motion to compel
209	DEHNEY	05/18/04 B	B190	1.00	Discuss Honeywell settlement term sheet w/GWW
338	WERKHEISER	05/18/04 B	B190	1.40	REview and comment on Honeywell settlement term sheet and discuss same with RJD and EDS.
394	KELLY	05/17/04 B	B190	0.80	Drafting third 9027 motion
394	KELLY	05/17/04 B	B190	0.10	Email to K. Pamentier re 9027 Motion
394	KELLY	05/18/04 B	B190	0.30	Emails bt. EDS & DBB re emergency objection and other motions
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.10	Reviewing emails re motions and objections to file
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.20	Conf w/ DBB re objection to motion to shorten

394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.40	Editing motion to extend removal period
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.30	Reviewing motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.20	Conf w/ EDS re objection to motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.30	Conf w/ R. Allen re objection to motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.10	Email to Katie re removal motion
394	KELLY	05/19/04 B	B190	0.10	Reviewing objection to motion to shorten
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	0.20	Conf w/ RDA re joint defense research
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	10.10	Researching common interest and attorney/client privilege
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	0.40	Reviewing joint defense agreement
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	0.50	Conf w/ EDS & RDA re objection to motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	0.70	Reviewing motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/20/04 B	B190	0.60	Conf w/ R. Allen re objection to committee's motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	2.80	Revising Objection to Committee's Motion to Compel
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	0.40	Preparing notice of service for objection to committee's motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	0.70	Keyciting cases in objection to motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamentier re objection to committee's motion
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	0.50	Conf w/ R. Allen re objection to motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/21/04 B	B190	2.80	Editing objection to committee's motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/22/04 B	B190	0.10	Email to K. Pamentier re response to Committee's motion to compel
394	KELLY	05/22/04 B	B190	0.80	Gathering binder for R. Barliant
394	KELLY	05/26/04 B	B190	1.30	Reviewing transcript from 5/24 hearing
		Total Task:	B190	36.10	11097.00
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04 B	B210	0.10	Rev. MOR
389	BUTZ	05/27/04 B	B210	0.20	Deal with administrative details concerning amended schedules
389	BUTZ	05/27/04 B	B210	0.10	Email from client re: MOR
389	BUTZ	05/28/04 B	B210	0.10	Review MOR; prep for filing
		Total Task:	B210	0.50	138.50
394	KELLY	05/05/04 B	B300	0.20	Conf w/ R. Howard re letter from Pitney Bowes
394	KELLY	05/05/04 B	B300	0.10	Message w/ Pitney Bowes re claim
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to DBB re stipulation resolving claim
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	0.10	Reviewing stipulation resolving claim
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	0.30	Reviewing documents for stipulation
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	0.10	Conf w/ R. Fusco & E. Campbell re motion to approve stip
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	1.10	Drafting and filing certification of counsel re claim stipulation
394	KELLY	05/28/04 B	B300	0.30	Editing certification of counsel re claim stipulation
		Total Task:	B300	2.30	506.00
594	CONWAY	05/28/04 B	B310	0.30	Discuss stipulation resolving claim of Midco w/EC and AK
597	CAMPBELL	05/24/04 B	B310	0.30	Prep nos re discl stmt and cert of counsels r same (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	05/26/04 B	B310	0.80	Prep cert counsel re order re fifth omn obj (.6);efile same (.2)



LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	PRO FORMA	AMOUNT	DETAILS
597	CAMPBELL	05/27/04 B	B310	0.20	Prep cert counsel re fifth omn obj for ct (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	05/28/04 B	B310	0.40	Prep cert counsel re midco claim
	Total Task:	B310		2.00	310.00
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.30	Plan and Disclosure Statement Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: discl. stmt., confirmation hearing, etc.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.20	Teleconf. w\ R. Barilant re: confirmation hearing, etc.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.20	Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: Discl. stmt., etc.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.20	Tele. w\ D. Morrison re: discl. stmt. and confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant and K. Pamentier re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant and K. Pamentier re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.20	Conf. w\ D. Butz and A. Kelly re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.30	Conf. w\ D. Butz and A. Kelly re: filings, discl. stmt., solicitation and confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04 B	B320	0.30	Tele. w\ R. Barilant (and in part K. Pamentier) re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04 B	B320	0.10	Teleconf. w\ A. Kelly re: confirmation hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04 B	B320	0.10	Rev. amended discl. stmt. notice
221	SCHWARTZ	05/28/04 B	B320	0.30	Rev. Discl. stmt. schedules
389	BUTZ	05/14/04 B	B320	0.20	Review objection of TCE claimants to plan exclusivity
389	BUTZ	05/20/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from co-counsel re: plan and disclosure statement redlines
389	BUTZ	05/20/04 B	B320	3.70	Prep disclosure statement and plan for filing
389	BUTZ	05/20/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with co-counsel (KP) re: disclosure statement and plan filings
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with Katie re: solicitation order
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: exhibit E to d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: exhibit E
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Review exhibit E
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: exhibit E
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: filing of D.S. and Plan
389	BUTZ	05/21/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: service of pleadings
389	BUTZ	05/25/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: service of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/25/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: d.s. service
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Katie re: notice of d.s. hearing and filing; review notice
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from co-counsel (KP) re: filing of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from N Peterman re: filing of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from R Barilant re: filings of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to RB, KP, NP, EDS and ABK re: filing of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from KP re: filing of d.s. and exhibits
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from NP re: filings of d.s.
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Emails from co-counsel re: disclosure statement
389	BUTZ	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: confirmation hrg dates
389	BUTZ	05/27/04 B	B320	0.10	Comm/ w/ K. Pamentier and reviewing served amended disclosure statement
394	KELLY	05/25/04 B	B320	0.30	disclosure statement
394	KELLY	05/26/04 B	B320	1.00	Preparing and filing 2nd amended disclosure statement, certificate of service and amended schedules

394	KELLY	05/26/04 B	B320	0.10	Reviewing emails from K. Pamentier re 2nd amended disclosure statement
597	CAMPBELL	05/21/04 B	B320	1.70	Review serv lst re serv of ds (.3);disc w/wp (.1);chk dock re sale order (.2);prep cert counsel re same for filing (.3);efiling same (.2);prep cert counsel re solicit order for filing (.3);efiling same (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	05/21/04 B	B320	0.80	Prep svc discl stmt, cert of counsel re sale order and cert of counsel re solicitation order (.8)
597	CAMPBELL	05/24/04 B	B320	0.20	Prep svc plan and discl stmt to trustee
597	CAMPBELL	05/25/04 B	B320	0.60	Email nos re discl stmt to KP (.1);edit serv list re same (.4);disc w/wp (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	05/26/04 B	B320	0.20	Prep COS re notice of filing re discl stmt (.1);prep same for efiling (.1)

Total Task: B320 13.30 3329.00

General Bankruptcy

134	SUDELL	05/13/04 B	B410	0.20	Confer with EDS.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/05/04 B	B410	0.10	Rev. Honeywell objection
221	SCHWARTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Rev. A. Kelly email re: motions
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04 B	B410	0.20	Rev. various orders
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04 B	B410	0.10	Rev. contractor motion
221	SCHWARTZ	05/13/04 B	B410	0.10	Rev. investigation motion
221	SCHWARTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Rev. investigation period stip.
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.10	Tele. w\ K. Pamentier re: Comm. Motion to Compel
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.30	Teleconf. w\ K. Pamentier and R. Barilant re: Comm. Motion to Compel
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.10	Emails to and from D. Butz re: motion to compel
221	SCHWARTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.10	Additional emails to and from D. Butz and A. Kelly re: Motion to Compel
221	SCHWARTZ	05/25/04 B	B410	0.10	Email to A. Kelly re: ordy course issues
221	SCHWARTZ	05/25/04 B	B410	0.20	Rev. R. Barilant, K. Pamentier, et. al. emails re: D.S.
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from R. Viginali re: motions
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: motion
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: exhibits to motion
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: motions to be filed
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: motion for patino lawsuit
389	BUTZ	05/06/04 B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: motions
389	BUTZ	05/11/04 B	B410	0.20	Conf with EC re: status request from district court (.1); email from EC re: status request from district court (.1)
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from Barluant re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/12/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel, Greenberg and ABK re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Email to Katie re: agenda and removal motion
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Conf with EDS re: research
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: removal motion
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	0.10	Emails from Katie re: 5th omnibus order
389	BUTZ	05/17/04 B	B410	2.80	Research re: nil
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/18/04 B	B410	0.10	Email to EDS and co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04 B	B410	0.10	Emails with EDS re: mtg for objection to shorten notice

389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.20	Conf with EDS re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Call from EDS re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.90	Conf with EDS re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from Katie re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: shorten notice
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from Katie re: shorten notice objection
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to Katie Ron and EDS re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email and msg from co-counsel re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/19/04	B	B410	0.10	Call with co-counsel (KP) re: revisions to objection to motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to EC re: agenda
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.20	Review agenda
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: motion to shorten
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/20/04	B	B410	0.30	Work with ABK on objection to 2004 motion
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Call with EDS re: hrg and filings
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: service of pleadings
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: joint defense objection
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with EC and ABK re: service of pleadings
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from EDS re: objection and 24th hrg
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails with co-counsel re: amended schedules
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: objection to 2004 motion
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: 2004 objection
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: Mestek common interest memo; review memo
389	BUTZ	05/21/04	B	B410	0.60	Research of 2004 objection
389	BUTZ	05/24/04	B	B410	2.10	Prep for hearing
389	BUTZ	05/24/04	B	B410	2.40	Attend hrg
389	BUTZ	05/24/04	B	B410	0.20	Conf with ABK re: pleadings
389	BUTZ	05/24/04	B	B410	0.10	Email form co-counsel re: transcript
389	BUTZ	05/24/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: transcript
389	BUTZ	05/25/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from ABK re: order and transcript
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: 5th omnibus order
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to EC and ABK re: 5th omnibus order
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.20	Revise certification of counsel for 5th omnibus order
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: notice of d.s. hrg
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: service of pleadings
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Call from Katie re: hrg date
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: confirmation date
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: ordinary course orders
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: ordinary course orders
389	BUTZ	05/26/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: ordinary course orders
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.30	Call with ABK and EDS to co-counsel re: hrg dates
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from WP re: filings

389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from claims agent re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: filings
389	BUTZ	05/27/04	B	B410	0.20	Review files
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: stipulation from co-counsel
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from ABK re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: date of stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from ABK re: status of stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: co-counsel explanation of stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: cert for stipulation
389	BUTZ	05/28/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: cert for stipulation
537	BATE	04/20/04	B	B410	0.30	Update case matters
543	PITCHER	05/03/04	B	B410	1.00	Document case management;
543	PITCHER	05/17/04	B	B410	1.40	Review docket and update case pleadings;
543	PITCHER	05/20/04	B	B410	3.50	Hearing prep
543	PITCHER	05/21/04	B	B410	2.50	Review docket and update case matters ;
560	TATE	05/20/04	B	B410	5.20	Hearing preparation for ejc
560	TATE	05/24/04	B	B410	2.60	Hearing preparation for Alicia Kelly
597	CAMPBELL	05/03/04	B	B410	0.80	P/d w/ct re fee hrg (.1);email to DB re same (.1);prep notice re same (.4);prep cos re same (.1);prep same for filing (.10)
597	CAMPBELL	05/06/04	B	B410	1.60	Prep nom re Beck settle mtn (.3);prep cos re same (.1);prep nom re Transhield agree (.3);prep cos re same (.1)edit same (.1);disc w/AK (.2);prep nom relief from stay mtn (.3);prep cos re same (.1);disc w/wp (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	05/11/04	B	B410	1.20	Prep notice to backdate re ltd relief stay mtn (.3);edit sarm (.1);prep notice to backdate re becks settlement mtn (.3);edit same (.1)prep notice to backdate re transhield agree mtn (.3);edit same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	05/12/04	B	B410	2.10	Chk on status rpt re New Hampshire matter (.9);disc same w/DB (.1);d/l doc re same for db (.1);email to co-counsel re same (.1);prep sub of course re same (.5);prep filing of same (.2);prep svc (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	05/13/04	B	B410	1.80	Prep agenda (1.8)
597	CAMPBELL	05/14/04	B	B410	0.80	Email to KP re New Hamp matter (.1);chk dock re oper rpt for Kp (.3);prep same for svc (.4)
597	CAMPBELL	05/19/04	B	B410	1.80	Prep obj to comm mnt to shorten for efilng (.1);efiling same (.6);chk dock re agenda matters (.3);prep cno's re same (.6);edit agenda (.6)
597	CAMPBELL	05/20/04	B	B410	5.40	Edit agenda (1.8);prep docs re same (.9);chk pleadings re same re serv data (.7);u/d serv lst re same (.5);review & edit binders re same (.7);prep svc (.4);prep nom re removal mtn (.3);prep cos re same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	05/20/04	B	B410	0.30	Prep nos re agenda (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	05/21/04	B	B410	4.00	Chk dock re agenda matters (.4);prep amended agenda (.1.2);edit agenda (.4);prep docs re same (.1.5);prep serv same (.5)
597	CAMPBELL	05/24/04	B	B410	2.90	Efilng second amend agenda (.2);prep svc same (.4);prep docs for hrg (1.3);prep nos re amended agendas (.6);u/d serv lst (.2);disc hrg date w/AK (.1);p/c to ct re same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	05/26/04	B	B410	0.50	Email wp re serv lst (.1);u/d fax serv (.4)

DATE:06/29/04 12:42:42  
MET-COIL SYSTEMS  
49828-DIP

PRO FORMA 61785 AS OF 05/31/04 INVOICE# 38053

597 CAMPBELL 05/28/04 B B410 1.20 Prep monthly oper rpt for filing (.5);prep cos re same  
(.1);efile same (.3);prep svc same (.3)

Total Task: B410 60.40 10465.00

FEE SUBTOTAL: 180.90 42161.50