## **EXHIBIT A**

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2195 WEB MMM.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION Met-Coil Systems Corporation c/o Charles F. Kuoni, III 711 Ogden Avenue Lisle, IL 60532

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 1

REGARDING: BANKRUPTCY

#### FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u> 07/01/04	DESCRIPTION Telephone conferences with A. Kelly re various	ATTY KAP	HOURS	AMOUNT
	certifications of counsel and review same (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
07/14/04	Telephone conferences with A. Kelly re stipulation and other filings (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
07/14/04	Review insurance settlement motions for filing (.90); prepare signature pages and documents for filing (.30)	KAP	1.20	420.00
07/15/04	Conference with KAP re FCR motion to clarify order and review same (0.4); conference with KAP re status of various matters (0.5)	RXB	0.90	477.00
07/16/04	Review draft motion re FCR order and conference with KAP and emails with T. Cairns and E. Harron re same (0.8)	RXB	0.80	424.00
07/16/04	Telephone conference with T. Cairns re motion and review same (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/18/04	Review and revise Mestek declaration (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/21/04	Prepare research agreement motion (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/22/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz and D. Butz re status of filings (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/22/04	Review and revise research agreement motion, amendments motion and Honeywell settlement motion (4.40)	KAP	4.40	1,540.00
07/23/04	Review and revise agenda (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
07/23/04	Review and comment on agenda and emails to KAP re same (0.7)	RXB	0.70	371.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WAW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 2	
07/26/04	Review and revise agenda and telephone conferences with A. Kelly re same (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY FILINGS			\$4,842.00
07/02/04	Prepare e-mails re PRP notices (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/02/04	Update re RXB analysis of PRP notices and work on position	APS	0.20	106.00
07/02/04	Review PRP notices and e-mails regarding violation of stay (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
07/02/04	Review PRP notices and research and emails re same	RXB	1.40	742.00
07/04/04	Email re PRP notices	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/06/04	Review PRP notices and related issues (.8); review email from RXB re same (.1); review case re same (.2); conference with APS re same (.2); draft email re same (.2); draft letter re same (.2)	MAZ	2.50	950.00
07/06/04	Confer with MAZ re automatic stay issue in contribution actions and review options in connection therewith	APS	0.30	159.00
07/07/04	Edit example response letter re PRP notices (0.3); review case law re pre-petition claims (1.2)	SKK	1.50	345.00
07/07/04	Review response letter to Third Party Defendants (.3)	DME+	0.30	31.50
07/07/04	Edit letter responding to notices (.3)	MAZ	0.30	114.00
07/07/04	Review and revise letter to contributors (.2)	MAZ	0.20	76.00
07/07/04	Review letter re PRP notices and email re same (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00
07/08/04	Review to e-mails re PRP notices and strategy vis a vis clarification and violation of stay (0.3); review draft letter to third parties re same (0.2)	OLA	0.50	180.00
07/09/04	Review final versions of letter to third parties re PRP notices (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
07/09/04	Review and emails re response to PRP notices (0.4)	RXB	0.40	212.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60503-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 200 5471.001/149009 PAGE 3	
07/09/04	Edit response letter re PRP notices (0.7); correspondence with N. Peterman, S. Bezark, F. Citera, and C. Kuoni re same (0.3)	SKK	1.00	230.00
07/12/04	Conference with RXB re draft of response to PRP letter (.2); review response to PRP letter (.1)	PTJ+	0.30	43.50
07/13/04	Review emails re PRP notices (.2)	MAZ	0.20	76.00
07/13/04	Review docket for stay motions	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/13/04	E-mails with SKK re PRP notices (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
07/13/04	Correspondence re PRP notices	SKK	0.20	46.00
07/15/04	Review PRP emails from RXB and SKK (.2); review issues re same (.3)	MAZ	0.50	190.00
07/15/04	Review email re subpoena response to PRP notices (.1)	MAZ	0.10	38.00
07/26/04	Review motion to extend stay (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/28/04	Edit response letters re PRP notices	SKK	2.00	
07/29/04	Review responses to PRP notices (.3); review email from SKK re PRP notices (.1); email to SKK re same (.1); review email from OLA re same (.1)	MAZ	0.60	460.00 228.00
07/29/04	Emails re PRP notices (0.3)	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/29/04	Correspondence with RXB and OLA re PRP notices (0.3); correspondence with C. Kuoni re same (0.5)	SKK	0.80	184.00

•	correspondence with C. Kuoni re same (0.5)	SKK	0.80	184.00
07/29/04	E-mails with SKK and RXB re strategy for contribution actions and PRP notices (0.3)	OLA	0.30	108.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR AUTOMATIC STAY MATTERS			\$5,461.00
07/01/04	Retrieve claims per order re first omnibus objection	KAB+	0.80	104_00
07/01/04	Prepare motion re personal injury settlements (2.0)	KAP	2.00	700.00
07/02/04	Review and telephone conferences regarding Exhibit H to Mejdrech settlement papers (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/02/04	Review and revise personal injury settlement motion	RXB	0.50	265.00
07/06/04	Review and comment on draft consent order (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 4		
07/07/04	Emails re Baker & McKenzie claim	RXB	0.40	212.00
07/07/04	Review and revise personal injury settlement agreements (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00
07/07/04	Review and revise Honeywell Settlement Agreement draft, draft consent order and draft personal injury settlement agreement (3.0); telephone conference with N. Peterman re PBGC claim (.20); telephone conferences with RXB, KSU, E. Schwartz re MB Financial claim (.70)	KAP	3.90	1,365.00
07/08/04	Emails re negotiation of US EPA claim (0.4); emails and telephone calls re Baker & McKenzie stipulation (0.5)	RXB	0.90	477.00
07/08/04	Telephone conference with RXB re settlement meeting (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/08/04	Review Mejdrech settlement papers (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
07/09/04	Prepare mark-up of consent order (2.60); review and comment on claim stipulations (.80); review and comment on Mejdrech settlement papers (1.50); telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (.30); prepare PBGC stipulation (.50)	KAP	5.70	1,995.00
07/12/04	Prepare DeVane Stipulation (.40); telephone conference with R. Perry re claim (.20)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/12/04	Review Mejdrech motion (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/13/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni and K. Michael re claims (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/13/04	Review and emails re Devane settlement documents	RXB	0.80	424.00
07/13/04	Prepare Central Steel Stipulation (.40); review and revise DeVane Stipulation (.30); e-mails to/from and conferences with DEM and APS re same (.30)	KAP	1.00	350.00
07/14/04	Telephone call with J. Spector re claim (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
07/14/04	Conference with KAP, review N. Peterman voice mail and research re Devane claims issue	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/14/04	Review emails and comment re same	MBM	0.30	114.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.337.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 5	
07/15/04	Review and comment on Consent Decree and telephone conferences with E. Wallace and S. Bezark re same (2.0)	KAP	2.00	700.00
07/15/04	Review Schreiber agreement (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/16/04	Review Schreiber settlement agreement (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/17/04	Review personal injury claimant settlement agreements (.60); review and revise motion re same (1.20); review DeVane settlement agreement (.40); review and revise DeVane stipulation (.20)	KAP	2.40	840.00
07/19/04	Telephone conferences with E. Wallace et al. re comments to Consent Decree and review and revise same (3.0); review and revise settlement agreements and stipulations and prepare motions re same (3.30); telephone conference with PBGC, N. Peterman and RXB re claim and stipulation (.60)	KAP	6.90	2,415.00
07/19/04	Review case information for People v. Lockformer	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/19/04	Review and send emails re Honeywell agreements (0.5) and DeVane Stipulation and release (0.6); conference with KAP re PBGC claim (0.3) and research re PBGC claim under section 365 (1.0)	RXB	2.40	1,272.00
07/20/04	Review and revise personal injury motions for filing (2.20); telephone conferences with N. Peterman re comments on motions (.50)	KAP	2.70	945.00
07/20/04	Consider ERISA issues re PBGC claim, including conference with RXB and telephone conference with RXB, W. Freudenrich re same	MLS	0.50	177.50
07/20/04	Conference with MLS and emails with KAP re PBGC (0.6); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (0.3)	RXB	0.90	477.00
07/20/04	Prepare e-mails re claims and continuation of hearing dates (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/21/04	Telephone conference with K. Lawson re claim and objection (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/26/04	Review and revise Puntero stipulation (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 6	
07/27/04	Review and revise Red River motion and telephone conference with R. Vignali re same (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION			\$15,640.50
07/18/04	Review Honeywell stipulation and telephone call to A. Zafrani re same (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS			\$70.00
07/01/04	Draft letter to court reporter re signature page to deposition transcript	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/01/04	Further e-mails and calls with KAP re scope of University of Illinois agreement (0.2); review agreement in light of information from KAP (0.2); e-mail to KAP re review of agreement (0.1)	OLA	0.50	180.00
07/02/04	Review and revise TRS contract (.50); telephone conference with C. Kuoni and K. Mack re same (.40); review reclamation notices (.20)	KAP	1.10	385.00
07/07/04	Search for record cites from LeClercq trial and any exhibits re invoices	DME+	1.90	199.50
07/08/04	Review Purdue contract (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/12/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re contract review and reclamation claim (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/15/04	Review and comment on ordinary course declaration (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/16/04	Telephone conference with SKK re creditor lists (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/16/04	Review U of I contract and Purdue contracts (0.7)	OLA	0.70	252.00
07/19/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re Stone Machinery (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
07/20/04	Conference with KAP re IP provisions of Purdue and Illinois contracts	OLA	0.20	72.00
07/22/04	Telephone conference with KAS re guaranty (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.CON 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 7

			5471.001/149009 PAGE 7	
07/22/04	Review of correspondence, conference with KAP re company filings (.2); conference with JMS re Delaware conversion issues, necessary forms (.1); correspondence with Mestek counsel re Met-Coil state filings (.1); conference with KAP re Mestek remediation guaranty (.2); review, editing of Mestek guaranty (1.1); preparation of mailing to Mestek counsel re guaranty (.2)	KAS	1.90	560.50
07/23/04	Conference with KAP re conversion filings (.1); correspondence with A. Zafrani re Met-Coil filings (.1); conference with KAP, correspondence with S. Bezark re Mestek guaranty (.2); review of revised guaranty (.4); correspondence with KAP re guaranty, LLC documents (.2)	KAS	1.00	295.00
07/23/04	Telephone conference with KAS re guaranty (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/26/04	Review agenda and attend board meeting	RXB	0.60	318.00
07/26/04	Attend board meeting and prepare minutes (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
07/26/04	Telephone conferences with E. Wallace, S. Bezark and KAS re guaranty (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/26/04	Review of revised Mestek guaranty (.3); conference call with KAP, S. Bezark, E. Wallace re guaranty issues (.2); correspondence with KAP re legal conversion matter (.1); review of Met-Coil board minutes (.3)	KAS	0.90	265.50
07/27/04	Review, editing of LLC documentation re Met-Coil conversion (1.2); correspondence and conferences with N. Peterman and KAP re LLC conversion and related documentation (.4); preparation of package re operating agreement comments (.4)	KAS	2.00	590.00
07/29/04	Review press release from AG (.2); review press release from Mestek (.2)	MAZ	0.40	152.00
07/29/04	Review press releases	SKK	0.50	115.00
07/29/04	Emails and telephone conferences with K. Mack and C. Kuoni re dealing with press re consent decree (0.8); review Mestek press release and emails with C. Kuoni re same (0.5)	RXB	1.30	689.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 8

	SUB-TOTAL FOR CORPORATE MATTERS			\$5,162.50
07/01/04	Review environmental documents submitted to Board of Review (.9); meet with TFM re PTAB requirements (.5); meet with SKK and BDF re PTAB requirements (.6)	ALG	2.00	430.00
07/01/04	Conference with ALG re filing evidence	BDF	0.20	46.00
07/02/04	Review correspondence re PTAB appeal and exhibit filing date (.20); telephone call to PTAB re upcoming exhibit filing date (.1)	ALG	0.30	64.50
07/06/04	Telephone conference with PTAB (.2); conference with TFM re same (.1); e-mail to TFM, ALG (.2)	BDF	0.50	115.00
07/06/04	Telephone conference with appraiser (.20); telephone conference with client re extension (.10); confer internally re status of request for extension and procedure for obtaining further extension of time (.40)	TFM	0.70	339.50
07/07/04	Draft letter to PTAB requesting extension	BDF	0.50	115.00
07/07/04	Attention to PTAB filing	TFM		115.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TAX MATTERS	1 % 141	0.50	242.50 \$1,352.50
07/01/04	Telephone conference with OLA and C. Kuoni re potential contribution settlement (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
07/01/04	Search for invoices or shipment notices in trial exhibits and document production	DME+	0.80	84.00
07/02/04	Review final report of R. St. John (0.7)	OLA	0.70	252.00
07/07/04	Telephone conference with SKK and review letter re testing issues	RXB	0.30	252.00 159.00
07/07/04	Teleconference with C. Kuoni re settlement strategy and developing itemization of costs incurred (0.3); teleconference with MAZ re same (0.3)	OLA	0.60	216.00
07/08/04	Call with SKK re case status and review of correspondence (0.2); Review C. Kuoni e-mail re itemization of costs incurred (0.2)	OLA	0.40	144.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MOHROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 9	
07/09/04	Review message from expert and strategy in litigation (0.2); e-mail from SKK re same (0.1); call with SKK re same and re meeting with Hybrids Defendants (0.2); e-mail from MAZ re meeting with Hybrids Defendants (0.1)	OLA	0.60	216.00
07/16/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/27/04	Prepare hook-up election notice and forms (.90)	KAP	0.90	315.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS			\$1,596.00
07/01/04	Further e-mails with MAZ, DEM, APS, KAP, RXB re to do list (0.4); call with KAP and C. Kuoni re settlement issues and strategy (0.3); conference with KAP re third-party contributors (0.1); conference with MAZ and RXB re settlement strategy (0.4); conference with DME re 26(a)(1) disclosure (0.1); review M. Billet letter re discovery (0.1); review e-mail from A. Green re R. St. John (0.1)	OLA	1.50	540.00
07/01/04	Review email re outstanding discovery (.3); sent multiple emails re same (.4); conference with SKK re same (.2); review expert reports (2.3); review data re same (.4); conference with SKK re same (.2); review discovery letter from contributors (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); conference with SKK re case strategy (.2); review subpoena (.1); conference with SKK re same (.2); conference with RXB and OLA re settlement strategy (.4); teleconference with RXB re same (0.1)	MAZ	5.20	1,976.00
07/01/04	Consider status of environmental information and EPA order	TFM	1.00	485.00
07/01/04	Conference with MAZ re outstanding discovery (0.2); conference with MAZ re expert reports (0.2); review correspondence from Third-Party Defendants (0.2); conference with MAZ re same (0.2); conference with MAZ re case strategy (0.2); correspondence with MAZ and RXB re electronic data files (0.3); conference with MAZ re subpoena (0.2)	SKK	1.50	345.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WAW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 5471.001/1490 PAGE 10	
07/01/04	Conference with OLA and MAZ re contribution actions and settlement strategy (0.4); teleconference with MAZ re same (0.1); telephone conference with N. Peterman re Groundwater subpoena (0.5)	RXB	1.00	530.00
07/02/04	Teleconference with MAZ re proposed settlement strategy (0.3); teleconference with MAZ and C. Kuoni re same (0.2); follow-up correspondence with MAZ (0.3)	SKK	0.80	184.00
07/02/04	Review settlement strategy (.8); conference with SKK re same (.3); teleconference with C. Kuoni and SKK re same (.2); review expert reports and related documents (1.4)	MAZ	2.70	1,026.00
07/05/04	Review settlement strategy	MAZ	0.50	190.00
07/06/04	Review class action complaint and related issues (.7); review email from RXB re same (.1); review cases re same (.2); conference with APS re same (.2); draft email re same (.2); draft letter re same (.5); attention to settlement issues (.5)	MAZ	2.40	912.00
07/06/04	Condense and organize litigation files	DME+	4.80	504.00
07/07/04	Conference with MAZ re settlement strategy (0.3); draft portion of contract with consultant (0.3); conference with RXB and MAZ re potential for settlement discussions (0.4); teleconference with contribution counsel re potential settlement (0.3); draft letter to R. Repko re testing issues (1.4); conference with MAZ re same (0.2); conference with MAZ re case strategy (0.2); correspondence with RXB and MAZ re case strategy (0.3); teleconferences with R. St. John re expert reports (0.2); conference with DME re expert reports (0.3); additional conference with MAZ re settlement strategy (0.6)	SKK	4.30	989.00
07/07/04	Conference with MAZ and SKK re potential settlement (0.4); conference with KAP re same (0.3); conference with MAZ and emails re same (0.3)	RXB	0.40	212.00
07/07/04	Conference with MAZ and SKK re potential settlement (0.4); conference with KAP re same (0.3); conference with MAZ and emails re same (0.3)	RXB	0.60	318.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB MMM.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION
----------	---------	-------------

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 11

			5471.001/1490 PAGE 11	009
07/07/04	Conference with SKK re settlement strategy (.3); review settlement issues and strategy (.8); review documents re same (.6) conference with RXB and SKK re settlement strategy (.4); review draft letter re testing issues (.3); conference with SKK re same (.2); conference with SKK re strategy with contributors (.2); review same (.5); email to RXB re Mestek (.1); review expert's bill (.2); conference with SKK re same (.1); review materials on contributor usage (.8); conference with RXB re settlement strategy (.2); conference with SKK re same (.6)	MAZ	4.50	1,710.00
07/08/04	Call from OLA re case status (.1); email to OLA re same (.2); review settlement options (.8); conference with SKK re same (1.2); conference with C. Kuoni and SKK re same (.3); review emails re contributor letter (.2); prepare for settlement conferences and review relevant materials (4.2); multiple conferences with SKK re same (.8)	MAZ	7.80	2,964.00
07/08/04	Review and comment upon settlement documentation	APS	0.30	159.00
07/08/04	Correspondence with OLA re case status and testing issues (0.2); conference with MAZ re settlement options (1.2); teleconference with C. Kuoni and MAZ re potential settlement (0.3); correspondence with J. Connor (0.2); preliminarily outline response costs and settlement strategy (0.5); multiple conference with MAZ re settlement strategy (0.8)	SKK	3.20	736.00
07/09/04	Review emails re negotiations re contribution actions (0.2)	RXB	0.20	106.00
07/09/04	Research re compensable response costs (2.5); review response cost figures prepared by C. Kuoni (0.5); follow-up correspondence with MAZ re response costs (0.3); conference with MAZ re settlement strategy (0.5); preparation for meeting with contributor lawyers (0.5); conference with MAZ and contributor lawyers (0.8); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.9); correspondence with R. Repko (0.2); conference with MAZ re testing issues (0.2); correspondence with OLA re same (0.2); teleconference with R. St. John re expert issues (0.3); conference with KAP re update on potential for settlement (0.2); additional conference with MAZ re settlement (0.4)	SKK	7.50	1,725.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM SS EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

MET-COII	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 12	
07/09/04	Prepared for settlement conference (1.8); conference with SKK re same (.5); meet with contributor lawyers (.8); conference with SKK re same (.9); email to group re same (.2); conference with SKK re testing issue (.2); review materials for further settlement discussions (1.7); conference with SKK re same (.4)	MAZ	6.50	2,470.00
07/12/04	Call with SKK re subpoena to J. Connor (0.2); review work product issues (0.4); call with KAP re Groundwater services (0.1)	OLA	0.70	252.00
07/12/04	Teleconference with J. Connor re subpoena (0.3); follow- up teleconference with OLA re same (0.2)	SKK	0.50	115.00
07/12/04	Condense and organize litigation files	DME+	5.00	525.00
07/13/04	Conference with MAZ re service requirements for expert reports	SKK	0.20	46.00
07/13/04	Review correspondence from consultant re materials (.1); review email and documents re same (.4); review ordinary course affidavit (.2); review issue re service requirements (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); review outstanding discovery issues (.4)	MAZ	1.50	570.00
07/13/04	Review and organize third party documents and condense litigation files	DME+	2.20	231.00
07/13/04	Draft contract for consulting services (1.5); draft affidavit for ordinary course professional (0.5); correspondence with F. Citera and S. Bezark (0.1); correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultants (0.2)	SKK	2,30	529.00
07/13/04	Review consultant contract (0.1); review 7/15 hearing and call to E. Manzke re same (0.2); call consultant to Holland & Knight re 7/15 hearing (0.1); e-mails with SKK re service requirements (0.2)	OLA	0.60	216.00
07/14/04	Edit contract and correspondence with consultant (0.3)	SKK	0.30	69.00
07/14/04	Review letter from Scot, Inc. re scope of Phase I (0.2); correspondence with E. Walsh re same (0.1); conference with SKK re disclosure motion (0.2); follow up e-mails with E. Walsh re Phase I (0.2)	OLA	0.70	252.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 13	004 99
07/15/04	Review issues re J. Connor subpoena and related issues (.4); review related email (.1)	MAZ	0.50	190.00
07/15/04	Teleconference with consultant	SKK	0.30	69.00
07/15/04	Conference with SKK re "approval" hearing (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
07/16/04	Background research on expert witnesses and CERCLA (2.2); conference with SKK re same (0.3)	AMW+	2.50	362.50
07/16/04	Research re standing re motion to quash (1.5); research re non-testifying experts (1); conference with OLA re research on motion to quash and non-testifying expert (0.3); follow-up teleconference with OLA re jurisdictional issue with subpoena (0.2); research re Rule 45 and territorial limit (1); follow-up correspondence with OLA re same (0.3); correspondence with consultant and KAP (0.2); review cases re circumstantial evidence in CERCLA cause of action (0.8); conference with AMW re CERCLA research (0.3); teleconference re J. Connor subpooena (0.2); review correspondence re J. Connor subpooena; correspondence with OL A re strategy concerning subpoena (0.5)	SKK	6.40	1,472.00
07/16/04	Conference with SKK re J. Connor subpoena (0.3); follow- up with SKK re jurisdictional issue with subpoena (0.2); review correspondence from SKK re subpoena (0.2); review SKK e-mail summarizing strategy on subpoena (0.3)	OLA	1.00	360.00
07/17/04	Continue background research on expert testimony	AMW+	1.30	188.50
07/19/04	Emails with MAZ re settlement	RXB	0.20	106.00
07/19/04	Research re expert testimony in environmental litigation	AMW+	4.00	580.00
07/19/04	Research re Rule 26 and electronic data files (2.8); correspondence with consultant (0.3); teleconference with contributor lawyer re settlement issues (0.3); teleconference with consultant re contract conflict issues (0.3); follow-up teleconference with KAP re same (0.1); follow-up teleconference with consultants (0.2); follow-up conferences with MAZ re settlement issues (0.6)	SKK	4.60	1,058.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 14	
07/19/04	Review letter re consultant (.1); review J. Connor issues and subpoena (.4); conferences with SKK re settlement issues (.7); review strategy re same (.3); correspondence with RXB re same (.2); review bill (.8); conference with OLA re settlement (.2)	MAZ	2.70	1,026.00
07/19/04	E-mails re settlement (0.1); conference with MAZ re settlements (0.2)	OLA	0.30	108.00
07/20/04	Correspondence with M. Bilut (0.8); review J. Connor report (0.7); correspondence with consultants (0.5); research re Rule 26 (1.5); teleconference with DME and J. Mercer re discovery issues (0.2); teleconferences with consultant re discovery issues (0.5); conference with MAZ re case status (0.2); conferences with MAZ re action items (0.9); teleconference with M. Bilut (0.1); correspondence with MAZ re expert issues (0.6); teleconference with J. Mercer (0.1)	SKK	6.10	1,403.00
07/20/04	Continue research re expert testimony	AMW+	2.00	290.00
07/20/04	Review correspondence from former counsel re service (.1); conference with SKK re disclosure and case status (.2); review issues re same (.5); call to consultant re status (.2); review strategy and materials re same (.8); review file issues (.3); conference with DME re same (.2); review subpoena issue (.3); review insurance issues (.3); conference with SKK re same (.1); conference with SKK re billing (.2); conference with SKK re response to contributors discovery issues (.3); review materials from consultant (1.4); conference with SKK re same (.3); review same (.6)	MAZ	5.80	2,204.00
07/20/04	Teleconference with J. Mercer and SKK re discovery issues (.3); copy disk in preparation of production to Third-party defendants(.4); review and organize third party documents and condense litigation files (2.8); conference with MAZ re status of same (.2)	DME+	3.70	388.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 15

			PAGE 15	
07/21/04	Conference with SKK re discovery requests from contributors (.3); conference with SKK re disclosure issue (.1); review issues re disclosure (.3); prepare for status meeting (.6); conference with SKK re same (.3); review DGSD issues and related materials (.8); conference with SKK re same (.2); prepared for conference with consultant (.3); conference with SKK re same (.1); teleconference with consultant (.5); conference with SKK re case strategy (.3); review disclosure materials and outline (.8); review subpoenas from Magnetrol (.2); call to DME re same (.1); conference with DME re files (.4); review Parsons materials (.5); review attorney materials re themes and strategies (.4)	MAZ	6.20	2,356.00
07/21/04	Conference with MAZ re discovery requests from Third-Party Defendants (0.3); conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.1); conference with MAZ re case status (0.3); conference with MAZ re DGSD issues (0.2); teleconference with consultant (0.5); conference with MAZ re consultant issues (0.1); draft outline re motion re disclosure (1); conference with MAZ re case strategy (0.3)	SKK	2.80	644.00
07/22/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issues (0.2); read cases re disclosure issue (0.8)	SKK	1.00	230.00
07/22/04	Review disclosure cases (1.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); review DGSD documents and strategy (1.8)	MAZ	3.20	1,216.00
07/22/04	Review e-mails with MAZ re T. Sykes analysis and comparison with J. Mercer Report (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
07/23/04	Review letter to M. Bilut from SKK (.3); bates label documents to be produced to the third party defendants (.3); conference with SKK re document production (.2)	DME+	0.80	84.00
07/23/04	Conferences with OLA re discovery dispute and edits to response letter (0.2); conference with DME re document production (0.2); review correspondence re documents produced by Met-Coil (0.3); draft and serve correspondence re Third-Party Defendants' informal discovery requests (1.5); read cases re disclosure issue (1.2)	SKK	3.40	782.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009

		5471.001/149009 PAGE 16		
07/23/04	Review discovery letter from contributors (.1); review court orders re testimony (.8); review strategy re same (.5); review portions of Devane and other transcripts (1.9); call to consultant re meeting (.2); prepared for same (.8); review DGSD issues (0.8)	MAZ	5.10	1,938.00
07/23/04	Review letter from McDermott re discovery disputes (0.1); conference with SKK re same (0.1); review letter to M. Bilut (0.1); conference with SKK re same (0.1)	OLA	0.40	144.00
07/26/04	Teleconference with consultant re meeting (.2); review of DGSD documents (1.8); teleconference with consultant re same (.8); conference with SKK re disclosure issue (.2); email to SKK and OLA re consultant (.2); review issues re DGSD discovery (.4)	MAZ	3.60	1,368.00
07/26/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.2)	SKK	0.20	46.00
07/27/04	Email to KAP re case status (.1); review outstanding discovery issues (.4); review potential rebuttal issues (.8)	MAZ	1.30	494.00
07/27/04	Read cases re work product and disclosure issues (2.5); additional research re same (2.2); draft motion re disclosure issue (3)	SKK	7.70	1,771.00
07/28/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure motion	OLA	0.30	108.00
07/28/04	Email to SKK re action items (.1); email to SKK re disclosure issue (.1); review issues re DGSD discovery (.7); review court orders affecting testimony (.6); conference with consultant re discovery (.3); review documents to consultant (.9); review liability issues (.6)	MAZ	3.30	1,254.00
07/28/04	Conference with OLA re disclosure motion (0.3); teleconferences with D. Helms (0.4); correspondence with R. Repko re testing issues (0.2); correspondence with R. St. John re discovery issues (0.1); teleconference with M. Kalsted (0.3); teleconference with E. Harvey re discovery issues (0.2); correspondence with opposing counsel re document production (0.3); research re work product immunity and disclosure issues (2.5)	SKK	4.30	989.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 NEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 35-2863762

МЕТ-СОП	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 5471.001/1490 PAGE 17	2004 009
07/29/04	Conference with SKK re status of discovery (.2); conference with SKK re outstanding subpoenas (.2); conference with SKK re response to contributors (.2); review response to DuPage County re subpoena (.2); review expert reports re areas for rebuttal (1.2)	MAZ	2.00	760.00
07/29/04	Continue research re expert witnesses and CERCLA	AMW+	4.00	580.00
07/29/04	E-mails with SKK re disclosure issue (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
07/29/04	Conference with SKK re action items (.3); review expert report for referenced materials and copy same for consultant (2); review documents received from Village of Lisle (1.2); copy SKK re same (.2)	DME+	3.70	388.50
07/29/04	Conference with MAZ re case status (0.2); conference with MAZ re outstanding subpoenas (0.2); teleconference with D. Helms (0.2); teleconference with R. St. John re discovery issues (0.2); conference with MAZ re response to Third-Party Defendants (0.2); correspondence with R. St. John (0.1); correspondence with OLA re disclosure issue (0.2); draft motion re disclosure issue (1.5); conference with DME re action items (.3)	SKK	3.10	713.00
07/30/04	Conference with SKK re testing issues (0.2); further conference with SKK re disclosure issue (0.2)	OLA	0.40	144.00
07/30/04	Conference with SKK re materials to be sent to consultant (.5); locate and review materials (1.6)	DME+	2.10	220.50
07/30/04	Teleconference with R. St. John re documents (0.1); teleconference with OLA re testing issues (0.2); teleconference with R. St. John re discovery requests (0.2); draft and edit motion re disclosure issue (9); conference with OLA re motion re disclosure issue (0.2); conference with DME re document production (0.5)	SKK	10.20	2,346.00
07/31/04	Draft and edit motion re disclosure issue	SKK	4.50	1,035.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL LITIGATION			-,000.00
0 = 1= =				\$50,482.50
07/21/04	Attend hearing in DuPage County (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 5471.001/1490 PAGE 18	
07/23/04	Prepare checklist and assemble agreements and other materials for confirmation hearing	KAB+	3.00	390.00
07/23/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, A. Cole, F. Citera and KAP re agenda and handling hearing (0.8)	RXB	0.80	424.00
07/26/04	Review docket, retrieve pleadings/affidavits in support of confirmation	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/26/04	Conferences with KAB re hearing preparation (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/26/04	Search for pleadings re settlement filings under seal	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/26/04	Office conference with KAP re hearing preparation (.2); retrieve materials for confirmation hearing (1.5)	KAB+	1.70	221.00
07/27/04	Review settlement agreements and prepare checklist of provisions/requirements to same (4); correspond with various individuals re hearing preparation, and service re same (2)	KAB+	6.00	780.00
07/28/04	Prepare for and attend confirmation hearing (4.5); review draft order (1.1)	RXB	5.60	2,968.00
07/28/04	Prepare for, attend and follow up re confirmation hearing	APS	6.10	3,233.00
07/28/04	Review hearing agenda and review/prepare proposed orders for confirmation hearing (3); correspond with KAP, RXB, APS, and C. Kuoni throughout the day re various issues in preparation for same (1); attend confirmation hearing (1.5)	KAB+	5.50	715.00
07/28/04	Prepare for and attend confirmation hearing	KAP	7.20	2,520.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY HEARINGS			\$11,666.00
07/02/04	Correspond with accounting re fee application	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/06/04	Review docket, prepare e-mail re June fee applications	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/07/04	Review fee statement, correspond with accounting re same, and revise and prepare monthly fee application for May	KAB+	2.80	364.00
07/08/04	Review and sign May statement	RXB	0.20	106.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 NEB WHW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-CO	IL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/14900 PAGE 19	
07/08/04	Attention to KAP comments, revise fee application with same, and prepare for filing (1.2); review June pro forma (.3)	KAB+	1.50	195.00
07/08/04	Review and revise GK pro forma (2.50)	KAP	2.50	875.00
07/15/04	Calls to SKK and e-mail to RXB re status of proforma, discuss same with accounting	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/19/04	Correspond with SKK re status of fee statement	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/22/04	Conferences with KAB and SKK re pro forma issues (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/23/04	Review/revise fee application (1.5); meet with BXD re fee statement (.3); correspond with various individuals re same (.5)	KAB+	2.30	299.00
07/27/04	Further review of revised fee statement	KAB+	1.00	120.00
07/29/04	Review/revise fee statement and application	KAB+	- · · · · ·	130.00
07/30/04	Review revised fee statement	KAB+	2.00 1.00	260.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLICATIONS (GK)	THE COLUMN TO TH	1.00	130.00 \$2,594.00
07/01/04	Strategize re contribution actions and confirmation hearing	DEM	0.30	07.50
07/01/04	Research issues for confirmation brief (1.8); conference w/RXB re: strategy (0.3)	AMS	2.10	97.50 441. <b>0</b> 0
07/01/04	Review various lists of open items in connection with confirmation hearing (.5); confer with RXB re confirmation hearing (.5); confer with RXB re injunction issue and consider strategy re same (.2); consider notice issue re sale (.1)	APS	0.80	424.00
07/01/04	Prepare notice re disclosure statement (.50); telephone conference with M. Araki and A. Kelly re same (.50)	KAP	1.00	350.00
07/01/04	Draft outline of confirmation order (3.2); telephone conference with N. Peterman re hearing strategy (0.5); conference with AMS re confirmation brief (0.3)	RXB	4.00	2,120.00
07/01/04	Prepare C. Kuoni affidavit (2.80)	KAP	2.80	980.00
07/01/04	Retrieve disclosure statement	KAB+	0.50	65.00
				05.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WE8 WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MOHROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLIMOIS 60603~5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 20	
07/02/04	Research and draft confirmation brief	AMS	1.40	294.00
07/02/04	Prepare C. Kuoni affidavit (4.0)	KAP	4.00	1,400.00
07/02/04	Confer with RXB re selection to trustee for future claims (.2)	APS	0.20	106.00
07/02/04	Retrieve plan confirmation materials	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/02/04	Conference with APS and GFM and telephone conferences with E. Katz and N. Peterman re appointment of trustee (0.5); KAP email re same (0.2); respond to emails re affidavits (0.2)	RXB	0.90	477.00
07/03/04	Draft outline of confirmation order and research re same	RXB	2.30	1,219.00
07/04/04	Draft outline of confirmation order and emails re same	RXB	1.00	530.00
07/04/04	Research and draft confirmation brief	AMS	5.20	1,092.00
07/05/04	Research and draft confirmation brief	AMS	8.40	1,764.00
07/05/04	Review plan and research in preparation for strategy meeting	RXB	0.90	477.00
07/05/04	Prepare for meeting with Greenberg Traurig re confirmation strategy (.2); review draft brief on confirmation issues (.6)	APS	0.80	424.00
07/06/04	Prepare C. Kuoni affidavit (3.70); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re same (.30)	KAP	4.00	1,400.00
07/06/04	Attend plan confirmation meeting at Greenberg Traurig	AMS	2.80	588.00
07/06/04	Correspondence, review of correspondence with N. Peterman, KAP re TCE funding documents (.2); review of funding agreement and security agreement (.3)	KAS	0.50	147.50
07/06/04	Review revised Exhibit H (.60); attend confirmation hearing prep meeting (2.80)	KAP	3.40	1,190.00
07/06/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, F. Citera, A. Cole, M. Prewitt, APS and KAP re confirmation hearing strategy	RXB	2.10	1,113.00
07/06/04	Office conferences with RXB, APS, KAP, AMS, A. Cole, N. Peterman, F. Citera and M. Prewitt re confirmation hearing issues	DEM	2.50	812.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WHW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 21	
07/06/04	Work on confirmation strategy (.2); attend meeting at Greenberg Traurig re same (2.4)	APS	2.60	1,378.00
07/07/04	Review and revise C. Kuoni declaration (3.30)	KAP	3.30	1,155.00
07/07/04	Consider follow up to meeting and call with F. Citera re next steps (.3); work on miscellaneous issues relating to solicitation and plan terms, etc. (.7); confer with RXB re strategy going forward (.1); participate in call with J. Berkeley re insurer affidavits (.2); work on confirmation planning (.2)	APS	1.50	795.00
07/07/04	Review and revise confirmation brief (1.5); telephone conference with J. Berkeley and KAP re insurance affidavits (0.8); draft language for insurers affidavit (0.5)	RXB	2.80	1,484.00
07/07/04	Discuss postpetition interest issues with KAP	RLK	0.20	90.00
07/08/04	Work on C. Kuoni affidavit (.2); consideration to miscellaneous evidentiary issues (.1)	APS	0.30	159.00
07/08/04	Conference w/RXB re: confirmation brief and review research re: same	AMS	0.20	42.00
07/08/04	Review J. Berkeley e-mail re affidavit on insurance (.1); review of C. Kuoni affidavit and transmit comments to RXB and KAP (1.0); consider production issues (.1)	APS	1.10	583.00
07/08/04	Correspond re request for records	DEM	0.30	97.50
07/08/04	Review and revise C. Kuoni declaration (2.9); emails with J. Berkeley and telephone conference with KAP re insurer affidavits (0.7); review and revise confirmation brief (1.5)	RXB	5.10	2,703.00
07/08/04	Retrieve materials re confirmation	KAB+	0.80	104.00
07/09/04	Confer with KAP re plan provisions	APS	0.10	53.00
07/09/04	Review and revise C. Kuoni declaration (1.50); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same and status (.50)	KAP	2.00	700.00
07/09/04	Revise confirmation brief (2.5); review C. Kuoni declaration (0.5)	RXB	3.00	1,590.00
07/10/04	Research re injunctions	RXB	0.70	371.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 22	
07/11/04	Work on C. Kuoni affidavit and brief (1.2); review Celotex decision re injunction issue (.2)	APS	1.40	742.00
07/11/04	Revise confirmation brief and research re same	RXB	2.50	1,325.00
07/11/04	Prepare BMC Declaration (2.10)	KAP	2.10	735.00
07/12/04	Prepare release of Devane judgment	DEM	1.30	422.50
07/12/04	Review and revise confirmation brief and conference with RXB re same (2.50)	KAP	2.50	875.00
07/12/04	Conference with APS re brief (0.1); conference with KAP re same (0.5); revise same (3.3)	RXB	3.90	2,067.00
07/12/04	Review confirmation brief	AMS	0.40	84.00
07/12/04	Work on open issues	APS	0.20	106.00
07/13/04	Review and revise confirmation brief (4.7); emails with KAP, APS and DEM re staffing and strategy for confirmation hearing (0.4)	RXB	5.10	2,703.00
07/13/04	Gather and prepare documents for potential witness	KAB+	3.20	416.00
07/13/04	E-mails to/from RXB and APS re confirmation hearing (.20); revise section of confirmation brief (2.70)	KAP	2.90	1,015.00
07/13/04	Prepare release of judgment (.3); office conference with GFM and KAP re same (.3); internal correspondence re same (.4); review proposed settlement agreement with Devane (.5); prepare memo to APS re alter ego materials (.7); office conference with KAB re same (.3); prepare stipulation (1); office conferences with APS, KAP and RXB re stipulation and release (1); office conference with APS re confirmation hearing (.3); draft letter to expert (.5); draft index of documents (.4); prepare letter (.4); review CBIZ report for hearing (.4)	DEM	6.50	2,112.50
07/13/04	Work on various confirmation issues (1.1); work on expert testimony issues (3)	APS	1.40	742.00
07/13/04	Conferences with DEM and KAB re production of documents	CSC	0.50	95.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 NEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 23		
07/14/04	Work on C. Kuoni affidavit (.2); attention to miscellaneous confirmation issues including expert testimony options (.5); work on confirmation brief (.4)	APS	1.10	583.00
07/14/04	Revise brief and emails re same (2.6); conference with GLJ re research re same (0.3); emails re same (0.2); review language for Settling Insurers declarations and emails re same (0.4)	RXB	3.50	1,855.00
07/14/04	Prepare release of judgment attachment to Stipulation (.3); correspond re release of judgment (.3); telephone conference with F. Balotti re expert opinion on alter-ego theory (.4); office conferences with APS re expert testimony re alter-ego (.4); review and edit confirmation brief (.4)	DEM	1.80	585.00
07/15/04	Review and revise confirmation brief (3.0)	KAP	3.00	1,050.00
07/15/04	Confer with KAP re testimonial issues (.2); work on brief in support of confirmation (1.3); participate in call with Berkeley re affidavit and work on revisions (.4); review proposed AIG affidavit language (.1); review motion re futures rep (.2); review letter re F. Balotti (.1)	APS	2.30	1,219.00
07/15/04	Telephone conferences with M. Prewitt, J. Berkeley and APS re Berkeley declaration (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
07/15/04	Review and comments to confirmation brief (2.6); conference w/KAP re: same (0.2)	AMS	2.80	588.00
07/15/04	Review and edit confirmation brief (2); draft letter to F. Balotti re scope of work (.8)	DEM	2.80	910.00
07/16/04	Review APS comments re F. Balotti letter (.2); office conferences with APS re expert witness (.5); revise and finalize letter (.3)	DEM	1.00	325.00
07/16/04	Review confirmation brief and conference with KAP and emails with APS and DEM re same (0.9); review emails and documents re various documents and declarations required for hearing (0.5)	RXB	1.40	742.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2195 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLENOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 24	
07/16/04	Confer with DEM re affidavit form expert on alter ego (.1); call with F. Citera re confirmation evidence and consider same (.5); attention to various exchanges of e-mails re various open confirmation issues (.2)	APS	0.80	424.00
07/16/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re agreements and futures rep negotiations (.60); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re voting on Plan (.30); telephone conferences with M. Araki re reports and same (.30)	KAP	1.20	420.00
07/16/04	Review and revise confirmation brief, C. Kuoni declaration and BMC declaration (3.90)	KAP	3.90	1,365.00
07/17/04	Prepare e-mails re claims and other confirmation issues (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/17/04	Review and comment on confirmation order, Mestek declaration and Stoubaugh declaration and prepare e-mails re same (2.0)	KAP	2.00	700.00
07/17/04	Review draft order and Mestek Declaration and emails and conference with KAP re same	RXB	1.90	1,007.00
07/18/04	Review and revise draft order and e mail to N. Peterman and F. Citera re same	RXB	2.10	1,113.00
07/18/04	Review drafts of our papers (1.2); review Greenberg Traurig drafts (.8); comments to RXB and KAP (.3)	APS	2.30	1,219.00
07/18/04	Review and revise confirmation order (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/19/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman and S. Bezark re various confirmation matters (1.50); telephone conference with H. Elkins re not receiving Ballot and telephone conference with M. Araki re same (.20)	KAP	1.70	595.00
07/19/04	Review and comment on E. Green draft declaration and conference with KAP re same (0.5); emails with N. Peterman and KAP re order (0.5); emails with N. Peterman and KAP re trustee appointment (0.3)	RXB	1.30	689.00
07/19/04	Review R. Stobough draft affidavit (.7); office conference with KAP re same (.3); edit same (.5); review release (.3); correspond with F. Citera re affidavit (.3); review CBIZ draft affidavit (.4)	DEM	2.50	812.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

5471			UGUST 30, 2004 471.001/149009 AGE 25	
07/20/04	Prepare CBIZ affidavit re expert report (1.5); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.2); edit brief (.3); office conference with KAP (.3); telephone conference with C. Kuoni (.2)	DEM	2.50	812.50
07/20/04	Conference and emails with KAP re modifications to plan/order (0.2) research re same (0.8); telephone conference with E. Schwartz re same and review email from D. Butz re same (0.3); review and comment on E. Green declaration and conference with KAP re same (1.1); telephone conference with N. Peterman re trust and financing issues (0.5); conference with KAP re trust issues (0.3); telephone conference with R. Millner re declaration and confirmation order and emails to KAP and N. Peterman re same (0.6)	RXB	3.80	2,014.00
07/20/04	Review revised Consent Decree and telephone conferences with S. Bezark, E. Wallace and C. Kuoni re same (1.50); review and revise stipulations (.50); review and comment on futures rep declaration (1.20)	KAP	3.20	1,120.00
07/20/04	Conference with RXB re handling future rep issues (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/21/04	Telephone conference with M. Araki re ballot report (.20); telephone conferences and prepare e-mails re claims voting (.30)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/21/04	Update re developments	APS	0.10	53.00
07/21/04	Conferences with RXB and telephone conferences with RXB and N. Peterman re confirmation/settlement issues (2.0); conferences with RXB re extension stipulation (.30)	KAP	2.30	805.00
07/21/04	Review C. Kuoni declaration and other plan documents (2.0); numerous emails, conference with KAP, telephone conferences with N. Peterman and C. Kuoni, and review of documents re trust issues, Pacesetter ballot, insurance settlements and consent order, and prepare document re Pacesetter ballot (4.2)	RXB	6.20	3,286.00
07/21/04	Prepare E. Stephens declaration for CBIZ	DEM	0.50	162.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE SYREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 5471.001/1490 PAGE 26	2004 009
07/22/04	Draft and revise E. Stephens declaration (4.5); telephone conferences with E. Stephens (.6); office conferences with KAP (.5); draft letter to F. Balotti's office re documents (.4); telephone conference with F. Balotti's office re same (.3); correspond with E. Stephens re declaration (.3); correspond with E. Schwartz re same (.3); review CBIZ report and draft memo to KAP re debt issues (.4)	DEM	7.30	2,372.50
07/22/04	Telephone conferences with M. Araki, N. Peterman and C. Kuoni re ballot report (.30); conference with SKK re futures rep declaration (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/22/04	Review Future Claims Representative Declaration (0.2); conference with SKK re same (0.1)	OLA	0.30	108.00
07/22/04	Conference with OLA re declaration	SKK	0,10	22.00
07/22/04	Review affidavit of future claimant representative and related issues (1.2); conference with SKK re same (.8); conference with SKK re claims report (.4); conference with KAP re same (.1); email to KAP re same (.2); review multiple emails from RXB, KAP and SKK re same (.3)	MAZ	3.00	23.00 1,140.00
07/22/04	Telephone conferences with KAP and A. Cole re brief (0.4); and various emails with DEM, KAP and SKK re declarations (0.6)	RXB	1.00	530.00
07/22/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re declaration (.40); telephone conference with K. Martin and N. Peterman re Berkeley declaration (.20)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/22/04	Plan for witness preparation	APS	0.20	106.00
07/22/04	Telephone conference with futures rep and Mestek re declaration and trust (.80); review and revise Kuoni declaration, Stephens declaration, BMC declaration and Berkeley declaration and prepare/review e-mails and attend telephone calls re same (4.30)	KAP	5.10	1,785.00
07/22/04	Limited review of Green affidavit (1.7); conferences with MAZ re same (1.2) correspondence with RYB KAP and	SKK	4.00	920.00

MAZ re same (1.2) correspondence with RXB, KAP and

MAZ re same (0.5); conference with OLA re same (0.1); teleconference with KAP, S. Bezark, N. Peterman and F.

Citera (0.5)

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MOMROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 27		
07/23/04	Review correspondence re: Mestek brief and cite check Met-Coil brief and conferences w/RXB and ACW re: same	AMS	1.60	336.00	
07/23/04	Confer with KAP re hearing planning and work on same	APS	0.20	106.00	
07/23/04	Review E. Stephens edits to declaration and final declaration (.8); office conference with KAP re declaration (.3); correspond with E. Stephens and E. Schwartz re declaration (.5)	DEM	1.60	520.00	
07/23/04	Review and revise confirmation brief, Kuoni declaration, BMC declaration, Berkeley declaration for filing (5.90); telephone conferences with M. Araki and D. Butz re certain aspects of same (1.80)	KAP	7.70	2,695.00	
07/23/04	Limited review of Green affidavit (0.8); conference with MAZ re same (0.2)	SKK	1.00	230.00	
07/23/04	Review and revise brief per Greenberg Traurig comments and research re same (2.4); review and comment on E. Green declaration and conference with KAP and telephone conferences and emails with T. Cairns and E. Harron re same (2.1); review and comment on Mestek brief and email to A. Cole re same (1.0); conference with ACW re brief cite check and research re indemnity issues (0.3); conference with AMS re cite check (0.2); telephone conference with M. Araki re ballot report (0.2)	RXB	6.20	3,286.00	
07/23/04	Cite check brief and meetings with AMS and RXB re: same	ACW	1.50	367.50	
07/23/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman, A. Cole, F. Citera and RXB re confirmation hearing (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00	
07/23/04	Review e-mails re settlements and Consent Decree amendments (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00	
07/23/04	Limited review of affidavit of future claims representative (.8); conference with SKK re same (.2)	MAZ	1.00	380.00	
07/23/04	Conferences with KAB re declarations and settlement agreements (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	
07/23/04	Limited review of futures rep declaration (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLIMOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 28	
07/24/04	Prepare argument and review documents and emails with KAP re same	RXB	1.80	954.00
07/25/04	Review and revise order (4.5); emails to N. Peterman (0.5)	RXB	5.00	2,650.00
07/26/04	Telephone conferences with A. Zafrani re binders and documents for same (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
07/26/04	Prepare for confirmation hearing including conferences with RXB and KAP re open issues and presentation (.5); confer with DEM re Balloti affidavit (.1)	APS	0.60	318.00
07/26/04	Attend to emails re draft order and review KAP comments re same (0.4); prepare argument and conduct of hearing (2.1); review Mestek affidavits (1.0); deal with trustee issue (0.3); conference with APS re hearing and status (0.2)	RXB	4.00	2,120.00
07/26/04	Review and revise confirmation order (3.20)	KAP	3.20	1,120.00
07/26/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re futures rep status and hearing prep status (.70)	KAP	0.70	245.00
07/26/04	Prepare supplemental declaration (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
07/27/04	Prepare for hearing on confirmation, including conferences with Mestek attorneys and KAP, review of order, research and prepare argument	RXB	8.30	4,399.00
07/27/04	Review email re confirmation (.1)	MAZ	0.10	38.00
07/27/04	Prepare for confirmation hearing including review of papers filed for hearing and meeting with Kuoni and RXB (2.6); consider issue re collateral attack and subject matter jurisdiction (.1)	APS	2.70	1,431.00
07/27/04	Review and revise confirmation order and trust documents, prepare supplemental declaration, review LLC documents and attend conferences and telephone conferences re same all in preparation for confirmation hearing (7.70)	KAP	7.70	2,695.00
07/27/04	Review and revise agenda, confirmation order and other documents (2.50)	KAP	2.50	875.00
07/29/04	Emails re confirmation order	RXB	0.50	265.00
07/29/04	Consider remaining tasks re confirmation (.2); review press release from State re remediation (.1)		0.30	159.00

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

07/07/04

07/08/04

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WAW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

AUGUST 20 2004

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

175.00

700.00

0.50

2.00

KAP

WE 1-601	2 STSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 5471.001/1490 PAGE 29	
07/30/04	Review and comment on draft order (1.5); emails re status of order and trust (0.4)	RXB	1.90	1,007.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMEN	Т		\$102,437.50
07/21/04	Travel to DuPage for hearing (1.70)	KAP	1.70	595.00
07/27/04	Travel to Wilmington for hearing	RXB	3.00	1,590.00
07/27/04	Travel to Wilmington for hearing (3.30)	KAP	3.30	1,155.00
07/27/04	Travel to confirmation hearing	APS	2.80	1,484.00
07/27/04	Travel to Delaware	KAB+	2.00	260.00
07/28/04	Return from hearing	APS	3.50	1,855.00
07/28/04	Travel from Delaware	KAB+	2.00	260.00
07/28/04	Travel to Philadelphia airport	KAP	0.80	280.00
07/28/04	Travel from Wilmington	RXB	3.00	1,590.00
07/31/04	Travel from Philadelphia	KAP	3.00	1,050.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TRAVEL			\$10,119.00
07/20/04	Review e-mail and voice mail from client re supervisory issue	MLS	0.20	71.00
07/21/04	E-mail to client re FLSA	MLS	0.30	106.50
07/27/04	Attention to voice mail from R. Scheel re arbitration	MLS	0.10	35.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE MATTERS			\$213.00

Telephone conference with S. Bezark re ACE negotiations KAP

(.30); telephone conference with T. Howard re hearing on

affidavits (.80); telephone conferences with J. Berkeley re

Telephone conference with J. Berkeley and RXB re

CGU insurance settlement agreement (1.20)

insurance motion (.20)

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WAM.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COE	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 2 5471.001/1490 PAGE 30	
07/13/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman and J. Berkeley re revisions to Wausau agreement (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/13/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re insurance premium (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/14/04	Review and revise Wausau agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/16/04	Review ACE settlement agreement and telephone conference with S. Bezark re same (.60); review settling insurer agreements and prepare e-mail re same (.40)	KAP	1.00	350,00
07/18/04	Review, revise and prepare settling insurers declarations (.50); prepare ACE settlement motions (1.0)	KAP	1.50	525.00
07/19/04	Prepare e-mails re insurance settlements (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/20/04	Review and revise ACE motions (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
07/20/04	Review and revise ACE settlement agreement (1.0); review insurance amendments (1.50)	KAP	2.50	875.00
07/21/04	Telephone conferences with P. Anker et al. re Hartford amendment (1.0); telephone conferences with E. Bower et al. re Columbia amendment (1.0)	KAP	2.00	700.00
07/21/04	Review ACE Settlement Agreement, pre-petition settling insurer agreements, Honeywell Settlement Agreement, prepare ACE settlement motions for filing (4.90)	KAP	4.90	1,715.00
07/22/04	Review and revise Columbia and Hartford amendments (1.0); telephone conferences with P. Anker, E. Bower, C. Cameron and N. Peterman re same and motion (.60)	KAP	1.60	560.00
07/26/04	Prepare e-mail re Columbia order language (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/29/04	E-mails to/from KAP re settlement agreements	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/30/04	Review and prepare e-mails and telephone conference with M. Hynes re payment	KAP	0.10	35.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR INSURANCE/REGULATORY MAT	TERS		\$6,711.00
07/01/04	Conference with RXB re update on status from prior week upon his return (1.30)	KAP	1.30	455 -00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 31	
07/01/04	Retrieve court orders, update binder re same	KAB+	2.20	286.00
07/01/04	Conference with KAP re various pending matters	RXB	1.20	636.00
07/02/04	Attend and reply to email re sale of equipment	RXB	0.20	106.00
07/02/04	Conference with RXB re status (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
07/06/04	Call from MAZ re bankruptcy stay, retrieve/review relevant rules	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/07/04	Retrieve court orders	KAB+	0.30	39.00
07/07/04	Conference with JBR re vendor payments (0.3); conference with KAP and telephone conference with E. Schwartz re conflict issue (0.5)	RXB	0.80	424.00
07/12/04	Emails with KAP and N. Peterman re status of various matters.	RXB	0.20	106.00
07/12/04	Review and respond to RXB and N. Peterman e-mails re status of documents (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
07/13/04	Attend to emails re various topics	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/14/04	Attend to emails re various issues	RXB	0.50	265.00
07/14/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman re status of various matters (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/14/04	Review case docket, prepare e-mail re same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/15/04	Conference with RXB re status (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
07/15/04	Attend Mejdrech hearing (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
07/20/04	Review case docket	KAB+	0.20	26.00
07/25/04	Review and respond to e-mails in matter (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
07/26/04	Emails and review documents re DynaGear claim	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/28/04	Attend post-hearing meeting with C. Kuoni, RXB, APS and prepare e-mails during same	KAP	1.00	350.00
07/29/04	Review, respond to, and prepare e-mails re confirmation order, hearing, election notice and forms, press release etc.	KAP	0.30	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		AUGUST 30, 200 5471.001/149009 PAGE 32	4
07/29/04	Review D. Biederman invoice and conference with MAZ re same (0.3); correspondence with RXB re D. Biederman and administrative claim issue (0.3); correspondence with C. Kuoni re D. Biederman invoice and administrative claim (0.3)	SKK	0.90	207.00
07/29/04	Correspondence with RXB re DynaGear bankruptcy issues	SKK	0.10	23.00
07/29/04	Review DynaGear plan and disclosure statement and email to SKK re status of claim and ballot (1.1)	RXB	1.10	583.00
07/29/04	Emails re dealing with D. Biederman fees	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/29/04	Review D. Biederman invoices and conference with SKK re same (.3); review email from SKK re response to same (.1)	MAZ	0.40	152.00
07/30/04	Attend to emails re various topics, including orders	RXB	0.30	159.00
07/30/04	Review case docket, review hearing agenda, and prepare e-mail re same	KAB+	0.50	65.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CASE ADMINISTRATION		5	55,579.00
07/09/04	E-mail to C. Kuoni re status of litigation	CSC	0.10	19.00
07/14/04	Meeting with GLJ re: research project	ACW	0.30	73.50
07/15/04	Review definitions and draft e-mail to GLJ re: same	ACW	2.00	490.00
07/23/04	Conferences with MXE re service of complaint (.2), e-mail to DEM re same (.1)	CSC	0.30	57.00
07/26/04	Draft and file motion for appointment of special process server for MQ Complaint	CSC	0.50	95.00
07/26/04	Appear before Judge McGrath's Routine Motion Call for an Order Granting Leave to use a Special Process Server and arranging for service of Summons and complaint re 04 L 7241 CSC	MXE+	1.50	90.00
07/26/04	Email re Padihar	RXB	0.20	106.00
07/27/04	Conference with process server re service of MQ complaint	CSC	0.20	38.00
07/29/04	Emails re Red River	RXB	0.30	159.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMW.GOLDBERGKOHH.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 33

SUB-TOTAL FOR GENL LIT (NON-ENVIRON'TAL)

\$1,127.50

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$ 225,054.00

+ DENOTES PARALEGAL

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM SS EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 34

#### ATTORNEY SUMMARY

ATTORNEY	<u>TITLE</u>	RATE	HOURS	AMOUNT
Oscar L. Alcantara	PARTNER	360.00	11.70	4,212.00
Ronald Barliant	PARTNER	530.00	118.10	62,593.00
Randall L. Klein	PARTNER	450.00	0.20	90.00
Michael B. Manuel	PARTNER	380.00	0.30	114.00
David E. Morrison	PARTNER	325.00	30.90	10,042.50
Terry F. Mortiz	PARTNER	485.00	2.20	1,067.00
Alan P. Solow	PARTNER	530.00	34.20	18,126.00
Michael L. Sullivan	PARTNER	355.00	1.10	390.50
Matthew A. Zapf	PARTNER	380.00	74.10	28,158.00
Catherine S. Carrigan	ASSOCIATE	190.00	1.60	304.00
Brian D. Fagel	ASSOCIATE	230.00	1.20	276.00
Alais L.M. Griffin	ASSOCIATE	215.00	2.30	494.50
Salvador K. Karottki	ASSOCIATE	230.00	87.30	20,079.00
Kathryn A. Pamenter	ASSOCIATE	350.00	173.60	60,760.00
Anne M. Sherry	ASSOCIATE	210.00	24.90	5,229.00
Keith A. Sigale	ASSOCIATE	295.00	6.30	1,858.50
A. Colin Wexler	ASSOCIATE	245.00	3.80	931.00
Patrick T. Jordan+	LAW CLERK	145.00	0.30	43.50
Anthony M. Webb+	LAW CLERK	145.00	13.80	2,001.00
Kristina A. Bunker+	PARALEGAL	130.00	42.60	5,538.00
Diane M. Ende+	PARALEGAL	105.00	25.30	2,656.50
Mike Evans+	PROJECT ASSIST	60.00	1.50	90.00
TOTAL TIME		<del></del> ,	657.30	\$ 225,054.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHH.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.\*. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 35

LEAD ATTORNEY - Ronald Barliant

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 36

### SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopy Charges	
Telecopy Charges	743.70
Long Distance Telephone Charges	108.48
Outside Photocopy Expenses -	23.75
Travel Expenses VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter May 11 & 12, 2004 Delaware - re:	4.00
Hearing Hearing	119.95
Deposition Transcript Fees VENDOR: Ellen Grauer Court Reporting of J. Nicholas	
Filler Filler Filler	1,059.00
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 5/7/04 Wilmington, DE	4 5 40 50
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 5/17 - 5/19/2004 Wilmington, DE	1,549.78
Travel Expenses - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 5/21 - 5/24/2004 Wilmington, DE	2,666.48
Travel Expenses VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 6/21 - 6/22/2004 wilmington, DE	1,846.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	1,345.10
CEADOR: Document rechnologies	1,470.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	326.90
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	71.55
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	305.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	3,098.17
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	1,908.60
- VENDOR: Highland Solutions Litigation Support	2,608.01
Federal Express Inv. #1-860-66856 6/23/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	2,706.25
Federal Express Inv. #1-860-66856 6/23/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	22.65
Federal Express Inv. #1-861-24763 6/30/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	1,099.72
Federal Express Inv. #1-861-24763 6/30/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	27.42
Federal Express Inv. #1-861-83121 7/7/2004 - VENDOR: Federal Express Outside Photography.	58.30
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	309.09
Luncheon Expenses Atty: Date: VENDOR: Fox & Obel 7/0/04	1,173.08
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	133.10
Velocity Courier, Inc. invoice #54/68 6/14/04 - VFNTOOP Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
VOICEY COURSE, INC. INVOICE #34/68 6/14/04 - VENTOOD: Volcaine Carrier I	4.25
Velocity Courier, Inc. invoice #54/68/6/14/04 - VENTOD: Velocity Courier t	4.25
volocity Courier, the invoice #54/68 6/14/04 - VENDOD, Valacia A	4.25
Tologny Council, mc, invoice #54/6X 6/14/04 - VENTOOD, Valante Council	4.25
Vilouty Course, the invoice #34/68 6/14/04 - VENDOD, Valacity Course	4.25
velocity Counter, inc. invoice #54/68/6/14/04 - VENDOD, Valority Country to	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #34/68 6/14/14 - VENDOD, Velocity Courier to	4.25
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
22.25 Oct. Velocity Country inc.	4.25

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-S802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

#### AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 37

Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 VENDOR Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54768 6/14/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54768 6/14/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	15.25
velocity Courier Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR · Velocity Courier Inc.	5.75
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 VENDOR · Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.56
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	13.20
velocity Courier, Inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR · Velocity Courier Inc.	25.20
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR Velocity Courier to	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54857 6/21/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
voicity Courier, inc. invoice #54941 6/28/04 - VENDOR · Velocity Courier Inc.	18.60
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #54941 6/78/04 - VENTOOD Valority Courier Inc.	12.00
velocity Counter, Inc. invoice #55032 7/6/04 - VENDOR · Velocity Counter Inc.	90.75
velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55032, 7/6/04 - VENTOOD Valority Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Counter, inc. invoice #55032 7/6/04 - VENDOD: Velocity Counter to	4.25
velocity Courier, Inc. invoice #55032 7/6/04 - VENDOR · Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
velocity Courier, inc. invoice #55328 7/12/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
7/14/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	14.71
1 rederal Express Inv. #1-908-36817 7/14/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	16.20
Service of Summons VENDOR: Clerk of the Circuit Court Alias Summons Fee	6.00
Lexis-inexis Legal Search Charges 6/30/04 Invoice #0406025234	379.20
Westlaw Invoice #806894268 6/30/04	3.54
Westlaw Invoice #806894268 6/30/04	33.02
Westlaw Invoice #806894268 6/30/04	2,693.65
Westlaw Invoice #806894268 6/30/04	167.07
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55411 7/19/04 - VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Federal Express Inv #1-908-97177 7/21/04 - VENDOR: Federal Express	85.73

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

AUGUST 30, 2004 5471.001/149009 PAGE 38

Federal Express Inv #1-908-97177 7/21/04 VENDOR: Federal Express Telephone Charges VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter June 2004 Travel Expenses VENDOR: Alan Solow July 27-28, 2004 Wilmington, DE - Hearing Travel Expenses VENDOR: Kristina Bunker July 27 - 28, 2004 Wilmington, DE re: Hearing		48.38 21.35 1,299.63 721.20
TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	s <sup>—</sup>	30,600.57
TOTAL THIS STATEMENT	\$	255,654.57

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WAW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION Met-Coil Systems Corporation c/o Charles F. Kuoni, III 711 Ogden Avenue Lisle, IL 60532

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE I

REGARDING: BANKRUPTCY

#### FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	<u>HOURS</u>	AMOUNT
08/02/04	Review agenda and telephone conference with A. Kelly re same (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/04/04	Prepare motion to change case caption (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/05/04	Review and revise motions for filing (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/12/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re filing motion (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/18/04	Prepare omnibus objection and telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and M. Araki re same (1.0); review and revise agenda (.30)	KAP	1.30	455.00
08/19/04	Review documents re service and prepare e-mails re same (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
08/19/04	Review agenda (.20); telephone conference and e-mails with M. Araki and L. Mota re exhibits to omnibus objection (.70)	KAP	0.90	315.00
08/20/04	Review documents to finalize for filing (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/31/04	Finalize stipulation for filing and prepare emails re same	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/31/04	Telephone conferences with A. Kelly re filing	KAP	0.20	70.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY FILINGS			\$2,205.00
08/03/04	Prepare e-mails re DIP financing extension (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/04/04	Review and revise DIP financing extension motion and investigative period extension motion (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR DIP FINANCING/CASH COLLATI	ERAL		\$455.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 2 5471.001/14957 PAGE 2	
08/06/04	Draft affidavit of R. Franklin Balotti re retention of non- law firm professional in the ordinary course (.8); review order approving order course professionals (.3); correspond re affidavit (.3); telephone conference with E. Schwartz re same (.3)	DEM	1.70	552.50
08/19/04	Correspond with F. Balotti re affidavit	DEM	0.30	97.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR RETENTION OF PROFESSIONAL	s		\$650.00
08/30/04	Prepare lift stay stipulation (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR AUTOMATIC STAY MATTERS			\$175.00
08/02/04	Telephone conference with M. Araki re service and claims report (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/04/04	Conference with C. Kuoni re obtaining signed agreements (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/05/04	Review USEPA settlement agreement (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/05/04	Telephone conferences with M. Araki and F. Glass re claims (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/12/04	Telephone conference with F. Glass re claims (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/13/04	Telephone conference with M. Araki re claims objection (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/13/04	Review claims chart (.40); review and revise administrative expense bar date documents (.40)	KAP	0.80	280.00
08/17/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re claims (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/17/04	Telephone conference with J. Spector and S. Bezark re USEPA settlement (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/18/04	Conference w/RXB re: Imgruth issue and research re: same	AMS	2.10	441.00
08/18/04	Telephone conference with F. Glass re claims (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/24/04	Review and comment on USEPA settlement agreement (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

ħ	AFT.	COIL	CVC	PMAT	CORPOR	ATION
в	Y1 [ . 1 *	·CULL		1 C. VI.3		. ^ 1 1 1 1 1 1

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 3

			PAGE 3	
08/26/04	Telephone conference with J. Bubnack re stipulation (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION			\$2,296.00
08/02/04	Conference with KAS and telephone conferences with KAS, C. Kuoni and T. Scanlan re LLC issues (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
08/02/04	Conference, meet with KAP re conversion issues, company resolutions (.3); conference call with C. Kuoni re conversion issues (.2)	KAS	0.50	147.50
08/03/04	Review, editing of conversion documents, LLC documents	KAS	0.60	177.00
08/04/04	Telephone call with KAP (.20); office conference with RXB and KAS re tax issues, review same, prepare email re same (2.60)	GLJ	2.80	1,288.00
08/04/04	Review LLC documents, telephone conferences with GLJ and KAS re same and prepare e-mails re same (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/04/04	Review of conversion documents, LLC documents (.4); conferences with KAP re conversion issues, LLC documents (.3); meet with GLJ, RXB re tax issues (.9); review of correspondence re tax issues, conversion issues, LLC capitalization matters (.3)	KAS	1.90	560.50
08/04/04	Conference and emails with KAP (0.2) and conference with GLJ and KGR re tax consequences of conversion to LLC (1.0)	RXB	1.20	636.00
08/04/04	Review plan and attend and reply to emails re LLC Agreement and plan obligations	RXB	0.80	424.00
08/05/04	Review of revised LLC documents (.4); review of correspondence per KAP, N. Peterman re Formtek capital contributions (.2); conference with KAP re LLC documents (.1); review of GLJ correspondence, meet with GLJ re tax issues (.3)	KAS	1.00	295.00
08/09/04	Review and sign audit letter	RXB	0.20	106.00
08/11/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status and LLC documents (.10); telephone to KAS re same (.10)	KAP	0.20	70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINGIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 2- 5471.001/14957 PAGE 4	
08/11/04	Review of correspondence per KAP, C. Kuoni re qualification documents (.2); review, editing of qualification documents (.2)	KAS	0.40	118.00
08/12/04	Review Woodridge bid specifications (1.30)	KAP	1.30	455.00
08/12/04	Correspondence with C. Kuoni re qualification documents (.1); meet with JMS re qualification forms (.2)	KAS	0.30	88.50
08/13/04	Telephone conference with R. Jones re bid specifications (1.50); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same and Puntero (.30); prepare correspondence and documents re conversion (.20); telephone conference with KAS re certain of same (.10)	KAP	2.10	735.00
08/13/04	Conference with KAP re state qualifications, prepare related forms	KAS	0.20	59.00
08/16/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re status of agreements, corporate documents and settlements (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/17/04	Review bid specifications and prepare e-mail re same (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
08/17/04	Review dealer letter and e-mails re same (0.3); attend to Imgruth matter and review demand letter (0.3)	RXB	0.60	318.00
08/18/04	Telephone conversation with Corp-Link Services re process for withdrawal corporation and qualification of the limited liability company with the Illinois and Iowa Secretaries of State	JMS+	0.30	37.50
08/18/04	Telephone conference with R. Jones re bid specifications (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/18/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re investment of funds (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/18/04	Meetings, conference with KAP re LLC conversion, qualifications, state filings (.3); meet, conferences with JMS re qualification and withdrawal filings (.4)	KAS	0.70	206.50
08/18/04	Emails and telephone conference with N. Peterman, and emails with KAP re Imgruth (0.4)	RXB	0.40	212.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 24 5471.001/149571 PAGE 5	
08/19/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re investment of funds (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/19/04	Research and conference with AMS re Igmuth matter (1.2); emails with N. Peterman and KAP re same (0.2)	RXB	1.40	742.00
08/20/04	Prepare IL and IA withdrawal documents for Met-Coil Systems Corporation and revise IL and IA qualification documents for Met-Coil Systems, LLC	JMS+	1.00	125.00
08/20/04	Conferences, meetings with JMS re qualification documents, withdrawal documents (.3); review, editing of withdrawal and qualification forms (.5); preparation of mailing to C. Kuoni re state filings, withdrawal documents (.2)	KAS	1.00	295.00
08/21/04	Emails with C. Kuoni re Imgruth matter	RXB	0.10	53.00
08/23/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni and review emails from C. Kuoni re Imgruth	RXB	0.50	265.00
08/24/04	Prepare and send correspondence and filings to Corp-Link Services, Inc. for filing with the IL and IA Secretaries of State	JMS+	0.50	62.50
08/24/04	Review of package per C. Kuoni re state filings (.2); meet, conference with JMS re qualification and withdrawal filings (.3)	KAS	0.50	147.50
08/24/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re Imgruth matter and conference with AMS re same	RXB	0.30	159.00
08/25/04	Conference, meet with JMS re state qualification, withdrawal filings	KAS	0.20	59.00
08/27/04	Review and revise side letters (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/27/04	Prepare e-mails to C. Kuoni re monthly operating reports and other status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/30/04	Review and revise side letter (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/30/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re Imgruth	RXB	0.20	106.00
08/31/04	Conferences with KAP, JMS re withdrawal and qualification filings	KAS	0.30	88.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINGIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 35-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 6

	SUB-TOTAL FOR CORPORATE MATTERS			\$10,136.00
08/03/04	Meet with FHC re PTAB appeal (.5); review costs of remediation document (.5)	ALG	1.00	215.00
08/04/04	Confer with FHC re upcoming filings	TFM	0.20	97.00
08/05/04	Conference with GLJ re net operating losses	BMF	0.30	120.00
08/06/04	Review costs remediation (.4); discuss remediation and assessment issues with BDF (.20); telephone conversation with R. St. John and draft email to FHC re conversation (.2)	ALG	0.80	172.00
08/06/04	Conference with GLJ re net operating losses	BMF	0.20	80.00
08/24/04	Meet with TFM and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re appraisal and remediation cost data	ALG	0.30	64.50
08/24/04	Respond to issues re appraisal (.2); telephone conference with C. Kuoni (.4)	TFM	0.60	291.00
08/26/04	Telephone call with J. Haglund at Lockformer re remediation costs (.2); draft email to C. Kuoni (.1)	ALG	0.30	64.50
08/30/04	Respond to issues re PTAB evidence	TFM	0.60	291.00
08/31/04	Telephone conversation with J. Hagland (.1); meet with TFM re remediation costs (.2); telephone conversation with KAP re remediation costs (.1); draft email correspondence to K. Martin re invoices for remediation costs (.2); meet with BDF re valuation of contaminated property memo (.1); review draft appraisal (1.1)	ALG	1.80	387.00
08/31/04	Review withholding issue	GLJ	0.50	230.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TAX MATTERS			\$2,012.00
08/02/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re remediation guidelines and other pending environmental issues, including documenting the water suppression line issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/02/04	Review and revise hook-up notice and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMM.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 5471.001/1495 PAGE 7	
08/04/04	Telephone conferences with M. Hayes and E. Wallace re hook up notice and extension of deadline (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/11/04	Prepare e-mails re hook-up and USEPA settlement (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/12/04	Telephone conference with E. Wallace re same and hook- up notice (.30); telephone conference with S. Bezark re same and USEPA settlement (.30)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/13/04	Prepare e-mail to S. Bezark re status of environmental matters (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/19/04	Review and revise hook-up notices (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/23/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re environmental issues (.10); telephone conference with SKK and C. Kuoni re DGSD line (.60); review e-mails re hook up forms (.20)	KAP	0.90	315.00
08/24/04	Prepare e-mails and telephone conferences re hook up notice (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/24/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re status of environmental matters (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/25/04	Prepare e-mails re conference calls on USEPA agreement and hook-up notice (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/26/04	Attend conference calls re USEPA settlement (.90); attend several conference calls re hook-up election notice (2.10)	KAP	3.00	1,050.00
08/26/04	Prepare funding agreement side letter (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/26/04	Review and revise hook-up election forms (1.10)	KAP	1.10	385.00
08/27/04	Prepare revised hook-up notice and telephone conferences re same (1.80); attend conference call re USEPA settlement (.80)	KAP	2.60	910.00
08/27/04	Attend conference call re loan program in Village of Lisle (.40); telephone conference with S. Bezark re same (.20)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/30/04	Review and revise hook-up notice (1.10)	KAP	1.10	385.00
08/30/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni et al. re USEPA/IEPA meetings (.30); telephone conference with K. Mack re same (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.1.#. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBER 5471.001/1495 PAGE 8	-	
08/31/04	Telephone conference with T. Krueger re coordination with USEPA	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/31/04	Telephone conferences with K. Mack re coordination with USEPA	KAP	0.40	140.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS			\$5,670.00
08/02/04	Search for correspondence re disclosure issues for SKK (.6); review DGSD documents re same (1)	DME+	1.60	168.00
08/02/04	Review sewer line issues and related materials (1.4); review settlement options (.8); conference with RXB re same (.2); call to fourth party counsel (.2); review contributor materials re use (.8); review Clayton report re same (.7)	MAZ	4.10	1,558.00
08/03/04	Search re documents for SKK (1); bates label new MSC documents to produce to third party defendants (.4); conference with SKK re action items (.4); conference with MAZ re consultant issues (.5); conference with SKK re documents for exhibits to motion and data files	DME+	2.30	241.50
08/03/04	Review materials and issues re DGSD (1.2); review cases re same (.9); conference with SKK re action issues (0.4); review email re testing issue (.1); multiple calls to consultant re contributor liability issues (.6); review documents re same (.5); review DGSD discovery issues (.9); conference with DME re same (.2); review revised discovery to DGSD (.3); email to DME re same (.2); review documents produced by Village of Lisle (1.2); email to DME re same (.1); conference with SKK re same and settlement issues (.5); prepared for meeting with fourth party attorneys re settlement (1.5)	MAZ	8.60	3,268.00
08/03/04	Conferences with DME re documents for exhibits to motion and data files (0.8); conferences with MAZ re action items (0.4); conference with MAZ re settlement issues and case strategy (0.5); review consultant contract (0.5); teleconference with R. Repko (0.3); conference with DME re action items (0.4)	SKK	2.90	667.00
08/04/04	Consolidation and reorganization of files per MAZ	DME+	2.00	210.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	<b>MET-COII</b>	L SYSTEMS	CORPORATION
------------------------------	-----------------	-----------	-------------

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 9

08/04/04	Prepare for and meet with fourth party counsel (1.9); conference with SKK re same (.7); review letter from DME re document production (.1); email to C. Kuoni re case status (.3); conference with SKK re same (.2); review and revise partial draft motion for protective order (.8); conference with SKK re same (.4); conference with SKK re discovery status (.2); conference with SKK re testing issue (.2)	MAZ	4.80	1,824.00
08/04/04	E-mail with MAZ re settlement possibilities (0.1); conference with SKK re testing issue (0.1)	OLA	0.20	72.00
08/04/04	Conference with MAZ re settlement issues (0.7); correspondence with E. Harvey (0.2); conference with MAZ re case status (0.2); conference with MAZ re edits to disclosure motion (0.4); conference with MAZ re discovery status (0.2); teleconference with R. Repko (0.5); conference with MAZ re testing issue (0.2); edit correspondence with M. Bilut (0.3); review correspondence with consultants (0.3); conference with OLA re testing issue (0.1)	SKK	3.10	713.00
08/05/04	Email to C. Kuoni re summary judgment issues (.2); correspondence with SKK re same (.2); review expert reports re contributors liability and potential rebuttal issues (1.5)	MAZ	1.90	722.00
08/06/04	Review case strategy (.3); review strategies re potential summary judgment (.8); review case documents re same (1.2); review discovery issues re same (.8)	MAZ	3.10	1,178.00
08/09/04	Conference with SKK re testing issues (.2); conference with SKK re consultant (.1); review strategy re rebuttal (.8)	MAZ	1.10	418.00
08/09/04	Conference with MAZ re testing issue (0.2); review materials sent to Third-Party Defendants (0.3); conference with MAZ re consultant (0.1)	SKK	0.60	138.00
08/10/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure (.1); teleconference with SKK and C. Kuoni re testing issues (.2); conference with SKK re same (.5); review outstanding discovery issues (.5); review rebuttal issues (.8)	MAZ	2.10	798.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBER 2 5471.001/14957 PAGE 10		
08/10/04	Teleconference with C. Kuoni and MAZ re testing issue (0.2); conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.1); conferences with MAZ re testing issue (0.5); draft and edit disclosure motion (0.4)	SKK	1.20	276.00
08/11/04	Review sewer line issues and related materials (.8); review discovery strategy (.8)	MAZ	1.60	608.00
08/11/04	Correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultant	SKK	0.20	46.00
08/12/04	Review email from SKK re consultant (.1); review rebuttal issues (.7); review discovery issues re DGSD (.5)	MAZ	1.30	494.00
08/12/04	Draft disclosure motion	SKK	1.80	414.00
08/13/04	Draft letter to Bilut re data file (.4); conference with SKK re same (.2); teleconference with consultant (.3); review documents received from Village of Lisle (.8)	DME+	1.70	178.50
08/13/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure issue (.3); review documents produced by DuPage County Public Works (.8); conference with DME re file issues (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); review sewer line issues and related materials (.8); call to consultant re same (.1)	MAZ	2.40	912.00
08/13/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.3); conference with MAZ re case status (0.2); teleconferences and correspondence with M. Bilut re WinFlow file (0.5); teleconferences with consultant (0.3); document review of Village of Lisle documents (1)	SKK	2.30	529.00
08/16/04	Review documents produced from Village of Lisle and County of DuPage (1.3); copy and send same to consultants (.3); conference with MAZ re status of files (.2); consolidation and organization of files per MAZ (1.2); multiple conferences with MAZ re subpoena issues (.4)	DME+	3.40	357.00
08/16/04	Review possible discovery for DGSD and others (.9); review and revise requests re same (.3); review possible subpoena issues re same (.7); multiple conferences with DME re same (.4); conference with DME re file (.2); conference with SKK re case status (.2); review consultant issues (.6); conference with SKK re consultants (.3)	MAZ	3.60	1,368.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 2 5471.001/14952 PAGE 11	•
08/16/04	Conference with MAZ re case status (0.2); review of Village of Lisle and DuPage County documents (1.7); conference with MAZ re consultants (0.3)	SKK	2.20	506.00
08/17/04	Consolidation and reorganization of files per MAZ	DME+	4.50	472.50
08/17/04	Conference with MAZ re status of contribution actions (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/17/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure (.2); prepared for meeting with consultant (1.2); conference with consultant (.9); followup conference with SKK re same (.2); review various issues and documents and strategies re consultant's discussion (1.4); conference with DME re consultant issues (.3)	MAZ	4.20	1,596.00
08/17/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure (0.2); conference with MAZ re consultants (0.2)	SKK	0.40	92.00
08/18/04	Review IEPA issues (.5); conference with SKK re same (.2); review issues re same (.9); teleconference with SKK and R. St. John (.5); email to SKK re disclosure (.1); review updated draft re same (.6); review letter re subpoena to DuPage County (.2); conversation with DME re same (.1); conference with SKK re strategy and reports (.3)	MAZ	3.60	1,368.00
08/18/04	Review IEPA comments on R. St. John analysis	OLA	0.20	72.00
08/18/04	Correspondence with R. St. John (0.5); conference with MAZ re IEPA issues (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John and MAZ re same (0.5); conference with MAZ re case strategy and expert reports (0.3)	SKK	1.80	414.00
08/19/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure issue (.5); correspondence and conference with RXB re rebuttal reports (.1); correspondence and conference with DME re file preparation (.3); review same (.6); review and revise discovery to DGSD (.6); email to SKK re same (.1); teleconference with R. St. John, SKK, and K. Mack re IEPA issues (.7); conference with SKK re same (.3)	MAZ	3.20	1,216.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 2 5471.001/14957 PAGE 12	
08/19/04	Draft disclosure motion (2); teleconferences with KAP re testing issues (0.2); teleconference with S. Deely (0.1); teleconference with R. St. John, MAZ, and K. Mack re IEPA issues (0.7); teleconference with C. Kuoni re case strategy (0.2); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.3); conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.5)	SKK	4.00	920.00
08/20/04	Correspondence with SKK re disclosure (.2); conference with DME re discovery to DGSD (.1); review recent version (.3); correspondence with SKK re status (.1); review remaining outstanding issues (.9); review files re same (.8); review rebuttal and additional liability issues (.7)	MAZ	3.20	1,216.00
08/23/04	Reviewed status issues for transfer (1.2); review files re same (.8); conference with SKK re disclosure (.3); review updated motion re same (.8); conference with SKK re testing issue (.2); email to DME re DGSD discovery (.1); conference with OLA re status (.3)	MAZ	3.70	1,406.00
08/23/04	Conference with MAZ re case status	OLA	0.30	108.00
08/23/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.3); draft disclosure motion (4); review driller contract (0.4); follow-up conference with MAZ re testing issue (0.2); teleconference with S. Deely (0.3)	SKK	5.20	1,196.00
08/24/04	Conference with MAZ and SKK re DGSD discovery and files (.3); review former discovery requests (.8); conference with MAZ re files (.3)	DME+	1.40	147.00
08/24/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure (.2); conference with SKK re testing issues (.3); conference with SKK re rebuttal strategy (.6); review issues re same (.8); conference with DME re files (.2); review Mercer report (.6); conference with SKK re Clayton materials (.3); conference with SKK and DME re DGSD discovery and files (.3); conference with SKK and KAP re Clayton materials (.3)	MAZ	3.60	1,368.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLODM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPOR	ATION
----------	---------	--------	-------

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571

			PAGE 13	
08/24/04	Conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.6); review correspondence from KAP re Clayton materials (0.3); conference with MAZ re same (0.3); follow-up teleconference with KAP and MAZ re same (0.3); conference with MAZ re disclosure issues (0.2); conference with MAZ re testing issues (0.3); conference with MAZ and DME re DGSD discovery and files (0.3)	SKK	2.30	529.00
08/25/04	Revisions to second set of discovery to DGSD (1.1); teleconference consultant and SKK re additional information (.5)	DME+	1.90	199.50
08/25/04	Review Clayton issue (.3); review case materials for status for future (.9)	MAZ	1.20	456.00
08/25/04	Teleconference with S. Deely (0.2); edit discovery requests (0.5); teleconference with DME and consultant (0.8); teleconference with R. St. John (0.2); prepare discovery requests for service (0.2)	SKK	1,90	437.00
08/26/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure issue (.2); review status issues (.7); review reports and related materials re rebuttal issues (.9)	MAZ	1.80	684.00
08/26/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issue	SKK	0.20	46.00
08/27/04	Email to SKK re disclosure issue and review same (.3); review testing issues (.3); review file issue (.4); review rebuttal issues and related reports (.8)	MAZ	1.80	684.00
08/27/04	Edits to disclosure motion	SKK	6.50	1,495.00
08/30/04	Review expert reports	DME+	2.00	210.00
08/30/04	Conference with SKK re disclosure (.2); review new draft re same (.9); conference with SKK re edits (.2); review outstanding issues (.8); conference with DME re files (.2); conference with SKK re reports and related strategy (.6); review strategy re same (.8)	MAZ	3.70	1,406.00
08/30/04	Conference with SKK re Defendants' expert reports and strategy for reply (0.3); review disclosure motion (1.5); emails with MAZ re same (0.1)	OLA	1.90	684.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINDIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBEI 5471.001/149 PAGE 14	
08/30/04	Edit disclosure motion (2.5); initial review of expert reports (2); follow-up teleconference with OLA re expert reports (0.2); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.2); correspondence with MAZ re expert reports (0.5); teleconference with consultant (0.3); draft affidavit and supporting documents for disclosure motion (1.3)	SKK	7.00	1,610.00
08/31/04	Review expert reports for references (1.3); gather and copy same for potential rebuttal expert reports (3.5)	DME+	4.80	504.00
08/31/04	Review letter to C. Kouni re reports (.1); review letter to F. Citera re reports (.1); review consultant's bill (.3); conference with SKK re same (.2); reviewed issues re DGSD (.8); reviewed discovery strategy (.7); review transfer issues (.2)	MAZ	0.70	266.00
08/31/04	Conference with SKK re re-write of disclosure motion (0.2); review expert reports of contribution defendants (1.5); conference with SKK re rebutal strategy (0.5); revise Memo in Support of motion for entry of protective order (3.7)	OLA	5.90	2,124.00
08/31/04	Conference with OLA re disclosure motion and case strategy (0.2); teleconference with consultant (0.3); teleconferences with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (1); conference with OLA re rebuttal strategty (0.5); review expert reports and exhibits from Third-Party Defendants (2.2); review correspondence and expert reports for potential issues (0.8); review and edit current draft of disclosure motion (1)	SKK	6.00	1,380.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL LITIGATION			\$42,040.00
08/03/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman re hearing, comments to documents (1.0); telephone conferences with A. Kelly re hearing, notice and prepare e-mails re same (.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
08/17/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re agenda (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/18/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re cancellation of hearing (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CO	RPORATION	
---------------------	-----------	--

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 15

08/20/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re hearing (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY HEARINGS			\$700.00
08/01/04	Revise fee application	KAB+	0.30	39.00
08/03/04	Revise and prepare fee application for filing (.1); draft third interim fee application (.2)	KAB+	0.30	39.00
08/03/04	Review fee application (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/03/04	Review June application and sign	RXB	0.20	106.00
08/05/04	Review and revise pro forma (.70)	KAP	0.70	245.00
08/06/04	Review July Pro Forma	RXB	0.40	212.00
08/11/04	Revise interim fee application and prepare for filing	KAB+	0.20	26.00
08/18/04	Review/revise fee statement	KAB+	2.00	260.00
08/24/04	Draft monthly fee application, correspond with accounting and KAP re the same	KAB+	0.70	91.00
08/31/04	Review revised fee statement and revise fee application	KAB+	2.20	286.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLICATIONS (GK)			\$1,479.00
08/02/04	Update re developments including consideration to resolution of open issues (.3); attention to F. Balotti report (.1)	APS	0.40	212.00
08/02/04	Telephone conference with F. Balotti re hearing (.2); internal correspondence re payment of expert fees (.3)	DEM	0.50	162.50
08/02/04	Review provisions to disclosure statement	KAB+	0.60	78.00
08/02/04	Review and comment on confirmation order and telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (2.20)	KAP	2.20	770.00
08/02/04	Telephone conference with T. Cairns re documents and status (.30); telephone conference with T. Cairns, N. Peterman and C. Kuoni re financing issues (.50)	KAP	0.80	280.00
08/02/04	Review order re discharge issues and emails with KAP and N. Peterman re same (0.8); emails re jurisdiction issue (0.2)	RXB	1.00	530.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBER 5471.001/1495 PAGE 16	•	
08/02/04	Emails and review of trust issues (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00
08/03/04	Attention to open confirmation issues and update re status	APS	0.30	159.00
08/03/04	Review trust documents and prepare e-mails re same (3.0)	KAP	3.00	1,050.00
08/03/04	Review and revise confirmation order and prepare e-mails re same (1.60)	KAP	1.60	560.00
08/03/04	Review order (0.5); emails and review plan and draft order re discharge/injunction issue (0.9); telephone conference with N. Peterman re status of trust negotiations (0.3); review later draft and research and emails with KAP and N. Peterman re same (0.9)	RXB	2.60	1,378.00
08/04/04	Confer with C. Kuoni re developments on future trust (.1); attention to revisions to documents (.1)	APS	0.20	106.00
08/04/04	Review draft confirmation order and prepare e-mails re same (1.70)	KAP	1.70	595.00
08/04/04	Emails with KAP and N. Peterman re trust negotiations (0.4); telephone conferences with E. Harron re same (0.3); review Green supplemental affidavit and emails re same (0.7); attend to emails re various other matters (0.3)	RXB	1.70	901.00
08/04/04	Review draft order and plan and emails re same	RXB	1.00	530.00
08/05/04	Update re modification to and finalization of documents	APS	0.10	53.00
08/05/04	Prepare e-mails re Trust Documents (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/05/04	Review confirmation order and certification of counsel (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/05/04	Review trust funding term sheet and plan and several emails re same (1.0); review LLC agreement and emails re same (0.4); attend to several other matters, including tax issue, trust negotiations, certificate of counsel re order, KAP emails, etc. (1.2); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re trust funding term sheet (0.3)	RXB	2.90	1,537.00
08/06/04	Work on remaining open issues	APS	0.10	53.00
08/06/04	Review e-mails re term sheet, affidavit and order (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINDIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 17

08/06/04	Emails with N. Peterman re trustee compensation and negotiations (0.4); emails re Meyer settlement and expert fees (0.3); attend to current filings (0.2); telephone conferences with N. Peterman re trustee compensation and negotiations (0.5); telephone conferences with T. Cairns re same (0.4); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re same and general status (0.4); KAP emails re same and status (0.3); review response re audit letter (0.1); review revised term sheet and emails re same (0.4)	RXB	3.00	1,590.00
08/09/04	Confer with RXB re resolution of open issues	APS	0.20	106.00
08/09/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re status of term sheet, affidavit and order (.20); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.20)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/09/04	Numerous telephone conferences and emails with C. Kuoni, N. Peterman, E. Harron and T. Cairns re trust negotiations, trustee compensation and supplemental affidavit and review current term sheet (1.6)	RXB	1.60	848.00
08/09/04	Telephone conference and email with P. Ferak re Meyer settlement procedures	RXB	0.40	212.00
08/10/04	Review schedule of conditions to settlements/effectiveness (0.2); emails re trust negotiations and review latest term sheet (1.0); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (0.2)	RXB	1.40	742.00
08/11/04	Review e-mails re court schedule (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/11/04	Prepare e-mails re affidavit, term sheet and order (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/11/04	Numerous emails and telephone conferences with N. Peterman, E. Harron and C. Kuoni re trust funding term sheet, execution of same and filing order and affidavit	RXB	1.50	795.00
08/12/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz, A. Kelly and A. Conway re confirmation order (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/12/04	Attend to emails re filing of proposed order and telephone conference with E. Schwartz re same	RXB	0.40	212.00
08/13/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re order (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/16/04	Telephone conferences re confirmation order (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBER 5471.001/1495 PAGE 18	
08/17/04	Confer with KAP re signing of confirmation order and consider remaining open items including proceedings at District Court level	APS	0.20	106.00
08/17/04	Various telephone conferences re confirmation order, service of same and items to be completed as a result of the confirmation order having been entered (1.30)	KAP	1.30	455.00
08/18/04	Telephone conferences with M. Araki and N. Peterman re service of confirmation order (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/19/04	Conferences and e-mails with RXB re confirmation order (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/24/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re service dates and status of various matters (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/27/04	Review and edit motion and accompanying declarations for order approving settlement with Meyer minor (1.3); office conference with KAP re same (.2)	DEM	1.50	487.50
08/30/04	Telephone conference with V. Statsny re futures rep (.10); telephone conference with E. Harron re same (.10)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/30/04	Emails re entry of final order and effective date (0.3)	RXB	0.30	159.00
08/31/04	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz re entry of final order and emails re same	RXB	0.50	265.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			\$16,352.00
08/03/04	Telephone conversation with R. Scheel and review notes from union discussions	MLS	0.30	106.50
08/04/04	Review fax from Lockformer re health grievance (.2)	MLS	0.20	71.00
08/13/04	Attention to health grievance/arbitration	MLS	0.10	35.50
08/25/04	Telephone conference with R. Scheel re union arbitration	MLS	0.30	106.50
08/30/04	Voice mail from T. Santacroce re employee issues	MLS	0.10	35.50
	SUB-TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE MATTERS			\$355.00

08/01/04

08/02/04

(.30)

Review case docket

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COII	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBER : 5471.001/1495 PAGE 19	
08/01/04	Review settlement agreements and update signature checklist	KAB+	0.50	65.00
08/02/04	Review declarations and prepare checklist of signatures to same	KAB+	0.30	39.00
08/16/04	Prepare status report (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/17/04	Prepare status report re adversary (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/19/04	Revise status report (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/24/04	Telephone conference with T. Cairns re insurance issue (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/24/04	Review letter re FRC insurance premium from T. Cairns and conference with KAP and telephone conference with T. Cairns and KAP re same (0.4); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (0.2); telephone conference with T. Cairns re same (0.2); email to KAP re same (0.1); review emails re various matters (0.2)	RXB	1.10	583.00
08/25/04	Telephone conferences and e-mails re insurance premium (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/25/04	Emails re FRC insurance issue and telephone conference with KAP re same	RXB	0.50	265.00
08/26/04	Prepare side letter re insurance premium (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/26/04	Telephone conference with E. Harron re insurance premium (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/26/04	Emails re FRC insurance issue	RXB	0.40	212.00
08/27/04	Review draft letter re FRC insurance and email re same	RXB	0.30	159.00
08/28/04	Emails re FRC insurance issue	RXB	0.20	106.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR INSURANCE/REGULATORY MA	TTERS		\$2,234.00

KAP

KAB+

0.30

0.20

105.00

26.00

Review mail and numerous e-mails following hearing trip

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 35-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPOR	ATION.
----------	---------	--------	--------

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571

			PAGE 20	
08/02/04	Meet with KAP re follow-up matters from confirmation hearing	KAB+	0.40	52.00
08/02/04	Conference with KAB re declarations, settlement agreements and orders (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
08/02/04	Emails re expert invoices (0.3); attend to emails re various emails and KAP updates (0.4)	RXB	0.70	371.00
08/03/04	Emails with KAP and N. Peterman and telephone conferences with N. Peterman and E. Harron re August 4 hearing and negotiations (0.8); attend to emails re various matters and filings (0.3)	RXB	1.10	583.00
08/04/04	Review case docket	KAB+	0.20	26.00
08/04/04	Prepare settlement agreements for circulation (1.60)	KAP	1.60	560.00
08/05/04	Prepare status of lawsuit chart (.40); prepare response to claim summary (.30); telephone conference with N. Peterman re status (.30)	KAP	1.00	350.00
08/09/04	Review case docket, prepare email re the same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
08/09/04	Review e-mails re status (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/10/04	Review e-mails re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/12/04	Telephone conferences with RXB, N. Peterman and C. Kuoni re status (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/12/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re workers compensation claim, status of order (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/12/04	Review e-mails and mail from while out of office (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
08/13/04	Review/prepare e-mails to/from N. Peterman re order and status of various matters (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/16/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
08/16/04	Emails and correspondence re various matters	RXB	0.20	106.00
08/18/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/19/04	Attend to KAP emails and attachments on various matters, including Hook-Up notices, hearing scheduling, etc.	RXB	0.30	159.00
08/23/04	Emails re various matters	RXB	0.20	106.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			SEPTEMBER 5471.001/1495 PAGE 21	
08/24/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status of various matters (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/24/04	Telephone conference with B. Gottschalk re status of case (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/25/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status (.50); prepare status e-mails (.20)	KAP	0.70	245.00
08/26/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re premium, hook- up notice, and other matters (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/27/04	Various telephone conferences with N. Peterman re documents, hearing etc. (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/30/04	Review and respond to status e-mails (.50); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re same (.40)	KAP	0.90	315.00
08/30/04	Attend to KAP emails re other matters, including PGB and other litigation (0.3)	RXB	0.30	159.00
08/31/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status of orders	KAP	0.10	35.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CASE ADMINISTRATION			\$4,939.00
08/02/04	E-mails to DEM, C. Kuoni re MQ (.2), confirm date of service w/ TXL (.1)	CSC	0.30	57.00
08/02/04	Prepare e-mails re status of pending litigation matters (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/13/04	Prepare e-mails to R. Vignali re Puntero (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
08/16/04	Telephone conference with R. Vignali and C. Kuoni re Hendley, Puntero and Patino matters (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
08/23/04	Review motion to strike filed by defendant, discovery requests	CSC	0.50	95.00
08/23/04	Review pleadings in MQ Construction matter	DEM	0.30	97.50
08/24/04	Telephone conference with KAP re upcoming hearing on motion to strike	CSC	0.10	19.00
08/26/04	Research re motion to strike and timing of discovery (.8); conference with DEM and e-mails re same (.3)	CSC	1.10	209.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		SEPTEMBE 5471.001/14 PAGE 22	•
08/26/04	Review motion to strike punitive damage claim (.3); office conferences with SKK and CSC re same (.5); draft letter to C. Kuoni re same (.5); strategize re response to motion (.5)	DEM	1.80	585.00
08/26/04	Telephone conference with R. Vignali and C. Kuoni re Damon Hunt matter (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
08/26/04	Conference with DEM re hearing on MQ Construction's Motion to Strike	SKK	0.30	69.00
08/27/04	Letter to R. Scheel re discovery requests	CSC	0.20	38.00
08/31/04	Attend telephone conference re PPG appeal	KAP	0.60	210.00
08/31/04	Prepare status report re PPG appeal	KAP	0.20	70.00
08/31/04	Telephone conference with T. Breiner, C. Kuoni and KAP re PPG appeal	RXB	0.40	212.00
08/31/04	Review Motion to Strike and Complaint for MQ Construction matter and outline argument (0.5); attend hearing on MQ Construction's Motion to Strike (0.9); follow-up correspondence with DEM and CXC (0.1)	SKK	1.50	345.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR GENL LIT (NON-ENVIRON'TAL)			\$2,706.50
	TOTAL FOR SERVICES		\$	94,404.50

+ DENOTES PARALEGAL

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 23

#### ATTORNEY SUMMARY

ATTORNEY	TITLE	RATE	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
Oscar L. Alcantara	PARTNER	360.00	8.50	3,060.00
Ronald Barliant	PARTNER	530.00	30.80	16,324.00
Barbara M. Flom	PARTNER	400.00	0.50	200.00
Gerald L. Jenkins	PARTNER	460.00	3.30	1,518.00
David E. Morrison	PARTNER	325.00	6.10	1,982.50
Terry F. Mortiz	PARTNER	485.00	1.40	679.00
Alan P. Solow	PARTNER	530.00	1.50	795.00
Michael L. Sullivan	PARTNER	355.00	1.00	355.00
Matthew A. Zapf	PARTNER	380.00	65.30	24,814.00
Catherine S. Carrigan	ASSOCIATE	190.00	2.20	418.00
Alais L.M. Griffin	ASSOCIATE	215.00	4.20	903.00
Salvador K. Karottki	ASSOCIATE	230.00	51.40	11,822.00
Kathryn A. Pamenter	ASSOCIATE	350.00	71.10	24,885.00
Anne M. Sherry	ASSOCIATE	210.00	2.10	441.00
Keith A. Sigale	ASSOCIATE	295.00	7.60	2,242.00
Kristina A. Bunker+	PARALEGAL	130.00	8.10	1,053.00
Diane M. Ende+	PARALEGAL	105.00	25.60	2,688.00
Julie M. Spencer+	PARALEGAL	125.00	1.80	225.00
TOTAL TIME			292.50	\$ 94,404.50

LEAD ATTORNEY - Ronald Barliant

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.H. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

SEPTEMBER 24, 2004 5471.001/149571 PAGE 24

#### SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

Dong Distance Total Sea	17.90 16.06
Travel Expenses VENDOR: Alan Solow 7/27/04 7/28/04  Travel Expenses VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter Delaware 7/27/04 7/31/04  - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copies, Tabs, Oversize Copying  - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copies, Tabs, Oversize Copying  - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copies, Oversize Copying  - VENDOR: Document Technologies Copies, Oversize Copying  - VENDOR: Document Technologies Glass Wors, Bates Labeling, Oversize Copying  - VENDOR: Esquire Deposition Services Deposition transcript  - VENDOR: Esquire Deposition Services Deposition transcript  Federal Express Inv #1-909-54753  - 7/30/2004 VENDOR: Federal Express  - 7  Federal Express Inv #1-952-14476  - 8/5/04 VENDOR: Federal Express  - 8  Federal Express Inv #1-952-14476  - 8/5/04 VENDOR: Federal Express  - 8  Federal Express Inv #1-952-14476  - 8/5/04 VENDOR: Federal Express  - 7  Travel Expenses VENDOR: Alan Solow 6/21 - 6/23/04  - Federal Express - VENDOR: Alan Solow 6/21 - 6/23/04  - VENDOR: Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55499  - 7/26/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.  Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55499  - 7/26/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.  Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55499  - 7/26/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.  Pacer Service Center  - 7/9/04  - Pacer Service  - VENDOR: Ronald Barliant  - 7/27-28/04  - Wilmington, DE  - 1,	90.70 76.90 93.52 99.26 23.26 89.41 11.00 71.63 23.94 32.39 66.99 6.00 78.67 70.95 6.00 6.00 66.83 4.06 4.55 54.53 28.86 73.55 90.15 7.42 80.79 10.00 12.00 75.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Downers Grove Sanitary District and Bates Labeling Lexis-Nexis Legal Search Charges 07/31/04 Inv #0407027586  47	72.46 75.10

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM S5 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION	SEPTEMBER 2 5471.001/14957 PAGE 25	•
Westlaw Invoice #807064183 7/31/04		404.67
Westlaw Invoice #807064183 7/31/04		95.85
Westlaw Invoice #807064183 7/31/04		1,203.47
Westlaw Invoice #807064183 7/31/04		45.12
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55585 8/2/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		4.25
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55585 8/2/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		6.00
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55893 8/9/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		4.25
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55893 8/9/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.		4.25
Federal Express Inv #1-952-68355 8/11/04 VENDOR: Federal Express		33.31
TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	\$	15,932.19
TOTAL THIS STATEMENT	\$ 1	10,336.69

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION Met-Coil Systems Corporation c/o Charles F. Kuoni, III 711 Ogden Avenue Lisle, IL 60532 OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 1

REGARDING: BANKRUPTCY

#### FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

<u>DATE</u>	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
09/16/04	Review motions (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/17/04	Review and comment on agenda (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/20/04	Prepare agenda and telephone conferences with D. Butz, N. Peterman and A. Landis re same (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/22/04	Telephone conference with RXB re orders (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/15/04	Review status report and prepare e-mail re same (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
10/18/04	Prepare agenda (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
10/19/04	Review stipulations (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY FILINGS			\$980.00
09/07/04	Review Mejdrech final motion (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/09/04	Review amendment to settlement agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/09/04	Review settlement agreements re payouts (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/10/04	Review and comment on USEPA settlement agreement (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
09/12/04	Review Wroble motion (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/13/04	Review amendment to settlement agreement (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/15/04	Prepare settlement agreements for transmittal (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
09/21/04	Review USEPA settlement agreement and prepare e-mail re same (.40); prepare orders and e-mails re same (.50)	KAP	0.90	315.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 2	
09/29/04	Review letter from creditor re expunged claim and email to KAP re same	RXB	0.30	159.00
09/30/04	Emails re notice to creditor of claim objection	RXB	0.30	159.00
10/12/04	Telephone conferences with B. Wallace and R. Perry re claims (.40); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re claims (.20); telephone conference with M. Araki re same (.10)	KAP	0.70	245.00
10/19/04	Conference with KAP re transfer of domain names and timing of HVAC payment (0.1); E-mail with New England HVAC re transfer of domain names (0.2)	OLA	0.30	108.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION			\$1,581.00
09/02/04	Prepare for and attend conference with C. Kuoni and RXB re distributions and hookups (2.30)	KAP	2.30	805.00
09/02/04	Review of correspondence per KAP re funding issues (.3); review, editing of funding agreement (.5)	KAS	0.80	236.00
09/03/04	Review corporate documents (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/03/04	Review, editing of funding agreement, assignment of claims, and escrow agreement (.7); review of term sheet re funding matters (.2); meet with KAP re funding agreement and related matters (.6)	KAS	1.50	442.50
09/05/04	Prepare e-mails re meetings (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
09/07/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman and KAS re agreements (.50); review same (.30)	KAP	0.80	280.00
09/07/04	Conference call with N. Peterman and KAP re funding agreement (.6); preparation, drafting of comments to funding agreement (.5)	KAS	1.10	324.50
09/08/04	Conference, review of correspondence per KAP re funding agreement comments (.3); review, editing of revised funding agreement (.4)	KAS	0.70	206.50
09/09/04	Review escrow agreement (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/09/04	Review of TCE Trust escrow agreement (.4); conference with KAP re escrow agreement (.1)	KAS	0.50	147.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 NEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINDIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 20 5471.001/150366 PAGE 3	04
09/10/04	Review, editing of funding agreement (.4); conference with KAP re funding agreement (.1)	KAS	0.50	147.50
09/13/04	Telephone conferences with KAS re funding agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/13/04	Drafting, editing, preparation of comments to Met-Coil funding agreement (.5); preparation of mailing to N. Peterman re funding agreement (.2); conference with KAP re funding agreement, related documents (.1)	KAS	0.80	236.00
09/14/04	Review of C. Kuoni memo re funding agreement (.3); conference with C. Kuoni re funding agreements, comments (.6); editing, preparation of mailings to N. Peterman re funding agreement comments (.5); conference with KAP re funding agreement, letter of direction (.2); drafting of letter of direction to Mestek (.4)	KAS	2.00	590.00
09/15/04	Telephone conference with KAS re letter of direction (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/15/04	Editing, drafting of letter of direction (.4); review of correspondence, correspondence with KAP, C. Kuoni re letter of direction (.1); correspondence with KAP and JMS re state qualification and withdrawal filings (.2)	KAS	0.70	206.50
09/21/04	Telephone conference re guaranty (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/21/04	Review, editing of Mestek guarantee and Mejdrech escrow agreement (.7); meet with KAP re funding agreement, escrow agreement, and guarantee (.2); conference with S. Bezarks re funding agreement (.3)	KAS	1.20	354.00
09/22/04	Telephone conference with A. Bourlard, C. Kuoni and K. Mack re technical meeting (.70)	KAP	0.70	245.00
09/22/04	Review escrow agreement (.20); review guaranty (.30)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/22/04	Conferences with KAP re Mestek guaranty (.2); review of guaranty (.4); review, editing of funding agreement (.4)	KAS	1.00	295.00
09/23/04	Conference with KAS re guarantee and review same (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
09/23/04	Review escrow agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMM.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

OCTOBER 25, 2004

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

			5471.001/150366 PAGE 4	
09/23/04	Meet with KAP re guaranty (.3); preparation of comments, mailing to T. Scanlan re Mestek guaranty (.3); conference with T. Scanlan re guaranty (.2); correspondence, conference with KAP re funding agreement (.2); review, conference with KAP re escrow agreement (.2); review of state filings for Met-Coil Systems (.2)	KAS	1.40	413.00
09/23/04	E-mails with KAP and B. Heller re transfer of domain names (0.2); attention to Tucows registration for three domain names (0.1)	OLA	0.30	108.00
09/24/04	Review extension motion (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/24/04	E-mails with B. Heller re transfer of domain names (0.1); call and e-mail to B. Smith re transfer of domain names (0.2)	OLA	0.30	108.00
09/28/04	Review escrow agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/28/04	E-mails with KAP and I. Hurtado re status of Luland payment and transfer of domain name	OLA	0.30	108.00
09/30/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re budget	KAP	0.10	35.00
10/01/04	Prepare e-mails and telephone conferences re budget (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
10/01/04	Review of revised trust funding agreement (.3); conference with KAP, preparation of memo to KAP re comments to funding agreement (.5)	KAS	0.80	236.00
10/07/04	Review contract (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
10/11/04	Conferences with MAZ re audit update (.4)	DME+	0.40	42.00
10/11/04	Conferences with KAP re funding agreement, letter of credit (.3); review of funding agreement (.4); review, editing of letter of credit and correspondence re same (.4);	KAS	1.40	413.00

KGR

KAS

0.30

0.70

0.80

96.00

266.00

236.00

meet with KAP re letter of credit issues (.3)

re audit (.3); review response re same (.3)

Conference with KAS re letter of credit issues

Conference with C. Kuoni re guarantee to lenders (.4);

conference with KAP re guarantee, letter of direction (.1)

review of letter of direction, wire directions (.3);

Call to DME re Met-Coil audit (.1); conferences with DME MAZ

10/11/04

10/11/04

10/13/04

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 5		
10/14/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re letter of direction (.50); revise same (.20)	KAP	0.70	245.00
10/14/04	Meeting with KAS re wires (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/14/04	Meet with KAP re direction letters, wire transfers (.5); conference with KAP re funding agreement, wires, credit facility matters (.3)	KAS	0.80	236.00
10/15/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and C. Kuoni re wires and funding (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
10/15/04	Conference with KAP re funding agreements, related documents	KAS	0.20	59.00
10/18/04	Review of revised funding agreement (.4); drafting of correspondence to KAP, C. Kuoni re comments to funding agreement (.3)	KAS	0.70	206.50
10/19/04	Telephone conferences with A. Davis re cancellation of hearings and setting professional fee application hearing (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CORPORATE MATTERS			\$9,178.50
09/01/04	Review memorandum on valuation of property	ALG	0.80	172.00
09/01/04	Issues re filing and discussion with ALG re mediation costs	TFM	0.50	242.50
09/02/04	Conference with GLJ re withholding tax issue in settlement	BMF	0.30	120.00
09/02/04	Telephone conference with GLJ re tax issues (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/07/04	Meet with FHC re consultants invoices and draft email correspondence to J. Haglund and C. Kuoni (.3); telephone conference with PTAB re extension (.1)	ALG	0.40	86.00
09/07/04	Work on PTAB materials	FHC	1.30	494.00
09/07/04	Office conference and research re Form 1099	GLJ	2.00	920.00
09/08/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and GLJ re tax withholding issues (.90); telephone conference with C. Kuoni and GLJ re same (.80); conference with GLJ re same (.30)	KAP	2.00	700.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM SS EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 6	
09/09/04	Telephone conference with J. Haglund re documentary support for remediation costs	ALG	0.50	107.50
09/09/04	Conference with GLJ and research on withholding issue.	BMF	1.30	520.00
09/09/04	Telephone conferences and conferences re tax issue and 1099s (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
09/10/04	Meet with FHC re invoices and remediation cost documentary support (.3); telephone conversation with J. Haglund re documents and visit to Metcoil offices (.3)	ALG	0.60	129.00
09/10/04	Work on evidence for property tax appeal	FHC	0.40	152.00
09/10/04	Attend telephone conferences re tax issues (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/13/04	Telephone conferences and e-mails re SSN and 1099 issue (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/15/04	Telephone conference with S. Bezark re tax issues (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/16/04	Prepare TIN letter (.30); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.30)	KAP	0.60	210.00
09/20/04	Prepare for visit to Lockformer office including telephone conference with J. Haglund (.6)	ALG	0.60	129.00
09/20/04	Telephone conference and exchange messages with KAP re tax issues (.2); review e-mails (.1)	BMF	0.30	120.00
09/20/04	Telephone conferences with N. Peterman, S. Bezark, C. Kuoni and BMF re SSN/1099 issue (1.0); prepare draft e-mail re same (.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
09/20/04	Emails and telephone conference with KAP re SSN issue (0.4)	RXB	0.40	212.00
09/21/04	Meet with J. Haglund and A. Bourlard re vendor invoices, remediation costs and remediation process (4.1); draft email correspondence to J. Haglund and A. Bourlard (.3); email correspondence with KAP and conversation with TFM re case status (.2)	ALG	4.60	989.00
09/21/04	Telephone conferences re SSN/tax issue (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 7	
09/22/04	Telephone conference with KAP re remediation cost materials (.1); meet with KAP and SKK re remediation cost materials (.5); telephone conference with J. Van Santen (.3); prepare materials and affidavit for J. Van Santen (1.6)	ALG	2.50	537.50
09/22/04	Retrieve documents for ALG review	KAB+	0.20	26.00
09/22/04	Conference with ALG and SKK re PTAB status and discovery (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
09/22/04	Review email from ALG re PTAB work (.1); review email from KAP re same (.1)	MAZ	0.20	76.00
09/22/04	Conference with KAP and ALG re PTAB and contribution action (0.3); conferences with ALG re same (0.3)	SKK	0.60	138.00
09/23/04	Prepare remediation cost materials for appraisal, including meet with RXB re remediation cost data (1.0); review spreadsheets from A. Bourlard (1.0); and prepare packet of materials and letter for J. Van Santen (1.4)	ALG	3.40	731.00
09/23/04	Review PTAB issues (tax appeal) (.4); conference with SKK re same (.2)	MAZ	0.60	228.00
09/23/04	Review disclosure statement and consultant documents before delivery to appraiser and conference with ALG re same and emails KAP re same (1.2)	RXB	1.20	636.00
09/23/04	Conference with MAZ re PTAB issues and contribution actions (0.2);conference with ALG re same (0.2); teleconference with ALG re same (0.2)	SKK	0.60	138.00
09/23/04	Conference with MAZ re PTAB issues and contribution actions (0.2); conference with ALG re same (0.2)	SKK	0.40	92.00
09/26/04	Conference with TFM, KAP and ALG re remediation cost disclosures to appraiser	RXB	0.50	265.00
09/27/04	Meet with TFM re remediation cost materials (.3); meet with TFM, KAP and RXB re remediation costs and bankruptcy/litigation (.6); review remediation cost materials (.4)	ALG	1.30	279.50
09/27/04	Meeting with TFM, RXB and ALG re tax matter (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 8		
09/27/04	Conference with TFM, KAP and ALG re disclosures to appraiser	RXB	0.50	265.00
09/27/04	Meet with ALG, KAP and RXB re interaction tax case and bankruptcy case	TFM	1.30	630.50
09/28/04	Telephone conference with TFM and C. Kuoni (.6); meet with TFM and SKK (.3)	ALG	0.90	193.50
09/28/04	Telephone conferences with K. Mack, N. Peterman, S. Bezark, C. Kuoni, B. Wallace and RXB re SSN issue and consent order (1.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
09/28/04	Emails with KAP re IEPA and SSN issue and contribution action assignment (0.3); conference with KAP and telephone conference with S. Bezark, N. Peterman, and C. Kuoni and emails and review documents all re SSN issue and consent decree (0.8)	RXB	1.10	583.00
09/28/04	Conference with TFM and ALG re PTAB issues and contribution action (0.5)	SKK	0.50	115.00
09/28/04	Meeting with ALG re appraisal (.50); conference with C. Kuoni re appraisal (.60); follow up with appraiser re meeting (.40)	TFM	1.50	727.50
09/30/04	Emails re SSN issue and consent order	RXB	0.30	159.00
10/01/04	Draft email to KAP re enterprise valuation and affidavit (.1)	ALG	0.10	21.50
10/04/04	Prepare for and attend meeting with J. Van Santen and TFM (2.6); meet with SKK re paragraph on remediation process for appraisal (.3)	ALG	2.90	623.50
10/04/04	Review materials for appraiser per ALG (0.3); review draft appraisal report in light of contribution actions (0.7); conference with ALG re write-up on remediation process (0.3)	SKK	1.30	299.00
10/04/04	Meeting with appraiser (.6); follow up with ALG (.2)	TFM	0.80	388.00
10/05/04	Review C. Kuoni affidavit and bankruptcy filings (.7)	ALG	0.70	150.50
10/06/04	Telephone conference with A. Bourlard re remediation costs	ALG	0.30	64.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 9	
10/12/04	Meet with KAP re edits to appraisal (.2); telephone conference with C. Kuoni and KAP (.3); prepare paragraph on PTAB appeal for audit (.3); review costs for appraisal (1.0)	ALG	1.80	387.00
10/12/04	Conference with ALS re tax appeal (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
10/13/04	Telephone conference with J. Van Santen re appraisal edits (.4); review PTAB appeal evidence, including remediation costs (3.0)	ALG	3.40	731.00
10/13/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re tax form (.20); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.20)	KAP	0.40	140.00
10/14/04	Telephone call with KAP re appeal evidence (.3); meet with TFM and KAP re appeal evidence (.5); telephone conference with K. Mack and KAP re appeal evidence (.3); research admissibility of summarizing documents (1.1)	ALG	2.20	473.00
10/14/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack and ALG re PTAB appeal (.50); conference with ALG and TFM re same (.50); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same and hook-up notice (.50)	KAP	1.50	525.00
10/14/04	Review materials re PTAB discovery issues (.70); office conference with KAP and ALG re same (.40)	TFM	1.10	533.50
10/15/04	Telephone conference with K. Michael re employee tax (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
10/18/04	Teleconference with KAP, RXB and C. Kuoni re PTAB filing materials (.5); telephone call to J. Van Santen (.1); review and prepare Clayton Group spreadsheets (4.7); draft affidavit for C. Kuoni (2.9)	ALG	8.20	1,763.00
10/18/04	Conference call with ALG and C. Kuoni re PTAB (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
10/18/04	Conference with ALG and FHC re issues re Met-Coil PTAB	TFM	0.80	388.00

09/03/04

Review and revise hook-up notice (1.40)

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 50603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 10		
10/19/04	Telephone conference and email correspondence with J. Van Santen re appraisal (.3); draft affidavit for C. Kuoni (.7); meet with FHC re case status (.7); prepare for and attend meeting with KAP, TFM, RXB, FHC, SKK, and MAZ re evidence issues (.6); telephone conferences with K. Mack re same (.3); meet with FHC re consent order (.2); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and TFM re meeting (.2); conference with SKK re appraisal evidence (.3); review and prepare PTAB evidence (2.4)	ALG	5.70	1,225.50	
10/19/04	Teleconference with ALG re USEPA order; search for underlying orders, and conference with ALG re same	DME+	0.50	52.50	
10/19/04	Work on evidence to be submitted to PTAB in support of property tax appeal	FHC	3.30	1,254.00	
10/19/04	Conference re PTAB filing (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00	
10/19/04	Conference with TFM, RXB, SKK, KAP, FHC and ALG re outstanding evidentiary issues and strategy for PTAB matter (.5); follow-up conference with SKK re pertinent documents re same (.3)	MAZ	0.80	304.00	
10/19/04	Conference with TFM, et al. re tax appeal	RXB	0.50	265.00	
10/19/04	Conference with TFM, RXB, MAZ, KAP, FHC and ALG re PTAB matter (0.5); follow-up conference with MAZ re documents to be used in PTAB matter (0.3); review spreadsheets for appraiser per ALG (0.2); review prior filings for description of contamination per ALG (0.4); conference with ALG re appraisal evidence (0.3)	SKK	1.70	391.00	
10/19/04	Conference with FHC, ALG, KAP re PTAB matter	TFM	0.50	242.50	
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TAX MATTERS			\$24,810.50	
09/01/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni, T. Krueger and K. Mack re USEPA relations (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00	
09/02/04	Telephone conference re hookup election notice (.60); review and revise same (.60)	KAP	1.20	420.00	

**KAP** 

1.40

490.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

			PAGE 11	
09/03/04	Telephone call with C. Kuoni and SKK re Clayton summary (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/03/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re environmental status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/08/04	Review and revise hook-up notice (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/09/04	Review Form 1099 issues	GLJ	1.00	460.00
09/10/04	Review proposals re FEINs and research re same	GLJ	1.80	828.00
09/16/04	Review and revise hook-up notice (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/17/04	Prepare e-mails re hook-up notice (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/20/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re remediation schedule (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/21/04	Review draft supplemental order and telephone conference with K. Mack re same (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/22/04	Telephone conference with E. Wallace and S. Bezark re hook-up notices (.40); telephone conference with E. Manske re same (.30)	KAP	0.70	245.00
09/22/04	Telephone conferences with K. Mack, D. Garber, C. Kuoni and T. Krueger re USEPA issues (1.90)	KAP	1.90	665.00
09/23/04	Attend telephonic technical meeting (1.0); telephone conference with A. Bourlard in advance of same (.30)	KAP	1.30	455.00
09/23/04	Review supplemental remediation schedule and telephone conferences with K. Mack re same (2.0)	KAP	2.00	700.00
09/23/04	Conference with KAP re USEPA issue and Clayton documents (0.5)	RXB	0.50	265.00
09/24/04	Meet with KAP re address information (.4); review of same (.5)	KAB+	0.90	117.00
09/24/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re status (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
09/27/04	Prepare revised draft of consent order amendment	KAP	0.40	140.00
09/29/04	Telephone conferences with K. Mack, S. Bezark, N. Peterman and RXB re consent order issues (.60)	KAP	0.90	315.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SVS	TEMS	CORP	$\bigcap \mathbb{R} \Delta \mathbb{T}$	MOI
17XD 1 - C/C/11	J 1 J		CON	.,,,	11 71 9

		5471.001/150366 PAGE 12			
09/29/04	Review consent decree and emails re same and hearing (0.7); telephone conference with S. Bezark and M Prewitt re hearing (0.4); telephone conference with K. Mack and email to KAP re same (0.4); various telephone conferences with Greenberg Traurig lawyers and C. Kuoni and KAP and emails all re consent order (1.3)	RXB	2.80	1,484.00	
09/30/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re status of consent order (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00	
10/04/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re consent order (.20); telephone conference with RXB re same (.20); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same (.20)	KAP	0.60	210.00	
10/04/04	Emails and telephone conference with KAP re SNN issue	RXB	0.80	424.00	
10/06/04	Prepare hook-up notices, other documents and e-mails re same (.80); review amendment and telephone conferences with K. Mack and S. Bezark re same (.60)	KAP	1.40	490.00	
10/07/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re order and letter (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	
10/08/04	Review USEPA settlement agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	
10/11/04	Telephone conferences with K. Mack and C. Kuoni re environmental matters including bioremediation pilot study (.90)	KAP	0.90	315.00	
10/12/04	Review and prepare e-mail re USEPA settlement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	
10/13/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack and R. Jones re hook- up (.30); telephone conference with E. Manzke re same (.20)	KAP	0.50	175.00	
10/14/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack and T. Krueger re remediation (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00	
10/15/04	Prepare e-mails re hook-up notices (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00	
10/18/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni, M. Obarski and K. Mack re hook-up notice procedures (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00	
10/19/04	Telephone conference with K. Mack re hook-up notices (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00	

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL MATTERS			\$10,053.00
09/01/04	Review prior research files (0.3); conference with SKK re CERCLA research (0.2)	AMW+	0.50	72.50
09/01/04	Prepare and organize contribution files	CSM+	6.30	504.00
09/01/04	Consolidation and reorganization of files	DME+	4.50	472.50
09/01/04	Conference with SKK re expert reports (.3); review issues re rebuttal reports (1.1); conference with OLA and SKK re discovery issues (.3); conference with OLA re relattal reports (0.2)	MAZ	1.90	722.00
09/01/04	Further revision to Met-Coil memo in support of disclosure motion (0.8); conference with SKK re edits to Memo re disclosure (0.4); conference with SKK re case update and strategy (0.4); conference with SKK re responding to expert reports (0.2); conference with MAZ re same (0.3); conference with SKK re overlap on IEPA issue (0.2); further review of Defendants' expert reports and notes on strategy for rebuttal reports (0.5); conference with MAZ and SKK re discovery issues (0.3)	OLA	3.10	1,116.00
09/01/04	Review correspondence from consultant (0.3); conference with MAZ re expert reports (0.3); edit disclosure motion (1.8); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.3); conference with OLA re same (0.2); review materials from consultant (0.2); research re disclosure issues (1); teleconference with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.5); conference with AMW re CERCLA research (0.2); conference with OLA and MAZ re expert issues (0.3); conference with OLA re case update and strategy (0.7); teleconferences with consultants (1); conference with OLA re edits to disclosure motion (0.4); conference with OLA re rebuttal reports (0.2)	SKK	7.40	1,702.00
09/02/04	Research re evidentary burdens in CERLA action	AMW+	2.50	362.50
09/02/04	Prepare and organize contibution files	CSM+	7.10	568.00
09/02/04	Continued organization of environmental files (6)	DME+	6.00	630.00
09/02/04	Obtained various publications by purchasing and inter library loan from Illinois Water Survey Library	LKM+	1.00	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3780 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25 5471.001/150 PAGE 14	
09/02/04	Review outstanding strategy and discovery issues (.8); conference with SKK re same (.3); review rebuttal issues (2.8)	MAZ	3.90	1,482.00
09/02/04	Review Defendants Expert's Articles (1.1); e-mail with SKK re strategy for reply reports (0.2)	OLA	1.30	468.00
09/02/04	Conference with MAZ re case status (0.3); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.3); teleconference with K. Mack re discovery issues (0.2); review expert reports and exhibits from Third-Party Defendants (1.1); email from OLA re rebattal issues (.2)	SKK	2.00	460.00
09/03/04	Research re expert testimony and evidentary issues	AMW+	1.50	217.50
09/03/04	Ordered Land Use Planning Map	LKM+	0.30	31.50
09/03/04	Conference with DME re files (.2); email to RXB re transition (.2); review and revise newest version of rebuttal strategy disclosure motion (1.2); conference with SKK re same (.2)	MAZ	1.80	684.00
09/03/04	Conference with SKK re rebuttal strategy (0.6); conference with SKK re disclosure motion and in camera inspection (0.1); review newest version of disclosure motion (1.0); attention to Malcolm-Pirnie estimate (0.1);	OLA	1.80	648.00
09/03/04	Emails re contribution actions and expert reports	RXB	0.20	106.00
09/03/04	Teleconference with C. Kuoni and KAP re ERH write-up (0.5); conference with OLA re rebuttal strategy (0.6); conference with OLA re disclosure motion and in camera inspection (0.1); conference with MAZ re disclosure motion (0.2); edit motion for protective order and memo in support (6.2); correspondence with MAZ re action items (0.7)	SKK	8.30	1,909.00
09/05/04	Email re contribution actions transition	RXB	0.10	53.00
09/06/04	Review issues re disclosure (.5); review transition issues (.6); review emails from KAP and RXB re same (.2); review issue re experts costs (.3)	MAZ	1.60	608.00
09/07/04	Research re expert testimony and evidentary issues	AMW+	1.50	217.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 317.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 15	
09/07/04	Locate and send documents requested by consultant (2.6); review motion (1); continued organization of environmental files (2.4)	DME+	5.00	525.00
09/07/04	Review Glanders expert report and related documents re Mejdrech (1.8); review documents and issues re rebuttal (3.8); review Glanders expert report and related documents in LeClerq (.8); review documents re rebuttal issues re same (2.5)	MAZ	8.90	3,382.00
09/07/04	Review and revise SKK draft Motion for Protective Order (0.4); review and revise Memo in support of Motion (1.0); e-mail to MAZ re same (0.1)	OLA	1.50	540.00
09/07/04	Edit Memo in Support and Karottki Affidavit (3); teleconference with CXB re edits to same (1.5)	SKK	4.50	1,035.00
09/08/04	Research re expert testimony and evidentary issues	AMW+	2.00	290.00
09/08/04	Prepare and organize contribution files	CSM+	2.20	176.00
09/08/04	Prepared for teleconference with J. Mercer (1.2); teleconference with J. Mercer (.6); review issues raised in same (1.3); conference with OLA re transfer and disclosure issue (.5); review SKK's declaration (.4)	MAZ	4.00	1,520.00
09/08/04	Conference with MAZ re finalizing and filing motion, re filing under seal or submission for in camera inspection (0.2); conference with MAZ re strategy on disclosure motion and transfer (0.3); revise motion and memo based upon conference with MAZ (0.7)	OLA	1.00	360.00
09/09/04	Research re expert testimony and evidentary issue (2.5); begin drafting bullet point memo for SKK (1.5)	AMW+	4.00	580.00
09/09/04	Retrieve documents from contribution action files	CSM+	0.30	24.00
09/09/04	Attention to Biederman Affidavit and Kralovac Affidavit (0.2); final review of SKK affidavit and exhibits (0.3); final review and revision of motion and memo (1.2)	OLA	1.70	612.00
09/10/04	Draft and edit bullet point memo for SKK	AMW+	3.00	435.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.W. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CO	RPORATION
---------------------	-----------

			PAGE 16	366
09/10/04	Prepare for and attend teleconference with consultant (1.8); review issues from teleconference (.8); review expert reports and related documents re additional rebuttal issues (3.6); conference with OLA re call with Greenberg (.3); review transition issues and case status re same (.4); review various emails from KAP re meeting with Greenberg (.1); conference with OLA re privilege issues with respect to assignment of contribution claims (.2); review outstanding issues re discovery (.2); review transfer issues (.3); review contribution agreement issues (.4)		8.10	3,078.00
09/10/04	Conference with MAZ re privilege issues with respect to assignment of contribution claim (0.3); conference with KAP re preparation for call with Greenberg (0.2); call with Mestek's counsel (0.3); attention to hearing date for in camera inspection and presentation disclosure motion (0.1); review packet for S. Bezark re disclosure motion (0.1); conference with RXB re transition and assignment (0.1)	OLA	1.10	396.00
09/13/04	Prepare and organize contribution files	CSM+	3.10	248.00
09/13/04	Office conference with SKK re action items (.5); search PAR documents for data logs for experts (.3)	DME+	0.80	84.00
09/13/04	Conferences with SKK re action items (1.4); conference with SKK re disclosure motion (.2); conference with SKK re rebuttal issues (.2); conference with OLA re same (.3); review assignment damages (.2); review Lue-Hing report (.8); review issues for rebuttal (.4); prepare for teleconference with R. St. John (1.4); conference with OLA, SKK and R. St. John (1.5); conference with SKK and OLA re same (.2); review joint defense agreement (.6); conference with KAP re hearing on settlement (.3)	MAZ	7.50	2,850.00
09/13/04	Finalize blackline of assignment agreement (0.2); conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.3); conference with SKK re disclosure motion and expert issues (0.2); emails with SKK re coordinating with Deutsch-Levy (0.1); teleconference with MAZ, SKK and R. St. John re Defendants' expert report (1.5); conference with MAZ and SKK re Glanders' expert report (0.2)	OLA	2.50	900.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

09/13/04	Conferences with MAZ re action items and case status (1.4); conference with MXE re notice of motion re disclosure (0.2); correspondence with MAZ and OLA re same (0.2); conference with OLA re disclosure motion and expert issues (0.2); review issues re potential motion practice re expert reports (0.7); teleconferences with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.2); teleconference with KAP and C. Kuoni re consultant invoice and correspondence re same (0.3); conference with DME re documents and action items (0.5); prepare for teleconference with R. St. John (0.3); teleconference with OLA, MAZ, and R. St. John re comments on Glanders' expert report (1.5); teleconference with KAP re Mejdrech matter (0.1); conference with MAZ and OLA re Glanders' expert report (0.2); conference with MAZ re disclosure motion (0.2); conference with G. Rovner re disclosure motion and review correspondence re same (0.3)	SKK	6.70	1,541.00
09/14/04	Prepare and organize contribution files	CSM+	4.20	336.00
09/14/04	Condense and organization of files (9.8); review Parson's documents for analytical figures (.4)	DME+	10.20	1,071.00
09/14/04	Prepare for hearing on disclosure motion (.8); conference with SKK re disclosure hearing (.2); conference with KAP re resolution of Mejdrech action (.1); attend hearing before J. Leineweber re disclosure issues and Mejdrech settlement (1.5); follow-up conference with SKK re same (.8); teleconference with SKK, consultant and OLA (1.2); review issues from consultant conference (1.3); email to DME re files (.1); conference with DME re files (.2); review same (.2); conference with SKK re rebuttal theory (.5)	MAZ	6.90	2,622.00
09/14/04	Conference with SKK re hearing (0.1); teleconference with MAZ, SKK, and consultant re reaction to Defendant's expert reports and re strategy for reply (1.2); conference with SKK re discovery issues (0.2)	OLA	1.50	540.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-S802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

09/14/04	Review disclosure motion and prepare for hearing before J. Leinenweber (0.8); conference with MAZ re hearing on disclosure motion (0.2); attend hearing before J. Leinenweber on disclosure motion (1.2); follow-up conference with MAZ re Leineweber hearing (0.8); conference with OLA re hearing on disclosure motion (0.1); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.3); review materials to experts and follow-up correspondence with DME re materials to experts (0.5); teleconference with consultant, MAZ, and OLA re Glanders' and Lue-Hing's expert reports and strategy for reply (1.2); conference with OLA re discovery issues (0.2); conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues (.5)	SKK	6.50	1,495.00
09/15/04	Prepare and organize contribution files	CSM+	4.50	360.00
09/15/04	Consolidation and organization of contribution files (7.6); teleconference with consultant re materials (.4); conference with MAZ re files (.3)	DME+	8.30	871.50
09/15/04	Review files for transfer (1.8); conference with DME re same (.3); conference with SKK re rebuttal reports (1.0); review issues re same (.8); conference with SKK re transition (.3)	MAZ	4.20	1,596.00
09/15/04	Review consultant's analysis of Defendant's expert report	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/15/04	Conference with MAZ re rebuttal reports (1.0); review Glanders' expert report (1.3); conference with MAZ re transition (0.3); review CERCLA cases from AMW (2.2); teleconference with consultant re rebuttal issues (3.5)	SKK	8.30	1,909.00
09/16/04	Prepare documents for return to client	CSM+	7.30	584.00
09/16/04	Condense and organize contribution files (6.8); conference with MAZ re same (.2)	DME+	7.00	735.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

09/16/04	Review consultant issues (.3); conference with SKK re same (.2); prepare for conference with expert (1.8); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (1.4); conference with SKK re same (.1); review open issues from conference call (.8); conference with DME re files and transfer (.2); review same (.4); review protective order issue (.2); review strategy re rebuttal to Lue-Hing report (1.2); review related documents re same (.8)	MAZ	7.90	3,002.00
09/16/04	Correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultant (0.8); follow- up conference with MAZ re same (0.2); review Lue-Hing's expert report and VOC emissions textbook (2.6); teleconferences with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (1); conference with MAZ re same (0.1)	SKK	4.70	1,081.00
09/17/04	Prepare documents for return to client	CSM+	2.20	176.00
09/17/04	Consolidation and organization of contribution action files (7.8)	DME+	7.80	819.00
09/17/04	Prepare for teleconference with consultant (2.3); conference with SKK re same (.2); teleconference with SKK and consultant (.8); conference with OLA re DGSD discovery (0.1); review issues from conference (1.2); review rebuttal issues, documents and strategy going forward (1.4); review rebuttal issues for Mercer report (2.4); review documents re same (1.7)	MAZ	6.40	2,432.00
09/17/04	Conference with SKK re status of rebuttal report (0.1); review rebuttal issues for Mercer report (0.5); attend portion of teleconference with MAZ, SKK and consultant (0.3); conference with MAZ re deposition of DGSD (0.1); conference with SKK re DGSD deposition or interview (0.2)	OLA	1.20	432.00
09/17/04	Conference with OLA re status of rebuttal report (0.1); conference with OLA re deposition or interview of L. Cox (0.2); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.5); correspondence with consultant re rebuttal issues (0.3); conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues and call with consultant (0.2); teleconference with MAZ and consultant (later with OLA) re rebuttal issues (0.8); review issues for Mercer rebuttal report (1.6)	SKK	3.70	851.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2195 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60503-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25 5471.001/1503 PAGE 20	•
09/20/04	Consolidation and organization of contribution action files (5); search document production for NPDES permits (1.2); draft notice of deposition for DGSD (.3)	DME+	6.50	682.50
09/20/04	Review issues re rebuttal reports (2); conference with SKK re same (.6); review Glanders reports (.7); review references in reports (.8); review transcript from hearing on disclosure issue (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); conferences with SKK re DGSD discovery (.4); review issues re same (.2); conference call to Greenberg (.1); conference with SKK re consultant (.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); review email re same (.1)	MAZ	5.70	2,166.00
09/20/04	Review issues for rebuttal report (0.2); review hearing transcript re disclosure motion (0.2)	OLA	0.40	144.00
09/20/04	Review transcript re hearing on disclosure motion (0.2); conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.6); conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.2); conferences with MAZ re DGSD discovery (0.4); teleconference with C. Kuoni re consultant (0.1); review discovery requests to DGSD and issues for access to documents (1.2); conference with MAZ re coordination with Greenberg and call to F. Citera re same (0.1); conference with MAZ re consultant (0.2); correspondence with S. Deely (0.2); teleconference with S. Engle re discovery from DGSD and follow-up correspondence re same (0.5); correspondence with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.2); correspondence with K. Mack re discovery materials (0.2)	SKK	3.90	897.00
09/21/04	Consolidation and organization of contribution action files per MAZ (5.7); conference with MAZ re file transfer (.3); conference with SKK re document production and action items (.3)	DME+	6.30	661.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

Α	MET.	COIL.	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION	ĺ
	Y L L ユ **	$\sim \sim 10$	J 1 J 1 L 171.		

			PAGE 21	
09/21/04	Prepare for teleconference with R. St. John (1.8); conference with SKK, OLA and R. St. John (.9); review issues from same (.7); conference with SKK and OLA re outstanding discovery issues and rebuttal reports (.5); conference with DME re file transfer (.3); conference with SKK re same (.1); conference with SKK re DGSD discovery issues (.3); review consultant bill (.2); correspondence with SKK re same (.1); review DGSD questions and related discovery issues (0.8); conference wit SKK re same (.1)	MAZ	5.80	2,204.00
09/21/04	Conference with SKK re DGSD deposition or interview issues (0.1); e-mails with SKK and DGSD's counsel re document discovery and re interview of L. Cox (0.2); e-mails with SKK and KAP re sanctions motion (0.2); review e-mail to DGSD counsel re topics for interview (0.1); teleconference with R. St. John, MAZ and SKK re rebuttal issues (0.9); conference with MAZ and SKK re rebuttal reports and discovery status (0.5)	OLA	2.10	756.00
09/21/04	Review and revise email re hook-up notice issue and conference with KAP and telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same and emails re same	RXB	1.50	795.00
09/21/04	Conference with OLA re DGSD deposition or interview issues (0.1); review correspondence from KAP and OLA re sanctions motion (0.1); teleconference with MAZ, OLA, and R. St. John re rebuttal report (0.9); follow-up conference with MAZ and OLA re rebuttal reports and case status (0.5); conferences with MAZ re discovery issues and consultant bill (.5); review selected references from Defendants' expert reports (2.5); correspondence with S. Engle re list of topics for L. Cox (1); review correspondence from consultant (0.3); teleconference with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.2); conference with DME re document production and action items (0.3); correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultant (0.2)	SKK	6.60	1,518.00
09/22/04	Conferences with SKK re DGSD documents (.6); coordination of outside copying service for onsite copying at DGSD (.4); teleconference with S. Engle re coordination of copying of documents (.4)	DME+	1.60	168.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

Λ	$MFT_{-}C$	TIO	SV	CTEN	21	COR	POR A	MOITA
41	V1L: 1 ~\	JUIL		3 I C.I	VI.T	r u in	PI IK A	A I II II II V

			PAGE 22	
09/22/04	Review response from DGSD re documents and witnesses (.3); review issues re same (.3); conference with SKK re same (.3); review email from SKK re strategy re DGSD (.1); review email from OLA re same (.1); review email from OLA re sanctions motion (.1): review email from KAP re same (.1); conference with SKK re obtaining materials from DGSD (.2); review DGSD discovery (.4); multiple conferences with consultant re DGSD issues (.5); review issues from consultant conferences (.8); email to OLA and SKK re same (.3); conference with consultant re DGSD (.2); conference with SKK re DGSD discovery (.3); review email from KAP re same (.1)	MAZ	4.10	1,558.00
09/22/04	E-mails with MAZ re call with consultant re DGSD discovery (0.1) conference with SKK re options in dealing with L. Cox interview or deposition (0.1)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/22/04	Conference with OLA re interview or deposition of L. Cox (0.1); conferences with MAZ re DGSD discovery (0.8); teleconferences with consultants re DGSD issues (0.5); correspondence with S. Engle re discovery issues (0.2); conferences with DME re duplication of documents at DGSD (0.6); teleconference with consultants re rebuttal issues (0.5); correspondence with consultant re rebuttal issues (0.2); teleconference with J. Reyes re duplication of materials at DGSD (0.2)	SKK	3.10	713.00
09/23/04	Organize and prepare contribution action files	CSM+	0.40	32.00
09/23/04	Numerous teleconferences with J. Reyes from DTI re set up at DGSD for copying of documents onsite (1.3); teleconferences with SKK re same (.5)	DME+	1.80	189.00
09/23/04	Prepare for meeting with R. St. John (1.3); conference with SKK re same (.5); teleconference with SKK and R. St. John (.9); review issues from conference call (1.3); review rebuttal issues for Mercer report (1.2); conference with SKK re teleconference with Greenberg (.5); email to OLA and SKK re same (.1); review status of case for transfer (.4)	MAZ	6.20	2,356.00
09/23/04	Review issues re St. John rebuttal report (0.5)	OLA	0.50	180.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 23	
09/23/04	Teleconferences with DME re onsite copying at DGSD (0.5)	SKK	0.50	115.00
09/23/04	Conferences with MAZ re rebuttal reports (0.7); conference with MAZ re teleconference with Greenberg (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John and MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.9)	SKK	2.10	483.00
09/24/04	Prepare for teleconference with F. Citera (.8); conference with SKK re same (.3); teleconference with F. Citera, S. Bezark and SKK (.5); conference with SKK re same (.3); prepare for teleconference with R. St. John (1.4); teleconference with SKK and R. St. John re rebuttal issues (.8); review issues re call (.2); conferences with SKK re same (.3)	MAZ	5.10	1,938.00
09/24/04	Correspondence re MAZ assignment agreement (0.1) conference with SKK re meeting with Mestek's counsel and DGSD's (0.2); conference with SKK re call with G. Rover re compliance with disclosure demand and memorialization of same (0.3); conference with SKK re status of rebuttal reports (0.3); e-mails with MAZ and SKK re transfer of case (0.1); review issues of St. John rebuttal report (0.8)	OLA	1.70	612.00
09/24/04	Conference with MAZ re teleconference with Greenberg (0.5); teleconference with F. Citera, S. Bezark, and MAZ re case status (0.5); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.3); teleconference with MAZ and R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.8); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.3); review issues for St. John rebuttal report (1); teleconferences with consultant re rebuttal issues (4); teleconference with S. Engle re DGSD discovery (0.2); correspondence with S. Engle re same (0.2); teleconference with copy service re duplication of DGSD documents (0.1); teleconference with G. Rovner re disclosure issues and follow-up re same (0.5); teleconference with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.2); teleconference with J. Reyes re duplication of DGSD documents (0.3); conference with OLA re status of rebuttal reports (0.3)	SKK	9.20	2,116.00
09/27/04	Review of documents and supervision of copying of same at DGSD (5)	DME+	5.00	525.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	<b>SYSTEMS</b>	CORPORATION

			5471.001/1503 PAGE 24	366
09/27/04	Conference with SKK re status of expert reports (.6); call to R. St. John re meeting (.2); email to RXB, KAP, OLA and SKK re meeting with Greenberg (.2); review responses from RXB (.1); review issues re St. John rebuttal (1.3); prepare for meeting with consultant (.8); prepare for teleconference consultant and OLA and (SKK for past) with consultant (.7); conference re rebuttal issues (.7); review issues re Mercer report (1.1); review documents produced by DGSD (2.0); conference with SKK re same (.7); conference with R. St. John re case (1.4)	MAZ	9.80	3,724.00
09/27/04	Further review of issues for St. John rebuttal report (0.4); review issues for Mercer rebuttal report (1.2); teleconference with MAZ and consultant (SKK for part) re rebuttal issues (0.7); conference with SKK re follow-up email to G. Rovner (0.1); draft same (0.2); e-mail to SKK and MAZ re comments on St. John report (0.3); teleconference with R. St. John re rebuttal report (0.8)	OLA	3.70	1,332.00
09/27/04	Review correspondence from consultant (0.3); teleconferences with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.8); conference with MAZ re status of rebuttal reports (0.6); teleconference with MAZ, OLA, and consultant re rebuttal issues (left early) (0.5); multiple teleconferences with S. Engle re DGSD documents and troubleshoot re review of same (1.2); teleconference with S. Deely and S. Engle re DGSD discovery (0.2); document review at DGSD (2.0); conference with MAZ re same (0.7); conference with MAZ and R. St. John re rebuttal issues (1.4); review issues for Mercer rebuttal report (1.5); conference with OLA re potential resolution of disclosure issue (0.1); further review of issues for Mercer rebuttal (1.3)	SKK	10.70	2,461.00
09/28/04	Organize and prepare contribution action files	CSM+	1.20	96.00
09/28/04	Prepared for teleconference with J. Mercer (1.2); conference with SKK re same (.2); conference with SKK re rebuttal issues (.5); review issues for rebuttal to Lue-Hing's report and related documents (2.7); further review of issues re same (.8); teleconference with SKK and OLA re rebuttal issues (1.4)	MAZ	9.30	3,534.00

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

09/29/04

09/29/04

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

OCTOBER 25, 2004

5471.001/150366 PAGE 25

1.50

12.40

2.00

120.00

4,712.00

720.00

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

			FAGE 23	
09/28/04	Review issues for rebuttal to Lue-Hing's report (0.7); conference with SKK re St. John rebuttal report (0.2); review issues for Mercer rebuttal (1.1); teleconference with SKK re same (0.2); teleconference with SKK re rebuttal to Lue-Hing's report (0.3); review issues for St. John rebuttal report (1.2); e-mail to SKK re same (0.3); e-mail from SKK re rebuttal reports (0.1); teleconference with MAZ, SKK and J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (2)	OLA	6.10	2,196.00
09/28/04	Conference with OLA re St. John rebuttal (0.2); conference with MAZ re Mercer rebuttal (0.2); teleconference with OLA re rebuttal to Lue-Hing expert report (0.3); review correspondence from OLA re rebuttal issues (0.1); teleconference with J. Mercer, MAZ, and OLA re rebuttal issues (2); review issues for rebuttal to Lue-Hing report (4.5); conference with MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.5); correspondence with consultant re rebuttal issues (0.3); teleconferences with consultant re rebuttal issues (3.3);	SKK	12.20	2,806.00

CSM+

MAZ

conference re same (1)

09/29/04 E-mails with G. Rovner re status of response on disclosure motion (0.2); teleconference with SKK re St. John rebuttal (0.3); review issues for Mercer rebuttal report (1.2); teleconference with SKK re Mercer rebuttal report (0.3)

(.5); conference with R. St. John re same (.5);

review correspondence from OLA re rebuttal issues (0.7)

Review issues and related documents re Mercer rebuttal

report (2.8); conference with SKK re same (.3); conference with SKK and J. Mercer re same (1); review issues and related documents re Lue -Hing's report (2.6); conferences with SKK re same (.5); conference with consultant and SKK re same (1.6); review issues and related documents re St. John rebuttal report (1.6); conference with SKK re same

teleconference with SKK and consultant rebuttal issues and

Prepare documents for return to client

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

09/29/04	Teleconference with OLA re St. John rebuttal (0.3); correspondence with R. St. John (0.2); teleconference with OLA re Mercer rebuttal (0.3); conference with MAZ re status of rebuttal reports (0.3); correspondence with MAZ re rebuttal issues (0.3); teleconference with J. Mercer re rebuttal issues (0.3); review issues for Mercer rebuttal report (1.3); teleconference with MAZ and J. Mercer re rebuttal issues and follow-up conference with MAZ re same (1); teleconference with consultant re rebuttal issues (0.2); conferences with MAZ re rebuttal reports (0.8); teleconference with MAZ and consultant re rebuttal issues and follow-up conference with MAZ re same (1.6); review issues for rebuttal to Lue-Hing's report (1); teleconference with MAZ and consultant re rebuttal issues and follow-up conference with MAZ re same (1); review issues for St. John rebuttal report (2); teleconference with consultant re rebuttal issues (1.5)	SKK	11.80	2,714.00
09/30/04	Conference with SKK (.3); review and preparation of expert reports for distribution (12.2)	DME+	12.50	1,312.50
09/30/04	Conference with SKK re R. St. John report (.3); review issues re St. John report (3.6); multiple conferences with OLA re same (.4); conferences with R. St. John and OLA re same (4.8); review Mercer rebuttal report and related materials (2.3); review Kavanaugh rebuttal report and related materials (1.8)	MAZ	13.20	5,016.00
09/30/04	Conference with SKK re St. John rebuttal report (0.2); review issues re same (0.6); conference with SKK re serving T. Kavanaugh and J. Mercer (0.1); conferences with MAZ re St. John report (0.4); call to R. St. John re same (0.3); meetings with R. St. John, MAZ and SKK re completing report (6.7); conference with SKK re serving same, re deposition strategy (0.2)	OLA	8.50	3,060.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.1.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEMS	CORPORATION

			5471.001/15036 PAGE 27	6
09/30/04	Review issues for St. John rebuttal (1.5); conference with OLA re St. John rebuttal report (0.2); teleconferences with R. St. John re rebuttal issues (0.7); conference with OLA re serving Kavanaugh and Mercer rebuttal reports (0.1); teleconference with R. St. John, OLA and MAZ re rebuttal report (0.3); conferences with R. St. John, MAZ, and OLA re rebuttal issues (3.5); conference with OLA re serving St. John rebuttal report and deposition strategy (0.2); conference with MAZ re St. John report (0.3)	SKK	6.80	1,564.00
10/01/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put documents in folders, and order folders for documents	CSM+	2.10	168.00
10/01/04	Review expert rebuttal reports	DME+	3.00	315.00
10/01/04	Review St. John rebuttal report (1.2); review issues and documents re same (1.8); email to SKK and OLA re reports (.1); review DGSD responses to discovery (.6)	MAZ	4.10	1,558.00
10/01/04	Correspondence with S. Bezark re transfer (0.1); review final rebuttal reports (2.3)	SKK	2.40	552.00
10/04/04	Review correspondence file for letters from third-party defendants (.8); order files for DGSD documents and organize same (.8); conference with MAZ re DGSD documents (.1); review correspondence from Third-Party Defendants (.2); continue review of DGSD documents (1.2); prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg (5)	DME+	8.10	850.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

10/04/04	Calls to KAP re effective date (.1); conference with DME re documents from DGSD (.1); conference with SKK re strategy and expert discovery (.4); review issues re same (.8); review issues re motion to strike (.7); draft outline re same (.8); review Glanders report re same (.8); email to DME re documents for motion (.2); review email from RXB re transfer date (.1); review emails from KAP re transfer date and expert discovery (.1); review email from SKK re disclosure issue (.1); review materials and documents obtained from DGSD (2.8); email to KAP re effective date and discovery (.1); email to F. Citera re same (.1); review multiple emails from N. Peterman re same (.1); call to Malcolm Pirnie re discovery issues (.2); email to OLA re expert depositions (.3)	MAZ	7.80	2,964.00
10/04/04	Review joint defense agreement (0.1); e-mails with MAZ re expert depositions (0.2); e-mail to G. Rovner re reply brief on disclosure motion (0.1); response from G. Rovner re same (0.1); conference with SKK re drafting notices of deposition (0.1)	OLA	0.60	216.00
10/04/04	Conference with MAZ re action items and strategy (0.4); conference with OLA re notices of deposition (0.1); correspondence with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.3); review correspondence from consultant (0.3); teleconference with consultant (0.4)	SKK	1.50	345.00
10/05/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put documents in folders, and create labels	CSM+	2.50	200.00
10/05/04	Prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg (2.5)	DME+	2.50	262.50
10/05/04	Multiple teleconferences with Malcolm Pirnie re deposition issues (.3); review correspondence re disclosure issue (.1); conference with SKK re same (.2); teleconference with J. Mercer re depositions (.2); call to R. St. John re deposition issues (.1); review deposition strategy (.8); conference with SKK re same (.3); complete review and analyses of DGSD documents (2.5); review issues re possible supplementation (.5)	MAZ	5.00	1,900.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.H. 35-2863762

MEI-COIL 9191E	MIS CURTURA	IION

			PAGE 29	
10/05/04	Letter from third-party defendants re agreement on Motion (0.1); conference with SKK re same and re deadline and re definitions (0.3); e-mail to G. Rovner re withdrawal of Motion and re timing of return (0.1); e-mails with MAZ re expert depositions (0.1)	OLA	0.60	216,00
10/05/04	Conference with MAZ re disclosure issue (0.2); conference with OLA re Third-Party Defendants' agreement on disclosure motion and withdrawal of same (0.3); review correspondence from Third-Party Defendants (0.2); teleconference with J. Leinenweber's clerk re disclosure motion and withdrawal of same (0.2); conference with MAZ re depositions (0.3)	SKK	1.20	276.00
10/06/04	Conference with MAZ re transition of case (.4)	DME+	0.40	42.00
10/06/04	Teleconference with R. Bahe-Jachna and M. Prewitt from Greenberg re case (.3); review outstanding issues (.7); email to RXB re same (.1); conference with DME re transition (.4); conference with SKK re transfer (.8); teleconference with R. St. John re deposition dates (.1); review affidavit and contract re consultant (.4)	MAZ	3.00	1,140.00
10/06/04	Conference with MAZ re transfer of case (0.8); draft affidavit re consultant (0.4); draft contract with consultant (0.5); correspondence with KAP re same (0.1); correspondence with consultant re same (0.2)	SKK	2.00	460.00
10/07/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put documents in folders, order folders	CSM+	3.50	280.00
10/07/04	Conference with MAZ re transition of case (.2)	DME+	0.20	21.00
10/07/04	Conference with KAP re billing issues (.1); review email re same (.1); conference with SKK re status of case and transition (.3); conference with DME re transition issues (.2)	MAZ	0.70	266.00
10/07/04	E-mails with SKK re timing of expert depositions (0.1); conference with MAZ re reports and transition to issues (0.1); call to G. Rovner re compliance with disclosure demand (0.1)	OLA	0.30	108.00
10/07/04	Correspondence with G. Rovner re depositions (0.2); conference with MAZ re case status and transition (0.3)	SKK	0.50	115.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25 5471.001/1503 PAGE 30	
10/08/04	Conference with MAZ re transfer of files (.3)	DME+	0.30	31.50
10/08/04	Conference with DME re transfer of files (.3); review same (.4); conference with SKK re same (.1); review email from SKK re deposition of experts (.1); review voice mail from contributors re same (.1); email to SKK and OLA re same (.1); review issues and materials for possible motion to strike (2.5); conferences with SKK re motion to strike (0.8); draft motion re same (2.3)	MAZ	6.70	2,546.00
10/08/04	Correspondence with MAZ re depositions (0.2); conference with MAZ re transfer of files (0.1); conferences with MAZ re motion to strike (0.8); edit contract with consultant (0.5); teleconference with consultant (0.2); correspondence with C. Kuoni re consultant (0.1)	SKK	1.90	437.00
10/09/04	Email re handling of contribution actions	RXB	0.20	106.00
10/10/04	Revise draft motion to strike (1.1)	MAZ	1.10	418.00
10/11/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put documents in folders, order folders	CSM+	4.40	352.00
10/11/04	Prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg, order folders and box same (6.8); conference with SKK re transfer of files (.1); review same (.3); Conference with MAZ re transfer of files (.2)	DME+	7.40	777.00
10/11/04	Review email from RXB re additional work on matter (.1); responded to RXB re same (.1); call and message to R. Bahe-Jachna re deposition notices to experts (.1); conference with C. Kuoni re same (.1); review message from M. Prewitt re transition (.1); email to KAP re effective date (.1); review email re same (.1); email from KAP re effective date and responded to same (.1); review email to C. Kuoni re consultants (.1); correspondence with DME re files (.2)	MAZ	1.10	418.00
10/11/04	E-mails with G. Rovner re timing on return of work- product documents	OLA	0.20	72.00
10/11/04	Correspondence with DME re transfer of files	SKK	0.10	23.00
10/12/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put folders in boxes, order folders	CSM+	5.80	464.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM SS EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 31	
10/12/04	Prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg (5.6); teleconference with SKK re working files and transfer of same (.8); conferences with MAZ re transition of files to Greenberg and related issues (1.1)	DME+	7.50	787.50
10/12/04	Conferences with DME re transition of files and related transition issues (.4); review same (.3); review SKK's files for transition (.9); multiple conferences with DME re same (.2); conference with DME re teleconference with SKK re files (.5); correspondence with OLA re working file (.2); email to DME re same (.1); teleconference with C. Kuoni re case status and motion to strike (.2); review MAZ files for transfer (.8)	MAZ	3.60	1,368.00
10/12/04	Teleconference with DME re files and transfer of same	SKK	0.80	184.00
10/13/04	Prepare documents for return to client, put folders in boxes, order folders	CSM+	3.30	264.00
10/13/04	Prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg (6); teleconference with vendors re delivery of files to Greenberg (.3); e-mail to MAZ re same (.1); conference with MAZ re motion to substitute (.2); draft initial motion to substitute (.2)	DME+	6.80	714.00
10/13/04	Review files for transfer (.3); review email from DME re delivering files (.1); sent email to DME re same (.1); conference with expert's assistant re deposition dates (.2); conference with DME re motion to substitute (.2); review and revise same (.4); conference with MXE re filing same (.2); teleconference with J. Mercer re status of depositions and expert discovery (.2)	MAZ	1.70	646.00
10/14/04	Review Geo-trans bill (.3); e-mail to MAZ re transition of files (.2)	DME+	0.50	52.50
10/14/04	Review GeoTrans bill (.3); email to SKK re same (.1); review email from OLA re deposition scheduling (.1); review email from DME re transition of files (.1); email to DME re same (.1) correspondence with OLA re same (.1)	MAZ	0.80	304.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WHW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2 5471.001/15036 PAGE 32	
10/14/04	E-mails with G. Rovner re depositions of experts, re acceptance of service (0.2); e-mails with MAZ re same and re transition issues (0.2); follow-up e-mails with MAZ re Mestek request for 30 day extension (0.1)	OLA	0.50	180.00
10/15/04	Correspondence with contributor lawyer re deposition notices (.2); email from R. St. John re deposition dates (.1); call with R. St. John re deposition dates (.2); email to R. St. John re same (.1); call to Greenberg re deposition dates and possible continuance (.2); email to Foley re same (.1); email to OLA re same (.1); review consultants bill (.2); correspondence to SKK re same (.1); review correspondence from contributors re disclosure issue (.2); correspondence to SKK re same (0.1)	MAZ	1.60	608.00
10/15/04	Review letter from Foley and other counsel re return of Litigation Documents (0.2); e-mails with MAZ re depositions and request for extension of time (0.1)	OLA	0.30	108.00
10/18/04	Conference with MAZ re transfer of files (.2); prepare contribution files for transfer to Greenberg (4)	DME+	4.20	441.00
10/18/04	Telephone conference with MAZ, SKK and C. Kuoni re transition of contribution action (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
10/18/04	Review remaining issues in case (.4); conferences with SKK re remaining transition issues (1); email to OLA, RXB, SKK, KAP and DME re same (.3); conference with contributors re continuance (.2); call to M. Prewitt re same (.1); review email from KAP re same (.1); review email to C. Kuoni re final transition issues (.1); email from SKK re same (.1); review and revise motion to withdraw (.2); conference with SKK re filing same (.2); conference with OLA re remaining transitions issues (.2); conference with DME re transfer of files (.2); review Met Coil audit letter (.2); teleconference with C. Kuoni, KAP and SKK re final action items (.2); follow-up conference with SKK re same (.2)	MAZ	3.70	1,406.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 MEB MNN.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 33	
10/18/04	Conference with SKK and MAZ re final action items and transition, re scheduling for motion to withdraw, re sanctions motion and re final delivery of Litigation Documents (0.3); review motion for substitution and emails with SKK re comments on same (0.4)	OLA	0.70	252.00
10/18/04	Review correspondence from MAZ re action items (0.3); edit draft motion to strike (1.3); conferences with MAZ re transition issues (1); correspondence with C. Kuoni re wrap-up teleconference (0.1); correspondence with MAZ re transition (0.2); conference with MAZ re motion to withdraw (0.2); review final action items (0.3); teleconference with MAZ, KAP, and C. Kuoni re final action items (0.2); follow-up conference with MAZ re same (0.2); conference with OLA re final action items and motion practice (0.3); correspondence and teleconference with M. Prewitt re motion for substitution (0.3); review correspondence from OLA re motion for substitution (0.2)	SKK	4.60	1,058.00
10/19/04	Prepare contribution action files for turnover to Greenberg, order folders and box same (11.7); multiple conferences with MAZ (1); call to Greenberg re same (.3); conferences with SKK re transfer of files to Greenberg (.2);	DME+	13.20	1,386.00
10/19/04	Teleconferences with N. Peterman, M. Prewitt, RXB and SKK re motion to substitute (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
10/19/04	Conference with DME re file transfer (.1); review same (.3); multiple conferences with SKK re outstanding transition issues (motion to withdraw, files, etc) (.7); review motion to withdraw and substitute (.3); email to OLA and SKK re same (.2); email to DME re file transfer (.1); teleconference with R. St. John and SKK re transition to Greenberg (.2); teleconference with J. Mercer re same (.1); teleconference with M. Kavanaugh re same (.1); teleconference with consultant re same (.2); review schedule for discovery and disposition actions (.3); teleconference with M. Prewitt re same (.2); call with M. Kavanaugh re transition (.2)	MAZ	2.70	1,026.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

MET-COIL	SYSTEM	AS CO	RPOR	ATION

			PAGE 34	
10/19/04	Conferences with MAZ re transition issues (0.7); teleconferences with MAZ and experts re transfer of case to Greenberg (0.6); correspondence with M. Prewitt re Joint Motion for Substitution (0.2); edit Joint Motion for Substitution (1.5); teleconference with KAP re edits to same (0.2); teleconferences with M. Prewitt re additional edits to Joint Motion for Substitution and coordination on executing same (0.9); correspondence with KAP re service of Plan on Third-Party Defendants (0.2); correspondence with DME re transfer of files to Greenberg (0.2)	SKK	4.50	1,035.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR ENVIRONMENTAL LITIGATION	Ī		\$138,947.50
09/14/04	Attend hearings (1.20)	KAP	1.20	420.00
09/15/04	Prepare e-mails re hearing (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
09/21/04	Conferences and emails with KAP re omnibus hearing and Mejdrech position (1.0)	RXB	1.00	530.00
09/21/04	Conferences and emails with KAP re omnibus hearing and Mejdrech position (1.0); prepare for omnibus hearing (0.3)	RXB	1.30	689.00
09/22/04	Attend hearing on good faith finding motions (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
09/22/04	Attend telephonic court hearing (.90)	KAP	0.90	315.00
09/22/04	Prepare for and attend September omnibus hearing	RXB	1.80	954.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR BANKRUPTCY HEARINGS			\$3,223.00
09/01/04	Review and revise fee application (.80)	KAP	0.80	280.00
09/13/04	Telephone conference with U.S. Trustee re fee application (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/21/04	Retrieve/review invoices for travel expenses (.2); revise supplemental fee application (.3); review August fee statement (2)	KAB+	2.50	325.00
09/21/04	Review draft supplement to fee application (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/22/04	Telephone conference with B. Ammone re fee application (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHH.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

		PAGE 35	
Call from KAP re fee applications (.1); review revised proformas and prepare fee application (1.5); correspond with RXB re the same (.1); review previously filed fee applications pursuant to court comments (.5)	KAB+	2.20	286.00
Emails with D. Butz and conference with KAB re July corrections (0.3); review current pro forma with KAB and MDK (0.5)	RXB	0.80	424.00
Conference with KAB re amended fee application and telephone conference with D. Butz re same (.40); review monthly fee application (.40)	KAP	0.80	280.00
Confer with Keith Shapiro re status	APS	0.30	159.00
Further conference with RXB	APS	0.10	53.00
Prepare supplement to third interim fee application	KAB+	0.80	104.00
Conference with KAB re fee application (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
Conference with APS re billing (0.3)	RXB	0.30	159.00
Review fees and prepare email to RXB re accounting/fee issues (.3)	KAB+	0.30	39.00
Telephone conference with B. Anemone re fee application (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
Review and revise certifications re interim fee applications (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
Respond to emails from KAP and revise supplement to third interim fee application	KAB+	0.50	65.00
Review pro forma (.80); revise certifications of counsel (.40)	KAP	1.20	420.00
Meeting with KAP re fee statement, correspond with SKK and MAZ re the same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
Conference with KAB re invoice (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
Review bill	SKK	1.00	230.00
Review bill (1.3)	MAZ	1.30	494.00
Email from secretary re review of bill (.1)	MAZ	0.10	38.00
	proformas and prepare fee application (1.5); correspond with RXB re the same (.1); review previously filed fee applications pursuant to court comments (.5)  Emails with D. Butz and conference with KAB re July corrections (0.3); review current pro forma with KAB and MDK (0.5)  Conference with KAB re amended fee application and telephone conference with D. Butz re same (.40); review monthly fee application (.40)  Confer with Keith Shapiro re status  Further conference with RXB  Prepare supplement to third interim fee application  Conference with KAB re fee application (.10)  Conference with APS re billing (0.3)  Review fees and prepare email to RXB re accounting/fee issues (.3)  Telephone conference with B. Anemone re fee application (.10)  Review and revise certifications re interim fee applications (.30)  Respond to emails from KAP and revise supplement to third interim fee application  Review pro forma (.80); revise certifications of counsel (.40)  Meeting with KAP re fee statement, correspond with SKK and MAZ re the same  Conference with KAB re invoice (.20)  Review bill  Review bill (1.3)	proformas and prepare fee application (1.5); correspond with RXB re the same (.1); review previously filed fee applications pursuant to court comments (.5)  Emails with D. Butz and conference with KAB re July corrections (0.3); review current pro forma with KAB and MDK (0.5)  Conference with KAB re amended fee application and telephone conference with D. Butz re same (.40); review monthly fee application (.40)  Confer with Keith Shapiro re status  Further conference with RXB  Prepare supplement to third interim fee application  Conference with KAB re fee application (.10)  KAP  Conference with APS re billing (0.3)  Review fees and prepare email to RXB re accounting/fee issues (.3)  Telephone conference with B. Anemone re fee application (.10)  Review and revise certifications re interim fee applications (.30)  Respond to emails from KAP and revise supplement to third interim fee application  Review pro forma (.80); revise certifications of counsel (.40)  Meeting with KAP re fee statement, correspond with SKK and MAZ re the same  Conference with KAB re invoice (.20)  Review bill  Review bill (1.3)  MAZ	Call from KAP re fee applications (.1); review revised proformas and prepare fee application (1.5); correspond with RXB re the same (.1); review previously filed fee applications pursuant to court comments (.5)  Emails with D. Butz and conference with KAB re July corrections (0.3); review current pro forma with KAB and MDK (0.5)  Conference with KAB re amended fee application and telephone conference with D. Butz re same (.40); review monthly fee application (.40)  Confer with Keith Shapiro re status  APS  O.30  Further conference with RXB  APS  O.10  Prepare supplement to third interim fee application  Conference with KAB re fee application (.10)  KAP  Conference with APS re billing (0.3)  Review fees and prepare email to RXB re accounting/fee issues (.3)  Telephone conference with B. Anemone re fee application  (.10)  Review and revise certifications re interim fee applications  (.30)  Respond to emails from KAP and revise supplement to third interim fee application  Review pro forma (.80); revise certifications of counsel (.40)  Meeting with KAP re fee statement, correspond with SKK  AP  O.20  Review bill  SKK  1.00  Review bill (1.3)

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 36	
10/11/04	Review bill	SKK	2.50	575.00
10/18/04	Review/revise September fee application	KAB+	2.20	286.00
10/19/04	Review and revise monthly fee statement	KAB+	2.00	260.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR FEE APPLICATIONS (GK)			\$4,993.00
09/01/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re objection period and other effective date conditions (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/01/04	Emails re final order issues and research re same (0.7); several telephone conferences with E. Schwartz, D. Byrd and S. Cousins and related emails re having final order entered and revise motion insert re same (1.)	RXB	1.70	901.00
09/02/04	Telephone conferences with D. Feinberg re final order issues (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/02/04	Emails and telephone conferences with A. Kelly and E. Schwartz re entry of final order	RXB	0.60	318.00
09/03/04	Review and revise Kuoni affidavit (1.60)	KAP	1.60	560.00
09/03/04	Review assignment of contribution actions (.9); conference with SKK re same (.3)	MAZ	1.20	456.00
09/03/04	Review assignment agreement for implications in cointribution action (0.3)	OLA	0.30	108.00
09/03/04	Emails re status of final order	RXB	0.20	106.00
09/03/04	Review draft assignment for effect on contribution action (0.5); conference with MAZ re same (0.3)	SKK	0.80	184.00
09/07/04	Respond to e-mails re effective date issues (.30); review Mejdrech final motion (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/08/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re conditions precedent (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
09/08/04	Telephone conference with A. Kelly re District Court Order (.10); prepare e-mail re same (.10); review and revise affidavit (.40)	KAP	0.60	210.00
09/08/04	Conference and email with KAP re assignment (.2)	MAZ	0.20	76.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WMW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINDIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2 5471.001/150366 PAGE 37	
09/08/04	Review MAZ comments on Assignment Agreement (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/08/04	Emails re final order	RXB	0.30	159.00
09/09/04	Review affidavits (.40); review and revise confidentiality agreement (.20)	KAP	0.60	210.00
09/09/04	Telephone call re effective date conditions and procedures (1.60)	KAP	1.60	560.00
09/09/04	Review notice for District Court (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/10/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and N. Peterman re conditions to effective date and status of same (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/10/04	Review and revise notice to District Court and telephone conferences re same (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
09/10/04	Telephone conference re assignment of contribution actions (.60)	KAP	0.60	210.00
09/10/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re affidavits and motions (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/10/04	Conference with KAP re assignment agreement and transition issues (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
09/10/04	Prepare blackline of assignment agreement (0.3)	OLA	0.30	108.00
09/10/04	Several telephone conferences with E. Schwartz, KAP and N. Peterman and emails with local counsel re final order and review drafts of notice re same	RXB	1.00	530.00
09/13/04	Review motions re good faith finding (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/13/04	Review and revise confidentiality agreement (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/13/04	Review and revise side letter (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/14/04	Review and revise confidentiality agreement (.20); review and revise side letter (.20)	KAP	0.40	140.00
09/14/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni, M. Hynes, P. Shine and M. Casarino re wires (.50); telephone conferences with N. Peterman and C. Kuoni re District Court order and prepare e-mails re same (.40)	KAP	0.90	315.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 NEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 25, 5471.001/1503 PAGE 38	
09/14/04	Conference with KAP re assignment of contribution actions (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/14/04	E-mail to Mestek's counsel re comments on Assignment Agreement (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
09/14/04	Review motions re good faith finding for hearing before J. Zagel (0.5)	SKK	0.50	115.00
09/14/04	Attend hearing before J. Zagel (.50)	SKK	0.50	115.00
09/15/04	Review and revise side letter (.30); review amendment (.20); prepare stipulation (.70)	KAP	1.20	420.00
09/17/04	Conference with KAP re distributions to creditors and effective date, review plan re same, email re same	RXB	1.00	530.00
09/20/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re hearing and effective date (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/20/04	Conference with KAP re omnibus hearing (0.4)	RXB	0.40	212.00
09/21/04	Telephone conferences re waiver letter (.30); review same (.20); review contribution assignment action letter (.30)	KAP	0.80	280.00
09/21/04	Telephone conferences re hearing and effective date conditions (2.20)	KAP	2.20	770.00
09/21/04	Review revised assignment agreement from N. Peterman (0.2); conference with KAP re "no-assumption" clause (0.2); e-mail to KAP, MAZ and SKK re same (0.1)	OLA	0.50	180.00
09/21/04	Review letter re waiver of 30 day condition and conference with KAP and telephone conference with N. Peterman re same (1.0); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re said issues and effective date questions (0.5)	RXB	1.50	795.00
09/22/04	Review revisions to assignment (.4); review legal issues re same (.6); review email from OLA re same (.1)	MAZ	1.10	418.00
09/22/04	Response from KAP re access to documents (0.1); e-mail to N. Peterman re same (0.1)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/22/04	Draft revision to assignment agreement (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/22/04	E-mail to KAP re same (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
09/23/04	Review and revise effective date letter (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2 5471.001/150366 PAGE 39	
09/23/04	Revise effective date letter and telephone conference and emails with KAP and email N. Peterman re same	RXB	0.80	424.00
09/24/04	Call with N. Peterman re question on language for assignment agreement (0.1)	OLA	0.10	36.00
09/24/04	Review and revise draft letter re effective date and emails with KAP and N. Peterman re same	RXB	0.90	477.00
09/27/04	Telephone conferences re effective date conditions	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/27/04	Review revised version of assignment agreement from N. Peterman (0.1); e-mail to KAP re same (0.1)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/28/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman and RXB re effective bar condition status (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/28/04	Review contribution action assignment agreement (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/28/04	E-mails with KAP re release (0.2)	OLA	0.20	72.00
09/29/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and N. Peterman re status	KAP	0.30	105.00
10/01/04	Review trust funding documents (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/04/04	Telephone conference with E. Manske re order (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/05/04	Prepare e-mail re Scanlan letter (.20); telephone conference with KAS re funding agreement (.50); review consent order and prepare e-mails re same (.70)	KAP	1.40	490.00
10/08/04	Prepare e-mails to M. Araki re charts (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/11/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re effective date and funding agreement (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/12/04	Review and revise administrative bar date notice (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/13/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re effective date, wires and unsecured distribution (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00
10/13/04	Review and revise notices (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/13/04	Review distribution lists (1.00)	KAP	1.00	350.00
10/14/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re wires, status report and funding agreement (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 2 5471.001/150 PAGE 40	
10/15/04	Prepare e-mails re withdrawal notices (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/18/04	Numerous telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re wires and effective date issues (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
10/18/04	Review and revise administrative bar date notice forms (1.0); review and revise TCE PI Funding Agreement and Trust Agreement notice forms and telephone conferences re same (.80)	KAP	1.80	630.00
10/18/04	Emails re effective date issues and Travelers payment and conferences with KAP re same	RXB	0.40	212.00
10/19/04	Numerous telephone conferences re going effective and review of documents (1.90)	KAP	1.90	665.00
10/19/04	Respond to e-mails re impact of effective date on litigation (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
10/19/04	Prepare notices of withdrawal and dismissal orders (1.0); telephone conferences with M. Araki re administrative bar date notice service and publication (.80)	KAP	1.80	630.00
10/19/04	Emails and conferences with KAP re effective date, notice issues and effect of going effective	RXB	0.60	318.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMEN	T		\$17,433.00
09/21/04	Travel to and from Lockformer office (2.0)	ALG	2.00	430.00
09/22/04	Travel for omnibus hearing	RXB	6.50	3,445.00
09/27/04	Travel to and from DGSD (2)	DME+	2.00	210.00
09/27/04	Travel to and from DGSD	MAZ	2.00	760.00
09/27/04	Travel to and from DGSD	SKK	2.00	460.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR TRAVEL			\$5,305.00
09/13/04	Telephone conference with D. Giordano re reporting (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR US TRUSTEE			\$70.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COII	SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 25 5471.001/1503 PAGE 41	
09/02/04	Telephone conference with T. Santacroce, et al. re employee issues	MLS	0.80	284.00
09/07/04	Teleconference with T. Santacroce and other managers re potential termination	MLS	0.50	177.50
09/09/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni, R. Scheel re employee problem with AHS manager	MLS	0.40	142.00
09/24/04	Telephone conference with K. Michael re employee termination matter (.20); telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same and status (.40)	KAP	0.60	210.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR EMPLOYEE MATTERS			\$813.50
09/02/04	Prepare e-mails re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/02/04	Emails, telephone conference with KAP and voice mails with R. Millner re Traveler's payment	RXB	0.50	265.00
09/16/04	Telephone conferences with P. Shine re ACE payment (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/20/04	Telephone conference with M. Hynes and W. McVisk repayment (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/20/04	Telephone conference with R. Millner re Travelers settlement (0.3)	RXB	0.30	159.00
09/30/04	Telephone conference with R. Millner, review settlement agreement and plan and draft email re payment	RXB	2.20	1,166.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR INSURANCE/REGULATORY MA	TTERS		\$1,800.00
09/02/04	Telephone conferences with creditors re plan status (.20); telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re various outstanding issues (.30)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/02/04	Conference with C. Kuoni and KAP re distribution scheduling (1.1); review escrow and contribution action assignment and emails re same (0.5)	RXB	1.60	848.00
09/08/04	Prepare e-mails re status of various items (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 42	
09/09/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni, KAP and N. Peterman re emergence	RXB	0.70	371.00
09/13/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/13/04	Telephone conference with SKK and C. Kuoni re GeoTrans (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
09/14/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re press release and hearing (.30); review press release (.30)	KAP	0.60	210.00
09/14/04	Emails with KAP re notice of order and communication with press	RXB	0.30	159.00
09/15/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/15/04	Telephone conference with N. Peterman re status and documents (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/15/04	Emails with KAP re handling of omnibus hearing and calls to R. Millner and N. Peterman (0.3); email and telephone conference with N. Peterman re notice of order and timing of effective date (0.5)	RXB	0.80	424.00
09/16/04	Conference with KAP re status and Mejdrech settlement	RXB	0.10	53.00
09/17/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni and N. Peterman re status (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/17/04	Prepare documents for circulation (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/22/04	Review case docket and prepare email re the same	KAB+	0.20	26.00
09/23/04	Telephone conferences with C. Kuoni re status (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/30/04	Review and prepare emails re status	KAP	0.10	35.00
10/01/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status (.20)	KAP	0.20	70.00
10/07/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status of effective date conditions (.30); telephone conference with RXB re same and transition (.30)	KAP	0.60	210.00
10/07/04	Telephone conference with KAP re status and transition issues	RXB	0.30	159.00
10/08/04	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re status and maps (.40)	KAP	0.40	140.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25 5471.001/1503 PAGE 43	
10/09/04	Review emails re effective date and other matters	RXB	0.30	159.00
10/12/04	Emails re status	RXB	0.10	53.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR CASE ADMINISTRATION			\$4,002.00
09/01/04	Telephone conference with P. Ferak re status of motions (.30)	KAP	0.30	105.00
09/02/04	Telephone conference with P. Ferak re affidavits/notices (.50)	KAP	0.50	175.00
09/03/04	E-mail to DEM re discovery requests, conference re same (.2); revise requests (1.0)	CSC	1.20	228.00
09/03/04	Review and edit written discovery to MQ Construction	DEM	0.50	162.50
09/07/04	Draft discovery requests (2) and e-mail to client re same (.1)	CSC	2.10	399.00
09/07/04	Office conference with CSC re discovery on MQ Construction	DEM	0.30	97.50
09/08/04	Revise discovery requests per e-mails w/ client (1.0); e-mail to client re revised discovery (.3), conferences with DEM re same (.2); e-mails to client re discovery responses (.2)	CSC	1.70	323.00
09/08/04	Review C. Kuoni correspondence re discovery (.3); correspond with CSC and KAP re same (.3); review and revise discovery (.3); office conferences with CSC re same (.6)	DEM	1.50	487.50
09/09/04	E-mails w/ KAP, DEM, R. Scheel re discovery strategy (.4)	CSC	0.50	95.00
09/09/04	Correspond with R. Scheel re discovery	DEM	0.20	65.00
09/10/04	Filed motion with the District Court	CSM+	0.30	24.00
09/13/04	Office conferences with DEM re discovery (.3); e-mail to C. Kuoni re discovery (.1)	CSC	0.40	76.00
09/13/04	Office conferences with CSC re discovery	DEM	0.20	65.00
09/14/04	Conference with KAP re discovery (.2)	CSC	0.20	38.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & HORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLIHOIS 60603-5802

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION			OCTOBER 25, 20 5471.001/150366 PAGE 44	04
09/14/04	Office conferences with DEM re response to discovery	CSC	0.30	57.00
09/14/04	Office conferences with CSC re response to discovery	DEM	0.30	97.50
09/15/04	Draft responses to discovery (2.3); e-mails with NXB re photographs (.1), e-mails w/ M. Obarski re documents (.1)	CSC	2.50	475.00
09/15/04	Revise and edit discovery responses	DEM	1.00	325.00
09/15/04	Prepare e-mail re J. Andrews matter (.10)	KAP	0.10	35.00
09/16/04	Revise responses to discovery requests (.5)	CSC	0.50	95.00
09/16/04	Meet with CSC re possible document production for Friday and email word processing re printout pictures emailed by client to CSC to produce	NXB+	1.00	100.00
09/17/04	Finalize and serve discovery responses on defendants (1), conferences with NXB re same (.3), telephone conferences with R. Scheel re verification (.2)	CSC	1.50	285.00
09/17/04	Review revised discovery responses (.5); office conferences with CSC re same (.5)	DEM	1.00	325.00
09/17/04	Review motion for filing (1.0)	KAP	1.00	350.00
09/17/04	File Appearance for KAP 02 C 4992	MXE+	0.50	30.00
09/17/04	Retrieve documents for production	NXB+	2.50	250.00
09/21/04	Office conference with CSC re answer to complaint (.2); review same (.2)	DEM	0.40	130.00
09/22/04	Review answer filed by defendant (.1), conferences with DEM and KAP re same (.2)	CSC	0.30	57.00
09/22/04	File Pleading with the Clerk office re 01 C 6485; 02 C 7268, 02 C 7066, 02 C 2672 and 02 C 4992 KAP	MXE+	0.50	30.00
09/23/04	Letter to client re answer to complaint	CSC	0.20	38.00
09/27/04	Office conferences with DEM re discovery and strategy (.5); telephone conference with DEM and C. Kuoni re same (.4); draft requests to admit (.8), conferences with DEM re same (.2)	CSC	1.90	361.00

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

MET-COI	L SYSTEMS CORPORATION		OCTOBER 5471.001/15 PAGE 45	
09/27/04	Office conferences with CSC re discovery and strategy (.5); telephone conference with CSC and C. Kuoni re same (.4)	DEM	0.90	292.50
09/28/04	Revise requests to admit (.3)	CSC	0.80	152.00
09/28/04	Review and revise requests to admit	DEM	0.40	130.00
09/29/04	Revise and serve requests to admit (.3); letter to R. Scheel and C. Kuoni re same (.1); conference with NXB re document production (.1)	CSC	0.50	95.00
09/29/04	Prepare filesurf folders for documents produced to Metcoil	NXB+	0.50	50.00
09/30/04	Draft subpoena for documents to Exelon (1.0)	CSC	0.80	152.00
10/01/04	Draft rider to subpoena for documents for Exelon (1.0), conference with DEM re same (.2)	CSC	0.20	38.00
10/04/04	Telephone conference with superintendent of public works at Village (.2), attention to pre-trial memorandum requirements (.3), draft subpoenas to IDOT and Village of Lisle (1.0)	CSC	1.50	285.00
10/05/04	Revisions to subpoenas (.5)	CSC	0.50	95.00
10/06/04	E-mails w/ DEM re status	CSC	0.10	19.00
10/08/04	Telephone conferences with IDOT and Village of Lisle re subpoenas (.5)	CSC	0.50	95.00
10/11/04	Telephone conference with Village re subpoena	CSC	0.20	38.00
10/14/04	Office conference with CSC re discovery strategy (.20); review letter to opposing counsel (.10)	DEM	0.30	97.50
10/15/04	Telephone conference with DEM re discovery (.1); telephone conference with opposing counsel's office re same (.2)	CSC	0.30	57.00
10/18/04	Letter to T. Carlson re discovery (.6)	CSC	0.60	114.00
	SUB-TOTAL FOR GENL LIT (NON-ENVIRON'TAL)			\$7,091.00
	SUBTOTAL LESS ADJUSTMENT PER BILLING ATT	ORNEY	\$	230,281.00 (100,000.00)

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.400D FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 46

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$ 130,281.00

+ DENOTES PARALEGAL

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 47

#### ATTORNEY SUMMARY

ATTORNEY	TITLE	RATE	<b>HOURS</b>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Oscar L. Alcantara	PARTNER	360,00	49.20	17,712.00
Ronald Barliant	PARTNER	530.00	39.50	20,935.00
Frederick H. Cohen	PARTNER	380.00	5.00	1,900.00
Barbara M. Flom	PARTNER	400.00	1.90	760.00
Gerald L. Jenkins	PARTNER	460.00	4.80	2,208.00
David E. Morrison	PARTNER	325.00	7.00	2,275.00
Terry F. Mortiz	PARTNER	485.00	6.50	3,152.50
Keith G. Radner	PARTNER	320.00	0.30	96.00
Alan P. Solow	PARTNER	530.00	0.40	212.00
Michael L. Sullivan	PARTNER	355.00	1.70	603.50
Matthew A. Zapf	PARTNER	380.00	186.50	70,870.00
Catherine S. Carrigan	ASSOCIATE	190.00	19.30	3,667.00
Alais L.M. Griffin	ASSOCIATE	215.00	42.90	9,223.50
Salvador K. Karottki	ASSOCIATE	230.00	150.90	34,707.00
Kathryn A. Pamenter	ASSOCIATE	350.00	94.10	32,935.00
Keith A. Sigale	ASSOCIATE	295.00	16.90	4,985.50
Anthony M. Webb+	LAW CLERK	145.00	15.00	2,175.00
Natalia Barrera+	PARALEGAL	100.00	4.00	400.00
Kristina A. Bunker+	PARALEGAL	130.00	12.00	1,560.00
Diane M. Ende+	PARALEGAL	105.00	140.30	14,731.50
Mike Evans+	PROJECT ASSIST	60.00	1.00	60.00
Christopher S. Matthews+	PROJECT ASSIST	80.00	62.20	4,976.00
Linda K. McClain+	LIBRARIAN	105.00	1.30	136.50

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 48

TOTAL TIME

862.70 \$

230,281.00

LEAD ATTORNEY - Ronald Barliant

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTD TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM SS EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.N. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

OCTOBER 25, 2004 5471.001/150366 PAGE 49

#### SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

	1,426.90
Photocopy Charges	1,251.30
Telecopy Charges	30.58
Long Distance Telephone Charges Invoice #55977 8/16/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Courier, Inc. Invoice #55977 8/16/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56067 08/23/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	28.50
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	16.95
Invoice #56157 8/30/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	12.00
Inv #1-953-27569 8/16/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	61.95
Inv #1-953-86207 8/25/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	49.83
Inv #7-602-43264 9/2/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	45.31
Inv #7-603-00710 9/8/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	134.56
Inv #7-603-00710 9/8/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	452.91
Velocity Invoice #56456 9/7/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	51.60
Velocity Invoice #56456 9/7/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	5,989.20
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	5,877.01
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	2,059.98
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	1,680.50
- VENDOR: James W. Cheek Transcript OOC	26.40
- VENDOR: James W. Cheek Copy of Hearing Transcript for 9/14/04	26.40
. 22.2 Octobride to cheek copy of feeling Hanssipt for 7/17/07	ይሁ. <del>ፕ</del> ህ

GOLDBERG KOHN BELL BLACK ROSENBLOOM & MORITZ, LTO TEL 312.201.4000 FAX 312.332.2196 WEB WWW.GOLDBERGKOHN.COM 55 EAST MONROE STREET SUITE 3700 CHICAGO ILLINOIS 60603-5802

F.E.I.M. 36-2863762

#### MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION

Telephone Charges VENDOR: Kathryn Pamenter Aug 2004	44.61
ILD Telecommunications, Inc Conference Calling Service July 2004	28.20
ILD Telecommunications, Inc Conference Calling Service KAP 8/26 & 8/27/04	95.10
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Quality Blue Printing Copies of	118.35
Blueprints	
Local Travel Expenses VENDOR: Alais Griffin 9/21/04	95.83
Lexis-Nexis Legal Search Charges 8/31/04 Inv #0408050462	148.70
Westlaw Invoice #807265821 8/31/04	473.92
Westlaw Invoice #807265821 8/31/04	8.72
Travel Expenses VENDOR: Alan Solow Limo to Airport 7/28/04	130.00
Velocity Invoice #56540 9/13/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	144.00
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	4.25
Velocity Invoice #56628 9/20/04 VENDOR: Velocity Courier Inc.	6.00
Inv #7-603-54448 9/15/04 VENDOR: Federal Express	155.41
Local Travel Expenses VENDOR: Salvador Karottki to Downers Grove Sanitary District on 9/27/04	19.49
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Petty Cash 9/17/04	12.08
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Pitney Bowes Management	8.00
Travel Expenses VENDOR: Ronald Barliant 9/22/04 Wilmington, DE re: Omnibus	617.65
Hearing	
Vendor: Amm's Limousine 9/22/04 RXB	134.00
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	17,939.11
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	341.28
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	365.95
Outside Photocopy Expenses VENDOR: Document Technologies	70.00
TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 40,415.53
TOTAL THIS STATEMENT	\$ 170,696.53