

**EXHIBIT A**

\*----- TIME ENTRIES -----\*

ID	LAST NAME	DATE	STAT	TASK	BILLED HOURS	
Case Administration						
134	Sudell	09/18/04	B	B110	0.20	Confer with EDS and DB re: 9/22 hearing and agenda.
134	Sudell	09/21/04	B	B110	0.30	Confer with D. Butz. re 9/22 hearing.
209	Dehney	09/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Discuss 9/22 hearing w/EDS.
221	Schwartz	09/01/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. R. Barilant email re: dist. ct. papers
221	Schwartz	09/01/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ A. Kelly re: dist ct. order
221	Schwartz	09/02/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ R. Barilant and A. Kelly re: Dist. Ct. order
221	Schwartz	09/02/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. A. Kelly, et. al. emails re: Dist. Ct. order
221	Schwartz	09/02/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. A. Kelly and R. Barilant emails re: D.C. order
221	Schwartz	09/03/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ A. Kelly re: D.C. order
221	Schwartz	09/08/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ A. Kelly re: Dist. Ct. order
221	Schwartz	09/08/04	B	B110	0.20	Email to R. Barilant re: Dist. Ct. order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ R. Smith re: D.C. order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ R. Smith re: D.C. order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: notice re: D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.30	Tele. w\ R. Smith and R. Barilant re: D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant and J. Robinson's chambers re: D.C. order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: notice re: D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/13/04	B	B110	0.40	Rev. D.C. papers
221	Schwartz	09/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. K. Pamentor and D. Butz emails re: Dist. Ct. Notice
221	Schwartz	09/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ N. Peterman re: Dist. Ct. Notice
221	Schwartz	09/13/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. Notices of Transfer
221	Schwartz	09/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. MOR
221	Schwartz	09/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails to and from K. Pamentor re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/15/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/16/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/16/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. emails from R. Barilant, et. al. re: D.C. Order
221	Schwartz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ W. Sudell re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails to and from K. Pamentor re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. agenda for 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Pelzte Pepping stip. and related email
221	Schwartz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. K. Pamentor email and attached agenda for 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. K. Pamentor and D. Butz emails re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	09/27/04	B	B110	0.30	Rev. notices of transfer
221	Schwartz	09/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. various orders re: claims, etc.
221	Schwartz	09/28/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: 9/22 hearing
221	Schwartz	10/04/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Cert. of Counsel
221	Schwartz	10/04/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Mon. Op. Rpt.
221	Schwartz	10/04/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Notice of Filing and Budgets
221	Schwartz	10/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Hait aff.
221	Schwartz	10/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Notice of Transfer
359	Saydah	09/02/04	B	B110	0.20	Review MB Financial stip.
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.20	Call with K. Pamentor re: 9/22 agenda (.1); conf with EC
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from K. Pamentor re: agenda for 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EDS re: agenda and hrg

389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Call with K. Pamerter re: 9/22 agenda
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EC re: 9/22 agenda
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Call from K. Pamerter re: 9/22 agenda
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from K. Pamerter re: 9/22 agenda
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.30	Conf with EC re: 9/22 agenda (.1); research re: MB stipulation (.2)
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Review and revise agenda for 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Review agenda for 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with WHS re: 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with WHS re: 9/22 hearing
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from K. Pamerter re: 9/22 hrg
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re: 9/22 hrg
389	Butz	10/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from Katie re: ocp 9/22 filing
389	Butz	10/06/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with ABD re: ocp 9/22 filing
394	Davis	09/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ E. Campbell re Metcoil 9/22 hearing
394	Davis	09/24/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re MB Financial stipulation
394	Davis	09/24/04	B	B110	0.80	Drafting and preparing for filing cert of counsel for MB Financial stip
394	Davis	10/11/04	B	B110	0.30	Drafting letter to J. Goldberg re MB Financial stipulation and order
394	Davis	10/13/04	B	B110	0.20	Message w/ K. Pamerter re Mejdrech report
394	Davis	10/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re agenda and Mejdrech status report
394	Davis	10/14/04	B	B110	0.40	Editing agenda for 10/20 hearing
394	Davis	10/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to K. Pamerter re 10/20 agenda
394	Davis	10/15/04	B	B110	0.20	Reviewing and signing Mejdrech status report
394	Davis	10/17/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to DBB re status report and 10/20 agenda
394	Davis	10/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamerter re 10/20 agenda
394	Davis	10/18/04	B	B110	0.60	Preparing and filing 10/20 agenda
394	Davis	10/18/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re 10/20 agenda and effective date
394	Davis	10/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamerter re possible amended agenda
394	Davis	10/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails to K. Pamerter re amended 10/20 agenda
394	Davis	10/19/04	B	B110	0.70	Preparing amended 10/20 agenda
515	deBrabander	09/01/04	B	B110	0.50	Document Case Management
515	deBrabander	09/14/04	B	B110	4.00	Hearing Preparation
515	deBrabander	09/15/04	B	B110	5.00	Hearing Preparation
515	deBrabander	09/21/04	B	B110	0.50	Review docket and Update Case Matters
515	deBrabander	09/22/04	B	B110	2.40	Hearing Preparation
515	deBrabander	09/22/04	B	B110	0.60	Extracting documents for DBB
515	deBrabander	09/24/04	B	B110	1.00	Document Case Management
515	deBrabander	10/05/04	B	B110	1.00	Review Docket and Update Case Matters
515	deBrabander	10/11/04	B	B110	1.00	Review Docket and Update Case Matters
515	deBrabander	10/13/04	B	B110	1.70	Docket Research re: disposition of case matters
533	McGhee	09/23/04	B	B110	0.10	Doc case management
Total Task:					30.30	5910.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery						
389	Butz	10/01/04	B	B120	0.10	Email from K. Pamerter re: budget
389	Butz	10/01/04	B	B120	0.10	Email from ABD re: budget
597	Campbell	10/01/04	B	B120	0.20	Prep cos re mor (.1);prep cos re notice of filing re budget (.1)
Total Task:					0.40	79.00

Case No.	Client	Relief From	Date	Applicant	Amount	Description
597	Campbell	Relief From Stay/Adequate Protection	09/23/04	B140	1.00	Prep cert counsel re mejdrech auto stay mtn (.6);prep same for filing (.2);filing same (.2)
597	Campbell		09/24/04	B140	0.40	Prep cert counsels re mejdrech for ct (.4)
		Total Task:		B140	1.40	217.00
Fee/Employment Applications						
389	Butz		09/17/04	B160	0.30	Review 11th MNAT fee app (.2); prep for filing (.1)
389	Butz		09/20/04	B160	0.10	Review CNOs and revise 8th omnibus order
389	Butz		09/22/04	B160	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: supplement to fee app
389	Butz		09/22/04	B160	0.10	Email to K. Pamentner re: supplement to fee app
389	Butz		09/22/04	B160	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: orders for submission
389	Butz		09/23/04	B160	0.10	Review fee app for changes; conf with EC re: same
389	Butz		09/23/04	B160	0.40	Email to R. Barliant, K. Pamentner, ABK re: fee apps (.3); review fee apps (.1)
389	Butz		09/23/04	B160	0.10	Email from R. Barliant re: fee apps
389	Butz		09/23/04	B160	0.30	Review fee app revisions; conf with EC re: same
389	Butz		09/24/04	B160	0.10	Call with K. Pamentner re: fee app comments by judge
389	Butz		09/27/04	B160	0.20	Email from co-counsel re: fee app (.1); conf and email with EC re: fee app (.1)
389	Butz		09/27/04	B160	0.10	Review Goldberg fee app, prep for filing
389	Butz		09/28/04	B160	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: fee app
389	Butz		09/28/04	B160	0.10	Email to K. Pamentner re: results of review of transcript
389	Butz		09/28/04	B160	0.30	Review hrg transcript
389	Butz		09/29/04	B160	0.80	Draft certification of counsel for fee reduction (.6); research re: fee reduction (.2)
389	Butz		09/29/04	B160	0.30	Revise cert for fees
389	Butz		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Emails from ABD re: Goldberg cert for fees
389	Butz		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Email to ABD re: cert for fees
389	Butz		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Conf with ABD re: Goldberg cert for fees
389	Butz		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Email from ABD re: cert for fees
389	Butz		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: cert for fees
394	Davis		09/01/04	B160	0.10	Email to K. Bunker re Goldberg Kohn fee app
394	Davis		09/22/04	B160	0.10	Emails from K. Pamentner re orders for hearing and Goldberg kohn supplement to fee application
394	Davis		10/04/04	B160	0.10	Conf w/ K. Pamentner re Goldberg Kohn fee apps
394	Davis		10/04/04	B160	0.10	Email to E. Campbell re MNAT fee order
394	Davis		10/04/04	B160	0.20	Email to K. Pamentner re Goldberg Kohn CNO
394	Davis		10/05/04	B160	0.30	Editing Goldberg Kohn 11th Fee App
394	Davis		10/05/04	B160	0.10	Reviewing cert of counsel for Goldberg Kohns interim fee order
394	Davis		10/05/04	B160	0.20	Conf w/ A. Conway re Goldberg Kohn 11th Fee CNO
394	Davis		10/06/04	B160	1.10	Drafting fee order for Goldberg Kohn
394	Davis		10/06/04	B160	0.10	Pc w/ K. Pamentner re Goldberg Kohn cert and order
394	Davis		10/06/04	B160	0.20	Emails to K. Pamentner re Goldberg Kohn fee order
394	Davis		10/06/04	B160	0.10	Preparing and filing Goldberg Kohn 11th CNO for fees
394	Davis		10/06/04	B160	0.30	Conf w/ A. Conway re Goldberg Kohn 3rd interim fee order
394	Davis		10/07/04	B160	0.20	Preparing and filing cert and order for Goldberg Kohn's 3rd Interim fee app
394	Davis		10/19/04	B160	0.40	Conf w/ E. Campbell re hearing dates, notice of effective date, amended agenda and final fee hearing
394	Davis		10/19/04	B160	0.40	Reviewing plan documents re: final fees and effective date

517	Phillips	09/14/04	B	B160	2.00	requirements
517	Phillips	09/29/04	B	B160	1.00	Preparation of fee application through July 31, 2004.
583	Day	10/12/04	B	B160	0.20	Review and revise MNAT proforma through August 31, 2004.
594	Conway	09/17/04	B	B160	0.10	E-filing CNO re: 11th Interim
594	Conway	10/05/04	B	B160	0.00	Discuss mnat fee app w/AP and EC
594	Conway	10/06/04	B	B160	0.30	Review coc re: Goldberg, Kohn's fee app and discuss w/AB
594	Conway	10/06/04	B	B160	0.10	Discuss billing matters w/EC
597	Campbell	09/13/04	B	B160	2.90	Prep gtrly fee app index
597	Campbell	09/14/04	B	B160	2.10	Prep fee index
597	Campbell	09/20/04	B	B160	0.10	Case admin
597	Campbell	09/21/04	B	B160	0.20	Prep order re mnat fee req
597	Campbell	09/23/04	B	B160	0.40	Review mnat fee app re es entries
597	Campbell	09/28/04	B	B160	0.50	Prep amended order
597	Campbell	09/30/04	B	B160	0.70	Edit cert of course re mnat fee app order (.1);prep same
597	Campbell	10/06/04	B	B160	0.70	for filing (.2);efiling same (.2);prep same for ct (.2)
597	Campbell	10/07/04	B	B160	0.60	Researching open invoices (.6);email to AD re same (.1)
597	Campbell	10/12/04	B	B160	0.40	Prep cert counsel re Goldberg fee req for filing
597	Campbell	10/19/04	B	B160	0.30	(.2);efiling same (.2);prep same for ct (.2)
630	Lewicki	09/02/04	B	B160	0.50	Chk dock re mnat fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2)
630	Lewicki	09/07/04	B	B160	0.20	Disc final fee hrg w/ AD (.1); email to AD re same (.1);
630	Lewicki	09/08/04	B	B160	0.20	disc same w/ AC (.1)
630	Lewicki	09/16/04	B	B160	0.20	Prepare & file 11th Fee Appln of Goldberg, Kohn, .3;
630	Lewicki	09/17/04	B	B160	0.20	service Re: 11th Fee Appln of Goldberg, .2
630	Lewicki	09/23/04	B	B160	0.90	Review docket Re objs to 3rd fee appln of Goldberg, Kohn
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.20	Prepare CNO re MNAT fee app
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.10	Review docket for objs re 3rd interim appln of MNAT,
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.10	Review/Analyze
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.20	Filed cno re MNAT fee app
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.20	Prepared cos for supplement to 11th monthly appln of
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.20	Goldberg, .4, Filed 11th Monthly appln of Goldberg, .5
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.20	Review docket for objs to 11th appln of Goldberg & prepare
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.10	cno,
630	Lewicki	09/24/04	B	B160	0.10	Filed cno re: 11th appln of Goldberg, .1
389	Butz	Total Task:		B160	23.20	4033.50
597	Campbell	Avoidance Action Analysis		B180	0.40	Call from K. Pamentner and R. Barliant re: adversary orders
597	Campbell	09/22/04	B	B180	1.30	(.1); research re: order(.3)
597	Campbell	09/23/04	B	B180	1.30	Prep cert counsels re mejdrech prelim injunc (.7);edit
597	Campbell	09/23/04	B	B180	1.30	order re same (.2);prep same for filing (.2);efiling same
597	Campbell	09/23/04	B	B180	1.30	(.2)
221	Schwartz	Total Task:		B180	1.70	297.50
394	Davis	Financing/Cash Collections		B230	0.10	Rev. Santen aff.
394	Davis	10/06/04	B	B230	0.40	Preparing and filing notice of cash collateral budget
394	Davis	10/01/04	B	B230	0.70	Drafting notice of filing cash collateral budget
394	Davis	10/01/04	B	B230	0.20	Email to K. Pamentner re notice of cash collateral budget
394	Davis	10/01/04	B	B230	0.20	PC w/ K. Pamentner re cash collateral budget
394	Davis	10/01/04	B	B230	0.10	Email to K. Pamentner re consensual cash collateral budget

	Total Task:	B230	1.70	394.50	
Claims and Plans					
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B300	0.10		Email to EDS, R. Barliant & S. Cousins re expedited assignment to DC judge
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B300	0.20		Pc w/ clerk re District Court's approval of confirmation order
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B300	0.20		Email to EDS, R. Barliant & S. Cousins re procedures for assignment to DC judge
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B300	0.10		Pc w/ R. Barliant re entry of District Court order
394 Davis	09/03/04 B	B300	0.30		Pc w/ EDS re district court approval of confirmation brief
394 Davis	09/03/04 B	B300	0.30		Emails w/ R. Barliant re District Court's approval of confirmation order
394 Davis	09/08/04 B	B300	0.10		Pc w/ EDS re channeling injunction order
Total Task: B300 1.30 286.00					
Claims Administration and Objections					
221 Schwartz	09/29/04 B	B310	0.10		Rev. letter re: claim being expunged
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B310	0.20		Conf w/ GRS re MB stipulation
394 Davis	09/02/04 B	B310	0.80		Drafting MB financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/08/04 B	B310	0.30		Emails to C. Kuoni & J. Goldberg re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/21/04 B	B310	0.10		Conf w/ DBB re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/21/04 B	B310	0.10		Email to DBB re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/21/04 B	B310	0.10		Message w/ J. Goldberg re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/21/04 B	B310	0.10		Email to K. Pamentier re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/21/04 B	B310	0.10		Conf w/ DBB re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/22/04 B	B310	0.10		Email from noticing agent re notice of transfers
394 Davis	09/22/04 B	B310	0.20		Pc and email w/ J. Gibson re ANB settlement agreement and order
394 Davis	09/22/04 B	B310	0.10		Email to J. Goldberg re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	09/22/04 B	B310	0.20		Email to noticing agent re notices of transfer
394 Davis	09/22/04 B	B310	0.10		Emails to U. Norman re notices of transfer
394 Davis	09/24/04 B	B310	0.10		Pc w/ J. Goldberg re MB Financial stipulation
394 Davis	10/19/04 B	B310	0.40		Preparing and filing notices of withdrawal of claims
512 Norman	09/20/04 B	B310	1.40		Review docket for objections to debtors 7th omnibus objection to claims(.2); Prepare cno regarding same(.3); Attention to e-filing same(.2); Review docket for objections to debtors 8th omnibus objection to claims(.2); Prepare cno regarding same(.3); Attention to e-filing same(.2)
512 Norman	09/22/04 B	B310	1.00		Attention to e-filing 10 notices of transfer of claim(1.0)
594 Conway	09/01/04 B	B310	0.30		Prep. for svc upon chambers coc re: 8th omni to Wilson Tool Int'l claim (.2); discuss same w/KD (.1)
594 Conway	09/01/04 B	B310	0.30		Prep for svc upon chambers coc re: stip re: PI plaintiffs (.2); discuss same w/KD (.1)
594 Conway	09/22/04 B	B310	0.30		Discuss hearing matters re: omni's w/KD and DBB
594 Conway	10/19/04 B	B310	0.10		Discuss withdrawal of claim w/AD
597 Campbell	09/15/04 B	B310	0.60		Prep notice of subm of claims for 7th and 8th omn obj claims (.6)
597 Campbell	09/20/04 B	B310	0.10		Edit cno's re 7th & 8th omn obj to claims (.1)
597 Campbell	09/20/04 B	B310	0.70		Prep cert of counsel re claims nos 199 and 200
597 Campbell	09/22/04 B	B310	1.00		Prep numerous notices of transfer of claim for filing (.5);efiling same (.5)

597 Campbell 09/27/04 B B310 0.30  
 597 Campbell 09/28/04 B B310 0.40  
 597 Campbell 10/13/04 B B310 0.30  
 597 Campbell 10/19/04 B B310 0.60  
 630 Lewicki 09/16/04 B B310 0.20  
 630 Lewicki 09/27/04 B B310 0.20

Prep cert counsel re MB Financial Claim Order for ct (.3)  
 Prep affid serv re 7th and 8th omn obj claims for filing (.2);efiling same (.2)  
 Prep notice defective transfer re Center for Mgmt for filing (.1);efiling same (.2)  
 Prep notice of withdrawal re formtek claim for filing (.1);efiling same (.2); prep notice of withdrawal of Hill Engineering claims for filing (.1); efiling same (.2)  
 Filed notice of submission of proofs of claim re DI's 1243 & 1244, .2  
 Prep stipulation resolving claim #173 for court

Total Task: B310 10.90 1911.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ Bty. Ct. re: confirmation order
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: tele. w\ bty ct. re: confirmation order
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Rev. R. Barilant email re: confirmation order
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.30	Tele. w\ R. Barilant, D. Bryd, et. al. re: confirmation order\dist.ct
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.20	Tele. w\ R. Barilant and S. Couisons re: confirmation order\dist. ct.
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: confirmation order\dist ct. papers
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: confirmation order\Dist. ct.
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Tele. w\ R. Barilant re: confirmation order\dist. ct.
221	Schwartz	09/01/04 B	B320	0.30	Tele. w\ S. Counsins re: confirmation order\dist. ct.
221	Schwartz	09/02/04 B	B320	0.10	Rev. A. Kelly and R. Barilant emails re: Dist. Ct. confirmation order
221	Schwartz	09/10/04 B	B320	0.20	Rev. notice to D.C. re: confirm. order
221	Schwartz	10/19/04 B	B320	0.20	Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: closing out case and going effective
389	Butz	09/14/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to co-counsel and EDS re: district court confirmation order
389	Butz	09/14/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: notice of confirmation order
389	Butz	10/19/04 B	B320	0.10	Call to ABD re: status of notice of effective date
389	Butz	10/19/04 B	B320	0.50	Conf with ABK re: requirements for notice of effective date (.2); research re: notices for effective date requirements (.3)
389	Butz	10/19/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABD re: effective date
389	Butz	10/19/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: notice of effective date and mtg re: post-effective fee applications
394	Davis	09/01/04 B	B320	0.30	Pc w/ EDS re district court order approving confirmation order
394	Davis	09/02/04 B	B320	0.20	Email to EDS re Metcoil confirmation order
394	Davis	09/02/04 B	B320	0.40	Pc w/ EDS & R. Barilant re assignment of confirmation order to DC
394	Davis	09/03/04 B	B320	0.20	Email to R. Barilant re docketing and assignment of confirmation order
394	Davis	10/19/04 B	B320	0.30	Comm w/ K. Pamentier re effective date
394	Davis	10/19/04 B	B320	0.40	Comm w/ A. Conway re notice of effective date and final fee hearing
394	Davis	10/19/04 B	B320	0.40	Conf w/ DBB re notice of effective date, administrative bar date and final fee hearing
594	Conway	09/01/04 B	B320	0.20	Discuss conf. of case w/IRS (.1); review docket (.1)

594 Conway 10/19/04 B B320 0.50 Discuss hearing on final fees and notice of effective date w/AD and EC  
 597 Campbell 10/19/04 B B320 0.40 Prep notice of effective date of plan for filing (.2); efilling same (.2)

Total Task: B320 1702.00

General Bankruptcy

359	Saydah	09/01/04	B	B410	0.30	Review MB Financial stip.
389	Butz	09/02/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: ltr re: D.C. ltr
389	Butz	09/02/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: ltr filed in bk court
389	Butz	09/02/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: district court letter
389	Butz	09/02/04	B	B410	0.10	Review letter
389	Butz	09/02/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to ABK re: letter
389	Butz	09/07/04	B	B410	0.10	Review pleadings; confirm 22nd hrg date
389	Butz	09/08/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: status and district court proceeding
389	Butz	09/08/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from ABK re: district court order
389	Butz	09/10/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: d.c. filing
389	Butz	09/10/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails and call with K Pamentner (.2); emials with R
389	Butz	09/10/04	B	B410	0.90	Barliant (.2); emails with GTlaw (.2); prep order and notice for filing and service (.3)
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: notice
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: district court filing
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to K. Pamentner re: district court filing
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: notice
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from committee re: district court notice
389	Butz	09/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to committee re: district court notice
389	Butz	09/14/04	B	B410	0.10	Review order from district court
389	Butz	09/15/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: Monday hrg
389	Butz	09/15/04	B	B410	0.10	Email and call from EC re: agenda for 22nd
389	Butz	09/15/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: hrg
389	Butz	09/15/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to EC re: hrg
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B410	0.30	Conf with EDS re: 22nd hrg (.1); review docket and agenda (.1); email to co-counsel re: agenda (.1)
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from EDS re: hrg
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with WHS re: 22nd hrg
389	Butz	09/17/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: 22nd hrg
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to EC and from Katie re: proof of service from BMC
389	Butz	09/20/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from K. Pamentner re: stipulation
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Conf with ABK re: MB Financial Stipulation
389	Butz	09/21/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: hrg; email to WHS re: same Hrg
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B410	1.60	Reverse orders (.5); email to group re: revised orders (.1)
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B410	0.60	Email from K. Pamentner re: hrg
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B410	0.10	Prep for hrg
389	Butz	09/22/04	B	B410	0.20	Email from R. Barliant re: orders
389	Butz	09/23/04	B	B410	0.10	Review certs for Mejdrech orders
389	Butz	09/23/04	B	B410	0.20	Email from GTlaw re: docs
389	Butz	09/23/04	B	B410	0.10	Email to GTlaw, client, Landis re: orders
389	Butz	09/23/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from A Landis re: orders
389	Butz	09/23/04	B	B410	0.10	Final review of certs for Mejdrech orders; prep for filing
389	Butz	09/27/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from BMC re: affidavits of service
560	Tate	09/14/04	B	B410	1.40	Hearing preparation



597	Campbell	09/15/04 B	B410	1.70	Prep agenda (1.60);email same to DB (.1)
597	Campbell	09/16/04 B	B410	0.10	P/c to ct re hrg (.1)
597	Campbell	09/17/04 B	B410	1.70	Chk dock re agenda matters (.2);edit same (1.5)
597	Campbell	09/20/04 B	B410	1.80	Disc agenda w/DB (.1);chk dock re same (.3);edit agenda (.3);disc same w/KD (.1);email same to KP (.1);prep cos re same (.1);efiling same (.2);efiling exh a to same (.2);prep svc same (.4)
597	Campbell	09/21/04 B	B410	0.70	Prep cert of counsel re pelzer and pepping for ct (.3);disc hrg w/DB (.1);set up telephonic participation for goldberg (.3)
597	Campbell	10/05/04 B	B410	0.50	Email to client re mor (.1);chk dock re excl period order (.2);d/l docs re same (.2)
597	Campbell	10/06/04 B	B410	0.30	Disc ord course pleadings w/AD (.1);chk docs re same (.1);prep cos re Van Santan Affidavit re same (.1)
597	Campbell	10/08/04 B	B410	0.30	Disc ord course filing w/AD (.1);prep cos re same (.1);email wp re serv list (.1)
597	Campbell	10/13/04 B	B410	2.10	Prep agenda
597	Campbell	10/14/04 B	B410	0.40	Edit agenda (.4)
597	Campbell	10/15/04 B	B410	3.00	Prep docs for hrg
597	Campbell	10/18/04 B	B410	1.90	Prep agenda for filing (.2); disc same w/ AD (.1); efilng same (.2); prep binder re same for ct (.5); prep svc same (.4); prep attys binder re same (.5)
597	Campbell	10/19/04 B	B410	1.40	Disc hrg w/ AD (.1); p/c to ct re same (.1); edit amended agenda (.3); prep cos re same (.1); prep same for filing (.1); efilng same (.3); prep svc same (.4)

Total Task: B410 24.90 4440.50

FEE SUBTOTAL: 102.00 19271.50