

# WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246785

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL, INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

FILE NO. A3374.00103

---

IN THE MATTER OF:

LAURA WROBLE V THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
DIVISION OF MET-COIL SYSTEMS CORPORATION,  
ET AL.  
COURT : 02 C 4992 USDC

**INTERIM STATEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES  
RENDERED THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2003**

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/06/03	AGH	2.00	Draft motion for summary judgment; revise same.
11/12/03	CEC	2.00	Draft and edit memorandums of law in support of motions for summary judgment.
11/13/03	CEC	1.50	Draft and edit memorandums of law in support of motions for summary judgment.
11/14/03	MRM	0.50	Research files to locate all depositions of personal physicians for C. Clark.
11/17/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	EAM	1.00	Review, revise, edit and research motion for summary judgment and accompanying statement of facts.
11/18/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	AGH	0.50	Revise, edit and rewrite portions of summary judgment brief.

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
 INVOICE NO. 246785  
 PAGE 2

MAURA WROBLE V THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
 FILE NO. A3374.00103

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/19/03	EAM	0.75	Review depositions, review, revise, edit and research motion for summary judgment and accompanying statement of facts.
11/19/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; edit statement of facts; prepare motion for filing and file same.
11/19/03	AGH	0.50	Finalize memorandum in support of motion for summary judgment and Rule 56 statement of undisputed facts; conferences with C. Clark regarding final motions and argument.
11/20/03	LPD	0.25	Appear before Judge Zagel for status and to set briefing schedule.
		15.00	TOTAL HOURS

**SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:**

MARK R. MCCARL	0.50	hours at	\$130.00 =	65.00
ETHAN A. MCKITTRICK	1.75	hours at	\$180.00 =	315.00
CHAD E. CLARK	9.50	hours at	\$190.00 =	1,805.00
LEO P. DOMBROWSKI	0.25	hours at	\$275.00 =	68.75
ANTHONY G. HOPP	3.00	hours at	\$335.00 =	1,005.00

**CURRENT FEES**

**3,258.75**

**CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS**

**3,258.75**

WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246785  
PAGE 3

MAURA WROBLE V THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
LE NO. A3374.00103

---

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

10/14/03	241320	531.25
11/17/03	244047	170.00

---

PRIOR BALANCE DUE

701.25

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

3,960.00  
=====

PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH YOUR PAYMENT

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1% PER MONTH SERVICE CHARGE  
AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

**REMITTANCE ADVICE**

DECEMBER 11, 2003

INVOICE NO. 246785

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

FILE NO. A3374.00103

IN THE MATTER OF:

LAURA WROBLE V THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,

**CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS**

**3,258.75**

**OUTSTANDING INVOICES**

10/14/03	241320	531.25
11/17/03	244047	170.00

**PRIOR BALANCE DUE**

**701.25**

**TOTAL BALANCE DUE**

**3,960.00**  
=====

**PLEASE RETURN THIS SHEET WITH PAYMENT**

# WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246786

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

FILE NO. A3374.00104

IN THE MATTER OF:

ANNE SCHREIBER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY  
COMPANY, ET AL.

COURT : 02 C 6097

INTERIM STATEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES  
RENDERED THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2003

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/04/03	MRM	0.50	Retrieve Teitelbaum deposition materials from A. Hopp and add to files; retrieve document production from A. Hopp and restore to files.
11/17/03	MRM	0.50	Restore correspondence to files; remove document production to caseroom.
		<u>1.00</u>	TOTAL HOURS

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

MARK R. MCCARL	1.00 hours at \$130.00 =	130.00
		<u>130.00</u>
	CURRENT FEES	<u>130.00</u>

DISBURSEMENTS INCURRED:

OVERNIGHT DELIVERY		<u>30.08</u>
--------------------	--	--------------

WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

ANNE SCHREIBER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY  
LE NO. A3374.00104

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246786  
PAGE 2

---

CURRENT DISBURSEMENTS			30.08
			<hr/>
CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS			160.08
OUTSTANDING INVOICES			
10/14/03	241321	4332.23	
11/17/03	244048	2399.27	
			<hr/>
PRIOR BALANCE DUE			6,731.50
			<hr/>
TOTAL BALANCE DUE			6,891.58
			=====

PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH YOUR PAYMENT

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1% PER MONTH SERVICE CHARGE  
AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

**REMITTANCE ADVICE**

DECEMBER 11, 2003

INVOICE NO. 246786

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

FILE NO. A3374.00104

---

IN THE MATTER OF:

ANNE SCHREIBER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY

CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 160.08

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

10/14/03	241321	4332.23
11/17/03	244048	2399.27

---

PRIOR BALANCE DUE 6,731.50

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 6,891.58  
=====

PLEASE RETURN THIS SHEET WITH PAYMENT

# WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246787

FILE NO. A3374.00105

---

IN THE MATTER OF:

VIRGINIA HALLMER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
ET AL.

COURT : 02 L 011022 COOK

**INTERIM STATEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES  
RENDERED THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2003**

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
-----	----	-----	-----
11/14/03	MRM	0.50	Research files to locate all depositions of personal physicians for C. Clark.
11/17/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	MRM	1.25	Review summary judgment motion for all cites to deposition testimony; pull and copy all deposition cites for use as exhibits; research files to locate Rule 26(a)(2) disclosure; conference with C. Clark re: exhibits and pleadings.
11/18/03	EAM	1.00	Review, revise, edit and research motion for summary judgment and accompanying statement of facts.
11/18/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	AGH	0.50	Revise, edit and rewrite portions of summary judgment brief.



WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

VIRGINIA HALLMER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
LE NO. A3374.00105

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246787  
PAGE 2

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/19/03	EAM	0.75	Review depositions, review, revise, edit and research motion for summary judgment and accompanying statement of facts.
11/19/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; edit statement of facts; prepare motion for filing and file same.
11/19/03	AGH	0.50	Finalize memorandum in support of motion for summary judgment and Rule 56 statement of undisputed facts; conferences with C. Clark regarding final motions and argument.
11/20/03	MRM	0.50	Restore all depositions to files, pulled for review by C. Clark.
11/20/03	LPD	0.25	Appear before Judge Zagel for status and to set briefing schedule.
11/25/03	MRM	0.25	File documents received from C. Clark.
		11.50	TOTAL HOURS

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

MARK R. MCCARL	2.50	hours at	\$130.00 =	325.00
ETHAN A. MCKITTRICK	1.75	hours at	\$180.00 =	315.00
CHAD E. CLARK	6.00	hours at	\$190.00 =	1,140.00
LEO P. DOMBROWSKI	0.25	hours at	\$275.00 =	68.75
ANTHONY G. HOPP	1.00	hours at	\$335.00 =	335.00

CURRENT FEES

2,183.75

DISBURSEMENTS INCURRED:

REPRODUCTION EXPENSE

1.80

WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

VIRGINIA HALLMER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,  
FILE NO. A3374.00105

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246787  
PAGE 3

---

CURRENT DISBURSEMENTS 1.80

CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 2,185.55

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

10/14/03	241322	336.25
11/17/03	244049	88.65

---

PRIOR BALANCE DUE 424.90

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 2,610.45  
=====

PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH YOUR PAYMENT

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1% PER MONTH SERVICE CHARGE  
AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

**REMITTANCE ADVICE**

DECEMBER 11, 2003

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

INVOICE NO. 246787

FILE NO. A3374.00105

---

IN THE MATTER OF:

VIRGINIA HALLMER VS THE LOCKFORMER COMPANY,

CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 2,185.55

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

10/14/03	241322	336.25
11/17/03	244049	88.65

---

PRIOR BALANCE DUE 424.90

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 2,610.45  
=====

PLEASE RETURN THIS SHEET WITH PAYMENT.

# WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246788

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

FILE NO. A3374.00106

IN THE MATTER OF:

DENISE ANN EHRHART VS THE LOCKFORMER  
COMPANY, ET AL.

COURT : 02 L 011020 COOK

INTERIM STATEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES  
RENDERED THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2003

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/14/03	MRM	1.00	Research files to locate all depositions of personal physicians for C. Clark; conference with C. Clark re: research findings; draft email to C. Clark re: research findings.
11/17/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	MRM	1.25	Review summary judgment motion for all cites to deposition testimony; pull and copy all deposition cites for use as exhibits; research files to locate Rule 26(a)(2) disclosure; conference with C. Clark re: exhibits and pleadings.
11/18/03	EAM	1.00	Review, revise, edit and research motion for summary judgment and accompanying statement of facts.
11/18/03	CEC	2.00	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment; draft and edit statement of facts.
11/18/03	AGH	0.50	Revise, edit and rewrite portions of summary judgment brief.

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DENISE ANN EHRHART VS THE LOCKFORMER  
LE NO. A3374.00106

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO. 246788  
PAGE 3

---

			<u>20.17</u>
			<u>2,268.92</u>
<b>OUTSTANDING INVOICES</b>			
10/14/03	241323	3291.25	
11/17/03	244050	519.72	
			<u>3,810.97</u>
			<u>6,079.89</u> =====

**PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH YOUR PAYMENT**

**UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1% PER MONTH SERVICE CHARGE  
AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE**

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

**REMITTANCE ADVICE**

DECEMBER 11, 2003

DAVID P. COOKE, ESQ.  
HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC.  
P.O. BOX 2245R  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962

INVOICE NO. 246788

FILE NO. A3374:00106

---

IN THE MATTER OF:

DENISE ANN EHRHART VS THE LOCKFORMER

CURRENT FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS

2,268.92

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

10/14/03	241323	3291.25
11/17/03	244050	519.72

---

PRIOR BALANCE DUE

3,810.97

TOTAL BALANCE DUE

---

6,079.89

=====

PLEASE RETURN THIS SHEET WITH PAYMENT

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

**225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229**

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO.

DAVID COOKE, ESQ.  
LAW DEPARTMENT  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD, BOX 2245R  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07692

FILE NO.

---

**REDACTED**

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO.

FILE NO.

PAGE 2

---

**REDACTED**



**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO.

FILE NO.

PAGE 3

---

**REDACTED**

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO.

FILE NO.

PAGE 4

---

**REDACTED**

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

DECEMBER 11, 2003  
INVOICE NO.

FILE NO.

PAGE 5

---

**REDACTED**

**WILDMAN, HARROLD, ALLEN & DIXON LLP**

**225 West Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois 60606-1229**

Tax ID. No. 36-2615899

**REMITTANCE ADVICE**

DECEMBER 11, 2003

DAVID COOKE, ESQ.  
LAW DEPARTMENT  
101 COLUMBIA ROAD, BOX 2245R  
MORRISTOWN, NJ 07692

INVOICE NO.

FILE NO.

---

**REDACTED**